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Disaster Strikes Danes In NCAA's 

i 

by I m c i Maggki < 
The thrill of victory and the agony 

of defeat. The Albany State baiket-
ball team felt both of these emotions 
in a matter of weeks. A little more 
than two week* ago, you couldn't 
have found a happier baiketball 
team than Albany, after their upiet 
over Brockport. But it wai a 
different ttory Friday night, as St. 
Lawrence steamrolled past the 
Danes 82-63 in the opening round of 
the NCAA Division 111 playoffs. 

There were faces of gloom and dis-
pair on the Albany State bench as 
the team moved closer to elimina­
tion. Some of the players had their 
face on their laps. Most of the team 
had tears in their eyes. It was a quiet 
scene in the lockerroom after the 
game as the players were emotional­
ly drained. The team had worked so 
haul to gel to the NCAA playoffs 
but they showed little when they got 
their chance. 

The Danes' loss was the end of 
Albany's roller-coaster season. 
Albany J^ued inconsistent ball all 
year as they had a couple of up and a 
couple of down streaks. Unfor­
tunately, the NCAA tournament 
came when the Danes were in a down 
swing. The team discounted their 
two lackluster performances versus 
Marist and Stony Brook, feeling 
those games were meaningless. But 
Albany found out that you can't turn 
on good team ball like a water 
faucet. Albany lost their momentum 
and were never able to regain it over 
this past weekend. 

The A l b a n y lockerroom 
blackboard before the St. Lawrence 
game read: Rebound + Defense = 
Win. That's exactly what Albany 
didn't do and it showed in the final 
score. Perhaps the blackboard 
should have read beat St. Lawrence, 
as the team seemed to be looking 
past their opening round game. 

Led by Eddie Johnson and Bob ' 
Audi, Albany w n able to open a 15-
8 lead over St. Lawrence. The team 
•bowed no signs of tightness and 
they were playing good ball. The 

''Danes, though, could not break the 
game open and the Saints were able 
to inch back into the contest. Much 
of their scoring was coming from 
Jimmy Young and little Dan 
Watkins. The lead changed hands 
six times as both clubs were trading 
baskets. Albany was able to regain 
the lead and Mike Suprunowicz's 
basket gave Albany a 28-23 lead with 
under twelve minute to play in the 
first half. But Albany thought the 
game was won and stopped playing 
basketball. 

The Saints ran off the next thir­
teen points as the Danes lost their 
cool. They weren't doing anything 
right. Albany was getting killed un­
der the boards as St. Lawrence was 
getting second and third shots. 

The Danes'defense completely fell 
apart when the Saints starting to 
slow things down. State tried to 
cheat on defense by double teaming 
the Saint's ball handlers. But Albany 
got burned,asSt. Lawrencewasable 
to hit the open man underneath the 
basket, usually Tony Ross, for the 
easy layup. 

Offensively, Albany got just one 
poor shoi at the basket each time 
they had the ball. Koola's basket at 
the buzzer broke the Saint's streak 
and sent Albany into the lockerroom 
down 36-30. 

Albany could comeback in the se­
cond half if the club started playing 
like a team. The Saint's Kevin 
McGrath scored the first bucket of 
the second half as St. Lawrence im-
creascd their advantage to eight. But 
Johnson came right back, making 
his shot and converting the three 
point play. For the next six minutes 
the Danes' offense died, as Albany 

could not buy a bucket. 
The Danes were being run off the 

.court. The Saints were able to get 
many easy points from underneath 
and from wide open ball players. St. 
Lawrence opened up a 17 point lead 
before Tom Morphia hit1 a bucket 
with 13:34 to play. The Danes made 
one final effort to rally. Led by John­
son and Pete Koola, the Dane 
offense finally started moving. 
Albany closed the gap to nine with ' 
9:10 to play. But St. Lawrence could 
not be caught. They played a 
beautiful ball control game and they 
wouldn't succumb to the Danes se­
cond half pressure. Albany again 
closed to within nine with 3:28 to 
play but a couple of missed foul 
shots and a late St. Lawrence spurt 
scaled the Danes doom. 

"We just went flat," said Doc 
Saucrs after the game. "Defense and 
rebounding were the difference. Our 
defense inside wasn't good. We 
thought we could handle them man-
to-man... We didn't have enough 
movement out there. The team was 
able to get the ball into the middle, 
but wecouldn'tdoanythingwithit." 

Brockport made it a complete 
Capital District disaster when they 
beat RP1, following the Albany 
game. That setup an Albany -
Engineer consolation match the 
following night. The Danes offered 
only token resistence as RPI 
defeated the Danes 72-55. 

For Albany it was a repeat of the 
night before. The Danes played their 
worst ball of the year during the first 
ten minutes of the game, as Albany 
was asleep on the court. They were 
getting murdered under the boards 
and Albany kept throwing the ball 
away. Four times in the early going 
the Danes tried a lead-feed under the 
basket and four times the pass sailed 
over an Albany player's head. 

The Danes were not playing 
defense, leaving It PI wide open. The 
Engineers took advantage of this 
and opened up a 28-10 lead. Led by 
Johnson, the Danes woke up and 
finally played some basketball. They 
closed RPI's margin to eight before 
Bill Susetka threw in two baskets to 
give RPI a 38-26 half time lead. 

The second half wasn't that much 
better, as Albany stopped playing 
basketball. Doc kept shuffling his 
lineup but he could not find a win­
ning combination. RPI began to . 
romp as they .took a 26 point lead 
with seven minutes to go. Mike 
Suprunowicz provided some offense 
in the closing minutes but it was too 
little and too late as the Danes had 
their second straight loss. 

In the championship game, 
Brockport's high powered offense 
was too much for St, Lawrence, as 
they clobbered the Saints, 103-79. 

Albany finishes the year at 15-10. 
"You have to give the team alot of 
credit for getting here," said Saucrs. 
"We will be back soon." The tourna­
ment was a good learning experience 
for the young Danes and a year of 
maturity could prove most valuable. 

Mfce Suprunowfca goat to the basket 
•gainst t t . Lawrence forward Ron 
Latonda. tup scored 22 m toting aHoct 

Ithmen 

Senior Pale Kooiaputs up a 10 lootar from 
the foul Una versus S.L.AU. Danes III miss 

their 6'4" vaplaln. 

Swimmers 
In 

by Rob Geier 
It was the culmination of six 

months of dedication and hard 
work. For two hours a day, six days 
a week they had pushed themselves 
in thousands of yards of swimming, 
and it seemed as if it was till lor this 
one meet—the SUNY Conference 
championship, in which twleve 
schools from all over New York 
State gel together lor three days to 
determine who actually is the best in 
the 19events that comprise the meet. 

The Albany State Team placed 
seventh, a result that brought with it 
a number of significant triumphs as 
well as disappointments. The 
triumphs were composed of a 
number of individual successes that 
brought improved limes, new school 
records, the first qualifiers for the 
nationals in Albany Stale's swim­
ming history, and an overall im­
provement in the quality of Albany 
Stulc swimming under new head 
coach Ron While and assistant John 
Quinn. The disappointment was on 

Dana Coach "Doc" Sauere making that 
last, long trip to the lockerroom alter Dane 

loss to Engineers. 

Finish Seventh 
SUNY Championships 

the part of swimmers who did not do 
as well as they had hoped, as well as a 
general anger over the way the meet 

was run. 
Dudley stars 

Sophomore Dan Dudley was the 
first Albany State swimmer to ever 
qualify for the nationals. Already 
one of the top breaslstrokers in the 
slate, Dudley had been sharpening 
up his stroke over the last two weeks 
with the hope of qualifying in both 
the I00 and 200 yard hreaststroke 
events, lie hit the necessary I.05.1 
right on the nose in the afternoon 
qualifying round for the I00 yard 
hrcuslstrokc. The nationals will be 
held on March 21 and 22 in 
Meadsville, I'cnn. Dan slacked off 
placing 11 tli in the finals. Dun had 
some other fine individual perfor­
mances during the three day meet. In 
the 200 yard individual Medley he 
qualified sixth for the finals and then 
went on to place third, heating the 
two swimmers that were seeded with 
faster limes. In the 200 yard 

hreaststroke he placed seventh, only 
missing the national qualifying time 
by I second. 

The highlight for the team was the 
performance of the Rubin brothers, 
Milch—sophomore and Dave-
freshman, whose efforts generated 
the most team points as well as the 
most excitement. Mitch improved 
more significantly than any other 
swimmer and in doing so became the 
second Albany swimmer to qualify 
for the nationals. In the early mor­
ning qualifying heals ol the 200 yard 
butterfly lie swam the best race of his 
life, dropping his time two seconds 
to finally break I'etc Cicrstanhaber's 
long standing record of 2,11,8 with a 
solid 2.09.4S6. This was still not fast 
enough to qualify for the nationals. 
In the finals everyone seemed skep­
tical about him dropping the extra 
second that wus needed. Minutes 
before his race he appeared to be at 
ease, walking around in his non­
chalant, slump shouldered manner, 

continued on \>uw 19 j 
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Telethon Festivities Begin Tonight 
by Randi Toler 

Beginning at 8 p.m. tonight in the 
Campus Center Ballroom SUNYA 
will hold its eighth annual 24 hour 
telethon for the benefit of the 
Wildwood School for developmen­
tal^ handicapped children. 

Co-chairperson Ernie Sprancc 
promises that this year's talent will 
be even better than last year's. Presi­
dent Henezct and Mayor Coming 
will be opening telethon this year. 
According to Sprancc. President 
Henezct hinted thai he and the 
mayor may be performing a Laurel 
and Hardy routine. 

One o f the h igh lights of telethon is 
the auctioning and the throwing of 
pies. This year there will be several 
new laces with whipped cream all 
over them. Harold Cannon of the 
business department. Jane llurkin-
son of the Bio 101 labs, Norbert 
Znhm of l-.S.A, and John Slutz of 
the Allen Center have all agreed to 
lose a little of their dignity in the 
name of charity, l-ollowinglradition 
the water bed suite at the Hyatt 
House will again he auctioned off to 
the highest bidder. 

This year telethon is presenting 
more local talent outside the Univer­
sity than in previous years. Betty 
Cieorge and her dog Moo are ten­
tatively scheduled for Saturday at 
seven p.m. Also appearing this year 
will be John Simson. Icalro 

Boriken, Dick Smith of Channel 13 
sports, John Cimino, Neil Brown 
and the Faculty Band, and many 
others. 

Sprance promised that this year's 
children's hour, Saturday lOu.tri. -2 
p.m.. will be • MCII better organized 
than last year's. There will be several 
acts such as a magician, a balloon 
sculptor, and a lap dancing troupe. 

Telethon will be broadcast jointly 
by WAHY and WSUA for 12 hours. 
It will also be viewed on Channel 10 
from I a.m. - 2 a.m. and on WAST 
from 2:30 - 3:30 p.m. Anyone 
wishing to get their lace on TV 
should be there between 8:30 and 
9:30 tonight, when the television 
stations will be taping. 

Last year's telethon drew in SI5,-
154. Co-chairpersons Ernie Sprancc 
and Karen Gilhoff hope to hit at 
least $16,000 this year. One obstacle 
they had to face was the donation of 
food last to Easter Seal this year, 
rather than to the Wildwood School 
luud. However, Sprancc reports that 
parents of SUNYA students have 
answered letters with pledges of 
nearly $2000. so far. 

As an added incentive to those 
who live downtown, the SUNY 
buses wil I be running all nigh I long at 
the regularly scheduled intervals so 
that evcryoncwill be able to stay and 
enjoy the fun lor as long as they 
want. 

Robust student stands triumphant after receiving pie In face in frolics of last year's Telethon. 

Administrators Here Optimistic About Future 
by Daniel dailies 

While waiting for the Slate 
legislature to complete next year's 
budget SU N Y A administrators have 
noted what they believe is a change 
in attitude towards SUNYA's 
growth and potential bySUNY Cen­
tral. 

The attitude ol SUNY Central in 
past years has been that a school 
should not be budgeted for more 
l-TE's without having more space. 
(I'TK'sare "Full-Time Equivalents", 
an enrollment measure that lakes 
credit load into account.) Recently, 
however, they have agreed in princi­
ple to a larger staff and student body 
without an increase in capital con­
struction, according to administra­
tion here. 

"I here is considerable cautious 
optimism." said Edward Jennings, 
Assistant to the President. 

A spokesman for SUNY Central 
said that they felt SUNYA's budgets 
had always been considered fairly, 
and would continue to be. 

SUNYA will go to legislature dur­

ing the summer, as they usually do, 
for a supplemental budget request. 
This year they are going lo try to add 
300 l-TE's lo the presently budgeted 
figure. 

This was explained by Jennings as 
an effort, in part, lo gel credit for 
l-TE's that are already on campus. 
"People want to come here," he 
pointed out. "and more stayed this 
year than we predicted." Albany has 
among the highest number of 
applications per place among the 
schools in the SUNY system. "This 
year, we have received 13,441 
applications lor ISO!) freshman 
places," said Assistant Vice Presi­
dent of Academic Affairs David 
Martin. SUNYA is pleased that 
SUNY Central has encouraged go­
ing l o r the supp le m e n I. 
"Nowadays," sid Jennings, "it's op­
timistic if they haven't told you to 
stop [asking lor money]", 

SA President Pat Curran ex­
pressed hope thai "more l-TE's 
won't mean overcrowded dorms, or 
lounges, or a packed library. We es­

pecially don't want students living in 
lounges ever again." 

Governor Hugh Carey's budget, 
proposed in late January, would 
e l iminate eighteen SUNYA 
positions, including five faculty. 
Since Carey's proposed gasoline lax 
is in trouble and because the 
statewide financial picture lor next 
year is considered bleak, the 
legislature isconsidcring further cuts 
throughout the slate budget, file 
SUNY budget is considered relative­
ly sale. 

SUNYA's original budget request 
wttsS4.576.000, which became $1,-
476,0(10 by the time it went through 
Sliny* Central and the Governor's 
budgeting system. 

In recent years SUNYA has been 
considered a "mature" campus and 
there has been only minor increases 
in stall, money or equipment. In this 
same period, however, the number 
ol Graduate students, master and 
doctoral degrees, and outside gniills 
have jumped considerably. The 1976 
SUNY "Master I'lan" sets up a 

steady enrollment for SUNYA and a 
slight decline from 19X0 lo 1985. 
SUNYA is presently contesting ibis. 
Ihe key lo uncling has been l-TE's, 
bill SUNYA believes that 
educational quality may one day 
receive the upper hand. 

During last year's budgeting 
procedures, administrators from 
SUNY schools were pressed lo dis­
cuss the quality of Ihe institutions. 
"We were able to answer, and they 
were pleased," said one SUNYA ad­
ministrator, "and I don't think other 
schools answered as well." I his was 
considered a sign ol decreasing 
emphasis on the workload factor. 

Chough the details change, the 
central office uses a workload 
evaluation in determining what a 
school's budget. "In the last three or 
four years," said Martin, "the 
workload has been Ihe only one thai 
sells". A workload increase would 
result from an increase in I-1 E's. 
which would mean a school would 
need more faculty, more faculty 
assistance (help), more equipment. 

and more library books. Other 
reasons lor a budget increase vary 
bin ihisycni thc\ have been based on 
programs. On-going programs are 
sometimes expanded and new ones, 
like ihe SUNYA Russian Exchange 
program, arc period icallyintrodueed, 

Our school's Journalism program 
was encouraged by SUNY. and was 
financed initially out ol "soli" lands 
under Chancellor Buyer's direct con-
(ml, I lien SUNYA was able to 
ivcehc Hinds in Ihe inllowing years' 
bud gel In con I in lie Ihe program. Ihe 
Russian Exchange program was 
worked out in the same way. and 
thus were newer introduced by 
SUNYA as a new program. 

I he budgeting process, according 
to Jennings, has a "peple orienta­
tion" rather than a "dollar orienta­
tion." 1 here is a concern with 
positions rather ihan monetary 
amounts. 

Ihe altitude changes in SUNY 
Central and yere may reduce some 
recent pessinnsini about SUNYA' 
future, 

SUNYA administrators working with budget: Vice-President lor Academic Affairs David Martin, 
Assistant to the President Ted Jennings, Vice-President lor Management and Planning John 

Hartley, Assistant Vice-President lor Management and Planning John Hartlgan. 

Ihree candidates for SUNYA's Presidency will be on campus this 
neck, Ihe Search Commute announced 

On Monday, March 17, between 9:00 a.m. and 10:15 the first 
candidate will meet with students in the I'airoon lounge in the 
Campus Center. 

I hen between 2:20 p.m. and .1:45 p.m. (here will be tin open meeting 
wiili laculiy in the I'atnion Lounge, 

I he other two candidates will heal SUNY A on Wednesday Ihe 19th, 
and Iriday the 21st respectively, and will have the same schedule of 
open meetings as the first Presidential candidate, 

Students and laculiy arc invited lo attend and ask questions of Ihe 
Presidential candiales and scud feedback to the committee. 

I he Search Commitlee, headed by J. Vanderhill Struub, has been 
conducting ils search for abuul seven months. 

http://wttsS4.576.000


Senior Week Activities Planned 
bjrrtg Moffttt 

Movies, parties, dinners, square 
dancing . . .al l this and more are 
but a few of the numerous functions 
planned by the activities committee 
for Senior Week, which will kick off 
on May 24th and culminate on 
Graduation Day, June 1st. 

Some of the ideas suggested by the 
group of 20 seniors are the 
possibilities of: an overnight trip to 
Montreal, a day trip to Boston, a 
semi-formal dinner-dance, a night at 
Saratoga Harness Raceway, roller 
skating, and cartoons in the dining 
rooms. 

This is in addition to the 
traditional clambake at Mohawk 
Campus and the new idea of having a 
cabin reserved at Dippikill all week 
for those who wish to spend their last 
week in the North country. It has 
been suggested by Bruce Newman, 
chairperson of Senior Week, that 
Seniors should try to attend as many 

events i s possible. Newman feels, 
"It's their Senior Week, it's their last 
week at Albany State before becom­
ing alumni. 

At this time, theSenior Class has a 
$13 ,000 budget accumulated 
through class.dues. This is more 
money than has been available in 
previous years.. Hopefully this 
amount will help absorb the cost of 
many activities, or at least reduce the 
admission prices for the 2,200 
seniors. 

Diversified Function 
According to Linda Weinstock, 

Class President, "In the past, classes 
conducted one function atatime. We 
hope to have two or three at the same 
time to increase the various types of 
activities. We're really diversified." 

Newman mentioned that,"Some| 
colleges have you pay. a flat fee for 
Senior Week. However, our way 
people get to attend some things-
trie things that they want." 

One activity suggested by Dave 
Abramoff, class treasurer, is a field 
day in cooperation with the LaSalle 
School for Boys. The idea behind 
this, according to Newman, is.to 
"spend a part of Senior Week with 
someone other than ourselves, shar­
ing our time with other people." 

Entertaining parents, who arrive 
on campus May 31st, could be a 
problem that the activities com­
mittee hopes to alleviate. They are in 
the process of planning an icecream 
social with a band for the afternoon 
and a nightclub following Torch 
Night. 

The committee plans to send out 
informational letters to seniors at the 
end of April, so they may begin plan­
ning their individual activities. 

Right now Senior Week is still in 
the planning stage. The activities 
committee is open for ideas. We will 
hold a general meeting for 
volunteers after vacation. 

University Guilty of Racial Discrimination 
(CPS) The Department of Health 

Education and Welfare (HEW) has 
found the University of Texas guilty 
of widespread racial discrimination 
in programs ranging from ad­
missions to athletics, the Daily Tex­
an has reported. 

Title VI 
In a report compiled over the past 

year HEW cited violations of Title 

VI—a law which prohibits dis­
crimination based on race, color or 
national origin in federally assisted 
institutions—in the areas of equal 
opportunity policy, recruitment, stu­
dent financila aid and student 
employment. 

. Lists 
The report also listed student ser­

vices, enrollment, placement, hous­

ing and social fraternities as areas 
where minorit ies were un­
der rep resented or discriminated 
against. 

HEW gave the Texas school 90 
days in which to "overcome the 
effects of past discrimination" by 
taking "corrective action" or, as 
provided for under the law, face a 
cutoff of federal funds. 

THEDA^^EDCMPHIN 
Saturday only March 15 
7:30, 8:30, and 9:30 LC—land2\ 

$.50 with tax card $1.25 without 
funded by student association •:•:*."*:*:.:*:•:•:*:•:• 

JOHANNESBURG, Soath AMca (AP) Elizabeth Bagaya, the attractive 
former foreign minister of Uganda,has become the most recent to join black 
Africa's growing club of exiles. 

Uganda's unpredictable president, Gen. Idi Amin, fired the 35-year-old 
former model and attorney after accusing her of making love with a white 
in a restroom while on a stopover at a Paris airport. She has denied the 
charge, and French officials who were at the airport at the time have termed 
the charge impossible. 

NEW DELHI, India (AP) The transition of William B. Saxbe from 
outspoken politician to quiet diplomat has begun. 

After nearly two weeks in New Delhi as U.S. ambassador to India, the 
former attorney general, who earned a reputation in Washington for his 
candor and quick tongue, has avoided embroiling himself in any public 
controversies. 

He says he plans to keep that policy. 
PHNOM PENH (AP) On Cambodia's war fronts, government armored 

and paratroop units reported no progress to clear infiltrating insurgents from 
villages seven miles northwest of the capital, field reports said. 

In another area 12 miles west of the city a similar government operation 
pushing into the rebel "rocket belt" made no progress. 

Heavy air strikes by propeller-driven T28 fighters failed to halt insurgent 
rocket and artillery attacks into the capital's airport four miles west of the 
city. 

WASHINGTON (AP) The Senate Finance Committee agreed tentatively 
Thursday to cut taxes by as much as $6 billion for millions oflow and middle-
income families that itemize deductions. 

That group of taxpayers would get no relief from 1975 taxes under the 
$2l.3-billion tax-cut bill passed by the House. 

The committee made the tentative decision as it began writing its own tax-
cut measure, which is expected to total about $30 billion, ulmost double what 
President Ford recommended. 

!',',' mm&mi^)nM?k w'̂ rvKfi feff a n d SemttcThursdaj 
apparently quashed the Ford administration's ,bidr^qiadditional military aid 
for Cambodia and South Vietnam. 

Senate Democrats voted 38 to 5 against any more arms for the besieged 
Cambodian government and 34 to 6 against President Ford's request lor 
extra money for South Vietam for the next three months. 

WASHINGTON (AP) A $5.9-billion bill said by its sponsors to be 
capable of creating 900,000 jobs directly and as many more indirectly *ll!> 

passed Wednesday by the House. 
Key Republicans attacked the measure as a budget-busting delusion. A ml. 

even before the House acted, Speaker Carl Albert, D-Okla., publicly urged 
President Ford not to veto it. 

The bill, which goes to thcSenatc.would make appropriations for a variel > 
of programs already authorized but never fully funded by Congress. 

HARRISBURG, Pa. (AP) U.S. Atty. John Cottonc went to the grand 
jury Thursday following reports that fugitive-heiress Patricia Hearst recently 
had been in hiding in a Pennsylvania farmhouse, where her fingerprints were 
said to have been found. 

NEW YORK, N.Y. (AP) Dr. Hollis S. Ingraham, commissioner ol the 
state Health Department from 1963 to 1974, declared Thursday that the 
majority of proprietary nursing homes deliver "good care." 

Testifying before the Temporary State Commission on Living Costs, he-
said the nursing home industry in 1966 had been a "disaster area." 

"But patient care in the homes since has been improving and today the 
majority give good care," he said. 

NEW YORK (AP) The state medical society recommended Thursday a 
sweeping series of changes to deal with the malpractice insurance crisis. 
including a longoerm plan to take such cases entirely out of the courts. 

Among shorf-fifrli proposals to ease the problem, the society proposed a 
shorter statute'onffnitation on malpractice suits, limiting attorneys' fees to a 
fixed sliding scale, and a definition of medical malpractice. 

The Medical Society of the Stale of New York, MSSNY, sent its 
recommendations to the stale legislature, which is faced with making some 
change in the malpractice insurance system by July I. 

ALBANY, N.Y. (AP) Democratic legislators elected a Puerto Rican, a 
woman and a Jew to the state Board of Regents late Tuesday in an 
unorthodox joint session boycotted by Republican senators and in which 
Republican assemblymen refused to vote or nominate their own candidates. 

The election was over at 10 p.m., and was subjected to long delays and 
heated procedural squabbles in which legislators engaged in shouting 
matches with one another and with the lieutenant governor. 

ALBANY, N,Y, (AP) Gov. Hugh Carey said today he has decided to 
allow the federal government to assume most of the responsibility for job 
safety and health inspections in New York State. 

I he stale Labor Department currently handles the task. 
The announcement means that at least some and perhaps as. many as 

half of the state's 450 inspectors are virtually certain to lose their jobs after 
June 30. 

And that, in turn, would mean a sharp decline in the number of inspections 
performed across the slate each year. 

Compiled by Cheryl Wagner & Mali Kaufman 
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Greer Speaks on "Feminism and Fertility" 

Overflow Crowd 
by Betty Stein 

"Being feminist is almost like be­
ing pregnant—it's very difficult to be 
a little feminist," quipped Germainc 
Greer during her talk last Wednes­
day night in LC-7. Greer's an­
nouncement of her unlikely topic, 
"Feminism and Fertility," drew reac­
tions of mild surprise from the 
audience of about six hundred. But 
her talk—incisive, witty, and often 
cutting-was well-received by the 
mostly female audience. 

"There are two sorts of pregnan­
cy." said Greer. The first is the 
positive kind: "When you really 
want a child to be pregnant is to 
assert yourself." The negative or 
"unwanted pregnancy is more like 
cancer. It's disgusting . . . an 
obscenity." 

"The difference is like the 
difference between loving sexual in­
tercourse and rape," Greer con­
tinued . "You men will have to stretch 
your imaginations,' she said, taking 
on II sarcastic tone and asking them 
to imagine a situation in which they 
"could manage to ball, but would 
rather not." 

"There is a crass assumption that 
feminists are against birth." Greer 
denied this was true, saying, 
"Feminism is not anli-nalalism. 
When feminists struggle fdnrVe'rlght 
to control our owH'troiiies we lire 
protesting compulsory childbirth , 
which is quite a different thing." 

Using as an example the case of 
Boston physician. Dr. Kenneth 
Edelin. who was recently convicted 
of murdering a 24-weck-old fetus 
during a late-term abortion, Greer 
spoke out against those who would 
deny any woman an abortion. "Why 
was that pregnancy terminated so 
late'.'" she asked, raising her voice, "1 
would sue every single institution 
that denied that woman an abortion. 
'Do it'—in the immortal words of 
Abby Hoffman—sue them all; sue 
even the woman's mother." 

"There are so many females, most­
ly virgins, representing the fetus; I 
think the fetus is well-represented," 
remarked Greer, lashingoutat anti-
abortionists. "The peopleconcerned 
about the Ictus are those least con­
cerned about the unborn." 

"The best abortion is ihe least 
traumatic, fastest, and most ef­

ficient," slated Greer, who went on 
to say that abortion has been 
historically important, while con­
traception has not. According to her, 
some types of contraception arc ac­
tually forms of "early abortion." 

"It is the medical profession's 
cherished belief that only the doctor 
knows exactly how we work; only 
the doctorcan takecarc of our plum­
bing," said Greer, who described the 
sterilization of three black women by 
tubal ligation following Cacsaren 
birth. 

"While many of you in the 
audience choose not to exercise your 
fertility, it is also something you 
would fight to the death to have," she 
exclaimed. 

"Gynecology is still 500 years 
behind brain surgery," she said, ad­
ding bitterly. "We can keep old men 
alive but can't care for women with 
simple disorders." Greer criticized 
what she called the "illusion that 
doctors will help you do what you 
want to do. We arc alltyrranizcdby 
the mystique of the expert." 

We have lived most of our lives in 
an amoral universe,"shesaid."We do 
things because we feel we ought to." 
She went on to articulate hcrviews 
concerning the way women are 
treated by society in general; "1 think 
thctiling 1 resent most about the op­
pression of women is that we arc 
denied nobility. The only nobility 
open to us is that sincere nobility of 
oppressed people." 

Greer expressed concern for what 
she called the "spiritual tyranny" 
under which women are forced to 
live. "My interest," she said, "is in. 
the quality of life I and mypeople are 
allowed to live." 

Greer's smooth Australian accent 
held her audience spellbound for 
some two hours. Her talk included 
many allusions to oppressed women 
in India and the Third World, using 
some of her own experiences to paint 
a frighteningly vivid picture of the 

injustices that overwhelm their 
everyday lives. 

An outspoken feminist and author 
of The Female Eunuch, Greer has 
long been at the forefront of the 
women's movement. She recently 
delivered the keynote address at the 
United Nations in commemoration 
of International Women's Year. 

Above: Feminist Germaine Greer 
speaks out on women's rights to 
have abortions, and freedom 
from oppression. "Whie many of 
you in the audience khose not to 
exercise your fertility, It la also 
something you would fight to the 
death to have," she said. Though 
many men heard Greer, she 
spoke mainly to the women In the 
audietjef. .Right: SUNYA 
students both male and female, 

listen patiently. 

Rebels Protest Patroon Prices 
A Feature Analysis by Vinny Reda 

This is the second student 
revolution!" the rebel leader had told 
me a few days before. As a reporter, I 
was immediately aroused. "On 
Tuesday, March llth," he con­
tinued, "over 200 will demonstrate 
en masse at the Patroon Room." 

The plan was simple, really. Fill all 
the tables of the Patroon Room with 
students, so that faculty could not sit 
down. Then have each student, from 
11 a.m. until 2 p.m., order nothing 
but coffee from the 25 cent, never-
empty pot. 

From there, however, the 

Student David Coyne talks, with faculty University Collage Advisor John Levato and HCO 
professor John Qunn. 

kuthn 

possibilities could be endless. 
Bloody insurrections. Flying cups 
and saucers. Upheaved bureaucracy. 
Overturned urns — all because this 
restaurant in the campus center is 
losing $13,000 a year. 

FS A makes up the difference, and 
that is why the rebels, many 
members of the Student Associa­
tion, were calling the demonstration. 
It seems that FSA aids losing es­
tablishments with the surplus it gets 
from student meal plans. 

Student board costs are going up 
next year, so the rebels do not want 
to subsidize the faculty-used 
Patroon Room any longer, at their 
own expense. They would now 
frustrate faculty members by ruining 
their lunch hours. The tension would 
be high, and 1 was thrilled when my 
editor allowed me to get into the 
thick of it. 

On Tuesday, at 10:40 a.m.. I 
entered rebel headquarters in Ihe 
Campus Center, to find six 
revolutionaries - five men. one 
woman - engaged in last minute 
strategy. These were anxious 
moments for all present in Ihe small 
smoke-filled room. 

"Would you like to smoke some of 
this?" asked a burly fellow at my 
side. 

"Uh, no thanks. I plan on keeping 
my head while all around are losing 
theirs." 

Twenty minutes later, the leaders, 
myself, and about 60 followers stood 
outside the door to the Patroon 
Room. Press-releases on the rebel's 
positions were being passed around. 

One small attractive girl with long 
dark hair, showed strain as sheshov-
ed one of the papers into some guys 
hands. "Puss this to somebody," she 

said. Then louder, she cried, "pass 
this to somebody! I don't want to get 
stuck with it!" 

It was now 11:05, "Calm down 
everybody," said Jay Miller, 
member of CAUSE (Committee 
Against University Student Ex­
ploitation), to his increasingly 
grumbling troops; "they usually 
open the doors at ten after, so let's 
wait another five minutes." 

"There's probably about 60 tables, 
spread out," yelled another. 

"Don't let there be any all-faculty 
tables!" 

One stocky fellow with brown friz­
zy hair and a red FuManchu 
muslache, said to his friends, "This 
stuff better come off, that's all I 
know." 

A Channel 6 cameraman had 
shown up. A short round-laced 
fellow, he had a bulky old camera 
strapped to his back. A microphone 
was also attached to the parapher­
nalia, now extending a foot over his 
head. 

Jon l.cvensun.a tall,good looking 
.insurgent with curly hair was ex­
plaining the rebels' position tp/him, 
in the now crowded area near the 
restaurant's entrance, 

The cameraman interrupted once 
to say. "did you saysomelhingabout 
coffttT 

Suddenly, a middle-aged woman 
with brown curly hair, stuck her 
head out from the entrance and 
smiled, saying "soon as 1 get the 
cream on the tables, we'll open up." 
A cheer rose from the crowd for her 
galantry under pressure. 

Upon entering, I began question­
ing this woman, who turned out to 
be Jan Thompson, hostess of the 

continued on page S 
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Miller Brewing Go. Plans Ecology Drive Here 
by Roxannt Retadi 

Miller Brewing Company wants 
to rid itself of the image that all big 
businesses are unconcerned 
polluters of the environment. In a 
soon-to-be launched i contest and 
ecology drive called Pick-Em-Up, 
Miller Brewing ' Company will 
attempt to establish a continuous, 
recycling program on the SUNYA 
campus. 

"Brewers are not the big, bad guys 
environmentalists make us out to 
be," said Glenn Griffo, Albany area 
manager for Miller Brewing Com­
pany. "Cannersand bottlers are run­
ning into tremendous resistance 
from environmentalists who want 
ideal solutions. We're trying to find 
feasible methods of cleaning up the 
environment." 

While beverage containers ac­
count for only 20% of the total 
volume of litter, less than 2% of this 
waste is recycled. Instead, beverage 
container waste goes into open 
dumps, sanitary landfills, in­
cinerators and sewer systems. These 
disposal methods create their own 
environmental problems. Open 
dumps breed, germs,• insects and 
disease-carrying rodents as well us 
pose fire hazards. Landfills, even 
when properly handled, can emit 
methane gas us well as pollute the 
underlying water. 

"We're trying to find an nlter-
native solution to disposing of can 
and bottle litter through our recycl­
ing program." Griffo said. The Pick-
Em-Up contest, which started in the 
spring of 1973 on the campuses of 
Louisiana State University, Florida 
University and the University of 
Rhode Island, is an ecology drive in­
tended lo get campus groups to 
collect beverage contuincr litter for 
recycling. The program is being run 
by the Miller Reclamation Com­
pany, a subsidiary of the Miller 
Brewing Company. Presently, full 
year reclamation programs operate 
on eighty college campuses 
throughout the United States. 

While onlyMillerproducts will be 
counted in the contest, Miller Brew­
ing Company will collect all other 

brand name aluminum cans picked 
up throughout the community. 
"This clean-up activity will en­
courage local restaurant owners, 
pub owners and other breweries to 
be more ecology-minded," Griffo 
said. 

The Pick-Em-up contest will 
become a year-round recycling 
program at the end of the contest 
period, March 19th to May 7th. 
Cans and bottles collected by cam­
pus groups will be picked up weekly 
by the local Millerdistributor. From 
the campus, the beverage container 
litter will be sent to Reynolds 
Aluminum, Alcoa and various glass 
manufacturers for recycling treat­
ment. 

"The program is not a drinking 
contest but a serious ecology drive 
intended to clean up the environ­
ment," said Griffo. "We're not look­
ing to fool the public. We're es­
tablishing a program that will 
benefit the campus and the com­
munity as well as ourselves," he add­
ed. 

"It's a compromise," agreed Rick 
Sabilia.a SUNYA student and cam­
pus representative of the Miller 
Reclamation program. "Big business 
is trying to help out without strangl­
ing themselves. We're trying to com­
bine economic welfare and en­
vironmental welfare." 

Environmentalists' criticism of 
waste-producing industries is often 
unjustified according to Woody Eu-
tt.fi, manager of the college 
marketing department of the 
Milwaukee-based Miller Brewing 
Company. "Our glass bottles have 
clean bottoms which lack the usual 
inscription 'no deposit, no return'. 
The bottles are recyclable and 

TELETHON 75 
hi the CC Ballroom 

8p.m. Friday to 8p.m. Saturday 

24 HOURS 

refillable. We're the only brewery 
with all aluminum cans rather than 
steel ones which are harder to recy­
cle. In addition, our other packaging 
materials have the potential to be 
recyclable." 

Yet, some'ecology-minded people 
object to the packaging of beverages 
in any type of can -aluminum, steel, 
or otherwise. "There shouldn't be 
cans to begin with," said Lynne 
Jackson, A SUNYAjuniorin charge 
of PYE's recycling program. 
"M iller's program is just a stopgap 
method. People have to be educated 
that it would be better for the en­
vironment to use bottles." It takes 

less energy and expense to have 
bottles recycled than to make and 
reuse aluminum cans, she said. 

"It would be more beneficial in the 
long run if students lobbied to get the 
ibottle bill passed," Jackson said. 
The bottle bill, presently on file in 
the New York State Assembly and 
Senate, proposes mandatory 
deposits on all beer and soft-drink 
cans and bottles. The bill, if passed, 
would require beverage companies 
to use containers of uniform design 
for reuse by more than one beverage 
manufacturer. All beverage con­
tainers with tab tops or other 
detachable devices would also be 

to have banned. 
ike and Jackson believes it is unrealisticlo 
jjd. expect students to save up a bag of 
ialinthe cans for future collection. Instead, 
ogetthe people will continue to pollute the 
>n said, environment with these non-
n file in degradablc cans, she said. Snlbilia, 
ibly and campus representative for the Miller 
idatory program, feels that strong student 
ift-drink and community involvement in the 
passed, recycling drive would cut down on 

mpanies aluminum can litter. "The question 
n design whether a can is bio-degradablc 
leverage wouldn't bean issue ifpcoplcpicked 
ge con- up cans," Sabilia said. "We're trying 
r other to meet the environmentalists hall 
also be way. You have to start somewhere." 
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Irish Jig Dance Contest • 

New York Style Soft Pretzels 
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COME YE OVER "AND PUT YOUR NOSE TO 

THE "BLARNEY STONE" 
here with us at the 
RATHSKELLER 

your window lies the Valley of 
the Hudson. 

Ten Broeck Manor was con­
ceived around a basic idea: One 
of life's greatest pleasures is to 
relax and enjoy a beautiful view 
from a quiet place that is your 
own home. 

It's like living in the country 
with the city next door. 

Directions: 
Take Interstate 90 (East, if west 

of Albany; West if east of Albany) 
to Exit 6 (South Mall); left at 
light; take next left onto North­
ern Blvd.; right onto North Man­
ning Blvd.; 1st right onto Lark 
Street; pass Ten Broeck II; left 
on Colonie Street; follow signs to 
Model Apartment, E-2. 

For information call 465-2449 
or call the Albany Housing Infor­
mation Center. 

• B u s Mr 

s 
t 
a 
o 
S 

cto 

\F I 
CIO 

1 

AII Ki/nfil lltiiisint) f* | 
Opiiorliuiih/ hcrcltiiHiwiit 4st 9 

Modal apartment open Mon.- Fri. 

PAGE FOUR ALBANY STUDENT PRESS 

come help us celebrate 

SAINT P/VTR |̂C'S D/^ 

at the RATHSKELLER 
campus center 

MONDAY MARCH 17th 
happy hour % pnffo? pm • •'. • 

plus A SPECIAL FEATURE > 
7 pm to 11 pm .'': -£r 

Plaviffgfor 'Yqtff" j /^Specigi Green Day 
>§n concert < \ /&$ /Prices: 

Your Own Group", • , hud*ti*r * 
^mfmm Dutch Quad • 'VW .p.in. AS pitcher 1.7} 

n, JAMBALAtAW I AJ 
{••':•••':'/ \ , , Genestp Cream,Ale 
^i? i& |w" . IQIH-JS pitcher IS} 

"•''•' fi \ '' \ - ' V 
Irish Jig Dance Contest • 

New York Style Soft Pretzels 

yy-jr-y: • 

WJ| j||L 
COME YE OVER AND PUT YOUR NOSE TO 

THE "BLARNEY STONE" 
here with us at the 
RATHSKELLER 

cWaKgup. 
cMove to the country side of the city 

Remember those wonderful 
days when there was time to 
settle back and enjoy a long, 
peaceful look at the world? 

Come back to those days. You'll 
find them at Ten Broeck Manor. 
Here are apartments in the 
country style. Serene simplicity 
and warm textures all around 
you. Sunlight streams into your 
lofted living room. And below 
your window lies the Valley of 
the Hudson. 

Ten Broeck Manor was con­
ceived around a basic idea: One 
of life's greatest pleasures is to 
relax and enjoy a beautiful view 
from a quiet place that is your 
own home. 

It's like living in the country 
with the city next door. 

Directions: 
Take Interstate 90 (East, if west 

of Albany; West if east of Albany) 
to Exit 6 (South Mall); left at 
light; take next left onto North­
ern Blvd.; right onto North Man­
ning Blvd.; 1st right onto Lark 
Street; pass Ten Broeck II; left 
on Colonie Street; follow signs to 
Model Apartment, E-2. 

For information call 465-2449 
or call the Albany Housing Infor­
mation Center. 

AII til/mil llonsiiii/ 
()})jH)i1nnit(i l)c 

1,2, and 3 bedroom apartments, 
including every major appliance. 
Living rooms with cathedral ceil­
ings. Each apartment has its own 
private patio or balcony. 

• Electricity and heat included in rent . 

• Economical laundry centers. 

• 24-hour security patro l . 

• Ceramic tile baths. 

• Landscaped pat io a n d play a rea. 

• Bus line at door. 

r 

nr 

I 

L J 
••> ^ ^ The Stuyvesant 

l"l""n» I S l 2 bedroom $ 1 8 6 

Model apartment open Mon.- Fri. 9-5. Sat. 9-3, ft Sun. 12-4 

Comparison Shows Patroon 
Room Food Prices Lowest 

by Susan Michael 
One of the demands students have 

presented to the F.S.A., which is 
responsible for all food service 
(among other things) on campus, is 
that prices at the Patroon Room (on 
the second floor of the Campus 
Center) be raised to prices of com­
parable establishments in the urea or 
that services be reduced so that 
Patroon Room is able to break even 
on its own. The prices given on the 

following table arc taken from the 
menus of those establishments. The 
table cannot say anything about ser­
vice or atmosphere, and although 
the writer has never eaten at any of 
them, the Patroon Room is a very 
pleasant place and the service is sup­
posed to be quiet good, bum's and 
Piatt's Place are on Wolf Road in 
Albany, Lerner'sand Howard John­
son's are in fhcStuyvesant Shopping 
Plaza on Fuller Road. 

Chattering Chimpanzees 
. . . . r. .:'.-'• .- 1 . 1 . . . . L . . . 1 . 

(ZNS) Planet of the Apes may be 
closer than we think 

Two baby chimpanzees, each 
placed in the homes of a deaf couple 
and raised from birth alongside the 
couple's own infants, are reported to 
be learning sign language as quickly 
as the human babies do. 

According to two University of 
Nevada Psychologists, Doctors 
Allen and Beatrice Gardner, the two 
chimps were each placed in the 
homes of a deaf couple who com­
municated with their babies only 
through sign language. 

The Gardners found that both the 
human and chimpanzee infants 
began making signs such as "come" 
or "gimme" at the age of three 
months, whereas most human babies 
won't utter thi first word until they 
are about one year old. 

Jabbering Chimps 
The Gardners report that after six 

months, the baby chimps were 
jabbering away with their fingers at 
the human infants much faster than 
other chimps had learned to com­
municate in sign language with 
humans before. 

Tm. mothe* macJs <*• 
bijdbly-kwfc F«H,ilY " " * ' 
wttick suKvivts poverty, 

U*1*l,ness, baJc-briJdnj 

formig thorns onJ 
tlejpaiK. 

T W fwof"io"t joy 
at bit fathtV. rciuM 
is beautiful bo 
bcMd. 

B _.•** Comput 
Kwnkovm Camp ia 
admission F/?ee. 

"+:oop.m. L.C. 

7:00 p.m. 

SRubtwKeR 
all.-mam 

Lounge 

Chefs Salad 

Reuben Sandwich 

Sirloin Steak 

Hambtirger with French Fries 

Cheeseburger with French Fries 

Roast Beef Sandwich 

Corned Beef Sandwich 

Patroon 
Room 

$1.70 

1.75 

1.25 

1.25 

1.35 

1.20 

1.25 

Lum'i 

$1.75 

3.65 

1.49 

1.65 

1.29 

Howard 
Johnum'i 

$2.95' 

2.25 

1.95* 

2.10* 

1.65 

Lcmcr'i 

2.75 

Tuna Sandwich 

Ice Cream Sundae 

1.15 

.45 

Coffee 

.95 

.70 

.50 

.25 

1.45 

.95 

.95 

1.95 

1.95 

1.25 

Plait's 

Place 

$2.05 

2.55 

1.40 

1.50 

1.75 

1.75 

1.75 

.25 

•coleslaw also included '•bottomless cup 

Low Prices Precipitate Patroon Protest 
•continued from page 3 
Patroon Room. Little did I realize 
that 1 was blocking the cameraman's 
shot of the revolutionaries coming 
through the doorway of the 
restaurant. I slipped away under ver­
ba I fire. 

I went to the end of the Patroon 
Room near the bar and sal at a small 
table next to a guy with red hair, a 
see-through mustache, and a flannel 
shin. W i»atain« was Perry Wolfson, 
and-wecTOiindered coffee. 

Wlnlc wailing for it. I went over lo 
live opinionated, former Central 

Councilchairperson,David. Coyne 
and asked how he thought things 
were going. "I'm disappointed right 
now," he replied. There's less than a 
hundred here,although more may be 
coming." 

The cameraman's light was 
suddenly on usand I began 10 nodal 
David without thinking about what 
he was saying. When the cameraman 
noticed thai I wasstill nodding while 
David drank col Ice. he turned off his 
light and walked away. 

Hack at my own table. Perry 
observed, "it's pretty good. I think.' 

llmupomt 75-70 
needs researchers, writers, 
graphics and layout people. 

WE'RE STARTING WORK NOW! 
So, if you're interested, call: 

Donna (457-5231) 
or 

Bob (457-4754) 
limited l>\ xtuilem association 
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Jewish Students Coalition presents: tf& 

"Simulation 6me on tiio Plight i! 
of tiio Russian Jews" 

Sunday, March 16 5:15 pm 

Please be prompt 

Ed. 127 

MM Seder 
8:15 pm C.C. Assembly Hall 

Come to one or both! limited by smilciu auociuiiotc 

M 

"The turn out'.'" 
"No, the coffee. Have you tasted it 

yet'.'" Perry pulled out a white 
paper hag as i drank my coffee. "My 
lunch." he said. "No sense having to 
suffer more than we arc already. 
Want a peanut butter and jelly 
sandwich?' 

I look one. The guy with Ihc l-ti 
Manchu looked at me from across 
the room and said "had" to me, He 
thought I had bought the sandwich. 1 
would have been a fool to. It was 
stale, and there were some crunchy 
brittle things in a 

I opened it up. 1 hings that looked 
like piece', ol purple-tinted glass 
stared up at inc. 

"Bacon bits." interjected Perry, 
who had observed that I wasabout 
to leap at In-, throat. "Hut don't 
worry, they're kosher bacon bits." 

"I appreciate that. Perry." lie u.u, 
really a nice guy, loo nict lot this 
kind ol work. He kepi asking il 
anyone had gotten the cameraman a 
cup ol coffee. 

A little later, as our waitress. 
Cathy, was poui ing nn loath cup. 1 
., Ved her it she had down . 
beforehand ol the protest. 

"What protest'.'" she answered, 
"t'li. this thing going on here." 
"What's going on here'.'" 
"Uh. well, hec-hee. nothing I 

guess. Joke's on me." She obviously 
had been trained to withstand even 
Ihc sternest ol interrogations. She 
coldly handed us our checks for 27 
cents and turned lo leave. 

Perry slopped her short and ask­
ed. "Do you know what 20% of 27 
ccol* i' so I know how much lip to 
leave. She shook her head no, and 
lei i 

Perry turned to me and queried, 
"that was a mean thing for me to say 
wasn't it'.'" He was worried iwhat 1 
might write about him in the paper. 

"Listen Perry.' 1 answered, "can't 
sou see that you're in a stale of 
revolt. I'm ashamed to say that that's 
the first revolting thing I've seen you 
do here. Buckle up man; there may 
he action now any minute." 

To be continued . •. 

ORIENTAL RUG 
SHOWING 

Scutter and Room Sim 
including: 

Qum, Xain, Kmltath 
Sarauk, Tabriz, Bokhara 

Fri. March 14, 9-9 
Sat. March 15, y-5 

Howfilower Minor Inn, Wolf lioad\ 
Colonic 

LOUDON RUG GALLERY 
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; TAX EVASION 
(ZNS) Marin Tnnquffli, • 64-

yctf-oU pacifist, wai releued from a , 
California prison this week afteraer-
ving seven-and-a-half montht for 
refutini to pay taxes to support the 
war. 

Tranquilli was sentenced to prison 
last year for claiming anti-war 
organizations as dependents during 
the years 1970 through 1972. 

She reports the government is now 
trying to sue her for $5439 in taxes 
and penalties it claims she owes. 
Tranquilli says, however, that Uncle 
Sam hasn't a chance of getting the 
back tax money. 

The anti-war activist says she gave 
all of her tax money away to poor 
people in Mississippi rather than 
have it impounded by the Govern­
ment and spent on guns and bullets. 
She reports she is now living on 
social security. 

Asked what she did in prison, 
Tranquilli said, among other things, 
she had a high school course in 
crime. Said Tranquilli, "I've learned 
how to rip-off food stamps, how to 
hold up a store and lots more." 

MYSTERIOUS 
MANSLAUGHTER 

(ZNS) A pedestrian in Scotland 
was sentenced to jail this week on 
charges that he literally frightened 
another man to death. 

The pedestrian, John Taylor, 
pleaded guilty to charges of making 
threatening behavior toward a 63-
year-old motorist Andrew Davis. 

The incident occurred when 
Taylor stepped out in front of 
Davis's car last September and the 
car came to a screeching halt, barely 
missing Taylor. 

Taylor apparently became enrag­
ed at this. He opened the car door, 
dragged Davis out, struggled with 
him and then tried to let the air out of 
the car's tires. 

Davis, shocked by what was 
happening, suffered a heart attack 
and died on the spot. 

PELVIS'S PLANE 
(ZNS) Elvis Presley is probably 

regretting the day he got involved 
with Robert Vesco. 

It all started when Elvis made a 
down payment on a lavish 707 jet 
once owned by the fugitive financier. 
The $1.5 million plane includes two 
dance floors, a sauna hath and two 
large private bedrooms. 

The Pelvis was ready to claim the 
jet when he received a worning from 
one of Vesco's companies. The 
Panama-based firm warned Elvis 
that if he bought the plane, and then 
landed anywhere outside the United 
States, Vesco would have it seized. 

This was enough for Elvis; he 
quickly backed out of the deal. 

This week, however, Elvis got 
more bad news. He learned that the 
American firm which claims to own 
the jet, Fairchild General, has filed 
suit against him. The suit claims that 
Elvis backed out of the deal too late, 
and that he must now come through 
with the money for the jet. 

GENITALIA SCULPTOR 
(ZNS) A New York artist, Doug 

Johns, is probably one of the most 
unique protrait specialists you'll ever 
run across. 

Johns specializes in turning out 
exact but enlarged replicas of in­
dividual genitalia. Johns reports that 
nearly 200 men and women have 
already posed for him, and that he 
has cast perfect likenesses of their 
organs. 

Johns is collecting the replicas for 
a show he plans someday. He 
rewards each model with the first 
cast of his or her oigan. 

Johns says thai after gazing 
carefully atgenitalia for years, he has 
found that they are 0>r mure unique 
than faces or even fingerprints. 

H you think Ifodak 
b lost pretty pictures, 
you ought to hane 

your chest examined. 

When a chest x-ray shows that you have a 
potential killer like TB or cancer, it's not a pretty 
picture. But it's an important picture because it 
can help the doctor detect and catch the killer 
in time. 

When doctors are out to catch these poten­
tial killers, they want the sharpest, clearest x-ray 
films they can get. And that's why people at 
Kodak spend so many hours creating new and 
better x-ray film equipment. Already, the results 
include convenience for the patient, economy 
for the hospital, an even more useful tool for the 

radiologist-and, most important, reduced radi­
ation exposure. 

Researching and creating better x-ray films 
is good for our business, which is why we went 
into them in the first place. But it does our soci­
ety good, too-which isn't a bad feeling. After all, 
our business depends on our society—so we 
care what happens to it, 

Kodak. 
Hoit than a business. 
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Council Backs Curran's Veto of EOPSA Budget 
by Brent Khpier 

With a rare display of unity, Cen­
tral Council voted Wednesday night 
to uphold Pat Curran's veto of the 
$.13,650 EOPSA budget that had 
been passed by Council in a 
tumultuous session two nights 
before. Other action in the unusually 
short, 75-minute meeting included 
passage of a resolution of support 
for the demands of CAUSE (a/k/a 
the Student C .cvancc Group) and 
the granting of a supplemental ap­
propriation to leCercle Francais. A 
multisponsorcd bill calling lor the 
dissolution of the Student Associa­
tion government was withdrawn by 
its introducers. 

An undebatcd 26-1 decision— 
with faculty member Ralph Beisler 
casting the only negative vote—, 
demonstrated Council's endorse­
ment of Curran's strongly-worded 
veto statement. The message, which 
combined a written memorandum 
with a short address, Council 
Chairperson Lew Kidlcr's opening 
warning thai harrassment would no 
longer be tolerated at Council 
meetings. "Monday night was the 
last lime: the last time Central Coun­
cil will be railroaded into a decision; 
the last time Student Association 
will yield to inflammatory mob 
rule . . . " began Curran's state­
ment. The SA President went on to 
denounce intimidation through the 
use of "personal insults" and 
"charges of racism" as well as by 
physical threat or action. — 

Curran's declarations < refer* to 
Monday's emergency Council 
meeting, in which EOPSA members 

barricaded the doors of the Campus 
Center Assembly Hall, refusing exit 
'to Council members unless the EOP­
SA demands were met. By contrast, 
Wednesday's meeting, which was 
held in the Campus Center cafeteria 
to accommodate an expected crowd 
spectators, was unusually placid. 

Council's approval of Curran's 
veto has the effect of turning the 
clock back to last Sunday, when 
Budget Committee recommended 
that the 1975-76 EOPSA allocation 
be $7000, some $30,000 less than re­
quested It is expected that the EOP­
SA budget will come up for approval 
in April along with those of the other 
SA groups. 

The events of the past week have 
had widespread effects within SA. 
Half or Budgei Committee, in­
cluding chairperson Mark Golds­
tein, have submitted rcsignationsand 
several members of Central Council 
reportedly may follow them. More 
importantly, officers of SA and 
EOPSA have been persuaded to 
schedule a series of meetings among 
themselves and members of faculty 
and administration to work out the 
differences between the two groups. 
Optimism can be seen in EOPSA 
President Fred Stokelin's declara­
tion of cooperation from his group 
and faith that problems in the 
budgetting process can be solved 
through interaction. 

Due to the amount of time that 
they were required to devote to the 
EOPSA J8sue,SAjofficcrs were forc-

•ed.,toihavc last Wednesday's l-'SA 
Board of Directors meeting called 
off. 

SA President Pat Curran, at Wednesday nights Central Council meeting vetoed the legislative 
body's $35,650 EOPSA appropriation. 

Library Workshop Series to Commence 
The School of Library and Infor­

mation Science at State University 
of New York.at Albany will sponsor 
a scries of three one-day workshops 
on the last three Fridays in April. On 
the 11tli. Professor Irving Klempner 
of the facultywillconduct a workshop 
on "Access to Federal Government 
Research Reports" in which the 
bibliographic structures, missions, 
and overlapping services of such 
agencies as NI IS, ERICDDC, 
NASA, AEC, and the Government 
Printing Office will be examined. 
The Freedom of Information Law 
also will be discussed. 

The second workshop, on Apr. IK, 
is designed to explore the principles 
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of indexing and abstracting as ex­
emplified in tools familiar to most 
librarians. Coordinated by Lucille 
Whalen, the workshop will include 
an opening session on general prin­
ciples of indexing by Jane Stevens, 
former ed i to r of "Library 
Literature" and visiling lecturer at 
SUNYA, and a panel on specific 
abstracting and indexing problems. 

On Apr. 25, Professor Joseph 
Mo relic ad and Le Roy C. 
Schwarzhopf. documents librarian 
at the McKcldin Library, University 
of Maryland, will co-direct a 
w o r k s h o p on " C u r r e n t 
Developments in Federal and Un­
ited Nations Documents." Sessions 

i x u m i B f l BaBsoBCBeaaaaspg 

will cover such topics as depository 
l i b r a r i e s . the G . P . O . 
Micropublishing Program, sources 
of U.N. and specialized agency 
documentnr >n, and UNDEX, a 
c o m p u t e r - a s s i s t e d indexing 
program for U.N. documentation. 

Si.sions for all workshops will 
begin at 9:30 a.m., preceded by 
registration and coffee at 9. The cost 
for each is $10. Those interested in 
an application and further informa­
tion may call 457-8575 or write 
Workshops, School of Library and 
Inlonnalion Science, Stale Universi­
ty of New York at Albany, Albany, 
12222. 

The SUNYA Nite Club & Discotheque 
Invites you again to an evening of unlimited, unrivaled, fun & enjoyment 

Featuring SLIPSHAKE, a , i v e b a n d P'ay'm9 progressive party & funky music 

Also non-stop dancing disco music " O n l y So M u c h O i l i n the Ground" , 

an exciting dance contest, prizes, and good people 

Yes, all this happens 

Saturday, March 15 

Brubacher Hall, Snack Bar 

Drink to 3 am 

Admission: $1.00 w/tax or ID $1.50 w/out tax or ID 

Please bring tax or ID 

Do Come, People, Get Down and "Release Yourself" 

HOSTS: Julian Riley, Beau "OTB" Beller, Rick Sabllla, Sam Horowitz, 
Marvin Church, "Starman" Reedom, Eddie Diaz, Steve Klein, Marc 
Benecke, Birthday Kid, Ed Williams, Al T., Mike Emerson, Crazy Dave 

HOSTESSES: Helen Wllborn, Diana Castillo, Laurie Fisher 

This event Is sponsored In conjunction with the "Friends" organization, 
the SUNYA Nite Club & Discotheque and your student tax 

\rT-rr~~™-"-mr^rmri* M w n B <n>rmca 

'funded by student association 
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eel to r la I. / comment 
^ o S ^ i t i X * * " •«"«>•» , i m e i «he.Ia»t time CentralCouncilwill be railroaded into a 

decision. —PatCiirran, Student Association President, 

in a statement, in which he vetoed the EOPSA budget which Council passed 
Monday night. 

More Than Tactics 
The recent controversy surrounding EOPSA and SA has been concentrated on the 

issues of procedures and tactics. There is far more to the issue than that, however. The 
key to the entire situation is whether or not EOPS A deserves to be funded. And there is 
little doubt that it does. 

The principle of there being a group programming black cultural events is based on 
the assumption that the existing mechanisms for programming are not able to serve the 
black students' needs. This is not to say that blacks do not see movies put on by Albany 
State Cinema (they do) or are never seen at Dutch Quad parties (they are), but simply 
that there are certain kinds of cultural events that are important to the members of 
EOPSA and simply not that important to the people running these and other 
organizations. To force EOPSA to haggle with Concert Board in order to convince 
them to put on one group or the other would be to ignore basic differences in cultural 
orientation 

There is not enough communication between blacks and whites at this University to 
make it likely that whitescontrollingprogramming will understand what is needed by 
the black student body here. If there was continuous communication there would never 
have been an EOPSA. That the Executive Branch Budget Committee would suggest a 
cut from $37,000 to $7,000 with so little discussion is indicative of a paucity of contact 
between the two groups. That decision deserved far more discussion and thought than 
it received. And it is hoped that they would realize after p roper investigation, that a cut 
of that magnitude was completely unwarranted. 

It is no surprise that EOPSA doesn't trust S A when that kind of unthinking action is 
taken. It indicates the inherent weakness in the budget system itself that was debated 
by SA President Pat Curran and EOPSA President Fred Stokelin in their joint 
statement on page 10 today. 

The imprisoning of Central Council Monday is completely inexcusable but it is an 
effect, not a cause. 

The details of funding EOPSA, the exact amount funded and the degree of spending 
freedom allowed the group, are other issues that are subsidiary to the basic issue of 
funding them. The funding itself has been questioned because it appears inefficientto 
have two differenlgroupspursuing speakers, two different groups organizing concerts, 
and other overlapping when it could be avoided by eliminating most of EOPSA. But 
this outlook ignores the lack of communication, and i communication', essential before 
that kind of "efficiency" would make sense.. - .-

To Save by Destroying 
Politicians were never known for their reasoning powers, but recent statements 

from the Ford administration seem to indicate things may be worse than originally 
thought. 

In an effort to avert a Cambodian "bloodbath" when the insurgents takeoverin the 
near future, Ford has proposed we try to extend the present American-financed 
bloodbath going on there. Though one might think that the greatest concern in Ford's 
mind is to save lives, in. truth he is proposing that thousandsmorcdieand thousands 
more suffer, and at our tax-payer'scxpense. 

Spending money for: armaments and talking about being humanitarian is quite 
absurd; saving Cambodia by sending guns and bullets is analogous to helping your 
friend get home faster by pushing him out a window. It is encouraging to note the 
stance House Democrats have taken against aid to Cambodia. It is hoped that if there 
is aid it will be in the form of food or other non-military assistance. 
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In Washington: 

Thousands Excluded 
From Clemency Program 

S K S s ^ K - S * : * : ^ ^ Ron Hmiren&i®®8®®8^XS*^ 

Errata 
Louis Welch was mistakenly referred toas Vice-President for Research in Tuesday's 

issue. He is Vice-President for Univesity Affairs. Also, the column From theCapttol: 
called "Pressed for Time" was written by David Lerner. 
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Some 7,500 Americans in Canada, together 
with smaller numbers in other countries of 
Europe and Asia, may be excluded from 
participating in the President's amnesty 
program by the U.S. Immigration and 
Naturalization Service (INS). 

These men are primarily Vietnam war 
resisters who have been in their host countries 
long enough to have become naturalized 
citizens (in thecaseofCanada, five years), and 
who are deemed by INS to be alien "who have 
departed from or who have remained outside 
the United States to a void or evade training or 
service in the armed forces." 

The President's clemency program 
specifically excludes from participation 
persons whose situation Ills that quote, which 
is from u section of the immigration and 
nationality law in the United States Code (8 
U.S.C. IIK2 (u) (22)). 

And although the law and case history arc 
hazy, leaving plenty of room to help 
thousands of these young men who might 
otherwise participate in the clemency 
program, the INS has so far steadfastlyrefuscd 
to bend. 

Moreover, many of these men- have never 
been charged with evading the draft or 
anything else, and in many instances, where 
charges have been brought, cases have been 
dismissed or dropped. 

To cap the dunce, INS has created a 
situation in which the burden of proof fulls not 
upon the government but upon the 7,500. That 
is, the assumption that these Americans left 
to avoid thcdraft.and if that isn't the case then 
it's up to the person who left to prove it, 

If that doesn't sound to you like the way 
courts are supposed to operate, there's u 
reason for it: note that these decisions are 
made administratively, not judicially, The 
only effective recourse is appeal to a punel of 
administrative law judges, u sort of quasi-

judicial post under the aegis not of the courts 
but of the executive branch. Thus to date, no 
one has seen a way to help these men through 
the courts and so they have been prohibited 
from participating in the clemency program, 
from living here, even from coming here to 
attend a family funeral even though no 
charge whatsoever muyave been humiiln 
against them, notsomuchasaparkingl ickcl ! 

The American Civil Liberties Union has 
been working behind the scenes to find a ttaj 
to permit thousands of young Americans m 
this situation to participate in the clemeiic\ 
program. The only avenue they have 
discovered so far is to prove on u ense-by-case 
basis that,even though these men have become 
naturalized citizens of their hasicountries.ilH* 
did not give up their American citizenship oi 
at least did not do so voluntarily. 

The word voluntarily is the key. One line yl 
argument that has some promise ami •> 
s m a t t e r i n g of case h i s tory on the 
adminis trat ive law level is economic 
coercion, that is, in the absence ofa e l ement 
program that would permit them to re-enlei 
the United S t a t e s , these men were 
economically forced to become miturali/ed 
citizens of their host countries in ordei to 
obtain jobs, social services, and the like. 

Hut what all this boils down towhenlhe legal 
jargon is swept away is that the Immigration 
and Naturalization Service, which could pa) 
the return of these thousands of America its hj 
adopting the rcconciliutory tone promised In 
President Ford, is instead taking the hting-oul 
road—a sort of il-yoti-don't-like-it-take-us-
to-court-and-by-lheii-thc-clemeiiey-prograin 
will-be-over-iinywny approach. 

President Ford needs to have a talk will' 
somebody over there, and with the folks at die 
Justice Department who are pushing INS to 
take the hardline, 
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Everyone Always Liked Groucho Best 
by Steve Ganz 

"Certainly I "know the names of 
the three Marx Brothers. They're 
Groucho, H'rpo, and Chico;" or 
"Oh yeah, you must mean Groucho, 
Chico and Harpo." Invariably, the 
mention of the Marx Brothers illicits 
Groucho's name numero uno. Har­
po and Chico Tile behind as if to be 
subordinate members of the trio. I 
contend, on the contrary, that Har­
po is, by far and away, the most com­
plex, sensitive and creative of all the 
others. 

Webster defines institutionalism 
as "an emphasis on organization (as 
in religion) at the expense of other 
factors." It is well recognized that the 
Marx Brothers thrive at destroying 
these institutions, wheter they be 
educational (as in lloisefcathers), 
diplomacy (Duck Soup), art 
(Animal Crackers), heroism, opera, 
etc. Their humor depends on ex­
ploding our "comfortable conformi­
ty", petty rules, and the absurdity of 
man's need to impress others, to feel 
stronger, greater, wealthier, (n.b. 
Roscoc Chandler in Animal 
Crackers), (iroueho's and Chico's 
imitation is that while they effective­
ly satire regulations and rcstictions ... 
on man's freedom, they offer lut*"' 
alternate way of life. Alter their 

laughter dies, we arc left with a feel­
ing of emptiness. Harpo, on the 
other hand, takes us a great step 
further. In addition to being a great 
comedian and a subtle satirist, he 
attempts to redefine life by 
emphasizing the "other factors" 
alluded to in the definition above. 
He strives for an underlying purity 
and innocence devoid of society's in­
stitutions, and as I will show, often 
attempts to trr scend reality com­
pletely. Hence, he constructs a uni­
que perspective of reality. 

On the surface, Harpo redefines 
life by attacking three of society's 
most acknowledged institutions; 
namely our dress code, means of 
communication and eating halts. As 
far as dress goes, his clownish attire 
might well be a form of eotintercon-
formity but I tend to think he truly 
I'cels comfortable in his outfit. He 
has no need for the "stuffy" dress 
code society often enforces. At 
limes, he blatantly satirizes it to be 
both funny and to make a point, e.g. 
the entrance of The Professor in 
Animal Crackers. Harpo appears 
cloaked in a black cape and carrying 
a cane, only to be wearing an 
'>thl*tic:!,iiijt^e*tri. 
?;^n^»g--to'-4tteMTolion "action 
speaks louder than words," he is the 

embodiment of ear perfect com­
munication. His honk,whistle, facial 
expressions and bodily contortions 
express a complete vocabulary of 
"words" as well as uninhibited 
feelings, not always permitted in our 
"emotionally-structured' society. 
Groucho and Chico continuously 
mock our language, (n.b. the famous 
"Why a Duck" scene where puns are 
landed left and right) but never truly 
communicate as sensitively as Har­
po docs. 

Music, considered to be a signifi­
cant transmitter of feelings is an in­
tegral part of his character. Often 
used in conjunction with cx-
tramusical objectives, e.g. love, 
satire, the instrument is yet another 
vehicle used for enhanced human 
understanding. 

Harpo goes even so far as to 
destroy the "fallacy" of our requiring 
three balanced meals daily. He 
replaces it with his notion ofa well 
balneal diet; including, a button 
from the jacket of a page boy for an 
appetizer, a telephone swallowed 
with the aid of a bottle of ink as an 
entree and a beverage, and a crisp 
flower for dessert (ThcCocoanuts). 

While satirizing our oftimes 
peculiar dress," language and eating 
habits(liamburgcrsand french fries 7 

times a week), he replaces it with his 
own version. There is no institution 
that Harpo doesn't have a "better 
way" for, including our dearest one-
love. 

Harpo restructures our concep­
tion of love for his is like no one 
elses. It is unlike Groucho's satirical 
though feeble attempt at lovemaking 
(n.b. (iroueho's countless scenes 
with Margaret Dumunt), nor is it 
like Chico's ceaseless physical attrac­
tion for the other sex. Neither one 
have the potential to exhibit true 
affection. Harpo, on the other hand, 
frequently displays a sincere form of 
love, although by our standards, 
"misdirected", as it is not for the love 
of a woman. The weak attempt of 
Penelope in the Cocoanuts to seduce 
Harpo with her hauture is shunned 
by Harpo, for his is truly infatuated 
with a horse. He sings to one in 
lloisefcathers (eating of its oats as 
well); sleeps with one, preferring il 
over a young girl (Duck Soup); and 
produces a picture of a horse when 
asked if he was ever in love. It is his 
contention that the questioner is in­
deed the deviant as he laughs at his 
resonse (Animal Crackers). His love 
was truly genuine. 

Maybe he found the love of a 
woman lo 'be oftimes full of 
hypocrisy, needless anxiety, etc.? 
This is probably ihe case; however, 
infrequent moments exist where he 
displays a love lor a "real" girl. I'm 
not referring lo his mad dashing 
across the sel lor the illusive blond. 
Rather along the lines of his sincere 
rendition of "Everyone Says 1 Love 
You" on the harp for Connie Bailey 
outside of her bedroom window 
(The Cocanuls). Once again, Harpo 
finds satisfying alternatives to 
society's institutions; Groucho and 
Chico offer none. 

Harpo goes much further than just 
supplying answers to society's ills. At 
limes, he creates a totally new reality 
lor himself, transcending his own ex­
istence by being both timeless and in­
animate, (on the verge of immortali­
ty). He leaves his poor "mortal" 
brothers far behind. It sounds like 
surrealism as he "seaehes for a new 
reality beneath the conscious mind 
in dream slates or in bizzareacts of 
late." Harpo himself says, "Most 
people have a conscious and a sub-
concious. Not me I have a sub­
conscious and a sub-subconscious." 
(Quotations from Grouco, Chico, 
Harpo and Sometimes Zeppa, by 
Joe Adamson). Many examples 
come to mind; the incredible broken 

mirror scene in Duck Soup where he 
virtually becomes Groucho's double 
by perfectly "reflecting" his brother's 
action; his great "stretch" in Go West 
where he desperately tries to hold 
two train cars together as the gap, as 
well as he, lengthens; and the scene 
of the Big Store when he "joins" ISth 
century manniqnins in a recital of 
Classical Music. His timelessness is 
clearly shown in this last examle. 
Besides, isn't "lime" a human 
construct in Itself! 

Among his greatest scenes in­
volves the Punch and Judy Show 
aboard the boat in Monkey 
Business. Here. Harpo becomes 
another puppet as he assimilates 
himself into the proceedings to es­
cape his late as a stowliway. The 
scene is further complicated by the 

fact that the puppeteer is never seen, 
closing the gap between Harpo and 
the puppets even further. Ilarpo's 
mannerism become bolh inanimate 
and childlike, simultaneously. The 
scene is significant for three reasons. 
Thel-'irsi Officer and Captain, trying 
to throw him oil theship. are conse­
q u e n t l y made fools of. He 
"transcends" the here and now by 
becoming inanimate, (the pursuers 
succeed in pulling Ilarpo's "leg" off 
in a tug of war). And the scene con­
firms Ilarpo's desire to destroy 
society's inherent age/role restric­
tions dominated audience. 

Our society has delincd for us the 
proper role to play at each phase of 
our lives and in each situation we 
find ourselves in. One who does not 
play the assigned role could very well 
be considered abnormal. By Harpo's 
definition, though, he's not com­
mitted to play the roleof a stowaway 
or of anyone else for that matter. 
Roleplaying is a society construct, 
an artificial one. Harpo, with facili­
ty, plays all roles equally well accor­
ding to the situation he finds himself 
in. 

Each movie illustrates all of these 
qualities and much more. Harpo was 
an incredible comedian and I 
suspect, and equally remarkable 
human being. Certainly the world of 
Harpo Marx on the screen is one of 
anarchy; however, he does offer 
alternatives to our coping with reali­
ty. They arc for the taking. Go to the 
IIG films of the Marx Brothers this 
weekend, and focus on Harpo, And 
when someone approaches you and 
says, "Hey, did you see the Marx 
Brothers this weekend?", you'll res­
pond with, "Sure, you must mean 
Hurpo, Chico and Groucho." 

...But We Know Belter 



They Don't Glitter But Do Shine 
by Guy Frankc 

The Irish'Rovers are so different 
from any other contemporary 
musical group that an entirely uni­
que set of standards must be 
employed when judging them. Their 
audience is not just teen-age and 
college people; instead it ranges 
through every age group.They do not ' 
specialize in rock music, but in Irish 
ballads and drinking songs, usually 
filled with rich humor. Their reper­
toire is of the sing-along nature, and 
indeed much of their appeal rests 
upon audience participation. They 
do not glitter, they dp not flash, they 
are not loud. What theydo have isan 
intimate, friendly appeal, which 
their admirers expect and receive in 
abundance. 

Played to 600 
The Rovers were in concert this 

past Sunday night at the Palace 
Theater in Albany. They played to a 
good sized crowd of about 600, who 
ranged in age from toddlers to great 

classical forum mm 

grandmothers. These people gave 
the Rovers a warm reception as they 
ran onstage. 

The Rovers have been together a 
long time, and not just as a group, 
although this year they did celebrate 
their tenth anniversary together. In 
fact, it's almost a family act. The 
group leader is Will Millar, who 
plays guitar, mandolin and har­
monica, his brother George, also on 
guitar, and their cousin Joe, who was 
on bass. The lead singer, Jimmy 
Ferguson and accordianist Wilcil 
McDowell lived near' the Millar 
family in Northern Ireland, and all 
five grew up together, which has 
created a strong cohesiveness that 
still exists. They know each other's 
movements, habits and peculiarities, 
and their timing as they work 
together, both on song and conver­
sation with the audience, is quite ex­
traordinary. 

The entire two hour set was of a 
consistent' quality;' their usual 
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procedure being a tang, followed by 
a bit of conversation with the 
audience. The latter usually con­
sisted of jokesand humorous stories, 
discussions of the virtues of liquor, 
and introductions to songs the group 
felt wereofparticularimportanceof 
interest. The songs, as i'e said, were 
usually ballads of either lost love or 
humorous events in the life of the 
average Irishman. And, of course, 
the sense of Ireland was ever present, 
from the songs themselves to the 
heavy brogue evident in every voice 
in the group. 

Before the first song had ended, 
their particular appeal was clearly 
evident as many in the audience were 
clapping in time with the music and 
tapping their feet, all of which was 
encouraged by the Rovers. The 
audience seemed to truly enjoy this, 
and complied with even greater fer­
vor. For a number of songs. Will 
Millar would recite the chorus, sing 
it a couple of times with the 

sassssawft • • • •:• yswawsw: 

Freud Analyzes Classical Art 

The intellectual interests of Sigmund Freud were not 
by any means limited to psychoanalysis, in which he 
pioneered, but rather ranged widely over many fields of 
inquiry. Time, in its issue of January 6, 1975. reported 
Freud's experimentation with cocaine, in which he 
hoped to find it miracle drug. During the months of 
November through January a most remarkable exhibi­
tion at the Jewish Museum in New York City focused 
attention on another relatively unknown facet of Freud's 
life: his serious interest in archaeology and his collection 
of antiquities. 

Vienna 
The exhibition featured two kinds of things. First, 

there were photographs of the apartment and office 
which Freud maintained for almost half a century at 
Berggasse 19 in Vienna. These photographs were taken 
by Edmund Engclman, who now lives on Long Island, in 
1938, shortly before Freud left Vienna for London. They 
show how Freud's antiquities filled his cabinets, shelves, 
tables, and desk. Thenk there were twelve ancient art 
objects once owned by Freud and lent to the museum by 
his daughter Anna, who still lives in London. In time 

these objecls ranged from the second millcnium B.C.E. 
to the second century C.E.; ancient Near Eastern, Egyp­
tian. Greek, Etruscan, and Roman art were represented. 
Among the objects was one of which Frcudiwas.cspccial-
ly fond, a small Janus-headed bronze figurogifiMirierva 
and Silenus. "Ii 

' Freud frequently visited archaeological sites in Italy, 
especially Pompeii. When he visited the United States in 
1909 he made it a point to sec the Ccsnola collection of 
antiquities in New York City's Metropolitan Museum of 
Art. In Paris one of the most important attractions to 
him was the Egyptian obelisk in the Place de la Con­
corde. Freud's library contained many books on 
archaeology. "I have read more archaeology than psy­
chology," he once wrote tothe author Stefan Zwcig. He 
fell that archaeology provided insights into psychology. 
His interests were "interdisciplinary" long before that 
word had been invented. 

Finally, since most people arc familiar with the Freu­
dian concept of the Oedipus complex, it might be men­
tioned that Freud's office contained a copy of lngre's pai­
nting, "Oedipus and the Sphinx." 

ENRICO RECOMMENDS 

MONDAY '5.95 
Veal Scalopplne al Marsala 

TUESDAY *5.95 
Beel Rollallne 
or Combination Beef Rollallne 
and Chicken Parmlglana 

WEDNESDAY '5.50 
Boneless Breasl o( Chicken 
al Vino Blanco 

COLONIE * 1673 CENTRAL AVE. 
Open: ROUTES 
M0KI.lN.-8it m m m 

3:00 P.I. SQUIUJ 

THURSDAY '6.95 
Lobster Tails Fra Dlavolo 

FRIDAY '6.95 
Filet Mignonette all' Enrico 
or Combination Filet Mignonette 
all' Enrico and Shrimp Marlnara 

All sfirvtjcl wilh 
all tho Antipnsto 
and Spaghnll 
you can nat. 

Buy beer, 
wine or Sangria 
at modest prices 

PAGUERI 
AGREES 

audience, and the whole group 
would encourage participation in the 
song itself. This led to a very friendly 
atmosphere in the theater, as people 
would turn to their neighbor, 
laughing and congratulating them 
on their singing ability. It was this in­
timate atmosphere which gave the 
evening the appearance of a large 
party, rather than a concert. This ac­
tivity reached a climax when the 
group did their most popular piece, 
"The Unicom" which had people 
singing through the entire song. 

Along with their music, the 
Rovers madeeffective use of visuals 
as part of their performance. At one 
point, Will Millar described a recent 
trip he'd made home to Northern 
Ireland, and how he had been 
horrified to find the children of 
Belfast playing amidst barbed wire 
and destroyed buildings, growingup 
and learning the methods of street 
fighting from their elders. The hate, 

the lack of understanding he found 
there prompted him to write a song 
about these: children and their life. 
As he sang it, a film was shown on a 
screen behind him. It depicted first 
scenn of children playing peacefully 
in a playground, followed abruptly 
by chilling visions of children in 
Belfast playing with guns amidst 
barriers and barbed wire, and older 
youths taunting British soldiers and 
tossing home-made bonbs at tanks 
as they rolled through the city 
streets. Although the song did slip 
into sticky sentimentality, the effect 
was quite sabering. 

In summation, I would say that 
the concert was a great success. The 
Rovers, for all their down-home in­
formality, are polished performers 
who know their business and how to 
please their audience. And in this 
day of dissatisfaction and disap­
pointment, that is no small ac­
complishment. 

Y'ull lake hole: 
Two of our ArtsEditors.Hillary 

Kelbick and Paul Pelagalli, will be 
co-cmcces at Telethon 7 5 from 2-.1 
p.m. Saturday. 

i Vail be there! 

Let's give 
America 

a hand! 

w e n . " * " " 0 " ' 
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The Sound's Not It A'Tull 
by Mart Kaufman and Spcnce 
Ragglo 
WARNING: The concert you are 
about to read about wai performed 
In one of the worst acoustic en­
vironment! in existence, Madison 
Square Garden. Please check your 
ears at the door and keep the line 
moving. Thank you. 

Record companies, as a matter of 
good public relations, arc in the 

habit of providing the press with ex­
cellent seats at concetti, usually 
within the first twenty rows or so in 
an arena like Madison Square Gar­
den, but it might be a good idea every 
now and then to see what it's like to 
sit somewhere off in the hazy dis­
tance. Watching Jethro Tull perform 
from the Garden's green seats—seats 
just a little closer to heaven than the 
tower of Babel ever achieved—was 

FRYE 
IjouNG SHOES 

MERCHANTS TO GENERATIONS 

OF BOOT BUFFS 

Bench-crafted and handfinished by 

skilled artisans for over 100 years. 

YOUNG SHOES, adds still another to the largest collection : 

of FRYE BOOTS in the country! Our Driftwood Boot, it is • 

brass pegged and fitted by hand. The platform sole is of j 

solid oak-bend leather to match the new stacked 2'U inch ; 

high heel. > 

IN fTOCk fOR M£N & WOMGN 

an interesting experience. The group 
seems so distant as to be in another 
place; more often than not, you're 
watching an audience watching Tull, 
or an episode of In Concert that con­
sists of long shots and sweeping pan­
orama of the concert hall. 

Tull's sound system proved to be 
ineffective, at high altitudes, in­
creasing the uncomfortable feeling 
of having just paid $7.50 for a ticket 
and not even being there. 

Strangely.an eight o'clock concert 
was beginning at five minutes to 
eight. Carmen opened the show, 
playing .to a three quarters empty 
house, but when they exited, encore-
less, after forty minutes, the Garden 
was packed. They played fast, engag­
ing Spanish tinged rock, complete 
with castenets and flamenco dancing 
on an electrically amplified dance 
floor. They were excellent, but once 
again just could not handle the 
tremendous size of the Garden. It 
would have been a more interesting 
set if they had waited for more of the 
audience to find their scats, and 
perhaps even played a little longer— 
though both these drawbacks were 
simply indications of the tight pre­
programmed format of the evening's 
presentation. 

The Who, Zeppelin, the Stones, 
ELP, Tul l —these arc the 
"supergroups" of today, and each 
one of them would have no trouble 
selling out a few shows at the Gar­
den, but can any of them really play 
in such a large and distant audience? 
Many of the special effects and 
pyrotechnics of Tull's extravaganza 
were lost on a sizeable portion of the 
ludiencc. 

The show itself was quite a well 
organized, polished presentation. 
Neither Thick Ax A Brick nor A I'as-
sion Play dominated as they had in 
the past. Instead, Tull performed 
itbout fifteen or twenty minutes of 
each of these albums, filling in hte 
rest of their short, ninety minute set 
with six of the ten songs on War 
Child, six also from Aqualung, and 
one or two from Living in the Past 

interspersed by means of medley 
with the others. 

Tull did some interesting things 
with the acuta! performing area of 
the stage; two platforms were built 
out in front, one on either side of the 
stage, onto which guitarist Martin 
Barreand bassist Jeffrey Hammond-
Hammond would occasionally leap 
out and play. There was also a long 
balcony set up above and behind the 
stage, allowing Anderson even more 
room to dash about, and providing 
the means for his grand entrance at 
the commencement of the concert, 
soaring over the head of the 
drummer, landing amongst an ex­
plosion of smoke and light in the 
center of the stage. 

Court-jesting, never-resting—he 
must be very cunning 

To assume an air of dignity and 
bless 

His lame-brained antics 
And his jumping in the air. 
And every night his act's the 

same* 

The antics of Ian Anderson are a 
main attraction, the center ring of 
this mad three ring circus called 
Jethro Tull. He's all over the stage at ' 
once, jumping, waving, swinging his 
flute in wide circles about his head. 
Dressed in a long greatcoat, high 
boots and a large codpiece Anderson 
is the focal point of the group on 
stage. He's also the musical center of 
lull, running the group with an iron 
list, controlling the How and direc­
tion of the music with a turn of his 
hand or a twist of his ami. Un-
disputedly the captain, he runsa very 
tight ship, everything carefully 
p lanned c o o r d i n a t e d and 
choreographed. 

Hut that's not all there is to this cir­
cus. Hammond-Hammond is out­
fitted totally in zebra stripes, bass 
and all, and is never still for a mo­
ment. John Evan on keyboards 
remained at the bench throughout 
most til the performance, leaving to 
lead the audience in handclaps dur­
ing "Ladies" and later on to wander 
about the stage in a bit of drunken 

Available in Hand Stained Brown, Natural ailed, An­
tiqued wallnvl, and Burnt chestnut. 

tm 
159 CENTRAt AVENUE 

Frye Bootmakers since 1863.... OPEN EVERY EVENING Tltt 9 PM 

••.•:*:*»::'.*:*:*WUSE YOUR BANKAMERICARD OR MASTERCHARGE i&& 

4361015 

Progressive 104 

•JACKHOPKUH 
pMUNLiHRERetl 

Progressive 104. 
WE HAFrlN HVE / 

insanity while Anderson relieved 
him on the organ. Barre, in 
patchwork quilt costume, had his 
moment in the spotlight when, to 
begin the encore he came flying 
across the stage, letting loose with a 
flaming guitar solo. Drummer 
Barricmore Barlow is the only sane 
member of the group, ignoring the 
theatrics, concentrating on laying 
down a rock-hard steady rhythm. Of 
course there was the mandatory 
drum solo—this time leading right 
into the most effective part of the 
show. Flashing lights, explosions, 
sirens, smoke--yes, it's "War 
Child", assaulting the Garden with a 
visual and sonic barrage of Tull 

Anderson decided to augment his 
crew for this tour, adding on five new 
members (well, six if you count the 
zebra). On the left there was a four 
woman string section who started off 
the concert, conducted by a scantily 
clad young woman named Shona 
who introduced the group by drop­
ping her pants. She continued the 
role of subservient sex object 
throughout the concert, always pre­
sent to remove or supply Anderson's 
Utile and guitar, and once helping 
him change his coat. Anderson never 
has had much respect for women, 
and he doesn't seem to mind using 
them here and there to spice up the 
production. 
,s> Wur ChiM 1974 Chrysalis 

Applications for position at 

SAILING SUPERVISOR-

INSTRUCTOR 

in 

tho Albany Sailing Club 

Summer Sailing Program 

(Juno 5-Aug.il), 
are now available in tho 

Student Association Office 
CC»46 Deadline April 14 

•;Thp, international Film Group 
The alternative filmic experience since IS54. 

in conjunction with the Class of 75 presents 

The Marx 
Brothers 

Friday, Mar. 14 
7:00 Horse Feathers 
8:15 Day at the Races 

10:15 Horse Feathers 
11:30 Day at the Races 

landed hy student association 

LCI 8 
Dues-paying Class of 75 : $ .25 

With Tax: $ .50 

Without tax: $ 1.00 

Saturday, Mar. 15 
7:00 Monkey Business 
8:15 Night at the Opera 

10:00 Monkey Business 
11:15 Night at the Opera 

COME EARLY STAY FOR BOTH SHOWS 
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Drawing A Win?! 

Friday, March 14 Dance Marathon: for Multiple Sclerosis at the 
Washington Ave. Armorystar t ing9a.m. today un-

Make Someone Happy: Telethon '75 will be for til 9 p.m. Sunday night. 36 hours of dancing and 
the benefit of the Wildwood School for spectators are welcome to cheer you on. 
Developmental^ Handicapped Children. It starts Remember : Dance for those who can't! 
tonight at 8 p.m. and continues through 'till Satur­
day night a t 8 p.m. Come and see both your friends Sunday March 16 
and other amusing talent perform for this worthy 
cause in the CC Ballroom. Help make someone 
happy! 

Saturday, March 15 Movie: Sounder will be shown on the uptown 

campus at 4 p.m. in LC 18 and at the downtown 

Indian Quad Coffeehouse: Tonight at 8:30 p.m. in campus at 7 p.m. in the main lounge of Brubacher 

Adiruga's basement, there will be free donuts, Hall. Admission is free so. don't miss this ex-

coffee, hot chocolate, etc.and entertainment by cellent film. 

Steve and Dave! 

The SUNVA Nile Club & Discotheque: presents 
another evening of fun and enjoyment. Special 
features are a live band playing progressive, par­
ty, and funk music, good dancing disco music, 
dance contest prizes and good people. If you like to 
dance, party or just socialize in an unique relaxed 
atmosphere, then come out tonight (after the 
Telethon) from 9 p.m. 'till 3 a.m. in the Brubacher 
Hall Snack Bar downtown dorm. Admission is 
$1.00 with tax or I.D. and $1.50 without. Come 
out, get down, and "Release yourself. 

Jewish Students Coalition: presents "Simulation 
Game on the Plight of the Russian Jews" today at 
5:15p.m. in theEd . 127 and a t 8 : l 5 p . m . i n t h e C C 
Assembly Hall. There will also bea Model Seder. 

jBlack Experience Ensemble Inc: presents Eclipse 
ISaturday and Sunday night at 8 p.m. in the Perfor-
jming Arts Center Studio 2. Admission is $2.00 
for students and $3.00 for all others. There will 
|also be a matinee at 3 p.m. Sunday afternoon ! 
L I 

Movie Timetable 
On Campus 

Albany State Cinema 

The Day of the Dolphin 
Sat.: 7:30,8:30,9:30 p.m. LC I & LC 2 

IFG 

Fox Colonie Hellman 
* i- r» . . . . . Godfather Pari II 
Alice Doesn < Live Here Anymore . . . . „.nn „ ,„ 
Fri.A Sat.: 7:00, 9:15 p.m. ^ ' » P 1 

1 Sat.: 6:00, 10:00 p.m. 

Horsefcathers 
Fri.: 7:00, 10:15, p.m. LC 18 

Day at the Races 
Fri.: 8:15. 11:30 p.m. LC 18 

Monkey Business 
Sat.: 7:00, 10:00 p.m. LC 18 

Nile at the Opera 
Sat.: 8:15, 11:15 p.m. LC 18 

iTower East 
ISerpico 

F r i . & Sat . : 7:30. 10:00 p.m. L C 7 

|ARK Films 

Laurel and Hardy Festival 
Sat.: 7:30, 9:30 p.m. LC 23 

Off Campus 
Cinema 7 
Towering Inferno 
Fri. & Sat.: 7:00, 10:00 p.m. 

Delaware 

Street Fighter 
'Hammer of God 
Fri.: 7:00, 8:30, 10:00 p.m. 
Sat.: 6:35, 8:10, 9:40 p.m. 

Colonie Center 

Lenny 
Fri. & Sat.: 7:00,9:00, 11:00 p.m. 

Cine 1234 

M u r d e r on the Orient Express 

Fri. & Sat.: 7:00, 9:45 p.m. 

Young Frankenstein 
Fri. & Sat.: 6:50, 9:00 p.m. 

N i g h l Porter 

Fri. & Sal.: 7:20, 9:40 p.m. 

tunny Car Summer 
Fri. & Sal.: 7:10,9:45 p.m. 

Circle Twin 
The Longest Yard 
Fri. &Sal.: 7:15,9:15 p.m. 

The Life & Tines of Grizzly Adams 
Fri. & Sat. 7:00, 9:00 p.m. 

Madison 

Play It Again Sam 
Fri.: 8:30 p.m. 
Sal.: 6:45 p.m. 

Blazing Saddles 
Fri.: 7:00, 9:50 p.m. 
Sat.: 9:50 p.m. 

Towne 
Earthquake 
Fri.: 7:15, 9:45 p.m. 
Sat.: 7:30, 9:55 p.m. 

•Tincmil 7 7K5-I625 

^Tneuter Directory ' 

timi I 2 .1 4 . . 459-8.100 

783-3388 

459-2170 

4(>2-47l4 

459-1020 

459-5.122 

iDtrcle Twin 

jColoiitc Center.... 
l-k'lawii ru 

ux Colonic 
iHcl l i i ian . .• 

iMadiniin 489-54.11 
jfownc 7K5-15I5 
thdiun Drive-In 459-.1S50 

L a t h a m Drive-In 785-5161. 

L l i i i a w k Drive-In 456-2551 

Contest Rules 
Su bmit puzzle solutions to the Albany Student Press (CC334) before .1 

p.m. on Monday following the Friday the puzzle appears. 

////////////////////////////////////////////////////////// 
Name, address, phone numbcr'and social security number musi 

appear on your entry. 

/ / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / / ; . • 

Puzzle solutions will be drawn at random until three correct solutions 
have been chosen. 

//////////////////////////////////////////////////////;. 

Each of the three winners selected will receive a $ 5 gift certificate 
redeemable at the Campus Bookstore. Merchandise must be claimed 

within two weeks of notification. 

1,11 IIHIIIH-HIIH III I If llllll lllll III llll III I.'IIII HI I 

No one working on or for the Albany Student Press is elegible to win. 

mmmiiiiiimmii/miiiiiimiimiiiiiiimii'! 
One solution per person will be accepted. 

iiuiiiiiii.iiimiiiiimiiiiiiiimiiimmniinmi 
•IIIIIIIIIIIIHIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIHIIIIIIIIIMIIIIIHIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIII 

Hi 2 3 4 H5 6 7 8 1 

13 H l 4 
•17 18 J i9 

•Sn Hp 
23 24 K 5 26 

• 2 7 H29 WM 

KM30 JF H"i 
•32 33 H 3 4 35 ^ 1 

37 38 H39 40 

• 4 2 B 4 4 

• 4 6 W 7 

48 49 WO 51 

•54 W5 1 
©Edward Julius'] i W Targum CW74-21 

A C R O S S 

1 Destroy 
5 "The of the 

Greasepaint . . . " 
9 Humble Howard 

11 Se l le r : var. 
13 Tirana Is I t s 

capi ta l 
14 Evangeline, e .g . 
16 Boxing great 
17 T a t t l e : 2 wds. 
19 Compass point 
20 Evergreen tree 
21 Examine in detail 
22 Rockweed 
23 Rubinstein 
25 Rib In Gothic 

vaulting 
27 Ancient ascetics 
29 Encourage 
30 Make at 
31 Portion out 
32 Extra hand In cards 
34 Compensation for a 

wrong 
37 Anything that 

puzzles 

39 Unexpected delight 11 
41 Musical Instrument 
42 Al lev ia tors 12 
44 Noun-form1ng su f f i x 13 
45 Gelderland c i t y 
46 Merriment: var. 
47 Don 
48 Short metal sleeve 
50 Ralph or Douglas 
52 Jousted 
53 English novel ist 

and family 
54 Spanish Invader 
55 Postman's beats 

(abbr. ) 

D O W N 

1 Rules of Order 36 
2 Glacial ridge 
3 Type of Buddhism 
4 Type of type 
5 Intimidated again 
6 Judah's son 
7 Augment-
8 Reaccustom 
9 Eau , wise. 

10 "Hamlet" character 

Sibelius' " 
Trlste" 
111 will 
Herb genus 
No, In Nuremberg 
Pitcher T1ant 
Commit depredations: 
2 wds. 
Antenna 
Consumed: 2 wds. 
Haps 
FDR for one: 
2 wds. 
Ceres 
Dyed blue 

natura: 2 wds. 
Trick 
Hakes fast 
Caesar, and others 
Kitchen VIP 
Harked with 
stripes 
Bills 

cup 
Wolverine genus 
Wear out 
Old car 
Angkor 

t**r Host's 
Push Soitfhn 

aaaa anocin GJQBH 
FJ0HM 0000171 DG0B 

aaron HBQQE 
aUlDHGlB 00000 „ „ 
mroran iinronranDnB 
aaa anarara am 
rannnnnrinn raranap 

onnnn unaaao 
iifinnra r.iraein , „ 

kjr.iHiinrjwr.U'iraMiTiiuiuB 
r.iHHr.1 manaia 0000 
nnnifi nnrnnn naaa 
innnn nnnnn nnnn 
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by Jason "The Flying Rook"Braun 
Chess is a very strange game. One 

day everything will go right, the cor­
rect strategical plans will materialize 
on the board and I'll play a game I 
never thought I could. However, the 
next day 1 could stare at a simple 
position for naif an hour without 
seeing anything. The following 
game was played on the first day of 
the R.P.I. Open last weekend and I 
consider it my most accurate game. 
Wh itc has a slight advantage in space 
after the opening and increases it 
throughout the middlegame. The 
very important A5 square is oc­
cupied by a white knight through 
most of the game which tics clown 
black's pieces nicely. As for the 
endgame . . . well, play it out and 

21. N-Q5!(0 
22. P-N5! 
23. P -K4 

24. B-R5!(g) 
25. B-B.l 

26. P-114 

27. PxP 
28. H-N4(i) 
29. P-B5 
.10. P-B6 
31. BxN 
.12. P-QR4 
33. R-N5 
.14. K-U.l 
.15. P-R4 
36. K-K2!(ki 
.17. KxB 

.18. N-K7! 

White 

Jason Braun 

1. P-QB4 
2. N-QB3 
.1. P-KN3 
4. B-N2 
5. N-KB.l 
6. O - O 

7. N-Q5! 
8. I'-Q.l 
9. N-Q2(c) 
It). NxN 
11. N-K4 
12. H-Q2 
1.1. N-B.1! (d) 
14. R-NI 
15. I'-QN4 
16. K x l l 

17. I'-K.l 
18. Q-K5(e) 
19 Q-R.l 
20. QxQ 

Black 
Wilfred Brown 

P-K4 
N-KB.l 
B-N5 
O-O 
N-QB.l 
R-Kl(a) 
B-BI 
l'-Kls.l(h) 
I'-Q.l 
QxN 
Q-QI 
B - K l 

Q-BI 
B-R6 

BxB 
N-Q5 
N-K.l 
P-K.N3 
N-KN4 
QRxQ 

R-RI. 
Rxl'ch. 
R-RI 
RI'xK 
K-K2 
I M ' 
N-1W011I 
R-NIVtn) 
K-K.l 

48. Nxl' 
NxP 
N x l ' 

VQ7 
N-K4 
l'-Q4 
R x l ' c h . 

N-R2 
B-N2 
P-KR4 
I'-N.l 
N-B.l 
l'-B.l(h) 
RxP 
N-Q2 
N-B4 
B-BI(j) 
R x B 

B-R.l 

B-Q7 
K-R2 
P-KN4'! 
I'xl'7! 
P x P 

P-KR4 
K-R.l 

K-N4 

RxR! 
K-N5 
P-RJKI) 
R-RI 
R x P 

R-R2ch. 
|'-N7 
K-N.l 

K -KH2! 

R x l ' 

R-O.l 
K-U.l 
R-UI 
K\R 

DRAW'.'! 

NuK's: 0) llns is a position 1 was 
lamiliai with though l'\c never 
pliued 11 bclore. While's next move 
gets the aduintagc. hi While was 
Ihreaiening II-N5. c) llns is where 
long-rangeplanningeoincs in. White 
inn sunn 11011 he 05 square b\ N-K4-
11.1-05. then gain space on 1 lie queen-

Tricks and Trumps 

side with P-QN4-N5. P-QR4. d) 
Stopping black's attempt to play P-
Q4 and free his pieces, e) I wanted to 
trade queens because I felt white has 
much better endgame chances here. 
I) And here the white knight sits for 
the next 17 moves, g) If 24 . . .. P-
QB.1 25,PxP Pxl'and theQN file is 
whites. 24. . . P-QN3 leaves the QB 
pawn backwards and it can not be 
pushed with any effect; h) Black can­
not play26. . . NxN;27.BPxN!and 
the OH pawn will fall eventually, i) 
Now 28 . . . NxN 29.KPxN R 
moves tinf the QP is lost, j) Protec­
ting against N-K7ch. k) Winning a 
piece for 2 pawns.or a pawn. I) Black 
opens a file to gel his rook into play. 
At this point I had to make two 
moves very quickly to meet the time 
control, m) Finally making the time 
control by all of 20 seconds. 

I don't know it' I could explain 
why 1 offered a draw in this position. 
White can win just by pushing the 
KP and QPund there isn't a hell ol a 
lot black can do about it. But there 
are outside factors in a chess game: I) 
my opponent was rated 250 points 
above me; we had been playing for 5 
hours straight: it was lifter midnight 
and I couldn't even see the board 
straight; and I honestly thought it 
would lake me until 3 A.M. to win. 1 
was a \ cry exciting game to play with 
several beautiful moves by both 
players. 

Crossword halo 
Contest Winners 

Vieki BUM 
Bill Stuart 

Uurfo RoMnthal 

by Tom Webster and Henry Jacob-

sun 

N O R T H 

• AQ8 
O KQo 
0 K6.1 
* 54.12 

WEST 

» 65.1 
<0 J984 
0 .QJI0 
f .187 

KAN I 

« 104 
<0 10 
0 98752 
• KQI096 

SOI III 

4 KJ972 
V A75.12 
0 A4 
• A 

N-S vul. 
Opening Lead: Queen ol Diamonds 

Bidding: 

South 

IS 
411 
7S 

West 

P 

P 

North 
2NI 
5S 

All Pass 

After South rebid 4 IIcarts, North 
saw excellent slam possibilities. 
South announced 5-5 in the majors 
by his bidding and combined with 
North's excellent holding in those 
suits, thai translated into 10 tricks 
already. North next jumped to 5 
Spades assuring South of II great 

spade fit. After ihis. South fell he 
needed no further encouragement lo 
hid the 7 Spade "Granny", 

I he bidding was good hul the 
hand also needed good play lo make. 
I he average declarer would have 
won the opening lead, pulled Humps 
and tried lo cash his hearts, i he root 
ea\ es in when Kast shows out on the 
second heart, and South ends up 
down one. 

South can complain up and down 
about his poor luck, but Ihe slam 
should have been made. 

I he heller declarer would win the 
opening lead and cash two rotmdsol 
trumps, lea\ nig one trump outstan­
ding. Declarer then thinks to 
himself. "II the hearts split .1-2 ihere 
will he no problem. But if they break 
4-1,1 surely lace the loss ot a heart 
tuck. 11 I have played three rounds ol 
trump. So I'll test the hearts first. 1 
lhe\ spin .1-2. fine, the contract com-
es home, II they splii4-l and the per­
son wilh the singleton heart has the 
last spade, he will trump the second 
round tor down one; hut if that is the 
distribution ol Ihe spade and hear! 
suits then I wa s going down anyway.. 
Ilui, il ihe person who has lour 
hearts also has the last spade, 1 can 
cash three rounds of hearts trump 
one heart in dummy .establishingthe 
lilth heart, then draw trumps for the 
contract", 

I his method of cashing only two 
rounds of Humps and then playing 
two rounds of spades is completely 
sale, and oilers the best play for the 
contract. 

WSUA'S 
WHISKEY BAR IS HOT! 

The Whiskey Bar is a telephone dialogue show 
designed to air your opinions, grievances, and 
revelations. Trivia nuts- 3 new albums and 4 pairs 
of movie tickets will be given away free! 

Starting at 11 P.M. sharp we'll be discussing such 
controversial topics as: 
EQUITY IN BUDGETING featuring this week's guests: 

EOPSA Pres. Fred Stokelin 
and 

S.A. V.P. Ira Birnbaum 

Hear their debate and address them on our phones: 

457-5808 and 457-6443 

Sundays 11 P.M. - 3A.M. on WSUA 640 A.M. 

Free giveaways compliments of Just A Song and Cine 1-2-3-4 
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"Make Someone Happy" 

March 14-15 CC Ballroom 

8 pm - 8 pm 

Come on down! Food, beer, 

-,iy, . fj*M/ 'HlKpi *H 1 •"• 

i j l ' l l • g M In 'A< f C i ' l " . " " 

lots of 
t'« t • mm vis' 

Proceeds go to WHdwood School 

for Developmental^ Handicapped Children 

Highlights: 

Children's Hour - Saturday 1 0 - 2 

Auction of Hyatt House Waterbed Suite 

Pie throwing - at Norbert Zahm, Pat Curran, 

Harold Cannon, Jane Harkinson 

Talent: 

John & Hector, LaRoux, Terry "D.C." Harps, 

Tiny & the Tinettes, John C/mino, 

Chef Arthur & the Flaming Aces 

Campus bases will be running on a 24 hour 

on a 24 hour schedule from Fri. 8 pm to Sat. 8 pm 

Campus Connoisseurs 
Sample Fine? Wines 

Post Watergate Funnies 

by Hillary D- Kclblck and Aim D. Abbey 
They leaned against the aluminum folding table with the yellow plastic 

tablecloth, licking their lips between the tastes of wine being served in plastic 
doblets. Some held the wine to the light to check its clarity. One man sniffed 
his itlass, testing the wine's bouquet. These amateur sommeliers were in the 
Fine Arts Building, surrounded by the Martha Jackson Gallery Collection 
Monday night. 

"The 1975 College Wine Tasting Festival," was the name given to this 
promotionof the Media Group of Boston, a public relations firm dealing 
primarily with college related activities. 

TheV soli' She idea to a number of wine companies, collated the different 
wines, and offered the package to 25 schools in the Northeast. Kim Kricger, 
Services Director of S A, organized the event on this campus, and used the 
occasion to announce her candidacy for SA President next year. 

Eight inexpensive wines ($2 to $3 a bottle) were served one by one to the 
100 students who came and went throughout the evening. Los Hermanos 
Mountain Chablis was the first, a light, delicately flavored white wine from 
California. Next was what turned out to be the most popular wine of the 
night, Isabel Rose, from Portugal, a semi-sweet rr-e. New York Great 
Western Dutchess Rhine, with a taste close to that of l.iebl'raumilch. was 
next. It was a bit tasteless. Great Western Veritas, which was described as a 
"crackling rose" by the brochure, received negative comments from the three 
people questioned. "It's the worst, 1 prefer Ripple. The shit tastes like Lavoris 

with bubbly," said one man. 
Israeli Carniel Carignan, a very dry red wine. G.W. Chelois, a terribly 

hitter medicinal red wine. Kirsberry. a cough syrup flavored cherry wine 
from Denmark, and Sicilian Gold, which was overwhelmingly sweet, and 
almondy, finished the selection. Small pieces, -fondue size." said an Art 
Gallery worker were served ostensibly to clean the palate and cool the 
stomach. Ravenous students stuffed much more in their mouths. 

Havinggonedown the line, the people were free to go hack and refill their 
glasses with whatever they wanted. A cocktail party atmosphere settled over 
the crowd, which broke up into little groups. I here were several political 
discussions scattered throughout the crowd. In one corner, sal four women 
busily entertaining three half filled hollies of wine. A lew couples stood 
around talking softly and some people walked around alone, viewing the 

exhibit. 
Serving the wine was John Astwood, who for the last two years has been 

Ihc show manager of the Wine and Checse*lTsllVal at the New York 
Coliseum. He admitted thai nol all the wines were being served at their 
correct temperatures, thus affecting their taste. At (his function he was just 
the bartender. 

As the evening continued the Gallery got noisier, as people "laslcd" more 
and more wine. A few ol'.lhe more overzealous "connoiseurs" were seen 
stumbling out the door. 

by C.S. Santino 
David Frye, comic and im­

pressionist, appeared last week at the 
Lancelot Lounge, a cozy night club 
nestled under downtown Albany's 
Twin Towers building, presenting a 
mixed bag of celebrity and political 
impersonations to a generally un-
enthusiustic unresponsive crowd. 

My own curiosity as to what 
political satirists are up to these days 
in the absence of the President who 
supplied them with so much raw 
material prompted me to attend the 
show. Well, the press may not have 
Dick Nixon to kick around 
anymore, but David Frye is still tak­
ing an occasional shot at him. trying 
to keep political humor front suc­
cumbing to lite Post-Walergatc 

doldrums. But even with Nixon 
jokes, Frye's audience was unap-
preciative and sometimes even row­
dy, and Frye, sensing this, seemed to 
be going through the motions in 
order to get to the sure-fire stuff. 
Luckily, there was some good 
material, mostly political, although 
Frye's political commentary is never 
really as bombastic or cutting us, 
say, the National Lampoon's "Miss­
ing White House Tapes" album. 

As farasjust impersonating voices 
and facial expressions, Hollywood, 
rather than Washington, is Frye's 
strong point. Gregory Peck, Rod 
Steiger, Henry Fonda,Jack Pa lance, 
among others were all done 
beautifully. Frye's best imper­
sonations of actors include Robert 

Rensselaer Union 
presents 

'Tom Rush" 
Sat. March 22nd 8 pm 
also appearing: "Orphan" 

Proctor's Theatre 
4th Street, Troy, N.Y. 

Tickets:$3, $4, $5 
For information call: 270-6505 

Mitchum and a wicked rendition of 
George C. Scott, mostly because of 
the nearly perfect facial contortion! 
which impressionists can't really 
manage. 

On the political scene, Frye pic­
tures Nixon as a has-been who goes 
tohisGodfather (great Brando imita­
tion) to have his justice for what 
John Dean did to his once-beautiful 
daughter Julie. The Godfather asks 
Nixon why he waited so long and 
tells him he never thought she was 
beautiful anyway. Frye's Ford is the 
bumbling Frankenstein monster 
who can't think straight enough to 
answer questions from the audience. 
Sam Brvin is pissed offbecause "that 
Polaek Jaworski gets to sec 
everything." This material was 
received a bit more graciously than 
the act's opening bits, but even so, 
the one or two persistent hecklers in 
the crowd caused Frye to lose his 
place now and then, at which times 
he fired a nasty comment hack 

One of the longer and better bits 
was the obligatory Rockefeller 
sketch. According to Rocky, if a 
man like Lord can become Presi­
dent, he canhecomct'haiuellor of the 
world, "If Ford puts on the same 
color socks in the morning.thedayis 
a triumph. And of Lindsay • "I 
know Lindsay is handsomer than I 
am. hill anybody would look 
good standing next to garbage."1 

And ol Albany - | just used it 
as a stepping stone Albany is 
Ihcshithole of thcwoild " 

frye closed the shim with a 
straight-forward eulogy to Robert 
Kennedy and Martin Luther King, 
done in a theatrical Richard Burton 
style. Where I-rye's attempts at 
humor occasional!) tailed, this hit 
was a total success, providingu few 
moments ol genuine warmth. Asifto 
apologize for the beha\ ior of ilie 
audience, a middle-aged black man 
w ho had been bothering 1'rye earlier 
a) the show eanie on stage litllle eu­
logy's close and affectionately em­
braced I-rye while the audience gave 
him a hearty round ol applause. 

CHARTER BUSES 
For Spring Recess 

To all New York a reas 
;kets being sold in CC] 

LOBBY 
jMon andTues . , March 17 and| 

18 
9 am - 4 pm 

American Enterprise Co. 
472-5203 -489-3639 

Camp Dippikill 
Governing Board 

is looking for new members, 

Students and Faculty 
Anyone interested, come to meeting: 

Tuesday, March 18 
5:00 pm CC 333 

or call Kathy 463-5634 
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Interphase.. ..Part H 
by Tom Mmtf 

"Well, yoii've got a vacation coming to you—don't be so hard on yourself. Listen, Tm 
interested only in your....your health. If work's getting you down, take a rest—God knows you 
deserve it." 

"Imay take you up on that." 
"Sure, it'll do you good to relax and let the world slip away." 
" Well, I would like to get away for awhile, til think it over. Vet me sleep on it and Til call you 

tomorrow." 
"All right. Goodnight." 
"Good night." 
The clock registered 7:50, meaning that it was actually about 7:40. It was brand new, 

displaying a grinning Sol with rigid gold rays emanating in all directions. But when Bill had tried 
to set it, pushing in the toggle jogged the minute hand ahead. It seemed inherently incapable of 
telling the right time so Bill had finally settled for a ten minute displacement. 

He plugged the bath and turned on the faucets. Maybe he would take a vacation. He had one 
coming to him after all. He'd been working hard for a long time—too hard, too long. The office 
had gotten especially hectic in the last few weeks and now the cumbersome O'Heany account had 
crashed in all at once. It would take at least a month and a half to—oh, hell—what's the sense of 
worrying about it. The office would survive without him for a week. Even if his vacation did 
cause a slowdown—the show need not go on. It was all just a sophisticated juggling act anyway: 
the clients had been instructed to applaud or hiss according to well-defined rules and well, the 
office wouldn't fall apart without him. He could use a little recreation; drive up through the 
Berkshires and catch a performance at Tanglewood. Let the others continue the juggling for 
awhile. 

The water was steaming hot the way he liked it. He let the cold water run for a few minutes 
longer than the hot so it formed a slender corridor of warm that he could step into comfortably. 
Then he churned the water with his legs, clasped the edge of the tub, eased down inch by inch and 
slid back until the water lapped round his neck. Steaming hot and peaceful. His lungs felt the 
added pressure. How many millions of years ago had the tide receded swiftly from the jungle, 
leaving a lungfish flopping in a puddle? Ontogeny recapitulates—what was it? The future 
recapitulates the past? Something like that. The same water here as then. Or is that possible? 
Docs water when it dissipates to air and joins a cloud and clatters down again retain its won 
over Canada and cruised across Lake Ontario to bring its bounty here. Fell 5000 feet into several 
hundred acres of evergreens and seeped into the reservoir. Was cuked into a weed y mouth of pipe 
to pulse far underground to the city. Labyrinthine channels under Main Street feeling every sink 
in every store-with running hot and cold water. Climbed the hill up Lark to Grossman's 
Groceries, Tate's brewery on the corner and Tubman'sGun Shop where a 6-point buck stares out 
the window through glass eyes. Leaning on a varnished square of plywood where the buck's 
shoulders should have been were two rifles, one with a scope and sling. The sunlight glinted off 
the glass and obscured the inside of the shop.The sumwas hot onhishack and he walked in. ,Qld,, 
Tubman was leaningttgavnstHlle coumbn'flrppaig a pagcofi F.telil andiStretun vu\i\ tugging ttf,h,>8, • 
pipe. He looked up at the stranger, pressed the magazine flat with the palm of his hand to prevent 
losing his place and asked in a gruff, phlegm-cluttered voice, "Can I help you, son?" 

"Ah—well—1 hope so. I'm interested in buying a pistol." 

..j ,,»tola are right here,"Tubman said, pointingdown through the glass countertop, "What 
did you have in mind?" 

Bill looked at thhhee collection of revolvers, perplexed at the variety. "I want something 
small—to keep the rabbits out of the garden, that's all. A .22." 

"A .22, well I have several .22's right here. This here's a..." he pulled out a revolver and set it on 
the counter, "this here's a .22. Could be what you're looking for." 

Bill picked it up. It had a long, sleek barrel and an ivory stock; it was uncomfortably heavy. 
"Feels too heavy. I'd like something smaller." 

"You'll want a long barrel for accuracy, you know. Those damn rabbits make mighty small 
targets." Cherryscented smoke coated the words. 

"1 won't have an trouble hitting them." 
Tubman looked closely at Bill. "No, I guess you won't. They're small but they'll sit right still 

while you walk up on 'em. They'll stare at you with their nostrils twitching like the devil 'til you're 
nearly on top of 'em." He placed another pistol on the counter. "This here might be more suited 
to your needs." 

Bill picked it up. It was lighter than the other gun but still felt heavy. It was compact and solid; 
the dark bulegray barrel as short as a snout. "This is as light as they come," Tubman said. "Finest 
snubnose made and priced lower than that Colt I showed you." 

"This will do just fine. Give me a box of cartridges with it." 
Tubman put the revolver into a cardboard box and slid it into a paper bag with the cartridges. 

"That'll be $35 and let me see," he said, sliding his finger over a tax chart taped to the side of the 
cast register, "and $2.17 tax." 

Bill reached for the checkbook in his jacket but decided to pay cha. He threw two twenties on 
the counter. "What do you grow in your garden?" Tubman asked, picking up the bills. 

"Oh, just a little corn, some tomatoes, strawberries—that sort of thing." 
"1 see," the gun man said, ringing up the sale. 
The telephone rang. Bill bolted awake, splashing water on the linoleum. What the hell? The 

water was cool and opaque. He grabbed a towel and ran to the phone, shivering. 
"Hello?" 
"Bill—what the hell are you doing?" It was Constance's voice, shrill as a bluejay. 
" / was taking a hath—what's the nuttier?" 

"Whal'sthematier-whai'sllie matter he asks. What's the matter with YOU? It's nine o'clock." 
He looked up at Sol grinning 9:10. "You're an hour late. I thought you might have had an 
accident or something." 

"No, no—I—tth...I'll he right over." He heard her receiver crash on the cradle and the 
monotonous hum of electricity take over the line, erasing the connection. "I'll he right over." 

Constance was all smilesal the door. Her place was familiar: the highceilinged living room, the 
wicher chairs, the television-stereo hidden in a mahogany console, posing as a Hope chest, the 
multicolored steel bars of the Mondrian prints, the bugeyed tropical fish suspended in the 
acquarium,.t.he red and gold bindings staring out through the glass door of the bookcase, the 
buatiof; Brahtrov,»l)d \jmhentttifully panelled.fireplace m whichthree plastic-birch logs sal among 
formal electric flames, retaining their white bark forever. 

To he continued . . . 

! HAPPY 2nd B1RTHDA Y I 
j JUST-b A- &SONG 1 

Bring in this birthday card with 
the information filled in and get 
$1. off a $2.99 c.o. 

or $.50 off a $1.99 c.o. 

Offer good from FrL, March 14 to 
FrL, March 21. 

Only one c.o. LP per customer. 

don't forget!!! 
tonight at the palace theatre 

"Maggie & Jiggs Out West" 

plus selected shorts 

from your friend # 

~liame~ address $ 
84 central ave. 
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Was it Necessary? 

To the Editor: 
H is with deep regret that 1 must inform you 

that 1 um resigning as chairperson and 
member of the Budget Committee. I realize 
this will P 1 " " u n additional burden on the 
Committee and its effectiveness (since six 
other member .mve already resigned)and that 
thisalso places inordinate problems upon you. 
Consequently, a rationale for my action is in 

order. 
I have resigned because of the actions of 

E0PSA and the subsequent actions of both 
the SA President Pat Curran, and Central 
Council. The actions on the part of the 
membership of EOPSA I feel were highly 
reactionary and totally without validity. There 
was no reason why the SA office needed to be 
inundated with blacks from EOl'SA. There 
was no reason why the office had to be 
vandalized and made into a shambles. There 
was no reason why irrationality had to 
override rationality. Furthermore, the actions 
taken during theCentral Council meeting by 
EOPSA was reprehensible and totally alien to 
my conception of morality, fair-play, and 
justice. 

Let me explain: when EOl'SA stormed into 
the SA office, Pat Curran should have either 
met with the officers (a function of officers is 
to represent, remember!) or called security. 
Assuming the former, since the latter could 
quickly escalate into fighting, he should have 
then called Ira'Birnbaum, Jerry Albrccht, and 
myself, so we all could have been present, since 
it directly affects all of. us- Since it was our 
budget appropriation, there was no reason not 
to call me. 

I do not feel that an Emergency Session of 
the Council was necessary. There is no reason 
why pressure tactics of this sort should be 
allowed to succeed. These people (i.e. the 
executives of EOPSA) could have come to S A 
andrcquestedthat council be presented with 
another proposal. Council had no legitimate 
right to decide on this budget prior to our 
review and recommendation for all budgets; 
what they did Monday night is an 
unprecedented action, which I feel, must not 
be allowed to remain valid. Intimidation of 
this sort has no place on campus. Eventually, 1 
hope, people will realize that it also has no 
place in the world. 

Returning to Central Council, apart from 
my disagreeing with their even considering the 
question, I disagree with the manner in which 
they debated and finally voted on that 
question. As everyone knows, the fact is that 
we must cut budgets, hopefully doing this as 
objectively as possible. Central Council, 
however, was intimidated and coerced into an 
emotional (i.e., non-rational) debate, talking, 
about philosophical points hut never financial 
points. 1 no 'longer have any respect for 
Central Council as a legislative body, and I see 
no reason why I should deal with such a poor 
excuse for government. 1 feci that what was 
allowed lo occur represents a travesty of 
democracy, government, morality, elc.ete, 
etc,. I feel John Locke, et a/would turn over in 
llicir graves if they were aware of what 
transpired. 

%MXM. 

The minority does not have the right to 
intimidate the majority. The majority, in this 
case, did not have the moral fiber, or the 
personal conviction, to prevent this 
intimidation by the minority. 
_The manhandling of Council proved lo me 

that it was a farce, and it proved to me that 
those who were incompetent and incapable of 
making responsible decisions were, in fact, in 
the majority on Council. Finally, perhaps as a 
high-point in Monday night's Central Council 
meeting, 1 objected to the locking and body-
blocking of exits leading out of the Assembly 
Hall. This was an intolerable condition, one 
which I feel should have resulted in the calling 
of security, and perhaps, if possible, the 
misdemeanorarrests of some of these people. 
The fact that we were not ailowed out of the 
room (for quite some time)duringa fire alarm 
perhaps best exemplifies the atmosphere and 
conditions that existed that night. 

My reason, primarily, for resigning is 
because of Council. Their action showed me 
the pointlcssncss of having student 
government. Under different circumstances, 1 
again would be willing and eager to participate 
actively in government. However, this not 
being the ease, 1 feel my resignation is in order. 
Irrational circumvention of my committee 
makes my committee a sham; consequently, I 
half-jokingly suggest that Council completely 
disreg. J the committee and that they should 
budget the remaining 40-odd groups. 

Mark Goldstein 

A True Picture 

To the Editor:: 
The events of Monday afternoon and 

evening constitute a new low in the history of 
student government at Albany State. In fact, 
they raise serious doubts that the university is 
fit to have any student government at all. 

Sunday afternoon the Budget Committee 
met with EOl'SA and recommended to SA 
President Pal Curran (who was present at the 
meeting) that EOl'SA be budgeted S7850 lor 
the 1975-76 academic year, rather than the 
$.17,5110 they requested. Both those figures 
allowed EOl'SA use of any income they 
generated, in any manner they chose, in 
addition to their allotted funds. The bulk of 
the culs were not cuts at all, but proposed 
diversions of the funds requested for concerts 
and speakers into the more experienced hands 
of Concert Board and Speakers Forum. Both 
these organizations' constitutions designate 
them as the sole groups on campus through 
which these activities are to be programmed. 
The meeting proceeded smoothly, hindered 
only hy EOl'SA President Freddie Stokelin, 
who contributed nothing but insults and 
thinly veiled thrcatsdircctcdatthccommittee, 
and specifically at SA Controller .Icrry 
Albrccht. 

Budget Committee is a group appointed by 
the SA President to recommend a budget to 
Central Council (subject to the approval of the 
SA I'residenl). We had to distribute a 
projected $390,000 in student tax money 
among groups requesting over $510,000. Any 
group dissatisfied with their proposed budget 
maS petition the committee lor another 
hearing or appeal lo CentralCouncilduring 
thcii scheduled review ol the budget for final 
ratification. I he legitimate process of 
lortnululing ncxl year's budget allows room 
lor changing specific appropriations without 
such ill-advised, unnecessary liaseos as 
Monday's. 

However, EOl'SA chose a more direct 
method ol gelling what Ihev wanted: mob 
action. At the "peaceful" sit-in. during which 
malicious and destructive acts were 
commillcd, EOPSA members heard Pat 
Curran bail himscll out by discrediting the 
integrity ol the committee, and they 
intimidated CentralCouncilChairperson Lew 
l-idlei into calling an unwarranted emergency 
Cenmil Council meeting to avert lurther 
destruction of the SA office. At the meeting, 
EOl'SA employed the unusual lobbying 
technique ol block nig the doors until their 
demands were met. 

Snip away all of Slokelin's perverse 
rhetoric and equivocation, and all of the 
hackneyed cliches EOPSA is so fond of, and 
you have airuepicturc of the situation, one in 
which a group has extorted funds from our 
legislative body hy employing real and implied 
Ihreatson their personal safety. In view of this, 
w c feel that a more equitable way of 
distributing the lax money would he to place it 

in the center of the podium and let the various 
groups fight to the death for it. 

There is no room for student government at 
Albany or any other place where mob rule is 
the order of the day and legislative bodies are 
puppets of these . mobs. Due to this latest 
travesty of responsible student government, 
we the undersigned feel compelled to resign 
from Budget Committee. 

Ralph J. Blair 
Malcolm Purow, Vice-Chairman 

Jerry Albrecht, ex-Controller SA 
Matt Meyer 

Samuel V. DiGovanni 

Clear it Up 

To the Editor: 
Concerning the topic of a recent weekly 

column in the ASP, "Focus," 1 have become 
aware of the many resources at SUNYA. 
Namely a constitutional expert, a lay Noah 
Webster, as well as a close personal friend to 
Sam Ervin, all in the same person. I consider 
the energy that Mr. Trocgcr must have put 
into writing his article to be a total waste, it 
would seem that he feels that he can clear up 
the ERA matter by telling us that Congress is 
wasting it's time. Maybe it is, but with the 
ERA, 1 see no evidence of it. 

I do commend himonhisdefinition of amend 
and the analogy to the twenty-sixth 
amendment, although the total logic behind it 
was asinine. The fact is, that the era of women 
being considered second class and recipients 
to only partial rights under the law has passed. 
If I may interpret the fourteenth amendment 
in my own way, it says that all states must not 
inflict any "more" legal restraints upon its 
citizens. "No state shall make or enforce any 
law which shall abridge the "existing" 
privileges or immunities of citizens of the 
United States". At present, thirty-four states 
and I feel that the fourteenth amendment just 

doesn't make it. Thii is my clarification of the 
fourteenth amendment and I feel that it does 
"indeed" deserve correction. 

As far as his epitome concerning equality, 
inequality may not be tantamount to injustice 
but it certainly does not solely imply 
"competitive" fairness. Equal rights for all, 
makes possible the right "to live" just like 
anyone else. This may, and hopefully will, 
permeate every aspect of life—which means 
that men will have to compete "fairly" with 
women. If it was already fact that this 
occurrence is prevailing in our society, it 
would not be the issue that it is. So, it's quite 
possible that Mr. Troeger and others will just 
haveto sit back and strain under the enormous 
paperwork of amending the constitution, 
because it's already "come a long way baby." 

Ronald Waite 

AT*. 

Vie AIIHIII)I'Student,. Press reserves the sole 
right to print or edit letters to the Editor. 
Letters should he type-written and submitted 
to CC326 to he eligible for consideration. 

Keen those cards and letters comingfolks! 

MARCH 14, 1975 

"We Demand" 
by Ken Wax 

The precedent has been set. If you yell and scream and threaten, you can gel special treatment 
from Central Council. And if you barricade a few doors, you can get thirty-five thousand 
dollars. Its that simple. 

Now, you shouldn't think it was always like that. Nosirec, there was oncea time when you had 
logo through a budget process. First the group had to go before Budget Committeeand explain 
how much they wanted and for what, penny by penny. Then the students who comprise the 
committee made recommendations to the president of Student Association. He could cither 
accept, reject or modify these recommendations before he offered them in his annual budget 
recommendations to Central Council in April. Then Council had the option of revising any and 
all of the budgets. It's a pretty sophisticated system, and many student governments throughout 
the slate have used Albany's budget process as a model. 

But that's all over now. Groups no longer have to waste lime on all those meetings under the 
new system, all you have to do lo gel money is to sit-in at theSA office lor a day, make a mess of 
the place, and yell real loud. If you do this you'll get your money -and they won't even ask what 
you're going to do with it. 

Strange things happen to some people when they're yelled at. They get scared. Some ol them 
get scared enough to forget their convictions. They'll completely reverse previous beliefs and say 
"give them the money so we won't have any problems." This is how'thcy uphold the trust they 
were given when they were elected. 

Thereare variations. "They're going to get the money anywayJ'Or, "Let's get this over with. We 
should lighl the administration, not other students." But the translation is the same: I'm scared 
to do what I believe is right. 

An emergency meeting of Central Council was called Monday night. The 'emergency' was a 
budget that council had never seen, much less considered. This emergency, which couldn't wait 
two days until Wednesday's regular meeting, was about money that couldn't be spenl until next 
September no mailer what. Who would call an emergency meeting on these grounds? A scared 
person. The sit-in people 'demanded' it. 

The worst thing you can dowhen faced with pressure tactics is to allow them to work. To do so 
invites others to try their own pressure tactics. How do you tell the Camera Club that they have 
to follow the usual procedure Budget Committee, Executive Branch, then Council, when 
others don't? Why should they wastethcir time, not too mention risk budget cuts along the route? 
If they spend the day in 346 and mess up a few papers, will they too become special and get 
whatever they want when they want it? Why should anyone else care about your rules and 
policies if you yourself have so little respect for Ihem? 

There's only one way to react to mob threats'! hat'sto explain that they simply will noi work. 
"I'm sorry, but you're no more special than anyone else." No arrogance, no loud screaming, you 
should calmly explain the fuel of life lo the people who arc trying to bully. There's no way you 
can give in without inviting everyone else to try strongurm tactics. So their attempts at coersion 
will just be a waste of time, you've got your principles and convictions. 

But to do that, alas, you need to be willing lo stand upfor those principles and convictions. 

Assuming that you have them. _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ ^ _ _ _ _ _ 
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columns 

Last Ditch 

Attempt 

by Dive Gdlctly 
Oil politics aside, the U.S. Congress has not 

lost its touch for international crisis 
management. The latest case in point being the 
call for the ouster of the Lon Nol government 
in Cambodia. In a rare show of unity Senate 
Democratic, Leader Mike Mansfield 
(Montana) was joined by Republican Leader 
Hugh Scott (Pennsylvania) in calling for Lon 
Nol':; departure as the best hope for peace in 
that troubled Southeast Asian nation. 

Scott stressed that he was speaking only for 
himself and not for the Administration who is 
seeking an immediate $222 million emergency 
appropriation to bail out the Cambodian 
government until the start of the rainy season 
in June. The Ford request has fallen short this 
week as a compromise $125 million was 
reported out of a Senate subcommittee for 
military aid. 

The problem is that the government might 
fall before any aid could get to it. And therein is 
the complex rationale for granting aid in the 
first place. 

Defense Secretary James Schlesinger is 
keeping up his public relations campaign for 
the Cambodians, being quoted early this week 
saying such encouraging things as "The fall of 
Phnom Penh is not imminent,'' though the 
airport, the only lifeline for the capital, was 
again closed by rocket fire as late as Tuesday. 

The scenario floating around the halls of 
Congress lately goes something like this: 
G rant aid to the faltering Lon Nol government 

now to show our support for our allies in time 
of need. This will retuure the rest of the world 
dial but commitments to them will be 
honored. The Cambodian regime will not hut 
long enough for the money we send to be fully 
spent, as it is already to late to save that 
floundering nation. Thus, we get the best of 
both worlds, we support an ally during a 
period of severe difficulty and get the cash sent 
over there back when Cambodia falls.' 

Of course if this was asked of an American 
official all you would get is a flat denial since 
the plan must be kept secret to work. If our 
friends knew this would be only a futile 
gesture, the whole plan would backfire. So the 
pretense of a militarily viable Cambodian 
defense has to be kept by all parties involved 
for the next few weeks. 

To the end of helping persuade the 
Congress, Lon Nol has fired his top general 
and announced major cabinet changes. This 
will only partly help however as the 
Cambodian military, will no doubt retain its 
corrupt image. The bulk of American relief 
shipments have gone to the army and not to 
the majority of the starving populace. Those 
who can pay the steep black market prices eat 
. . . those who can't, don't. It's that simple. 

The Senate has attempted to put some 
strings on any continued aid, by passing a 
resolution, without dissent, asking the Ford 
administration to assure that half the rice 
shipped to Cambodia be made available for 
free, humanitarian distribution. 

The distribution resolution was sponsored 
by Sen. Mark Hatfield (R-Orcgon) who was 
praised by Mansfield adding his feeling that 
peace in Cambodia would be "a distant 
mirage" if the Ford plan was passed. 

So we can probably predict three things for 
the next few weeks in the debate and final 
action on the Cambodian crisis. First, the 
Congress will take some action on a watered 
down appropriation to aid Lon Nol (or a 
possible new leader). This will try to satisfy all 
parties in Washington that we have taken care 
of our obligations. Second, assisted or not 
Phnom Penh will most likely fall by June with 
unknown consequences for it's residents and 
the rest of Southeast Asia. And third, the 
people of Cambodia will come upon the short 
end of the stick becauicof U ,S. foreign policy. 

From the Frog's Mouth: 

The Time is Not Now! 

To the University Community: 
The events spanning the past few days involving the budget cut of EOPS A by the S A 

Budget Committee have left bad feelings in the hearts and minds of a number of people. 
Understandably, feelings cannot be eradicated overnight. However, a genuine effort to 
work toward meaningful solutions may be a starting point. We of SA and EOPSA are, 
indeed, at that point now. 

We have recognized the inherent shortcomings within the present student government 
system. These areas are: (I) the budgetary process, and (2) lack of adequate representation 
on Central Council. We view these as crucial to not only the event's leading up till now, but 
also to the continuation of student-controlled activities here at SUNYA. 

We of SA and EOPSA are committed to the restructuring of both our structures to 
accommodate our varied needs and insure active participation of all sectors of the student 
and university population. Weask your assistance and cooperation in the development of 
rational solutions to our present situation. 

Patrick Curran, President. Student Association 
Fred Stokclin, President, EOPSA 

by Grace Jordan 
This past week, the bad news from the 

Environmental Protection Agency was 
postponement of yet another phase of the 1970 
Clean Air Act's auto emission levels. From 
Washington, the head of EPA, Russell Train, 
actually called for a slowdown in the drive to 
improve emission standards. With 
Congressional authorization, EPA is granting 
the automakers a one year extension to attain 
the standards that were originally set Tor 1975 
model cars. The extra year covers 1977 as well, 
giving automakers until 1978 to improve the 
emission cdntrols present on cars now! 

These long range plans for cleaning up the 
automobile arc somewhat in accord with 
President Ford's proposal to place a freeze on 
emission standards from 1977 to 1981. 
Although both arc weak. Ford's proposal 
would at least bean improvement over Train's 
because it requires a higher degree of 
proficiency to be obtained before the freeze 
takes affect. As of this writing the President 
has instructed Train to announce the EPA 
proposal, but has not yet approved it. 

To reduce air pollution controls of any form 
is to deal a tremendous setback to our 
environment. In the automobile industry, 
models and their parts arc stocked for ten 
years before being phased out. If in this year of 
1975, cars were being produced with faultless 
emission control, it still would not be until 
1984 thai most curs on the road hud them! 
Obviously reducing emission standards in any 
year is taking a huge step backward; one that 
we can hardly afford. 

Hut what is the rationale behind EPA's 
abrupt unnouncenient'M'iain places the blame 
on the catalytic converter, an anti-pollution 
device his agency forced on the industry in 
1973. Developed by General Motors, a 
catalytic converter is basically a hed of 
ceramic heads with a catalyst (i.e. 
plutinum/puludium) through which the 
exhaust passes, thus promoting the 
conversion of carbon monoxide and 
hydrocarbons into carbon dioxide and walcr. 

Suddenly, the word from EPA is that 
catalytic converters on new curs may be doing 
more harm than good because of thcsulphuric 
acid produced during the process. 

Train admitted just this past week, that 
EPA has known about the problem since 
February '73 but didn't consider it a serious 
one! Hut now that it is a "serious" problem 
Train says that hedoesn'twish to increase the 
use of converters in the future, thus the need 
for less strigent emission levels. All this leads 
me to wonder what the real reason is behind 
relaxed auto emission standards. 

The automobile industry, backbone of the. 
American economy, suffered some severe 
setbacks last year. Chrysler Corporation lost 
$52 million ;ind earnings at GM dropped by 
60%. The profits at Ford likewise fell 60%, 
compared with a dip of 84% at American 
Motors. All in all, what a year! 

Things arc bad all over and obviously the 
government is trying to help, but arc we sure 
this is the best answer? Once again, I'm afraid 
we're left wondering: what will be the real 
price and how long before we find out? 

X > « X » « > 0 » O » ^ ' ^ . O o»«> 

S.A.V. CLUB 
SPRING BANQUET 

April 18,1975 

5:00 PM Reception ( Pahoon Lounge) 
6:00 PM Full Dinner ( Pahoon Room ) 
8:00 PM Speaker (Lecture Center 3) 

Dr. Betty J. McWMtams 
air i ly on "Cleft Palate" 

SMI •eibei* w/awJ card- $4.75 
Sill nmber v/e • * cad- $625 
KM Maker W/BNI cat- $525 
KM M b * w/e Mai cat $1.75 
Men Maker pest w/aeel cant- $4.75 
Hen leaker pest « / • B N I cad - $125 

MONEY COLLECTED-
Staring March tt, 3-4 PM. outside Dep'r. Office 

LAST DAY FOR MONEY APRIL 9n 
i * i » o ^ ^ » « » »>«>^«n«»^«e»^^^a»«»«>«»o^« 

Multiple Sclerosis 
DANCE MARATHON 

Dance for those who can't 
Washington Ave. Armory-

9:00 am Saturday, March 15 to 
9:00 pm Sunday, March 16. 

36 hours of Dancing! Spectators Welcome! 
— • • • • 

We need volunteers to work or dance, 
-answering phones -dancers aids 
-taking tickets -serving food -clean up 

People needed to work 4-hour shifts, -food provided 
-transportation arranged 

Please cal l Melissa Worden 457-8957 for more information. 
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Pra-Medieal Dental Advisory 
Commit*** mealing for students 
Intending application to medical, 
denial ana other professional health 
care schools for Fall 1976 will be held 
Tuesday, April 8, 1 p.m., SS 119 and 
3:30 p.m. in BA 214. Procedures for 
application and recommendations 
will be discussed. All interested 
ttudents should attend one of these 
meetings. 

* * * 
Deadline fo r app l ica t ions to take 

the Apr i l 26 DAT Is M a r c h 3 1 . 

Deadline for M a y 3 MCAT is Apr i l 7. 

Application Brochures a v a i l a b l e in 

University Col lege. 

* * # 
The Chemistry C lub wi l l be ho ld ing 

a group tutor ing session for Dr. 

Laurenzi's Chem 121 class. The 

session will be held Tuesday, March 

18 at 7:00 p.m. in C h e m 1 5 1 . Thoses 

students interested in a t tend ing 

should come w i th their questions 

ready! 

Attention Spanish M a j o r s — Sigma 

Delta Pi, the Spanish Honor Society, 

will be init iating members this spr ing. 

If you; a) have h a d 3 years of col lege 

Spanish (including a t least 3 semester 

hours of a 300 level l it. course1) wi th a 

minimum GPA of 3.0. If you a r e 

interested please leave your name, 

address and phone number in Dr. 

Corrino's off ice SS 339 or' cal l 457-

4528. Any questions? Contact Diane 

Schwartzman (president) 489-6905. 

At tent ion G a y Students—- The G a y 

Al l iance meets Tuesday evenings at 9 

p.m. in CC 370. This week's meet ing 

wi l l involve a discussion of p lans for 

the upcoming "It 's nice to be G a y 

D a y . " I n t e r e s t e d persons a r e 

encouraged to a t tend . 

* * * 
Al l students interested in l iv ing a t 

Sayles Internat ional House next fa l l 

should a t t end one o f these meetings: 

Monday , M ;h 17, 9:30 p .m. a t 

Sayles, lower lounge. Tuesday, 

March 18, 9:30 p.m., CC 373. 

Information and appl icat ions wi l l be 

d is t r ibuted. If unab le to a t t end , stop 

by CC 329 mornings from M a r c h 17-

2 1 . Space is l imi ted. 

' U.S.-China Peoples Friendship 

A s s o c i a t i o n . G e n e r a l m o n t h l y 

business meet ing , Thursday, March 

20, at 7:30 p .m. 727 Madison 

Avenue. All are inv i ted. 

"Belief in Science vs. Re l ig ion"— 

this week's Bahai Club discussion 

topic. Friday at 7:30 in CC 373. Al l 

welcome to par t ic ipa te , 

O r g a n i z a t i o n a l M e e t i n g (or 

S t u d e n t B icen tenn ia l . . N e e d e d 

students interested in developing 

a n d o r g a n i z i n g B i c e n t e n n i a l 

programs for students dur ing 1975-

1976. PJrst meet ing Tuesday, March 

18 at 8:00 p m. in CC 315. For further 

in format ion call Michael Anthony 

Fentz at 7 5257 

SHARE THE RIDE 
WITH US THIS 

VACATION 
AND GET ON 

TO A GOOD THING. 
Us means Greyhound, and a lot of your fellow students 
who are already on to a good thing. You leave when you 
like. Travel comfortably. Arrive refreshed and on time 
You'll save money, too, over the increased air 
fares. Share the ride with us on weekends Holidays 
Anytime. Go Greyhound. 

GREYHOUND SERVICE 
ONE- ROUND- YOU CAN YOU 

TO WAY TRIP LEAVE ARRIVE 

4:00 pm 6:50 pm 

5:15 pm 11:40 pm 

4:00 pm 10:10 pm 

4:00 pm 7:55 pm 

Ask your agent about additional departures and return trips. 

Leaves from SUNYA circle every Friday. 

Tickets on tale across from Check-Cashing. 

For Information Call 457-6542 

New York 

Buffalo 

Rochester 

Syracuse 

$8.00 

$10.55 

$8.70 

$5.40 

$15.20 

$20.05 

$16.55 

10.30 

GO GREYHOUND 
.and leave me driving to us 

If you hovt an intern! in th* iporl 
of Arclwry comt down to rht 
Wom«n'i Auxibry Gym (2nd floor) 
ond join Albany Star* Archon. 

fueiday Evening 6:30-8:00 p.m. 
« • • 

The Outing Club takes out several 
trips every weekend to such areas as 
the Adirondacks, the White 
Mountains, and the Berkshires. We 
go sno-shoeing, x-ing, ice climbing 
and of course— spelunkingl Get 
involved and have fun. Come to our 
meeting Wednesday nights at 7:30 in 
room 315 of the Campus Center. 

. * * 
Duplicate Bridge every Monday at 

6:30 in CC 375. Cash prizes. Special 
first-of-the-month big stakes game. 
Info call Andy 7-8759. 

* * * 
There wi l l b e a meet ing of the 

F r e e z e D r i e d C o f f e e h o u s e 

Commi t tee . Sunday, M a r c h 16 a t \ 

p.m. in the Campus Center Fireside 

Lounge. Work crew sign up a n d 

posters w i l l be discussed, a long w i th 

policies for next year . A l l interestd 

persons o re welcome to a t tend . For 

more in format ion call 457-4069. 

INTERESTED FOIK 

Tuesday, March 18, is the th i rd 

annua l Employer 's Day in the hea l th 

care f i e ld . The Communi ty Heal th 

Educat ion Service (CHES) sponsers 

the event which br ings dozens of 

employers in the heal th care f i e l d — 

hosp i t a l s , government agencies, 

nur ing homes a n d o thers— together 

wi th the public and students from al l 

a r e a co l l eges to discuss job 

opportuni t ies. . . . , r.j.i... ,<.... >>. 

Anyone intersted in p lay ing Gir ls 

Field Hockey this ta l l must cal l Coach 

Rhenish a t 7-4535 or contact her in PE 

242 to sign up . 

Remember: sign-up for qu ie t halls 

starts March 17 First come, first 

served!! 

Episcopal Services are held every 

5unday evening at 7 p.m. in the 

C h a p e l House Al l denominat ions a r e 

welcome! 

Transportat ion in fo rmat ion a n d 

r e g i s t r a t i o n f o r m s f o r t h e 

Internat ional leadersh ip Seminar 

M a r c h 22-29. Can be ob ta ined a t the 

Campus Center CARP tab le or at 336 

State St. A lbany 12210, Tel. 463-

3007. Visits can also be a r r a n g e d a t 

/ou convenience. 

W o m e n ' s S o f t b a l l — w o m e n 

n e e d e d , lo complete t e a m . Please 

j o i n . P r o c h c e 3 : 3 0 - 5 : 3 0 M-F. 

Interested contact Ms. Rhenish or 

Diana Woolis 7-8964. 

Audltiomw«kMiKt«dfor a Women's 
Coffeehouse en Friday, March 14,3-

t 5 p.m. intthe Women's Center., State 
Quad Cooptr 100. AH f•mirth* talent 
welcome) 

* • * 
The Veteran'* Information Center 

in Draper Hall, Room 141 is open 
Monday thru Friday. We have 
information on Educational Benefits, 
a veteran's work-study program and 
a tutorial service. Want to know why 
that check isn't coming? or just want 
to rap, come down or call 472-7563. 

• * * 
Jewish Students Coalition presents: 

Dr. Roman Vishniac Tuesday, April 8, 
1975,8 p.m., LC 1. He will present a 
multi-media presentation on "The 
Holocaust: Resistance and the 
Warsaw Ghetto Uprising." This will 
be to commemorate Yom Hashoah. 

• * » 
Earth Week '75 sponsored by the 

P.Y.E. Club is scheduled for April 10-
16. Main theme: World Food Crisis. 
For a ny on fo ca II457-8569 or come to 
FA 218, 

* * * 
Lecture: M a r c h 19 2:00-3:00 p .m. 

in Fine Arts B ldg. Room 126. Prof. L. 

Andrew: "Parad ise Rega ined: 19th 

century Architecture o f the l a t t e r -Day 

Saints." 

Learn a b o u t the Dangers of 

N u c l e a r P o w e r . C o m e see 

informat ive fi lms M a r c h 19 a n d 

March 20, 7:30 p .m . , LC 19. 

Ar t class a\ JCA needs ma le nude 

m o d e l . Must be ava i l ab le on 

T h u r s d a y s , 1 : 3 0 - 4 : 3 0 p . m . If 

interested contact Judy W a t e r m a n a t 

t .Junior. College, of A l b a n y . ;,j \\A\ jU , 

Women's Counsel l ing Co l lec t i ve— 

a service by w o m e n , for w o m e n . 

W a l k in, cal l in . 332 Hudson Ave. , 

A l b a n y ( b e t w e e n Lark a n d Dove)M-F 

6-9:00. 462-6739. 

Friends, do need someone to let 

out your hassles to? M i d d l e Earth's 

hotl ine 7-5300 a n d drop- in center 

prov ide a 24-hour service far you. 

You need not g ive your name and 

you still can be assured of ge t t ing 

d rug , sex, housing or p reganancy 

info. Counselors a re ava i l ab le for 

help in specif ic p rob lem a reas . So, 

drop- in at Ten Eyck Ha l l , Dutch Q u a d 

a n d f ind out for yourself that M.E. is 

peop le who a re concerned a n d care 

abou t your p r o b l e m s — no matter 

how big or smal l they may a p p e a r . 

If you need help wi th any campus 

hassles, bureaucra t i c run arounds, or 

reams of t ime consuming red t a p e -

come to the 5.A. O m b u d s m a n . CC 

353 (7-5451) or CC 346 (7-6542). 

Viewpoint itojojBi wweiif, ttnnM* 
graphic, people. Col l ab 497-4754. 

• • • • - . * 

Poetry Workshop Tuesday 
evenings at 7:30 in HU 290. Bring 
your work. AH welcome. Info: 465-
8996. 

• * * 
The Marines are looking for a few 

good men. Are you one of them? For 
more information, contact Matt 
Meyer, Box 356, Dutch Quod. 

• # • 
The poetry of Wil l iam Butler Yeats 

is the subject of a n important lecture, 

to be given by Professor Helen 

Vend I or of Boston University, on 

Wednesday afternoon, March 19th, 

at 4:15 p.m.,' in the Humanities 

Lounge, under English department 

sponsorship. Professor Vendler, a 

distinguished writer on contemporary 

poetry, has been one of the judges 

for Pulitzerawards, reviews regularly 

for the N e w York Times Sunday Book 

Review, a n d is the author of two 

highly regarded studies: "Yeats' 'A 

Vision' a n d the Later Plays" a n d "On 

Extended W i n g s " ( a study o f W a l l a c e 

Stevens). A book o n the poe t ry of 

George Herber t is in the press, a n d 

Ms. V e n d l e r has also wr i t ten 

extensively in journals, on poe t ry in 

genera l . 

Oppor tun i t i es for Volunteers in 

Gove rnmen t— Two organizat ions 

need volunteer, par t - t ime student 

assistance: The Research Commit tee 

of the NYS Assembly needs g r a d u a t e 

or upper-d iv is ion u n d e r g r a d u a t e 

students to do research in the areas 

o f g o v e r n m e n t a d m i n i s t r a t i o n , 

o r g a n i z a t i o n a l b e h a v i o r a n d 

i .economics. Twenty hours a week for 

,1,975 Legislative Session. Common 

C a u s e , the g o o d government 

g r o u p — needs a par t - t ime lobbyist 

to work in the Legislature. A 

g r a d u a t e o r u p p e r - d i v i s i o n 

unde rg radua te is des i red. If you are 

interested in ei ther o l the unpa id 

m e a n i n g f u l w o r k expe r i ences , 

contact the Assistant to the Dean, 

G r a d u a t e School of Public Af fa i rs , 

2 3 7 1 , Mohawk Tower, Room 905, 

WHAT TO DO 

Like to dance , par ty , or just socialize 

wi th peop le , then come to (the 

SUNYA Nite Club a n d Discoteque act 

this Saturday in Brubacher Hal l , 

snackbar, down town do rm , March 

15, 9 p.m.- 3 a .m. " C o m e out , get 

d o w n , release yoursel f . " 

There's Israeli Folk Dancing in the 

G y m , each Thursday nite a t 8:30. 

Instruction a n d Requests. It's held in 

the Dance Studio on the third f loor. 

Come a n d join us. You' l l enjoy the 

fun. 

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • o ^ » ^ » W e ^ o ^ e W o W o ^ o ^ o W « » » 

Last Chance 

For t h e NEW 

H+L 

M H W 

Due to popular demand we are holding 

1 last mandatory interest meeting 

Saturday March 15 1:00 pm Indian Flag Room 

Come-join an experiment in alternate living 

Call Zanne 7-5232 or Judy 7-5231 
m m m M M M M M M M M M M M M * — — — — — 
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International Leadership Seminar 
March8-15,22-29/Barrytown,NY 

Summer 1973 
120 Tokyo Uni­
versity students 
and 140 Oxford 
and Cambridge 
students attended 
the 40-day 
seminar. 

•^-A. 

I1' . .. 

The nature of God and Christ 
will be analyzed, as well as 

their relevance to orthodox 

Christianity, Eastern religions 

and a new emerging wqrld 

religious, cultural, political and 

economic system 

Social consciousness was awakened as the British students discussed and worked to­
gether with international staff members who had been studying the Principles. Abstract 
concepts were given a practical test in this situation. Group interaction led to much in­
dividual soul-searching which was of lasting mutual benefit to staff and students alike. 

The philosophic implications 

of a harmonized view 

Western image of God and 

Eastern principle of Yin-Yang 

» * Si-

Spring 1974 

Participants came from major universities on the East Coast. 

Summer 1974 
T!«»3-:r -. -

During the summer of 1974, the second International Leadership Seminar was held. 120 students from 
Japan, 80 from Korea and 120 from France, England and Germany lived together for 40 days. 

Sponsored By 

Student Quotes 
"At times I was simply overwhelmed at 
the thought of these ideas being the 
truth," 

"Outstanding quality of lectures, good 
content, impeccable format." 

"The people from C.A.R.P. taught me 
more about the principles just from 
their actions." 

/ 0 \ The Collegiate Association for the 
V < y Research of Principles (C. A. R. P.) 

International Leadership Seminar 

March 22-29 
Barrytown, N.Y. 

International Training Center. Barrytown, New York 

ORIENTATION MEETING 
TUESDAY MARCH 18 

\%}\\\ \ 

7 pm CC rm. 375 

Tuition $30 
includes meals and room 

Transportation will 
be provided 

Soccer competition between British and Japanese students in Denver at the joint 
student conference. 

For more information, contact C.A.R.P. at: 

Campus Center Table 
tel 463-3007 

336 State St 
Albany, N Y 12210 

'-,,--
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FOR SALE 

Baroque lute with hard caie. Call 
Alan 4825997. 

BSR turntable. Excellent condition. 
Very reasonable. Todd 438-7019. 

Wesco work boots, handmade, mid-
calf, vibram sole, black, women's site 
A-6V4. Excellent condition. Maryann 
465-9392 evenings. 

Pots, toaster, towels, breadbox 
bookcase, things for your summer 
apartment. No reasonable offer 
refused. 482-254S. 

Aires Viscount 35 mm Rangefinder 
camera. Very good condition. Case 
included. 482-2545. 

Avon Products call 438-1439. 

Fuji 10-speed in very good condition 
SI 50 . Price discussible. Call 
463,2917, 436-0262. 

Two Mickey Thompson Indy Profile 
1.70-15 tires with "ETMAG" rims: from 
1969 Econoline Supervan 200. 
Package $70. Randy at 472-6782. 

'67 ES 335 Gibson electric guitar. 
With case $300. Cajftent 7-5345. 

Olympus Pen-ft. 1.2 lens. $150. 489-
8894 after 7 p.m. 

BflJ mU m "•ili'ff 
Marantz 2230.Receiver. Lfttifpo $4QQ 
sacrifice at $250. 1 yr. old. Call Mitch 
462-3044. 

HOUSING 
Female Roommate wanted to share 
furnished apt. near busline. 
Available April 1st. Call Jeri 434-
0691. 

I'm looking for a few people who are 
conscious of the shortcomings of city-
life and yearn to be out in the 
countryside. I would like to get a farm 
or house with some land for the 
summer and next year. 434-4000. 
Eddie. 

To sublet for summer; rent for fall. 
Huge 2 story house, 4 bedroom, large 
kitchen (with 2 refrigerators), large 
living and dining rooms, full attic. 
Located close to busline, shopping 
laundry and lark tavern. Call 463-
5634. 

Unfurnished. Heated. Large 4-
bedroom apartment. Upper 
Madison. S320. Available June 1st, 
482-0111. 

Attention off-campus seniors: If your 
2-4 bedroom opt. will be available 
next semester any information will be 
apprec ia ted . Please contact 
Malakay or Nadine at 472-5011. 

Wonted: 3 bedroom apartment: 
$180 to S220, on busline, coll Pat, 
457-7924. 

Two women interested in living off 
campus: need others to share apt. 
with—preferably 2 women. If 
interested in searching for 4 
bedroom apt, with us, call Laurie, Jill 
4360262. 

Roommate needed lo share 
apartment—occupancy on or near 
May 1st. 465-4292. 

Nice apartment to sublet with other 
male college students. On SUNY 
busline w/w carpeting washer/dryer 
good friendly atmosphere. Furnished 
Call 472-9518. 

Furnished unhealed 3 bedroom flat, 
suitable for 3 girls. 55 Partridge. 

4 bedroom arid 2, bedroom 
apartments located on Weitern 
Avenue. Call evenings 869-5291, 

On* bedroom unfurnished, heat and 
hot water, range, refrigerator, $ 120, 
463-7183, gay preferred. 

SERVICES 

Light moves. Locally. Weekends 
Cheap. 438-0697. 

Beginning piano lessons from music 
major. Call Lorri 7-7862. 

Typing: professional quality, quick 
service, reasonable rates. 237-0858. 

Medical, dental 1 law school 
applicants: Have you applied for 
1975 classes, but without success so 
far? Perhaps we can help you get an 
acceptance. Box 16140, St. Louis, Mo. 
63105. 

Typing—my home near SUNY—• 
e x p e r i e n c e d P h . D . thesis, 
manuscripts—Pat Jones 438-1450. 

Manuscript typing service 869-5225. 

Typing done in my home. 482-8432. 

Typing done in my home—869-2474. 

OVERSEAS JOBS— Australia, 
Europe, S. America, Africa. Students 
all professions and occupations $700 
to $3000 monthly. Expenses paid, 
o v e r t i m e , s ightsee ing . Free 
i n f o r m a t i o n . TRANSWORLD 

oil RESEARCH. iCQd D_ept. BS.iB.QoRox 
.,1!608,lCorte.Mad.era,,C,A, 9492,5.,,.,, 

Righteous "Foreign" Auto repair, 
specializing in Volvos, 501 Yates 
Street, Near corner of Madison & 
Ontario. Phone 438-5546. 

Need a photographer? Weddings, 
Portraits, Albums, artist's and other 
Portfolios, etc . . . Whatever your 
photographic needs, call Joe: 457-
3002. 

Classical guitar lessons beginner— 
advanced 456-1201. 

"STREETNOISE" Rock band for hire. 
Call 438-0582. 

WANTED 

Wanted—FM car radio and 8-track 
tape deck. Call Sandra 7-5184. 

Rubber boat and motor. After 7 p.m. 
489.8894. 

Car radio or tape deck. Sandra 438-
7019 or 457-5184. 

HELP WANTED 

Kittens need home. 463-7331. 

Help Me, Spock! 

Hostess and waitress positions 
avai lable . Fall or part-t ime. 
Applicants should be self-assumed, 
bright and intelligent. Call evenings 
436-8215. 

Adventurous patient gentleman 
willing to instruct enthusiastic young 
woman in the art of POOL (billiards, 
not water ) . Cynthia 457-8870 
evonings. 

RIDE/RIDERS 
WANTED 

Ride wanted—will share expenses. 
Shoperama, Rotterdam—SUNYA 
arrive MWF 9:—5:00 approx, Call 
Phyllis 457-4710 will return call, 

Ride wanted to Florida. Leaving 
3/21-22. Jeff 472-5139. 

LOST&FOUND 

If anyone found a beige knit hat with 
red, brown, yollow strlpi on 3 /9 , 
please colt 472-8709. H was a special 
gift. 

Lost: 1976 Aquamarine SUNY ring 
Initials RC on inside. Please cal Rob 
371-6305. Reward $10.00. 

Lost—pair of eyeglasses in a brown 
case. Reward if found. Call 457-
4032. 

Lost: plain, silver cross from man's 
chain sentimental value. Please call 
457-8762. 

lost: Old Shaeffer red-brown pen. 
Generation pen. Lost lower Patroon 
lounge, March 4. REWARD. Call 355-
0276, ask for Will. 

To the racists who called me whitey 
when I walked into yourmovie in I C 7 
last, Sunday: I've never been colled 
whitey before. You made me cry. Did 
you get even? I gueii it was only an 
ebony affair, Love you too, Ivory. 

Prorlneous 
Knows a l l 
Sees all! 

Frodo 

PERSONALS 

Dear Lake— 
Happy Birthday, honey. Did you 

ever get the feeling that this is only 
the beginning? Well it is. Today isthe 
first day of the rest of your life. Hap­
py today and a million tomorrows. I 
love you. 

Sweet Nothing 

To the Scrubs, 
Thanks for a good season and for 

being such a fine group. The real vic­
tory for me this season was meeting a 
good group of guys with good team 
spirit, but next year I expect the 
championship!!! 

BIG MAN 

Dear Cutie, 
Thanks for throwing your 20 years 

of experience my way. - . , 
Lover 

r - •...... >J ft J :. 

Party at Fred J's, good time had by 
all because Larry S. won't be there. 

Dollboy's Yes-Yes 
is a 

Dollchild's No-No 
Bob, 

Let's make this coming year as 
good as the last. 

Love, 
Paula 

On March 9, six uniquely beautiful 
girls revived my faith that love and 
friendship are the most important 
things in life. Thank-you alt fora feel­
ing I have not know in a long time. 

Love, 
Eddie 

Lockjaw— 
Wishing you and 1108 a "terrific" 

time on your birthday. Hopehis input 
is working for a change. 

Love, 
Mikiey & Treefrog 

Utile B.— 
"Could it be I'm falling in love with 

you baby," — yes, it could. 
Honey 

Party at Larry S's, Good time had by 
all because Fred J. won't be there. 

Happy Birthday Jane 
From .Barry and the psychologist 

Hey Mark Jay Woinstein, 
I finally got into your pants and 

Dolancy 303 knows it. 
Michelle 

"If you can't dazzly them with your 
brilliance, baffle them with your 
bullshit." 

Lover on' Hudson, 
We made it to our second—Let's 

took forward to our future together. 
Hugs & Kisses, 

Your Person Purple Pumkin 

Sexy, 
Believe me, you have nothing to 

worry about. Keep smiling?" 
Guess who. 

Dumbo, 
Whoever said "beware the Ides of 

March" didn't know you. Thanks 
Love always, 

Knut 

VCCM 
You ' re one helluva Pizza 

Woman!!!!!! 
BMOS 

JBL, 
I give you all my love, always 

happy S3! 
So glad to know you 

I love you, 
SJS 

IOW F: 
Welcome to SUNYA! (Glad your 

condenser didn't break. Hmm . . . ) 
From your loving Old .Attic. 

Schwartzie, 
For once, / can't think of anything 

to say, just Happy Birthday. 
Katie 

To Wendy ^ ; , 
Happy Birthday Snoote-Wcl^'" jJ ! U * 

From Your Two Puppies 

Happy Birthday, fella 
the GUYS 

Sue and Marilyn, the cute R.A.'s: 
Congratulations and much luck! 

Love you both, 
Bets 

Grace and Brian, 
Good luck tonight. I know you'll 

both be great. 
Randi 

Quiet Students speak out: Special 
Dorm Sign-up at Fulton Mon. 17th. 

T.i.doublegrr, 
Hug Me! 

Pooh 

TELESCOPES CAN BE FUN TO THE 
FULTON BOYS THAT GET NO RUN!! 

WATCH our/ 
E. Robert Blaine (of Cornell Fame) 

will be roaming the campus this 
weekend for the 2nd Annual B. Bob­
by Blaine Dayf Tickets: two dolla 
cheap! Plenty funl Offer void where 
prohibited by law! 

Herman (of Troy) 
This is your 1st official Personal! 

Have a nice day! 
— Lisa 

Dear Pumpkin— 
I love you more every doy I'm with 

you. Happy 2nd, with many more to 
come. 76? 

—Mickey 

Keep a good thing going—Re-
elect Curron •• 

let's give Pat Curran another term! 

To Our Jode: 
Precious things come in small 

packages, contrary to popular belief. 
Happy Birthday Pig let! (sorry) 

Love always, L.T.F.D. 

Archero— 
Just your basic "Happy Birthday" 

M a , Mo, Rhon, Rob, Lin. 
with Love, 

And Now . . . In Concert— 
Elizabeth Tudor, 

"My friend the banker" . . . "I'm 
so fucking sexy" . . . "I'll show you a 
picture, . . " Happy Birthday to our 
dishwasher. 

Love, 
The Nerds 

Babe, 
We deserved it; we got it! 

Your Sweetie 

To the Basic Jane, 
Granted, its your birthday, (i.e. 

Happy Birthday). In light of this 
Havea-Nagila! 

The Spirit of Archer Present 

Come to the Indian Quad 
Coffeehouse Sat. nite at 8:30 in 
"Adiruga" basement. Music by Steve 
and Dave. Refreshments. Free. 

Tars hall, 
I've known you almost 15 years — 

do you think I'd forget your birthday7 

Happy 820. 
The Roach 

To My Friend — "Our responsibility is 
not discharged by an announcement 
of virtuous ends. Our responsibility is 
to achieve these objectives with social 
invention, with political skill, and ex­
ecutive vigor." 

• ^ ^ • ^ - ^ r e s i d e n t John F. Kennedy 

Richie, 
Happy Birthday, Sweetheart! 

You're the best! 
I.L.Y., 

Laurie 
P.S. Hans called last night. He sends 
his love, also. 

Dear Ma, 
Happy Birthday Remember—each 

year adds another Karat. 
(and I'm the one who cashes in on 

the deal) 
All my love, 

Andrea 
P.S. Finally-the whole paper 

Happy 35th Anniversary to Mr. and 
Mrs. Aaron Woloz. Remember the 
good of days of meeting on the sly • 
Well, you beat the opposition. After 
35 years you deserve all the hap­
piness I wish (and each otherl) 

Niece 
AJ 

ZWEIF, 
I'll love you always. The happiest 

and brightest days are yet to come. 
Happy B-Day Sweets. 

Love, 
Cow 

M.L.B.M.— 
Happy Birthday—Your present is 

'Trouble' 
Ray J 

Ynsllow Jane, 
Maaan, it's your birthday! Higgit! 

Machahyor, 
The Ghost of Syosset Past 

A new sorority on campus: LICKA 
DICKA SUCK FUCK 

Randy Gold is all right. I don't care 
what anyone else says. 

His Roommate 

The great Protineous is Homy!! 

Dear Questions, 
It's been a fantastic month. 

Much Love, 
No Answers 

I think I'll just take 30 laps and do for­
ty or fifty wind sprints. I can't be 
bothered to rest In peace. 

President Curran In '75. 

Celebrate PROTINEOUS LIVES DAY 
March 151 

A 22-Gun Birthday Salute, to the one 
and only one Edward C. Williams Jr. 
(Von Drako): 

From: Lucien Fontaine, The Horse 
(Gilmore), Rick's Tips, Bo tho Bar 
Boiler, Amy,captain Barry Otto 
Preminger, Al-T, Patrick Jim Bouie, 
Chop Meat, Ray Maye, and a host of 
others including: 

Fred S-A-N-F-O-R-D. 

Karen & E.G.: Best wishes for a 
smashing success! With love, Your 
TELETHON staff 

Students planning to take 

COMMUNITY 

SERVICE 

Come la 

Interest Dity 

Tuesday, March 18 

Campus Center Ballroom 

10 a.m. to 4 p.m. 

Agencies will be there 
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U/AMWAMIA/AMWAM^ I 
League 1 
I. Panama Red 
j.Colloius 
3, Soul Spirit 

4, Bells 
5, Dancing Mach 

6,Undeciders 

League IIA 
I.APA 

2. Players 
3. STB 
4. Rebels 
5. Drop Trou 

League 11B 
1. Henry's Tub 
2. Papas 
3. Egress 
4. Johnson 
5. Overdrive 

League I1C 
1. Mama's Children 

2. Herkimer 

3. Yes 
4. Untouchables 
5. H. Trucking 

W-L 
9-1 
8-2 
6-4 
3-7 
2-8 
2-8 

9-1 
7-3 
b-4 
5-5 
3-7 

8-2 
8-2 
7-3 
4-6 
2-8 

10-0 
7-3 
5-5 
5-5 
1-9 

League IIIA 
1. Kuzorchcs 
2. Carbunklc 
3. Shish 
4. Trojans 
5. Ribit 
6.JSC 
7. Mung 
8. Cock-pit 
9. Ferns 

League Mill 

1. Longhoms 
2. Dr. Johns 
3. Wcedies 
4. Schupak's 
5. Fcrrit 
6. Pips 
7. Otr-B 
8. Becrwall 
9. EH I' 

league I lit' 
1. Mud 
2. Miracles 
3. Mardi tints 
4. Clowns 
5. Eaglebcak 
6. Trip 
7. Chuckers 
8. TXO 
9. Follies 

W-L 
9-0 
8-1 
6-3 
5-4 
54 
3-6 
3-6 
2-7 
2-7 

9-0 
8-1 
6-3 
54 
5-4 
4-5 
3-6 
3-6 
0-9 

' ) • < ) 

7-2 
6-3 
5-4 
5-4 
4-5 
3-6 
2-7 
0-9 

•j£gSOB£S3B *-J*r*n 

Outsibe 
Inn 

3 3 4 WASHINGTON AVE. 

Sooner or later 

you know we're gonna 

get you! 

t^f^t vm 
<Q 

< 

S/i ^Bk 
ffycc/ftHOP 

A 

^^ARTSTIDFOLE \ 

DOMINIC FISCHER 
^L nulti -dimensional mime ty 

vv> p e r f o r m a n c e and u > o r k s h o p v | i / 

A KTWEENIAWANDGUAIL moKWommcMM 0 * 

C(**sprs ***** 
s * 

League H ID 
1. Potter 
2. LcMont 
3. OTB 
4. Roids 
5. 1st Floor 
6. Florvdories 
7. Winnie the Pooh 
8. Polachek's 
9. Homegrown 
10. Frigate 

League HIE 
1. AldenSW 
2. Price Choppers 
3. SUNY To Go 
4. Pax II 
5. Pit 

6. Flintstones 
7. Texas Opt 
8. Hig Victims 
9. lappan Zees 

league 11IF 
1. Au Contrairc 
2. Had Dogs 
3. Zoo I I 
4. Colonials 
5. The Morgue 
6. l-'rien s 
7. Ottos 
8. Hig A's Army 

league IVA 
1. AI'A Strokes 

2. Newcomers 
3. I- rani C liecse 
4. Syknrora 
5. Mumps 

6. Ham hssence 
7. Al tiarcia 

W-L 
8-1 
8-1 
6-3 
6-3 
4-5 
4-5 
4-5 
3-6 
2-7 
0-9 

9-0 
8-1 
5 4 
5-4 
4-5 
4-5 
4-5 
3-6 
2-7 

8-1 
8-1 
7-2 
4-5 
4-5 
3-6 
2-7 
1-8 

9-0 
8-1 
7-2 
54 
54 
3-6 

2-7 

League IVB 
1. Who Cares 
2. One Last -Try 
3. Trifectas 
4. Dollar Bills 
5. Adiruga 
6. Orig Derelicts 
7. Bloodfarts 
8. STB 
9. Clyde's Crew 

League IVC 
1. Family 
2. Scrubs 
3. Reggae 
4. A PA Apaches 
5. B.D.'s 
6. Oy-Oys 
7. Pootanc 
8. Dribblers 
9. Space Dwarfs 
10. Perverts 

W-L 
9-0 
8-1 
7-2 
5-4 
4-5 
3-6 
1-8 
1-8 
1-8 

9-0 
7-2 
5 4 
54 
4-5 
4-5 
4-5 
3-6 
3-6 
2-7 

The A.M.LA. basketball finals 
will be played Sunday. The League 
IV final will be at 1:30; League III at 
2:30; League 11 at 3:30. The public is 
invited to attend. 

The A.M.I.A. Free Throw Con­
test will be held Sunday al 12:30 p.m. 
Two-person teams arc required. No 

pre-iign up necessary, but be there 
promptly. 

The A.M.I.A. Pinball Tourna­
ment was held March 10. Order of 
finish was as follows: Singles: 
Robert Hui, Mark Fisher, and Gary 
Leaderman; Doubles: Dave Thom­
son and Steve Hubbs; Alan Soloway 
and Ron Woods; and Steve Ganz 
and Gary Leaderman. 

Softball captain's meetings are 
scheduled for Tuesday (League I -
windmill pitch allowed), Wednesday 
(League II - no windmill or 
slingshot) and Thursday (League III 
- slow pitch) in CC 315 at 3:30 p.m. 
Rosters, which may be picked up in 
the A.M.I.A. Office (CC 356). and 
$10 bond money arc due at the 
meetings. No dough, and you wait 
till next year. 

Captain's note: No one may par­
ticipate in an A. M. LA. Softball game 
unless he has already signed the team 
roster-medical form. Anyone 
violating this risks suspension from 
play and his/her team will 
automatically forfeit any gamc(s) 
he/she plays in. 

There will be a meeting fur all per­
sons interested in officiating 
A.M.I.A. sol'tbull Wednesday. 7 
p.m.. in the Patroon Lounge in the 
Campus Center. This meeting is 
mandatory. No show, no ump. 

NFL To Change Rules? 

8. IXO 

NEW YORK AP-One-loot-in-and-
onc-foot-out may be the ordeMifthc 
day for • 'pas's receivers'." Av&' the 
traditional toss of the coin may 
become history when National Foot-
hall league rules changes are con­
sidered next week. 

I he NIT.'s annual meeting starts 
Monday in Honolulu and, along 
with naming the site of the Super 

CAMP COUNSELOR OPENINGS 
UNDERGRADUATE STUDENTS 

(Mm.agaW&cornplelionalaf leuil I vanr ol college ) 

GRADUATE STUDENTS and FACULTY MEMBERS 

THE ASSOCIATION OF PRIVATE CAMPS 
. . . comprising ISO outstanding Boys, Girh. Brolhei-Siilar 
and Co-Cd Camps, located throughout the New England, Mid­
dle Atlantic States and Canada. 
. . INVITES YOUR INQUIRIES concerning summer employment as Head 

Counselors. Group Leaders. Specialties. General Counselors. 
Write, Phone, or Call In Person 

Association of Pr ivate Camps — Dept. C 
55 W. 42 St., New York NY 10034 t i l l ) OX 5.2*54 

Howl XI next season's Super Bowl 
will be in Miami on Jan. 18.1976 
the- leilglie will consider a lew 
changes to open up the game even 
more. 

Among them is a rule similar to 
college hall, one introduced into the 
pro ranks by the World Toolhall 
League last year. Under it, a pass 
receiver would need only one loot in­
bound* to make a catch legal. I he 
current NIT. rule is "both feet in." 

Other rule changes 10 be con­
sidered would: 

•Eliminate the presume coin flip, 
giving the home team the option to 
receive or kick off or defend a par­
ticular goal. 

>:•»:•»>»>»»»>»:*>>:»»»»»»:•»: 
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WOMEN'S 
INTRAMURAL 

SOFTBALL 
is starling right after Easter Vacation. 
Pick up rosters from Intramural Office, 
CC 356. Deadline for returning rosters: 

Friday morning, March 21 :•: 
*{• 

Individuals and incomplete teams sign •:• 
up in CC 356 we'll find you a team!! {':• 
Questions? Call Denny Elkin, 7-7210. •:• 

% 
Referees needed. Anyone interested in being a $ 

••• 
referee for women's intramural softball, call :;! 

( amy 457-4300. !§ 

SEE YOU PLAYIN' % 
SOFTBALL! % 

Sponsored by Women's Intramural and Recrea- & 

••• 
lion Assoc. funded »r student association t^ 

Sail either In September 
or February, with the ship 
as your classroom and the 
world your campus . . . com­
bine accredited study with 
fascinating visits to (ha fa­
bled ports of the Caribbean, 
Africa, the Mediterranean, 
and the Americas. Over 10,-
000 undergraduates from 
450 colleges have already 
sailed with WCA — join 
theml Financial aid avail­
able. Write today for frea 
catalog. 

WCA, Chapman College 
Box F, Orange, CA 9 2 6 M 
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It's Wait Till Next Year For Danes 

w, 

by Brace Maggki 
"We feel that we let our fans 

down," said Coach Doe Sauers 
about his team's recent poor perfor­
mance in the N C A A tournament. 
His basketball team wil l have the 
whole summer to reflect on their two 
lopsided losses. 

It was an unfortunate way to close 
out an otherwise successful season. 
The team provided much excitement 
for this university and Great Dane 
fans wi l l long remember Albany's 
upset victory over Brockport. The 
team fulfilled its goal by making it to 
the NCAA tourney. . Many of the 
ballplayers, though, mentally let­
down when they got to Brockport, us 
they played like they were satisfied 
just to participate in the tournament. 

For I'ete Koola it wasn't a happy 
occassion as he closed out his one 
and a half year career at Albany 
State. "He was it line captain for us," 
said Sauers. "I 'etcdid all we've asked 
from him. Heplaycd thebestdefense 
inside. Pete always guarded the op­
ponent's big man. He would handle 
any big man. as long as he had a little 
help." 

I'ete never was a hig offensive 
threat as the Danes did not get the 
ball inside. If you you don't have the 
bull, you can't score. 

With the loss of Koola. much of 
the pressure for next year wi l l fall on 
Tom Morphis. who wil l have to 
guard the opposition's big men. This 
year Morphis had a motivation 
problem. In some games lorn played 
fine ball, while in other games Tom 
looked lost on the court. Morphis 
must learn to stay out of foul trou­
ble, as Doc Sauers often had to hold 
Tom out of the starting lineup 
because of this problem. Defensive­
ly, Tom improved greatly but Doc 
feels he still has a way to go. 

Most Improved 
Bob Audi was the most improved 

player on the team. He averaged ten ' 
points a game and was the team's 
leading rcbounder. Hcalso became a 
solid defensive ballplayer. Audi 
played gutty ball all year as he was a 
real competitor. "He always played 
his best," said Sauers. If the Danes 

had ten players with Audi's desire, 
they would have some team. 

Kevin Kcane should see much 
more action next year, as he moves 
into the third forward slot. His 
progress in the early going was 
hampered by an ankle injury but he 
played pretty well for a freshman. 
"He did a fine all around job," said 
Sauers. "Wc have to get more 
rebounding out of h im next year." 
Kev in played aggressively on 
defense. Offensively, Kevin can 
shoot, but as the season progressed, 
he seemed to lose confidence in his 
shooting. In the NCAA's, he would 
pass, rather than shoot, even when 
he was open. 

Albany's three sophomore guards 
provided much of the Danes'scoring 
punch but they all had their troubles 
defensively. "1 was not pleased with 
any of my guards defensively," said 
Sauers. "Our defense was hurting 
without Rich Kapner (lost due to a 
shoulder injury)." Kapner's steady­
ing value was also missed. 

Leading Scorer 

Eddie Johnson was the Danes' 
leading scorer. Johnson seemed to 
rise to the occasion as his best games 
came against Buffalo State and 
Brockport. Against some of the 
Danes' lesser opponents, he had his 
tips and downs. "Offensively, he had 
a great year," said Sauers. "He still 
had some ball handling problems. 
He had better body control, hut he 
got carried away near the end of the 
season." 

Clary Trevett broke the Danes' 
asset record this year, assisting on 
153 baskets. He played his best 
basketball when he concentrated on 
being a playmaker. His move to 
forward proved unsuccessful. Gary 
shot more this year but Doc felt he 
didn't shoot that well. 

Mike Suprunovicz showed much 
improvement this year, especially on 
offense. His shots were dropping 
w i th greater consistency. On 
defense, Mike worked very hard and 
this showed in his game. 

The Danes finished the year al 15-
10, their worst record since 1970. To 
be able to get past the first round of 

the NCAA's next year, Albany must 
make some changes. "Wc need three 
things for next year," said Sauers. 
"We need more defense from our 
guards, more rebounding and some 
inside scoring." Whether the Danes 
can get this help from with in, 
remains to be seen. Much of that 
help might have to come from the 
bench, recruitment, or from the 
junior varsity. 

Dave Lanahan showed some 
promise in his brief appearances but 
his lack o f strength wi l l l imit his 
effectiveness. The .IV had a 
successful season and quite a few 
ballplayers could be moving up to 
the varsity. "There was alot of 
evenness of ability on the .IV," said 
Sauers. "They must work over the 
summer, improving their skills, to be 
of some help." 

Currently, Doc is placing much of 
bis efforts on recruitment. Recruit­
ment is a very difficult business at 
Albany, since coaches have no 
scholarships to offer and admission 
requirements are very high. Doc 
really won't know how successful he 
is unti l the beginning of school next, 
year. 

The team has good potential for 
next year as only Koola wil l be miss­
ing. Albany, though, wi l l be playing 
a much tougher schedule next year 
us they wil l play eight of the ten. 
topped ranked Division II and I I I 
New York State teams, with the ad­
dit ion of top ranked C'W Post and 
third ranked Union. I he Danes wil l 
be participating in a Shrine spon­
sored holiday tournament hosted by 
Muskingum College in New Con­
cord, Ohio. Albany wilt jo in Juniant, 
DePauw and the host on December 
29 and 30. 

Ihe pressure is certainly going to 
be on the Danes to return to the 
NCAA regional tournament. The 
team can no longer use the copout 
that they are so young. Three of the 
five starters have two years of varsity 
ball under their belts. Participating 
in the tournament was good ex­
perience for the Danes. Losing badly 
just might make Albany that much 
hungrier next year. 

hale 

The Albany State basketball team in their disastrous pertormance at 
the NCAA tournament this past weekend. 

Women Close Season 

hoi. 

The women's basketball team (pictured above) enjoyed playing al 
home this yaar at they were 2-2 at University Gym. 

Albany Stale's Women's varsity 
basketball team closed out a disap­
pointing season with a 7.1-42 loss to 
Hartwick on the victor's home court. 

Albany started off the game well 
and were down by only 3 at Ihc 
halfway mark, 29-26 but that was it. 
For all practical purposes. Albany 
State never came out of the 
loekerroom to finish the game, as 
Hartwick ran away with it. They out-
scored Albany 44-16 in the second 
half. 

Cathy Dower lead the Albany 
scorers with 10 points. The scoring 
was well distributed as co-captain 
Wendy Oath had 9, Sue Winthrop 
had H, Vicki Girko had 7.and Nancy 

Bartlc had (>. 
The women finished the season 

with 3 wins and 9 losses. This was 
Barbara Palm's first losing season as 
a coach. I he women won 2 of their 4 
home games for a .501) record at 
home but they were able to win only 
I of their 8 away games. Albany 
State beat SUNY at Binghamlon 
and SUC-New Palt/ by large 
margins on its home court. They ulso 
defeated the Brooklyn College's 

junior varsity on the loser's court for 
their lone win on the road. Albany 
Stale came close to heating Buffalo 
State, losing to them at Cortland in 
the closing seconds of the game. 

The Danettes were plagued by in­
juries from Ihe siart of Ihe season, 
when it wasdiscovcrcd that Dorothy 
Colet l i , who would have provided 
some sorely needed height, would be 
out for the season with water on both 
knees. 

Ihe team suffered through four 
games without the services of 
Dorethea Brown. During two of 
those lour games, the team also felt 
Ihe lossol Cathy Dower. Albany lost 
those two games by heavy margins to 
Russell Sage and SUC-Potsdain. 
Brown was sidelined with the flu anil 
Dower had a fool injury. 

Nancy Hurtle stepped into the 
starting lineup uud did u line job dur­
ing the second half of the season. 
Marilyn Hinder) and Lauren Harris 
provided much needed reserve 
power. 

Albany Stale appeared to he more 
of a first half team as they were 
Within seven points of their op­

ponents al halftime in lour of their 
nine losses. Ibis may have been due 
to the limited endurance of such a 
small squad. 

Vita Davishad 11)1 points in seven 
games for a 14.4 average. After 
Davis left Ihe team, Sue Winthrop 
look over the bulk of the scoring for 
Ihe remaining four games. She and 
co-captain Wendy Oath were the 
team's leading scorers, with 

89 and 88 points, respectively, for the 
season, and 7.4 and 7.3 point 
averages. Vicki Girko hud a fine 
season with a 78 point total,averag­
ing 6.5 points per game. G i iko also 
led the team in rebounding this 
season, averaging over 10 rebounds 
a game. 

Young Team 

Ihe team was composed largely ol 
freshmen and sophomores. Sue 
Winthrop was Ihc only junior, Thus, 
this has been a learning season which 
can be chalked up to experience, us 
ihe team has better hopes for next 
season. The team would like to ex­
press its appreciation to all those 
who supported litem at their home 
games. 

The automobile business provides several examples, The Ford Motor Co. probably named a 
line of cars after Mercury because the name implies speed. Atlas, who bears the vautofheaven on 
his shoulders, Is d symbol of strength, and undoubtedly Atlas tires and batteries are supposed to 
be especially strong. King Midas had "the golden touch," and mufflers and other pans installed 
y the Midas are golden In color, In the Bulck line of cars thfre has always been an Electro, and 

now there Is an Appollo; ihe reason for ihe choice of these names a less apparent. Pie 
Volkswagen people several months ago had a television commercial In which the gods of Ml. 
Olympus admire Volkswagen cars, of course, and in which Hermes, using his caduceus like a 
magic wand, transforms a simple Beetle Into a fancy Love-Bug... 

—Classics! Forum's "Myths In Advertiiing" on page 13 

Telethon Nets $15,500; More Coming 
by Betty Stein and Marc Weiger 

The eighth Annual Telethon, 
SUNYA's yearly fund-raising event 
for the Wildwood School for 
d e v e l o p m e n t a l ^ handicapped 
children, was a rousing success. At 
the close, a tentative total of $ 15,500 
was announced. This is several hun­
dred dollars higher than the amount 
raised last year and is expected to in­
crease as more contributions roll in. 

An overflow crowd of about 2,000 
to 2,500 packed the Campus Center 
Ballroom at peak hours. According 
to co-chairperso r, Ernie Sprance, 
"We hud to turn people away during 
TV lime. A lot more than lust yeur 
came." Sprance said that sealing for 
only 200 was provided al the tables. 
Asa result, most people either sal on 
the floor or stood on the sidelines. In 
addition to the usuul ciowd of 
students and faculty, many adults 
from the community were in atten­
dance. 

Seventy-five separate acts provid­
ed continuous entertainment during 
the 24-hour period. The audience 
reacted with much enthusiasm on 
the whole. Particularfv well-received 
were "Lurry and the All-Stars." a 
1950's-type musical group, and John 
Semino, who sang a medley from 
"The Man of La Mancha." Due to 
the audience's wild repsonsc to both 
of these acts, encores were given, but 
noi unt i l they hud been auctioned off 
for u sizeable sum ($50 and SI00 
respectively). 

WSUA broadcast Ihe entire 
event, with WABY, a local A M sta­
t ion simulcasting from 8 p.m. to 8 
a.m. anil again during ihe lust 2 
hours on Saturday night. According 
lo Joel Teld. assistant station 
manager, " W G N A offered to 
simulcast with us lor next year's 
I elethon." 

" I t was a very, very light 
I elethon." said Sprance. who had 
nothing but praise for the technical 
crew, which numbered well over UK): ' 

"The stage work was amazing under 
Pal McGlynn." Karen Gliboff, 
Sprance's co-chairperson, was 
equally pleased with the technical 

kirchmoyei 
Happy laces and ba l loons mark the festivit ies ot Telethon last Saturday morn ing . At the t ime the money raised for the Wildwood 

Schoo l was $7,332, when Telethon c losed the f igure surpassed $15,500. 

crew; "The people who worked were 
just lunutustic." 

Both Gliboff and Sprance were 
disappointed with the sound system 
provided by the Campus Center. "It 
happens every year." said Sprance. 
"The Campus Center sound system 
always blows up il never fails. Hut 
that's I radii tonal to Telethon." 
Gliboff also expressed her dismay 
over the mall i inciioning audio 
equipment, sayng thai it pui 
Telethon's schedule at least one-half 
hour behind. 

In contrast, the EEC (Educational 
Communications Center) was highly 
praised for the part they played. 
"They ran the best and most accurate 
TV time we ever had." said Sprance. 
"Once they left, our technical dif­
ficulties started. I wish Campus 
Center would gel together and get up 
a really good sound system. Thai 
would make Telethon a hell of a lot 
better." 

Gl iboff expressed disappoint­

ment at what shecalleda lack of sup­
port from the faculty; " I expected 
much more support from the facul­
ty," Gliboff described the faculty's 
support as being, on the whole, less 
than adequate, "when compared to 

ihe great support received from 
other sections of the university." 

The traditional pie-throwing ac­
tivities added variety to the evening 
by breaking up lite long succession 
ol acts. The most expensive pie land­

ed in the luce of Dr. Harold Cannon 
of the Accounting department. The 
crowd went wild wheft the SI 55 plate 
of whipped crcum hit its target. 

I he student who had Ihesatislac-
nmtlniml mi page live 

Presidential Candidate Here 

SUNYA's first president ial candidate, Executive Vice-President lor 
Academic Af la i rs at the University o l Hous ton , Emmett Fields, spoke 

betore an open meet ing ot students yesterday. 

by Daniel Gaines 
Risking open meetings with students and faculty, the 

Presidential Search Committee has invited three can­
didates on campus this week. The first. Emmett H. 
f ields, was here yesterday meeting with various 
members of the University community. 
' During the student meeting cameramen from Channel 
6 interrupted by setting up bright lights and fi lming. 
Students al the meeting were annoyed, and Search Com­
mittee members expressed unhanniness over the unex­
pected publicity. The students on the committee had 
fought long and hard so that there would be open 
meetings, and were afraid the candidate, who also ex­
pressed surprise at the TV men's presence, would he dis­
couraged from considering the position here. 

l-ields is Executive Vice-President and Dean of 
Faculties at the University of Houston, in Houston, Tex­
as. He taught history there until 1971, l-'roir 1960 to 1969 
he was Dean of Ihe College of Arts and Science at 
Vanderbilt University. 

The basis for fearing publicity is (hut a candidate may 
jeopardize his positional his home campus if it is known 
(here thai he is considering u not her position, especially if 
he bus not chosen lo inform his colleagues al the home 
campus. A l SUNY Binghamlon, for example, the selec­
tion process was completely closed and secret. This is the 
norm til most universities, and the altitude of Search 
Committees at SUNYA is unusually open. One com­
mittee member said this may be "The nature of Ibis 
school". The open meetings are hoped by the committee 
to produce written feedback to assist them in the deci­
sion. They are not designed as media conferences, 
though the presence ol ihe.l.S7'nl Ihe student meetings is 
expected. 

The Search Committee makes its recoinmendulion to 
the University Council (a kind of Hoard ol Trustees for 
just SUNYA) , and Ihen il goes to SUNY Chancellor 
Boyer. The final decision is made by the SUNY Hoard of 
Trustees. The Search Committee, headed by J. Vander­
bilt Siruiib, bus been conducting its search for the lasi 
seven months. Between 9:00 a.m. und I0:I5 a.m. on 
Wednesday another candidate will meet with students in 
the Campus Center Patroon I .ounge, and with faculty al 
Ihe same place from 2:20 p.m. to 3:45 p.m. Sorrcll E. 

Chesin, Executive Secretary of the Search Committee, 
(Chcsin is an Assistant Vice President for University Af­
fairs), is handling the candidule's schedule whie each of 
those visiting Ibis week are here. 

f ields, who was born in Arkansas, is a Doctor of 
Philosophy in American History. He has been involved 
in administration for over fifteen years. 

f ields spoke firmly but with what seemed In bea very 
relaxed attitude, l ie tried to define issues rather than 
take sides in them, and asked questions in Ihe process of 
answering those addressed to him. One student pointed 
out niter the meeting that "he's looking us over just as 
carefully as we're looking him over. It's tough for him to 
answer questions when he really doesn't know the com­
plex itiesol Ibis school", f ields spoke about the Universi­
ty of Houston, and his philosophy of education. 

Some sample answers by Tieldsat the student meeting 
were; "I don't feel comfortable with thoroughly for­
malized modes of communication." 

" I believe in strong Deans , . . of course I ulso want to 
know what's going on." 

" I 'm noi in favorol reorganization us un act of joy." 
"It's a tough problem getting continuity in student in­

put . . . I'm devoted lo student input in policy for­
mation . . . the answer lies in students forming a'collec­
tive student memory.' f ields indicated that he believed 
students should have a vole on (enure committees if that 
was Ihe situation laeulty supported. 

" I don't see, given the economic stale of the economy, 
lowering tuition levels." 

f ields also said thai though he felt slud.Mil input in in. 
policy decision was important, students don't havea feef 
foi research. 

In response to questions about Ihe future ol the Un­
iversity, fields discussed the reliance upon numbers 
throughout America's universities in determining 
success und reputation. "We didn't mean to say 
thai . . .we thought growth was the key, but l don't real­
ly believe (hut academic people feel that way down 
deep." In discussing quall i ty he emphasized the impor­
tance of external opportunity, which he suspected was 
not an important consideration here. "It's kind of a 
melancholy observation," he said, hut first-rate students 
remain lirsl-rate students no matter what we do , , ." 

http://slud.Mil

