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No .1 State Aide Signs Up Grievance Procedures 
Rushed as Falk Seeks 
Quick Start for New Plan 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — Although 
no members have yet been appoint-
ed to the new grievance board for 
State employees, Alexander A. 
Falk. President of the State Civil 
Service Commission, has asked all 
State agency and department 
heads to start developing griev-
ance procedures at once. 

The purjKJse of a memorandum 
he issued is to reduce to a mini-

State Aides 
To 'Bone Up' 
On TV Repair 

Governor Averell Horritnan signs a payroll deduction slip to 
purchase U.S. savings bonds. Comptroller Arthur Levitt, 
qenerol chairman of the State Employees Savings Bond 
Drive, looks on. More than 5.000 State aides are serving as 

volunteer "Minute Men" in the current bond drive. 

Levitt to Confer with Assn. 
On Rise in State's Rates for 
Both Mileage and Suhsistance 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — Hopes for 
an adjustment in the present State 
mileage and subsistence allow-
ances gained solid basis with the 
announcement that the Civil Ser-
vice Employees Association and 
State ofHcials are scheduling con-
Xerences on the subject. 

In a letter to John J, Kelly, Jr., 
assistant Association counsel, State 
Comptroller Arthur Levitt agreed 
to a meeting on allowance read-
justment, staling that the "matter 
has been of concern to me, too, 
for some months." 

The Association's special com-
mittee on subsistence and mileage 
rates, under the chairmanship of 
Roy McKay, has had the aid of 
P. Henry Galpin, Association re-
search analyst. The committee has 
been preparing data to show that 
the $ll-a-day subsistence allow-
ance is inadequate. 

J Costs Rise 
I At present. Slate employees are 
allowed, $l a day for breakfast; 
$1.50 for lunch; $2.50 for dinner, 
and $6 for a liotel room. Ttils U 
the maximum allowance and does 
not cover unusual expenses, which 
are reimbursed by the State. 

Research by the Association's 
Bpecial conwnittee and Mr. Galpin 
btui tA»owa. however, Ittal tlie aver-

age room rate in hotels during 
1954 was $7.50 a day. Their figures 
also shows an increase of 20 per-
cent in meal costs at hotels during 
last year. 

The present mileage rate of 8 
cents per mile for the use of em-
ployee automobiles on State busi-
ness is also in need of adjust-
ment, the committee reports. Car 
operating costs have risen con-
siderably in the past four years 
and a survey of car allowance in 

(Continueid on Page 16) 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — A TV con-
ference for employees doing tele-
vision maintenance and repair 
work in State institutions has been 
arranged by the Department of 
Civil Service for September 19 to 
23 at Marcy State Hospital. 

Representatives will attend from 
the Departments of Mental Hy-
giene, Correction, Social Welfare 
and Health. 

The conference Is an outgrowth 
of a TV school which was held at 
Haverstraw last year. Its objective 
is to bring together State person-
nel responsible for television re-
pair and outside experts in this 
work. The first conference was 
held at Rockland State Hospital. 

Who'll Do 4he Talking: 
The designing of TV installa-

tions for old and new buildings 
will be discussed by Emilio 
Buchaca of the State Department 
of Public Works. Edward Garrigan 
of the RCA Service Company will 
take up maintenance of TV an-
tennas. Trouble shooting of various 
types will be covered by Don Win-
ters of Sylvania Electric Products. 
A guided lour of the Utica Com-
munications Works will conclude 
the program. 

The conference Is under the 
supervision of William A. Law of 
the Training Section of the De-
partment of Civil Service. More 
information may be obtained from 
Dr. Charles T. Klein, director of 
public employee training. 

mum delays in getting the new 
grievance machinery in operation. 

The new grievance set-up was 
established by an executive order 
from Governor Averell Harriman 
last month. 

Department heads are respon-
sible for procedures to be used In 
their agencies, but these proce-
dures are subject to approval by 
the grievance board. 

The order itself. Commissioner 
Falk said, provides the broad out-
line for setting up the grievance 
plan for each department. He call-
ed attention to some of the prob-
lems that the departments might 
encounter, such as determining the 
number of stages in the proce-
dure and time limits involved. 

Text of Memorandum 
The full text of the Commis-

sioner's memorandum follows: 
"In order to reduce to a mini-

mum the delays involved in getting 
the new grievance machinery in 
operation, it is requested that you 
develop the procedure for your 
agency just as soon as possible. 
It is recognized that since the 
Grievance Board has not yet been 
appointed, there has been no op-
portunity for it to develop and 
adopt rules and regulations for the 
further guidance of department 
and agency heads. I believe, how-

ever, that you can, with the guid-
ance provided by the Executive 
Order itself, make real progress in 
the establishment of the procedure 
for your agency. While the ClvU 
Service Department has no desire 
to encroach upon the functions of 
the Grievance Board, we shall, 
upon request, be glad to assist you. 

Some of the matters to which you 
may wish to give consideration ia 
establishing your procedure are the 
following: 
1. Identification of "supervisory" 

positions for the purpose of the 
grievance procedure. 

2. Methods for arranging confer-
ences with employee representa-
tives pursuant to Section II15. 

3. Reporting of grievances process-
ed. 

4. Determination of the number of 
stages in the procedure. 

5. Definition of the stages for var-
ious parts of the organization. 

6. Time limits for processing ot 
each stage. 

7. Identification of the representa-
tive, if any, to represent the de-
partment or agency head in in-
formal hearings at the second 
stage. 

8. Identification of the official. If 
any, to represent the department 
held in the final determinatiou 
of grievances at the second stage. 

9. Method of notifying employee of 
decision at each stage. 
The above is not intended to be 

exclusive, but merely indicates the 
types of matters which you majr 

(Continued on Page 16) 

More Aides at Napanoch, 
Improved Work Conditions 
Urged in Official Report 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — Improved 
working conditions and facilities 
have been recommended for the 
State Correction Department's In-
stitution for Male Defective Delin-
quents at Napanoch. 

An official State inspection re-
port calls for many improvements 
at the institution, which would 
benefit both employees and in-
mates. 

The report, issued by the State 
Correction Commission, proposes: 

New Buildings 
(1) That a new education build-

ing, auditorium, kitchen and mess 
hall be provided. 

(2) That telephones be Installed 
in the North Hall and the South 
Hall so that officers in charge of 

Coctaro, Miss Debes Nominated 
By Petition for C5EA Office 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — Two persons 
have been nominated by petition 
for office in the Civil Service Em-
ployees Association. Angelo J. Co-
ccaro of Kings Park State Hospi-
tal received the required number of 
signatures and has been certified 
as a candidate for 3rd vice presi-
dent 

Marie Debes of the Albany of-
fice, Civil Service Department, will 
be a candidate for that depart-
ment's post oa the State Executive 
Couuuittoe. 

The petitions were certified by 
the Board of Canvassers, headed 
by Mrs. Mildred O. Meskil. Other 
committee members are George W. 
Hayes, Isabelle M. O'Hagen, Leon-
ard P, Requa, and Margaret Bay-
ers. 

• Names of those selected by the 
Association's nominating commit-
tee, and the two independent can-
didates, are now being printed on 
the official ballots, which are ex-
pected to be mailed out about Sep-
U'uiUer IS. 

The complete slate of candidates: 
President — John P. Powers and 

Raymond G. Castle, 
1st Vice President — Joseph P. 

Peily, Tax Department, Albany, 
and Lawrence W. Kerwin, Civil 
Service, Albany. 

2nd Vice President — Robert L. 
Soper, Wassaic State School, and 
Claude E. Rowell, Rochester State 
Hospital. 

3rd Vice President — William J. 
Connally, Hudson State Training 

(Cuatiiiuetl on Page 

a housing block do not have to 
leave their post when summoned 
to the phone. 

(3) That better lighting be la-
stalled in classrooms and school 
offices, 

(4) Tliat the position of Catho-
lic chaplain be made a full-tin>e 
post. 

(5) That at least two additooal 
teachers be employed. 

Safety Measures 
(6) That certain safety measuree 

be takeA such as brakes on 11 
chairs in the institution barber 
shop and the fixing of the stotM 
steps at South Hall, now in a 
"hazardous condition." 

These are only a few of some I t 
recommendations that the Inspec-
tion report suggested. 

Institution employees received 
high praise from the inspectint 
team for the cleanline.ss of the 
plant. 

Praise for AidesT 
The official report declared: 

"The exceptionally high degree of 
cleanliness and order maintained 
in the housing quarters and the 
out-lying buildings 1« commend-
able.-

The report was submittted by 
Charles D. Mullady. assistant sec-
retary of the coijimission. The In-
spection dates were June 7 and 8. 
At that time, a custodial staff of 
158 under the direction of Lloyd 
V. Wilklow, acting superintendent, 
was caring for an inmate popula-
tloa of 1,02L 
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I). S. Employees Face Charges 
When Relations with Russia 
Worsen, Security Probers Hear 

WASHINGTON, Sept. 5 — Pav-
•rable comment about Russia 
when relations between the United 
States and that country were good 
were used against Federal employ-
tes to fotce their resignation, or 
•ven cause their dismissal, on 
eharges under the loyalty program. 
Bo the Security subcommittee of 
the Senate Post Office and Civil 
Service Committee was Informed 
by Joseph L. Raugh, Jr., an attor-
ney, chairman of the Americans 
for Democratic Action. 

Jewish Group Heard 
The American Jewish Congress 

Joined with Mr. Raugh's group in 
asking that reforms in the loyalty 
program Include the right to be 
confronted by and to cross-
examine accusers, and that only 
employees in "sensitive" positions 
be subject to the program. Such 

or agencies that deal with national 
defense or security. 

Mr. Raugh said that the recent 
turn for the better in relations 
with Russia prompted President 
Elsenhower himself to issue a di-
rective forbidding oCBcial spokes-
men from saying anything against 
Russia. Tlie directive was issued 
after the Geneva conference at 
which Russia showed some signs 
of being a bit conciliatory. If the 
President were a competitive em-
ployee, and if the situation regard-
ing Russia should change to one 
of unfriendliness, then the same 
charge of being a security risk 
could be faced by Mr. Elsenhower 
as Federal employees had to face 
in the tenseness of 1953 and for 
remarks they made about Russia 
during a previous era of good feel-
ing toward that nation, said Mr. 

positions would be in departments Raugh. 

New Patrolman Exam 
Back in Picture Again 

NYC has been trying hard to fit 
the patrolman (P.D.) exam into an 
early schedule for receipt of ap-
plications, and while it has not yet 
set the application dates, it has 
decided to '"order" the exam held. 
That is the first step toward hold-
ing it. 

When the City Civil Service Com-
mission meets this week it is ex-
pected to order the exam held. 

The Police Department has been 
anxious to have the test held soon, 
and the Personnel Department has 
been trying hard to oblige it. 

The new starting pay of a patrol-
man grade 4, is $4,000 a year and 
ehanges as follows: grade 3, after 
the first year, stays at $4,000; 
grade 2, after the second year, 
$4,700; grade 1, after three years, 
$5,215. 

Former Requirements 
The minimum requirements in 

ttie new test will be set probably 
a few weeks after the "ordering" 
Is done. These requirements are 
expected to be about the same as 
those in the last test, with age 20 
as minimum. 

The principal requirements In 
• le last test follow: 

Ages: The Administrative Code 
provides that only persons shall be 
appointed patrolmen who shall be 
at the date of filing an applica-
tion less than 29 years of age. No 
person who has not reached his 
20th birthday on the last date for 
the receipt of applications may 
Ille an application. However, no 
person may be appointed unless 
he has reached his 21»t birthday. 

Exception: All persons, who were 
engaged in military duty, as de-
nned In Section 243 of the Mili-
tary Law, subsequent to July 1 
1940, may deduct the length of 
time they spent In military serv-
ice from their actual age In deter-
mining their eligibility (Sub. 10a, 
Section 243. Military Law). 

At the time of investigation, ap-
plicants will be required to submit 
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proof of date of birth by transcript 
of record of the Bureau of Vital 
Statistics or other satisfactory evi-
dence. Any willful material mis-
statement will be cause for dis-
qualification. 

Requirements: There are no for-
mal educational or experience re-
quirements for this position. At 
the date of filing applications, can-
didates must be citizens of the 
United States and residents of the 
State of New York. At the time of 
appointment candidates must com-
ply with that section of the Ad-
ministrative Code which provides 
that any office or position, com-
pensation for which is payable 
solely or In part from the funds 
of the City, shall be filled only by 
a person who Is a bona fide resi-
dent and dweller of the City for 
at least three years immediately 
preceding appointment. Service In 
the armed forces does not interrupt 
residence. 

Good Character 
Proof of good character will be 

absolute prerequisite to appoint-
ment. In accordance with the pro-, 
visions of the Administrative Code, 
persons convicted of a felony are 
not eligible for positions in the 
uniformed forces of the Police 
Department. In addition, the rules 
of the City Civil Service Commis-
sion provide that no person con-
victed of petty larceny or who has 
been dishonorably discharged from 
the army or navy shall be examined 
or certified or appointed as a pa-
trolman. 

The Police Commissioner Is re-
(juired by law to appoint only one 
out of every three candidates cer-
tified for appointment by the City 
Civil Service Commission. He thus 
has a discretionary power to re-
fuse to appoint a candidate. After 
a candidate has been "passed over" 
three times by the Police Commis-
sioner, no further certification of 
his name will be made. 

Applicants must not be less than 
5 feet 7V4 Inches (bare feet) In 
height and must approximate nor-
mal weight for height. 

Required vision, 20/20 for each 
eye, separately, without glasses. 

Tests: Written, weight 100. Tlie 
written test will be designed to test 
the candidates' Intelligence, Inltla-
tlre. Judgment and capacity to 
learn the work at a patrolman. 

Police Lieut. Test 
To Reopen for 3 Days 

The exam for prtwnotlon to llca-
tenant (PJD.), tor which appUca-
tions were received by NYC In 
June, will be reopened for three 
days, September 12, 13 and 14. 
The written test will be held on 
October 1, as originally acheduled. 

Promotions to aergeant, made 
subsequent to the previous closing 
date, qualified additional members 
of the force to take the test. The 
Personnel Department ordered tbe 
reopening to spare the additional 
men a wait of at least a couple mt 
years until the next test is held. 

Study material for tbe test k 
given on Page 15. 

Albanian Tops 
Thruway Toil 
Collector List 

ALBANY, Sept. S — There arc 
1,130 ellgibles on the Thruway toll 
collector list, the State Civil Serv-
ice Department announces. 

The roster is headed by Peter 
P. Czwakiel of Albany, with Ave 
other upstaters as runners-up: 
Michael Landes of New Palta, 
Richard L. Hayes of Syracuse, 
Melvin S. Foster of Schenectady, 
James H. Menzies of Buffalo, and 
Walter S. Marx of Auburn. Mr. 
Czwakiel's 106.67 score includes 10 
points as a disabled veteran. 

Forty-nine of the candidates 
earned 100 per cent or more, all, 
of course, including veteran 
credits. First 68 persons on the 
list, in fact, gained those positions 
with veteran credit. 

No. 69 on the roster is the first 
woman, Bernice G. Dodge of 
Verona. 

1,229 Failed 
A total of 2,800 had applied for 

the jobs which start at $2,870 a 
year. There were 1,229 failures, 
385 were absent from the exam, 13 
disqualified and 34 disapproved, 
the Cnvil Service Department re-
ports. 

Looking Inside 
l y H. J . BERNARD 

Civil Service Has Been Playing 
Second Fiddle Much Too Long 

THE PRESSURE on civil service administrators Is so great I f 
cause government expects to get more for its money than It pays, te 
hiring many employees, that not every civil service commissioner m 
personnel director can stand the strain. 

So far the Personnel Department in NYC, still in the throes aff 
tbe Career and Salary Plan, has stood the test fairly well, although 
there have been occasional signs of frayed tempers. Joseph Schecht«r, 
the Personnel Director, has a denfiite limit to his patience, but taM 
stretched that limit in a good cause. Despite all the recent contra, 
versy over pay, titles and job descriptions, he has won the acclaim 
employee groups for the democratic way in which the operation to 
being conducted, and for his fairness and sense of justice. 

Macy Spreads the Good Word 
The State Division of Classification and Compensation, whlck 

deals with the same problems that confront Mr. Schechter, is 
phllosopliical. It would be difficult indeed to put up any argument 
would disturb J. Early Kelly much. Mr. Kelly is the director of 
division. 

In the Federal government the situation is still calmer, in fact, 
too calm, for there is still a reluctance to go along with empioyea 
Ideas, as against administration ideas, although the situation taM 
Improved. John W. Macy Jr., the executive director of the U.S. C»T»I 
Service Commission, is largely responsible for the new look. Not onlr 
does he lend an attentive ear to employee requests but he even at-
tends their conventions and gives them learned yet sympathetic dis-
cussions of the ruling problems of the day, and even broaches possible 
solutions. If there is a httle too much of technical jargon in some 
of his speeches, he can not be blamed. Though brilliant, he is stW 
young, and subect to the influence of wiser heads who make a prac> 
tice of using more words than necessary, and the longer and 
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73 on Bridge l i s t 
Seventy-three of the 151 who 

applied for toll collector jobs with 
the State Bridge Authority have 
"made" the eligible Ust. 

Heading the roster is Michael 
Landes of New Paltz, who scored 
106, including 10 points as a dis-
abled veteran. Mr. Landes is No. 2 
on the Thruway toll collector list. 

Competition 
Urged in Filling 
Lawyer Jobs 

WASHINGTON, Sept. 5—A pro-
gram in which attorneys would be 
selected on the basis of competi-
tive examination is being consid-
ered by the U.S. Civil Service 
Commission. 

A direction to hire its lawyers 
through the merit system is con-
tained In the new Railroad Re-
tirement law, approved last week 
by the President. The new law 
specifically limits political Jobs In 
the agency to a special Kiisistant 
to each of the three board mem-
bers. 

Observers here see a trend to 
Government-wide anti-patronage 
provisions. It Is reported that Con-
gress will consider similar legisla-
tion next year to put restrictions 
on political jobs in other agencies. 

technical ones, the better. 
But through all the vexation of the civil service administratora, 

the worst difficulty is to be able to procure the calibre of employee 
that the government wants at the price the government is willing to 
pay. All that the commissions and personnel directors can do is to 
produce eligible lists from which the departments and agencies 
hire the best talent that can be obtained at the salary offered. Ever7 
civil service commissioner and personnel director in government se-
cretly wishes that mass recruitment was not subject to such defeatinf 
monetary limitations. ^ 

The Sorry Side 
Behind all this is the sorry fact that national. State and local 

government administrations do not show as much interest in etvU 
service adminstration as they should. There are sgns of improvement. 
Governor Averell Harriman of New York is on record as having sal4 
that as many jobs should be put into the competitive class as possiblek 
Mayor Robert P. Wagner of NYC actually assumed personal respon-
sibility for civil service administration, the first chief executive eC 
any branch of government, so ar as I know, to have done so. He cvea 
said he wants the Career and Salary Plan to be a model for all the 
other local, as well as State governments, and even the Federal gov-
ernment. The only hitch is that with the $28,000,000 appropriaUoB, 
full accomplishment was impossible. Thus the newly created Personnel 
Department was handicapped from the start. 

A real NYC reclassification, all inequities eliminated, a salary sche4-
ule a model would cost about $100,000,000. 

Relative Importance 
A government administration should ask its classification a r a 

to report how much it would cost to put all salaries o na realisUe 
basis. After this estimate is checked, and the budgeting process begins, 
provision should be made for including the required amount. H M 
policy of cutting the recruitment cloth to the pattern of a ihosi 
budget had too often been tried, and too often found wanting. 

Difficulty in 'finding" the money may be real, but greater by far la 
the difficulty of convincing top executives that hardly any operation 
that government performs is more important than proper recruitment. 
It is time the right arm of civil service played first fiddle, instead ef 
second. 

No Need to Do Anything 
•Se Pension 

A new law increases most 
annuities «nder the U .a Civil 
Service Retirement System. 

Who Receives the Increase — 
Tou will receive an increase U 
your regular annuity Is at least 
$5 but less than $'342 a month. 

Amount ef the Increase — If 
your annuity began before July 1. 
1955, the monthly increiise will be 
12% of any annuity up to $125 
and 8% of any portion over $125; 
U your annuity began during July 
or August 1955, the monthly In-
crease will be 10% of any annuity 
up to $125 and 7% of any portion 
over $125; all Increased monthly 
annuities will be adjusted to tbe 
ae&iest dollar. 

Limitation on Increase — Ha 
Increase may be more than th* 
amount which would raise the 
regular annuity to $342 a month. 

General Information — The In-
crease will begin with the Nc 
ber 1, 1955 check which 
annuity for October; if you are 
a retired employee, your Increase 
will not raise any annuity whlck 
may become payable to youi sur-
vivors; if you receive a ebeok 
which Includes several eorvlvvK 
annuities, each annuity will b « 
adjusted separately, and you 4m 

not need to write to the Civil i 
ice Commission or fill • 
lorms to get this increase. 
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THE PUBLIC 
EMPLOYEE 

By JOHN F. POWERS 

President 

Gv i l Service Employees Association 

Labor Day and the American Worker 

Team of Dickinson, 
Pittoni Reunited in 
State Commerce Dept 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — It Isn't gen-
erally known but New York's Com-
merce Commissioner and the First 
Deputy Commerce Commissioner 
are old friends and political bud-
dies. 

Commissioner Edwart T. Dick-
inson and Mario Pittoni, first de-
puty, organized the first Young 
Democratic Club In Nassau Coun-
ty in the early 1930's. 

Mr. Pittoni was sworn In to his 
new State post last week In the 
Governor's Office, with Mr. Dickin-
son at his side. Many years earlier 
both had served as organizers and 

Labor Day, celebrated by all in the United States as the day of 
recognition of the American worker, had Its beginnings in the late 
nineteenth century. For many years during the '80s the forerunner of 
»11 labor parties in this country, the Knights of Labor, paraded on the 
first Monday in September. At the Impetus of this group, in 1884 all i officers of the Nassau Young Dem-
workers In the country joined In a drive to have this day considered a | ocratic movement, 
national holiday. The first state to give recognition to Labor Day was 
Oreyon in 1887, and within a few years New York, New Jersey and 
Colorado adopted similar legislation. 

Congress Recognizes Labor 
The Congress in 1894 passed a bill making Labor Day a legal 

holiday throughout the nation. 
At the time, in 1334, when the Knights of Labor were agitating 

for this recognition, the labor movement in this country only had 
about 200,000 followers. Today there are approximately 16,000,000 
members in the various labor groups in the country. These include 
organized federal, state, county and local government employees. 

Our Part in the Labor Movement 
We are a part of this labor movement. Although the organized 

Government workers constitute only a small segment of the 16,000,-
000, they have made material gains in recent years. Labor figures, 
reflecting the size of governmental employee groups, are hard to esti-
mate. Only a few of the organizations publish their membership 
figures, and nowhere is there a complete or adequate listing of all the 
governmental employee associations. We can only guess at the growth 
from knowledge of our own Association and one or two other groups. 
Prom this knowledge it is safe to assume that along with the in-
•reasing size of government, employee organizations are also growing. 

Government Is an Industry, Too 
The labor movement in the government industry, as it has been 

ealled, needs the understanding and support of every government 
worker. The government industry has become so big and so complex 
on all of its levels that a labor group in it has become vitally neces-
•ary. The problems of the worker In government are essentially the 
lame as those of the worker in industry. Both are human beings. The 
lame forces which play upon one play upon the other. It is true that 
the structures within which they work may be different, but this fact 
does not negate the need of employee organizations. 

Recognition Comes Through Effort 
It is only through collective effort that the government employee 

can achieve the recosnition of the dignity of his positiotn,, keep his 
pay scales adequate and in tune with the changing times, and be the 
recipient of the other benefits accruing to tlie industrial worker. Un-
less he recognizes this, and becomes a part of the movement, his 
progress towards equality with industry will be as slow in the futuie 
as it has been in the past. 

L The Association and You 
Your employee organization—the CSEA^needs the earnest and 

Blncere member.Nhip of all state, county and local employees in the 
state. 

Labor Day should be a day of inspiration and organization of our 
Association, as well as a day to commtmorate the history of the 
American workman. 

With Mr. Pittoni, for the offi-
cial State ceremony, were his wife 
and three children. Judge Joseph 
Suozzi of Glen Cove and Mr. and 
Mrs. Frederic Henjes, his wife's 
mother and father, Samuel Lon-
don, deputy secretary of state offi-
ciated. 

Tentative Agenda Issued 
For CSEA Annual Meeting 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — The 45th 1955 
annual fall meeting of the Civil Service 
Employees Association will be held Mon-
day and Tuesday, October 10 and 11 
at the DeWltt Clinton Hotel and at 
CSEA headquarters here. It promises to 
be the largest meeting the Association 
ever held. 

Salary Goal Is Prominent 

The meeting is expected to be high-
lighted by delegates' approval of a reso-
lution urging the State to appropriate 
a substantial amount to correct existing 
salary inequities, and to provide an 
adequate overall pay plan. J O S E P H D. L O C H N E R 

The CSEA salary committee recom- Execut ive S e c r e t a r y , 
mended a $30,000,000 appropriation. C S E A , is aiding the c o n f 

The resolutions committee at its meet- mittee that is a r ranging 
ing last week also took up the question the 45th annual meeting 

of the Association. 

Metropoiitan Conference 
To Set Full-Year Program 
' QUEENS VILLAGE, Sept. S — 
The Metropoiitan Conference. 
Civil Service Employees Associa-
tion, will formulate its program 
lor the coming year at its Septem-
ber 10 meeting at Creedmoor State 
Hospital. 

The session gets under way at 
3 P.M. in the social room of the 
hospital's assembly hall. 

Creedmoor chapter, CSEA, will 
be host to the Conference. 

Chapter presidents in the metro-
politan area have been requested 
to tell Conference Secretary Edith 
Fruchthendler how many dele-
gates will be representing their 
chapter at the meeting. This will 
facilitate making refreshment ar-
rangements, Miss Fruchthendler 
said. She may be reached care of 
the Public Service Commission, 199 
Church Street, New York T, N. Y. 

Henry Shemin is Conference 
president. 

Th« CS&A e(ou|) lueetU^ at 

HENRY SHEMIN 

Creedmoor at the Invitation of Dr. 
Harry LaBiu t. diieclos. 

Safety Expert 
Will Address 
Western Group 

AVON, Sept. 5 — Arthur Mc-
Caughey will be principal speaker 
at the September 10 dinner meet-
ing of the Western Conference, 
Civil Service Employees Associa-
tion. 

The Retsof resident, who has 
served with the State Troopers, 
Livingston County Sheriff's De-
partment, and as safety director 
in private Industry, will discuss 
highway laws and safety on the 
roads. 

In the afternoon, the Conference 
will hear an address by Thomas 
L. Bransford, director of examina-
tions for the State Civil Service 
Department. Claude E. Rowell will 
preside. 

County Aides, Too 
William Hudson will chair an 

afternoon session of county and 
local employees. 

The meetings will be held at the 
Avon Inn, beginning at 3 P.M. 

Industry State School chapter, 
CSEA, will be host. 

Dr . Allen Assumes 
New Duties as Head 
Of Educaiion Dept. 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — New York 
State's new Commissioner of Edu-
cation took office officially Sept. 1 
in a simple but impressive cere-
mony in the Regents Office of the 
State Education Building. 

Dr. James E. Allen Jr. became 
the eighth commissioner to serve 
the State's public school system 
since the department was estab-
lished In 1904. 

The occasion was marked by the 
warm congratulations of the de-
partment staff. 

Dr. Allen is a native of West 
Virginia, the son of a college pres-
ident. He first joined the State 
Education Department in 1947 as 
an assistant to the late Commis-
sioner Francis T. Spaulding. 

When Dr. Lewis A. Wilson was 
named commissioner in 1950, Dr. 
Allen became deputy commissioner. 

Dr. Allen Is a Harvard graduate, 
served as secretary to the faculty 
and director of placement in the 
Harvard Graduate School of Edu-
cation and also did research at 
Harvard's Center for Research In 
Educational Admini^itratioa. 

of a salary appropriation. 

Resolutions on the 40-hour week 
for institutional employees, on im-
proved pension benefits and time-
off provisions, and hospital and 
medical insurance, are also covered 
by resolutions submitted to the 
Committee. 

The annual session will be cli-
maxed on the evening of October 
11 by announcement of election 
results for statewide office and for 
the departmental representatives 
on executive committee. 

This will be the first time in 
CSEA history those elected will 
serve two-year terms. 

Proposed Agenda 
The tentative agenda calls for 

the registration of delegates on 
Sunday evening, October 9 and 
Monday morning, October 10. At 
10 A.M. on Monday, departmental 
conferences will get under way. 
In the afternoon there will be a 
business meeting, followed by a 
social gathering at Association 

headquarters, where music and 
refreshments and renewal of ac-
quaintances will take place. 

On Tuesday, delegates will con-
vene to vote on the several dozen 
resolutions. 

That evening will be devoted to 
the dinner, at which time election 
results will be made known, and 
a guest speaker, as yet not an-
nounced, will addre-ss the group. 

First notices on the details of 
the annual meeting are expected 
to be sent to chapters on Septem-
ber 7. Those who will attend the 
Albany session will be warned, as 
in previous years, that making 
hotel reservations early is a "must." 
Chapters will also be asked to tell 
headquarters how many delegates 
will attend, and who they will be. 

Joseph D. Lochner, executive 
secretary of the CSEA, Is handling 
the administrative work on tho 
committee in charge of the meet-
ing. 

Career Workers— 
Unsung Heroes of 
Flood Relief Work 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — Governor 
Harriman, in speeding aid to the 
flood disaster areas of New York 
State, depended largely on a 
"team" of State employees and 
officials, many of tliem career 
workers. 

The State's helping hand to the 
disaster-struck communities was 
a cooperative venture by many de-
partments and agencies. 

The latest and still unpublicized 
aid given by the State was the as-
signment by Comptroller Arthur 
Levitt of two top-ranking munici-
pal examiners to make a tour of 
the flood areas to aid local officials 
in meeting the many fiscal prob-
lems brought about by the storm. 

Audit and Control 
The Audit and Control employ-

ees. now in the field, are Edward 
J. Brown and John Meek, both 
associate examiners of municipal 
affairs. 

Directing the State effort has 
been John W. Johnson, Superin-
tendent of Public Works, who was 
named by the Governor to coor-
dinate the program. Mr. Johnson 
recently met with Federal officials 
to work out a joint program. 

A few of the Public Works per-
sonnel who have been assisting the 
superintendent are: 

Arthur J. Nicholson, field flood 
control engineer, who has been 
working in Ellenville. 

Bernard LeFeve, the depart-
ment's director of highway plan-
ning. who has had charge of es-
timating Pond damage to State 
roads and facilities. 

James Truex, public relations di-
rector, who has been handling 
many of the intra-department re-
ports concerning the flood, 

A key Public Works official in 
directing State assistance at the 
local level has been James S. Bix-
by, district engineer with offices 
in Poughkeepsie. 

In the first trying days after the 
flood, Clark Ahlberg, d.--uty bud-
get director, dropped his regular 
duties to travel with Mr. Harriman 
to help draw up an overall Stato 
plan and to coordinate the activi-
ties of various State agencies. 

In the Governor's office, many 
Harriman aides worked on the 
emergency including James Sun-
quist, assistant secretary, who Is 
accustomed to trouble-shooting as-
signments. 

Health Dept. 
In the Health Department, Dr. 

John A. Degen, Jr., a district health 
officer, reported on water contami-
nation In the flood areas. 

At the direction of State Com-
merce Commissioner Edward T. 
Dickinson, a three-member team 
was organized to work in the im-
mediate disaster area. The mem-
bers; James E. McGrath, regional 
office coordinator; Donald J. Horn, 
regional manager, and Thompson 
Pyle, Commerce staffer In Buffalo. 

County farm agents at the direc-
tion of State Agricultural Commis-
sioner Daniel Carey Inspected food 
supplies stored in the flood areas 
for possible contamination. Horton 
Almond, director of the bureau of 

' (Cuntuiued on Page 16) 
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Courf Upholds Dismissal 
Of Employee VIho Has 
'Safisfacfory' Rating 

WASHINGTON, Sept. S — The 
Oovernment has % right to dismiss 
"nindCRirable" employees apeedily, 
•ven though they may have "satis-
factory" performance ratinBs, the 
Dnited States Court of Appeals 
held. 

Declaring that while the Per-

FLEET DISCOUNTS 
FOR YOU! 

•kc indlTtduat CiTfl 
»U> jM o n enjoT tlw •kme •enutionKll ; 
l ow priea giren M c Buto ft«et toayeral 
And we l l l i r e TOO h i i b n t trwlc-III 
aUow « a c « and eaAimt bndret term*, too 
Tonr credit i* rood here . eee kow 
Mal l7 7oa e*a ewn a IBM Pontlae er 
I n r KlleMre UMd C w l 

Aatborlaed 

ROCKYILLE 
Centre Motors 

Ro 6-0720 
35S Sunrise Highway 

KockvUle Centre, L. I., N. T . 
MNTO OR MENTTON THIS AB 

FOR R R F E GIFT 

formance Rating Act of 1950 af-
fords additional protection to Fed-
eral employees, the Court empha-
sized that It does not impair the 
right of. agencies and departments 
to disml.ss employees "in the in-
terest of promoting the efficiency 
of the service." 

No Mass Dismissals 
The decision was made in the 

case of William E. Ward, dis-
charged from his personnel Job at 
the Cherry Point (K.C.) Marine 
Corps Air Station in 1951. 

Following the decision, the U.S. 
Civil Service Commission de-
scribed as "sheer nonsense" any 
suggestion that there would be a 
mass firing by the Government. 

"Agencies are expeoted to get 
rid of incompetent employees," a 
Commission spoicesman said, "but 
they have been doing that before 
1950 and since 1950. They will 
continue to do so on the same 
basis as in the past." 

HOUSE HUNTING? 
SEE PAGE 11 
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Engineer Pay 
In Industry Up 
4.5P.C.inYear 

Earnings of engineers and other 
teclinical professional employees 
in private industry are now about 
4.5 per cent more than those of 
last year, according to a recent 
survey by the American Manage-
ment Association. 

Covering 20 engineering and 
professional job categories in 19 
industries, the survey was the sec-
ond on the subject made by the 
AMA's executive compensation 
service. The surveyed position, 
most of which are technical or 
highly specialized in nature. In-
clude development chemists, proj-
ect engineers, industria lengineers, 
sales engineers and others. 

In Tiew of the great demand 
and short supply of professional 
personnel, the survey noted, the 
range of salaries reported in the 
study Is "surprisingly narrow." 
The survey showed that the aver-
ace salary for beginning engineers 
is about $4,500 a year. For Indus-
trial engineering jobs, the median 
was found to be about $6,000 a 
year; for chemical positions, 
$6,500. and for electrical and me-
chanical engineering, $7,000. 

Licaders of civil service employee 
organizations p>oint out that gov-
ernment is staying far behind in-
dustry on engineer pay scales. 

Clapp Is Appointed 
Corporation Heod 

Gordon R. Clapp, former NYC 
Deputy Administrator, and pre-
Tlously Chairman of the Tennessee 
Valley Authority, has been named 
president of the Development and 
Resources Corporation, a new tub-
aldiary of liazard Preres A Co., 
Investment bankers. The new cor-
poration will organize and finance 
the development of natural re-
sources outside the United States 
for governments and private In-
dustry. 

David E. Ullienthal, Mr. Oapp's 
predecessor as TVA Chairman, 
heads the new corporation's board 
of directors. 

The Deputy City Administrator 
po«t Mr. Clapp vacated Is occupied 
by Maxwell Lehman, LEIADER edi-
tor OB leave. 

PAYMENTS AUTHORIZED FOR 
INJURY, DEATH IN DISASTER 

Payment to volunteer firemen 
who have been Injured in emer-
gency situations—or to their rep-
reaenUtives In case of death—Is 
sanctioned by statutory authority. 
Attorney General Jacob K. Javlts' 
•pinion was occasioned by an In-
< « i l i T eonceming the services of 
volunteer firemen during the re-

burrlcanes. 

U.S.JobsNowOpen 

PATROLMEN 
CANDIDATES 

VISION TRAININe 
War a f t a l rh t acvatremtiat Teata 

Dr. A . A . M a r k o w 
• T T O M B T R I . S T — O K T H O P T O r r 

M l < 12th Ave., Brooklyn 
r i l » > o h i t m « a t m . S - a l M 

The XJ. S. Civil Service Commle-
slon urgently seeks to /ill the fol-
lowing jobs in Federal depart-
ments and agencies throughout 
the country. 

The jobs listed below reiireseat 
the best job opportunities for 
those who would like to get Into 
the Federal civil service. 

Applications will be received 
until further notice. 

Application forms may be ob-
tained from the Second U. S. Civil 
Service Regional Office. 641 Wash-
ington Street. New York 14, N. Y. 

An address number Is given at 
the end of each job listing. Pilled-
out forms should be sent to that 
address. The "key" numbers 
stand for the following addreses: 

ADDRESSES OF PLACES 
WHERE APPLICATIONS 

SHOULD BE SENT 
1. First CiTil S»rT lp« Rpr ion. Poat M -

f ice and CnnrtboTiK Bldr-. B o « t « a a 

3 Seoonrt CITSI Serr ic* Rpirion. 
r.ral nidg., Chr is lophfr St.. N f w T o i * 14, 
N. T. 

3. T l i i rd CiTil Sf^rrice R « n o n , 0 «a-
tonihouso, Srrond aa^ Chretnni Sla., 
Phi1.-wlr-lphia 6, Pa . 

4. Board of Civi l Se rT i « « ExamliMra. 
Marc Inland Nava l Shipyard. Val lp jo . Cal i f . 

B. F i f th CiTil flerrir* Rr^ton, i Far-
syth St. NW. , At lanta 3, Oa. 

« . Sixth Civi l Sei-TIW Region. * o a t 
Off ice and Conrthonae BIdr. , Ctnetnoatl 
2, Ohio, 

7. Spvi?nth CiTil Serr ic* R r r i o a . » « w 
P o « t Otfi>* Bldir., Chicago 7. 111. 

R. Eiirhth CiTil Serv ic* R r r i o a . 1114 
Commerce St., Dallas I . T e i . 

9. Ninth CiTil Service RririMi, » « w 
Federal Bid?.. St. Ixinis 1. Mo . 

10. Tenth CiTil Service RcBion. BIdr . 
41. Denver Federal Centeir. DeuTcr, Colo. 

11. ElcTCnth Civil Scrr icc Retrlon, 
Ronm ,103, Federal Off ice Bldir.. Firat ATa. 
and Madison St., Seattle 4. Wash. 

12. T w e l f t h Civil Service KcBion, l t » 
Appraisers Bide.. « 3 0 Sansome St., Saa 
Francisco 11, Cal i f . 

13. Board of Civi l Service Rxamlnerm, 
U. 3. Nava l Av ia t i on Ortlinanre Teat 8 t » . 
tion, Chincoteairue, Va . 

14. Board of Civi l Se'-vica 'Bxamlneni, 
U. S. A . F. Aeronautical Chart and 
format ion Center. Second awl Arsenal 8 ta « 
St. Louis 18. Mo. 

15. Board of Civil Serr iee BxamiBcra, 
Dept. of the Air Force. A t tn . : HCOCO, 
WriR-ht Patterson A ir Force Base, DayVm, 
Ohio. 

i n . Bo.ard o f Civi l Service Fxanalnsra, 
Phi ladelphia NaTal Shipyard, N.IVB1 Baaa. 
Phi lade lphia 15. Pa . 

17. Board of Civi l Service Ezaminera, 
Pniret Sonnd Nava l Shipyard. Bremer t «a . 
Wash. 

18. Board of Civi l Service H x a m l n e n , 
TJ. S. N a v y Underwater Sound Laboratory . 
Fo r t Trumbul l , New London, Conn. 

10. Board of Civi l Service Examineni , 
N e w Enerland Div., Corpa o f Enfrtneera, 
867 Commonweal th Ave . , Boston. Maaa. 

20. Board of Civi l Service Examineni . 
A i r Force Cambridire RMcarch Center. * 8 4 
A lbany St., Cambridire 39, Mass. 

21. Board of Civ i l Scrr ice Examinera, 
Chicaro Quartermaster Depot, 1819 W . 
Pershinff Rd., Chicaro 9. 111. 

22. Recorder, Boadr of Civi l Service R * -
aminers. Charleston Nava l Shipyard, V. S. 
Nava l Ba.se, Charleston, S. C. 

23. Board of Civi l Service R x a m i n e n , 
A r m y Electronic P rov inc Oronod, For t 
HTiaehnca, A r i z . 

24. Bo.ird of C lvn Sarvioe KxamhHra, 
Burean o f Reclamation, Denver Federal 
Center, Denver, Colo. 

M . Board • ( O v i l Sarriee BaamlMra , 

F roT in r Ground, 
« . Mes . 

ST. BMVd a4 Civ i l Servtca 
OMap Rucker . A la . 

SS. Board of Civi l Sarvlaa H a a a a i a — , 
Datrolt Arccnal. ZN251 Vaa B r k c M , 
Oanter Une . Mich . 

S9. Board of Civi l Service K x a i r l n v a 
l a r Scient i f ic ami Tecl inical ParaoniMl a< 
P R I f C . Nava l Reecrai'h Lab. , Waah inv iaa 
as, D. c. 

so . Board of Civi l Service E x a m i n e r ^ 
Mar ie t ta Transportat ion Corpa 
Marietta, Pa 

51. Board of Civi l S e r v d e Kxaminar^ 
Corpa of Engineers, U. S. Army, 0 U « 
U r e r Division. T O . Box 1169, Ctncte-
••41. Ohio. 

52. Board of Civi l Service lExaminora, 
Dapartment o f the Army , Abanieen P r v r . 
k w Ground, Md. 

53. Board of Civi l Service Kxaminara, 
U. S. N a v a l A i r Dev i l opment Canter, 
Dopartniciit o f Airrieulture, Room 004. 
Johnsvi l le, Pa. 

54. Board of Civi l Service Examine r^ 
• a a t ^ Bid?., Cir> Southweat lOUi Ara . , 
Port land 5. Orep 

86 Board of Civi l Service Examinera, 
Enuineer Center, U. S. A rmy , F m i 

Bolvoir , V a . 
36. Board of Civi l Service Examinera^ 

Dept. of the Army , Corps of Knirineer^ 
T S l S. Fiirucroa St.. Los Anecles, Cal i f . 

37. Board of Civi l Scrvico Examinera, 
Midd le town Air Material Area, Olmitod 
A i r Force B.l9e. Middletown, Pa . 

3S. Board of Civi l Service Exam ine r^ 
Francis E. Vfarren A i r Force Baae, Cher-
aww . W y o . 

THE JOBS 

AIR NAVIGATION TECHNI-
CIAN, $3,175 to $5,940.^obs a r o 
I n Missouri. Requirements: Ex-
perience as a pilot or navigator of 
multi-engine airTaft , in air traffic 
control, aerial flight surveys, top-
ographic mapping, map and chart 
construction, or as instructor In 
advanced air navigation. Pertin-
ent education may be subtituted. 
Send application to Address 14. 

AIR TECHNICAL INTELLI -
GENCE SPECIALIST, $5,060 to 
$7000, — Options: power plant 
(fuels and lubrication), wit/iogl-
c a l and chemical warfare, phys-
k 5 s and geophysics, industrial e n -
gineering, aircraft equipment, a i r -
craft armament, aircraft materi-als, guided missiles, atomic ener-
gy, propulsion, electronics.—Jobs 
are In Ohio. Requirements: Bach-elor's degree in engineering, chem-
istry, physics, or mathematics, plus from IV2 to 3'2 years of ap-
propriate experience. Send appli-
cations to Address 15. 

AIRPLANE PILOT ( F i x e d 
Wing), $5,060.—Jobe are in Ala-
bama. Requirements: CAA c o m -
mercial license with single engine 
land plane and instructor ' s rating, plus 1,000 solo hours in single-
o r multi-engine aircraft and 500 
Instructor hours on single-engine 
aircraft. Age limits: 18-to 62. Send 
applications to Address 27. 

A IRPORT T R A F F I C CON-
TROLLER, $3,795 to $5,060.— 
Jobs are in Alabama. Require-
ments: Experience in controlling 
air traffic, in the control of flight 
operations ,or in air-ground com-

(Continued on Page 12) 

Big Difference in Pay 
For Doing Same Level 
Of Work Is Protested 

A group of employees of the 
NYC Board of Education has pro-
tested against being subjected to 
inequity under the Career and 
Salary Plan. 

The Board of Education Itself Is 
backing up the employees' protest. 

The Committee of Third Orade 
Clerical Employees, Board of Edu-
cation, complains that iMittlng 
senior clerks In grade 6 is not only 
unjust but conflicts with the Board 
of Education's own salary sched-
ule. Orade 6 pays $3,500 to $4,580. 
n i e Board's schedule for grade S 
clerks and stenographers was 
$3,556 to $4,230. Renumbering ot 
grades under the Career and Sal-
ary Plan resulted In the former 

THE CITY COLLEGE 
MHOCNL or GENERAL STUDIES—EXTENSION DIVISION 

la Collaboration with the New York Public Ubrary 

OFFERS 300 INTENSIVE COURSES 
Beginning the Week of September 19, 1*55 

Including: 
TYP ING . STATISTICS . STENOGRAPHY 
USE o r 8 U D E RtlLE . BOOKKEEPING 

BUSINESS BNGUSH 
Write for Catalogue to 

The caty College. School of General Studies, Extension Dtvlsloii. 
139th St. and Convent Ave.. New York 31, New York, or Phone: 

WAdsworth 6-5409 or ADlrondack 4-2000, Ext. 203. 

grade 3 employees going Into new 
grade 6. The employees say they 
should be in new grade 9, $4,250 to 
$5,330. The group has retained 
former Magistrate Eugene R. Ca-
nodo as counsel. 

Canudo Submits Brief 
Mr. Canudo sent a brief to 

the Board of Education. He set 
forth the job descriptions adopted 
by tbe Department of Personnel 
for Its on-the-job survey for the 
titles of senior clerk (formerly 
grade 3) and supervising elerfc 
(formerly grade 4). He stressed 
the close parallels in description 
oC duties of the two jobs. Ho 
pointed out that the former di f-
ferential In top pay of $655 be-
tween grades 3 and 4 employees 
has now gone to $1,410, and that 
the percentage Increase foe to* 
pay, 32.8 percent In the case of 
grade 4 employees, contrasts witM 
8.8 percent for grade 3 employees, 
who have passed two «xamina< 
tlons. He added that many grado 
3 amployees have S& to M yoaw 

serrloe. 
like Board of Education arged 

Budget Director Abraham Dt. 
Beame and Personnel Director Jo> 
seph Schechter to recommend 
V M t e 8 . 
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U. S. Needs Laborers 
At $52 to $54.60 a Week; 
Only Veterans May Apply 

The laborer exam, one oC ttM 
tests on the list for early receipt 
«r applications as published ex-
cliuivelr in The LEADER, ia now 
•pen. 

The title is laborer (custodial), 
•acancles exist in several Federal 
Mcnciea in NYC. 

Pay starts at $1.30 and $1.41 an 
bour. 

The exam is restricted to area 
Tcterans. Non-veterans will not be 
considered. The restriction is im-
posed pursuant to mandatory law. 

The exam is No. 2-64(55). Men-
tion both title and number when 
applying. 

Applicants must have had three 
months' experience for jobs pay-
ing $1.30 and six months for Jobs 
paying $1.41, in one or a combi-
nation of the following types ot 
work:: 

Performing janitorial or related 
custodial work, such as sweeping, 
dusting and cleaning. 

Active service in the armed 
forces in any capacity, if of tbe 

FireDepts.Held 
To Need l^uch 
More Research 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — The report 
for the year 1955, of the former 
Temporary State Commission on 
Fire Laws, has just been pub-
lished. Copies are being furnished 
to State and local officials, includ-
ing fire commissioners and Are 
chiefs, and to representatives of 
Tarlous fire associations and insur-
ance companies. Senator S. Went-
worth Horton, of Suftolk; County, 
chairman of the Joint Legislative 
Committee on Fire Laws, said that 
comments and suggestions of these 
•fHcials and representatives had 
been of great value to the Pire 
IAWS Commission. 

More Research Needed 
The report stresses the need for 

continuing legislative research on 
legal and practical problems in-
•olved in file department opera-
tions. particularly those relating to 
payment of financial benefits to 
volunteer firemen killed or in-
jured in line of duty. 

The problems affect the activl-
ttes of 1,600 fire departments and 
110,000 volunteer firemen not only 

their own communities but also 
IK intercounty and interstate op-
erations. In the recent flood disas-
ter, Senator Horton said, 52 fire 
departments from Delaware, Dut-
chess. Greene. Orange, Rensselaer, 
Rockland, Sullivan, Ulster and 
Westchester counties furnished 
•nergency aid in the Port Jervis 

Copies of Laws Included 
The report contains copies of 

M laws enacted by the I.egislature 
kt 1966 on recommendation of the 

Laws Commission, together 
explanatory notes. Included 

ti the new law that mandates an> 
•oal Inspections for fire hazards 
ki aO public and private schools In 
«bc SUte outside NYC. Buffalo, 
Rochester, Syracuse, Yonkers. and 
Albany. There is also an article on 
•abllltlea for negligent acts and 
tar injuries to paid flremea and 
vnlunteer firemen. 

The work of the Pire Laws Cou-
•laaloo Is being carried on by the 
•Mr Joint L«gi.slatlve Committee 
Ml Plr« Laws of which SeDator 

in chalrmaa, 

required length of time. Competl-
tkn In the examination is re-
•trkited by law to persons entitled 
t « Teteran preference. 

Where to Apply 
Application forms may be ob-

tained at the main post office in 
the Bronx. Brooklyn, Queens, and 
Richmond, or from the Director, 
Second U.S. Civil Service Region, 
641 Washington Street. New York 
14, N.Y. The exam is open until 
further notice. 

The register established as a 
result of a previous exam will be 
merged with the new register. 
Persons who attained eligibility 
under need not submit a new ap-
plication, since their eligibility will 
be continued. 

Get Standard Form 60 and Card 
Form 5001-ABC, at a post office; 
or from the U.S. Civil Service Re-
gion. Fill them out completely. 

Send the filled out forms to the 
Director, at the address above. 

Duties include general cleaning, 
dusting, emptying wastebaskets, 
waxing floors, and other duties of 
a janitorial nature. 

If appointed in the Post Office 
CXistodial Service, employees will 
perform general manual labor in-
cidental to cleaning buildings, of-
fices and workrooms; assist fire-
men in smaller buildings in the 
care of heating plant and related 
equipment; care for shrubbery and 
clean walks, and perform related 
duties as required. 

Rerquirements follow: 
No Competitive Written Test 

Competitors will not be required 
to report for a written test but 
will be rated on a scale of 100. on 
the extent and quality of their 
experience and training. Such rat-
ing will be based on competitors' 
statements in their applications 
and any additional evidence ob-
tained by the Commission. 

Candidates must be physically 
able to perform the duties of the 
position. Good distant vision in 
one eye and ability to read with-
out strain printed material the 
size of typewritten characters are 
required, glasses permitted. Abil-
ity to hear the conversational 
voice, with or without a hearing 
aid, is required. In most instances, 
an amputation of leg or foot will 
n<^ disqualify you for appoint-
ment, although it may be neces-
sary that this condition be com-
pensated by use of satisfactory 
prosthesis. Any physical condition 
which would cause you to be a 
hazard to yourself or to others will 
disqualify you for appointment. 

Candidates must be able to 
speak and understand the English 
language sufficiently to follow 
written and oral Instructions. For 
positions which require making en. 
tries or keeping records, ability to 
write legibly must be demonstrated 
prior to appointment. 

Type of Appointment 
Appointments will be career-

conditional unless otherwise lim-
ited. The first year ol a career-
conditional appointment will be a 
probationary period. Upon satis-
factory completion of the proba. 
tlonary period, employees acquire 
a competitive civil service status. 
Career-conditional appointments 
become career appointments when 
employees have completed three 
years of substantially continuous 
service. Former Federal employees 
whe have already completed the 
three year service requirement will 
be given career appointments sub-
ject to completion ti a new pro-
bationary period. Career-condU 
tlonal appointments of veterans 
with a compensable service-con-

dtsabiiUf tt M ^lueat sr 
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8TATI T A X BSYENUB 
EXCEEDS AVERAGE 

ALBANY. Sept. 5 — The State 
took In $1,178,721,063 in tax rev-
enue during the fiscal year ended 
March 31,1955, Comptroller Arthur 
Levitt's annual report states. 

On a per capita basis, the State 
tax revenue amounts to $73.98, only 
slightly above the per capita State 
tax for the United States as a 
whole, which the United States 
Census Bureau puts at $72.25. 

Jr. Engineer 
Starting Pay 
Is $180 Higher 

NYC Is recruiting Junior end-
neers In the dvil, mechanical and 
electrical fields at higher pay than 
formerly, now at the second step 
of the first grade, or $4,430, in-
stead ot $4,250. This action was 
approved by the Board of Bstl-
mate on recommendation of Per-
sonnel Director Joseph Schechter. 
The position is in grade 9, $4,asa 
to $4,330. 

On the quefition of assistant en-
gineer pay, which employee or-
ganizations want increased sub-
stantially also, Mr. Schechter 
made no recommendations to the 
Board. The reason ascribed is that 
as yet Insufficient information has 
been obtained to Justify a recom-
mendation that the pay be raised. 
The assistant titles are in grade 
13. $5,450 to $6,890. 

Broad Study Asfced 
The (jovemment and Civic Em-

ployee* Organizing Committee. 
CIO. wants the pay raised a f\ill 
grade. In each instance, not J\ict 
one step in the lowest grade to the 
first increment leveL The Juniors, 
says the union, should be in grade 
10, $4,550 to $5,990, and the as-
sistant engineers in grade 14. 
$5,750 to $7,190, to meet competl. 
tion from private industry and 
other governmental Jurl^ctlons. 

The union is dissatisfied wtth 
the one-step advance offered with-
in grade, and wants the Board oi 
Estimate to consider the whole 
subject of encineering pay on a 
broad scale. 

Borough President John Casta-
more of Brooklyn, Commissioners 
of the Transit Authority, and 
other public officials favor higher 
pay for engineers than Mr. 
Schechter recommends, on the 
ground that such higher salariec 
are necessary so that the C^ty may 
recruit the type of personnel It 
needs. Mr. Schechter thinks the 
$180 increase for the Juniors will 
protect the City's recruitment 
needs, but the union replies that 
current experience shows that the 
effect he expected Is not Uking 
p l a c e s 

more may become career appoint-
ments on completion of a one-year 
probationary period tf recom-
mended by the agency. 

Salary is based on the standard 
Federal workweek of 40 hours. 
Additional compensation is pro-
vided for any authorized overtime 
worked In excess of the 40-hour 
week. 

All career or career-conditional 
appointments are subject t « a de-
duction ot • percent for retire-
ment benefits. 

CARNIVAL TIMK 

ST. JUOE'S -MIAMI CAJMIVAL-
St. Jude's "Miami Carnival" at 

204th Street and 10th Avenue wUl 
run until Sunday. September 11th. 
This colorful affaffir, set against a 
Miami background, features night-
ly aerial acts, amusement rides 
and Florida displays. 

The 1955 attendance award Is a 
three bed-room house in Florida. 
There is no admission charge. A 
door priM stub is givea cach 

night. 

Human Side 
Of the Tax Dept. 

Driver License Renewals Lag: 
3,500.000 Permits Expire Soon 

Failure of applicants for renewal of operators' licenses to under< 
stand the new regulation requiring a physician's statement In certain 
cases has led to thousands of telephone calls to all offices of the State 
Bureau of Motor Vehicles. Commissioner Joseph P. Kelly said. 

Commissioner Kelly pointed out that only those who have a his-
tory of fainting spells, diabetes, stroke, Brlght's disease, excessive higk 
blood pressure, or any heart ailment, are subject to the rule that went 
Into effect last year, requiring the certificate. 

Those applicants who have suffered any of these ailments sine* 
obtaining their last license will be denied license renewal until thel* 
cases have been reviewed by the Bureau's Safety Division. 

Renewals are coming in slowly. Mr. Kelly suggests that all oper-
ators check their licenses to learn the expiration date. About 3.500.-
000 operators' licenses throughout the State will be void after Sep-
tember 30. 

Hoover Group Asks 
Separate Budget 
For Each Supervisor 

WASHTNOTON, Sept 5 — The 
idea that each personnel supervi-
sor In the Defense Department be 
given his own simple operating 
budget has been recommended by 
a Hoover Commission task force. 

Deoentralizatloa 
In recognition that budgeting is 

an operation largely confined to 
the staff ofhce, with most super-
visors unaware of how much they 
spend, the task force declared: 

"Decentralized operating budg-
ets should be extended to subor-
dinate and field levels of manage-
ment. Managers at these levels 

should participate In the develop-
ment of such budgets, be held re-
sponsible for operating wlthm 
them, and be recognized lor Im-
proved performance." 

Visual Training 
OF CANDIDATES Pve 

PATROLMAN 
FOI THI EYESIGHT TESTS Of 
CIVIL SERVICE REQUIREMENTS 

DR. JOHN T. FLYNI 
OpteeiafHH • Or tkep lM 

JOO Weft 23rd St., N. Y. C , 
•r Apwt e ^ WA. s-aeie 

PATROLMAN N . T. city POHC * O ^ 

Salary S5440 a Year After 3 Years 
Includes $125.00 Aaaual Uaifora Allowoace 

PENSIOI* AT HALF-PAY AFTER 20 YEARS SERVICI 
Om Ceers* of Preparatloe Affords Thoroa^h lastreetioa la AN 
Pboiei of the Exam. Delehoaty Stadeah Hav* Hod • • UasqeeHad 
RMord of Soccets la Patrolmaa Excnas tar Over 4t Teera. 

FREE Doctor's Office of 115 E. IS S*.. 
e v A ^ MONDAY m d THtlRSOAY 

MEDICAL EXAM ^.M. to 12 Nooa, aad S PJd. to t PJA 

Be Our Gaesf ai a Class Scssioa 
Attend la Either MANHATTAN er JAMAICA 

Clasiei at Coaveaieat Hoars D«y «ad Evaalaf 

Classes NOW Forming for N n t ExcHa for 

POLICEWOMAN — N . Y. city P.ne. Dept. 
Salary and Pension are the Same as for PatroloMNi 

TM* posltioa offers many spleadid advaatoges to ooibiHoas yoaof 
woiaoa aad competitioa ia tke oflical oxaa is always kooo. 
T l ieroa^ preparatioa by oxporieaced lastmctor* «ovor ia« ovory 
phaso of tho official exam. 
K E i MEDICAL EXAM (Woarao Oaly) oa WED.. S P.M. to • 

Be Our Guest at a Class Session 
la MANHATTAN: WEDNESDAY ot 5:45 er 7:45 P.M. 

OR. In JAMAICA: MONDAY ot 7:30 P.M. 

Classes Start Soon for. Approaching N. Y. City Ex«a far 

CLERKS — Salary $2,750 to Starl 
Aanaal Increases to $3,650—Excellent Promotloaol Oppui taaWsi 

Hundreds of Appointments—Permanent Position for 
Men and Women of All Ages—17 Years and Up 

NO EDUCATIONAL OR EXPERIENCE REQUIREMENTS 
Visit, Phone or Write for Conpleto DotaH* 

CLASSES WILL BE HELD IN MANHATTAN AND JAMAJCA 

Applications Ope« Sept. • — Official Exoai Ocf. 22 tor 

PARKING METER COLLECTOR 
$3,500 to Start CIVIL SERVICI •ENims 

• Moa yp to 50 Years of Age — Votoraas May l o OMor 
• No Educational or Exporieace Re<|alromoBts 

Bm Oar Guest at a Class fa Manhaffam or Jam^n 
MANHATTAN: TUESDAY at 1:15, 5:45 er 7:45 P.M. 

JAMAICA; FRIDAY at 7:30 P.M. 

• VOCATIONAL COURSES * 
• AUTO MECHANIC • DRAFTINft • RADIO ft TBLIVISION 

• SECRETARIAL, STENOGRAPHY ft TY 'EWIUTm* 

STUDY TV-RADIO-ELECTRONICS AT HOMB 
Shop Work StarH with Hnt L . S M I I — We FunMi 

All Equipmeet iecluding 2Mncli Pictwe Tab* 
NO RISK — NO OBLIGATION — MONEY SACK GilAJtANIH 

Writ. Dept. L (or FKEE IMustr.tio* looklot 

DEIEHANTY 
MANHATTAN: 115 EAST IStll STREfT — 6R. S-AtO* 
JAMAICA: M-14 SUTPHIN BOULEVARD — JA. * - t20« 

OVMOK HOURS: M O N V A T TO F R I D A Y • A H . t « • F . H . 
I V M HOI IK8 ; MON. to I 'RI , • A M. to O P.M. — <4\T. B A . M . I F J 
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« O V . R A R R I M A N 

Question, 
Please 

40-Hour Week as Vital 
As Security in One's Job 
The slowness of government to subscribe to the same 

standards it imposes by law on private industry has 
been one of the most disheartening aspects of public 
employment, but fortunately is disappearing. 

The Federal government has a 40-hour week ; the 
N e w York State has a 40-hour week for 
many of its employees, but not those who 
work in institutions; Mayor Robert F. 
Wagne r has asked Budget Director Abra -
ham D. Beame to estimate the cost of a 
general 40-hour week in N Y C , where such 
a week exists also for some employees, 
but not for others. 

John F. Powers, president of the Civil 
Service Employees Association, has writ-
ten two letters to Governor Averell Har -

man, both urging the State to join in the general move-
ment to conform government personnel standards to those 
existing in private industry. 

Mr. Powers asks for a study of how to make the 
40-hour week general in State employ. The Governor 
himself is on previous record favoring such a project. 
The question of cost arises. The Association offers to 
the Governor fullest co-operation in connection with this 
aspect and other facets of the improvement. 

The other letter deals with making more State jobs 
more secure. 

In public employ a different basis exists than in pri-
Tate industry, because appointments and promotions are 
made under the Merit System. Nevertheless, greater job 
security to the employee, as Mr. Powers points out, exists 
for those workers whose titles are in the competitive 
class, and who moreover are in that class themselves. Mr. 
Powers wants an earnest jurisdictional reclassification un-
dertaken, to achieve a realistic improvement on the none 
too reassuring present situation whereby competent State 
workers in non-competitive jobs often lose those jobs for 
political reasons. The Association president asks the Gov-
ernor for assurances that such removal will not be per-
petuated during his own term. 

The jurisdictional reclassification relates to putting 
jobs in that group of the basic classification in which they 
properly belong—competitive, non-competitive or exempt. 
The ruling purpose is to put all present noncompetitive 
Jobs in the competitive class that properly can be as-
signed to the more secure category. 

Both topics that Mr. Powers discusses go to the very 
root of progressive personnel administration. The Gover-
nor would be rendering a service not only to the em-
ployees but to the public if he undertook promptly the 
projects that Mr. Powers calls to his attention. 

Security Program Needs 
Most a Policy of Fairness 
\ committee of outstanding citizens is to study the Fed-

eral loyalty program, to determine what is the best 
method of safeguarding the interests of both the govern-
ment and the employees. A report is to be made to the 
President, including recommendations for improvement. 

It should not be difficult to improve on what has been 
in clumsy existence in three unfortunate forms so far . 

Wha t is needed, also, is a declaration of policy under 
which any new law on the subject is to be administered. 
I f such a policy is not actually written into statute, Presi^ 

WHAT IS NEW about the move 
to protect U. S. employees from 
having their »alary cut In cases 
of downgrading of their titles? 
W. D. C. 

Answer — Nothing. But some-
thing should come of It. The 
U. S Civil Service Commission 
agrees on some form of protection. 
The bill for a statutory prohibi-
tion against pay cuts In downgrafl-
Ing cases was not brought to the 
floor of Congress for a vote. 

IS IT not true that a Loyalty 
Review Board, as now constituted, 
by a U.S. Supreme Court decision, 
does not have the authority to 
reverse a departmental loyalty 
board exoneration of a Federal 
employee, but only to reverse a 
finding of guilt? P.L. 

Answer — The assumption Is 
correct. However, the loyalty pro-
gram was changed, after the facts 
arose In the test case to which 
you refer. There is no more 
Loyalty Review Board. A commis-
sion, by authority of Congress, is 
to study the operation of the se-
curity program, and propose 
remedies. Two important factors 
are protection of employees against 
being subjected to hearsay and 
other Irresponsible charges, and 
the right of employees to be con-
fronted by their accusers. Con-
frontation is granted in most in-
stances, but when the Government 
is using informers. It hides their 
Identity. The FBI holds that if it 
must reveal the Identity of its 
Informers it will lose its informers. 

TO WHAT EXTENT has a 
police department authority to re-
fuse to appoint an eligible to the 
uniformed force on the alleged 
grounds of nervousness? I am a 
veteran,' and saw plenty of action 
in World War I I and in the Korean 
conflict. All of us who saw action 
may be expected to be a little ner-
vous. Is it fair to rule us out? 

LP . 

Answer — Thousands who took 
part in the actual fighting, many 
of whom distinguished themselves, 
have been appointed to the police 
forces. The police department did 
not find them suffering from any 
form of nervousness. Some eligibles 
are denied appointment because 
they have a nervous condition, or 
a history of nervousness. Either 
fact. In the standards of most 
police departments, eliminates a 
candidate. One reason why police 
departments are so careful about 
cases of nervousness, past or 
present, is that a policeman carries 
a pistol. Another Is that he some-
times has to cope with situations 
that demand coolness In the midst 
of others' excitement, and must 
exercise calm Judgment. 

T I M E O F F 

jy vacationing State tax examiner 
^ has warmed the cockles of our 
heart by reporting on an Incident 
which showed that the joys of our 
youth are still supreme. 

The examiner happened to wit-
ness a dance contest during his 
stay at a resort. The jitter bugs, 
rock-and-roll crowd and the rest 
of the hep cats fell by the way-
side when the real champ took 
over—an expert in the "Lambeth 
Walk." He won hands down, we 
were told. 

Now all we need is a champion 
for 'The Big Apple" and the 1930s 
will receive their proper niche In 
dance history. 

One Federal employee. In filling 
out a job description form recerit-
ly, according to "Personnel Ad-
ministration," publication of the 
Society for Personnel Administra-
tion, described his job as follows: 

"Maintains high morals In the 
division by dispelling false ru-
mors." 

Well, a little lifting of morals 
in Government service can't hurt 
anybody. 

Another job description by an 
employee Included this explana-
tion: 

"The employee must carry M l 
personnel procedures In acconU 
ance with exhausting regulations." 

All we have to say about that 
spelling Is "Let it stand!" 

It's nice to see the State and th* 
NYC administrations of civil serv-
ice on such good terms that the 
one helps out the other. The Stat* 
Employment Service will receive 
applications for NYC jobs as ste-
nographer and typist. But as the 
State Is as hard up for such per-
sonnel as the City is, the City had 
better watch its step, lest the 
State swipe at least a few eligiblee 
while the City isn't looking. 

What we get out of the Court 
of Appeals decision on the time 
element that controls retroactive 
seniority for veterans is that the 
benefit starts when it starts and 
practically never ends. 

Victor H. Cahalane, assistant di-
rector of the State Museum and 
Science Service, who, in a Federal 
job, kept thousands of wild ani-
mals happy In 20 national parlc3< 
will find in his new job that It la 
much harder to keep human be-
ings happy. 

Letters to the Editor 
LOW PAY IS REASON FOR 
PENSION LONAS, AIDE SAYS 
Editor, The LEADER: 

A recent LEADER article indi-
cated that the reason State em-
ployees are borrowing money on 
their pension funds is to purchase 
new cars, television sets, washing 
machines, or that they are in debt 
for nothing. 

As one who has borrowed from 
the plan, I wish to assure you 
there is a more basic reason why 
loans are taken on pension funds. 
The reason is quite simple, to wit, 
the salaries State employees are 
receiving are insufficient to main-
tain a very simple standard of liv-
ing. It is a sad commentary that 
civil service employees have to 
make over 3,000 loans on their 
pension funds in order to keep 
their heads above water. Perhaps 
if the salaries were increased to a 
proper level commensurate with 
that paid to employees in private 
industry, such loans would not 
have to be made. 

STATE EMPLOYEE 
New York City 

HARD TO GET ALONG 
ON PUBLIC JOB'S PAY 

Editor, the LEADER: 
You have done a good job In pub-

lishing the facts about the low 

dent Eisenhower should declare the policy consistent with 
any new statute, or any improyed executive order he 
might issue. 

One of the princial difficulties has been that admin-
istrators have run wild and loose, in some instances, 
hounding employees with accusations not related to loy-
alty or even national security at all. There have been 
accusations that, besides being irrelevant, were also false. 
The falsity was proved either by the employees being 
cleared or the regretted charges withdrawn. 

Both the loyalty program, which relates to patriot-
ism, and the security program, which deals with propri-
ety of conduct and reliability as an employee, are in des-
perate need of improvement. 

One easy improvement would be to extend the pre-
sumption of innocence to accused Federal employees, the 
same protection that, for others, is the basic law of the 
land. 

pay of State, County and local 
government employees, the difilcul-
ties met in recruiting employed 
because salaries are so low, and the 
necessity of employees supplement-
ing their government pay check* 
with pay received from outside 
jobs. 

It is plain that public employees 
find it difficult to live within their 
incpme, even if they are most eco-
nomical. Their income is too small 
to permit them to live steadily on 
a basis of a good standard of 
living, without recourse to outside 
jobs and borrowing. That is the 
main reason why the loans made 
by the New York State Employees 
Retirement System have hit a new 
high. It is not because the employ-
ees have gone in for the fastidious 
though fetching appliances, or for-
eign-made cars. 

J. W. A . 
Hempstead, N. Y. 

WANTS DEPARTMENTS 
TO TELL WHAT THE PAY IS 
Editor The LEADER: 
While NYC employees are gettin« 
credit for their recent pay to-
creases, the actual payment of the 
raise is postponed. Meanwhile 
many employees do not know what 
their earned salary is. Depart-
ments do not tell them. Should not 
the departments be obliged to 4e 
so? 

FRED McGOVERN 
Brooklyn, N.Y. 

E. F. Gibbons New 
Chief Engineer in 
Public Works 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — Appoint-
ment of Eugene F. Gibbons ef 
Valley Stream as chief engineer ef 
the State Public Works Depart-
ment has been announced by CNi-
perintendent John W. Johnson. 
Mr. Gibbons succeeds George U 
Nickerson, who resigned and win 
assume the duties of his former 
post as district engineer of D(s-
trict 1, which has its headquarters 
Uere. 
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General Administrators 
Are Held National Need 
As Specialists Bog Down 

Residents of New York State, 
and of just about every one of the 
47 other States, who are now en-
joying the New York State Fair 
at Syracuse see the glittering 
lights, the fine entertainment and 
the accomplished agricultural dis-
plays. It's an eight-day annual 
demonstration of what the Empire 
State has to oEEer. And it "ticks" 
because of the year 'round efforts 
of State employees. 

The last visitor will hardly have 
left the fair grounds when State 
aides will begin the clean-up job, 
and the preparation for next year's 
proceedings. 

What Preparation Was Made 
Here's a brief look at how they 

got ready for the current Pair. 
The maintenance crew and the 

administrative staff — all State 
aides — are on the fairgrounds 
12 months a year preparing for 
th« big opening day. Many years 
of experience with the Pair and 
with the State equip these people 
with the knowledge necessary for 
successful operation of the 278 
acres. 

Among those who help make the 
Agricultural and Industrial Ex-
position the annual success it is, 
are: 

George W. Schilly, the business 
manager, who has been with the 
Pair for 38 years. 

Kenneth J. Lindeman, head ac-
count clerk. Formerly with the De-
partment of Audit and Control, 
he Is now a full-time Fair em-
ployee. 

Thirty-one years of experience 
make Mary C. IXmn, senior ac-
count clerk, an expert on space 
commitments. She can justify 
every inch of exhibit and other 
space requirements more know-
ingly than any other person on 
the grounds. 

Mere 20 Years' Service 
A comparative youngster of the 

permanent staff, with a mere 20 
I Attorney General Jacob K. Ja- au offense which carries with it years' experience, is Elizabeth A. 

OenersJ administrative ability. 
MUber than competence as a spe-
•telist, is now being considered a 
•Md of the times, as the United 
Mtntm advances, both in govem-
•Mftt and private industry, to high-
er standards of performance and 
iproduction. 

Until recently there was a great 
my in favor of the specialist. He 
vms supposed to know all the an-
swers. Maybe he did. Maybe de did 
•oi . But making the technologist 
Ilk* head administrative man Is 
Worted to be turning out rather 
IWdly. 

Government units that have 
lieen calling for specialists in nar-
row fields may now start raising 
ttielr voices for generalists in the 
•dmlnistrative specialty, if one may 
yot It that way. 

The .subject Is di.scussed by J. 
Donald Kingsley in the latest Is-
MM of Good Government, pub-
Bahed by the National Civil Serv-
iM League. 
^ Desperate Need for a Corps 

"We desperately need to develop 
A corps of general administrators, 
with vision, breadth, and imagina-
tkm." he writes. "At present, both 
•or usual training programs and 
•or usual routes of entry to pub-

service are heavily weighted 
•ealnst such a development." 

He has had wide administrative 
•Kperience, for instance, in food 
•ad rug inspection and control, vo-
cational rehabilitation, war mobiU-
•atlon, construction projects. 

He admits he made one big mis-
take. 

"The only time." he recalls. 
*T;hat I ever ran into serious ad-
ministrative trouble was early in 
mj career in a subject-matter area 
ki which I considered myself an au-

thority. There I learned the hard 
way that a good administrator 
does not second-guess his experts 
in technical matters. But if this 
is so, he does not need to be an 
expert." 

He therefore reasons that ad-
ministrative ability if transferrable 
from one special field to another, 
and that there is no necessity for 
the administrator to be an au-
thority in the special field in which 
the work is t>eing done. 

General Administrators Needed 
"Short as we are," he continues, 

"of specialists, we are more short 
of general administrators; of the 
people who can fuse ideas and 
mold the specialists into a team to 
accomplish a public objective; who 
devise the means to carry out 
broad public policy — and in the 
process, shape it. What we most 
desperately need at every level is 
the public admimstrator classically 
described by Henry Taylor in his 
book "Tlie Statesman": "The mag-
net that draws all the separate 
pieces together so that they move 
forward in one field of force; who 
knows a specialist when he sees 
one, but doesn't try to know what 
the specialist knows.' 

"This need is a challenge to those 
who are in public careers or are 
embarking upon them. It is also a 
challenge to the schools, which 
have found it easier to train tech-
nicians than to fashion adminis-
trators. This is, of course, not 
•surprising. Technique is always 
more readily taught than art. 

Social Work Problems 
"Finding personnel to administer 

our welfare program is, I think, 
a special problem, because of the 
high degree of professionalization 
in the field of social work, the na-
ture of social work training, and 
particularly the philosophy upon 
whicli American social work is 
grounded. 

"The average social worker has 
as little idea of the nature of ad-
ministration as the average doc-
tor. Both groups live and breathe 
— in general in an admiinstra-

(Continued on Page 10) 

Aides' Year'Round Work 
Gets 8-Day State Fair 
Rolling Merrily Along 

ton Seagears of the State Conser-
/ation Department. 

The exhibitors: 
Department of Agriculture and 

Markets: Personnel of the Bureau 
of Pood Control will demonstrate 
how Inspectors through egg can-
dling make on-the-spot Inspection 
of eggs to check retail egg quality 
and weights to insure that egg la-
beling is in conformance with 
State regulations. The Bureau of 
Markets will show proper and ii • 
proper packaging of fresh produce. 
The Bureau of WeMights and 
Measures will display scales and 
explain the State inspection pro-
gram to insure honest weight for 
consumers. 

Division of Standards and Pur-
chase: Economic • procedures de-
veloped in State purchasing will 
be passed along to consumers 
through demonstrations of a) 
meat inspection and grading, b) 
textile construction, and c) shoe 
construction by Division person-
nel. 

Education Department: The 
Bureau of Home Economics Edu-

Jayits Explains How Law 
Can Bar Some from Jobs 
Tits holds, in an informal opinion, 
that under some circumstances a 
discharge from the armed forces. 
If dishonorable, or granted under 
•ther than honorable circum-
•tances, may disqualify a person 
trom a job with the State or one 
•f its communities. 

The Weekly Bulletin of the 
•tate's Division of Veterans' Af-
fairs reports on the subject, citing 
major veterans' rights under the 
Btate Military Law also may be 
affected, under the terms of tlie 
• p i n i o n . 

Right to Vole 
t First Mr. Javits discusses the 
right to vote. If the veteran were 
discharged from the armed forces 
because of conviction of a felony 
•nder State law, or in a Federal 
court that has exclusive jurisdic-
tion over the offen.se, "such con-
Tlction deprives him of the right 
tm register or vote in this State 
•nless he was pardoned or re-
•tored to the rights of citizenship 
fciy the appropriate authority." 

In addition, Mr. Javits holds. 
• person dishonorably discharged 
because of conviction which de-
prives him of citizenship under 
tlM Nationality Code is not en-
titled to vote, since citizenship is 
• prerequisite. 

The citizenship voting and cltl-
•mship considerations are impor-

in civil service matters be-
the dlsqualiflration from 

Mitng also extends to job-holdlns. 
When Barred from Office 

Says Mr. Jarlta: 
"Citizenship is a qualification for 

• M holding of elvtl oRice under 
Btlon 3 of the E»ublic Officers 

CuosequeuUy. couviction of 

loss of citizenship under Federal 
law disables an Individual from 
holding civil office in this State, 
although a dishonorable discharge 
in itself does not otherwise have 
such consequence." 

Thus, not the nature of the dis-
cliarge itself, but the reason for 
the discharge is controlling. 

He quotes Section 14 of the State 
Civil Service Law, which applies 
to communities of the State also: 

"The civil service department 
and municipal commissions may 
refuse to examine an applicant, 
or after examination to certify an 
eligible, . . . who has been guilty 
of a crime or of infamous or no-
toriously disgraceful conduct." 

C'ommi.ssion's Powers 
Mr. Javits comments: 
"Thus, it would be within the 

province of the Civil Service De-
partment or Commission to refuse 
U) examine or, after examination, 
to certify, any person who had re-
ceived such a discharge. If the 
grounds for the discliarge con-
stituted infamous or notoriously 
disgraceful conduct. 

"Furthermore, the additional 
credits provided for veterans in 
connection with competitive clvU 
•service examinations are not ap-
plicable unless the veteran wai 
'honorably discharged or released 
under honorable circumstances.'" 

The Other Benefits 
Such additional credits would 

Include veteran's 10 points added 
te the earned score of a disabled 
veteran, or 5 t « a non-disabled 
veteran. In open-competitive tests, 
half as many points In promotion 
te.sts. AKso, retroactive seniority 
would be adversely affected. 

Bryan, senior stenographer. 
Name Any Task 

Among the newest civil service 
employees to hold a position at 
the Pair is Carlyle M. Cleland, 
senior maintenance supervisor, for-
merly employed at Dannemora 
Prison. He, like the workers, is a 
member of the staff of the De-
partment of Agriculture and Mar-
kets. Prom 8 A.M., the time he 
arrives in the morning, until he 
leaves late In the evening, he is 
possibly the busiest man on the 
fairgrounds. The last hectic days 
before the Pair opens demand 
every minute of his time for 
getting the grounds in shape. 

Preparing for the biggest Pair 
in the country Is a good-sized 
head£w;he, according to Mr. Cle-
land. "This year we put up a new 
front entrance, two lagoons in 
front of the grandstand, and con-
structed new walls for the auto 
races. Name any ta.sk and we've 
probably done It." 

The results of these labors may 
be seen until September 10. After 
that, the employees start all over 
again, getting ready for Septem-
ber, 19f56. 

cation, in conjunction with prac-
ticing home economist-s, will help 
consumers with their buying hab-
its through demonstrations of a> 
food labeling, b> home utensil 
standards, c> sweater construction, 
and d> dress construction. 

Department of Labor: The Bed-
ding Division, which is responsible 
for the establishment and mainte-
nance of bedding standards in this 
State, will show the basic elements 
of bedding construction, how the 
State inspects bedding manufac-
ture. and the use and meaning of 
bddding labels. 

State Insurance Fund: Will 
demonstrate the proper use of and 
dangers of volatile fluids such as 
home cleaning fluids in the home 

NYC Department of Health: 
Will illustrate how the local 
health department can protect the 
consumer through food inspection. 
Tests will be run on milk, maca-
roni and meat for possible adul-
teration. Another demonstration 
will center on lead paint and the 
dangersof using it on children's 
toys. 

Spotlight 
On Labor Dept. 

Booths at Fair 
SYRACUSE, Sept. 5 — "Know 

Your Products—Gel Your Mon-
ey's Worth" lA the slogan under 
which five State agencies and the 
NYC Health Department are par-
ticipating in the State Pair. 

The demonstrations, under the 
auspices of Dr. Persia Campbell, 
Governor Harriman's Consumer 
Counsel, are being held in booths 
designed aad supervised by Clay-

How Cosf Is Met When Benefits 
Of Unemployment Insurance Rise 

WHILE the advantage ol higher weekly benefits under unem-
ployment insurance is well recognized, because present rates are in. 
sufficient to maintain a family properly during the trying period, and 
the Federal government appears willing to defray some additional 
expense, the burden of meeting the cost of any increase would fall 
mostly on the States. 

As an example. New York State recently raised its benefit rate to 
$36 a week, from $30. This increase costs the Federal government 
nothing. It is financed from a trust fund created from taxes paid b j 
employers in the State. Unless Federal legislation is enacted to pro-
vide to the contrary any such future improvement in benefits would 
increase the actual tax in the State that raised benefits, by re-
ducing the tax credit allowed to the employer. 

Effect of Present Laic 
Under the present law on segregating the Federal excise tax on 

employers of eight or more persons, the Federal government would 
not pay any increase in administration costs. Instead, the special loan 
fund, or refunds to States, would decrease. 

It is true, however, that the Federal government defrays admini». 
trative costs, and that Federal employees and veterans are paid un-

employment insurance at the Federal government's expense. That is 
similar to the case of any other employer who pays on behaU of hi* 
employees, except that the veterans may be regarded as 'former em-
ployees." In this connection the words "servicemen" and "employee" 
could be treated synonymously. 

State Supplies Lawyer 
To Claimants in Some Cases 
Involving Jobless Insurance 

In accordance with a new law, 
unemployment insurance claim-
ants whose benefit rights have 
been upheld by the Unemployment 
Insurance Appeal Board but chal-
lenged in the courts wil be reim-
bursed for counsel's fees and 
other court costs. 

Industrial Commissioner Isador 
Lubin commended the change. 

The court must apjxiint an at-
torney to represent a claimant 
otherwise unrepresented, and will 
allow the claimant's attorney not 
more than $150, and sanction not 
more than $50 for printing and 
other court costs. 

Coiiditioiiii to Be Met 
1. The employer or the Indus-

trial Commissioner appeals to the 
Appelate Division from an Unem-
ployment Insurance Appeal Board 
ruling favorable to the claimant. 

2. Tlie euiyloycf or tlie Indus-

trial Commissioner appeals « 
seeks leave to appeal to tire Court 
of Appeals from a ruling relating 
to an Unmployment Insurance 
Appeal Board decision which wa« 
favorable to the claimant. 

3. The claimant appeals to ttw 
Court of Appeals from a Iruling 
unfavorable to him, provided tlia 
earlier Appeal Board decision was 
in his favor, and provided the 
Court of Appeals finds his appeal 
was meritorious. 

Where the Unemployment In-
surance Appeal Board hands dowa 
a deci.sion unfavorable to tlM 
claimant and the claimant car. 
ries the case to Che Appellate Di-
vision, there will be no allowanca 

Pees and disbursements allowed 
by the cotirt will 'je paid by tb* 
Industrial CouuuLssioner out of 
the unemployment insuiance ad-
uuiustrution fund. 



NYC Tests That Open Sept. 8 
Tlie following are requirements 

In the September series of exams 
for Jobs with NYC. Applications 
will be received starting Thur.sday, 
September 8. Last day to apply is 
given at the end of each notice. 

Candidates must be U.S. citizens 
•nd residents of New York State. 
Three years' residence In NYC Is 
requirement for appointment, un-
less otherwise indicated. 

Apply in person at the applica-
tion section of the NYC Personnel 
Department, 86 Duane Street, 
Manhattan. Applications must be 
made by mall to the same address 
•nly where specifically stated. 

Exam number, title, salary 
range, minimum requirements, ap-
plication fee, and last day to file 
applications are given in that 
•rder. 

Open-Competitive 
7534. ASSISTANT C m i . ENGI-

NEER (3rd filing period). $5,450 
to $6,890; 149 vacancies in various 
City departments. Requirements: 
either (1) bachelor's degree in 
eivll engineering and three years' 
appropriate experience, or (2) 
high school graduation and seven 
years' experience, or (3) equiva-
lent combination of education and 
experience. Pee $5. Application 
may be made by mall. (Wednes' 
day, October 26). 

7342. ASSISTANT DIRECTOR 
OF PROGRAM REVIEW, $7,100 
to $8,900; one vacancy in NYC 
Youth Board. Former title of this 
position: assistant director of 
group work and recreation. Those 
who filed in January or February 
need not file application again, 
but may bring them up to date. 
Kequirements: (1) bachelor's de-
gree; (2) certificate or master's 
degree from school of social work; 
(3) i,,ven years' experience in 
social work agency, including five 
years in group work and three 
years in supervisory, administra-
tive or consultative capacity. Fee 
$5. Application may be made by 
mail. (Thursday, September 29). 

7343. ASSISTANT DIRECTOR 
OF YOUTH GUIDANCE, $7,100 to 
$8,900: one vacancy In NYC Youth 
Board. Tliose who filed in January 
or February need not file applica-
tions again, but may bring them 
up to date. Requirements: (1) 
bachelor's degree; (2) certificate 
er master's degree from school of 
•ocial work; (3) seven years' social 
casework experience, including 
lour years in field of family case-
work, child welfare or psychiatric 
casework and three years in super-
Tlsory, administrative or consulta-
tive capacity. Fee $5. Application 
may be made by mail. (Thursday, 
September 29). 

7437. ASSISTANT LANDSCAPE 
ARCHITECT, $5,450 to $6,890; two 
Tacancles in NYC Housing Au-
thority. Exempt from NYC resi-
dence requirement. Requirements: 
bachelor's degree in landscape 
architecture and three years' ex-
perience; or equivalent. Fee $5. 
Application may be made by mail. 
(Thursday, September 29). 

7531. CIVIL ENGINEERING 
DRAFTSMAN (9th filing period), 
$4,250 to $5,330; 60 vacancies in 
Tarious City departments. Re-
quirements: either (a) high school 
graduation, by February, 1956, and 
lour years' experience, or (b) 
bachelor's degree in engineering, 
by February, 1956. Fee $4. (Wed-
nesday, October 26). 

7559. COMPTOMETER OPERA-
TOR (4th filing period), $2,750 to 
$3,650; two vacancies. Require-
ments: No formal educational or 
experience requirements, but can-
didates must be able to operate 
efficiently a Felt and Tarrant 
comptometer or a Burroughs cal-
culator. Fee $2. Application may 
be made by mail. (Tliursday, Sep-
tember 29). 

7369. COURT REPORTER. $6,-
•50 to $7,490; 25 vacancies in 

NYC to Act Soon 
On Police-Fire and 
Social Worker Tests 

The NYC Civil Service Conimis. 
ilon is expected to approve soon 
the official requirements for social 
Investigator, and Fire Department 
exams for promotion to deputy 
thief and captain. 

The Commission meets Septem-
ber 9. 

The patrolman (P.D.) exam has 
Bot yet been ordered. 

Not until after these actions are 
taken will application dates be 
mt. 

Tarious City courts. Requirements: 
either (1) high school graduation 
and two years as legal stenogra-
pher, hearing reporter or court 
reporter; or (2) Bve years' steno-
graphic experience, including two 
years as legal stenographer, hear-
ing reporter or court reporter; or 
(3) certified shorthand reporter 
certificate; or (4) satisfactory 
equivalent of education and ex-
perience. Pee $5. Application may 
be made by mail. (Thursday, Sep-
tember 29). 

7472. ENGINEERING AIDE, $3,-
250 to $4,330; 36 vacancies. Re-
quirements: either (a) high school 
graduation and one year's engi-
neering experience; or (2) two 
years of technical training In 
school of engineering; or (3) 
equivalent combination of educa-
tion and experience. Pee $3. Ap-
plication may be made by mail. 
(Thursday, September 29). 

7476. JUNIOR DRAFTSMAN, 
$3,250 to $4,330; nine vacancies. 
Requirements: either (a) high 
school graduation and one year's 
drafting experience; or (2) two 
years of technical training in 
school of engineering or architec-
ture; or (3) equivalent combina-
tion of education and experience. 
Pee $3. Application may be sent by 
mail. (Thursday, September 29). 

7307. MASON'S HELPER, $17.85 
a day; 20 vacancies. Requirements: 
either (a) three years' experience 
as mason's helper; or (b) one and 
one-half years as mason's helper 
and related training in trade or 
vocational school to equal three 
years' experience. Maximum age, 
50, except that there is no top 
age limit for veterans, and others 
who have had recognized military 
service may deduct length of such 
service from their actual age. Pee 
50 cents. (Thursday, September 
29). 

7566. OCCUPATIONAL THERA-
PIST (6th filing period), $3,750 
to $4,830. Open to all qualified 
U.S. citizens. Requirements: either 
(a) graduation from school of 
occupational therapy; or (b) reg-
istered therapist recognized by 
American Occupational Therapy 
Association. Pee $3. Application 
may be made by mail. (Open until 
further notice). 

7347. PARKING METER COL-
LECTOR, $3,500 to $4,580; 10 va-
cancies in Department of Finance. 
Open to men only. No educational 
or experience requirements; can-
didates must be in good physical 
condition and able to carry a 
loaded case weighing up to 75 
pounds. Maximum age is 50, except 
that tliere is no top age limit for 
veterans and others who have had 
recognized military service may 
deduct length of such service from 
their actual age. Pee $3. (Thurs-
day, September 29). 

7481. PURCHASE INSPECTOR 
(MILL STEEL), $4,250 to $5,330; 
four vacancies in NYC Transit 
Authority. Open to all qualified 
U.S. citizens. Jobs are outside the 
City. Requirements: three years' 
experience as inspector of steel on 
mill work or as foreman or super-
intendent of steel rolling mill op-
erations; or equivalent. Pee $4. 
Application may be made by mail. 
(Thursday, September 29). 

7383. STRUCTURE MAIN-
TAINER, GROUP C, NYC Transit 
Authority, $1.90 to $2.14 an hour 
for 40-hour work week; 16 vacan-
cies. Requirements: four years' 
journeyman experience in altera-
tion, erection or fabrication of 
structural or ornamental iron or 
steel. Including welding or riveting. 
Helper experience or trade educa-
tion will be credited for part of 
the experience requirement. Maxi-
mum age, 50, except that there 
is no top age limit for veterans, 
and others who have had recog-
nized military service may deduct 
the length of such service from 
their actual age. Pee $3. (Thurs-
day, September 29). 

Promotion 
Candidates must be present, 

qualified employees of the NYC 
department mentioned. Last day 
to apply given at end of each 
notice. 

7493. ADMINISTRATIVE AS-
SISTANT ( IBM EQUIPMENT) 
(Prom.), $5,450 to $6,890. Open to 
employees of Departments of Edu-
cation, Finance, Health, Hospitals, 
Purcha.se, Welfare, City Magis-
trates Courts, NYC Housing Au-
thority and Police Department. 
Six mo.nths in any title in grades 
4 and 5 of the CHerlcal Service, 
Fee $5. (Thursday, September 29). 

7519. ASSESSOR (Prom.), Tax 
Department, $6,400 to $8,200. Six 
months as assistant asses,sor (old 
title: Junior a.sse.s.sor). Pee $5. 
(Thursday. September 29). 

7453. ASSISTANT CHEMIST 
(TOXICOLOGY) (Prom,), Office 
of the Chief Medical Examiner, 
$4,550 to $5,990. Six months as 
Junior chemist (toxicology). Pee 
$4. (Thursday, September 29). 

7389. ASSISTANT SUPER-
VISOR (POWER DISTRIBU-
TION) (Prom.), NYC Transit Au-
thority, $6,500 to $7,000; four 
vacancies. One year as foreman 
(power distribution). Pee $5. 
(Thursday, September 29). 

7537. ASSISTANT S ITER-
Y I S O R O F R E C R E A T I O N 
(Prom.), Department of Parks, 
$4,550 to $5,990. Six months as 
recreation leader (former title: 
playground director). Pee $4. 
(Thursday, September 29). 

7203. CABLE SPLICER (Prom.), 
Fire Department, $22 a day; two 
vacancies. Six months as cable 
splicer's helper. Fee 50 cents. 
(Thursday, September 29). 

7506. CHEMIST (Prom.), $5,750 
to $7,190. Open to employees of 
NYC Transit Authority, Queens 
Borough President's Office, De-
partments of Air Pollution Control 
and Purchase. Six months as as-
sistant chemist .Fee $5. (Thursday. 
September 29). 

7193. LINEMAN (Prom.), Fire 
Department, $19.92 a day. Six 
months as lineman's helper. Pee 
50 cents. (Thursday, September 
29). 

7284. STATIONARY ENGINEER 
(Prom.), $19.68 a day; 48 vacancies 
in various City departments. Open 
to employees of Departments of 
Correction, Education, Markets, 
Sanitation, Hospitals, Parks, Wel-
fare and Board of Higher Educa-
tion. Six months as stationary 
fireman, oiler or maintenance man. 
Candidates must have valid NYC 
Housing and Buildings Depart-
ment license as stationary engi-
neer. Fee 50 cents. (Thursday, 
September 29). 

7452. SUPERVISING FIRE 
ALARM DISPATCHER (Prom.), 
Fire Department, $5,150 to $6,590. 
Former title: supervi.sing fire tele-
graph dispatcher. Six months as 
fire alarm dispatcher (former 
title: fire telegraph dispatcher). 
Pee $5. (Thursday, September 29). 

7410. TRAINMASTER (Prom.), 
NYC Transit Authority, $7,500 to 
$8,500; one vacancy. One year as 
assistant trainmaster or motorman 
instructor, or two years as assist-
ant motorman instructor, schedule 
maker, train dispatcher or yard-
master. Pee $5. (Thursday, Sep-
tember 29). 

Visual Aid Technicians 
And Engineers Sought 

The NYC Board of Education 
has two vacancies for visual aid 
technicians and several vacancies 
for civil engineers, mechanical en-
gineers. assistant civil engineers 
and assistant mechanical engi-
neers The salary for visual aid 
technician will be $3,250 a year, 
assistant engineer, $5,450, and en-
gineer, $7,100. 

Apply in person at Room 102 at 
110 Livingston Street, Brooklyn. 

W. J. CONWAY NAMED 
TO CIVIL DEFENSE POST 

MINEOLA, Sept. 5 — William 
J . Conway, senior employment se-
curity manager of the Division of 
Employment, Hempstead, has been 
named chief of the newly organ-
ized Manpower Service for Nassau 
County Civil Defense. 

Dining . Dancing • Banquets 
Wedding Parties 

H E R B E R T ' S 
1054 Madison Ave., Albany 

Tel. 2-2268 

A r Candl l l onto . _ . J / . J _ 
Room* . Pirkinf t ^ O i f U l C i l U t f 

John ) . Hytand, M a n a g e r 

Dr. i Analyzes 
Effect of Pension Ruling 
Dr. Paul Studenskl wrote State 

Comptroller Arthur Levitt, pro-
testing the denial of pensions to 
workers employed under contract. 
The following is the third and 
final instalment: 

Personal Effect 
On the personal economic aide 

Dr. Studen.ski says: "Now the of-
ficers of the retirement system, 
misapprehending the opinion of 
the Attorney General propose to 
knock out my service credits for 
these five years and three months 
of 'contractual' employment on 
the ground that I was not then a 
State employee; and 'a return Is 
being made to me of the contribu-
tlons which I made on account of 
this service, which with accumu-
lated Interest amount to some 
$5,000. I had built my plan of eco-
nomic life during the.se past years 
in part on the basis of tJie recog-
nition by the retirement system 
of my entire range of State ser-
vices Including those performed 
under contract. I find now that 
these plans of mine are being 

Learn to Drive Now 
AMERICAN AUTO ACADEMY 

3 Central Avenue. Albany 3-6150 

Tobacco Ta/lar*i> f e Me Taste 

PIPES C IGARS 
lOaO MADISON AVE. TEL-89-1715 

wmmm 
•JPfc. n-23M State t lark Sla. 

Albany, N. Y. 

H O U S E H U N T In Albany with Your 
Lady Licensed Real Estate Broker 

MYRTLE C . H A L L E N B E C K 

Bell Real Estate Agency 
50 Robin Street Albany, N. Y . 

Phone: 5-4838 

The Greenwood Co., Inc. 
Producers of 

PINE PRINTING 
by Offset Lithography 

Railroad Avenue, Albany, N. T. 

thrown into the scrapheap. DoM 
this action make any sense to you 
and does it appear honorable?" 

The professor asks the appoint-
ment of some unbiased expert t « 
study the whole pension aspect of 
contract employment. He does not 
think litigation is the best way out« 
though advised by eminent coun-
sel that the case could be won. 
Litigation takes too long and costa 
too much. An administrative rem-
edy is preferred. He believes cor-
rective and elucidating legislation 
would be advisable. He would like 
the Attorney General to restud* 
the legal aspects, too, and possi-
bly clarify and amend the 
formal opinion that caused all the 
furor. That opinion was the first 
one that ever declared contract 
workers Ineligible. 

B A M E R & M C D O W E L L 
Over 45 Years Service to Public 

Complete Line of HARDWARE 
Mechanics Tools • Household Goods 

PAINTS 
3 « Central av 4-1347 
1090 Madison av 2-0401 

ALBANY. N. Y. 

Choice midweek league spot 
available — 10 alleys. Home 
alleys for State Income Tax 
League. 

Midway Bowling Center 
Albany.Scheneetady Rd. 

Stop 22 
XXN 9-8936 

SNACK BARS 

HI. Fo lks : I ' m now at CHRIS ' S N A C K 
BAR, 222 S T A T E . opposite Albanr 'e 
Cnpitol Park (downsti i ivs), Mrvinff tbe 
beat homeniado pies .'mil paiulwiches y o « 
ever ta£ted. A?neB. Xoinierly Capitol C» I -
teria. 

H O U S E F O R S A L E 

Elsmere — $18,900; 3 bedrooms. 
Cape Cod, l'/2 baths. Full dining 
room and garage. Immediate 
possession and exclusive listing. 
LUCY RICE, Real Estate and 
Insurance. Delmar, 9043. 

MEN'S SHOES 
MANUFACTURERS' SHOE OUT-
LET. Nationally advertised men'a 
shoes at cut prices. 25 S. Pearl St. 
(Near Beaver) Albany. 

Home of Tested Used Cars 

ARMORY GARAGE 
DESOTO - PLYMOUTH 
926 Central Avenue 

Albany. N. Y. 

ARCO 
CIVIL SERVICE BOOKS 

and all tests 
PLAZA BOOK SHOP 

380 Broadway 
Albany. N. Y. 

Moil & Phone Orders Filled 

Readers have their say In The 
LEADER'S Comment column. Send 
letters to Editor. The LEADER. 
97 Duane Street. New York 7, N.Y. 

When in Lake George 
Visit 

Julie's Delicatessen 
Where Friends Meet 

To Eat. 

50 STOCKS WITH 
50-YEAR DIVIDEND RECORDS 

• YIELDS UP TO 7.8% e 9 SELLING UMDER » 0 
WE hava compiltd thU FREE tl it of SO stocks that hav* 

fill Out nU Coupon 

SUTRO BROS. & CO. 
Member N. Y, Stock Exchange and oiher principal eichanqei 

J. ERWIN HYNEY. M&R. Pk. 5 4546 
17 ELK STREET. A L I A N Y 

Nam* ...„....„....„ 
A d d r e n 
City State . 



Rent Collector Among State Tests Now Open 
Exams for positions of rent col-

Ucter In NYC and the State will 
alose Sept. 16. 

The salary range Is $3,360 to 
14,280. 

Requirements for the position 
are (1) three years' experience as 
a building inspector or other work 
requiring knowledge of building 
maintenance, rental practices and 
housing conditions, or conducting 
field Investigations or Inspections 
and preparing reports; and (2) 
have a high school graduation or 
two years of business ichool or 
Jour more years' experience or the 
•^uivalent combination. 

Op«n-CompetItire 
Candidates must be U.S. citizens 

and residents of New York State, 
Mnless otherwise indicated. 

The following State open-com-
petitive exams are now open for 
receipt of applications. Appiy to 
•Sices of the State Civil Service 
Department until the dates indi-
•ated at the end of each notice. 

Candidates must be C. S. citi-
•ens wid residents of New York 
State, unless otherwise indicated. 

2102. ASSISTANT HYDRAULIC 
ENGINEER, $5,360 to $6,640; two 
vacancies In NYC. Requirements: 
•even years' engineering training 
•r experience. Pee $5. (Friday Sep-
tember 16). 

2104. ASSISTANT DIRECTOR 
FOR CUNICAL RESEARCH, 
$10,470 to $12,510; one vacancy in 
Albany. Open to all qualified U.S. 
citizens. Requirements: (1) State 
license to practice medicine; (2) 
medical school graduation and 
completion of internship; (3) two 
years' experience In clinical and 
laboratory research. Including su-
pervision; and (4) either (a) three 
more years' experience in clinical 
and lab research, or (b) three years 
of clincial or lab training beyond 
the M. D., or (c) equivalent. Eee 
$5. (Friday, September 16). 

2105. SENIOR MEDICAL, BAC-
TERIOLOGIST ( V I R O L O G Y ) , 
$7,300 to $8,890; one vacancy In 
Albany. Open to all qualified U.S. 
citizens and non-citizens. Require-
ments: (1) medical school gradua-
tion and completion of internship; 
and (2) two years In medical bac-
teriology, Including one year In 
project planning and developmen-
tal research In virology. Fee $5. 
(Friday, September 16). 

2106. ASSOCIATE PUBLIC 
HEALTH DENTIST, $7,690 to 
$9,340; one vacancy In Albany. 
Open to all qualified U.S. citizens. 
Requirements: (1) State license to 

Where to Apply for Public Jobs 
O. 8.—Second Regional Office, O. 8. Civil Service Commission 

841 Washington Street. New York 14, N. Y. (Manhattan). Hou/s 8:3C 
to 5, Monday through Friday; closed Saturday. Tel. WAtkins 4-1000 
Applications also obtainable at post offices except the New York, N. Y. 
post office. 

STATE—Room 2301 at 270 Broadway. New York 7, N. Y.. Tel 
BArclay 7-1618: lobby of State Office Bulldlns, and 39 Columbia 
Street. Albany, N. Y., Room 212. SUte Office Building, Buffalo 2. N. Y. 
Hours 8'30 to 5. exceptinp Saturdays. 9 to 12. Also. Room 400 at 1S9 
West Main Street, Rochester, N. T.. Tuesdays, f to 5. All of foregoing 
applies also to exams for county Jobs. 

NYC—NYC Department of Personnel, »6 Duane Street, New York 
1. N. Y. (Manhattan) two blocks north of City Hall, ]ust west o) 
Broadway, opposite the LEADER office. Hours 9 to 4. excepting Sat-
urday, 9 to 12. Tel. COrtlandt 7-8880. Any mail Intended for the 
NYC Department of Personnel, should be addressed to 299 Broadway. 
New York 7. N. Y. 

NYC Education (Teaching Jobs Only)— Board of Examiners, 
Board of Education, 110 Livingston Street, Brooklyn 1, N. Y. Hours 
9 to 4:30. except Saturdays and Sundays. Tel. ULster S-1000. 

NYC Travel Directions 
3apld transit Unes for reaching the U. 8.. State and NYC CITD 

Service Commission offices in NYC follow: 
State Civil Service Commission, NYC Civil Service Commission— 

IND trains A. C, D, AA or CX; to Chambers Street: IRT Lexington 
Avenue line to Brooklyn Bridge; BMT Fourth Avenue k>cal on 
Brighton local to City HalL 

D. 8. Civil Service Commission—IRT Seventh Avenue local to 
Christopher Street station. 

Dava on Applications by Mall 
Both the U. S. and the State Issue application blanks and receive 

flUed-out forms by mall. In applying by mail for U. S. Jobs do not 
enclose return oostage. If applying for State Jobs, enclose 6-cenl 
stamped, self-addressed 9-inch or larger envelope. Both the U.S. and 
the State accept applications If postmarked not later than the closing 
date. Because of curtailed collections, NYC residents should actually 
do their mailing no later than S:30 P.M. to obtain a postmark ol 
that date. 

NYC does not Issue blanks by mall or receive them by mall except 
for nationwide tests and for professional, scientific end administrative 
jobs, and then only when the exam notice so states. 

I ^ e O. S. charges no application fees. The State and the local 
Civil Service Commissions charge fees at rates fixed by law. 
V ^ > 

practice dentistry; and (2) either 
(a) four years' experience In prac-
tice of dentistry, including three 
years with public health depart-
ment, or (b) postgraduate course 
in public health, and two years in 
practice of dentistry, including one 
year with public health depart-
ment, or (c) equivalent combina-
tion. Fee $5. (Friday, September 16). 

2107. VETERINARIAN (SMALL 
ANIMALS), $5,090 to $6,320; one 
vacancy at Rosweil Park Memorial 
Institute. Open to all qualified U.S. 
citizens. Requirements: (1) State 
license to practice veterinary medi-
cine; (2) graduation from school 
of veterinary medicine; (3) one 
year in practice of veterinary medi-
cine with emphasis on small ex-
periemntal animals. Fee $5. (Fri-
day, September 16). 

2108. SUPEIEVISING PHYSICAL 
THERAPIST (PUBLIC HEALTH), 
$4,350 to $5,460; one two vacancies 

In Health Department. Open to all 
qualified U.S. citizens: Require-
ments: (1) State license to prac-
tice physical therapy; (2) bache-
lor's degree with Instruction in 
physical therapy; and (3) two 
years' physical therapy experience 
under supervision. Including one 
year with public health agency. 
Fee $4. (Friday, September 16). 

2109. SENIOR TELEPHONE EN-
GINEER, $6,590 to $8,070; one va-
cancy expected in Albany. Require-
ment: (1) four years' experience 
in construction, maintenance, op-
eration or inspection of telephone 
plants, including two years in su-
pervisory capacity; and (2) either 
(a) bachelor's degree in mechani-
cal or electrical engineering, in 
physics or industrial engineering, 
plus one more year's experiecne, or 
(b) master's degree in above spe-
cialties, or (c) two-year college 
course in above specialties, plus 
three years' additional experience. 

or (d) equivalent combination. Pee 
$5. (Friday, September 16). 

2110. ASSISTANT TELEPHONE 
ENGINEER. $5,360 to $6,640; one 
vacancy each at Albany and Ro-
chester. Requirements: (1) two 
years in construction, mainten-
ance, operation or Inspection of 
telephone plants; and (2) same as 
in Exam No. 2109, above. Fee $5. 
(Friday, September 16). 

2111. ASSISTANT TAX VALUA-
TION ENGINEER, $5,360 to $6,640; 
two vacancies in Albany. Require-
ments: (1) high school graduation; 
and (2) one year's experience in 
public utility, municipal or indus-
trial valuation work; and (3) either 
(a) two more years' experience 
and bachelor's degree in engineer-
ing, or (b) one more year's ex-
perience and master's degree in en-
gineering, or (c) six more years' 
experience, or (d) equivalent com-
bination. Fee $5. (Friday, Septem-
ber 16). 

2112. SENIOR TELEPHONE IN-
SPECTOR, $4,130 to $5,200; one 
vacancy each in NYC and Buffalo. 
Requirements: (1) high school 
graduation; (2) one year's ex-
perience in telephone plant con-
struction, maintenance or opera-
tion; and (3) either (a) bachelor s 
degree in engineering, or (b) four 
more years' experience, or (c) equi-
valent combination. Pee $4. (Fri-
day, September 16). 

2113. ASSISTANT DIRECTOR 
OF PRISON INDUSTRIES (TEX-
TILES), $8,090 to $9,800; one va-
cancy in Albany. Requirements: (1) 
eight years' experience in textile 
manufacturing, including five years 
in supervisory or administrative 
capacity; and (2) either (a) col-
lege graduation with specialization 
In industrial engineering or textile 
manufacturing; or (b) two more 
years' experience, or (c) equivalent 
combination. Fee $5. (Friday, Sept-
ember 16). 

2114. INDUSTRIAL SUPERIN-
TENDENT, $6,940 to $8,470; one 
vacancy at Auburn Prison and one 
at Sing Sing. Requirements: (1) 
high school graduation; (2) three 
years of supervisory work in fac-
tory manufacturing cotton or wool-
en textiles, textile knit good.s, sheet 
metal products, or shoes; and (3) 
either (a) bachelor's degree in in-
dustrial engineering, industrial 
management, production manage-
ment or related field, or (b) bache-
lor's degree in busine.ss adminis-
tration, with six credit hours in 
production management, plu.s addi-
tion year's experience, or (c) two 
more years' experience, or (d) equi-
valent combination. Fee $5. (Fri-
day, September 16). 

2115. ASSISTANT INDUSTRIAL 
SUPERINTENDENT, $5,940 to $7,-
320; one vacancy each at Clinton 
Prison, Sing Sing,- Green Haven, 
Institution for Male Defective De-
linquents at Napanoch and West-
field State Farm. Requirements: 
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same as Exam No. 2114, above, ex-
cept that there must be two years' 
supervisory experience In factory 
manufacturing cotton or woolen 
textiles, textile knit good.<5, sheet 
metal products, shoes, v ooden fur-
niture, or sewn goods. Pec $5. (Fri-
day, September 16). 

2116. FOOD SERVICE MANA-
GER, $4,350 to $5,460; one vacancy 
In Hudson River State Hospital, 
Poughkeepsie. Requirements: <1) 
three years' supervising large-
scale cooking in large instiut-
tlon.s; and (2) either <a) four 
year.s' experience in larpe-sc«le 
cooking, high school graduation 
and cook's training course in-
cluding dietetics; or (b) two years 
of such experience and two-year 
technical school cour.se in food 
preparation, or (c) bachelor's de-
gree with specialization in hotel 
management, ho.spltal administra-
tion or related fields, or (d) equi-
valent combination. Fee $4. (Fri-
day, September 16). 

2117. SENIOR EXAMINER OF 
METHODS AND PROCEDURES. 
$5,090 to $6,320; one vacancy with 
Thruway Authority in Albany. Re-
quirements; (1) four years' busi-
ness or professional experience, in-
cluding either (a ) two years in 
devising, installing and testing me-
thods and procedures for large-
scale operations, or (b) three years' 
experience in supervisory capacity 
involving devising, installing and 
testing methods and procedures in 
office management practice; and 
(2) either (a) four more years' 
experience, or (b) bachelor's de-
gree, or (c) equivalent combina-
tion. Pee $5. (Friday, September 16) . 

2118. PURCHASE SPECIFICA-
TIONS WRITER, $4,350 to $5,460;! 
one vacancy in Thruway Authority 
in Albany. Requirements: <1) two 
years' experience preparing pur-
chase specifications for large pub-
lic or private agency; and «2) 
either (a ) four years' office or busi-
ness experience, or (b) bachelor's 
degree, or (c) equivalent combina-
tion. Fee $4. (Friday, September 16). 

2122. PROOFREADER. $2,450 to 
$3,190; one vacancy In Albany. 
Requirements: one year of ofiBce 
experience including proofreading. 
Fee $2. (Friday, September 16). 

2119. JUNIOR T A X EXAM-
INER, $3,360 to $4,280; 50 vacan-
cies in Albany, 40 in NYC, and 
several each at Buffalo, Roches-
ter, Syracuse and Utica. Require-
ments: either (a) high sciiool 
graduation and tliree years' ac-
counting, bookkeeping or account-
clerical experience, including one 
year of responsibility for proper 
recording of financial transac-
tions; or (b) two-year bu.siness 
school course with bookkeeping or 
accounting, and one year's experi-
ence; or (c) college graduation 
and one year's experience: or (d) 
equivalent combination. Fee $3. 
(Friday, September 16). 

2120 TAX COLLECTOR. J3,360 
to $4,280; 12 vacancies in NYC, 
three in Rochester, five in Syra-
cuse, one in Utica. Requirements: 
either (a) four years' experience 
in collection, investigation, book-
keeping, or legal-clerical work, in-
cluding one year collecting ac-
counts; or (b) high school gradua-
tion and two years' experience; or 
(c) bachelor's degree and one 
year's experience; or (d) bache-
lor's degree with specialization in 
accounting, law, or business ad-
ministration; or (e) equivalent. 
Fee $3. (Friday, September 16). 

COUNTY AND VILLAGE 
Optsn-Competitive 

Candidates must be residents of 
the locality mentioned, except 
where otherwise hidicated. Apply 
to oifices of the State Civil Service 
Department, unless another ad-
dress is given. Last day to apply 
at end of each notice. 

2519. PROBATION OFFICER, 
Bronx County Court, $4,500 to 
$5,800. (Friday, September 30>. 

2520. PROBATION OFFICER. 
Kings County Court, $4,500 to 
$7,100. (Friday, September 30). 

2521. PROBATION OFFICER, 
New York County Court of General 
Sessions, $4,500 to $7,000. (Friday, 
September 30). 

2522. PROBATION OIH-ICER, 
Queens County Court, $4,150 to 
$6,250. (Friday, September 30). 

2523. PROBATION OFFUXR, 
Richmond County Court, $4,000 to 
$5,700. (Friday, September 30). 

94. SENIOR LABORATORY 
TECHNICIAN, Genesee County, 
$3,300 to $3,675. Open to all quali-
fied New York State residents. Ap-
ply to Genesee County Civil Serv-
ice Commission, 83 Main Slitet, 
Batavia, N. Y. (Thursday, Novem-
ber 3), 
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MENTAL HYGIENE MEMO 
MHEA is Not Resting on Laurels 

THE MENTAL HYGIENE Employees Association, which this year 
celebrates its fiftieth anniversary, is justifiably proud of its accom-
pllAhments at the institutional and departmental levels. Its calm, 
clear presentation of the facts, in conferences with hospital adminis-
trators and Albany "brass," has earned MHEA a strong berth as 
•pokesman for the mental hospital employee. Nor is the group resting 
•n its laurels. Its current membership drive is keyed toward a united 
front in the campaign to win a true 40-hour work week for institu-
tional aides, with no loss in present take-home pay. 

'Everyone Has Problems' 
"Everyone Has Problems" is the theme of the Mental Hygiene 

Department's exhibit at the State Fair. 
Some common emotional problems are being portrayed by Mother, 

Dad, Junior and Big Sister, members of a new cartoon family spe-
cially created for the department by Joe Muslal of "Blondie" fame. 
Visitors have an opportunity to peep through a five foot picture 
window and observe the family's ditticulties. 

"The gist of the message," said Commissioner Paul H. Hoch, "is 
that when emotional problems get too big for you, you can take them 
to a psychiatrist or a mental hygiene clinic." 

Another feature of the exhibit is a life-size tableau of a clinic 
Bcene, in wliich "talking" mannikins explain what is going on. The 
scene represents a play therapy session with Junior as the central 
character. 

Cost of Mental I Illness Runs High 
The care of the mentally ill is the largest expense in the State's 

proposed budget, now more than $150,000,000. Governor Harriman 
revealed at a meeting of newspaper editors last week. The expendi-
turs grow steadily, he noted, because the population of mental hy-
giene institutions has been increasing at the rate of 3,000 persons 
a year. 

TWO FKOM N.Y. STATE 
WASHINGTON, Sept. 6—Twen-

ty-three Federal employees will 
participate in the seventh annual 
Junior management intern pro-
gram that begins on Monday, Sep-
tember 12. 

PIC KED FOK U.S. COURSE 
Two are from New York State— 

Ruth P. Carroll, of Tuckahoe, an 
employee of the U.S. Department 
of Labor, and George T. Schultz 
of Buffalo, who works for the De-
partment of the Navy. 

Shoppers Service Guide 

Specialists 
Bog Down 

(Continued from Pa^e 7) 

tlve vacuum. But In the case of 
social work, this deficiency is a 
matter of philosophy and prin-
ciple. 

"Those administrative relations 
summed up in concepts of line and 
staff, authority and responsibility, 
hierarchy and span of control — 
which we have drawn largely from 
military experience — are utterly 
foreign to, and incompatible with, 
the extreme concepts of primitive 
democracy which are often taken 
as given in the philosophy of so-
cial work. 

Too Much Talk 
"This has far-reaching results 

and implications, both for social 
work and for administration. 
There is, for example, an incipient 
tendency for our social services — 
public and private — to bog down 
in a welter of committees, consul-
tative groups, lengthy discussions; 
and the ideal of indirect leader-
ship in its extreme form is easily 
transformed in practice into rule 
by an obstructive minority. 

"To be sure, many straight-line 
agencies would clearly benefit from 
a larp;er infusion of democratic 
procedures and practices; but a few 
straight lines and some recogni-
zable centers of decision are also 
required in social service agencies. 
They are frequently difficult to 
find and are least likely to be pro-
vided by persons whose only train-
ing and experience is in social 
work. 

" I have welcomed New York Uni-
versity's action here in bringing 
together in a single school, public 
administration and social work. 
The fusion of such disparate sys-
tems of ideas can only serve to 
benefit both. Those who have thus 
been doubly exposed can, I think, 
make a special contribution and 
find special opportunities in wel-
fare administration." 

Under the executive order issued 
recently by Governor Harriman, es-
tablishing a new grievance machin-
ery for State employees, it is the 
responsibility of the head of each 
State department and agency to 
establish formal grievance proce-
dures for use in his agency. The 
procedures thus established are 
subject to approval by the Griev-
ance Board. 

FEDERAL EXAMS OPEN 
IN METROPOLITAN AREA 

M o r i n g and Storagm 

I/>ADS. pai-t loadf all ovei USA «Deciall» 
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pers, eto. VirliKilly any wall ooverinKS, 
any quantity at a fraction of the liMt 
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• & L WALLPAPER CO. 
r m \vr. I , ror. K. 8(ll B'kira 

4 Kitchen Chairs 
Reuphoistered $15 

Free pU-kiip Si delivery 

Mof! Haven Upholstery 
387 E. 140 St. MO 5-81 08 
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F o r Civil Service Exams 
WE r iBLIVKR TO THE EXAM ROOM 

All IVIakes — Easy T e r m s 
MIMEOGP.\Ptl « . ADDINO MACni.NKS 
I .NTrUNATION \I. TY I ' KW l i l TK I i CO. 

240 E. H6tli St ^ ' - O p o n till 0 .30 n m. 

HELP WANTED 

ISM Tab Operator 
.t I'M to I:.'t0 .\M 

Mitiiititiin 1 year ex|ierienee 
Alexanders Dept. Store 
Or:fciti) t'oiu'dlirse, Bronx, 5th Fl. 

IBM Kep Punch Oper 
P » l timt* oi part time eveiiiiimi 
ItJiri* exti-a iiioili'.v In siuire iini® 

Alexanders Dept. Store 
» t Cirittitl I'oni'oiirse, Bronx, Ath 

BLUE KITCHEN 
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Omm M.in. - I'ri. 7 a.m. to 6;.10 

tE 2-6548 
Delivery 
Serv ice 

SODA FOUNTAIN 
Comfortably Air Conditioned 

Kalorie Kounter Menu 
115 WORTH STREET 

Cor. Lafayette & Worth St. 

HI. I.I' If 4I\TLD 

WOMEN; Earn part-time money 
mt Uonie, addressing envelopes 
(typing or longhand) lor advertis-
er.s. Mail $1 for Instruction Man-
ual telling bow. (Money-bacis: 
guarantee) Sterling. Dept. 707, 
Great Neck, N. Y. 

MIMEOGRAPHING 
E s ( « l l e llitnor, 128 State St., Al-
bany, N. Y. 5-2451 days. 2-2tjai. 

eves. 

Typewriters 
Adding Machines 
Addressing Machines 
Mimeographs 

Cuiiruiitoecl, AIho RLMitilts, K i im in 
ALL LANGUAGES 
TYPEWRITER CO. 

• 19 W. S3r(l ST., NICH VOKK U , N . l 
Cllrlsra 3 808ti 

State Issues 
Four Rosters 

ALB.-VNY, Sept 5 — There are 
19 names on four open-competi-
tive eligible lists announced re-
cently by the State Civil Service 
Department. The rosters and 
number of ellgibles: 

Assistant librarian (medicine), 
5. 

A.ssociate scientist (paleontol. 
ogy>, 2. 

Gas meter tester. 5.' 
Senior building construction en-

gineer, 7. 

tenuis SNACK BAR. S'l'! State, opposit* 
C;iI)[tol Park. Albany. Hoiucniaile pjca A 
Haii.lvi j. lies. 0'M>::i<l. 
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Application forms for the follow-
ing U.S. Jobs in the metropolitan 
area may be obtained from the 
Second U.S. Civil Service Regional 
Office, 641 Washington Street. 
New York 14, N.Y. . or at the 
address indicated. Pilled-out forms 
should be sent to the appropriate 
address. Last day to apply, if any, 
is given. 

2-195 (54). ENGINEER, $5,440 
to $7,570 a year. Openings in the 
following fields: aeronautical; aer-
onautical research, development 
and design; architectural; elec-
tronics: fire prevention; general; 
hydraulic: industrial; internal 
combustion power plant research, 
development and design; safety; 
structural. Jobs throughout New 
York and New Jersey. Require-
ments: completion of four-year 
professional engineering curricu-
lum or four years' engineering ex-
perience plus to 3% years' en-
gineering experience. Send Forms 
57 and 5001-ABC to Second U.S. 
Civil Service Regional Office, 641 
Washington Street, New York 14, 
N. Y. (Last day to apply, Thurs-
day. September 8. New exam for 
engineer, all options and grades, 
with different requirements, will be 
announced soon.) 

2-71-1. DENTAL HYGIENIST. 
$3,415 a year. Jobs at VA Hospital, 
Northport, L. I. Requirements: 
registration as dental or oral hy-
gienist, plus one-year cour.se at 
school of dental hygiene and one 
year's experience, or two years' 
experience. Minimum age, 18 years. 
Send Forms 57 and 5001-ABC to 
Board of U.S. Civil Service Exam-
iners, VA Hospital, Northport, L. L. 
N .Y . (No closing date). 

2-71-1. MEDICAL X - R A T 
TECHNICIAN, $3,415. Jobs at VA 
Hospital, Northport, L. I. Require-
ments: one and one half years' 
experience in operating, super-
vising or instructing in operation 
of x-ray equipment in medical 
capacity, plus six months' general 
experience. Education may be sub-

Ordnance Jobs 
Offered by Navy 

A test for ordnance technician, 
with a starting salary of $4,970, has 
been announced to fill positions at 
Naval installations in New York 
and New Jersey. Most of the jobs 
are in the Naval base at Camden. 
N. J. 

To qualify, applicants must have 
three years' experience in ordnance 
and fire control instruments, plus 
one and a half to two years' spe-
cialized experience in inspectional 
work or a related Job. 

Application forms and further 
details may be obtained from the 
executive secretary, U.S. Civil Ser-
vice Examiners, N. Y. Naval Ship-
yard, Brooklyn 1. Applications must 
be returned there not later than 
Sept. 12. 

stltuted for experience. Send Fo rma 
57. and 5001-ABC to Board of U.S. 
Civil Service Examiners, VA Hos-
pital. Northport, U L. N . Y . (N« 
closing date). 

2-52. STENOGRAPHER, $2,96* 
to $3,415, and TYPIST, $2,690 t « 
$3,175. Jobs In NYC. Require-
ments: eligibility In written exam 
plus appropriate education or ex-
perience for $3,175 and $3,415 jobs. 
Minimum age, 17 years. Send 
Form 500-AB to Second U.S. Civil 
Service Regional Office, 641 Wash-
ington Street. New York 4, N . Y , 
(No closing date). 

2-196. TABULATING MACHINE 
OPERATOR. CARD PUNCH OP-
ERATOR, $2,960 to $3,175. Jobs in 
NYC. Requirements: written te.st. 
plus three to six months' experi-
ence. Send Form 5000-AB to Sec-
ond U.S. Civil Service Regional 
Office, 641 Washington Street, 
New York 14, N .Y . (No closing 
date). 

2-71-4. K ITCHEN HELPER, $2.-
600. Jobs at VA Hospital. North-
port. L. I. Restricted by law t « 
persons entitled to veteran prefer-
ence. Others may apply, but will 
receive job offers only if veterans 
are not available. No experience 
required, but applicants must b« 
able to read and write Englislu 
Males preferred. Send Forms 60 
and 5001-ABC to Board of U .a 
Civil Service Examiners, VA Hos-
pital, Northport. U L, N .Y . ( N « 
closing date). 

2-71-3. HOSPITAL ATTEND-
ANT (MENTAL) , $2,960. Jobs at 
VA Hospital, Northport. U L 
Restricted by law to persons en-
titled to veteran preference. Others 
may apply but will receive joli 
offers only if veterans are not avail-
able. Ne experience requirements, 
but applicants must be able tm 
read and write English. Minimum 
age, 18 years. Males preferred. 
Send Forms 60 and 5001-Afec t « 
Board of U.S. Civil Service Exam-
iners, VA Hospital, Northport, L. L , 
N .Y . (No closing date). 

2-71-2. LAUNDRY HELPEIk 
$2,600. Jobs at VA Hospital, North-
port, U I. Requirements: thre« 
months' experience in performanc® 
or supervision of laundry opera-
tions, such as marking, checking, 
folding and sorting. Minimum age, 
18 years. Send Forms 5001-ABC 
and 57 to Board of U.S. Civil Serv-
ice Examiners, VA Hospital, 
Northport, N. Y. (No closing date). 

MP-

The Port of 
New York 
Authority 

has o p e n i n q i f o r 

POLICE 
OFFICERS 

f o r b r i dge s , tunnels, 

termina l s , a i r po r t s . 

SALARY 

$4,108 to $5,018 
40 Hour Week Rotati i i i Shilt. 
Liberal beneflta. ineliulinir hoaltk 
aiid life inBur.in(?e. Year R*-
tin^Dient. 
Flish Si'baot CraiUiuti's. ace 31-
'̂ U: riaioa SO/'jO witliout e j * -
Klaaaea: tniuinuim height » • » " , 
aiiaimam wciffht 116 Iba. 

Aipply ia Persoa 

PORT AUTHORITY 
BUILOIMG 
OOOM 1577 

111 Rtk Art. (at l.'ith St.) H. T. 
Applicatiooa oiAsa T i i oJar . Snptembtr M 
thru Saturday. Sapteiiilxr 17. WeekdaTi 
• M l « T P H . , S.atunl.ay( • A M. to 
S P 11 

Nev St'nttrr acaldeiita may anply lai 
I'-itk thr« Sent. lAth at 

NEW JEHSKY 
KMPl iOYMENT SKKVICr* 

I M WaxhinKtuB St., Newark. H I . 
Mob thni l<-ri 0 A.M. to 4 P M. 

STATE NEEDS PATROLMEN 
Apply until Friday, September 

30 for the following State jobs: 
2130. INSTITUTION PATROt.-

MAN AND BUILDING GUARD, 
$2,720 to $3,520: 11 vacancies for 
institution patrolman. No experi-
ence requirements. Fee $2. (Friday, 
September 30). 

HELP WANTED MALE 

Part-time collectors. Apply in per-
son between 2 p 7 p.m., Pridaj, 
Sept. 9. 

Solo Sales Co. 
114 E. 110 St . NYC 

REAL ESTATE 
BROOKLYN 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

I B R O O K L Y N ' S 
I BEST BUYS 

DIRECT FROM OWNERS 
ALL VACANT 

* LINCOLN PL—3 family. $16.-
*500. 

I l I E R K I M E R ST. (Nostraod)—; i 
* 3 andTbasement. $17,000. 

^PULASKI ST. (Marcy) — 10] 
J^rooms. Cash required $8(ML 

I PARK PL. — 8 family, boz; 
rooms. Cash required $2 ,8 (M. 

* SULLAVAN PL. (Rogers) — S' i 
Xstory, semi-detached, garage. 
•Modern. Bar. Porch $19,500. 
|MONROE ST.—1 family, seml-
Xdetached. Garage. Price $11,000. 
|Cash $600. 
:|c Manj 9PBCIAL9 aTallal>ta to M . 
* DONT WAIT ACT TO DAT 

I C U M M I N S R E A L T Y 
* Ask for Leonard Cummlna 

. . MafUoota i SL 

% PR. 4-6611 
I 4: Ol>n< Sundari I I to « 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * » < m * » 

We Have A Selected Group 
OF FINE 1. 2. 4 FAMILY 

AND APT. HOUSES FOR SALE 
AT SACRIFICE PRICE ! ! ! 

I N V E S T I G A T E A T O N C E 11 
PHONV NOWt 

HERMAN ROBINS. INC. 
GLENMORE 5-4600 
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REAL ESTATE 
HOUSES - HOMES — PROPERTIES 

THE BEST OIFT OF ALL — YOUR OWN HOME 

L O N G I S L A N D L O N G I S L A N D L O N G I S L A N D L O N G I S L A N D 

INTER-RACIAL 
Beautiful WESTBURY 
5 Gorgeous Models 

NEW! NEW! NEW! 
Xot attiK^hcd — Not Seml-Altactacd — 
But Coniiyictelj Detached On Beautiful 
Lnrire Lantl<)oaped Plote — For Compl-ie 
Home Happinees I Ist Section All Sold — 

A Dare to Oompare I 
t o w DOWN P O YME NT FOB A l i 

• tart inr At the Fabulously Low Pricen of 
Sll.OOO to $13,000 or Custom Built to 

Suit Tour Taste 1 
A l l Completefy Dctached on I juTe Land-
•cnpe<l I'lota — Various Deeirni — Split 
I<evclB — Center Hall Cape Coda with 
Dormcre — 3 Bedroom Banche* — 2 and 
Z Bndroom Bungalows — Al l Exquisitely 
DesiRned "A l l L,ar{;e Rooms" Al l Hare 
Ful l Poured Concrete Banementl — Most 
Ba r e Larre Expansion Attics — Room 
WOT Al l — Colored Tiled Baths — Some 
with Vanitoriiims — Varied Exteriors — 
•cientif lc Kitchen — Ultra Modern to the 
Last Detail — Choice of Colors — Not A 
Development — But Gorgeous Individual 
•tylinir — Over 300 Homes to Be Built in 
This Beautiful Tree Lined Neiehborhood 
— Near Schools, Churche*. Shopping, 
Iransporlation and Every Other Poesible 
Convenience I 
Please Act (Jtllckly—Select Choice Loca-

tions Now I 

GREGG REALTY 
814 PROSPECT AVENUE 
(corner SHERMAN ST.) 

New Cassel, Westbnry 
M . 7-<l(>0<i KD ^1790 

OI 'KN 7 DAY.S — • to O 
Inrludinc I.AIIOK D A Y 

MODELS ARE ON BROADWAY 
NEW CASSEL, WESTBURY 

DIRF.CTIONS: Old Country Road to Ur-
ban Avenue, Turn North to Broadway, 
Mew Cased, Westbury. 
O R : Northern State Parkway to where 
•iem «nys Jones Bcach. Go in that direc-
tion of Jones Beach S i ^ and the Tery 
>ext siim will read "Union Ave. and 
Brushholluw Road." Leave the parkway 
fcere and gn alone Brushhollow Road to 
First St., turn left on First St. to Omce 
• r Broadw.iy. 

OR: Take Long Tskind Railroad to West-
bury Station and call Office for Free Auto 
Bcrvice from station. 

GOOD HOMES 
HOLLIS 

BRICK 
2 Kitchens 

Beautiful modern 1 family. All 
rooms spacious. Hollywood tile 
jath; oak floors; modern kit-
chen Includes refrigerator. All 
,̂his plus extra kitchen and cozy 

finished basement with 1 room 
extra bath and private en-
trance. Garage; oil heat. 

$15,000 

ST. A L B A N S $11,990 
C O L O N I A L 

DETACHED 
7 ROOM 
4 BEDROOM 
l'/2 BATHS 
OVERLOOKS 
DELIGHTFUL GARDEN 

• REAL BUY 

Terms Or Course 
M A N T GOOD BUYS 

Jamaica St. Albans, So. Oione r » r k 

CALL JA 6-0250 

n » Goodwill Roaify Co. 
WM. RICH 

Ue. Broker Real Batata 
IW-13 Naw York Blvd., Jamaica. H.T 

G. I.'s SMALL GASH 
St Albuis $11,500 
1 family • room detached home, 
modern tile kitchen and bath semi-
flnished banement, oil heat, rara^e, 
loads ot extras. Small cash. 

Springfield 
Gardens |14,90« 
Don't B i M Ihls loToly S-room 
borne, lesturtnc • bedrooms, oU 
beat, l ane plot 50x100 on a beau-
Uful t n e Uacd atreei. Sxtraa. 

Uollis 919,500 
A (orceoua I lamily atueoo con-
aistinr t t 1 Ave ruom apartment 
and one tbrea ruom apartment, oil 
heat, llnlahed baoement, larse plot, 
* ear la iaoe. Both apartments T » -
eaot an Utla. Loatlii extras. 

MANY • T U K K 8 TO CUOOSB f l lOk l 

MALCOLM BROKERAGE 
106-57 New York Blvd. 

Jamaica 5. N. Y. 
BE. 9-U645 — JA. 3-3716 

AUGUST SPECIALS 
NO CASH FOR VETS 

S P R I N G F I E L D G A R D E N S 
2 family Insul brick; semi 
attached; 6 and 4; two mod-
em kitchens A baths; oil 
beat; newly decorated 20x100 

Pr ice $9,500 

H O L L I S 
7 room Cape Cod; 3V4 years 
old; knotty pine patio; oU 
heat; 1 car garage; plot 50x 
100. G. L $800 down. 

Pr ice $10,999 

ST. A L B A N S 
2 family brick; 5 and 5; fin-
ished knotty pine basement 
with a playroom; modern 
baths and kitchens; oil heat; 
2 car garage. 
Pr ice $12,800 

ST. A L B A N S 
Addisleigh ParTc; 7 room 
3tucco with sun porch & 
Reading room, 3 baths, 1 
with stall shower; finished 
knotty pine basement with 
bar, kitchen and shower; oil 
heat; 1 car garage; beautiful 
barbecue on lawn. 
Pr ice $14,500 

LOWEST CASH DOWN FOR CIVILIANS 

WE SPECIALIZE IN G. L A F.H.A. MORTGAGES 

ARTHUR WATTS, Jr 
112-52 175 Place. St. Albans 

JA 6-8269 
S A.M. to 7 P.M. — SUN. 11-6 P.M. 

CONSOLIDATE 

ALL 

YOUR DEBTS 

We Can 

Refinance 

Your Mortgages 

CALL 

CENTRAL BROOKLYN 
ESTATE 

962 Halsey St. 

Brooklyn 

G L 5-4600 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 
B A I S L E Y P A R K $12,990 

INTER RACIAL 
Completely modern, finest neigh-
borhood. nr. transportation. Is this 
up-to-date home of 7 rooms, stall 
shower, extra lavatory, garage, 
large plot, garden patio. Open for 
Inspection. 

H O L L I S $11,500 
6 lovely modem rooms, IVi bath 
garage. 40x100 plot, oil, with many 
extras. Nr. transportation. 

ST. A L B A N S $10,509 
Beautiful 2 bedroom bouse, 35 x 
100, automatic heat, finished base, 
ment, garage. Real Buy. 

LOW G.L & FHA 
DOWN PAYMENTS 

Other 1 A Z famUy homea 
Priced from $8,000 up 

Stores With Apts. — Bargains 
Business & Residential lots from $1,000 - $12,000 

LEE ROY SMITH 
U2-11 Linden SlTd.. St. Albans 

LA 5-0033 JA 6-4592 
H t * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * -

HOUSE FOR SALK 2 Bedroom 
Ranch with Tile Bath, Delmar, 
N. Y , for $18,500. Beautiful Kit-
chen with Dining Area. Living 
Room 14 X 22". Dry cellar. At-
tached Garage. Immediate pos-
session. LUCY RICE, Delmar, N. Y. 
9-043. Real E^ilate & Inamnfic^ 

BUILD hoHses OR your| 

9OWR plot, or on onr plot—(J 

$To your own plans, or to^ 

^our plans. 

INDEPENDENT 
;BUILDERS, Inc. 

33-21 Junction Blvd. 

Jackson Heights, L L 

HI 6-3672 — H A 6-1151 

INTER-RACIAL 
CERMAC HOMES 

(Balsley Park) 
by 

FRANK M A C E 
{ Order your new home now 

for FALL occupancy — G.I. 
and FHA Mortgages — Talk 
to the builder direct. Come 
to see me Saturdays and 
Sundays from 11 a.m. to 8 
p.m. 160th Street and 131st 
Avenue., Baisley Park, L. L 
or phone LA 5-9327 Days —. 
Eve. VI 8-4221 for personal 
appointment. 

Over 100 homes built In 
Baisley Park community 

to date. 

ST. A L B A N S E S T A T E S $10,990 

6 Years Brick and Shingle 
DETACHED RANCH BUNGALOW 

This hoMif Ifi for the buyer v l i o likes all of hU rnom<« on one ffonr—U'li •T 
true rancli hnnpTHlow fit.vlr, nrrhitertiire. Fully dchtchtHl on • 4,000 hi|. f t pro-
fefiNionally inmlNonppfi plot, only (i years old. Al l rooms are ernsn ventn»U«l 
And e«>r|)ectnlly larse. A b<>nutiriilly flniHiieil banement, YoiinKs(oun kitrhen 
from HoiiKe Heaiitifiil, nuiHHive living; room-dining room, croHH Tenlilafed airy 
bedrnomn; riinlnr room, be<lroom. & living room ful ly covered wilh wall-wall 
llaoleiim. Front & rear patios. All extras. 

QUEENS HOME SALES 
l M - < 5 HII.I.»<II)E A V K . JAMAIC.V 

ASK FOR MR. r . U l M E R 
RK ft-ino* 

• W e Lead the Field! 

• 

• 
• 
• 

Baisley Park $7,900 

Cash $200 G. I. 
Tiiis Is A Honey! 
8un dicnched roome. oil steam 

heat, raragf^, nioUfrn hollywood 
kitt.'hcn & tile bath — near shop-
ping. schools tc tranfcportation. In 
exoellont desirable A-1 repi<l»'nlial 
aroa. Boiler hurry. This can t la«t I 
Aelc ior No. 

Jomaico Pork $10.500 

G. I Cash $210 
Fully Detached! 

1 Family 
C f\ni rooms. 3 bcarooms, OTt-r-
•ized garage, ful l b:ifiement. steara 
heat. rfHiuofd for quick 
$05.40 monthly pays all — AbIi 
lor 418-B. 

Richmond Hill $9,900 
C a s h $200 G . I. 
Bungalow 4̂ 2 Rms. 

Beautiful home, wich linif^hf^ 
baHomejit. Includop. oil str.-ain iieat, 
modern glamour liitflu-n bath, 
near evopythinff. A-1 dosiral)le n-i*l-
dential area, witli many essentiul 
extras included, S and S. vini-fiao 
bliiidH, etc. Don't mif^e seeing (iiis 
one. First comc firwt buy 1 HtMlt-r 
bring depoHit. This is a real sac-
rifloe. Owner loicod to leave town. 
B-439. 

St. A lbans $11,900 
G I. $250 

Detached—1 fiiniily BoiBcons fl^i 
rooms, parage. .'1.000 6m. It. J^ot, 
BUn drenched bedroojii, modem 
kitchen, tile balh. all enKintial ex-
tr.-w inchided. Near cver j i l i ine. 
B 4:13. 

e - s - s - e - x 
143-01 Hillside Ave. 

i 
i 
i 
i 
A 

\ 
i < 
i 
\ 

JAMAICA. L. L 
Call for Detail Driving Directions - Open Every Day 

7-790P 

B R O O K L Y N 

FURNISHED APTS . 
White - Coiorea. l and 3 room 
apts., beautifully furnished, kitch-
enettes, bathrooms, elevators. Kis-
met Arms Apartments, 57 Herki-
mer St., between Bedford and Nos-
trand, near 8th Ave. and Brighton 
iiues. 

EXCLUSIVE HOMES in NASSAU&pUEENS 
M O R T G A G E S A R R A N G E D FOR GI 'S & C I V I L I A N S 

BARGAINS AND RESALES 
so. OZONE PARK ON LINDEN BLVD.—5 lois, C f l n A A 
100x100; resitiential area, near school. Price ^ • f g U W 

ST. ALBANS: Detached 8 large room home on a 50x100 plot; 
semi-iinished basement; oil steam heat; Z car g a - f r l O ^ A A 
rage; excellent value. Price * I A g O W 

HOLLIS: Beautiful brand new 2 family Custom Built Brick and 
Shingle. Two 5-room ultra-modern apts., lovely ^ ^ ^ A f M l 
neighborhood. Price 

A L L E N & E D W A R D S 
Prompt Personal Service — Open Sundays and Eveningf 

OLympia 8-2014 - 8-2015 
Lois J. Allen Licensed Real Estate Andrew Edwards 

168-18 Liberty Ave. Brokers Jamaica. N. Y. 

ST. ALBANS 8,990 3 Old 
2-FAMILY BRICK COMB. 

Situated on large plot in nice residential section. Both 
room apts. vacant. No closing fees. 

Live Rent Free — Move Right In 
Take over large G.I. 4% Mtge 

MANY OTHER GOOD BUYS IN 1 & 2 FAMILY HOMES 

TOWN REALTY 
L86-11 Merrick Blvd. SpringHeld Gardens, L. I. 

LAurelton 7-2500 — 2501 

i : 

S E C U R E Y O U R FUTURE 

O W N Y O U R O W N H O M E 

Questions answered on civil ser-
vice. Address Editor. The LEADER, 
97 Duane Street. New York 7, N.Y. 

Unfurnished Apt.. Bklyn. 

Readers have their say In The 
LEADER'S Comment column. Send 
letters to Editor, The LEADER. 
97 Duane Street, New York 7, N.Y. 

Guard or watchman. Landlord of fere m 
Brooklyn A - l loralion choice U larg® 
rooniB, corner apartment, oil l i-alrd. bUii-
able for couple H»'ni f n e in fx.hunfc'c ior 
parl-Unie lacrvioc. Itux No. 81 4 .M. l.««Mlt4r 

S T O P P A Y I N G RENT! 
O W N Y O U R O W N H O M E ! ! 

For an analysis of civil service 
problems in the forefront of the 
news, rfad H. J. Bernard's weekly 
column, "Looking Inside." See 
I 'At i* ! 2 . 
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U. S. GOVT. 
POSITIONS 
NOW OPEN 
(Continued from Pag^e 4) 

munications; or 400 hours of solo 
flying time. Send appHcationa to 
Address 27. 

CARTOORAPHER, $3,410 to $5,-
940.5—Jobs are in Missouri. Re-
quirements: Bachelor's degree In 
cartography, engineering, mathe-
matics, or physics, or 4 to 5 years 
ol equivalent experience. Age Um-

l ,K( iAI , N O T K K 

if li' 
adii 

who 

li< 

CITATION The People of the 9t»l» of 
Kkw York. Ky the Oraee of God, Free 
Kiul Iiidependint To Allorney General of 
ths Stale of Now York: ISABELLA MY-
ERS ANTHONV. I ' AUL ANTHONY awl 
" J O H N " ANTHONY, the name "JOHN" 
bcini lictUious. the true first name Ocin* 

ns, and if dead, their e*-
strators, distribuleeo and 
names and Poet Office 

aknown and cannoi after 
i>c asccrtainiyi bT Um pe-

M A R Y LASSIO; The 

of kin of EUQENB AM-
own as EUGENE A. AN-

cd, whose name* and Port 
ai'c unknown and cannot 

inquiry i>e ascertained b j 
iicrciii. beinff the pereone 
distriljutees. creditor* or 

le eslatp of EUGENE AN-
kiiown as EUGENE A. AN-
Kii. wiio at the time hie 
resident of I I B W<«t IZtk 

•k. N. Y. 
Send GUKI;T1X(I : 

Upon tiie pclilion of The Public Adniinl-
alralor of the Coiuity of New York. haT-
inc his olhrr at Hail of Uccordg, Boom 
309. Boroiisli of Manh.-Hlan. City and 
County ot Ni w Vorlt. :i8 administrator ol 
the Boo(is. e l ia l l iU and erediU of eald 
4cocaso<J; 

\ou and each of you are hereby cited 
tm show ca\ise ix-fore the Surrogate's 
Court ot N( w Vei l; Coniily. held at the 

unknow 
•cutors, 
•ssiirns 
a.tdrc95( 
diliSTKnt 
titioner 
Salvation Army; 

And the next 
T H O N Y also kT! 
THONY . deceaw 
Office addresses 
after diligent i 
the petitio 
lntcre.sted 
otherwise in tl 
T I IONY, at 
T H O N Y del 
death was 
Street. New V 

Hall of Uo< ords. ilooin 500. in the County 
»t New York, on the 20th day of Sei>-
tcniber llifj.-). at hiiltpast ten o'clock in 
the forenoon of tlial day. why the account 
at procoedinss of The Public Administra-
tor of the Cuiihiy of New York, a* ad-
•iinistrator o! the soode, ehattele and 
credits of siiid dicea-ed. should not be 
judicially sedled. ami -why the lum of 
$1'J7.00 should not be expended for the 
•uonument and iiiscription on decedent'! 
»ravc. 

In Testimony Whereof. We liaTe caueed 
the seal of the SurroBate's Court of the 
•aid County ot New Yorli to be hereunto 
aAlied. 

Witness. Honorable OEORGS 
Flt .VNlvENTHAI.EB a Surro-
ea(e ot our said County, at 
the County of New York, the 
2(>!h clay of July in the year 
of cur Lord one thoueand nine 
hiimiied and f i fty-f ive. 

U A I . I ' lU l . l i ' A. DONAHUE 
Clerk ot the Surrogate'* CooK. 

A i a 9pe<-i:U Ti 
Court ot tl 
of New Yi.r!:. 
Chambers Strict 
hatton. City of 
day of Allsn^.t. 
Sanford H. Coli 
ot the Appllcal 
T I N C'OUl)i:i( 

Part n ef tiM City 
l i l y ol New York, County 

at the Courthouse. 62 
I t ill the ItiiroUKh of Man-
il Sew York, on the a4th 
.1. l!ir>.''i. I 'KEiiENT, HON. 

11. Jublice. In the Matter 
;in of U A P A E L V A L E N 
(i.r leave to chaiiM his 

lame to I'VUl-O VAI .KNTIN CORDERO 
On reiuiiMK ami lllina- the petition of 
R A F A K L VA I .KNT IN C01U>EH0. verj f led 
til* 15th il;i 
for a oh:ili!; 
it UMnir rc,|: 
asHiime the 
COIlDKllO ii 
prodcnt 11.1111 
an allidavii 
DBIU). liiM 
chaut'o anil 
the pel j l ion 
from aajii petit J 
•alislied llial tin 
joction to the 
and it furllicr 
caul w;ifl liorn 
lU lB at I'uert 
• f hia birth i-
• f l-uerto l l i 
hereto alt 

ot All 
111 mill 

t. 1055, I»rayin« 
3f the petitioner, 

-led (hat ho bo permitted to 
lame ot PAHI.O V A L E N T I N 

the plaeo and stead of bis 
. and on reading and niiof 
f I lLANCA GONZAI,EZ COli 
wife, consenting to sach 

lir court beimr satisfied that 
is true and it appearing 

I the court ti/ing 
no re.isonabie ob-

i-liaiigo ot name proposed, 
appeal iiii; that said appU-
on the '.JOth day of Jiioe, 

I Uico. and the eortiflcate 
iilcd iiy the Commonwealth 
o which bears No. 474 

il, NOW, on motion of 
BRODERICIv. CAT.WAY & VACCARO. at-
torneys for said petitioner, { t ia OR-
DERED. that I IAKAEL V A L E N T I N COR-
DERO. born OH June 'JOth. 1016 in I>uor-
t « Rico as more fully appears by tho 
birtk ccrtiliciie No. 474 issued br the 

lAierto Rleo, hereto 
r lierehy is authqrized 
e PAULO V A L E N T I N 
after October S. l t ) M 
Id of hia prcsnnt name 
ilh the provisions sif 
Civil Rights Law and 
l.v, that this order be 

ComnionwiMllli 
attached, be a 
to assume the 
OORDERO on 

the place ai 
• P O B e o m i i i l j i i 
Article V I of tl 
•f thla ord 

ot 
1 he 

liiid 
I ste 

•ntered and the sai.l petition upon which 
U is granted he ni.d wiliun ten days from 
the date herein in tlie Ollice of the CTerti 
•f this Court :ihat witliin twenty days 
troM the U.nc of eiilry thei-cof a copy of 
this order shall be punished in the CItU 
Berrii-e l>>adcr. a lii wspiiper published In 
the County ot New York, Slate of New 
Tork. that within forty days after the 
making ot thi'. order proof of such pub-
lication by alliiLivit shall bo filed with 
UM Clerk ot this Court, n i a t following 
UM due liliii; of the said lietition and 
entry of said onlcr as hereinbefore dl 
rsctsd. the publication of sitid order and 
Uw aiing ot priKit of puhlicalion thereof 
mm and after the ;)rd day of Octobor, 106ft, 
the petllioner, RAKAKL VALENTIN COB-
BHKO shall luiown aa and by the 
•ame PAHLO VAI.ICNTIN CORDERO, 
which ha is hereby authorized to aosunie, 
WHl by no oilier n:ime. and It is further 
• a O E R K D that a certilicd eopy of this 
• n b r shall not be issued until proof of 
•MDpUauee with the abovo provisions 
k w n been duly nied with the Clurk of 
M OmiK a J.CJ3, 

Mi for $S.4N lata: I t to M 
itppUcations t « Address l i . 

CARTOGKAPmC AID, $S.»56 
to |5.060.-^olM art In Missouri. 
Requirements: At least 15 montbs 
ot subprofessional experience 
such as englneerins, drafting, 
mapping, or use of chart or aerial 
photographs. Including at least 3 
months' experience as cartograph-
ic aid or draftsman or pertinent 
aeronautical experience. Appro-
priate education may be substi-
tuted. Send applications to Ad-
dress l i . 

CHEMIST, $4,035 to $4,580.— 
Jobs are in Delaware, Pennsyl-
vania, Maryland, and Virginia. Re-
quirements : Appropriate education 
and /or experience. Age limits for 
$4,035 jobs: 18 to 35. Send appU-
cations to Address 3. 

DENTAL HYGIENIST, $2,950 
and $3,175.—Jobs are in Missouri, 
Iowa, Minnesota, Nebraska, Kan-
sas, North Dakota, South Dakota. 
Requirements: Registration as a 
dental hygienist plus completion 
of at least a one-year course in 
dental hygiene or 1 to 2 years of 
experience. Send applications to 
Address 9. 

DRAJPTSMAN, $2,200 to $5,0«0. 
—Jobs are in States mentioned 
below. Plequirements: Pertinent 
experience and/or education. 
Sample of work, 8x10 inche*. 
For jobs in places and at salaries 
shown, send applications as Indi-
cated below: Wash., Oreg., Idaho 
Mont, (option: engineering—$3,-
175 to $3,795): Address 11. Md., 
Va., D. C. (option: engineering, 
$2,500 to $4,205): Address 29. 
Calif, (options: structural, civil, 
aeronautical, architectural, ship 
construction, engineering — me-
chanical. electrical, $3,410 to $4,-
205): Address 4. Mo. (option: car-
tographic. $2,950 to $4,205): Ad-
dress 14. 17 Western states (car-
tographic and engineering—civil 
and general, $3,410): Address 24. 
Ohio (option: general, $3,410 and 
$3.795): Address 8. 

ELECTRONIC SCIENTIST, 
035 to $10,800.—Jobs are In 

$4,-
the 

States named below. Require-
ments: Appropriate education 
and/or experience. Age limits for 
$4,035 jobs: 18 to 35. 

For jobs in place and salaries 
shown, send applications as Indi-
cated below: Conn. ($4,035 to $9,-
600): Address 18; Del., Pa., Md., 
Va. ($4,580 to $10,800): Address 
32: N. Mex. ($4,035 and $4,580): 
Address 25; N. Y., N. J. ($4,035 
and $4,580): Address 2; Ariz. ($4,-
580 to $10,800): Address 23; Mast. 
($5,940 to $9,600): Address 20. 

ENGINEER (ALL BRANCHES), 
$4,035 to $5,950.—Jobs are In the 
States mentioned below. Require-
ments: Appropriate college educa-
tion and/or technical experience. 
In addition, for jobs paying $4,580 
and above, professional engineer-
ing experience. Age limits for $4,-
035 Jobs: 18 to 35. 

Send applications as indicated 
below: N. Y.. N. J. ($4,035 and $4.-
580): Addre.'ss 2; Ohio, Ind., K.v., 
W. Va. ($4,850 to $5,940): Ad-
dresses 15 and 31. 

For engineering Jobs ta special-
ized fields, in locations and at 
salaries chown, send appUeationa 
as indicated in list below: 

Aeronautical Engineer: Pa. ($5,-
060 to $7,040): Address 16; $5.-
060 and $5,940): Address 33; DeU, 
Pa. Md., Va. ($4,035 and $4,580): 
Addre.-ss 3; New England States 
($5,060 and $5,940): Address 20; 
Calif. ($5,060): Address 12; Utah 
($5,060): Address 10. 

Ammiuiition Design Engineer: 
HI. ($4,580 to $7,040): Address 7. 

Architectural Engineer: Calif. 
($4,035): Address 12; New Eng-
land States ($5.0«0 to $S,940>: 
Address 19. 

Automotive Engineer: Mich. 
($5,060 and $6,940): Address 28; 
Md. ($5,060 and $5,940): Address 
32. 

Civil En«:ineer: Oreg., Wash.. 
Idaho, Mont ($4,035 and $4,580): 
Address 11. 

Oreg., Idaho, Wash., Calif., Ner. 
(civil engineer and agricultural 
engineer. $4,036 and $4,580): Ad-
dress 34; m., Mich, Wis. ($4,-
$35 to $5,940): Address 7: Del., 
Pa., Md.. Va ($4,035 and $4,580): 
Address 3; 17 Western States ($4,-
035 and $4,580): Address 24; Pa. 
($5,060 to $7,040): Address 16; 
($5,060 and $5,940): Address 37; 
8. C. ($4,035): Address 22; New 
England States ($5,060 to $7,040): 
Address 19; ($4,035 and $4,580): 
Address 1; Calif. ($4,035): Address 
12; ($4,035 to $5,940): Address 
36: Tex., Okla., La., Ark. ($4.-
035): Address •. 

Coostruetioa .Engineer:, TW _ 
Mich., Wis. ($4,035 to $5,940): 
Address 7; Kans., Mo., N. Dak.. 
S. Dak.. Nebr., Iowa, Minn. ($4,-
035 and $4,580): Address » ; Del., 
Pa., Md.. Va. ($4,035 and $4,580): 
Address 3; New England States 
($S.0«0 to $6Jh»i: Addrea 1»; 

Employee Ideas 
Triple in 2 Months 
Awards are Given 

A 900 percent incretise In sugges-
tkxu received from employees dur-
ing the last two months has been 
announced by A Hurlbut, acting 
manager of the N, Y. Regional 
Office of the Veterans Administra-
tion. 

Attributing the rise to the policy 
of having supervisors assist em-
ployees iB presentation of their 
ideas. Mr. Hurlbut awarded prizes 
to 12 employees. 

Outstanding among the Ideas 
was one from Leonard Feldman, 
Adjtidication Division. Prevention 
of overpayments of pension and 
compensation was the theme. 

C âsh and cerlificates of appre-
ciatiOD also went to Frederick BL 
Neun, NeU P. Vuolo and Thomas 
L. Woods, Loan Ouaranty Division; 
Pletra Dentlce and Michael U 
Meyer, Administrative Division; 
Andrew J. Reilly and Nathan M. 
Zootbarit. VR & E Division; Mar-
Tla C. Chaiken, Contract Division; 
Albert A. Friedlan, Adjudication 
DlTlslon; Frank Kllpper, Legal 
DlTlaloB and Charles P. Meschetto. 
Plnanee Division. 

($4,036 and $4,580): Address 1; 
Pa. ($6,060 and $5,940): Address 
31. 

Kleetrieal Engineer: Greg.. 
Wash.. Idaho. Mont. ($5,060): 
Address 11; Pa. ($5,060 to $7,-
040): Addresses 16 and 26; ($5,-
060 and $5,940): Addresses 33 and 
37; DL. Mich., Wis. ($4,035 to $5,-
940): Address 7; Mo., Kans., 
Iowa. Minn., Nebr., N. Dak., S. 
Dak. ($4,035 to $5,940): Address 
9; Calif. ($4,035 and $4,580): 
AddrefBe 4 and 12; Del., Pa., Md., 
Va. ($4,035 and $4,580): Address 
3; S. a ($4,035 and $4,580): Ad-
dress 23; New England State* 
($4,038 to $5,940): Address 1. 

Etoeironics Engineer: C^alif. ($4,-
036 to $5,060): Address 4; ($8.-
360): Address 12; Conn. ($4,036 
to $9,600): Address 18; HL, Mich., 
Wis (electronics and radio, $4,036 
to $6,000); Address 7; Pa. ($5,-
0«0 to $7,040): Address 10; ($6,-
060 and $5,940): Addresses 26, 
33. and 37; N. Y.. N. J. ($5,000 
to $7,040): Address 2; Mo.. Kans., 
Iowa, Minn., Nebr., N. Dak.. S. 
Dak ($4,036 to $5,940): Address 
9; N. Mez. ($4,035 and $4,580>: 
Address 35; Greg., Wash.. Mont. 
($4,036 to $5,060): Address 11; 
Va. ($6,000 to $7,040): Address 
13; DeL, Pa., Md., Va. ($4,035 and 
$4,580): Address 3; B. C. ($4,036 
and $4,580): Address 22; Tex.. 
Okla., La., Ark. ($4,035 to $5,060): 
Address •; Ariz. ($4,580 to $10.-
800): Address 23. 

General Engineer: Va. ($7,040 
to $10,800): Addres 13; Pa. ($6,-
000 to $7,040): Address 16. 

Indirtrial EngUieer: Calif. ($4,-
036 to $5,940): Address 12; Pa. 
($5,000): Address 26; ($5,060 to 
$7,040): Address 16; ($5,060 and 
$5>t0): Address 37; Tex., Okla., 
L»., A r t ($4,035): Address 8; 
3. C. ($4,035): Address 22; Utah 
($8,000): Address 10. 

Markie Engmeer: New England 
StotM ($4,035 and $4,580): Ad-
drees 1; N. Y.. N. J. ($5,060 to $7,-
040): Address!; Calif. ($4,035 to 
$5 .0 « » : Address 4; Del., Pa., Md., 
Va. ($4,035 and $4,580): Address 
S. 

Meehanieal Engineer: N. Mez. 
($4,036 and $4,580): Address 25; 
Oreg.. Wash., Idaho, Mont. ($4,-
036 to $6,060): Address 11; Kans . 
Mo.. Iowa, Minn., Nebr., N. Dak., 
8. Dak. ($4,035 to $5,940): Ad-
dress • ; Hi.. Mich., Wis. ($4,036 
to $7,040): Addresses 7, 28; New 
Rngland States ($4,035 to $5,940): 
Address 1; Pa. ($5,060): Address 
30; ($6,000 and $5.940): Addresses 
37. 33, 36. 13, ($5,060 to $7,040): 
Address 16; Calif. ($4,036 to $4,-
580): Addresses 4 and 12; ($5.-
000): Address 12; Del., Pa., Md., 
Va. ($4,035 and $4,580): Address 
3; B. C. ($4,035 and $4,580): Ad-
dress M ; Va. ($5,060 and $5,940): 
Address 13; Utah ($5,060): Ad-
drees 10; Tex., Okla., La.. Ark. 
($4,038): Address 8. 

OrdMknoe Engineer: Va. ($6.-
000 to $6,360): Address 13; Md. 
($S.0M and $5,940): Address 32; 
CaUf. ($4,035): Address 13; Pa. 
($6,000 and $8,940): Address 2«. 

Sons Engineer: New England 
States ($5,060 to 7,040): Addre « 
10. 

StMetanU Engineer: Pa. ($•,-
0 « to $7.040): Address 16. 

(C*»UiMie4 * • Pa«s 

A M M T A N T SI'K.riM, DK.ri'TT C U R K , 
( iKAI IR n 

<rrMB.). County Court, Queens County 
1. Wiala«» . Edward. Ma«peth . . . . B4'JffO 
t. Sacks, Harold, Lsiureltoa . . . . 92030 
S. Caray. John J., Holli<i B0020 
4. Mnrvby. Thomas J. Forest His 88090 

Brady, Janiess P.. JnclisoQ Hrt 88420 
Po rM , r i l i x , Ridsewood 85920 
Vetrano, Robert M.. Whitcstons 82820 
Hays. William H.. Jamaica . . . 80060 
Scnlly, Joseph B.. .hicUxon Hrt 79680 

OOCRT n . K K K . f i lt.MH! O 
1.), County Court, K Inn Conaty 

»94:!0 
ooiino 
90590 
86.130 
B5780 
SS210 
92110 
91100 
90190 
891 RO 
87780 

COUNTY AND VILLAGE Promotion 

1. Shapiro. IrvinB. BlU.v-n 
» . Charkln. Fpl ir i im. Ttlilyn 
3. Beleb. Morris P.. Blilyn . 

.4 Denisch, Leon, Blilyn . . 
5. Poww. William H,. Bklyn 
S. Carpenter. Harold. BUlya 
7. Sohmer. Julius. Bltlyo. . 
8. Kaye. Martin. nl<bn . . . . 
» . OroM. Isidore R.. Bl^l.yn . 

10. Redden. William J.. Bklyn 
11. •orrtek. Albert C.. Bklyn 

DOCrMKNT CLFRK 
< r r » . ) . County t l e r V i OOlM. 

Krie Connty 
1. Milt. Mario A..' BulTnlo 8&060 
t . Ranehe. Marraret C.. BulTala . . 80920 
a. McSnane. Mary A., Burr.'Uo . . . 789.10 
4. BSanrahan. Mary A.. BpfTalo . . 70030 

• W M J C A T I N O U N I T SUPKRVISOR 
( f i l l . ) , Bnreaa of Purchase and Sa|>%lr. 

Westrhpst<-r County 
1. a m i . Herbert O.. Mt. Vernoa . 8S60C 

• L U C T R I C I A N FORKMAN 
<ri'SM >. Department of Publie W s i t m , 

WMtehf-itrr County 
1. eMI, Arthur C.. White Fins . . SSSOO 

INTF.RMFDIATK Cf.RRK 
(Pron.), Wnitrhester County 

I . Akraluun. T. A., While Pins .. 8S8M 
« . Camoo, Tolanda M.. Ilastinrs . 81980 
5. Amory, Dorothy L., Peekskill . 77BS0 

WTERMK.DIATK F ILK CIJIRK 
(Prom.), Westchester County 

I. Bowman. Marsaret E.. Elmsford 8 « 8 < » 
». CalabroK. Phyllis, White Pins 79200 

I N T K R M K n i A T R S T K N O C R A P H K * 
(Prom.), Westchester Connty 

1. H e l » l » , Edna M., Yonkers . . 88«e« 
» . De « r a i l v Marion. Thornwood 87320 
S. Kossi. L«onarda, White Pins . 87100 
4. Shestsel. Alice. Ossininir 80410 
*. Marehant. Cleo J.. N. Koehelle 8BR90 
•. Koeher. Carolyn. Pt. Che.ster . 85080 
7. StlUman. Helena S.. Elmsford 86140 
5. Haller. Louise L.. Pelham Mnr 83410 
t . Dahlka. Elizabeth. OasininK . 82650 

l e . Reifley. Leola A.. White Pins . 80670 
I I . Winiams. Ros.alie. Pt. Cheater 79300 

I N T F R M K n i A T E T Y P I S T 
(Prera.), Westrhester Connty 

1. FmneDe. Aneela K.. Whit Plna 87 t «0 
t . Koehsr, Carolyn. Pt. Cheater . 86<M0 
» . Carina, Irene N.. Pt. Chester . 88810 
4, Orvlt, Mildred W., Mt. Vernon 86910 
i . Bowman. Margraret E.. Elmsfd 86800 
5. Stafllfro, M. E.. Dobbs Ferry . 84680 
T. Howell. Lois J., Ossininr . . . . 84070 
S. Anrel, Mario J.. Dobbs Frry . 84000 
S. Topplns. Dorothy M.. Wht Pins 8.^0R0 

l e . Roett. Kvelyn C.. Elmaford . . 83790 
11. l M > a > . Elizabeth. Purchase . 8.1870 
IS. Hoarm. Elizabctr, Ossinin? . . . 82980 
IS. Abmt, Dorothy I.., Peekskfll 82410 
14. Abraham. P. A.. While Plna . 82290 
1*. Mloraa. Arnea C., N. RoeheD* 82030 
15. Mottl, Uabel L.. Harrison . . . 88000 
17. Hedloy. L eoU A.. White Pins . 81910 
IS . Pols. Elizabeth H., Mt. Yemon 81400 
»•. Washbnme. Lois B.. Whit Plna 80710 
Se. Searinc. Katherine. N. Rochello 78380 
S I . Sehmelter, Carol E.. Mt. Kise* 77*10 

mrr .RMEDI .AT I ! T Y P I S T 
(rssM.). Wntchester Joint Water 
1. Riddeka. Marie T., MamnronoA 81000 

SENIOR CLKRK 
(rram.), Westchester Connty 

1. Bamsa. Estelle M., Pt. Chester 
t. CotieK. - Robert L., M.imaroneck 
*. LaTlB. Mancarct O.. Thomwd 
4. BalbK. Frances T , Yonkers . 
5. Jecksoe. Joseph N., Mamarnck 
S. Toitpim. Dorothy M., Wht I I m 
T. Chrl»toi«ier, M. B.. Yonkers . . 
S. Prloa, Nancy L.. White P l M . 
t . Moora. Smbre C.. Yonkers . . . 

10. MeOnlra. Caroline. Whits Plna 
I L Amede*. Carmela M., Wht Pins 
IS. Brown. Sally A.. White Pins . 
IS, Tsahan. Elizabeth. Piirehase . 
14. To»elsan*. Mabel U , Wlit Phis 
15. ^hnson. Meirae T.. Mt. Vmoa 
IS. Rorks, Jane M.. Yonkers . . . 
IT. KIBv, Ameata P , Mt. Ycrsoa 

eooM 
89920 
88930 
84610 
83900 
83840 
83410 
82910 
828^ 
82790 
82270 
ssseo 
81820 
81380 
81230 
80820 
7»S00 

SKNIOR KNCINEKKINO A I » 
>. Department of Pnblls Wasfta. 

Westchester County 
Harry R.. Mt. Kiseo . . . . 70070 
SENIOR FI I .E C U W K 

( r r om . ) . eWstcheater Com 
1. TlcUante. Edna B., Oseininr . 80630 
S. M u s o o . Meirae T.. Mt. Teraoa 8.3360 
S. A M d e o . Carmela M.. Wilt P i m KSeiO 

STNIOR L I U K A R I A N I 
(P rom. ) , Rrie Connty 

i . Isaas. Winifred M.. BaSalo . . . 84T«0 
a. UndBtrom. Ida r . . Buffalo . . 70S«0 

SENIOR X -RAT TF:cnNICIAI f 
( V M M . ) , Rdw«rd 4. Ut 

pital. Erie Ooanty 
1. BMiaarardner. H. C., Tonawaada 80190 
S. B«rk . Marraret P., Budalo . . . . 7 m n 

ASSOCIATF. IN INDUSTRIA I . 
FDUCATION 

1. BmsI. Alexander 0., Roohestw T8SS0 
ASSOCIATE I J D R A R I A N 

1. Sksvousa. Henry O . OrfBn. seSlO 
S. T l w i l s U , Dorothy, Rochester . S6S80 
S, F w v a m . A., Dearbm. Mlek. 84180 
4. Lm . Marrarei I.. Bklyn 81800 
5. Spaar. Jack B.. Albany 81800 
s. BrasB, Mary P.. Buffalo 80010 
T. EMUcer, Edward M . Watertowa 7S290 
S. Pkimga. Eleanor. N. Hartford . 77400 

ASMM'IATB P l IBMC HKAI .TH 
PHT8 IC IAN ( P K D I A T R I 0 8 ) 

1- e . Crosby, SUnrerlnd 

STATE 
Open-Competitive 

S M W O A T E RBtUi:.\KCB AJ«A1,' 
( P U B U O FINANCE) 

I . Skwkar. WlUlam A., MeKo 
S. SiCTtwa, Harold J.. Albany . . 
S. PalUak. Har«ld. riushinr . . . 
4. AofclM. SoroUky D., Albamy 
5. Vkoiaaoa. Joan M , Albany . . 

Mwit, Abralwna. Far B o c k « r 
BOIUCR INSrSCTOE 

1. ^ r a a , Henrr F., Syracnao . . 
a. E n a , 0., Dannemor* . . 
S. SiyasMi. Jans* H.. Bron* . . . 
4. H u t t e . DatTld C., FlitshlB* 
» . O 'Cowur, Frauds J., lluOato 
« . E M S . O l M C.. AluwiS . . . 

•4000 
80480 
88«40 
07010 
8B7S0 

WS840 
S1170 
7BM0 

•400* 

T. liMHiirS. S d w a n Omrw* , . 
EKIDOE B E P A I E FOREMAN 

1. Seout, Staadrlck A., Syri 
9. Shepard, Ellswartk. Watsri* 

CASE WOKKRR, J1TNIOR 
('A.SE WORKER 

1. Macmillan. Paul I., BoSaW 
2. Smith. Dorothy P., Oranrill* 
.1. Hubbard. Betty L., Kenmara 
4. Moch. Cynthia R., Nia«ara F l 
5. Oenser, Seymour, Bklym . 
S. Johnson, Thad. Buffalo . . . . 
7. Woodman. Mariarat, Bincmla 
8. Rosenberi. P. R.̂  Ithaca . . . 
9. Zlnraro. Janet J.. Walton , , 

10. Sawatzkie. M. L.. B. Syracuae 
11. Hmith. Barbara J., Salamaues 
12. Facelson, Rosalie. Bklyn . . . . 
13. Qraekin. Herman. Portion Rd 
14. MscDonaM, Alice D.. Jameata 
16. KHIouk. Mar»ei-y H.. Adm Ctr 
18. Eddy, Elizabeth C., B. Syrctia 
17. Sherman, Alice W.. Coopersta 
18. Carey, Jean M., Tappan . , . . 
19. Evia, Helen M., Bath 
21. Asbury, Ev\ W., Buff.llo . . . 

20. Connelly. John 9., Bklvn . . . . 
22. Punicelio. Frank D., Schtdy . 
23. Frey, Morris, Bklyn 
24. Crane. J. T.. IVys 
36. Oravlin. Lili ie A., Locust Y l r 
26. Orsor. Marifrances, Woodslck 
27. Daly. Miirkaret M., Pelham . 
28. Anderson. Kuth C.. John.sn Cy 
29. Schimmel. Janet H.. Wht Pna 
30. Cohu. Rosalyn B.. PeekaktU . 
31. Christcnaen, O. C.. Eden . . . 
32. Driacoll, Edward C., Buffala . 
33. Barkley. Hugrh E.. Bronx . . 
.14. Suter. Mary E.. White Pins . 
35. Nicholas, Paul J., Manhasset 
38. Reed. Tinka R., White Pins . 
37. Conine, Nancy E., S. Glens F l 
38. Carriero, Nicholas, Butfala . . 
39. Horowit i . Irwin, Bronx . . . . 
40. Bibber. EHizabeth. Schtdy . . 
41. Dalton. Mary S., Floral Pk . . 
42. Daly, Helen O., Ithaca 
43. Silverstein, O. B , Bronxrlls . 
44. Davideon. Mclyin. Buffalo . . 
46. Manicy. Adele W., White P I * 
48. Alex, Robert J., NYC 
47. Dyer, Audrey L., Schtdy . . . . 
48. O Connell, AprU W., Hempst4 
49. Mohr, Anne I., Depew 
50. Spratt. Kalherine, Troy 
61. Chapman. Thomas B., Albany 
62. Rosten. Bernice E., Syriw;uao 
63. Cutrona. Madonna M., Bufflo 
64. Sitomer. Roberta M., Syracue 
55. Runiplik, Dolores T., E. Islip 
58. Moraa. Arleno P., Buffalo . . 
67. Roaa. Herbert E.. Warrensbri 
68. Lindbcry, Haymond, Jaiiicstn 
69. Shapiro, Judith V., Whit Plna 
00. Brady, M. Margaret, Auburn 
81. Toland, Jean V.. Cairo 
62. Eadie. Dorothy, Lockport . . . 
63. Leddy. Elizabeth H.. Bronx . 
64. Srmmona. Allison L , Bklyn . 
66. Lowery, Mary H., Utiea . . . . 
86. Hain. Elizabeth Tt.. IsUp . . . 
67. Kurr. Uuth M., Marietta . . . 
68. Cordes. Henry M., Buffalo . 
69. Miraslia, Frank V.. Pt. Chstr 
70. Newbchaffcr. Ja^k, Lcvittwn 
71. Grahanie, Joanne C., Pketpsie 
73. Anister, Miriam S., Whit Pins 
73. Kata. Jaue C.. Glen Cove . . . 
74. Buchholz, Henry D.. Lackwna 
75. CoUier, Nuucy LiverlAjol . 
76. James. William, Pt Chester . 
77. Taub, Pauline O., Johnstown 
76. Leder, Uana H., Wantath . . 
79. A r j y , Uuth P „ Niaeara Fl . 
80. Clyue, Aune 3.. Manlius . . . 
81.' Marouey, illancho O., Olean ., 
8a. Marotta. Uuth H , Lockport 
Sy.Oaiza. Ph.vllis D , ParU Stata 
IM. Smith. Howard H., Kssex . . . 
85. Bernstein. Justin, Bronx . . . 
86. Oaffney, Jaue M., lYoy 
87. BrowntM, Marttaret, AmstnlH 
88. Aociulli , Dominick. Utica . . . 
89. Carr. Richard K., Auburn . . 
90. Harri. Bertha M.. Yonkers . . 
81. Guinu, JO!,epb, Ueer Park . . 
8a. Panaro, Ancelo J^ Middletwa 
93. Hcarn. Barbara J., Hempstead 
94. Owen*. James J., Troy 
96. McHuch, AUc* M., Trumnsbc 
88. Smith, Harriot H.. Beadnr UU 
1*7. Pllasterur. Martluk Schtdy . . 
» « . Keele. Helen M , BuUalo . . 
98. Moora, William Bnghmtoa 

100. Thorn, Barbara Whit Pins 
101. Mctiee. Gtnevievs S.. Potsdm 
lua . Burr. Douiflas WUUamsvl 
lOa. Hoherts, Sally U , Newhurvk 
lO l . Cist, U-lailyi U., U t . Vuruou . 
106. Jacobs. Vern D « Troy 
1U6. Uolcomb. liernioa M., Mmira 
107. GregK. Aencs B., Queens Vic 
lOS. Murden, Norma IL, N. Uartld 
1U8. Tervo, Kaartn A _ Uifton , . 
110. Macbol i . Kenneth W , Buflalo 
111. ScUiffhauer, J. A . Buffalo . . 
lift. AroazowBiii. JoMiph. Schtdy . 
l i s . Fisher, U>\m A.. Bklyn 
114. Cackeuur, Uoburt M., Schtdy 
115. Woodley, GriiUUi, Middletown 
116. Dupont, Joan M , Manhaiuiet 
117. Kaiaur, Dorothy C.. Niacra VI 
118. TiUuna, Moe, Bklyn 
118. McCoy, Uaflton W , Oweeo . . 
l a o . SuUivao. Thci'CMk Johnau Cty 
l a l . Kelly, Kathryn J., VViliiuuiavl 
l aa . I'ioriUo, James D, Schtdy . . 
I M . Clincli. Dorothy L, Watertwa 
124. Kreuaer, Edward A.. Bullala 

Nortun, Dorothy S., Uatavia . 
Joyce S.. Hi 

•esoe 
•407* 
•407S 
M 8 W 
• S 8 9 « 
•snse 
•2690 
•2690 
•3690 
•S690 
• 1860 
91860 
•1860 
•1850 
• l a s o 
• 1860 
• 1860 
• 1850 
•1110 
• 1870 
•1110 
09030 
90370 
903T0 
90370 
90370 
90370 
90370 
•0370 
8D370 
•0370 
•OlPO 
8!)ri30 
89630 
89(::>0 
89630 
89630 
89630 
88890 
S8890 
88890 
S8KOO 
88890 
88890 
88890 
88890 
88890 
88H80 
8«890. 
88700 
88150 
88150 
88150 
88150 
88150 
87uno 
87i)IIO 
87410 
87410 
87410 
87410 
874 10 
87410 
87̂ 10 
87410 
e'riuo 
874X0 
87410 

86U70 
86670 
86670 
86670 
86670 
86670 
80670 
86U70 
86d70 
86670 

. 8670 
86670 
86670 
86670 
S6670 
8fiU30 
85U30 
b&uao 
86U30 
86U30 
86uao 
86T40 
85190 
86190 
85190 
86180 
84440 
84440 
84440 
84440 
84440 
84440 
8371^ 
83700 
837UO 
Ki7U0 
83760 
837l>0 
83TU0 
saô io 
83o',2e 

82U60 
a-iUu* 

UUO 
DUO 
<U(iO 

iO 
•zzt 

ia& 
i a « . Posi 
i a7 . Bachofer. Janice S 
laS. Ualdo, Anthouy 
1^:8. Walker. Joan M. 
130. MUler, Kather M 

FU 
Huchostsr 
Blilyn . 

Floral Pk . 
Uamburc . 

144. 
146. 

131. Suedaker. Anna W.. Bi-unxyto 
138. A ien. Doris D., WUitesboro . 

Uusliea, Cloiuttaoca. Watei twa 
134. Munw, Shirley M., Bronx . . 
136. White, Helena M., Pooa Taa 
136. Dntka. John A.. Ultca 
137. Miller, VeruoB X.. Bklya . . . 
138. Cooa, Patricia Batavia . . 
138. Tolel . Aiiuu IL. PkeepiM . . . 
140. Schmali, Francia IL . Utioa . 
141 . Oainiar, Ktizabetk. I A Lussra 
1 4 a . Hart. Lalliau T . Buffalo . . 
143. Khoa. Juditii IL. Ulip 

Uaberstro. Edwin IL., BuifaU 
YOSSIHT. George A., Kggortsvi 

146. Sciaacia, UicharO, Jauieatowa 
147. Kcac'b, Hi-lun U., Amatenkun 
14S. Huiiaar, Rosemary A.. . 
14«. Bacon. Uulb WeUsTlla , 
160. Wal. Frank 8 , M d i c o U 
161. SelMuuck. Klwaa, Hswtovrak 
16lt. bamuola, Roben NYC ... 
15S. KnutMB. i lamsr. Bkiya 
164. StaTooa, Ruhr !».. ttaianaa Lk 
I5S. Storsa, JuamU i , JiUiusIuiA . 
160. UoKaa. l-bomas B.. Uuflato . 
IftT. Late , gcrmnary. ItalaiM , . , 
1 « « . Carrisn. Jotaa F , i »uSal* . . 
150. U lnn , Holwrt Byractwa . 
l a o . FUlMr, MataU* L , SyracaM . 
151. Hnloynsas. AaUtaay, BaEat* 
lOS. ausiaar, Marcarat U , Bi 
lOS. OuoU*, U a n r F , Ti 
l O i . Fowlw, Anvsta 
lOS. KiwisWIa, MMto 
lOO. SBUk, —ntm 
ISV. T M M T , Oaratya M̂  • 
laS. EorSiaa, DarM, B h ^ 
I M . iMlisB, Frank. DtUa 

8:; 
till 
ti~ 
82 

sa'̂ ao 
8au40 
8;iU40 
81480 
81480 
81180 
81480 
81480 
81480 
81480 
81480 
81480 
81480 
8U740 
80740 
80740 
80740 
8U740 
8UT40 
80740 
88740 
8U660 
8U600 
86600 
8UU00 
80000 
8U000 
80000 
8UOOO 
80000 
80000 
80000 
80000 
80000 
80000 
80000 
79810 
70800 
79800 
7»aeo 
T9S00 
79 
79 
T9S «0 
70*00 

i»sm 
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Apply Now for These U. S. Jobs 
FOWITTBAADL CRMI R»G% IS ) 

•KLICOFTEK HLOT, |i,OM 
and (S^O.-^otM are In AlakMun*. 
KequlremenU: CAA UcenM with 
kwtruetor'i ntlng. For $S,OM 
|oba too boun M first pUot ro-
W y wlnK aircraft, and for $5,940 
lobd, 1,000 houra helicopter flnt 
pilot or aolo firing time. 100 hours 
•f b«Hcopter time must be la 
rear preceding date of flllnR. Bend 
applications to Address 27. 

nXUSTRATOR, 13.050 to H.-

Do Yon Need A | 
Nigh School Diploma?] 

(Eqir ivaUncy) 

• Far Parseaal SotUfocflM 
• F o r J o b P r o n e t i e a 
• I W A d d l t l o M l E d a c v N o a 

TRY THE""Y" PLAR 
• C O A C H I N G C O U R S E 
• FOR M E N A N D W O M E N 
• S M A L L CLASSES 
• VISIT A C L A S S FREE 
• START A N Y T I M E 

T O T A L C O S T $ 4 0 

S*m4 F o r t o e h l * * C < 

Y M C A EVENING S C H O O L 
If W M t &3rd St., N . W York 23. N.Y.||| 

TEL: E N d i c o « 2-8117 I 

306.—Mtm are tn O M o . l l e q u l v » -
ments: 2 to 5 years' experienc* In 
•denttflc or technical lUustraUT* 
work, part of which may bo eov-
ered by education in the fields ct 
Illustration, design, or commercial 
art. Bend applications to Addrcas 
U. 

INSTEVCTOK, $3,410 and $«.-
305. — options: communications 
operation, wire maintenance, T*-
hlcle maintenance, eonstructloo, 
uttUtles, supply, adminlstratlTe. 
Jobs are In Wyoming. Requlr*-
ments: 4 to S years of appropri-
ate experience In teaching or Job 
performance. Appropriate col-
lege education may be substituted 
for experience. Send appUcatloos 
to Address 3. 

LABORATORY ELECTRONIC 
BIECHANIC, $2,750 to $5,040.— 
Jobs are In the States named be-
low. Requirements: Appropriate 
training or experience. For }obs 
In places and at salaries diown. 
send applications as indicated be-
low: N. Mex. ($2,950 to $4,300): 
Address 35; Md., Va., and D. C 
($3,750 to $5,940): Address 30. 

MATHEMATICIAN. $4,03* to 

•I I 

~ ~ » A V I T I M E f o r 

I E 6 E N T S . COLLEGE. BUSINESS 
7lli Orad* Ihroosli Hl«h WkMl 
•AT S IV I . CO-ID. A k i W M 

o u t OirtOMA ADMITS TO COUML 
B O R O H A L L A C A D E M Y 
a/naAttkWEit .Cw.Fat lMti . • Ik ' t l 
M.. ••1447-T*4I>Ml CATAUF 

, B O 
I air LI ' 

^ EVENING C L A S S E S ^ 

Hunter College 
SCHOOL OF GENERAL STUDIES 

Park Avenuo at 69th Street 

SHORTHAND, STENOTYPE A BUSINESS THEORY COURSES 
NEFARE roK mese OAMINATIONS: 

N.Y. City Court Reporter Certified Shorthand Reportw 
N.Y. State Hearing Reporter Certified Professional Secretory 
Six Court Reporting Courses for persona able to write sbert-
hand or stenotype at the rate of 140 words a minute sr mora, 
and who wish to qualify for a well-paying Court or Free-Laac.. 
Reporting position. Courses are conducted by Court Reporters, 
tnrrently active in their profession, and completely familiar 
with the needs of their studenU, In addition to highspeed die-
tation of teclinical, legal, and medical matter, the courses ens-
brace a study of advanced reporting techniques and principlea 
designed to equip the student fully for the exacting work 
•erbatim reporting. 
Three courses organized aro«md the areas covered in the sa-
amination for the Certified Professional Secretary sponsored 
by the National Secretaries Association. 
AUo courses In Spanish Stenography (Qregg and PltBMM>, 
French and Italian Stenography (Gregg). 

REGISTRATION 
SEPTEMBER 13. 14, IS 

IrMn t PJM. » • * PJA. 

If WEEK TERM 
Beginning 

MONDAY, SEPT. 

OpM •• imam mt wmt •> wom»». 
Far ( M * and fuN porHcvlon writ* to Room 241—CS 

miWTER COLLEGE, Par i A v w i w at 69tli S»rMt, N « w York >1 

PATROLMAN 
IXEW YORK CITY POIJCE DEPARTMENT 

MENTAL and PHYSICAL CLASSES 
EnroU Note! 

• DAY AND EVENING SESSIONS 
• SMALL CROUPS 
• INDIVIDUAL INSTRUCnON 
• FREE MEDICAI. EXAMINATION 
• FULL MEMBEItffllP PRIVILEGES 

YMCA Schools Bronx Onion YMCA 
15 West esnd St, — EN 2-tll7 m K. 181st St. — ME S-7M0 

For those who want to get into Civil Service 
Have you a relative or a friend who would Uke to work far 

the State, the Federal government, or some local unit of gorena-
ment? 

Why not enter a subscrlpUoa to the Civil Service Leader for 
klmf He wlU Qnd full }ob llsUngs. and learn a lot about cMI 
nrrlce. 

The price Is $3 — That brings him 52 Issues of the CMI 
•arvlce Leader, filled with the government lob news he wants. 

To«i can subscribe on the eoupoB below: 

LBADEB CTVIL SERVICE 
n Duane Street 
New York 7. New Tsrii 
I sncloee 98 (check or money order) for a 
year's subscription to the Civil Service 
iMder. Please anUr the name Usted below: 

• • • e We eMVo • o oKoeea aaoeea 

yX)RB8S 

o • • « ' « ' « • • B O N K 

$10,800.—Jobs are In tiia plaeca 
mentioned below. Requirements: 
Appropriate education and/or ex-
perience, plus professional experi-
ence for jobs paying $4,580 and 
above. Age imiits for $4,035 Jobs: 
IS to 35. For job In places and 
at salaries shown, send applica-
tions as indicated below: Md. ($5,-
0«0 to $10,800): Address 32; N. 
Mex. ($4,035 and $4.580): Address 
35; Pa., Del., Md., Va. ($4,035 and 
$4,580): Addres 3; Ari*. ($4,580 
to $10,800): Address 23. 

MEDICAL OFFICER, $5,»40 to 
$7,040.—Jobs are in the States 
named below. Requirements: De-
free of doctor of medicine plus 
appropriate experience to the 
field dP medicine for which appU-
catlon Is made. 

For Jobs In places and at aal-
arles shown, send applications 
•a Indicated below: Calif, (gener-
al medicine an dsurgery, $7,040): 
Address 12; Ind. (general medi-
cine, $6,940): Address 6; Mo., 
Iowa, Minn., Nebr.. Kans., N. Dale., 
(general. $7,040): Address t. 

METALLURGIST, $4,035 to $7.-
040.—Jobs are In the States 
named below. Requirements: Ap-
propriate education and/or experi-
ence .Age limits for $4.0S5 Joba: 
1« to 35. 

For Job tn places and at sahuiea 
shown, send applications as Indl-
oated below: 

H. T., N. J. ($4,035 and $4,»») : 

CTVIL SERVICE COACHIHa 
OhrO Bnclncn- Am* ArdritMt 
AMt CiTll «n(tr * . C W I fcW. 
Aart If«ai1 Knrr Jr. M c A l Wtm 
AMt mectr Entrr Jr. Bleetr Wmt 

UCKNHI ! n t K T A I l A T M m 
P M t fcWT. Ar«h. Snrr-eyor. Fo r t lM* m 

Statlonsnr, Rcfrt* Bn«r. R M t o M a n 
DKAFTTira • Dl i f l lON - M A T H K M A ' " 

MONDELL INSTITUTE 
«Sa W. 41«T HOT. Trib. Bid*. W1 1 - M M 

•raiKlMa Bronx. BhlTo * J u n t M 
Ortr M rrm Prf-parin* ThooMsd i tm 
C M Barriee. Knrineerinr A L l f M m n w a 

LEARN IBM 
M. X. errr AFPUCATIONB ai 

SKPT. 8-a« FOa 
O KXT RTMCH (BCCLABH* 
O T A B ( rrwaoMoB) 
A U O : M M r FrSena imkm Maw I 
T M t avT C l u M O , Bar * 

MACHINE 
ACCOUNTING 

SCHOOL 
St.. N.Y. 

r> t-wt 

Your E v e n i n g and 
S a t u r d s y C o u r s ^ ^ 

to MINIMUM FEES lead t i a 
CERTIFICATE or DEGREE l i 

CksBicsl Commercisl I r t 
Csastnictiii i Advertisini 

Electrical Accountiac 
Madaa ica l ReUII 
• a a t a l L i b Pbotsgraiilw 

HaMca i l ab l a d a s U i a l l M t M k i 

SM Eveniflf Division Cataiif 
H M F A U T E R M Begins Sept. 

itar: SMt 10, 10 UL-t PJI4 
Sa»L 12-13-14, 8-9 PJl 

N e w Y o r k C i t y 

C o m m u n i t y 

C o l l e g e 

300 Peorl St, Bklyn 1 . TR 5 •!9V. 

HANDS TIED? 

Address 3; Mo. ($5,000 to $7 040): 
Address 9; Pa. ($5,060 to $7,040): 
Addres 16; Pa., Del., Md., Va. 
($4,035 and $4.580): Address 3. 

NAVAL ARCHITECT. $4,035 to 
$7,040.—Jobs are In the States 
named below. Requirements: Ap-
propriate coilcge education or 
technical experience or a combin-
ation of such education and ex-
perience or a combination of such 
education and experience. In ad-
dition, for Jobs paying $4,580 and 
above, appropriate progressive 
professional experience. Age limits 
for $4,035 jobs: 18 to 35. 

IBM AT BMI 
KEY PUNCH AND TAB 

Prepare For Civil Service 
Positions with High Pay 
Train for Part Time Jobs 

40 KOTO COURSE 
LOW TUITION 

Free Placement Service 

BUSINESS MACHINE 
INSTITUTE 

^Hotel Woodward. 55 St.. B-way-j 
JD 2-5211 

Because Yo« Leek A 

HIGH SCHOOL 
DIPLOMA 

Y M OM got one at HOME IN 
yoar spare time. H yo« af« 17 
ar over and kave left school, write 
far interesting booklet — 
yoM howl 

AMERICAN SCHOOU EmTM 
IN W. 4i»4 St. N. Y. U. K Y. 

M®® yv^tf ^Hî Ji S^Ai^^t 

TRAIN FOR HI&H-PAr JOISf 
aalarln from SSS40 ta flO.OO* 

HEAAING REPORTER 
CONVENTIOM REPORTER 

COURT REPORTER 
LEGAL STENOGRAPHER 

Alia OMUM TE: 
Ateinlatratian 

nUnr O IfMUcal SMreUrial 
lal SMniartal O Straot^pa 

Ba j -Br * . 
ar w M * *ar BkM. L 

ibU/iAAofw §juIiJtuhi 
74 St. 

S<!ll<H>l 
8k 

ml Mvtvmtm, Tat. A|>pr. 
BC 1-17X0 

• M.TXL An>raT«a hr 

S ^ e Exam Coming Far 

JUNIOR 
TAX EXAMINER 

$3360 - $4280 
100 POSITIONS OPEH 

M H x to B«pt. 16 - K>iini Ort. IS 
INTENSIVE COURSE 

COMPLETE PREPARATION 
C l M berine Tiipo., Srpt 20 at S:1S 

Wriie ar Phone for Information 

Eastera School AL 4-5029 
133 2ad Avo., N.Y. 3 ( o t i St.! 
FVaae write me, free. lihont, th« Jr. 
n a examiner Coiirse 

Addr«as 

Boao rz 

A 
L 
L 

Sodte Brown iay»: 

VETERAHS 
and CIVILIANS 

N O W Is H io t i m e t o p r e p a r e f o r 

EXCELLENT JOBS 
Free Placement Service 

DAY AND EVENING 
MISINESS ADMINISTRATION 

EXECUTIVE SECRETARIAL 
«Mh •peciallr.uticn In Salminantihlp, 

Advertisins, MerrhtiniMRins. 
BatailInK, Fin.inrr. MnniifarluriaK 

•adio anfl Tclrvlalon, «tc. 
- A L S O -

HIGH SCHOOL 
EQUIVALENCY DIPLOMA 

C O L L E G I A T E 
BUSINESS INSTITUTE 

SOl Madnon Ave. (R'i St.) PL S-1872 

HOUSE HUNTING? 
SEE PAGE N 

Questions answered on civil ser-
vice. Address Editor, The LEADER, 

Prepare Yourself How For 
Coming U. S. Civil Service Tests 

During A a aai# twalva l a a l l w lltara « < l ba many appo in imenh te 
MLS. CivU Sarvica i * b « ia aaany parts af tka country. 

l l i e M w a ka ^ y i a q at M^li a* $377.00 a month to start. Tliay 
•ra wall paid ia aampari ioa Ika «ama Uad of jobs in private industry. 
TIMY a f far (ar Mara tacyti ly Miaa It anial k privata employment . Many of 
f lwaa jobt ta^alra RHia ar aa aaparieaca ar tpacia l i ied education. Tiiey are 
•MMtabla to aa aitd wamaa batwaaa M mmd 55. 

•UT la arJar to f a t aaa o f ifcasa jobs, you must pass a Civil Service 
toat. TIM aompaWiaa H tfiaea totta It M a a t a . la l ome cases as f ew as ona 
oaf af fiva app l i caah patsl Aay t l i i a f yaa can do to increase your chances 
t f patting it wafl warMi y o « r vkita. 

FraakKa latl i l i i to k a privataiy a o a a d t d m o l which helps many pass 
lltata tat i t aach yaar. H M iMtHwta it ttia larqett and oldest organi iat ion 
af l U i U » d aitd II h aot ooanactad wMi MM Government . 

Ta 9at <«> laformatioa fraa o f akar^a aa Hiasa U.S. Civil Service jobs 
M owl and aiail KM coupoa at once. T O D A Y . Tka Institute will also show 
f a a how yaa aaa e » a W y younatf to patt tfMea tasts. Don't d e l a y—ac t 
M O W l 

PrankR* l a t f l M ^ 
• a p * . M 4 , R e e h e c t a r 4 . H . T . 

Ratli to mm, aatiraly <raa af c k ^ f * ) a M l description of U.S. Ctvlt 
Sarvica jobt ; ( I ) f i ^ oopy af iflustrated 36-page book with ( 3 ) list af 
HLS. CWA Sarviaa |4) tot a o bow to prapara for one of tkasa tottt. 

_ A g e 

Straat .Stata. 

.Af*. No.. Cl»y 
Ceapea k. valaaWe. a** H be«ere fmm aiistey H. 

Zone 

SCHOOL DIRECTORY 
Callege Preparatorjr 

HALL ACASKMI , W i t ta i f c Kxt^ Car. raltea, Bklja. Beeenia A A p p r m * 
DL S-»44'r 

•aalacaa Behoale 

WASHINOTOM BDSINasa w n c , S10a-7«k Ave. (eor. isntfa St.), N V.C. Bacre«Mlil 
and clTil ecrrlca traimng. Switchboard. Moderate cost. UO 2 6080. 

laaifBOB SCHOOL ar a r S I K i a b . eaaaptomettT, KerpuQch, ABC Switchboard. 
jBir; oomptomeiry; Spanish A Medical Secretarial. Veteran Tniii i inr. O v a 

_ _ r ^ a r a t i a B . S a a t m i h at. ami Tremont Are., Bronn. K I 2 61)00 

i. m. m. MAVHINKH 

AUtmm 

CH* Stato.. 

RMningtoR Rand or IBM Key Punch & TAB Training 
. .DST . Ni fht , Weekend Claaaee. Introductorr Leseon S5. Free I'latemeot 

BNKOLL TODAY Coaobioatiaa Boainaee School, ! » « W. 12&lb SI , I M 
aaev. Ma Aaa Ua>ll. Ma edacaUooal reqalrementa. 

aaeretartal 

UKAKK8, 154 NA88AU BTHBIET, N.X.C. Secretarial Aecountlnc. Draftlnr. 
Dar Nllfbt. W H U tor Cataloc BK S-4840 

liTICMOTVI'K Ult'TATION <lKO|1l*N form Ins Shurtliaiid writers weiiome. AH 
Bcttd* accoiuMUted. Apvi/ itux Ma. «U i , I M JC. i i i k bt , M. 1. iM, 
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M O D E R N P U B L I C 
A D M I N I S T R A T I O N 

This column is designed to be of scrvice to administrators, 
aupcrvisors, and employees who are interested in new ideas per-
taining to government operations. The material is gathered from 
communities throughout the United States. 

Financing of City Halls Discitssvd 
A CITY can pay for Its new city hall In a variety of ways, says the 

Municipal Finance Officers Association. 
Construction of the $1,200,000 Pontiac, Mich., building began in 

May. 1953, but the history of its financing dates back to 1926. In that 
year, a bond issue of $120,000 was approved to build a hall and ac-
quire the site for it. In 1928, another $300,000 in bonds were ap-
proved, and another $330,000 in 1929 for a total of about $750,000. A 
site was bought in 1930 for about $540,000, and the rest of the unis-
sued bonds were reserved for construction. When the depression came, 
the unsold $210,000 bonds were cancelled, and nothing further hap-
pened until 1950 when the city commission appropriated $150,000 to 
e.stabli.sh a City Hall Building Fund. Additional sums were earmarked 
for the next few years, and finally $1,100,000 was accumulated before 
awarding the contract for construction. 

In Petaluma, Calif., a joint county- city building was built, occu-
pied 22 per cent by the county and 78 per cent by the city. It was fi-
nanced as follows: $200,000, bonds; $18,708, interest on invested bond 
funds; $3,683, state allocations; $72,573, county participation; $25,000, 
sale of old city hall site; and $79,028, transfers from reserve funds. 

Milwaukee's projected municipal biulding will cost an estimated 
$5,300,000. Tlie financial plan provides for the sale of $3 million short-
term notes to banks and financial Institutions and $2,300,000 of in-
ternal financing. The internal financing involves this bit of history: 
In 1948, voters approved issuing $5,000,000 to finance the start of a 
system of expressways. In 1950, the city sold promissory notes and in 
1901 and 1952 sold general obligation bonds for the expressways. But 
then the responsibility for construction and financing the express-
ways was transferred from the city to the county of Milwaukee, and 
about $2,389,893 of the $5 million approved for expressways remains 
as a balance with the city. Although it must be used for retiring out-
standing expressway bonds as they mature, the city plans to borrow 
oa that sum up to $2,300,000 for the municipal building. 

Try Now Traffic Safely Measure 
LOUISIANA Department of Highways, seeking to reduce traffic 

accidents, is now engaged in an experiment in which the outer edges 
of highways are marked to show where the pavement ends and the 
shoulder begins. 

Officials hope the outer edge markings will pull traffic away from 
the center line and further over to the side of the highway. A number 
of head-on and other serious collisions occur when vehicles crowd the 
center lines. 

• • • 

Carageniobile 
LONC; BK.-VCH, Calif., has reduced maintenance costs by estab-

lishing a mobile unit for lubrication and maintenance of heavy con-
struction equipment and stationary equipment located at different 
points throughout the city. It's like bringing the garage to the car. The 
unit is operated by one mechanic during the winter and by a mechanic 
and a helper in the summer. 

Two Aides Win 
$50 for Ideas 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — Dr. Frank 
L. Tolman, chairman of the State 
Merit Award Board, announced 
the following awards to Slate 
workers for suggestions: 

$50 to Anthony Brescia, X-ray 
aide at Ray Brook State Hospi-
tal, whose suggested cassette hold-
er to support hospital patients 
while having bedside X-rays taken 
saves time and helps to eliminate 
a safety hazard to employees. 

$50 to Thomas J. Golden, ^nior 
account clerk in the Albany Of-
fice of the Department of Bank-
ing, for his suggested revision of 
procedures for purchasing listing 
paper. 

$30 to Benjamin Graziano, sen-
ior boys' supervisor, and Vincent 
Graziano, Institutional vocational 
instructor, both employed at the 
Boyc Training School, New Hamp-
ton, for the design and construc-
tion of a jig and grinding assem-
bly to sharpen jointer blades on a 
machine lathe. 

$25 to Herman Freund, attend-
ant at Wassaic State School, for a 
suggestion with reference to the 
clothing worn by hospital patients. 

Certificates of merit w e r e 
awarded to: Lester Levine, a typ-
ist in the Albany Office of the 
Bureau of Motor Vehicles; Mrs. 
Margaret Logue, attendant at 
Rockland State Hospital, and Wil-
liam Strieder, a prison guard at 
Sing Sing. 

JOHNSON IN CHARGE 
OF FLOOD RELIEF FUNDS 
ALBANY, Sept. 5 — Governor 
Harriman appointed John W. 
Johnson, Superintendent of Pub-
lic Works, to administer any Fed-
eral funds for the repair of pub-
licly owned facilities in the 
State's flood stricken areas. 

A. D. O'Connor, Regional Ad-
ministrator, Federal Civil Defense 
Administration, has been request-
ed to designate an official to work 
with Mr. Johnson. 

POLICE GIVE $2,500 
NYC Police Commissioner Ste-

phen P. Kennedy presented a check 
for $2,500 to the Flood Relief Pro-
gram of the American Red Cross. 

The donation was from the 
Charity Fund of the department. 
The fund is supported by contri-
butions from members of the de-
partment. 

This column is for employees of the Stale Correction Deimrlment. It U 

written by Jack Solod, himself an employee of the department with intimatm 

knonledge of worker problems in his agency. Mr. Solod has been given • 

"free hand" in writing his material, and his liews are his own. Members of 

the department who tcould like Mr. Solod to discuss matters of especial irtt-

portance to them are urged to write him in care of the Civil Service 

LEADKR, 97 Duane Street, New York City 7. 

Prison Guards Can Help Juvenile Delinquency 
LETTERS from various department sources saying, "Jack, pay 

and pension are Important, but occasionally show that the guard is 
fully aware of delinquency problems and is an intelligent Individual, 
not just 'a guy with a club,' as most people believe." 

Across the country, social agencies, youth commissions. Congres-
sional committees, are meeting to try and help alleviate the problems,, 
of juvenile delinquency. In all these investigations and studies, the 
one grou pthat has more personal contact with these problem children 
has never been called. I am referring to prison guards, who in their 
daily work come to know and understand the distorted point of view 
exhibited by delinquents. 

You Frudian scholars explain this attitude which the prison 
guard hears frequently: "If you break into the house and get the 
money and the man wakes up and sees you, you gotta kill him, man; 
if you don't, he can Identify you and, man, then you are in trouble." 

The easiest way is to say that the parents are at fault and let 
it go at that. This attitude on the part of many so-called "expert^!" 
solves nothing and the problem remains as acute and frightening as 
ever. 

Dr. Sheldon Glueck, noted psychiatrist, has proven that the be-
havior patterns of children can be detected before the age of eight. 
It would seem that the utilization of these tests in the schools all 
over America would help tremendously in the fight on juvenile deliru 
quency. Central clinics set up in various school districts could con-
duct these tests all over the country. CHiildren showing unusual be-
havior patterns could, with the advice of psychiatrists and trained 
social workers, have a program set up suitable to the individual, which 
could help direct the child mind to a more acceptable social attitude. 

These clinics could be set up along similar lines as the inoculatioa 
program for polio administered to children in the schools. While it 
is true that money would play an important part in such a program, 
the problem, of financing is not insurmountable. Hundreds of millions 
are spent each year for prisons, rehabilitation, crime prevention, and 
the money for such a worthwhile project would be forthcoming. Of 
what use is knowledge and the advances being made by such noted 
men as Dr. Glueck if the people as a whole are denied access to sucU 
treatment and information? 

Seventeen prison disturbances throughout the country in 1955. 
One of the important reasons is Inadequate probation systems ia 
many States. Some counties have excellent probation servics, while 
in the same State other counties have no probation system at all. Ta 
cite an example: A youth steals a car in a county with probatioa 
services. In most instances, for the first offense the court will place 
this boy on probation for a year or two. This same offease committed 
in a county with no probation system will find the offender sentenced 
to a term up to five years. 

This is definitely unfair, to say the least, and creates a feeling 
of bitterness in the minds of offenders which is not conducive to a 
well-disciplined institution. 

New York State, with excellent probation services, still has eleven 
counties with no service at all. In other States, the ratio of no proba-
tion is much higher. A more uniform integrated probation system all 
over the country would tend to lessen the tensions in State prisons. 

Staff IsExpanded 

To Aid Placemersf 

OfOver-dS Croup 
ALBANY, Sept. 5 — Eighteen 

employees were added to the staff 
of the Stale Labor Department by 
Industrial Commissioner Isador 
Lubin and. after a training course, 
assigned to centers giving job aid 
to persons over 45 years old. Thir-
teen were assigned to NYC and 
one each in Buffalo, Rochester, Sy-
racuse, White Plains, and New-
burgh. They have already started 
work at State Employment Service 
offices. 

The department set aside $50,000 
of a Federal grant for the new aid 
to the older job-seekers. The State 
Legislature, at its last session, 
voted a $50,000 standby fund, to be 
used additionally, if necessary. 

State Senator Thomas C. Des-
mond, chairman of the Joint Le-
gislative Committee on Problems 
of the Aging, said Interviewers 
should be a.ssigned also to Albany, 
Schenectady, Troy, Utica, and 
Yonkers. 

Interviewers, Mr. Lubln explain-
ed, will spend half their time coun-
selling and the other half in trying 
to find job vacancies, by visiting, 
writing and phoning emgloyer^i. 
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2,500 Attend 
Kings Park Event 

KINGS PARK, Sept. 5 — The 
Annual Field Day at Kings Park 
State Hospital was held August 
22 at Tiffany Field. Some 2,500 
patients were present for the 17 
Held events, conducted under the 
supervision of Joseph DePaul, field 
director, and other Recreation 
personnel. Prizes awarded to the 
patients winning events were pro-
vided by the Hospital Community 
Store. 

Refreshments provided by the 
Food Service was served by the 
O.T. personnel and musical selec-
tions were played by the patients' 
band under the direction of Robert 
Schulze. 

Grateful acknowledgement is 
given to Ward personnel, O.T. De-
partment, Recreation Department, 
Food Service, Farm, Print Shop 
and all departments which assisted 
in the success of the day. 

Personal Notes 
Mr. and Mrs. Neil McErlane are 

on vacation. 
Eleanor McMahon, beautician In 

Group 4 Female, is vacationing in 
Florida. 

Get well wishes to Edith Steven-
son who is confined to the em-
ployees' infirmary. . . . Welcome 
back to Dorothy Collins who had 
been on the sick list. 

Best wishes to Joyce Gray who 
resigned to prepare a coming 
"Blessed Event." . . . Vacationers 
from A-B Service are Mrs. Marg-
aret Beuudoin and Mi'i>. Margiuet 

McMahon. . . . Mrs. Jack Farrell 
and friends went to Jones Boach 
recently to see Guy Lombardo's 
Arabian Nights. . . . Norman Kelly 
is visiting with his father in Ire-
land. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Smith are 
enjoying a motor trip to Auburn, 
N. Y., where they will visit friends. 
. . . Congratulations to Mr. and 
Mrs. Michael Salerno on the ar-
rival of a baby girl. . . . Continued 
get well wishes are extended to 
Salvatore Fava who is still off 
duty due to an injury. 

Building C employees on vaca-
tions Include: Alf Herle, Edward 
L. Barrett, Peter J. Collins, Mr, 
and Mrs. Patrick Belton and Vic-
tor J. O'Hara. 

Tompkins Oliapter 
To Meet Sept 12 

ITHACA, Sept. 5 — Tompkins 
chapter, CSEA, will meet on Mon-
day, September 12 at 8 P.M., in 
the High School Building. Re-
freshments will be served. 

Catherine Baber, Mrs. Doris 
Nadge and Kenneth Herrman of 
the Board of Education have re-
turned from vacation, as have 
Elsie Laubengayer, County Labor-
atory, and John Eugene Gilbert. 
John Potten and Harriett Chaffee, 
County Hospital. 

Congratulations to Mr. and Mrs. 
William Powers. County Highway, 
on the birth of a son. 

Sympathy to Walter Armstrong, 
Sr., Town of Newfleld Highway 
on the deatti of his brotlier, and 

to the family of Mury Margaret 
Can Pelt, X-Ray Department aide 
of the County Hospital, who died 
recently. 

Advisory Committee 
Formed at Central Islip 

CENTRAL ISLIP. Sept. 5 — An 
advisory committee, to create a 
closer relationship between em-
ployees of Central Islip State 
Hospital and the hospital admin-
istration, has been formed. The 
first meeting is scheduled for 
September 6 In the office of Dr. 
Francis J. O'Neill, director. 

Peter Pearson, president of Cen-
tral Islip chapter, CSEA, named 
Lawrence Martinsen, James Mc-
Peak and Dennis Moloney to serve 
with him on the committee, which 
will meet with Dr. O'Neill the 
first Tuesday of each month, and 
on special occasions when neces-
sary. 

Peter Dow Retires 
Peter Dow of the carpenter shop, 

whose family has served the hos-
pital since its inception, has re-
tired after 28 years' service. 

Employees extend sympathy to 
Roy Lochlin on the death of his 
father. 

Elizabeth Blair of B Group has 
resigned. Frank Piatt of B Group 
has returned from sick leave, and 
Enrice Torres, ditto, is back from 
the Army. Joe Curto of K-5 has 
returned from the Navy. 

Michael Horan is a new staff 
attendant at B-3. . . . Dr. and 
Mrs. Kurt Rawitd liave transferred 
to Middletown State UospitiU. 

Court Wonders If 
It's a Crime to Send 
Letter to the Editor 

WASHINGTON, Sept. 5 — The 
suspension of a postal clerk who 
wrote a letter to Cher editor of a 
newspaper, calling Governor Allan 
Shivers of Texas a "renegade" has 
been ordered held up by Federal 
Judge Robert N. Wilkin. 

The clerk, Curtis C. Wilson, of 
Houston, Texas, a year and a half 
ago deplored the Governor's sup-
port of President Eisenhower in 
1952. Shivers is a Democrat. 

The U.S. Civil Service Commis-
sion ordered Wilson suspended last 
May under its ruling that writing 
letters on politics to newspapers la 
a violation of the Hatch Act, which 
forbids political activities by gov-
ernment employees. 

Judge Wilkin wants time t * 
study whether the letter is such « 
violation. 

AID HANDMAN ASKS 
TO RED CROSS 

Ephraim Handman, president ot 
the New York Federation of Post 
Office Clerks, has called upon it« 
members to contribute generously 
to the special flood relief fund of 
the American Red Cross. A nation-
wide appeal was issued by Presi-
dent George Meany of the AnierU 

I can Federation uX Labor. 
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[Lists Certified to NYC Depts. 
Namra mt persons mn the follow-

- IBK NTC eliKible lists have been 
r Mnt t* peraonnel ofllcer* vf the 

tfepartnent mentioned, for possible 
•ppointment to existing vmcancies. 
•ince more names are "eertifled" 
Mian there are Job openinKS, all 
•aay not be called to tnterviews. 
Ifnmber of the Iwit ellrlMc certi-
•cd ia Klven. 

' I B F E C I A I . M I U T A K T U S T 
t ' Attendant, grade 1, Marine and 
• l&viatloii; 1,711 (for messenger 

lobs). 
' •Cleaner (men), Hunter Ck>IleKe; 
L I.OSl (list of December, 1950; 634 
t /Ust oif July. 1952. 

Maintenance man. Correction, 
' Dueens, Hunter College. Housing 
[ Authority, Hospitals; US. 

Malntainer's helper, group Ek 
Transit Authority; 249. <U«t 
January 21, 1953). 

Railroad cleric. Transit Author-
ity; 871. 

Sanitation man B, Sanitation; 
3,779 (list of April, 1950); 1,392 
(list of October, 1953). 

Laborer, Marine and Aviation; 
674. 

Bookkeeper, grade 1, Hospitals, 
Transit Authority; 793. 

Clerk, grade 2, Health, Housing 
and Buildings, Fire, Civil Defense, 
Teachers Retirement, c::ity Regis-
ter, Comptroller's office. Air Pol-
lution Control, Budget. Commerce 
and Public Events, Special Ses-
sions. Police; 3,357. 

HERE IS A LISTING OF ARCO 
COURSES for /^ENDING EXAMINATIONS 

INQUIRE ABOUT OTHER COURSES 
• AMa i sh - a f i v * AM* . _$2.S0 
• Accorataat A Aarfttar 

N . T . C $2.50 
• Appraalic* $2.00 
• A A « « Eag inamaa $2.50 
• Aa f * Maciiialt* $2.50 
• A l t * Michaate $2.50 
• Araiy t Navy 

Practic* Testi $2.00 
• Ats't Foramoa 

(Smifatioa) $2.50 
• AttMdaat $2.50 
• AHeraay $2.50 
• loolilietper $2.50 
• I r l d f * t Taaiial Ofllcar $2.50 
• Malataiacr $2.50 
• Coiitaia (P.O.) $3.00 
n Car Maiatainer $2.50 
• Chaailit $2.50 

c w n Eaqiaaar ..$2.50 
• Civil Sarviea Haadboah $1.00 
• Cloiais Examlaar (Uaaai' 

pleymaat lasuraaea _ _ -$4 .00 
• Clarlcol Astistoat 

ICalla«as) $2.50 
n Clark. ftS 1-4 $2.50 
• Clark 3-4 $3.00 
• Clark. 6r . 2 
• Clark. Grade 5 
n Coadueter 

..$2.50 

..$3.00 

• Corractiaa Officer U.S. 
• ' C o a H AHendaat 

(State) 
g Depaty U.S. Martbal 

„.$2.50 
-.$2.50 

..$3.00 

Dietltlaa 
Electrical Eaginear 
Electrician 

„.$2.50 
...$2.50 
...$2.50 
...$3.00 

• Elevator Operatar $2.50 
• EaipleyaiaBt Interviewer $3.00 
• Flrenaa (F.D.I $2.50 
• Fire Capt. $3.00 
• Fire Ueateaant $3.50 
• Flramaa Tests la all 

States $4.00 
Farenaa $2.50 

Haas $3.00 
• Law i Caart Steaa $3.00 
• Llantenaat (P.O.) $3.00 
• Librarlaa $3.00 
• Maintenance Maa $2.00 

....$2.50 a Machaaical Eagr. 
• Malntainer's Helper 

IA A C ) $2.50 
• Malntainer's Helpar ( • ) $2.50 
a Maintainar's Hel|»ar (Dl $2.50 
• Maintainar's Helper (E> $2.50 
• Messenfer (Fad.) $2.00 
• Messenger. Grade 1 - $2.00 
a Motorman -..$2.50 
• Meter Veklcla License 

Examiner $3.00 
• Notary Pablic $2.00 
• on Bnrner Installer $3.00 
• Park Rakger -$2.50 
• Parking Meter Collector $2.50 
• Patrolman $3.00 
a Patrolman Tests in All 

States $4.00 
n Playground Director 
• PInmber 

-$2.50 
..$2.50 

• Policewoman - - $2.50 
n Postal Clerk Carrier -..$2.50 
• Postal Clerk in Charge 

Foreman $3.00 
a fower Maintainor $2.50 
• Practice for Army Tests $2.00 
• Prison Gnard -....$2.50 
• Probation Officer $3.00 
• Pnblic Health Narse $2.50 
• Railroad Clerk $2.00 
• Railroad Porter $2.00 
a Real Estate Iroker $3.00 
• Refrigeratiaa License -..$3.00 
• Rnral Mail Carrier $3.00 
• Sanitationman $2.00 
• School Clerk $2.50 

..$3.00 

Gardener Assistant -
H. S. Diploma Tests 
Hospital Attendant . 
Honslng Asst. 

..$2.50 

..$3.00 
-$2.50 
..$2.50 

Heasing Caretaker $2.00 
Honslbg Officer $2.50 
How to Pass CoHega Ea-
trance Tests $3.50 

• Haw to Stady Past 
Oflica Schemes . .$1.00 

• Home Stndy Coarsa far 
CIvR Service Jobs $4.f5 

• Hew ta Pass West Pain* 
•ad Aaaapolis Eatraaca 
Exams $3.50 

n iasaraace Agent $3.00 
• iatemal Revenae A«aat $2.50 
• lavastlgator 

I Loyalty Review) $2.50 
• lavastlgator 

(CKrH and Law 
Eaforcament) _ _ _ _ _ _ _ .$3 .00 

n Investigator's Hai 
• Jr. Acconntant 

ek $3.00 
$3.00 

n Jr. Maaogement Asst. _$2.50 
n Jr. Government Asst. _$2.50 
• Jr. Professional Asst. _$2.50 
• Janitor Custodian $2.50 
• Jr. Pratessionol Asst. _$2.50 
• L«w Eaforcemeat Past-

FREE! 

• Sergeant (P.D.) 
a Social Investigator $3:00 
• Social Supervisor $2.50 
• Social Worker $2.50 
• Sr. File Clerk —$2.50 
• Surface Line Dispatcher $2.50 
• State Clerk (Accounts, 

File t Supply) — $2.50 
a State Trooper $3.00 
• Stationary Eagiaeer A 

Fireman —. , .$3.00 
• Steno Typist (GS 1-7) _$2.50 
• Stenographer, Gr. 3-4 -..$2.50 
• Steno-Typist (Practical) $1.50 
• Stock Assistant $2.50 
• Structure Malntalner _.$2.50 
• Substitute Pastal 

Transportation Clerk -..$2.00 
• Sarface Llaa Opr. $2.00 
• Tax Collector $3.00 
• Technical A Prafessionol 

Asst. (State) $2.50 
• Telephone Operator $2.50 
• Title Examiner $2.50 
• Tkrnway Tall Callectar $2.50 
• Trackman $2.50 
• Train Dispatcher -$2.50 

-$2 .50 

-$3.M 

• Transit Patrolmaa 
• Treasury Enforcement 

Agent 
• Uniform Conrt Attendant 

ICity) $2.10 
• War Service Scholar-

ships $3.00 
With Every N. Y. C. Arco Book— 
You Wil ReceJva M Invaluable 
New Arco "Outlme Charf 
New York City Government." 

ORDER DIRECT^MAIL COUPON 

M e lor 24 hour spMMl dalivery 
C O . D.'s M c w t r e 

lEADCR »OOK STORE 

V DWMM St.. New Y«t4 7. N. Y. 
s»i<d 

I eailsn aitect er 

„...._...«c|rie« af k«ok< »hs»U<l ekove. 

BMney order iar • 

Kddnu 

City . . . Stat*. 

Lieutenant, Fire; 2,3. 
Laborer, Parks; 674. 
Playground director (men), 

Park.s; 45. 
Stationary engineer. Sanitation, 
Railroad clerk. Transit; 1.9. 

Correction, Hospitals; 9. 
Bookkeeper, grade 1, Housing 

Authority; 626. (list of October, 
1951). 

Clerk, grade 2: Law, Health, 
Trlborough Bridge, Board of 
Water Supply, City Clerk and City 
Council, Purchase, Public Works, 
Education, Transit, Welfare, 
Housing Authority; 3,387. 

Fireman, Fire; 57.3. 
Correction officer. Correction; 

1,773.9 (from transit patrolman, 
bridge and tunnel officer, and cor-
rection officer list of April, 1949). 

Housing assistant, Housing Au-
thority; 505 (list of January 2, 
1952). 

Laborer, Sanitation, Fire, Parks, 
Public Works, Bronx Borough 
President; 674. 

A.sslstant gardener. Parks; 1,216 
(list of September. 1954). 

Junior civil engineer, Brooklyn, 
Bronx, Queens Borough Presidents 
Offices, Water Supply Board, 
Parks, Public Works, Water Sup-
ply, Gas and Electricity, Housing 
Authority; 9. 

Malntainer's helper, group E, 
Transit Authority; 418. 

Trackman, Transit Authority; 
652.5. 

LABOR CLASS 
Butcher, Correction, Hospitals; 

35 (list of November 19, 1952); 83 
(list of March 16, 1955). 

Cleaner (men). Welfare, Public 
Works, Health, Police; 1.899 Hist 
of July 23. 1952); Health, 597. 
Welfare, 636, Police, 637, Public 
Works, 644 (list of January 19, 
1955). 

Hostler, Police; 15 (list of De-
cember, 1952); 1 (list of Novem-
ber, 1954). 

Seasonal parkman. Parks: 291 
(ll.st of April, 1953); 1,117 (list 
of 1954). 

I.KG.\L NOTUB 

Police Lieut. Study Aid 
The LEADER conUnues publi- | partment should be notified by tlw 

desk officer? 
37. As desk oflBcer, to whom 

would you refer a properly identi-
fied representative of a City De-
partment who presented a written 
request, signed by the head of his 
department, for information con-
tained in the police records relat-
ing to an accident Involving said 
department and as a result e( 
which the city is likely to become 
a party to an action? 

38. State aa Instance in which 
a desk officer may admit to ball 
a person who has been arrested 
and charged with a felony? 

39. As a desk officer at what 
amount should you fix bail in tlie 
case of a person arrested and 
charged with disorderly conduct 
l>ecause he caused a disturbance ia 
a public conveyance? 

40. When a person arrested for 
violation of a local law punishable 
by a fine only wishes to give liis 
personal undertaking in lieu of m 
bondsman, what should be the 
value of the money or property 
deposited as security for the under-
taking? 

73. What, if any, are the dif-
ferences between compounding a 
crime and compromising a crime? 

74. Under the State Emergency 
Defense Act, what court in New 
York City Is invested with juris-
diction to hear and determine ia 
the first instance charges of vio-
lations constituting infractions 
under that Act? 

75. What record should appear 
on the lower half of the last pa^t 
of the Blotter? 

SUPREME C O r R T OF THE STATE OF 
NEW YORK. COUNTY OP NEW Y O R K — 
IDA KING. Plaintift. ajrainst JOSEPH 
KING. Defendant—SUMMONS W I T H NO-
TICE.—Index No. .H1331!).").'>.—.Vtion 
FOR ABSOLUTE DIVORCE.—Pli i inl i f f re-
eides in New York County.—Plainlift drs-
ifmates New York County ae I l aee of 
Trl.il. 

To the Above-named Defendant; TOU 
ARB HEREBY SUMMONED to answer the 
complaint in this action, and to serve a 
copy of your answer, or. if the complaint 
IB not aerved with this 6;inin)onF. to upvve 
a notice •f appcaranoe. on the riainti f f 's 
Attorney, within twenty days after vhe 
setTioe of this summons. «*'-lusive of the 
day of service; and in case of your failure 
to appear, or answer, judgment will be 
taken aeainst you by default, for the re-
lief demanded in the complaint. Date l ; 
Nrw York, March fllh 1!155. ANDREW R. 
T Y L E R . Atloinpy for Plaintiff. Office A 
Poet Office Address ^25 Broadway. New 
York 7. N. Y . 

TO JOSEPH K I N G : The Joreeoinir sum-
mons is lerved upon yon by publication 
pursuant t « an order of Hon. Vincent A. 
Lnpiano a Justice of the Supreme Court 
of the State of New York dated Anpust 
Z3rd. 1965. and filed with the complaint 
in the efHce of the jClerk of New York 
County, Foley Square, Borough of M.-in-
hattan, City and State of New York. 
D.-ttd. New York. Ausrust 26th, 1956. 
ANDREW R. TY^.ER 
Attorney for Plaintilf. 

STATE OK NKW YORK 
INSURANCE UEPART-MENT, A U I A N T 

I, Lelfert Holz. Superintendent of In-
(Uranc« at the State of New York, hereby 
certify pnr«u!uit to law that the PACI 
PIC N A T I O N A L F IRE INSURANCE 
COMPANY, SAN FRANCISCO. CALIFOR-
N IA la duly licensed to transact the bus-
iness sf insurance in this state and that 
its statement filed for the year ended 
December 31. 1054 shows the fo l lowinr 
condition: Total Admitted Assets S49,-
466,330.34: Total Liabilities »Slt.H)0,998. 
» 4 ; Capital paid-up «1,260,000.00; Sur-
plus and Voluntary Reserves $19,010,330.. 
7; Policyholders Surplus »20,260,330 70; 
Income for the year $20,638,056.23; Dls-
bursemer lor the year $21,136,422.74. 

STATU OK NEW YORK 
E N S r i A N C E U K I ' A U T M K N T , A L B A N Y 

I , Leffert Hole, Superintendent of In-
surance mt the State of New York, hereby 
certify pursuant to law that the BAL-
F O I I R Q U T H R I E INSURANCE COMPANY 
SAN FRANCISCO. CAL IFORNIA is duly 
tlcen«e<] t « transact the busint^ of iqsur-
ance in this state and that l u statement 
filed for the year ended December 31. 
1964 shows the fol lownic condition: Total 
Admitted Assets $1,469,718.84; Total Li 
•bilitie* $126 867.44; Capital paid-up 
$070,950.00; Surplus and Voluntary Re-
serves $661,911.40; Policyholders Surplus 
$1,332,801.40; Income for the ye»r $418,-
824.16: SMmrsemeuU i « r tke year $08.-
7 M 87. 

Exam Study Books 
Cicelfeaf tfudy book* by 4rce, 

ta preparafloB tor cirraal sad 
coaiiag aiams for pablic («b«, at a 
oa taia at Tke LEADER tookttoro, 
91 Oaaaa Sfraaf, New fork 7, 
N. In fwe bloeki aertfc mt City 
Hall, fa$t wo$t oi •rocdway. Saa 
odvarfUamaaf. foqo IS. 

cation of study material for the 
NlfC promotion exam for lieuten-
ant (P.D.), Sample questions are 
given. Key answers are at the end. 

The exam has been reopeneil for 
receipt of applications on Septem-
ber 12, 13 and 14. 

21. When a member of the force, 
who is investigating a complaint 
of a crime, has reasonable grounds 
to believe that evidence of such 
crime may lie obtained by wire-
tapping, what action should he 
take? 

22. In taking a dying declara-
tion, what is the principal element 
to be considered and on which the 
patient should be fully interro-
gated before a statement is taken? 

23. In searching for fingerprints 
in an automobile would the front 
door windows or the steering wheel 
be the more probable source of 
good prints? 

24. Whenever a person is ar-
rested for violation of the gambling 
provisions of the penal law and 
there is an automobile in the im-
mediate vicinity, which is owned 
by the person arrested and is be-
lieved to be used by him in con-
nection with his gambling activi-
ties, what disposition should be 
made of the automobile? 

25. How should a cartridge or 
shell be marked as evidence by 
the member of the force who finds 
it? 

26. If a detective wishes to sub-
mit a laundry mark to the police 
lalioratory for possible identifica-
tion, why must he bring it in per-
son to the laboratory rather than 
send it through department mail? 

27. Of what force and effect are 
instructions printed upon author-
ized Police Department forms? 

28. What Police Department 
forms comprise the Complaint 
Pile? 

29. When a pistol or revolver is 
allegedly found and voluntarily 
surrendered to the Police Depart-
ment by a civilian, what forms 
and records should be accomplished 
by the desk officer? 

30. "Tlie Board of City Magis-
trates is empowered and directed 
to prepare and issue summons in 
blank, attested In the name of 
the Chief City Magistrate, to 
members of the police force." 
'Paragraph 1, Article 31, Manual 
of Procedure) What is the mean-
ing of the word ATTESTED as 
used in this sentence? 

31. "Cases of simulated burglar-
ies or other crimes of this nature 
lend themselves to this kind of in-
vestigation" (Spring 3100, March, 
1951 issue, page 26) What is the 
meaning of the word SIMULATED 
as used in this sentence? 

32. "A public hack driver shall 
not be subsidized to induce a per-
son to patronize a public dance 
hall." (Public Dance Hall Regu-
lations) What Is the meaning of 
the word SUBSIDIZED as used in 
this regulation? 

33. "The lack of organizing in 
forensic science is attributable in 
part to the nature of the work" 
(Foreword to "An Introduction to 
Criminalistics" by O'Hara and 
Osterburg.) What is the meaning 
of the word FORENSIC as used 
in this sentence? 

84. "A policeman must not fail 
to realize that he is the cynosure 
of the public eye, and a ready 
subject of discussion." (Paragraph 
8, Article 29, Manual of Procedure) 
What is the meaning of the word 
CYNOSURE as used in this sen-
tence? 

35. Wliat notifications are to be 
made in the event of an accident 
in which a civilian employee of the 
Police Department is injured? 

86. If. an officer of the United 
States Army Is arrested and 
charged with a crime. In addition 
to the notification made to tlie 
Communications Bureau, what 
other office within the Police De-

1 ! ' 

KEY ANSWERS 
21. Report the facts in writin* 

to his C. O. 
22. His mental attitude — BO 

hope of recovery. 
23. Front door windows. 
24. Seize it EIS evidence. 
25. By scratching his Initials oa 

the side of it. 
26. To establish continuity af 

possession of evidence since It ti 
legal evidence. 

27. Same tks Rules and Regula-
tions. 

28. U.P. 60 (Complaints — 
Chronological Record) and U.F. U 
'Complaint Record.) 

29. Blotter entry. Complaint 
(U.F. 61) and Pistol Index Cart 
(U.F. 65b.) 

30. Vouched for: certified m 
accurate. 

31. Imitated: counterfeited. 
32. Grant an allowance, bona* 

or reward. 
33. Relating to courts: used la 

legal proceedings. 
34. Object of general interest ar 

attention. 
35. Chief Clerk or Corporattoa 

Counsel. 
36. Office of the CJhief Inspector 

'Bureau of Planning and Operm--
tions.) 

37. The Corporation Counsel. 
38. When a railroad employee ti 

so charged in connection with a 
railroad accident. 

39. $500. 
40. Double the largest fine that 

can be imposed. 
73. Compounding is a crime It-

self. Compromise is with tlw 
court's permission. Only a misde-
meanor can be compromised. 
Compromise is with consent 
There must be a civil remedy far 
a compromi.sed crime. 

74. Magistrates' Court. 
T5. Index of records taken 

a command. 

RESORTS 

CROOKED LAKE 
HOTEL & MOTEL 
Open Year 'Round 

Special attention to Partlas 
and Banquets 

AVERILL PARK, N. T. 
OKegon 4-8931 



Nominations Close Sept. 15 
For Supervisor Training; 
Day Courses Will Be Given 

ALBANY. Sept. 5 — Now is the 
time for State employees to let 
tlieir supervisors know tbey would 
like to participate in day super-
vi.sory training dasses. L ^ t date 
for nominatloitB is Thursday, 
September 15. 

Participation in the State. Civil 
Service Department's training pro-
gram is limited to those who have 
been nominated through the per-
sonnel office of the department in 
which they are employed. 

"Only three' ng(nT|nations may be 
made from each department for 
each class." a Civil Service spokes-
man said. "If you want to take 
part in tl3£ day sessions, you've 
got to act immediately." 

Three Courses in Five Cities 
The sessions will be conducted 

In NYC, Buffalo, Albany, Rochester 
and Syracuse. Courses include 
Fundamentals and Supervision, 
Case Studies in Supervision, and 
Administrative Supervision. 

All three study programs will get 
under way in NYC the week of 
October 3. That same week will 
see the start of the Fundamentals 
course in Buffalo and the Case 
Studies course in Flochester and 
Syracu.se. 

All three supervision courses will 
be given in Albany beginning the 
week of October 10. 

Cla.s.ses will meet for a three-
hour ses.sion once a week for ten 
weeks. 

Tiie Basic Courses 
Fundamentals of Supervision is 

a basic course for supervisors be-
tween grades 7 and 15 and is de-
signed to point out the funda-
mental principles underlying good 

employee relationships and effi-
cient work management. Included 
are such topics as directing and 
delegating work, planning, em-
ployee training, discipline, em-
ployee relations, control and co-
ordination. and job improvement 
factors. 

"The course," the Civil Service 
Department said, "provides an op-
portunity for group discussion of 
general problems and the exchange 
of ideas based on the experience 
of class members and Instructors." 

•Follow-Up 
The follow-up course is Case 

Studies in Supervision. It is open 
only to those who have successfully 
completed Fundamentals or Ad-
ministrative Supervision. Case 
problems are presented to the class 
for analysis and study, and the 
group attempts some solution to 
the problem. The objective is to 
a.ssist the supervisor in organizing 
his thinking before attempting to 
solve a supervisory problem and 
in exercising proper judgment in 
the evaluation of the facts in the 
case. The interdepartmental rep-
resentation is designed to assure 
a variety of cases and experiences. 

The Administrative Supervision 
course is for State aides above 
grade 15. Topics such as budgeting 
and leadership are stressed, and 
planning Is treated more exten-
sively than it is in the Funda-
mentals course. 

"The purpose of the administra-
tive course, however, is essentially 
the same," the department said, 
"a-s that of the Fundamentals 
course—to promote good employee 
relationships and effective work 
management." 

A t T B V I T I E S O F K M P l . O Y K E S l.'V S T A T U 

Newark Fetes Couple 
On Return from Europe 

NEWARK, Sept. 5 — Mr. and 
Mrs, Alex Mecliie, who recently 
toured Ireland, England, Wales, 
Scotland. France and Newfound-
land, were guests of honor at a 
dinner given by the Recreational 
Department of Newark State 
School. A talk on highlights of 
their trip was enjoyed by the many 
friends who greeted the couple. 

There's other vacation news at 
Newark, too. A. J. Bradley is vaca-
tioning in New England: Mary 
Bidwell spent a week at Westport, 
Canada: Mr. and Mrs. Elwood 
Kibler were at the races at Sara-
toga; Eleanor Vercruysse and 
family are vi.siting places of in-
terest in nortliern New York State; 
Nona Hagln, R.N., is spenidng two 
week.s in Florida; Marion MacKay 
and Mr. and Mrs. William Mad-
dock are at the Toronto Fair; Mr. 
and Mrs. Josepli McGuire are 
vi.siting relatives in Iowa and 
Kentucky: Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Quitin are at Sodus Point. 

And — Mr. and Mis. Wilbur 
Stillwell and Mr. and Mrs. Edward 
Stiliwell and family spent a week-
end with relatives in Tonowanda 
and Niagara Palls; Mr. and Mrs. 
Leonard Miller visited relatives on 
Long Island; Vernice Carver was 
on a three-week vacation; and 
Donald Orlopp is combining a 
vacation with broadcasting duties 
at the Palmyra Fair. 

Also vacationing: Lois Kardys, 
Lois Johnson, Margaret Chetney, 
Charlotte Reeves, Lucille Hitch-
cock, Jennie Rose, Ethel Lovejoy, 
Florence Coomber, Betty Baker, 
Catherine Werely, Mary Robbins, 
Dorothy Leaird, Elsie Beeman, 
Kenneth Robarge, Henry DesCamp 
and Boij Keiley. 

UauKhtcr Born to Burditts 
Employees at Newark extend 

congratulations to Mr. and Mrs. 
Chester Burditt, parents of a 
diiughter born August 14. 

A cordial welcome was extended 
to Mr. and Mrs. Joiui Boedecker, 
senior maintenance supervisor, who 
replaces Tiiomas LaMar, retired. 
. . . Dr. Hans Waller, formerly on 
tiie Newark staff, visited the school 
recently. 

Tlie Second Aanual Clambake 

held at V.F.W., Lyons, was a suc-
cess in spite of tiie heat wave. . . . 
Infirmary lA employees and 
families held their annual picnic 
at Ro.seland Park on August 18. 
Infirmary IB held theirs the 28th. 
. . . Lulu Redder and Lois Shaffner 
are driving new Plymouths. 

Sympathy is extended to Berna-
dine Carroll, whose father died 
August 25. and to James Lewis on 
the death of his fatlier. 

The annual laundry employees' 
picnic was held August 21 at 
Cayuga Lake Park. About 28 at-
tended, including Mr. and Mrs. 
H. Wlieeler, recently retired. 

Congratulations to Caroline Mc-
Cann who is wearing a beautiful 
diamond ring. 

Charles Smith is at Camp Drum 
for military training. . . . Welcome 
to Dr. Mina Keliow. . . . Greetings 
to Margaret Crowe, who has re-
turned to duty after several weeks' 
illness, and to Fay Avery after 
four months sick leave 

They Are Wished Well 
Best wishes for speedy recover-

ies to: Lenona Manley who is ill 
at her home on Cluirch Street; 
Melvina Gay, convalescing at 
home; Colin Woodgates recently 
returned from Clifton Springs 
Sanitarium and now at home; 
Dominick Viticore ill at home. How 
about cards to the shut-ins? 

The Boys' New Infirmary has 
tlie New Look — black-topped 
road and new sidewalks. 

f N 
FRIED AND BEHA NAMED 
TO CORRECTION COMMISSION 

ALBANY, Sept. 5 — Governor 
Harriman has appointed Henry 
Fried and James J. Beha, both of 
NYC, as members of the State 
Commission of Correction. Mr. 
Fried succeeds Charles M. Trunz 
of Forest Hills and Mr. Beha suc-
ceeds Robert E. Moore of NYC. 
Mr. Beha's father was State Su-
perintendent of Insurance, 1924-
29. 

i 

Full Slate in 
CSEA Election 

(Continued from Page 1) 

School; John J. Cox, Public Works, 
Albany; Angelo J. Coccaro, Kings 
Park State Hospital. 

4th Vice President — Vernon A. 
Tapper, Parks Department, Syra-
cuse, and John P. Quinn, Buffalo 
Sewer Authority. 

.51h Vice President — Charles E. 
Lamb, Sing Sing, and Noel F. Mc-
Donald, Conservation Department, 
Red House. 

Secretary — Charlotte M. Clap-
per, Health Department, Albany, 
and Margaret J. Willi, Division of 
Employment. Albany. 

Trca.surer — Harry G. Fox, Civil 
Service, Albany, and Kenneth L. 
Riexinger, Labor Department, Buf-
falo. 

Executive Committee 
Nominated for State Executive 

Committee posts were: 
Agriculture and Markets — Wil-

liam F. Kuehn. 
Audit and Control — Ed Soren-

son. 
Banking — Frank C. Maher. 
Civil Service — Peter H. Hilton, 

Marie Debes. 
Commerce — Mrs. Mildred O. 

Meskil. 
Conservation- George H. Siems. 
Correction — James L. Adams. 
Education — Hazel G. Abrams. 
Executive — Jack DeLisl, Delor-

as Fussell, Albert C. Kiilian and 
William O'Morrissey. 

Health — Eugene J. Cahalan 
and Emmett J. Durr. 

Insurance — Solomon Bendet 
and Stephen J. Banks. 

Labor — Edmund J. Bozek, Ar-
thur H. Israel and Grace Nulty. 

Law — Francis C. Maher. 
Mental Hygiene — John E. Gra-

veline. 
Public Service — Margaret A. 

Mahoney and Anthony A, Ber-
gamini. 

Public Works — Charles J. Hall. 
State — Edward L. Gilchrist. 
Social Welfare — Charles H. 

Davis. 
Taxation and Finance—Francis 

X. Maloney, Jeannette M. Finn 
and Paul F. Powers. 

Judiciary — William A. SuU-
van. 

Legislative — William S. King. 

Southern Conference to Hear 
CSEA Candidates for Office 

Flood Heroes 
(Continued from Page 

markets in the department, handl-
ed much of tlUs phase of the emer-
gency. 

These are only a few of the 
names behind the State's emer-
gency aid campaign to communi-
ties victimized by the flood disaster. 

THIELLS, Sept. 5 — The South-
ern Conference, Civil Service Em-
ployees Association, will hold its 
annual fall meeting on Thursday, 
September 22, at 8 P.M. at Kirk-
bride Hall, Letch worth Village. 

The session is being held a week 
later than the date originally an-
nounced, ijecause of a conflict with 
a meeting of the CSEA Board of 
Directors. 
• Invitations have been extended 
to all candidates for state-wide 
CSEA office, and each will be given 
an opportunity to present his plat-
form. 

No indorsement of candidates 
will take place at the meeting, but 
delegates may make indorsements 
at a later date if they wish, ad-
vises Conference President Charles 
E. Lamb. 

41-Polnt Program 
The Conference has submitted 

to the CSEA resolutions committee 
a 41-point prograjn for improve-
ment of civil service. The program, 
copies of which have been sent to 
all CSEA members in the Confer-
ence area, includes the following: 

1. Individual mortality rate for 
purpose of retirement. 

2. Right of coun.sel and re-in-
statement for non-competitive em-
ployees. 

3. Arbitrary action of the Budget 
Director be curtailed or removed. 

4. Uniform allowance for State 
employees. 

5. 35 million dollar personal serv-
ice appropriation for salary in-
crease. 

6. 40-hour week with no loss In 
take-home pay. 

7. Additional sick time to all 
employees working more than 40 
hours a week. 

8. Extra increments after 15 and 
20 years of service. 

9. Amend the Retirement Law 
to provide that beneficiary receive 
same option, if member dies after 
application is filed. 

10. Additional retirement credit 
for employees working more than 
40 hours a week. 

11. Re-open the 55-year plan. 
12. Elimination ot fees for pro-

motion examinations. 
13. Increased death Ijenefit. 
14. Augmentation of present re-

tirement plan. 
15. Grievance machinery set up 

by the Legislature. 
16. 37 V4 hour week for institu-

tional clerical employees. 
17. Liberalization of Attendance 

Rules. 

18. Ordinary death benefit for 
Mental Hygiene retirement mem-
bers. 

19. Supplemental pension al low 
ance. 

20. Repeal of the Condon-Wadlia 
Act. 

21. Require written reasons for 
veto by Budget Director of reclas-
sification or reallocation of posi-
tions. 

22. Cash payments for annual 
time accruals. 

23. Abolishment of 30 day wait-
ing period for retirement. 

24. Time and one half for all 
overtime. 

25. Retirement credit during 
period of physical disability. 

26. Optional retirement after 25 
years for all members of Retire-
ment System. 

27. Fair holiday and leave pri-
vileges for State employees. 

28. Permit employees wlio so de-
sire to work 40 hours a week. 

29. Disability retirement up t® 
age 70. 

30. Committee to check working 
out of title. 

31. Equal pay for equal work. 
32. Change of title of prison 

guard, matron and criminal iios-
pital attendant. 

34. Competitive status for patrol-
man at Westfield and Albion. 

35. Allowance of all vacation and 
sick leave credits. 

36. Pay recognition for hazard-
ous employment. 

37. 25-year retirement for cus-
todial employees in the Correc-
tion Department. 

38. Deferred retirement benefit. 
39. Cost of hospitalization, paid 

by the State. 
40. Minimum retirement allow-

ance. 
41. 25-year retirement for aH 

Mental Hygiene employees. 
Conference officers 

Conference officers, in addition 
to Mr. Lamb, are: John D. O'Brien, 
1st vice president; William Nelli-
gan, 2nd vice president; Catherina 
Glass, 3rd vice president; John 
Ward, 4th vice president; Robert 
L. Soper, treasurer, and JosepU 
Grable, sergeant-at-arms. 

Grievance Plan 
(Continued from Page 1) 

want to cover in your procedure. 
As indicated above, the Griev-

ance Board is empowered to adopt 
rules and regulations. I am sure 
that any suggestions you may have 
as to appropriate rules and regu-
lations will be welcomed by the 
Board.' 

Indorsed by CSEA 
State employees are showing 

keen interest in the new grievance 
settlement plan. The Civil Service 
Employees Association has indorsed 
it, although it would like to see 
some aspects improved. 

State Promotion Exams Now Open 
1117. ASSISTANT TELEPHONE 

ENGINEER (Prom.), Department 
of Public Service, $5,360 to $6,-
640. 

1118 ASSISTANT HYDRAULIC 
ENGINEER (Prom.), Department 
of Public Seivice, $5,360 to $6,-
6 i 0 . 

1119. SUrEItVISING MOTOR 
C.^KUIEU REFEREE (Piom.), 
Department of Public Service, 
$7,300 to $8,890. 

1120. DEPUTY CHIEF ENCIN-
EEK (BRIDGES) (Prom.), De-
IJartnient of Public Works, $13,-

570 to $16,000. 
1121. HE.\D CLERK (PAY-

ROLL), (Prom.), Department of 
Social Welfare (exclusive of the 
institutions), $4,350 to $5,460. 

1122. S E N I O R L I C E N S E I N -
VESTIGJVTOR (Prom.), Albany 
ofTlce, Division of Licenses, De-
partment of State, $4,830 to $6,-
020. 

1123. SENIOR T.4X VALUA-
TION ENGINEER (Prom.), State 
Board of Equalization and Assess-
ment, $6,590 to $8,070. 

1121 SUPERVISING PSYCHI-

ATRIST (Prom), Institutions, 
Departments of Mental Hygiene 

1110. P R I N C I P A L STENO-
GRAPHER (Prom.), Civil Service 
Department. $3,540 to $4,490. Last 
day to apply, Friday, Sepieml>cr 
20. 

1906. PRINCIP.U. KEY PUNCH 
OPERATOR (Prom.), upstate area. 
Division of Employment. $3,540 to 
$4,490. One vacancy in Albany. 
One year aa senior key punch 
operator or senior office machine 
operator (key punch.) Pe« $3. 
(Friday, Septeoiber 

Subsistence Talks 
(Continued from Page 1) 

private industry points toward ft 
10 cents-per-mile minimum. 

There has been no overall re-
vision of mileage and substinenca 
allowances in more than four 
years. 

However, Association effort* 
promise to bear fruit on this mat-
ter. First meetings with the Comp-
troller's office are expected to b« 
held this month. 

The Association has prepared a 
factual argument to support th« 
need for adjustments and will sub-
mit these facts at the first meet-
ing. 

The State has made no definlt® 
offer on readjustment but its will-
ingness to meet with Association 
representatives to try and iron out 
the present inequities indicate* 
some settlement will be reached. 

2 N A M E S O N W E S T C H E S T E R 
L I S T F O R P E R S O N N E L J O B S 

ALBANY, Sept. S — Anne H. 
Russell of Scarsdale and Law-
rence Greene ot Lewlsboro coin-
prise the Westchester county eli-
gible list for personnel technician. 
Department of Personnel. Six per-
sons had applied for Uie $4,l!j« 
jobs. 

For an analysis of civU servle* 
news, read H. J. Bernard's weekir 
problems in the forefront ot th« 
column. "Looking Inside^" S « « 
P a x e 2. 


