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Albany Upsets Alfred 7-6 

I 

by Bruce Maufn 
"Trie best of the Eait, the beat of 

the East" was the chant out of the 
Danes locker room after the football 
team defeated Alfred 7-6 in their 
biggest game ever. Water flowed like 
champagne over the mud-caked 
tired bodies of the players as there 
was exuberance all over the 
locker-room. 

The players had every right to 
boast as they beat one of the best 
sjnall college football teams in the 
East and this resulted in the Danes 
being ranked second only to Ithaca 
in the weekly Lambert Bowl voting. 

The game was decided for all in­
tents and purposes on one play. 
Alfred has just scored, leaving them 
one point behind with six and a half 
minutes to go. The Saxons choose to 
go for a two point conversion. If con­
verted it would have given Alfred the 
ballgame, as Albany's offense .was 
going nowhere. 

Alfred quarterback Chris Kristolf 
fired the ball but Albany's secondary 
converged to knock the football 
away from an open receiver to keep 
Albany in front. When questioned 
about Alfred's strategy Coach Ford 
said "In that situation you must go 
lor the win. I would have done the 
same thing." 

It was the defense that won the 
game lor the Danes. Led by pro 
prospect KudyVido, the defense was 
spectacular, allowing Alfred only 
three first downs in the second half. 
They constantly bottled up the Sax­
on's running attack with their great 
pursuit and the defense completely 
shut oil Alfred's highly touted pass­
ing attack. The secondary was o'lit-
siauding as Hilly Drown. Arnie Will 
and Donnie Minn all had u hand in 
key fumble recoveries or intercep­
tions. 

Defensive star Rudy Vido 
couldn't have been any happier with 
the game. "We played our finest op­
ponent ever. We really got- it 
together. The team moved well to the 
ball." 

Perhaps the biggest defensive hero 
for the Danes was punter Mike 
Marrin. Marrin constantly put the 
Danes out of potential danger with 
his punts of about forty yards. 

On the offensive side, things were 
d i sma l . Alfred Coach Alex 
Yunevich's philosophy ort how to 
stop Albany's wishbone was simple: 
gel the quarterback. And that is ex­
actly what his team did, as Albany's 
starting signal caller John Bertuzzi 
was injured in the 1st quarter, put­
ting him out of action for a month. 

That left things up to sophomore 
quarterback Dave Ahonen. Facinga 
tough Alfred.defense, Ahonen, who 
had limited college experience, had a 
great deal ol trouble moving the bull. 
He fumbled the bull nine limes. 

"I tried'to do the best I could," said 
Ahonen alter the game. "I would like 
to try it on a dry day. Most of the 
fumbles were caused by a pretty wet 
field and Alfred's tough defense." 
Perhaps inexperience and ner­
vousness must also be attributed lo 
some of those fumbles. 

Bertuzzi Hurt 

I'lie game was played in a constant 
pouring rain. Coach Ford described 
the field's condition as "wetter than 
Hell." Alfred won the toss and 
elected to receive. This was a 
questionable move because of the 
poor conditions. 

Alfred's Scott Herring received 
the opening kickolf and moved up 
field with the hall. Hewasmelwilha 
jarring tackle by Arnie Will and the 
hall squirted loose. Ray Gay dove on 

the ball and the Danes had excellent 
field position inside the thirty. 

This was' the set-lip Ford was 
waiting for. Using the halfback op­
tion pass, he inserted Ahonen into 
the halfback's slot. The pitch went to 
Ahonen. His pass found Bob Baxter 
wide open in the end zone for the 
Danes'only score of the day. Kicker 

, Al Martin converted the extra point 
for what proved to be the margin of 
victory. 

From then on it was a defensive 
struggle. The third time Albany had 
the ball, they showed signs of mov­
ing us Bertuzzi was handling the 
wishbone excellently. But suddenly 
Bertuzzi was on the sidelines with an 
icepack on his dislocated finger and 
the spark seemed to go out of the 
Danes. Aside from a dropped puss 
by Baxter near the end zone, Albany 
mounted little offense the rest of the 
way. 

Thomas Scores 

filings really got hot in the fourth 
quarter. With the Danes facing a' 
third and long on its sixteen, thecal! 
was a quick kick. The pitch was poor 
and Alfred recovered on Albany's 
five. Three plays later the Saxons 
were only two yards closer. On 
fourth down Kristolf found Greg 
Thomas in the corner of the end zone 
and he made a great catch for the 
touchdown, lire missed two point 
conversion meant the game to 
Alfred. 

Vido Recovers 

Alfred had two other chances 
before the game was over. One ended 
when Vido recovered a fumble deep 
in Alfred territory. The Saxons final 
chance ended on a fake pun! which 
was studied out. Ahonen ran out 
the clock, as the fans counted down. 

The Albany football team In their muddy encounter with Altred. 
Above: The Danes try to advance the ball In the wet turl. 

Below: Alfred running Into a heavy Albany defense. 

Runners Stun Army 
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Cross-country star Vlnnta Rede, who I fourth Saturday 

by George Miller 
The Albany State cross-country 

team has once again proved their 
high caliber of running this past 
weekend by upsetting a powerful 
Army squad at a triangular match 
with Syracuse. 

It was a most rewarding and 
satisfying meet for the Albany 
harriers.as they have been looking 
forward to facing Army with a quiet 
determination ever since last year's 
defeat. The scoring done at 2 dual 
meets showed Albany topping Army 
25-32, while Syracuse came away 
with all the marblcsdowning Albany 
22-35 and Army 25-.16. 

"My God, it was a thrill, " ex­
claimed Coach Bob Munsey, "Army 
takes its losses really hard. It just 
floored them." 

The meet was ran over a 5.2 mile 
course and according to Coach 
Munsey, "A very, very hard course 

i to run." The limes were very sur­
prising however, despite the overcast 
conditions and strong, gusty winds. 

Army placed their two top men, 
^jjS. three year veteran Dennis Trujillo 
* • * and former New York Slate cham-

»•< pion Bob Alii/, across the line 
together with a winning time of 
27:17. Ca rl Dugan of Syracuse came 

in ihird while Co-captains Vinnie 
Keda and Carlo Chcruhino came in 
fourth and sixth respectively with 
times of 27:36 and 27:49. 

An indication of the im-
pressiveness of these times is shown 
by their ranking in the top 25 limes 
ever recorded over the Drumlins 
Golf Course, since its completion in 
1946. 

"Vinnie Keda with his time, ran 
hard enough to get 15th best." stated 
Coach Munsey while "Cherubino 
ran hard enough in gel the 19th best 
time ever." 

Very important places were 
grabbed lor Albany by Chris Burns, 
10th, with a time of 28:09, Herb 
Hason. I2lh, with a time of 28:31 
and freshman Steve Archer, 13th, 
with a 28:55. 

"It looks like an upset but the way 
we ran it, it wasn't, " said Munsey. 
Supporting this claim is the almost 
unbelievable fact that Albany placed 
five men ahead of Army's third! 

"We were undressed, showered 
and sleeping by the time they got 
their 4th and 3th men across," laugh­
ed Coach Munsey. 

Reflecting on the race, Munsey 
said, "They went.out like a bullet 
wilh a 4:45 mile on a hilly, 
windswept golf course. When I saw 

Cherubino and Keda leading the 
puck I just about lost my cookies 
right there. I thought, 'Man they've 
got it, they're loose, louk relaxed, 
but they're still under a lot of 
pressure.' Behind them were a string 
of Syracuse men and a few Army, 
They were running like they meant 
it. and they did. Keda was running 
against this Trujillokid and it was on 
tile last hill that Trujillo shot ahead." 

Unfor tunate ly as Munsey 
revealed, "Keda got a little lost on 
the way back. He took a wrong turn 
and Duggan just barely beat him 
out." However, Munsey mutter of 
faclly stated, "Vinnie Keda ran the 
best nice he's ever run." 

Albany was in striking distance of 
giving Syracuse the same medicine 
as Army, but Syracuse was able to 
stretch it out on the lust mile. In ac­
tuality, it was more of an inching 
tiway than a marching. 

"Herb Hason went absolutely 
crazy," said Coach Munsey. "He's a 
spurt runner, starting off slow and 
then he does a series of crazy 
accelerations. He passes a group and 
then drops buck and then passes 
another group. The couch up there 
said, 'Good'Lord, you're driving my 
kids nuts.' In this way he was con-
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Student Input In Tenure Decisions Threatened 
Sirotkin says, "It i» not the number* 

that make the difference. 

It is the quality of input" 

Patricia Buchalttr resigns as President of the Albany Chapter of Un­
ited University Professionals. 

by Bob-Mayer 
Student input into the tenure and 

promotion process on New York 
State campuses may be seriously 
diminished as a result of the latest 
two year agreement between the 
state and university professionals. 
However, there is varied opinion as 
to the extent of the erosion. 

A primaryrcason tor the different 
interpretations now being argued is 
the wordingof the pact. The contract 
clearly states that, "academic review 
shall mean a review and recommen­
dation by a committee of academic 
employees..." It does not explicitly 
deny students the right to participate 
in the evaluation and discussion 
processes preceeding a decision. The 
accord docs however prohibit their 

votes from being included with facul­
ty voles, thus limiting students to ad­
visory status only. 

Patricia Buchultcr, director of 
Student Activities recently resigned 
her position as president of the 
Albany chapter of the United Un­
iversity Professionals. She admits 
that her resignation was a personal 
decision stemming from a conviction 
that she could not simultaneously 
be "ii "advocate of student 
positions" and president of a union 
chapter. 

Ms. Buchultcr, who participated 

Council Voids Some Elections; 
Extends Others Through Today 

by Nancy Cook and Mike Sena 
Central Council voted Wednesday 

night to invalidate the Student 
Association commuter elections. 
They also voted to extend current 
voting on the quadsthrough today. 
Central Council and University 
Senate scatsareat stake in thcseelcc-
tions. 

In the commuter voting machine, 
names were not fixed so that they 
"slid back and forth," said Vice-
President Ira Birnbauni. He ex­
plained "you couldn't tell who voted 
for whom." 

Veiling was extended until Friday 
on the lour quads because the 
machine in Colonial could not be 
opened Tuesday. I'o make up for the 
lost day. Central Council decided lo 
have the SA elections extended until 
Friday on all quads. 

Along with the S A commuter elec­
tions, the class of'76 elections were 
also invalidated. In class elections, 
only that particular class is entitled 
lo vole. However, the class elections 
were held in the voting booths so 
that anyone who wauled lo could 
vole. Also, on Dutch quad, voters 
could HOI write in for the '76 elec­
tions, 

I'hcSA elections on Alumni quad 
were also invalidated because of 
illegal electioneering by many of the 
candidates. "A number of Alumni 
candidates" stood by the polls and 
tried to influence voters, said Birn-
huum. 

The person who is in charge of 
overseeing the elections, and making 
sure everything runs smoothly is 
Linda Weinslock. 

Last year Linda Weinslock was 

the president of the class of'75. For 
those who remember, Weinstock 
was a leading figure in the Miami 
Bus tickets scandal. Weinstock, 
allegedly reserved 6-8 free tickets for 
herself. "I can't scehowa person like 
that can be election comissioner," 
said one SA official. One SA leader 
called Weinstock "incompetent" 
and added that "she didn't know 
what to do." There was "a lack of 
organization not just on her part," 
said SA President Pal Curran. He 
added that "no one was trained to be 
election commissioner." 

In other Central Council business, 
the executive body debated whether 

. lo appropriate $500 and a $100 loan 
lor the November second United 
Way Drive, headed by l.ee Anne 
Roberts. 

llnilcd Way 

Roberts attended the meeting in 
order to explain thedrive lo Council. 
It will be the first time in the history 

of the United States that students are 
runningadi'iveol this kind. The Un­
ited Way helps groups such as boy 
clubs, girl clubs, (he Red Cross, and 
adoption agencies. Tentative plans 
for the day include a l.aSalle Varsity 
Basketball game, a Faculty Talent 
Show, and a dance in the Campus 
Center Ballroom. < 

Objections were brought up that 
tile goal was to raise $ 1000 and that 
SA would be giving $500 for ex­
penses. Some fell it would be "for­
cing the student body lo make a 
donation." 

Several members appeared to be 
annoyed ul Roberts' constant "I 
want...," "I've worked hard," and "1 
don't want to be cmbarassed if it 
fails." When Roberts was not receiv­

ing full-attention from Council, she 
stood up nearly a half-dozen times 
and said, "Listen to me, I'm talking. 
You want to know where the money 
is going." 

After discussion, the bill passed 10 
in favor, 3 against, and 3 abstained. 
When Miss Roberts departed, Pat 
Curran expressed his.disapproval of 
Council's behavior towards her and 
other people he brings in. Coun­
cilman Lew Hair replied dial Curran 
"should consider a little more than a 
nice pair of legs" before he brings 
people before Council. 

Executive Board' 
The major issues under Pal 

Cumin's President's Report were 
that the PSA Executive Board-
Michael B. Meyer, Jeff Sherman, 
Lew Burr, Ira llirnbaum, Allan 

. Spivack, and Howie Grossman had 
been approved; there will be a for­
mation ol an Inler-Quad Council lo 
have ihe quads work together and to 
advocate their interests lo SA: and 
thul there will again be segregated 
parking in the big lots. 

Four bills thai were introduced by 
Finance Committee passed. A $500 
supplemental appropriation was 
granted to theAlbany Stale Cinema 
su thai lliey could lower their prices 
lo 50c lor lax card holders. The 
fable Tennis Club and Italian.-
Ameriean Alliance were given 
budgets of $25. Chess Club was ap­
propriated a supplemental $65. 

Chairperson Coyne ended the 
meeting by announcing that Council 
wuuld have different guest speakers, 
including E, Norbert Zanm and 
possibly Mayor Corning, to com­
ment on various issues, 

in the negotiations with the state, 
related how the students were ex­
cluded from the process. 

"The union doesn't represent 
students, ll does not pretend to. 
When Ihe negotiators met with the 
union representatives there were a 
couple of back-to-thc-wall issues. 
flic union was inflexible on two 
issues; salary schedule and job 
security." She continued, "Albany is 
atypicaf in regard to student par­
ticipation on these committees. 
Generally it is encouraged. At the 
negotiations however job security 
was a major issue. And a majority of 
the negotiators were adamant 
against student participation." 

Buchultcr noted that since most 
campuses had little student input 
anyway, the intention may not have 
been to eliminate student input. She 
argues that more likely, the target 
was administrators, who like 
students are excluded from voting. 
Still, she admits that the effect is 
clear.' ''They (students) no longer 
have ihe vole." 

The former union president now 
urges students to prepare for the 
next contract in two years. "Takead-
vantage ol the two years. Make sure 
that there remains a real input. If you 
(students) think these things are 
wrong, now is the lime lo prepare. 
Now you must build the bridges to 
change the direction." 

Buchultcr's successor is Bruce 
Marsh, chairperson of the Universi-
tySenate'sCoucilon Promotion and 
Continuing Appointment (CPCA). 
Dr. Marsh has consistently defended 
student input into tenure and 
promotion considerations and now 
is chapter president ofaunionthal hs 
in ell eel wiped out student votes 
from certain levels of review. 

Dr. Marsh admits littleol thecon-
llict ol his predecessor. He notes that 
students on his council will remain 
members and the final votes on 
recommendations will be separated 
into faculty and student categories. 

In order to comply with the union 
contract and at the same time ac­
comodate students. Dr. Marsh said 
that CPCA will now be an advisory 
committee to the (president and the 
votes may he open at meetings, in­
stead ol secret ballots us they were in 
the past. 

Marsh does not believe students 
were seriously hurt by this latest con­
tract, even though their votes no 
longer are pa rt of the official record. 
He argues, "Students influence 
votes, Their suggestions are listened 
lo on committees and they have 
often influenced faculty members 
wilh their verbal arguments." He 
went on lo note lhal in addition to 
the direct input on the committees, 
student evaluations arc a vital aspect 
of the decision making process. 

Someone w h o agrees with 
Chairperson Marsh is Phillip 
Sirotkin. Ihe Vice-President of 

- Academic Affairs admits that it is 
rare that he finds himself, "on the 
sa me side of I he fence wilh students." 
As an administrator Sirotkin is also 
excluded from voting. 

"This doesn't eliminate student 
participation. I suppose if one wants 
to exclude students one can try lo 
make a case bill students still will be 
influential." Vice-President Sirotkin . 
has informed departments thai they 
arc not to interpret the contract as a 
signal to remove students. A notice 
to departments reads. "...The 
department or school shall provide 
lor its regular consultation with 
students and others in such a way" 
that will comply wilh the union 
agreement. He also informed the 
Deans of this university that there is 
to be no diminution of student in­
volvement. 

Sirotkin does admit thai the 
agreement has produced a "tough 
line lo wulk on". However he argues 
that in the last analysis students will 
have considerable impact. "It is not 
the numbers that make the 
difference. It isthequalilyol input." 

Many students do not agree with 
this view. They see the agreement 
reached between the State and the 
Union as a clear sign that they are 
not to be included in these 
procedures. Students Association 
President Put Curran summed up 
their sentiments. "We are told that 
we still have influence. We don't 
have the vote. I wonder how they 
would feel il the Albany campus was 
told by the other campus chapters 
that Albany could not vote but you 
could talk and he influential. What 
may he a bargain for the union is a 
raw deal lor us." 

Dr. Bruce M a n n , head e l a UntvanNy 
tenure, takes over tor 



Red Cross Relieves 
to Victims 

_ t h e Albany Area Chapter. Red Cross, has reported receiving $450.00 in 
disaster relief funds as of September 30th for victims of Hurricane Fifi which 
struck Honduras. 

American Red Cross disaster workers in Honduras reported that flood 
reliefassistanceover the weekend was able to reach many of the thousandsof 
hurricane victims, despite the communication and transportation problems' 
still ptaguihgsome sections of the disaster area.\ -=•-.. 

Some 63,000 storrri refugees are being fed and sheltered in seven Red Cross 
shelters throughout the country; while nearly 11,000 victims are being 
sheltered in neighboring San Salvador, which was also affected by hurricane. 

In addition loan initial American Red Cross contribution of $30,000 to the 
.Honduras Red Cross Society, the American Sjociety has received substantial 
contributions of funds, food; and supplies for themassivereiief operation. 
These include a check for $25,000 from International Business Machines; 
canned foods valued at $l6.000fromtheCampbellSoupCo.;and ISOcases 
first-aid supplies from Johnson and Johnson. 

Earlier this week, Ave thousand blanketspurchasedby the American Red 
Cross were flown to Honduras! as well as $7,000 worth of short-wave radio 
equipment to help the Honduras Red Cross.with communications between 
relief centers and 500 disposablefacc masks-Tor use by emergency workers-
removing bodies from the debris. 

MR. SUB 
232 Washington Ave. 

BUY TWO SUBS - GET ONE FREE 
with this coupon .' ' 

I We deliver on Sundays to the Uptown Dorms at 6, 8, & 10 p.m. I 
j Minimum order 3 sandwiches ! 

j Hot Hot Home of i 
j_^ejrtbdls__ _Sausjjges_ the_Mini-SubJ 

G&LEom etimz 
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Bulletins 
On Tuesday evening, October I. 

S74, at approximately 7:15 p.m., a 
femalestudenthitchhikerwas picked 
upon Western Avenue in Ihevicini-
ty of Brevator Street and driven to 
the campus. 

When shetried to exit the vehicle 
near the University PoliceOffice.a-
scuffleensucd. The vehicle sped off 
and the girl fell from the car injured. 
i The vehicle involved is generally 
described as a 1965-67 white 
Chevrolet with a black convertible 
top or hardtop. It was last seen go­
ing north on Perimeter Road toward 
Washington Avenue. The occupant 
of the vehicle was a white male, with 
brown hair,, a three or four-day 
growth of beard and wearing a blue 
T-shirt. 

Anyone having information 
regarding the above incident is re­
quested to contact a University 
Police investigator at 457-8204. 

The Open Release Policy for 
female • undergraduates will end 
on October 11,1974, at 5:00p.m. All 
women who wish releases must see 
their residence hall director and 
move out prior to October II. After 
this date, there will he no releases. 
The reason for this policy is the fact 
that female space is available on 
campus and we arc able to eliminate 
all the triples who have expressed a 
desire to de-triple and are willing to 
take our available space. 

Male undergraduates will still be 
allowed to break contracts. 

.. It's about 
the first time 

« _ you fall in love. 

Jeremy 
United Artists 

Friday 
Oct. 4 

LC1&2 

7:30 ,8 :30 . 

&9:30 

* ' 5 0 w i t h t m m a u r d $ 1 ' 2 5 w l t h o , l t 

Saturday Oct. 5 

?M$ 
"IS COMING TO TAKE YOU AWAY" 

LC18 p 
7:00,8:30, 

10:00 
$.50 with tax card $1.25 without 

NEWVORK(AP) A grave that for years went unnoticed and unintend­
ed received a simple bronze plaque Ihursday inanautumn chill. It belongs to 
Scott Joplin, the ragtime composer who died in 1917. 

"The songwriters of America take care of their own," said Walter Wager, 
public relationsdirector of the American Society of Composers, Authors and 
Publishers., "As soon as we heard the grave was unmarked, it was our 
responsibility to do this." 

STOCKHOLM, Sweden <AP)1 The award of the 1974 Nobel Prize for 
Literature to two relatively unknown Swedish authors touched all im­
mediate criticism Thursday night in Swedish literary circles. 

While authors Harry Martinson and Eyvind Johnson arc "important 
writers.'the decision to award them the prize was "disastrous," said fellow 
author and critic Sven Delblanc. 

"The rest of the international prestige miraculously retained by the prize 
will be wiped out by laughter and derision around the globe." he said. 

Delblanc said there was "no strong international opinion speaking lot them 
and the choice shows lack of judgment." 

The two, acclaimed at home but little known abroad, share tin award 
worth about $124,000. 

SANTO DOMINGO, Dominican Republic (AP)' Hungry and thirsty 
terrorists holding U.S.diplomat Barbara Hutchison and six others hostage 
inside the sweltering Venezuelan Consulate scrapped a $ I million ransom de­
mand on Thursday. 

They offered instead to take political asylum in Mexico ol Peru, ami 
modified an earlier demand.that 37 political prisoners be Treed from Ilk-
Dominican jails to join them They said they would accept fewer, hut didn't 
say how many. . 

There was no immediate response from the governinenl which already has 
offered to lly the gunmen out of the country, but insisted it will not meet am 
other demands. 
LIMA, Peru (AP)'A violent earthquake jolted central Peru today, causing 

extensive damage and panic. Radio reports said three persons were killed ami 
38 injured in Canelc. 120 miles south of Lima. 

Radio Cruz del Sur said almost half the houses in the city were unvdc 
because ol cracked walls and water seepage. Canete has a population ol 
about 5000. 

LONG BEACH, Calif. (AP) Former President Richard M. Nixon angrily 
cursed anews photographer who tried to photograph him in a hospital cor­
ridor today, the photographer and witnesses said. 

Kent Henderson of the Long Beach Independent Press Telegram said Nix­
on's face contorted and he yelled, "You god-damn son-of-a-bitch" when he 
saw the photographer waiting outside an office where Nixon had just com­
pleted tests. 

Henderson said he was so shocked he didn't get off a picture before an 
attendant whirled Nixon's wheel chair around and pushed him back into the 
office he had been leaving. 

Henderson said he heard the corridor doors crash against Nixon's 
wheelchair as he was wheeled away. 

The incident occurred early this morning after Nixon was taken from his 
sixth-floor room at Memorial Hospital Medical Center of Long Beach to the 
first floor nuclear medicine division to continue tests to determine the cause 

-i of his phlebitis. 
NEW VOKK(AP) It appears New York State hasan adequate supply "I 

gasoline and fuel oil for the winter months, but a shortage of coal or natural 
gas could result in an over-all tight fuel supply, a spokesman for the 
Emergency Kucl Office said Thursday. 
"Gas and fuel oil appear to be in adequate supply lor the winter." said Keith 
Roland, couscl to the office. 

"Hut if there is a coal problem or if natural gas gets interrupted this year. 
people arc going to be looking lor alternate fuel sources and they're going to 
be converting to oil. 

"So there may be more demand for fuel oil and if that's the case wc could 
begin to see some over-all lightness in fuel supplies." 

Hut Roland said spot shortages of fuel oil could be alleviated by state "sct-
asides," or reserve allocation. 

"Our biggest concern tight now is coal. At the moment the situation is 
bleak to dismal," Roland said noting that 80,000 homes in the state wcie 
heated by anthracite coal. He said it has been difficult getting both anthracite 
and bituminous coal from Pennsylvania. 

"II there's a miners' strike in November, we're going to have a senoiis 
problem. About 15 per cent of the energy in this stale is generated by coal and 
tl utilities have trouble getting it we're going o have great difficulty tins 
winter," hesnid. 

KIAMESHA LAKE, N.Y. (AP)Gov. Malcolm Wilson describing hiniscll 
as a "long-time friend of labor," received a cool welcome from stale union 
leaders Thursday us he appealed for their support in the upcoming election 

" I he record is there for you to look at," Wilson said. "I don't make phony 
promises and I don't make phony claims." 

But the Republican governor, addressing the annual convention of the 
.State AH.-CIO, drew only unevenapplause-at one point he waseven hisscd-
as he recited a list of his labor accomplishments. 

The 1,800 delegates begun a three-day meeting at a resort hotel in this 
taukill Mountain community to consider their endorsements for the 
statewide offices in the Nov. 5 election. And they appeared rendu to back 
Wilson s Democratic opponent, Rep Hugh L. Carey. 
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Civil Liberties Union Head Attacks Rocky's Drug Law 
bj Betty Stela 
- "If organized crime hail a lobby in 
New York State," speculates Ira 
Glasser, Executive Director of the 
New York Civil Liberties Un-
ion,"they'd lobby for Rocky's new 
drug law." 

Mr. Glasser made this comment at 
a meeting of the Albany NYCLU 
chapter last Monday night in Chan-. 
ning Hall and was referring to the 
way in whicn tormer Governor 

Rockefeller's'tough new drug law 
has had the predictable effect of put­
ting away mainly small time sellers 
and users of hard drugs, while leav­
ing the big dealersand smugglers vir­
tually untouched. 

Glasser aims al heroin 
- Glasser, an articulate speaker who 
has been lobbying against this new 
law since its conception, made tome 
startling and thought-provoking 
statements concerning the drug that 
this law was aimed at: heroin. 

Thieu, Amnesty 
And Aid Assailed 

by Ed Moser 
On Wednesday about two dozen 

people staged a so-called silent 
demonstration at the front of the 
Capitol Building in Albany. The 
group, which brandished placards 
and passed out leaflets, questioned 
United States policy in regards to the 
Vietnam conflict. Demands were 
raised calling lor unconditional 
amnesty, an end to the torturing of 
political opponents by the Thieu 
regime, and a halt to American aid to 
South Vietnam. 

There were three official sponsors 
of the event. These were the Inter­
national Women's League of 
Friendship unci Peace, a local 
Quaker organization, and Albany 
Slate's Peace Project. A few in­
terested outsiders joined the 

members of these groups in the 
protest I (the participants were mixed 
in age; most were students although 
there were about a half dozen people 
in their fifties and sixties). 

Ihe demonstrators seemed to 
realize that their efforts would 
probably go unheeded. "Well, we 
won't affect the government very 
much, but someone has to at least 
make some kind of stand," said one 
protester. 

The peaceful, uneventful rally 
lasted for an hour, from twelve to 
one in the afternoon. Throughout it 
there fell a rather heavy rain, which 
kept down attendance and plagued 
the efforts of certain reporters, who 
could not writedown any comments 
about the affair on their drenched 
writing pads. 

Wim FtoNi Hie Timl Uotejjwto w (lie WvM' 

Pine Hills 
Wine & Liquor Store, Inc. 
mon - sat gift wrapping 

9 am - 9 pm 

482-1425 

chilled wines 

free delivery 

870 Madison Ave 
Quit above Ontario St.) 

"Heroin is, in fact, a rather bland 
drug," claims Glasser, Unlike 
alcohol, nicotine, and over-eating, 
heavy doses of heroin over 20 years 
time, under legal and safe con­
ditions, has no degenerative effects. 
What makes this concept so difficult 
for most people to understand says 
Glasser. is the stereotypic image of 
the heroin user that has been foisted 
upon today's citizens by various 
public relations agencies. 

Illegality of drug, not drug Itself 
Despite what most people think, it 

is the illegality of the drug itself, that 
has actually forced its users to live 
the way they do. And similarly, it is 
the illegality of the drug that 
prevents it from being regulated in 
any way. One result of this is that 
heroin sold on the street is generally 
only about 2% pure, the rest of it be­
ing harmless powder or sometimes 
other drugs which injected with 
heroin, can be fatal. In fact, accor­
ding to Glasser, it is usually this 
lethal mixing of other drugs with the 
heroin that produces symptoms 
erroneously termed by doctors as an 
overdose. Tests have shown that it is 
exceedingly difficult to get an over­
dose of heroin and virtually impossi­
ble to do so with the watered-down 
mixture that is sold on the street. 

In ths past, heroin was sold over 
the counter as a tranquilizer and 

pain'killer. Not until the early 20th 
century was the drug-made illegal,*: 
And strangely enough, it was not un­
til the early 20th century that its 
usage and subsequent addicition 
became a big social problem. In fact, 
there were more heroin addicts in 
our country during the 18th and 19th 
centruries than there are today. 
However, in those days, heroin ad­
diction was viewed no differently 
than alcoholism or nicotine addic­
tion are today. The difference that 
has made the heroin addict a 
national problem, according to 
Glasser, is the illegality of what he 
does: "The law creates the criminal-
in fact, the law creates the crime." 

"Crime without complaints" 

The usage and/or selling of heroin 
is what Glasser refers to as a "crime 
without complaints." In other 
words, it is a private type of crime, 
meaning that the police must resort 
to various techniques of surveillance 
(i.e. wiretapping) in order to enforce 
it. Glasser feels that, for this 
reason, in addition to the facts that it 
has failed to prohibit its usage and 
has created a black market, our pre­
sent drug law should he done away 
with. 

Recent attempts by luw makers to 
deal with the drug problem by for­
cing the addict to go through 

w i t h d r a w a l p r o g r a m s o f 
"questionable value or by in­
carcerating him have served only to 
compound the problem, claims 
Glasser. 

Rocky's reason? PoUtfcs 

Citing Rocky's new -"get tough" 
law as a prime example of this, 
Glasser went on to comment upon 
the real reason for malting this law: 
politics. Glasser claims that, before 
this law was ever conceived of. 
Rockefeller had private polls taken 
which showed that the two greatest 
fears today's citizens have are crime 
and drugs. Asa result. Rocky came 
up with what turned out to be One of 
the toughest drug laws in the nation, 
reasoning that people would now see 
him as a grass roots politician con­
cerned about coming to grips with 
today'sdrug problem. Although it is 
difficult to say exactly how 
successful he was in creating this im­
age, it is apparent that it has by no 
means crippled his political career. 

"I think our treatment of the drug 
problem in this country is a type of 
muss hysteria." says Glasser. Accor­
ding to him. the only way wc can 
really alleviate this problem is by 
dealing with iton a more logical and 
realistic level, instead of projecting 
our own ignorance and fears on its 
victims. 

Ukrainian Ice Festival in Troy 
Mostly Soviet, Durback Alleges 

by Kick McKobert 
Last week at the RP1 Fieldhouse, the Ukrainian. 

Festival on Ice was presented as an opportunity for 
Americans to become acquainted with one aspect of the 
Ukrainian culture. But some felt the audience was 
witnessing an illusion of cultural independence. 

Andrew Durbak, a member of the Ukrainian Con­
gress Committee, said that when he asked the promoter 
of the festival in Troy how many Ukrainians were actual­
ly in the show, the answer was "almost all." But upon in­
specting the list of names on the program, Mr. Durbak 
concluded that only six out of the eighty performers were 
definitely Ukrainian. There are such performing troupes 
all over the USSR, burtfisTead of sending one that is all 
Ukrainian, the Soviets have sent performers from 
different countries within the Soviet Union and called it 
a Ukrainian festival. Durbak compared it to presenting a 
German festival direct from England. 

Asked what difference this makes so long as the Ukrai­
nian culture is accurately reflected, he said, it is a very 
entertaining show but only a few of the routines are 
Ukrainian, the rest being primarily Russian. The Rus­
sian Hag hung conspicuously over the spectators rather 
than its Ukrainian counterpart. It is also a fact that the 
show is only being performed in minor cities where the 
Ukrainian population is low. 

They wouldn't dare put it on in New York, said Dur­
bak, but it is safe here where probably only a couple hun­
dred of the Capitol District's five thousand Ukrainians 
will go. The main point is that the people of Ihe Ukraine 

are suppressed in their efforts to maintain a national 
identity, and this show is a clear misrepresentation of 
current domestic affairs of the USSR. 

Durbak gave some information on the Ukrainian 
problem. In the minds of most Americans, the Soviet 
Union is considered one country, which'therefore has 
one culture/Actually, fifteen separate countries formed 
the Union of Soviet Socialist Republics after the first 
World War. When these countries..won independence 
from Czarisl Russia in the chaotic 1917-1918 period, the 
newly Communist Russia took over its neighbors. 

Today these countries arc nothing more than colonies 
of the Soviet Union, unlike Poland and East Germany 
which are Communist but not part of the Soviet Union. 
The process of Russification. that is, the organized 
spreading of Russian culture to all parts of the USSR is 
still incomplete. For example, when college students 
graduate, they arc usually sent to countries other than 
their own to work. 

In this manner, they are forced to adopt the language 
and other cultural aspects dominant in their new home. 
Russian efforts to suppress independent cultures has in­
cluded the arrests of over 560 artists and writers in the 
Ukraine between 1970and 1973. The New York Timesin 
an editorial of September 12. 1974. addressed itself to 
this problem and, in siting thcimprisonmenl of Valentyn 
Moroz and Leonid I'lyushch us prime examples, has 
warned the Soviet Government that the world will not 
tolerate such gross violations of human civil rights much 
longer. i 
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Remember Us? 
We started it all. 

Cl,e 

Outs'ibc 

inn 
334 WASHINGTON AVE. 

A jammin' bar 

that you can still afford. 

CVHRV m? is A titt m "7 

INDIA 
HANDICRAFTS 
Unique and UIHISU.II IJIII shop In Albany 

Importers of desirjnird silk and embroided 
(iti'Mi's, weiii'i it slylti mem' and ladles, shirts 
and pleasant gifts for 

STUDENTS and EVERYBODY 

Presenting a complete line of variety of Indian 
Producls. 

Ai« direct importer, our PRICES ARE IDEAL 

Be SURE TO STOP BY AND SEE THEM. 

. r-HONk (iiiitwnMt^ 
i - Man. - **i. - ew • J oo r.H. 1 111 

TTai >nwt lillMfM I j g 
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Shop Rite Ike Cheapest C^tiiMtiYPIRG 
> Grabi Prmtacti 

White bread 
' Corn Hikes 

Spaghetti 
Flour, 
Sugar 
Cookies-Cream Sand. 
Mtats/Ftt •• -
Bottom-Round Roast 
Ground Chuck 
Bacon 
Pork Chops-Center 
Whole Fry. Chicken • 
Cod Fillet-Frozen 
Tuna Fish-Can > ' 
Dairy 
Eggs-Ur.A-Large 
Margarine-Slick 
Butter-Slick 
American cheese 
Ice Cream 
Whole Mild 
Skim Mild Product 
Fralls/Vegclablcs-Fresh 
Apples 
Bananas 

Lettuce 

Potatoes-while 

Green Beuns 

QUANTITY . 

I lbi 602. 
12 o i . . 
1 lb. 
3)b; 
5 lb. 
IS at. 

1 lb. 
1 lb. 

' 1 lb. • 
1 lb. 
1 lb. 

-: Tib. 
6<A or.. 

Idoz. 
l ib . 
l ib. 
Hot. 

5* g a l 
I q l . 
Iq l . 

1 lb. 
1 lb. 
1 head 
Sib. 
1 lb. 

Frulls/V«tetahl«s-Proctmd 

Frozen Orange Juice 

Fruit Cocktail-Can 
Green peas-can 

Vegetable Soup-Can 

Cooking Oi l 

Beverages 

Coll'ee-Cun • 

t o l a Drink-8 I'ack 

Beer-* Puck 

Total 

Criffce-Miite 

Inslanl Coltcc 

Yogurt (Strawberry) 

(irahnni Crackers 

NeslliivQuick 

llavvaiiaii Punch 

Cup-a-Soiip (Chicken) 

Pcatiui Hullcr 

leu 
Ketchup 

Mustard 

Cottage Cheese 

Cucumbers 

lung (orange) 

Soap (Ivory) -

Mayonnaise 

Liquid Snap 

Hleach 

1 issues 

Bathroom tissue 

Soup Puds 

Detergent 

T O T A L 

• Items on Sale 

12 oz. 
1 lb. loz. 
1 lb. 1 oz. 
IOW oz. 
24 oz. 

1 lb. 
6-12 oz. Can 
'ft-12-oz. Can 

-•.-•J Jiwu' ii. 
I I oz. 

4 oz. 

Km. 
1 lb. 

1 lb. 

46 oz. 

1.5 oz. 

12 oz. 

48 hags 

20 oz. 

9 oz. 

1 lb. 

2 
1 lb. 2 oz, 

V oz. 
32 oz. 

.12 fl. oz, 

.12 n. w.. 
20(1 tissues 

1 roll 
10 pud box 

49 oz. . 

GRAND 
.UNION 

$;4»-.53 
.43 

.»-.49 

.93-.W 
2.03-2.13 
.6Sr.79 

" 2 . 1 9 . 
1 1.29 
1.19-1.89 

1.79 
.65 
1.29 

.5S-.73 

.89 . 
.69-.8S 
.88-99 
.S9-.75 

.99-1.79 
.19-.4I 

.41 

.49 
,2S 
.49 

.69-1.19 
.49 

.43-.6.1 

.4S-.47 

.3I-.4I 

.I9-.2I 
1.09-1.19 

1.09-1.39 
.89-1.25 
.99-1.63 

$26.56 
<' l l t j i 

S.69 

1.06-1.49 

• ..1.1-..19 

.79 
, . '79 

'.45-,4'J' 

' :5.1 

.55-.6.1 

.67-.7.1 

.5I-.55 

•.I7-.2I 

.6.1-.67. 

,. .39 

1.15 

.19 
1.05-1.29 

.59-1.05 

.25-..1I 

..19-.45 

.2.1 

.35 
.85-1.15 

SI2.6I 

A*P 

.57 
.37-.43 

.43-.49 

.H5-.93 

1.99-2.03 

.73-.79 

1.39 
1 1.19 • 

1.39-2.09 

1.59-1.79 . 

.49 
1.49 

.S7-.69 

. 8 7 T . 8 9 

.54-.8.1 

.87-.97 

.69 
.95-1.79. 

.37-.4I 

..17-.4I 

..19-.68 

.19 
.39 
,59 
.49 

.4.1-.67 

.S9-.65 

..10-..1.1 

.24-,26 

1.1.1-1..15 

1.1.1-1.49 

I..1.1 

1.05-1.6.1 

25.96 
3 MX 1 I 

. - i .95 
I.I9-I..19 
•3.1-.45 

.S9-.75 

*.73 . 

.45 
'.47 

.53-.6.1 

'.G5-.75 

.49-.5S 

.21 
.6.1-.67 

.38 
1.09 

•.17 

1.05-1.29 

.99-1.05 

*.25-.29 

•..15-.45 

.22 
..15-..19 

•.95-1.0.1 

1.1.02 

A L B A N Y 

P U B L I C 

M A R K E T 

.39-.S7 

.45 
•4.1-.49 

.75-.S9 

1.99-2,09 

.6S-.99 

1.49 

1.29 

.99-1.89 

1,79 

.59 
1.29 

.55-.59 

.89 
.65-.8.1 

.89-.99 

.75 
.95-1.79 

.39-.4I 

..15-.4I 

.59-.S9 

.21 
/ .29-..1.1 

.99 

.89 

..19-.65 

.4.1-.45 

.25-.3.1 

.27-.29 
1.09-1..15 

1.09 -1.19 
1.33 

.98-1.6.1 

26.32 

.75 
1.4.1-1.59 

.25-.4.1 

.59-.79 

.73 
' .47 

.49 
.5S-.59 

.S9-.69 

,49-.55 

.25 
.67-.69 

.29 
1.19 

.1.1 

.99-1.15 

1.09 

.25-,! 1 

'..13-.45 

.IK-.2I 

•3.1-.37 

•.79-1.09 

12.83 

P R I C E 

C H O P P E R 

.39-.5S 

• .61 
•38-.4S 

.79-1.18 

1.96-2.06 

.77 

I.W. " 
1.29 ' 

.98-1.79 

1.59*. 

. 7 9 ' 

1.29 

.4I-.73 

.89 
.5B-.77 

.D6-.96 

.49-.69 

.87-1.59 

J7-.42 

.34-.32 

• 30-.50 

.20 
J9-.49 

.69 
.39 

..17-.59 

.44 
.27-.32 

.20-.25 

.99-1.57 

.78*1:39 

.86-1.18 

1.19-1.65 

24.61 

mi l 1 •'"> 

.77 || 

.77-1,49 

,12-,14 

.77 

.76 
.49 
.5.1 

.S2-.5H . 

,59-,67 

,49-,57 

.I7-.20 

.6.1-.66 

.29 
1.07 

.17 
.96-1.06 

.29 
..19-.49 

.20 
.33-.14 

.91-1.07 

11.91 

SHOP 

R I T E 

139 
.37 

.39-53 

.S9-.99 

2.09 

.67-.7S 

1.69 

.99 
.89-1.69 

a. 
.59 
1.19 

49-.69 

.89 
.59-.S3 

.S3-.97 

.S9-.79 

.95-1.79 

.38-.4I 

.41 

.29-.49 

,23-.25 

.29-.49 

.89 

.49 

..19-.59 

.39-.45 

.35 

.23 
1.19-1.35 

.99-1.29 

1.25-1.33 

1.19-1.67 

24.6.1 
I I I - . ' II 

.75-,79 
1.119-1,47 

.25-..18 

.77 

.69 

.45 

.49 
.59-,65' 

..19-.7.1 

.4S-.55 

.25 

.62 

.29 
1.09 

.18 
.99-1.3.1 

.55-1.07 

.23-..19 

.31-.47 

..11-..17 

.89-1.19 

11.85 

Deep Throat 
(C'l'SI-lf you're one of those ecology 
and convenience conscious persons 
who pulls the tub till your beverage 
can and then drops it in your drink, 
you may be in trouble some duy. 

According lo officials of the 
American College of Radiology 
(At 'R) . the accidental swallowing of 
tabs from heel and soft drink cans is 
becoming a serious medical 
problem. Occasionally, drinkers will 
accidentally swallow Ihe tabs, which 
will lodge in ihe gullet or esophagus 
and require emergency surgery lo 
remove. 

In other cases, the labs may lodge 
in Ihe stomach, or may puss com­
pletely through the body without 
harm, according lo Dr. Ilyron 
Hriigdon of ACR. 

In a related incident, doctors tit 
M.I) . Anderson , Hospital in 
Houston report a similar problem 
with swizzle slicks. Warning that 
such .licks should be removed from 
drinks before imbibing, Ihe doctors 
ohsuveu that "Ihe accidental inges-
titir ill swizzle slicks poses u definite 
hiizmd during the drinking of 
alcoholic beverages." 

State 
Photo 

SPECIAL 
OFFER 

5 x 7 COLOR 
ENLARGEMENT 

Only 3 9 f regular $150 

from a Kodacolor negative only I 

STATE PHOTO SUPPLY 

T h e 3 U N Y A local board o f the N e w Y o r k Publ ic Interest Research Group 

today recused the results o f a c o m p a r a t i v e f t i o d price survey that indicates!! 

$ 1 6 9 pr ic : range for comparable items in five a rea stores. 

Janet Si lverman, coordinator of the survey, said that she and five other 

S U N Y A volunteers surveyed f i f ty i t e m s a t a rea A & P , A l b a n y Public Market 

Grand U n i o n , Price Chopper and S h o p R i te stores. " W e used the mnrket-

baskct list prepared by the N e w Y o r k C i t y D e p a r t m e n t o f Consumer Affairs 

and in addi t ion, surveyed items that S U N Y A students frequently buy." The 

survey was conducted Fr iday , Sept. 2 7 , a n d S a t u r d a y , Sept. 28. 

S h o p R i te vs G r a n d U n i o n 

"For Ihe items surveyed." reported Terr iCiet i ie lsk i .a Social Welfare major, 

"wcdiscoVeredthat Shop Ri te charged the least overa l l , and Grand Union the 

most overal l , reflecting a 7 . 4 % difference in prices. She stressed, however, 

that the figure is only applicable for the to ta l cost o f those items surveyed 

" over the weekend. 

Another survey volunteer, W e n d y Schauber , r e m a r k e d that the greatest 

differences between individual items were pork ihops/cenimw which cost 

S1.79 per pound a l A lbany Public M a r k e t , but cost only $ I. IK per pmind at 

Shop Rite. 

Study St imulates C o m p e t i t i o n 

"The lowcsl prices for grocery items of c o m p a r a b l e size and quality, were 

chosen lo reflect theselectionol many consumers w h o arc now buying the 

least expensive goods of similar quul i ly , " said M i t c h Rosenblatt a Business 

Administration major, who also part ic ipated in the survey. 

"Personnel a l most of the stores surveyed were very helpful and 

cooperative,'' added llcne Swicklc. 

Susan Rutncr.unothcr volunteer, expla ined t h a i "publ ishing comparative 

price surveys is helpful to consumers in two major ways. First, they provide 

consumers with the knowledge o f where they can get grocery items al the 

lowest cost; and secondly, compet i t ion a m o n g stores is stimulated, having 

long range beneficial effects for consumers." she concluded. 

O n e o f Several Projects 

Thc'survey is but one of several projects being under taken this semester by 

S U N Y A students as members of the N e w Y o r k Public Interest Research 

Group. N Y I ' I R G is a non-prof i t , non-par t isan research and advocacy 

organization, funded and directed by N e w Y o r k State college and um'u'isin 

students. It concentrates on mai lers of general public interest, including con­

sumer find environmental protect ion, health care, human rights, and govern­

ment reform. 

Individuals wishing to volunteer for next month's survey should contact 

. land Si lverman, .108 Van Cor t l and . Du tch Q u a d phone 457-7807 or Chris 

Aidi in . Indian Q u a d , phone 457-5.155; 

SHARE THE RIDE 
WITH US THIS 

WEEKEND 
AND GET ON 

TO A GOOD THING. 
Us means Greyhound, and a lot pf your fel low students 

who are already on to a good thing. You leave when you 

like. Travel comfortably. Arrive refreshed and on time 

You'll save money, too, over the increased air 

fares. Share the ride with us on weekends. Holidays 

Anytime. Go Greyhound. 

GREYHOUND SERVICE 
TO 

ONE­
WAY 

ROUND- YOU CAN 
LEAVE 

New York $»•"" 
Buffalo $10.55 
Rochester $8,70 
Syracuse $5.40 

TRIP 

$15.20 

$20.05 

$16.55 

$10.30 

4:oo p.m 
5:15 pin 

'4:00 pm 
4:00p.ni) 

YOU 
ARRIVE 

6:50 put 

ll:4u"pm 

10:10 pin 

7:55 pill 

Ask your agent about additional departures and return trips 
leaves from SUNYA circle every Friday 
lickcls on sale across from Check Cashing 
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Mat Unrolled for Community-University Day 
The welpome mat is being readied 

on the campus of State University of 
New York at Albany for the third an­
nual Community-University Day on 
Saturday, Oct, 5, when attendance ' 
is expected to top last year's mark of 
more than 12,000 people. Open 
house activities will begin at 10:30 
a.m. and continue until 5:30. 

President Louis T. Benezet has 
issued an invitation to the communi­
ty at large to attend and enjoy the 
more than 125 events scheduled. 
Said President Benezet, "For this 
third annual Community - Universi­
ty Day we should like to think that 
many of our fellow citizens have 
visited Ihe SUNYA campus and 
know something of its attractions. 
Like any human show, it changes 
from year to year. We hope you will 
come back and bring your families. 

"For the newcomers to the region 
or to the University Center", he con­
tinued, "I offer the most cordial in-
vitiation to come and see for 
yourselves the almost endless ways 
in which a modcrncumpusis prepar­
ing young people for modern life and 
at the same time exploring the paths 
of new knowledge. We shall be 
delighted to welcome you on Satur­
day, October 5th". 

One of the many highlightsof the 
day will be an outdoor musical 
program entitled "Mostly Marches" 
to be presented by Ihe University 
Wind Ensemble at 1:30 p.m. on the 
Academic Podium. Charles Boito, 
of the music faculty, will conduct. 

Featuring a variety of both well-
known and lesser-known marches 
from a round the world, the program 
promises to be "rather spirited and 

invigorating," said Mr. Boito. He 
added that, the concert should have 

an added appeal by virtue of its being 
presented outdoor!.. 

The composers to be represented 
are Byrd, Beethoven, Hanssen, 
Strauss, Teike, APord, Sousa, 
Rossini, Williams, Bagley, Boc-
calari. Chambers, Fillmore, Fucik, 
Hall, Lithgow, Waner, Ives, King. 
Joplin, and Bidgood. The ensemble 
includes 45 woodwind, brass, and 
percussion players, 

Of particular interest in the 
department of chemistry will be a 
look at how chemical energy 
theoretically is converted into mo­
tion. Shown will be an original mo­
tion picture cartoon which 
represents the solution of the con­
tinuum equations of the mechanics 
of pseudopodium extension in an 
amoeba. The equations describe the 
conversion of chemical energy into 
momentum and motion of the 
pseudopod of the amoeba. 

The model corresponds to a 
mathematical transcription of the 
frontal contraction ideas of Robert 
D. Allen, professorofbiologyatthe 
university. The cartoon based on Ihe 
transcription is the work of Gary M. 
Odcll , assistant professor of 
mathemtiticsat Rensselaer Polytenic 
Institute, and Harry L. Frisch, 
professor ol chemistry at SUNYA. 
The three-minute film will be shown 
in room 151 ol th chemistry building 
every 15 minutes during the duy. 

Environmentalists will be at-
traclcd lo equipment on display for 
the exh ib i t , "Environmental 
Studies—From Earth to the Stars", 

dimension IIILIIAI'IIU Luxury 
FOUR I XCITING I H L A l H t S UNDER ONb ROOf ' 

->ni l ln«KMl.Ht»y«tm| 

T h * s c a n s * mska 'Last Tango 
In Parte' took Ilka a sixth a n d * 
dancing e t e H . " - N t o a m n t a i e i o 

PMarSchHMaMi 
Mover*Tlm« I "An Important film 

Nightly at 
7:20, 

n9:4Q 
* » ^ r i 

(THE MUTEST WILDLIFE ADVENTURE. 
FOR EVERYONE! 

m 

Nightly at 
7:15,9:10 

r.,^ iL. (HIGHEST MTIHGI" - , c _ » -
&• . * » SENSATIONAL!" F l i , Sat 
« Mr mum 6 . 5 5 ( 9 . 2 f y 

A HEART AND S O U . COMEDY CAN YOU D I G I T ? E 

JAMES EARL J O N E S , DIAHANN CARROLL 

7:oo. m/BMnnrrsrsim \ 
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C L A U D I N E 

CINE 12 3 4 
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prepared by Andrew J. .Yencha, 
assistant professor of chemistry. It 
includes a molecular beam ap-: 
paratus for study ing fundamental in­
teractions between molecular par­
ticles, an innerstellar simulator for 
the production oforitanicmolecules 
in innerstellar space, and apparatus 

used to investigate the structure of I 
molecular ions through spectoscopic' 
means. Locations of the exhibit are 
in B 26 and 131A in the chemistry 
building. 

More than 35 unitt of the univer­

sity nave scheduled in excess of 125 
events to be held throughout the day.-
Guided lours of the campus, by bus 

around the perimeter and on foot 
through the academic buildings and 
residence halls, will provide an in­
troduction to a wide variety of ac­
tivities. * / . 

Schedule of Activities for C-U Day 
Here are some highlights from C-U Day 

Adm Bldg-Ad 246 
2-4 Open House 

Arts Uldg. (iullery 
Ongoing Brass Exhibit 

Aim Sci. Hldg/ES 232 
Ongoing-Tornado Exhibit 

Campus Center 
2:00 Burundi Dancers 

Com. Ccn. CS-5 
10-5 Computer Tour 

Ed. Comm. Cen. I.C-25 
Ongoing-Media Presentation 

PAC. PAC2I.1 
11-4 Music Demonstration 

I'hy. Ed. Bldg. Pool 
10-11 Scuba Demonstration 

Res. Ounds-Col. Flag Rm 
10:30-12 Reception 

Hum. I.C-25 
11.1.3.4 Hum. I'hemc 

Ast. Bldg. ES 241 
Ongoing Space Exhibit 

Client Hlilg. CH-firsi floor and base. 
Every 15 min. Active Research 

lieu. Sci. I.C-21 
IU:3D-5:Jt) Movie 

Math. ES-I52A 
10-5 Math Films 

I'hy. I! 11-229 
10-5 teaching Labs 

Antliro. I-C 23 
11-3 Lectures 

Geo, Outside of l.C-13 
Ongoing Eco qui/ 

Urban Stud. I.C-13 
Ongoing Slide Shows 

History I.C-25 
10:311-10:45. Hitler Exhibit 

Psych SS-14.' 
Oogoing-EECi Demonstration 

Sue. I.C-24 
11:30-12 Lecture 

Allen Centcr-I'AC Ct. 
2:00 Forum 

Bus. BA-220 
10:30-1. Co. App. to Bus 

Crim. .lust. L'C-19 

10:30-12 Rape Discussion 

Education Ed-127 

12-12:45 Counseling 

Lib. Sci, UI . I I - IOI 

I I .12.1.2. Storytelling 

Nursing l.C-22 

11.1:30. Breast Cancer 

1'uh AIT. LC-3 
2-3:30 Election Issues 

Social Wei. LC-5 

11.12.1.2. Film 

Health Ser. 10-4. Tour 

Inter. Programs. Library 

Ongoing Display 

Library. Muin Enl. 

10:30-5:30 lour 

ISA Lib. Red Carpet Lounge 

11.2. Moroccan Belly Dunce. 

Univ. College I.C-I I 
1:30-2:30. Sue. Sec. Number 

Admissions l.C-20 
11-12, 2-3 Panel Discussion 

FSA (Food Ser.) C C Calc ic™ 

X-.l Food 

Common Interests 
Highlighted Tomorrow 

by W e n d y Asher 

Communi ty -Un ivers i ty D a y is a 

one day mara thon which a ims ut 

br inging the school and the local 

c o m m u n i t y closer together. T h e 

third annua l C - U D a y is Sa turday , 

October 5. 

Lately the University and the c o m ­

muni ty have been experiencing 

many differences, C - U D a y is not 

designed to help solve pol i t ical 

problems directly. O n the cont rary , 

as explained by Sorrel l Chesin. the 

coord inator , i l is hoped that c o m ­

mon interests wil l be expressed 

rather t h a n local A l b a n y social 

issues, which tend to divide the U n ­

iversity and communi ty . Problems 

Hftar l G f ta r "'rw *****0M'5 

LARGEST A N D MOST COMPLETE SELECTION 
OF HEAD GEAR IN THE NORTHEAST AT THE 
LOWEST PRICES AVAILABLE ANYWHERE. 

Handmade Leather Goods 
COATS, JACKETS, CHANGE PURSES, BELTS, 
SHOULDER BAGS, WINESKINS CLOGS, 
SANDALS, TERRA FIRMA SHOES, BOOTS, 
WALLETS A N D KEY CHAINS. 

High Styled & Work Clothes 
O V E R A L L S , P A I N T E R ' S P A N T S , 
CARPENTER'S PANTS, JEANS, DENIMS, 1 £ 0 / 
CURDUROYS, S ICIL IAN PANTS, FLAIRS, • w / Q 
STRAIGHT LEGS, FLANNEL SHIRTS, f\CC 
SWEATSHIRTS, HOODED TOPS A N D W l T 
SWEATERS (CABLE KNITS, SHAWL COLLAR W I T H 
A N D WRAP-AROUNDS), I N D I A N SHIRTS A N D S T U D E N T 
TOPS, I D . 

21 CENTRAL AVE. 
THE NOftTHWAY MALL 

have not been met in the past and are 

not anticipated this year: 

This day al lows the communi ty a n 

oppor tun i ty to see the University in 

its workings. Dr . Chesin defines the 

ill 111 o f C o m m u n i t y - U n i v e r s i t y D u y 

as impar t ing an overwhelmingly 

positive experience o n the c o m m u n i ­

ty , wi th regard to the impact o f the 

University, the role ol education as 

a n inst i tut ion, and the importance of 

students us a group, part icular ly in 

the A lbany communi ty . T h e interac­

t ion between the communi ty a n d 

University is the d o m i n a n t theme of 

the day. 

Dr . Chesin. serving as the over-a l l 

coord inator , volunteered for this 

posit ion three years ago and fius 

assumed the role ever since. H e is 

supported this year by D r . S c h m i d t , 

as program cha i rman. M r . V u n -

D y k c , c h a i r m a n for publ ic i ty . 

A u d r e y S e i d m a n u n d Ra lph Heislcr, 

as co-chairpersons of the services 

subcommit tee and many others in 

organiz ing this event. T h e y have met 

w i t h m u c h c o o p e r a t i o n f r o m 

members of both the communi ty a n d 

the Universi ty . Most o f the services 

a n d equipment needed has been 

volunteered by various members o f 

the University. 

Serving as o n e o f the few Univers i ­

ty cumpus-widc opportuni t ies lo i m ­

prove relations between the c o m ­

muni ty and the Universi ty , D r . 

Ches in expressed t h a t . " Ihe O p e n 

House garners support f r o m al l U n ­

iversity members: students, facul ty , 

a n d stuff, jo ined together to host the 

publ ic. Being a public university, it 

is our obl igat ion, responsibil i ty, a n d 

c o m m i t m e n t to reach out to the 

c o m m u n i t y , " 

T h e c o m m u n i t y reciprocates by 

suppqrtir lg $ U . N V A . In ureas such 

ns Communi ty -Serv ice and local j o b 

oppor tun i t ies , the c o m m u n i t y . In 

t u r n , reaches out to t$\e Universi ty . 

OCTOBER 4, 1974 ALBANY STUDENT PRESS PAGE FIVE 



it-

kll 
•i 

4 

C E N T R A ! STATION 
R E U A a E YOURSELF 
' 'kUttmGC&./laim, 

JP+mmlnyau/ HayMtwrtto 

Everybody Talks About Reprise 

Frank Zappa/Mothers 
Roxy & Elsewhere 
On DlicReal Rfcordi and Tapee 
Mir. Mil prica S9.9S (Tapaa 110.97) 

6.98 

489-8346 Mon.fri. 10-9 Sat 10-6 I j ^ P 
fSOIS OON'T ( A l l M i NOW 

LITTIE FEAT 
FLOWED DANCt. Japanese Fold Melodies. 

THE IRISH PIKES OF FINBAHFUHtY 

U ™ ! ^ E CLASSIC GUITAR IPresti 1 

^ g . W W K S FOR ORGAN, Vol 9. Woihs by 

-mob 
wxuwsui 

350 
Superb 
Records 

ea. rec. 

RAMNAD KRISHNAN: KACCHERI 
• A Concert ol South Indian Classical Music 

MOZART: Serenade No 4, K. 203i 3 Marches, H. 408 

MUSIC IN HONOR Of SI. THOMAS OF CANTERBURY 

H» 73006 BACH, B r W . „ b u „ C|M, m . ^ ^ 

yT -i ... 

I'M l" 

t* - ~**&j~ 

GBJE CLAHK 

1 NO 

BON WOODS 
I'VE GOT MY OWN 

ALBUM TO DO 
Include: Act Tbgfrthci/Shubv 

Rj ZUA Man/Am I Grooving %,, 

MBA 

BONNIE HAITI 
STHEETtrCHTS 

O 
IfHluilffti mi i l t jUauMjn Ifiol I'kiily 
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Handicapped students sponsor Awareness Day to dramatize archetectursl ImpetJirnsnts at SUNYA. 

Those Curbs Can Be a Big 
Step for a Wheelchair User 

The "Students for the Improve­
ment of Programs for the Han­
dicapped," (S.I.P.H.), at the SUNY 
at Albany Campus will be spon­
soring the Second Annual Campus 
Awareness Day on Thursday, Oc­
tober 10. 

Beginning the extensive day of in­
tended awareness of program and 
architectural impediments facing a 
disabled student attending SUNYA 
will be the Opening Day Ceremony. 
Scheduled to begin promptly at 9 
A.M. in front of the Campus Center, 
the ceremony will be centered 
around a panel of a dozen key ad­
ministrators and staff-all volun­
tarily in wheelchairs—who have 
been selected for the event as in­
terested representatives of respective 
campus areas of needed architec­
tural modification or program 
change. A wclcomeand introduction 
to the day's events will be given by Al 
De Graff, President of S.I.P.H. Ad­
dresses will then be given by Stephen 
Cotler, Project Coordinator of the 
S.U.N.Y. Construction Fund, and 
Dr. Louis Benezet, President of 
S.U.N.Y. at Albany. 

The remainder of the day will in­
clude activities and demonstrations 
aimed at the day's objective of bring­
ing awareness to the communities of 
the University and off-campus 
locale. Administrators, faculty, 
staff, and students will take part in 
two main day-long projects. Close to 
fifty wheelchairs have been donated 
from community organizations to 
enable as many of the University 
community to spend a full day of 
normal activities from wheelchair 
mobility. The second project, also 
involving volunteers, will enable the 
nondisabled to spend time about (he 
campus, "seeing" it as those with 
sight disabilities do each day. This 
will be made possible by outfitting 
those interested with visual 
occluders and white canes. These 
supplies as Well asexperi instruction 
regarding, their use, will be provided 
by personnel from an oil-campus 
agency for the visually impaired. 

An information center located in­
side the Campus Cenier will be 
manned by members of S.I.P.H,, 

professional faculty and staff 
members connected with rehabilita­
tion education and service for the 
campus, and members of the Wheels 
to Independence, a quite active off-
campus organization whose con­
cerns run much along with those of 
S.I.P.H. This information center 
will answer any questions regarding 
the architectural and programatic 
advantages and impediments facing 
a student with any physical disability 
attending SUNYA as well as those 
regarding handicaps and disabilities 
in general. 

Demonstrations of facilities and 
special devices which aid the dis­
abled student will also takeplace. At 
an afternoon time to be announced 
that morning, an awareness seminar 
will take place In the Campus Center 
Assembly Room for all interested. 
Questionnaires given to each 
volunteer of the two projects will 

provide information for further 
research of S.I.P.H. in its attempt to 
make the SUNYA Campus fully 
accessible to the disabled student. 

Mike Mullerand Phil Marino,co-
chairmen of the event, stress the im­
portance of booths in the Campus 
Center on October 7,8, and 9 for 
anyone who may wish to volunteer 

* for participation in either, or both, 
of the two projects. 

The State U nivcrsity of New York 
at Albany has become a leader, both 
nationally and internationally, in its 
many innovations to higher educa­
tion, say S. I. P. H. leaders. It is the in­
tention of Campus Awareness Day 
to add yet another dimension to this 
leadership: that of architectural and 
programatic accessibility to those of 
various physical disabilities who are 
seeking such an atmosphere which 
enables furthering an education to 
whatever level is desired. 

Non-Meat Eaten 
Knew It All Along 

(CPSKThe scientific establishment sprouted new support for i 
eaters recently with two reports on vegetarian diets-

According toa study by a committee of the national Academy of Sciences,. 
plants can yield "the same'nutritional value as high-quality animal protein 
foods if they are judiciously" combined. The report went on to explain that 
individual plants do hot contain protein with all eight of the essential amino 
acids, but that combining different foods (like cereal grains and beans) will 
yield complete protein equal in qualltv to meat. 

The greatest risk vegetarians face, the committee warned, comes from 
heavy reliance on a single plant food source like a cereajgrain or starchy root 
crop as |n the Zen Macrobiotic Diet. 

To ensure proper nutrition the study recommended that vegetarians con-, 
sume two daily servings of high-protein meat alternatives like legumes, nuts, 
peanut butter, dairy products or eggs/Those who exclude dairy products 
form their diets should add liberal amounts of dark green, leafy vegetables or 
fortified soybean milk as sources of calcium and riboflavin. 

The National Academy study was the first concession by the scientific 
establishment to the research on "protein complementarity" presented by 
Francis Moore Lappe in herbook Diet For a Small Planet. In that 1971 book 
Lappe first presented the notion that foods containing incomplete protein 
can be combined to complement each other and produce a complete protein 
amino acid configuration. vT„ 

In another study the National Cancer Institute concluded that vegetarians 
may be less susceptible to cancer than meat eaters. 

To set a proper control the institute compared the cancer rate among non-
drinking, non-smoking Mormons with that among non-drinking, non­
smoking and non-mcat-cating Seventh Day Adventists. Preliminary con­
clusions of the five year study are that meat-eating Mormons have twice the 
cancer rate of the vegetarian Adventists. 

strawberry patcfy 
boutique 
67 Central Avenue, Albany 463 -3590 ft ^ w 
95 Congress Street, Troy .273 -1919 

Largest Selection of Pipe* & Papers in the area 
Authentic American Indian starling A turquoise Jewelry 
Blackilght posters 
Large selection ol dollar rings 
Large selection ol dollar earrings 

Belts 
incense 
Candles 
Clothing 
Imports 

Scented Bath Products 
Paintings 
Novelties 
Fish Nets 
Mobiles 

Daily 1 0 - 6 - Albany, Thurs. 'til 9 Troy, Fr i t i l 7 

clip & save 

Record & Tape Special 

This Coupon Worth 

$1.00 off 
Any record or tape in our Record Dept. 

clip & save J 

Offer expires Mori., Oct. 7 

,i 

• 

i 
i 

Stuyvesant Plaza Only 
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editorial/comment 
|@l99ingi Their Own Graves 

T h e United University Professionals have successfully undermined theirown posi­

t ion at their respective colleges. Arguing "job security," thenewUUP contract will seal 

the fate of hundreds of teachers whose only hope for appeal of negative tenure 

decisions occurs when students and faculty present a unified strong front to the college 

level and university level appointments-and tenure committees. 

Because of the new contract, students will no longer be able to vote on tenure com­

mittees such as the Council on Promotions and Continuing Appointments or the in­

dividual college level committees such as those for Arts and Sciences, Mathematics, 

and others. Their input will now be merely advisory, and the decisions made finally by 

Vice-President for Academic Affairs Philip Sirotkin and President Benezet Will only 

have to answer to a divided faculty. •.•':„ - ' , 

I t isn't necessary to point out the cases when the faculty of a department gave a 

tenure candidate high recommendations, only to find that the chairman, or the Dean of 

the Division or College submitted an undeserved and uncomplimentary letter of 

. recommendation to the C P C A . There were many cases, usually involving professors 

whose students' ratings were the highest and whose respect among the faculty was 

. great, but whose views did not necessarily match those of the administration, that 

found themselves the object of unwarranted attacks on their reputations and dismissal 

of their services. The result of the union contract will mean that any decision reached 

by the faculty will have that much less teeth in it without student input. 

T o be sure, the administration isn't given the power to vote on tenure recommen­

dations either, but this provision makes the contract that much more dangerous to 

faculty. It will enable administrators whose dedication to the higher principles of 

education is questionable, at best, to excuse themselves from their own actions. Thus, 

should another Carolyn Waterman case come up again this year. Dean Richard Ken­

dall will have the perfect excuse to exert a de facta veto of any faculty committee deci­

sion. 

S U N Y A faculty should be highly commended for their progressive stance on this 

issue, fighting the proposal from its inception. It is truly unfortunate that we are the 

only university to benefit from their insight i nto true matters of academic concern. The 

contract is binding on this university for two years. During this time, close faculty-

student interaction will be crucial if.we are to preserve any measure of excellence in 

teaching. 

'"•The only reason I'm the first Mack manager iii BeeauM I w a i l w n black. I'm not a superman 

I n not •miracle worker. ThH Is whit I really «*nt to be judged by-thepliyon the field, and™ 

onWngmef i rs i .onbd i ig biackT . ^ . 

-Frank Robinson,afterbeingttamed^thifiM blackManager'.. 
in the 105-year history of • major league baseball 

Visiting Day At the Zoo 
The Podium is under repair. The pillars are getting cleaned and scraped. Thegravel 

roads surrounding the quads and the podium are getting aface lift. The campus is get­

ting more thoroughly cleaned each day. Has the state suddenly found more money to 

give the university? Have the priorities of the Administration gone astray? Hardly, for 

Saturday is October S, and the annual farce of Community University Day is about to 

descend upon this campus for yet another time. 

Three hundred sixty-four days a year this campus goes about the normal business of 

running itself as an institution of higher educaiton. But on C-U day, it is like a cancer 

cell just coming alive. It goes berserk. 

Albany will once again be the colossal fish bowl that all the gaping town residents 

and parents come to ogle. What they will see is something that the daily residents of 

this university can only dream of: a clean, patched, paved, repaired campus that one 

would never suspect was inhabited by social human beings. ForCommuni ty -

University Day . the students should shut themselves in, protected within the confines 

of their rooms, so as not to despoil the perfection that the Administration is trying to 

shove down the throats of unsuspecting visitors who have no way of knowing any 

better. A student appearing outside on C - U Day will be an alien in his own home. We 

do not belong here on Saturday. The displays, the student/ mannequins, the pageantry 

and pomp is all that C - U Day means. I f we want to present to the outside community a 

true picture of the monolith that takes such a large biteof their taxes, let them come any 

day they choose, any time they choose, and go anywhere they choose. Let them sit in 

on classes, eat in the cafeterias, and ask students if they can visit their rooms. 

Passing off Community-University Day as an example of how this college is run is a 

gross insult to the sensibilities of anyone who sees this mockery for what it is. I f it takes' 

.1 Community-University Day to make essential repairs, to get the Administration out 

their ivory towers and onto the- campus with the rest of the population, then 

Community-University Day should be a daily occurrence. 
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DAVID LEKNEH 

NANCV S. MII.LEK 

Lei ZUCKUMAN 

NANCV J. ALHAIJOII 

MICHAEL SENA 

DANIEL GAINES 

BASHAHA FISCIIKIN 

PATHICK M I OLVNN 

. DONALD NEMCIK, WILLIAM J. Sin u 

MINDV ALTMAN 

ALAN AHHEV 

PAUL PELAUALLI 
BRUCE MAGGIN 

KENNETH AMMIINO 

LINDA MULE' 

LINDA DESMOND 
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WENDY AMIES 
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'tiEPEAT AFTER ME... IN ALLAH WE TRUST... ' 

In Washington; 

Fore Opponent Takes Favors 

WASHING TON The Forked-Tongue-of-
the-Weck Award goes to one of the most 
vociferous opponents ol air fare discounts for 
youths, the elderly and the handicapped Civil 
Aeronautics Board Chairman Robert D. 
Timm. 

Timm and hiswife.it was learned last week, 
accepted lavors from live largeairlines on a re­
cent four-Week junket to Europe, and also 
took a three-day Bermuda vacation courtest 
of United Aircraft Corporation. 

Apparently, Timm feels it is perfectly accep­
table for high-salaried federal officials to 
accept lavors, but that filling half-empty jum­
bo jets by permitting young people and others 
to fly at reduced rates is, in his words, 
"discriminatory". 

I say "apparently" because Timm, whose 
government salary is $40,000. has no comment 
when I called his office to discuss these latest 
charges by House Commerce Committee 
Chairman Harley 0 . Staggers (D-W. Va.). 

Of course, any way you cut it. it's wrong for 
government officials to accept gifts from the 
very industries they regulate. But it takes 
remarkable gall to accept those gifts, and in 
the same breath tell the young and the old, 
most of whom cannot afford to fly at full fare, 
that they shouldn't benefit from discount 
rates. 

In the first place, a majority of the Senate 
has already approved discount fare legisla­
tion, and more than 170 House members have 
introduced similar bills (all 0 r which are 
currently bogged down in the Subcommittee 
on transportation and Aeronautics). The 
reasons for this groundswell or support are 
many, but among the most persuasive is that it 
simply doesn't nuke sense in this time of 
energy shortages to permit jumbo jets to 

by Ron Hendren ffiti&stff*?t&f0S$s&£i®Sffl& 
traverse the continent hall empty not wlici 
the rcinslitulion of discount fares could hi 
them, saving automobile gasoline on ihi 
ground and putting more money into the air 
lines' pockets at the same time. (And to hew 
the carriers tell it. they need the cash. Just last 
week I'an American World Airways asked ilu 
government for a SlO-million-a-month sub­
sidy to help that company avoid bankrupici.I 

Moreover, discount fare passengers don't 
take seals away from full fare customers, 
because they fly on a stand-by or space 
available basis only. Thus, if the plane h full. 
discount farcpusscngersdon'lgclonor. worse 
yet, get 'bumped" airline jargon for throwing 
you off the plane at the next stop. So lor thai 
risk, of course the fares are discounted 

Hut many young and old people, whose 

schedules are often flexible, are willing to take 

the chance, simply because it is the onh wa> 

they can afford to fly at all.T'his is purtic-iilarl\ 

true of students trying to gel an education, and 

of older persons living on meager fixed in­

comes who for the first time in their lives are 

free to travel, but cannot fool the high cost 

Discount lures died June I of this year, and 

if hearings are not held soon by the Subcom­

mittee on Transportation and Aeronautics. 

they cannot be resurrected in this session ol 

Congress. If you have un interest to protect. 

you should write: 

Honorable Harley O. Staggers 

House of Representatives 

Washington, D C 20515 

Sluggers introduced discount fare legisla­

tion, but so far hasn't shown much inclination 

to hold hearings on the issue. 

Meanwhile, I have assured Chairman 

Timin's office that as soon us he decides in 

comment on the airline gifts and hospitality lie 

and his wife received, he will have at least one 

ready listener in this columnist. • 

f/_ II arts & leisure 
This semester, for a Community 

Service Course, I am tutoring in­
mates at Coxsackie Prison. The 
classes I work with are high school 
equivalency and regents classes. The 
following pieces'are samples of 
writings that these inmates have 
produced. On Tuesday I will have an 
article in the ASP about my first few 
weeks at Coxsackie. 

—Paul Pelagalli 

The Lost Soul 

I was brought into this world. 
On a dreary February Day, 
And before I got to know her. 
My mother went away. 
So who was to take care of me? 

The lost soul! 
My father wasn't no good. 
He said, "I would if I could." 
But like 1 said he wasn't no good. 
So 1 was still. 

The lost soul! 
But I. the lost soul lived on. 
With the help of my grandmother 
dear. 

Who when I was frightened would 
hold me near. 

And say. "Hush child, ain't nolhin 
wrong." 

And hum those gentle songs. 
. And be praying all the long. 

For God to make a way. 
for this child who was born. 
On that dreary February Day. 

I was. 
The lost soul! 

I hen my mother found a man. 
Who said. "I'll do the best I can." 
For you and your son. 

Until my life is done. 

I his may .sound like the happy en­

ding. 
Hut really its just begun. 
You see. they sent for me to come to 

New York City, 
Which was like stabbing me with a 

king si/ed knife. 
Because all New York City has done 

lor me. 
Is help mc corrupt my life. 
Other people saw it coming. 
But I was just too blind to see. 

What the things I was doing. 

Were slowly doing to me. 
Grandma pleaded with me. and 
begged me to do right. 
She'd say. "Watch who you hang out 

with. 
And don't slay out so late at night." 
Now Mom and Dad, they tried their 

best. 
But there was four kids younger than 

me. 
Need I tellyou the rest'.' • 

Everybody tried to get me to change 

my way. 

But I was riding loo high to hear 

what they had to say. 

Now grandma is gone. 

She was killed last May. 

Now there's nobody to stay on me, 

• About doing the right way. 

So let mc tell you what has happen­

ed. 
I'D the child who was born on that 

dreary February Day. 
Ihc losl soul is lost. 
Behind the jail house bars. 
For doing burglaries, selling dope. 
Stripping iind stealing cars. 
N„w I've been here before and 

managed to get out, 
But this lime I'm stuck. 
And about thai there's no doubt. 

And you know. I'll admit it. 

I'm still a lost soul. 
But the ihing ln»l Hurls me deep In 

my heart 
Is the fact that I know. 
There are thousunds upon 

thousands of losl souls like me, 
In the world beyond these jailhouse 

windows. 
I hope they find themselves. 

Before they've gone loo far. 
Because there's no help for losl 

souls. 
Behind these jailhouse burs. 
If they don't have a grand mother. 
And they're not understood by their 
father or mother. 
Lord, let them have an older sister, 
Or an understanding older brother. 
Someone to help Ihem find Iheir 

way. i 

Through the corruption und confu­

sion, 

Of our work! loduy. 
Don't let them end up like me. 
Because in the world of today, 
I see no place for me. 
The child who was born on that 
dreury February Day. 

I hud to learn the hard way, 
That crime doesn't pay, 

I've learned but I'm still, 
ihc lost soul! 

But through that longdarktunnel. 
A bright light I see, 
l o r the thousands upon thousands' 

of other losl souls like mc. 
Everyone try to help the younger 
generation, 
Because in their hands. 
Lies (he future of our nation. 

Drawing by Sue Powell 

Chess are the words of me. 

By me. 
lo r others like me, 

The losl soul! 

Story Of Cayuga 
Along the New York State 

Thruway. grows un oily weed, that, 
when cut und processed, is the 
nastiest lasting crap this side of 
Caster Oil, 

l-very Fall when the Highway 
Department cleans up dead leaves, 
tons of this sticky bush arc swept up. 
Al the public garbage dump slate' 
employees labor for weeks, 
separating it from leaves, broken 
glass, und variety of other refuse 
items. It is then taken in bulk la be 
rinsed several times in the polluted 

waters of the Hudson River, in the 
hope thai the chemical wastes in the 
water will remove some of the tar. 
Alter being quick dried on oil strewn 
banks of Ihe river, it is rushed off in 
garbage barges to the packaging 
plants of the New York Slate 
Department of Correction. 

After being packaged, und air 
tight sealed with a single piece of 
Baby Blue Tape, the now decom­
posing weed is shipped to state 
prisons, where inmates hope (and 
sometimes pray) that the new ship­

ment will be better than Ihe lust. 
Lager fingers shred Ihe simple strip 
of tape. Nervous hands shake the 
contents into the rolling paper. Tight 
lips puff ut the still damp cigarette. 
One lung draw, and slight tightening 
of the throat produces a hearty 
cough. Ihftiujrelle»an<»remaining 
junk in the bug is discarded in the 
yard. 

Congrudulations|t Cayuga, you, 
and Governor "ft'o'ckefeUe'r"'nave 
rehabilitated another inmate. 

Cayuga Is the trade name for fret 
tobacco which is distributed lo in­
mates by the stale. 

http://hiswife.it


Oankal Forum 

Ait Unpleasant Place 

Those who have visited the Greek 
islands usually have very pleasant 
memories of them. Many of the 
Greek islands are indeed picturesque 

'.'• places where life is simple and un­
hurried; but others are desolate and 
uninviting. Gyaros is one of the 
latter. 

Gyaros (alto Gyara. Yioura. and 
Yiaros) is a tiny island in the 
Northern Cyclades group. It is sur­
rounded by four larger islands: Kea 
to the west, Andros to the north, 
Tinos to the east and Syros to the 
south. Its triangular coastline is 
steep in most places and provides no 
good harbors. The rocky soil sup­
ports no vegetation other than 
oleander bushes and brushwood. 
There is almost no water at all. Only 
on the east side can one find a little 
soil, a tiny spring, and a small stretch 
of beach. All inall.Gyaros is so un­
pleasant and insignificant that 
tourist guidebooks do not even men-
lion it. 

• Nevertheless, the island has an in­
teresting history. Theophrastus. a 
student of Aristotle, and Vurro, a 
contemporary of Julius Caesar, as 
cited in Pliny and Elder's "Natural 
History." both report that at one 
time the inhabitants of Gyaros were 
driven out,by rats. Aratus. a Greek 
author of the third century B.C., 
calls the island "worth less." Cicero " 
saw it in.lulyof5l B.C. but offers no 
descriptive comment. Both Vergil 
and Ovid mention it in passing. The 
geographer Strabo .saw there shortly 
after 31 B.C. a small and terribly 
poor village of fishermen. 

Gyaros served the Roman Empire 
as a place of exile for condemned 
criminals. In 22 A.D. a certain 
Silanus-, former governor of the 
Roman province of Asia, was ac­
cused of extorlion and narrowly es­
caped exile on Gyaros. Similarly in 
24 A.I).a man named Scrcnus was 
spared exile on Gyaros: on the latter 
occasion the emperor .Tiberius 
remarked that there was no water on 
the island. Both incidentsare record­
ed in the "Annals" of Tacitus, Jibe 
satirist Juvenal, complaining about 
the corruption of Roman society, 
remarks that a man must commit a 
crime punishable by exile on Gyaros 

or by incarceration if he wants to 
amount to anything. ' 

In the Middle Ages purple-fishing 
(fishing for the purple-yielding 
shellfish) was carried on in the 
waters off Gyaros. In 1928 the 
island's population consisted of 28 
goatherds. In recent years the island 
has been infamous as one of the 
places where the Greek military 
regime confined political opponents. 
The last 45 prisoners were released in , 
July of this year just after the 
military regime gave way to a civilian 
government. Some have called 
Gyaros the Greek Devil's bland. . 

The Limericks conlesi final 
deadline is next Tues.. Oct.Sal 12:00 
midnight. Winners will be an­
nounced In Friday's ASP. 

What's Happening: 
Fair, Books, TV 

Interesting things are happening 
in the future. This weekend RPI is 
having an Arts and Crafts Fair. The 
RPI fair is at the Chapel and 
Cultural Center at 2125 Burden 
Avenue, Troy on Friday and Satur­
day. 

The Albany Public Library is 
resuming its Noon Book Reviews 
this Tuesday, October 8 with a 
review of the new Babe Ruth 
biography, Babe, The Legend Com­

es To Life. 
Next week ABC-TV will show 

first of two "Wide World Specials" 
filmed at Saratoga Springs Ihis past 
summer. On the 11 th they will show 
an "In Concert" which features Aunt 
Murray, Suzi Qualm. Spinners.and 
the Ohio Players. On October IS 
they will show highlights |mni [\K 

American Song Festival, which «ill 
feature Helen Redely. 1'aul Williams. 
Richie Havens." The Lctlcrnien. and 
others. Both will he ai 11:.1CJ p.m. 

PBRF 
Electronic Body Arts Shop on Central Avenue with a little help from 
hli friends Flndlay Cockrell, Arthur Stldfole, Paula Ennlt, Philip 

Edelatein and several atudenta. 

See and hear Ralph Caso, 
Republican Candidate 

for Lt. Governor 
Wednesday, Oct. 9 12 pm CC Ballroom 

Sponsored by the Albany Slate Young Republican Club 

from <San Franciscos 
Gfiiradelli Square... 

Xomr 

. 

FLY A 
KITE 

(fit moil BwuliW Kiln 
in th* world—fiom aft notions 
Gftot lo Fly—Suptr 
Wall-Graphic.... Thtw 
at* |uit a few from our 
wloW t•Itctnn at 
Ptail Grant-Rkhmani 

PEARL GRANT RWHMAN'S 

Centipede 

STiWESAMT PLAZA 

IUG:1^****** 
• Friday, October 4 
• 7:15,9:45 

• and midnight 

j $.50 with lax card 

§ $1.00 without 

: 

I 
• ' hii'yisfiHi, III.'I a.'!.' • 

• MMr. |«g iini fjiii ..nr 
• funded by student association 

The alternative filmic experience since 1954. # 

Woody Allen's What Up Tiger Lily 
and 

Mel Brooks« The Critic 

Join us as secret agent Phil Moskowltz joins Terl Akl 

and his sister Sukl as they learn the secret of the 

great e g g sa/ac/ r e c / p e 

THEATER OF BLOOD IS COMING 
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Nitty Gritty Dirt Band 
Versatile Band Here Saturday Be Unbroken9 

by Richard Parke 
This Saturday nite SUNYA is 

sponsoring a concert by the Nitty 
Gritty Dirt Band. They've been 
around for about eight years now, 
although not in their present form. 

Back in 1966, the Nitty Gritty Dirt 
Bund started playing at the Paradox 
Cluh in Orange City. They were 
basically a jug band at the time. This 
original group was made up of 
Jackson Browne, Bruce Kunkel, and 
Ralph Burr, and they cut an album 
for Liberty records in 1966. The 
group was upset with the way Liber­
ty handled the recording and they 
never recorded for them again. The 
album was fairly successful though 
and one song in particular,"Buy For 
Me file Rain", was moved into the 
"hit" category. 

Soon niter the album was cut 
.lackson Browne left the group lo 
broaden his horizons. John McEuen 
replaced him, The band kicked 
around lor about a year not knowing 
whether to stick solely with their 
acoustic instruments or moving on 
to the very popular electric in-
stui'ments. 

Confusion limited ihe hand's 
growth the following year I heir 
producer. Bill McEuen, landed them 
a pan in the movie Vuini your 
IViifion which turned 'out i" be a 
bomb. Soon alter this. Ihe group 
became listless and they decided one 

Steve Martin 
With NGDB 

Sieve Martin, the comedian who 
will appeal Saturday nighi with ihe 
Nitty Cirilty Din Band, couldn't 
decide whether to be n philosophy 
professor or a comedian. I lie 
UCLA graduate decided to do his 
routines in bars instead ol 
classrooms 

Mason Williams, who was head 
writer lor the Similiters llroibers 
Comedy Hour gave linn his hig 
break as a writer. Martin had also 
written for Sonny and Cher before 
he decided lo go out on his own. lie 
has appealed on the Ttmigiil Show 
and has an album called I've Pone 
Terrible Tiling w M\ Hon with a 
fork. 

nite to call it quits. Each man went 
his own way. As far as anyone was 
concerned, this band was through. 

Pate didn't let this happen though. 
In 1969, Bill McEuen, met up with 

Jeff Manna, who had been with the 
band before they broke up. Theyac-
cidentally met in Ihe men's room of 
the Golden Bear in Huntington 
Beach and they decided to re-form 
the group. They agreed, though. 
that this time everything must be 
perfect: the right musicians, the right 
image, and the right sound. The 
result? The new band which was 
formed included Jeff Manna. John 
McEuen, Jimmie Paddcn, Les 
Thompson, and Jim Ihbotson. They 
experimented with different styles 
and lound they were very versatile. 
Then country music came across as 
well as their hard rock. Their first 
allium as a group was Uncle Charlie. 
They had everything on it from 
bluegiass music to hard rock. It was 
very well received by KM. stations. 

They started to increase their pop­
ularity and they seemed to reach 
their peak in 1971 with "Mr. Bo-
jangles." Ever since then, they have 
been recording by themselves and 
with some great country artists. 

Their reviews have been mostly 
favorable. It is felt by many critics 
that they put on an enjoyable and 
entertaining show. They not only 
arc good musicians, they are good 
performers. They seem lo have 
retained their anonymity as in­
dividuals by hiding behind their 
group name. Unfortunately, they 
have not attained the popularity they 
deserve. 

The Nitty Gritty Dirt Band will 
put on two shows Saturday Nite Oc­
tober 5. One at 8:00 p.m. and one at 
10:30 p.m. Tickets arc on sale now 
from 10:00 a.m. lo 2:00 p.m. in the 
CC lobby. The cost is $2.50 for 
students with tax cards and parents 
accompanied by students with tax 
cards and $5.00 without. 

•by Paul Pelatalli . ; ? - ' . 
Until recently, country music had 

a small audience which centered 
around Ihe Nashville, Tennesee area. 
Gradually it gained national accep­
tance and widespread radio play. 
Now many bands make a living play­
ing country music. Many of the old 
tunes arc still popular while new and 
original material is constantly being 
produced by young writers. 

Despite the fact that the new 
music is similar to the old, the 
different generations of country 
musicians have only their music in 
common. Most of the older 
musicians come from the South 
while the younger come from all over 
the country. Southern conservatism 
is seen in the musicians who are 
reponsihle for country music's initial 
success, while the new bands have 
values which might be distasteful to 
some middle-aged people. 

Tor these reasons country music 
has hud two separate entities: The 
real Nashville musicians und the 

Saturday nigh* of the ballroom the Niuy (iriny Dirt Band will play their apecial brands of country, 
bluegrass, and rock muiic. There are shows at 8:00 pm and 10:30 pm and ticketsare $2.50 with tax. 

qpapaaaaggp 

JICI 
Julius; H.gyi, Conductor and Music Director 

SUBSCRIPTIONS STILL AVAILABLE 

OPENING NIGHTS 
Friday, Oclob.r'4 * • * M u , '« K-11 

Saturday, October 5 Palace Theatre, Albany 

8:30 P.M. 

MALCOLM FRAGER, pianitt 
Blaine. f . * » • « ' " * * * • " 
Schumann Symphony No. 1, SprhiJ 
•oethovon H"no Concerto No, 3 In C mlnv 

T I C K E T S - Trov-$6,5,4; Albany-16.50,8,60,4.50,3.60; Student* and 
Sen CU - S o both location. Call 465-4765, or ticket, available at 
door. Albany Symphony Orche.lra, 10 Clinton Ave., Albany, 
13207 

Free Homecoming 

Concert Featuring: 
M§©J©uin *f 

Saturday, Oct. 5, 1974 

3 pm : 5 pm 

Campus Center 
Rathskeller 

Free peanuts with every beer 

while they lost 
WEKXMSBDBIBEIOB KEBBBDDDDO 

country-rock stars. They stayed dis-
tinctlyapartuntil 1971, when the Nit­
ty Gritty Dirt Band, four young 
musicians, decided to have a recor­
ding session with some of the old 
school. They asked Roy Acuff, Earl 
Scruggs, Doc Watson. Jimmy Mar­
tin and Mother Maybelle Carter. 
Almost everyone asked accepted, 
but not without some reservations. 
Roy Acuff. upon first seeing the Dirf 
Band said, "Well, you're supposed to 
know a man by the character of hit 
lace but if you have got your face all 
covered up with something...". 

Even with these doubts the 
sessions went well as the old and new 
produced one of the finest albums to 
come out in years. Will ihe Circle Be 
Unhoken. a triple album, features 
the Nitty Gritty Dirt Bund (which is 
made up of Jimmy Faddcn, John 
McEuen. Jim Ibbotson. Jeff Hanna 
and Les Thompson) along with the 
multitude of country musicians who 
came in for the sessions. 

The Dirt Band, which has tried 
everything from country to hard 
rock, are very proficient musicians 
who sound just as good with 
acoustic instruments as they do with 
electrically amplified equipment. 
This is what made Ihe whole lliing 
work. Only acoustic instruments 
were used because the older 
musicians would have it ftp other 
way. The Dirt Band was aware of 
this. A'cuff-and the.rest were im­
pressed by the adeptness of the Dirt 
Band regarding production techni­
ques. 

Once mutual respect for the 
abilities ol both factions was es­
tablished, the stag; was set for what 
turned out to he great music. Most 
of Ihe songs were written by A.l'. 
Carter, the lute husband of 
Mayhelle. Both were part of the 
singing Carter family. A lew Hank 
Williams songs are on Ihe album, 
which isexpeeled ol a collection of 
greal coiuilrj songs. Earl Scruggs 
plays "Earl's Breakdown" with the 
Dirt Bandhackingaiid he plays the 
traditional "Soldier's Joy" with ban-
joist McEuen. Vassal Clements 
plays n fantastic version of "Orange 
Blossom Special". All ol the older 
musicians solo with the Dirt Baud 
and the others playing behind them. 
In a way the Dirt Baud is set in the 
background somewhat but it is only 
right that they stepped back a bit so 
Ihe talent they had accumulated 
would shine. 

A precedent was set by this com­
bination of the old and the new. The 
Earl Scruggs Revue, which consists 
of Earl and three of his sons, has 
become very popular recently. 
Vassar Clements has recorded ' ith 
the Grateful Dead and Dicky Belts. 
Byron llerline. three times national 
fiddle champ, has played with the 
Rolling Stones and Ihe Hying 
Burrilo Brothers. When Johnny 

Cash had a weekly T.V. show three 
years ago he had James Taylor, Neil 
Young und Derek and the Dominoes 
lis his gucsls. 

The Dirt Band, et al have proved 
that music always borrows from 
what has come before. Newidcasare 
never so revolutionary that they are 
not, in some ways, based on old con­
ceptions, They also made it evident 
that music can transcend such 
barriers us regional, moral and 
generational differences, And aside 
from all this, they put out six sides of 
great country music. 
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sure review 

This Weekend 
Friday, October 4 i 

i 
• ; r 
•Women's Gathering: This week's gathering will feature Homecoming Concert: "Sojourn" is playing at the Free 
•Elizabeth Burns from the Counseling "enter Friday Homecoming Concert. Saturday. Oct. 5 from 3 p.m. -5 
fcfternoon from 3:00-5:00 p.m. in the Women's Center, p.hi. at the Campus Center Rathskeller. Free peanuts 
ICooper 100. Everyone is welcome and refreshments will with every beer while they last Saturday Oct. 5! 
we served. 

•Stile University Theatre: The University Theatre will 
present "The Rimers of Eldritch" Friday night at 8:30 
" \ m . in the University Lab Theatre. r 
fell Party Tonight: The Class of '77 is sponsoring a "Pit 
•Party!", Friday night starting at 9 p.m. at the downtown 
•Campus. There will be Tequila Sunrises & Beer. The 
tost : $.50 for the class ol'77 and $1.00 for everyone else. 

I 
•Neon Park Wingout: This Friday, the official Neon 
•Park Wingout #2 will take place in Hcnways (the pit of 
•Indian Quad). The music starts at 10 p.m. and will play 
• till the hand expires (at least 3 a.m.). The cost is $1.00 for 
•everyone and all the, Free Beer you could possibly con 
•sumo. 

Saturday, October 5 

! University-Community D«y:ThisisSUNYA'sthird An-
.nu.i l Open House lor the community. There will be a 
• variety of exhibits, performances, demonstrations, and 
• exciting sports events. It should prove to be a very en-
• joyahlc day for all. Oon'l miss it! 

L . . . . . . . . . - - - - - - - - - - -

University Concert Board: For Homecoming '74, the 
University Concert Board presents: The Nitty Orittyj 
Dirt Band and a special guest lor the first time in Albany! 

This great concert will take place twice in the Campus 
Center Ballroom Saturday night. The shows are at 8:00 
and 10:30 pm. 

State University Theatre: The University Theatre will! 
again present "The Rimers of Eldritch" in the University* 
l.ab Theatre in the Performing Arts Center tonight at 
8:31) p.m. 

Sunday, October 6 

Rafters Coffee House: The Coffee House will host a, 
benefit concert for the Alton Smith Defense Fund this; 
Sunday night al 8 p.m. at the Chapel House, Special| 
Guest Performers will be featured! j 

Stale University Theatre: Hie final performance of "The 
Rimers of Eldritch" will be given this afternoon at 2 p.m. 
at flic University Lab Theatre. This is the last chance to 
sec a great play anil a fantastic performance. 

Movie Timetable 
On Campus 
Albony Stote Clnemo 
Jeremy 
Fri: 7:30, 8:30, 9:30 pm LC. 2 
Magical Mystery Tour 
Sal.: 7:30. 8:30, 10:00 pm LC, IK t 

IFG 

What's Up, liner Lily? 
Fri.: 7:15, 9:45 pm LC. IK 

Delowore 

Phase 4 
Fri.: 6:30, 10:10 pm 
Sat.: 4:10. 7:50 pm 
The Hit 
Fri.: 8:00 pm 
Sat.: 5:40, 9:20 pm 

Towne 

Juggernaut 
Fri.: 7:25, 9:45 pm 
Sat,: 5:30. 7:30,9:45 pm 

H oilman 

done With the Wind 
Fri,: 7:30 pm 
Sal.: 2:00. 8:00 pm 
The Haven 
Fri,: Midnight 

Modlson 

Jeremiah Johnson 
Fri,: 7:15, 9:20 pm 
Sat.: 7:20, 9:40 pm 

tower Eost 

Emperor of the North Pole 
Fri.: 7:30, 10:00 pm LC, 7 
Slaughterhouse -Five 
Fri,: 7:30, 10:00 pm LC.7 

Off Campus 

Klne 1234 

Clnemo 7 

Pardon My Blooper 
Fri. & Sal.: 7:00, 8:." I0: l0pm 

Center Colonic 

Animal Crackers 
Fri.:7:l5, 9:45 pm 
Sut.:o:30, 8:20, I0:I5 pm 

Contest Rules 
Puzzle solutions must be submitted' to the Albany Student Press olTii 

(CC334) by Monday, 3 p.m. following the Friday that the puzzle appear 

Name, address, phone number and social security number must appear on 
your solution. 

Puzzle solutions will bedrawnal random until three correct solutions have 
been chosen. ' 

L'li'ch ol ihe Ihrcc winners will be entitled to a $10 gift certificate lo the cam­
pus bookstore. Merchandise must he claimed within two wecksolniililica-
iion. 

So one working on or for I he Albany Student Press is eligible to wii 

(Illy one solution per person accepted. 
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ACROSS 

1 Professional starts 
7 Halo 

13 Flowers 
15 A tie score: 2 wds. 
16 Indication 
17 Rare 
18 Spanish uncles 
19 Ancient Egyptian 

city 
21 Suffix: animals 
22 Hindu cymbal 
23 Greek letter 
24 Manipulated person 
25 French state 
27 Love, Italian style 
29 Bunker or Beacon 
30 Loathes 
32 Facts' 
34 Treaty organization 
35 Knights of 
38 Chums 
40 Dots 
42 Prefix: other 
45 Wolves 
47 Aid's partner 
48 Fruit decay 

49 Hockey great 
50 Bullring shout 
51 Sheep sound 
52 Set fire to 
55 Actor John 
56 Salad green 
58 Dale or Hall 
60 Allen and Rossi 
61 Place of fabulous 

wealth: 2 wds. 
62 Most rational 
63 Rape of the 

Women 

DOWN 

1 Perverts 
2 Bleach 
3 Begins to develop 
4 French numeral 
5 Color 
6 Tribal chiefs 
7 Proboscis 
8 Business organi­

zations (abbr.) 
9 culpa 

10 Russian wolfhound 
11 Excited 

12 and know a l l : 
2 wds. 

13 Caressed 
14 Tend: 2 wds. 
20 College 1n New York 
24 Muse of comedy 
26 Dome 
27 Coral reef 
28 Soprano Emma — 
31 Depot (abbr.) 
33 Sailor 
36 Winter sports craft 
37 "Guys and Dolls" 

character 
39 Anon 
40 Doorways 
41 Record player 
42 Convent superior 
43 T1re: Sp. 
44 Dull gray 
46 Fanny 
52 Burl 
53 Adventure 
54 Wagnerian role 
55 Prefix: air 
57 " Got You Under 

My Skin" 
59 Hill 

The Seven Wonders of the West 
Fri. & Sul.: 7:15, 9:10 pm 
C'laudine 
Fri. & Sal.: 7:00. 8:55 pm 

[China Town 
Fri. & Sal.: 7:00, 9:25 pm 
fining Piece* 
Fri. ASat. : 7:20,9:40 pm 

Fox Colonle 

The Longest Yard 
Kri.; 7:30, 9:45 pm 
Sal.: 2:00, 4:15, 7:00, 9:20 pm 
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Last Week's Puzzle 
Solution 
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by Eddie "the whale" Fox 
Jason Brauh is an up and coming 

chess player from SUNYA. Only 
last year, Jason was playing at the 
level of aclass Cplayer, this year he is 
playing close to the expert level. 
Jason, with a rating of 1499(classc) 
finished second in the booster sec-
lion in the N.Y.S. Chess Cham­
pionship (he would have taken first 
place had it not been for yours truly, 
Eddie "the whale" losinga won game 
lo the gentleman who took first place 
in the last round). This game ia 
against one of the areas strongest 
players. 

Lester Van Meter 

P-K3 
N-KB3 
P-QB4 
N-H3 (c) 
B-K2(d) 
0-0 
P-QR3? (e) 
PxP 
Q-B2 (g) 
P-Q37 (i) 
I'xN 
R-QI 
H-N2 
P-K4 
P-Q4 
PxP 
NxP 
QR-NI 
UxN 
Q-N2 
RxB 
U-H3 

QR-QI 
Q-N4 

Jason Hraun 
1. P-QB4!?(a) 
2. N-QB3 
3. P-KN3'.'! (b) 
4. H-N2 
5. P-K3 
6. N-K2 
7. 0-0 
8. P-Q4!8 
9. NxP?! (f) 
I0.P-N3 (h) 
11. NxN 
12. P-K4 
I3.Q-N3 
14. U-U4 (j) 
15. H-HI 
16. KPxP 
17. PxP 
18. H-N2 
19. NxN 
20. Q-U3 (k) 
21. 11x11 
22.Q-B3 
23. Q-N4 
24. QK-QI 

25. KR-K1 
26. P-QR3 (1) 
27. P-N4 
28. RxR (m) 
29. Q-K4 
30. QxQ 
31. PxP 
32. B-B3 
33. R-RI'.'(n) 
34. Bxl) 
35. R-NI 
36. K-HI 
37. K-K2 
38. K-K3 
39. P-R4 
40. R-N3 
41. R-NI 
42. R-Hlch 
43. R-B5ch 
44. I'xK 
45. K-U4 

Q-R4 
Q-N4 
P-QR4 
QxR 
PxP 
RxQ 
R-N4 
K-HI 
P-K5 
PxB 
K-K2 
K-K3 
P-B4 
K-K4 
P-B3 
K-Q4 
K-U57?(o) 
K-Q4 
Rx l< 
KxP 

and the win is evident 

Notes: ail hismove is being played by 
quite a few Russian grandmasters 
and seems lo be meeting with greater 
popularity even with local players. 
myself included. b| An unusual 
move whose merit is doubtful. Black 
gains equality with 3.... P-QB4; 4. B-
N2 l'-(J4. Probably heller is the 
characteristic move 3. P-Q4orP-K4. 
ci More accurate is 4. ...P-Q4 im­

mediately creating tension in the 
center, dI Again 5. ,..I'-Q4is in order 
bill liotli players seem content to 
wail and sec what the other is going 
lo do before making a commitment 
in the center, e) Just a plain had 
move, totally unnecessary. Hie idea 
is lo allow llie Queen on llie QH2 

square without being molested by 
the N-N5 move,by white, but the 
Queen is not well placed on the B2 
square, f) Much better is 9. PxP and 
il 9. ...P-Q4; 10. P-B5 with the better 
game. If: 10. ...P-QN3: I I . B-K3 
PxP: 12. PxPN-Q2: 13. R-Bi. 
gllJetcrmincd to play the Queen 
move regardless whether it does 
anything or not. h) 10. P-K4 is 
stronger, i) 10. ...B-N5 gives black 
llie better opportunity to gain 
equality. Making P-Q4 possible on 
the I llh or 12th move, j ) 14. R-QI 
maintains pressure in the center, k) 
11 there are any winning chances in 
this game Ihey clearly belong to 
while with his queen side majority 
and strong bishop criss-crossing the 
center. I) A maneuver designed to 
gel whites pawns all on the same 
color as the bishop thereby cutting 
the mobility of (he bishop lo a 
minimum, in) White rightly so 
wants lo liquidate the pawn position 
minus all the pieces, which is a win 
for white. n)33. R-K4 maintains llie 
pressure, o) The final blunder. 

Crossword Puzzle 
Contest Winners 

Lisa Comsau 

Lyncttc Dar ia 

Leslie Tobea 

I aawoCMCMCMttMSMM 
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Pit Party Tonight! 
Downtown Campus 

9 pm 

Tequila Sunrises & Beer 

.50 class of '77 members 
$1 all others 

Sponsored by the class of '77 
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • a * 
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WSUA SPORTS 
IN CONJUNCTION WITH HOMECOMING WEEKEND AND COMMUNITY UNIVERSITY DAY: 

WSUA SPORTS PRE5ENTS 

A BROADCAST DOUBLE HEADER 

Saturday.-

ALBANY GREAT DANE SOCCER Albany state 
Join Nate Salant as he brings you exciting VS 

play-by-play coverage beginning at 11:00 am Cort land Red Dragons 
( a league game between two undefeated teams!) 

ALBANY GREAT DANE FOOTBALL 
Doug Lewanda and Harvey Kojan are there with 

the exciting play-by-play action 

Albany State 
vs 

RIT Tigers 

WSUA THE SPORTY 640!! 
$J96XWKt6tOSX$^MSSSS9SK)SXXK3SS6SSs}$iSi VJtttsWM 
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UNIVERSITY CONCERT BOARD 
prints for HOMECOMING 1*74 

Isf t/me/n A/bony/H/ 

| l * e itfitty Grltt» IHr* Bowl 
I a******1*1*™* Steve Martin 

• Saturday night, October 5 in the CC ballroom 
| 2 shows at 8:00 and 10:30 PM 
• Tickets on sale now In CC lobby from 10:00-2:00 
I $2.59 for students with tax cards and parents 
I accompanied by sltulettt tHtf* tax card 
| $5.00 without tax 

I ' 
I 
I 
I 
I 

BRING YOUR PARENTS!.'.' 

funded by student association 

•I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
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! UCD proudly presents 

Fall '74 
I 

Coming Attractions 
\K : 

fi-

¥> ':• 

'i,' :||; 

1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
• 

Sun., Oct. 27 

Sun. Nov. 10 

Fri., Nov. 15 

• 

I 
I 
I 
• 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
• funded by student animation 

Sot, Nov. 16 

Fri., Nov. 22 

Randy Newman and special guest 

(to be announced later) (CC Ballroom) 

Jerry Garcia, Merl Saunders and friends (Palace Theatre) 

The Eleventh House featuring Larry Coryell 

and special guest Michael Urbaniak (2 shows, CC Ballroom) 

The Preservation Hall Jazz Band (CC Ballroom) 

The Kinks (Palace) (Special guest to be announced) 

Further details will appear in the ASP 

clip & save 

• 
i 
i 
i 
• 
i 

• 
i 
i • 
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Alton Smith: Art and Law 
Editor's Nofe: 

Last Monday I saw in the Tower 
Tribune .a note saying thai the 
drawings of Alum Smith, a student, 
were to be on exhibit in the Art 
Gallery this peek. I assigned a 
reporter to write a review of his 
works and thought no more about it. 
Until Wednesday, that is, when out­

side the Campus Center there was a 
table with literature about this same 
A lion Smith. It appears that there is 
more to the story than I expected. 
Underneath is the. review of his art, 
and an excerpt from the NAACP 

U.S. average and Alton's prior 
academic training could, in all 
honesty, be termed sub-standard. 
But he and his family had a vision of 
a better life, and New York had a 
program to aid such potentially 
successful students. And so for three 
and a half years. Alton grew and 
matured and succeeded at SUNYA. 
He became an art major and had 
planned to graduate in the summer 
of 1974 and enter a career in the art 
field. 

But last Tall Alton Smith ap­
parently made a mistake. His mis-

literalure.'Next week in ASP will he take was to drive his mother's car 
a study of Alton Smith, and his down Delaware Avenue at 10 p.m., 
troubles with the law. 

•Alan D. Abbey 

the last two counts. Assault, Second 
Degree: causing cuts, bite marks, 
and lacerations to the two police­
men!. The judge immediately revok­
ed Alton's bail and he was com­
mitted to the Albany County Jail 
pending sentencing. 
, On July 22, the Court denied • 
defense motion, which - cited 
numerous errors in the trial, to set 
aside the verdict. The judge went on 
to impose a sentence of five years of 
probation. 

by Veronica Szccsny 
Alton Smith's charcoal and pencil 

sketches displayed in the Fine Arts 
Gallery arc combinations of both 
power and beauty. His definite, 
strong style and careful use of 
shadings produce an effect which 
leads the eye from one point to the 
next, producing a total, unifying 
effect. 

Some sketches may appear to be 
no more than a jumble of lines at 
first, but the moreone lonksal it. the ' 
more one sees the precision u> which 
Smith has placed each line, and the 
images they are creating. Elusive 
and yet explicit, his is a display 
which this c r i t ic s t rong l ) 
recommends. 

park it. cross the street to the Pizza 
Spot (a fewdoorsfrom the Delaware 
Theatre) only to find it closed, and 
return to his car. For acting in this 
seemingly natural and harmless 
manner on the first of November. 
Alton was set upon by two casually-
dressed men who suddenly drove up 
in a non-descript car. Alton resisted 
what he considered to he tin un­
provoked attack and repeatedly 
called for the police and assistance. 
During the struggle, two shots were 
lired by Alton from a gun dropped 
by one ol the unknown men. A 
bystander was inflicted with u super­
ficial arm wound by one of the 
bullets. Alton was beaten 
throughout the struggle and only 
later was astounded to learn that his 
attackers were Albuit) policemen, 
lie was arrested and charged with 
seven felonies as a result of the 
slrtmule. 

I he i n i \ louud Alton not guilty of 
the Inst five counts of the 
indictment the live most serious 
charges. I lie) lound him guilty of 

AHon Smttti It student and artist at SUNYA who has recently had 
legal troubles. An exhibit ol his work is in the Art Gallery 

Alton Smith came to Albany in 
June I970 to begin studies at Stale 
University of New'York at Albany. 
His family had income far below the 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

A Celebration in Mime 

State University Theatre 
presents 

The Rimers 
of Eldritch 

by Lanford Wilson 
I Directed by Jerome Hanley ! 
3 S' I 

October 2-5, 8:30 PM 
1 ' October 6, 2:30 PM 

Lab Theatre, Performing Arts Center 
Tickets- $3.00, $2.00 with ID, 

$1.00 with student tax 
for reservations call 457-8606 

by I'am Burri 
Ihealer Council has something very special in store 

for SUNYA and the surrounding community, October 
l)-ll. Performing and giving workshops in a three day 
residence will be the Celebration Mime Theater, from 
Portland, Maine. I he troupe has an excellent reputation 
and people of all ages who have seen them perform were 
enthralled by then ability to work together and the utter 
beauty of their art. 

Mime is man's most ancient dramatic form, yet it is 
one of the least known for the modern audience. It is as 
old as civilization, yet is still preserved by actors like 
lony Mumanaro and his Celebration Mime Theater. 
I hese actors and actresses have spent their lives learning 
to imitate life. Though the art has always been silent, it 
none the less speaks to us through its vitality. It has come 
to include aspects of comedy, drama, acrobatics, and 
dance. 

lony Monlanaro is the director of this troupe. His 
assistant is Heeny Keehl. One review says of him: Mon­
lanaro is more than a skilled performer. He is a teacher. 
...also a very line originator of material." {The tVhifi 
Sidiitlarit. Kingston Ontario) Another report out of the 
\ltiitw Sunday Ti'lt'xram says "He is an enthusiast as well 
as a faultless craftsman, qualities which have broken 

through the reserve ol many Maine audiences." It seems 
from i ending various critics on the CMTthat their joy in 
the work alone is enough to captivate any audience. 

I he troupe of seven men and two women will perform 
"An American Collage" and other works here in the Per­
forming Arts Center and give workshops in the after­
noons. Wednesday through Friday. One of these 
workshops will be open to the public, the other two will 
be limited to SUNYA students and faculty. All 
workshops are free, however (he size of the classes will he 
limited in order to make them as rewarding as possible 
for the participants. Sign-up sheets will be posted in the 
Performing Arts Center on the second floor between the 
Lab Theater and the Ihealer Office. Performance 
tickets will be on sale in .the box office and the week 
before the performance in the CC lobby for: $3.1X1'for 
non-students, $2.00 student and $1.00 with Student 

Association laxcard. The performance is being lundccT 
by the Student Association. 

I he Celebration Mime Theater should be an exciting 
experience lor all who allend. The troupe will perform 
and demonstrate their an with all the enthusiasm they 
can muster, and no doubt they will let a lot of that joy 
spill over lor us in the audience. Ihealer council urges 
you to come and share in this celebration in theater. 

8 

HAPPY HOUR- 2PM to 10PM 
LARGE PITCHER $1.50 MIXED DRINK $.75 

Large Cheese Pizza $1.95 

S LUNCHES SERVED DAILY PIZZA SERVED TILL 2 AM ^ 

i PIZZA TO GO! 

Long Island 

Pizza 
here on Church Rd„ at Westville 

only at 

Mad Hatters 
call Kitchen 456-5050 

daily 12 noon - 3 am 

Try Hatter's heros & hot sandwiches 

"you've tried the resf 
now taste the best" 

456-5050 456-5050 
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U reflections 

v 

hudrMof plunging lemming* 
Never noticing • 
their enslavement in the powerful current' 
Ceaselessly (peaking without thought 
Ceaselessly listening without comprehension 
nodding in fanatical agreement 
Adopting masks '•' 
protective shields of complacency 
dissembling anxioui impulses to glance 
toward the hollow void (so distant 
yet slowly steadily approaching 
the creeping minute hand of time) 
Never deviating 
yielding to the force of the current 
relaxing"' 
outwardly calm 
boasting o f the endured hardships 
the struggle—yet jolted 
fatally challenged 
by the f irst obstacle 
I I . 
Choosing darkness 
searching for divinely bril l iant light 
ignoring the harsh uncomfortable light 
streaming from the sun 
Settling effortlessly into the serena anonymity 
into the chanting congregation — 
our lather who art in heaven 

A 

bellowed be thy name— "•,':' ^ 
mindless slaves crying out 
in existential anguish 
kneeling to lame vaporous desires 
hallucinatory images 
appearing in the empty void 
Clambering heedlessly 
recklessly over each other 
exploiting faults as footholds ,. 
straining ever upwards 
to touch the infinite blur ••• 

il'l' : '• 
Suddenly the epiphany—blood 
flowing more easily 
more beautifully than water 
leaving a clear crimson trai l 
to mark its tortuous passage 
Rough edges are more satisfying to the touch 
but they take their tol l—in flesh 
the marker of thousands 
cut while cutting through knotted wilderness 
The current can be fought 
without blade and litany (weapons 
of cowardice 
so often found hand in hand) 
Boldly facing the naked existence of the void 
uncovered by paranoic fantasy—yet Undaunted 

—Spencer liafgio 

'•'\ i inrrrj ini 

show me the brooks, and 
streams where,we used to lie 

side by side unaware of intruders 
what of the sonnets, whose. 

tarnished epics or incompleted love? 

and theiparklein your eye . » ' \ 
when1 you appraised, my perfect body 

and the glitter doubled always • v ; 
as the gesture was returned '•' 

tell me of your love, as i bite 
ithe golden apple with my hungry lips 

and laugh; lor you see '•?'_ 
i've forgotten your name! 

—R.M.Goodman 

You X 

You came with the sunlight 
Bring springtime flowers, and 
blue skies. 

I found your love, playing, as a child does, with a shell, 

washed up on the beach—polished and it shone 
like diamonds emeralds you may say 

But when you held me in your arms 
briefly we knew joy 

and now you are far away 
No comfort in my loneliness 

i yearn lor the touch ol your hand upon my lace, the 
gentleness of your kiss, the smooth sound of your voice 
such deep eyes 
and yet the sun lades: and 
the star grow cold, and their burning embers find 
solace and dance in my tear-drop eyes (silent eyes that 
leel so much silent voice thai says so much) 

and mv heart bursts 

*"— H. M. (jimdimm 

NOW THIS ES A REEL SALE!!! 
REEL TO REEL TAPES 

SAT.&MON 
ONLY 

$2.99 each 
4 for $10. 

Save a Little 
Green 

on Browne 

% *'l«ld tmv\ _ 
"£• ft * • * • •*>• 

this Saturday AY nonday v t ara runnl*** * 

•*&V 

/ • 

come eee ue at 

,<l'J« it,„.,:.J V/ll 

84 central ave. atbany n.y. 

saturate before using - asylum S061 
for everyman - asylum 5067 
late for the sky - asylum 7E - 1017 

ALL 
JACKSON 
BROWNE 

LP's 
SATURDAY ONLY 

$3.99 
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letters 
Political Abuses 

To the Editor: 
An Open Letter to the SUN Y A Community: 

In conjunction wi th the SECOND INTER­
NATIONAL WEEK OF CONCERN FOR 
S A I G O N ' S C I V I L I A N P O L I T I C A L 
PRISONERS, we would like to remind you 
(hat the Paris Peace Agreements that were 

'signed over a year and a half ago are still not 
being adhered to. Many civilian and political 
prisoners are still being kept in South Viet­
namese jails under extremely inhuman con­
ditions. These prisoners include women, 
children, farmers, intellectuals, labor and 
religious leaders, and students. 

Many have been detained for not suppor­
ting the Thieu regime (although not suppor­
ting the Communists cither) or have been 
falsely accused of being Communists. There 
are countless numbers of prisoners who have 
not been charged with any crimes or have serv­
ed out their sentences. Barbaric tortures are 
commonly used in these prisons. A new, " im­
proved" tiger cage developed by Americans is 
now being used. It is smaller and darker than 
the ones which were publicized and done away 
with in 1970. A common practice in the 

-prisons is the shackling of prisoners to a wall 
for long periods of time which results in 
paralysis of the legs. 

flic Paris Peace Agreements called for the 
release of political prisoners and civilian 
detainees as well as granting some democratic 
liberties to the people. These included per­
sonal freedom, freedom of speech, belief, and 
movement, and also freedom of political ac­
tivity. However, under the Decree Laws of the 
Thieu regime, acts of any sort arc outlawed it 
they arc directly or indirectly aimed at prac­
tising Communism. Any politically neutral 
position is considered pro-Communist. 
Freedom of press is curtailed by decrees which 
threatenb to closedown any publications that 
do not support the government. One reason 

for these laws is that the Thieu government 
does not have popular support fronrthe peo­
ple. The actions of this government are clear 
violations of the Paris Peace Agreement. 

This unnecessary and oppressive suffering 
can be lessened with an effort from the United 
Stales. With respect to the facts, we feel that 
the American support of the Thieu regime is 
hypocritical to the values this countryalleged-
ly holds. As a matter of conscience and as a 
matter of justice to all humanity, we feel that 
the United States should immediately end all 
aid to both the Thieu and Lon Nol 
governments IK Southeast Asia until the 
provisions of the Paris Peace Agreements 
have been lullyiniplementcd. As our represen­
tative, we urge you to oppose all legislation 
giving aid to these governments and to speak 
publicly of the plight ol the Vietnamese people 
due to the intervention of world powers and 
the failure to follow the peace agreement. 

We are also bringing to your attention a 
group of seven Vietnamese students living in 
the United Stales who haveasked for political 
asylum here out of fear ol being persecuted 
upon their return to South Vietnam. They 
have all spoken lor the cause ol peace in Viet­
nam and surely will be punished by the Thieu 
government as so many have been. However, 
our government has ruled thai "there is no op­
pression in South Vietnam." To deport these 
students would he to throw them to the lions. 
Surely you must leel that our country has a 
responsibility to help these students. 
Therefore we usk you to defend these students 

and work lor their political asylum. 

It would be appreciated if members ol the 
SI INVA community would send usa reply ex­
plaining their own position and committments 
in this situation, as well as any plahs to deal 
with it. We thank you for your concern and are 
looking forward to your reply. 

1 his letter has been written by Peace Project 
and we intend to send it to various government 
officials. II you support our statement please 
come to our table in the Campus Center on 
Friday. October 3, or to our booth on Com­
munity University Day, October 5, and sign h. 
fhe more signatures we get. the greater the 

meaning ol the letter. . ,, 
" Joe Kraut 

Costles Burning: 

Children's Letters to Pres. Denezet 
by Ken Wax 
Dear President Benezet, 

Thank you very much for arranging a tour lor our class. I liked your school a lot and can't wait 

to see what it looks like when you paint it. 
Your friend. 

Dear President Benezet, M l c k l 

Thank you very much for arranging a tour lor our class. 1 had a very nice time, and specially 

liked the sounvenir shop in the middle where I bought I he colored cigareltcs. 
Your friend. 

Dear President Benezet, 
Thank you very much for arranging a tour lor our class. I thought the lake was very nice and 

really like the balloons I found near it. 
Your friend. 

Dear President Benezet. . K i c h i , : 

Thank you very much forarranging a tour for our class. I'm sorry about the spray paint and I 

don't know who did it or why they wrote my name on the pillars. 
Sincerely Yours Truly, 

Salvatore 
Dear President Benezet, 

Thank you very much for arranging a lour lor ourclass. I thought the tunnels were beautilul. 

Did you find Henry yet? v , , 
' ' Your Inend. 

Jeri 
Dear President Benezet, 

Thank you for arranging a tour for our class. I liked your school very much. Is it going to sink 
any more? 

Your friend. 
Karen 

Dear President Benezet, ., 
Thank you very much forarranging a tour lor our class. Am I going to have to ndea schoolbus 

in college, too? „ , . , 
Your Inend, 

Eric 
Dear President Benezet, 

Thank you lor arranging a tour for our class. My teacher says you have a very important job. It 
must be fun to ring the bells al l the time. I'll do il if you ever get tired. 

Your Inend, 
i \ „ . . .. "r ian 
Dear President Benezet. 

Thank you for arranging a tour lor our class, Ealing in the dining hall was a lot ol fun. I'm all 
better now. 

Your Inend, 
k n .. Debbie 
w a r President Benczel, . ,. . , . 

Here are some letters the children wrote. Hope you cm.w reading them as much as they did 
writing them. Er . , /w i r you found Henry yet'' 

Electoral Abuses 
T o l h e E d k o n ' ' - % V 

From the vantage point of a transfer student 
as myself or for that matter of any freshman. 
or new student. Albany State's concept of stu­
dent government is one of absurdity. True, 
there are University laws supported by a con­
stitution and a governing body empowered to 
make the laws. ' However, this entire 
framework of "Democracy" is negated by the 
insufficiencies o f the electoral process by 
which the students elect the "candidates of 
their choice." 

In the Tuesday. October I editorial entitled 
"Voting Machinery." you mentioned the need 
lor students to vote in the current student 
government elections and to naturally vote for 
the "candidates of their choice." Having puid 
my sludcnl f i x I may therefore vote; However 
there remains « seemingly slight but actually 
major technicality, For whom am I voting, 
and what is the platform of the candidate 
whom I randomly select to represent me? I 
would assume that this is not a minor question 
in the eyes of the candidates, the student 
body, or lor (hat matter anyone. 

Aside from having published a list of the 
names ol the candidates and the positions to 
which they aspire, this newspaper has failed in 
iis primary role of Informing its readers. In 
Ibis serious case, il tailed to furnish the public 
with the pending issues and to publish the 
various positions taken by the individual 

.aspirants. After a l l whst can take pweedince 
over the coverage of a student epvnramem 
election oil a college campus, whose outcome 

'd i r t^ iy-a i tecta 'Aiy l l? ' -'r 

t h e problem delineated here is not 
restricted to neglectful journalistic seme as 
displayed by theA.S.P. Rather it exemplifies 
an altitude of apathy and indifference at the 
intellectual higher centers of learning and 
among the youth in America, who but a 
decade ago Were bequeathed the honor of 
safeguarding freedom and were then por­
trayed as representing the refreshing con­
science of us all. The prevalent sickly in­
different attitude o f today has permeated 
throughout practically all segments of ou r 
society and hits ostensibly permitted our 
elected officials in a l l levels of government to 
a buse their power and to subsequently lead the ' 
people astray and into the quagmire of crisis. 
No one can deny such happenings as the 
"Watergate Al l i t i r . " 

Tin not suggesting that Albany State's elec­
toral system' and hence it's student govern­
ment is on the verge of corruption or ruin. 
However. I am impressing that thercexists the 
possibility lor such decay and abuse if the elec­
toral system is not brought out into the open 
for all In see. This can be very simply ac­
complished by a campaign on the part of the 
candidates and the A.S.P. to educate the 
voters as to what the issues are and where the 
candidates stand in relation. Otherwise, as 
longns. studentsare not given the opportunity 
to intelligently distinguish between the various 
candidates, the wrong people wil l he elected" 
and only the problems ol 'power abuse nnd the 
neglect ol sludcnl needs can be expected to 
follow. 

,loe| I. Binstnk 

A From the Frog's Mouth Editoriol: 

Environmental Impact Analysis 

Confidential to Cheryl- , „ , 
He lied io you, There is no such thing as a morning-alter pill lor guy>. 

OCTOBER 4, 1974 

Sincerely. 
Mrs. Sheridan 

1£,M 
by Lawrence i l . Pohl 

Section 102 of the National Environment Policy Act (NEPA) has brought into a position of 
prominence the lield of environmental impact analysis. Under NEPA, any "major Federal ac­
t ion" would dictate the preparation of a comprehensive, interdisciplinary environmental impact 
statement assessing thelongterm us well as short as that action wil l have on the environment. 
Through numerous far-reaching court actions. NEPA environmental impact legislation bus 

helped inject environmental values into the federal planningproeess.while at the same time sur­
facing as one of the more applicable procedures open to those concerned with the lack of atten­
tion paid to environmental factors. 

It would he lolly to dwell on the infallibility and perfection of the assessment process, for in­
deed the "slate of the art", although improving, remains at an early stage of development. Bui 
the process is a realistic one and. when properly ad ministered, a fair procedure: fairto the pro­
ject initiator, lair to the citizen and fair to the proponents of environmental protection. 

What is the next step lor the environmental impact field? from the h'mx's Mouih endorses any 
attempts to mandate environmental assessment ol privately funded developmentprojccls.Mulli-
unit housing projects and mammoth second home developments present us much, i f not more, of 
a danger to the environment as do many federal actions. It makes environmental sense as well 
us economic sense to construct environmentally sound and aesthetically attractive development 
projects. 

What is the best administrative route to take to implement a private assessment program? 
Current government action in N YS comes from Part 615 of the Code of Rules and Regulations 
of the NYS Dept. of Environmental Conservation. Part 6I5 allows Ihe Department to hold 
hearings and approve ol disapprove projects deemed of significant size or which produce signifi­
cant environmental impact. The recent "Ton-da-lay" decision and subsequent DEC appeals 
highlight the need for legislation controlling private development's extent of encroachment on 
the environment. A private assessment hill is currently being considered by the legislature, but 
political shufllinghaslefi i l tangled in the Capitol web. 

If environmental impact a s s e s s m e n f t W l | * t * * r H T c « W the environment of NYS then a 
law controll ing private development must be enacted. A l l those who are politically active should 
consider expressing their support. • 
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columns 
At $100 A Head... 

by Mare Writer 

"If we are to restore order and respect for 
law in this country, there's one place we're go­
ing to have to begin: we're going to have a new 
Attorney General," so spoke Richard M. Nix­
on in a 1968 campaign speech in which he 
bitterly denounced Ramsey Clark, then At­
torney General. We have.all witnessed how 
much respect Nixon and his Attorney 
Generals John Mitchell and Richard Ktien-
dienst (not to mention the other members of 
Nixon's debased crew) had for law and justice, 
t h e nation saw the brand of law and order im­
posed by Nixon and was repulsed by it. 

Political Irony 

The nature of politics is such that it abounds 
with irony. Today while Richard Nixon lies in 

I a hospital bed, his life at its nadir, the political 
fortunes of Ramsey Clark are on the rise. 
Clark is the Democratic candidate for Senator 
for the state of New York. Decency and in­
tegrity - qualities alien to politics as practiced 
by Richard Nixon - are the hallmarks of the 
Clark campaign. The voters of New York 
State are receptive to Clark's brand of politics, 
as evidenced by his smashing primary victory 
three weeks ago. 

The people of New York and the nation 
want a marked change in the post-Watergate 
style of politics. Politicians must respond con­
vincingly and decisively to the abuses of 
Watergate. In 1974 the voters will seek a new 
breed of candidates; the public will favor 
office-seekers who are not linked to big 
money, big business, or special interest 

' groups. 

Ramsey Clark, in acknowledging the voters' 
concern with the evils exposed by Watergate, 
has stipulated that his camoaien contributions 

be limited to $ 100 per person. Clark feels that 
"money dominates politics and, through 
politics, government." He is attempting to free 
politics arid government from the shackles and 
influence of great wealth. In a day when 
political campaigns arc expensive, grandiose 
projects, Clark is.taking his message to the 

people via a low-key, low-cost campaign. The 
austere campaign being run by Clark differs 
sjrjkingly from the campaign of his opponent 

Jacob Javits. 

money dominates 

politics and, through politics, 

government." 

The Javits campaign promises to be a 
lavish, well financed affair, he already has, 
amassed a colossal campaign treasure chest. 
Javits has solicited contributions from all 
segments of the business world. Banking, real 
estate, and insurance interests have all 
donated heavily to the Javits campaign. These 
people will not give $100 or $200 but 

. ..' 'UiilillKUIIIWHtlo' J. ., <IIIUltim:l'.ll'J:iUi«/JI<l 
thousands and tens of thousands or dollars. 
Some have bought into the Javits campaign 
for $ 100,000. This should not surprise people, 
because in his other three campaigns, Jacob 

Javits always kowtowed to the 'Tat cats" of the 
business world. Despite disclaimers by Javils 
and his supporters, those large checks do 
affect and sway the performance of un office 
holder; it would be fatuous of us to think 
otherwise. 

While in the senate Javits has often been 
slow to act on the major issues. He supported 
U.S. policy in Vietnam well into the I960's, 
switching his position when it became the pop­
ular thing to do. Javits waited a long time 
before calling for Mr. Nixon to resign; even 
the troglodytic James Buckley called for Nix-' 
on's resignation before Javits. 

t l ark A Civil Libertarian 
iiiiiiioitiiiiiMify 

There is more to the Clark campaign than 
just a $100 limit on contributions. Clark's 
record in government is enviable. His years at 

• M M o a o o o a o a o w M a a o o o e o o o o o w o a 

£.b-HtWiH 

the Justice Department were noteworthy lor 
many accomplishments. In such areas as civil 
rights, prisonreform, and civil liberties, Clark 
was at the forefront of change. In addition, he 
was a leader in anti-trust enforcement, cur­
tailing the merger activity of such industry 
titans as IBM and ITT. 

A Bad Year for the Pundits? 

The pundits say Clark has no chance of 
defeating Jacob Javits, one of the most for­
midable vote getters in the history of New 
York State. But, in a tumultuous year such as 
this, one in which both the President and Vice-
President have been driven from office, 
anything is possible. As Senator J. William 
Fullbright can tell you, it is a bad year for in­
cumbents. 

PIOOaOBBBHi 

Special Events Board welcomes you and your parents to 

Parents' Weekend '74 
12:00 

9:30 

Friday, October 4 
Movies: |FG-WhoJ's Up Tiger Lily LC 18 7:15 9:45 

Tower East - Emperor of the North Pole LC 7 7:30 10:00 

Albany State Cinema - Jeremy LC 1 & 2 7:30 8:30 

Saturday, October 5 
CoMMUIty-Ualverai ty Day on the Academic Podium and in the Gym. 10:30-5:00 

Receptions & tours on the Quads - State : 1:00 - 3:00 Colonial : 10:30 - 12 

Tours on Indian : 10:30 - 4 Dutch : 10:30 • 12 

Nitty Gri t ty D i r t Bend c c Ballroom 8:00 and 10:30 Students w/tax $2.50 $5 w/o tax 

Parents accompanied by student w/tax card $2.50 

Movies: Tower East: Slaughter House Five LC 7 7:30 10:00 

Albany State Cinema : Magical Mystery Tour LC 18 7:00 8:30 10:00 

Sunday, October 6 
Coatlaeatal Breakfast w/ guest speaker President Benezet CC Ballroom 10:00 am 

Only students accompanied by parents will be admitted 

Free tickets still available in the CC lobby today and tomorrow 

Alumni Quad reception - in Sayles Halt- International House ' 8:30 J 
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SPEAKERS FORUM 
Your Student Tax Dollars At Wbrk 

(and how much they're really worth) 
HANNEFORD CIRCUS 

($3500.) A three ring circus 
with elephants, lions, tigers, 
horses in the SUNYA gym, 
Sunday, Oct. 13. Shows at 
2:30 & 5:30 751 for children 
under 12 and students with 
tax cards. $1.25 for 
everyone else. Tickets are on 
sale everyday in the Cam­
pus Center Lobby from 11 -
2 and are also on sale the day 
of the circus, 2 hours before 
etfch show. 

iiiiiiiiimiiiiiiiiMiiiiiiiimKiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiitiiiiiiiiiMiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiimi 

iiiiiiiiiiiimiiiiHiiiiiiiiiiimiimiiiiiiiimi 

HUNTER S THOMPSON 

($1400.) Wednesday, Nov. 
15, CC Ballroom at 8l3T~ 
Nat'l Affairs editior of 
"Rolling Stone Magazine", 
author ofFearandLoathim 
on the Campaign Trail and 
the book on the Hells 
Angels. 

iiuuiHMiiiMtmnM 

CHRISTINE JORGENSEN 

($ 1200.) Thursday, Oct. 17, 
CC Ballroom at 8:00. 
Famous lecturer who, in 
1954 , underwent the first 
sex change operation. 

HiitiiiiiitiiiiMiiiiiuiiHmninmretmHHMi 

Illlil tllllXtllllltllllt till til IlilllMIII MMII11 ril ij 

FREDSTORASKA 

CICELY TYSON 

(co-sponsored with EOPSA, 
$ 2500.) Tuesday , Oct. 29. 
CC Ballroom at 8:00. Star 
of "Sounder" and "The 
Autobiography of Miss Jane 
Pittman". note: no cameras 
will be allowed inside the 
Ballroom during Miss 
Tyson's performance. 

Y 
t 
i 
i 
i 
i 
i 
i 
i 

iiiiiiiiiimimuuiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiimniuiiiHMHiiiiiiiiiiiHiiiiiiiie 

biiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiimiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiMiiiiiiiiiiiimiiiiimiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiitiii 

($ 1,000.) Monday. Nov. 4, 
LC 18 at 8:00. America's 
foremost expert on rape. He 
spokeat SUNYA last year to 
capacity crowds. § 

irilllllllllllUIIHNIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIIII|IIIIIIIHIlE 

SPRING SEMESTER I 

FLO KENNEDY 
($ 750.) Monday, Jan. 27, 

DAVID HALBERSTAM 
($ 1250.) Wednesday, Nov. 
II, CC Ballroom at 8:00. 
Author of best selling The 
Best and the Brightest, and 
also a former foreign cor­
respondent for the N.Y. 
Times and Pulitzer Prize 
winner 

iiiiiiiiiHiiiiiiHiiiiimiiiiiiiiiiiHiiiiiiiiiiimiiiiina> 

CC Ballroom at 8:00. Out­
spoken feminist, organizer 
of N.O.W. 

JUSTICE 
WILLIAM O DOUGLAS 

Thursday, March 6, in = 
the gym at 8:00. Famous f 
Supreme Court Justice and | 
Civil Libertarian 

ALGER HISS 
($ 600.) Wednesday, April 1 
23 through Friday, April 25. | 
Former high ranking State | 
Department official who in | 
1949 was convicted of per- 1 
jury at the prodding of the | 
then young congressman | 
from California, Richard § 
Nixon. At the time of his 1 
conviction, Hiss was the § 
President of the Andrew | 
Carnegie Endowment for | 
International Peace. 

iiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiimiiiimiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii-

JERRY terHORST 

($ 1500.) Wednesday, Dec. 
jLin the gym at 8:00. Presi­
dent Ford's first appointee 
and press secretary. He left 
the Ford Administration in 
protest of the pardon 
granted to Nixon, sorry 
about the date change , but 
he's better late than never. i 

I 
m 
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•MabkA, 

ALSO THIS SEMESTER, 

RALPH NADER 
Thursday. Oct. 31. in the gym. 
Consumer advocate. 

DR. SOL GORDON 
Outrageous lecturer on 
human sexuality from 
Syracuse Univ. (a Richie 
recommendation) 

I 
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HOPEFULS 

hut yet to be confirmed 
for either semester 
WILLIAM F. BUCKLEY 
ISAAC A SI MOV 
DAN RATHER 
ROBERT SALTZMAN 
GEORGE PLIMPTON 
GLORIA STE1NEM 

1 WATCH FOR OUR POSTERS 1 
| § 
nnMimi iiiimiiiimiiiiiimiiimiiiiiiii iiiiiiiiiiiiimiiiiiiummiiiiiulR 

SPEAKERS FORUM 
HAS SEVERAL 
OPENINGS ON ITS COM­
MITTEE. THOSE IN­
TERESTED SHOULD 
ATTEND OUR 
MEETINGS AT 5:30 ON 
TUESDAYS IN THE 
FIRESIDE LOUNGE] 
ALL STUDENT T^X 
PAYERS ARE ELIGIBLE. 

jeci 

CUP AND SAVE This ad cost us $110. but we felt It was worthwhile to Inform you. 
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E M «*tE 
Trumpet, good condition. $90 356-

1171! 

1970 Gremlin itandard. 58,000 miles, 

good condition. Reawnable price 438-

cWSI " 

Olbton EtO Rati guitar, $145, Shure . 

unidirectional mike, $25,457-4665 aik 

.for Kathy or Nancy. 

Rickenbacker 12-itring itereo guitar. 

McOuinn model. $250.-Firm. 482-4117 

Fran. 

1968 Oldi Convertible. Very good con­

dition. Power everything. Coll John 

457-7968 

Camera: 35 mm Konica Auto S-2, 

automatic-manual, excellent condition. 

482-8783 

Fiat 1969,124 Sport Sprint $1100 

355- 6721, 

Mamlya Secor C330 Twin Lent Reflex 
w/80mm lens $250.00, Hershey Type 
flash with battery pack $40.00, G.A.F. 
lighting equltftrl«r»'$45?0O'.(Alt brand 
new andmustsell. Call Michael 5akoff 
482-5546. Will Deall 

Ping-Pong table $15—7-5293 after 3 

Royal Portable office typewriter-
good condition—$40, 7-5293 after 3 

1970 Fiat 850 sports coupe, needs 

work, make offer, call456-5336after5 

PM. 

Electric guitar and amplifier. 

Reasonable. Call 439-0807 

Stereo: "Best-Buy" Dynaco A-25 
speakers, Dynaco SCA80Q amplifier 
(80 RMS), Miracord turntable w/base 
and top cartridge, plus extras. Call 
Harvey 7-7952 

HOUSING 

Apt. mate needed to complete bus line 
apt. Females preferred. Own 
bedroom. Call 465-8996 

Unfurniihedflat with utilities, stove and 
refrigerator, four bedrooms, two 
baths, near Draper. Call 482-1400 

1 female roommate needed, own room 
-$80 per month—all utilities. Call Mar-
cy 465-1314. Near busline. 

Wanted: Males and/or females in­
terested In communal living to com­
plete mixed apartment. Lovable 
bunch, rent yery cheap. Larry, Jill: 482-
1689 

Fourth girl needed for apartment, $60 

per month. Near busline. Quiet house. 

Call mstfifLu iv 

Room in 9 room dot available far oho 

w o m a n — p r e f e r o lder or grad 

student—to t h a n with same. $69 plus 

utilities. 482-4136 

Female • Roommate wanted for a 4 girl 

apartment, 160/month. Good loca­

tion. Call 489-8685 

SERVICES 

Freel Male Siamese cat. Great in­
door/outdoor pet. Very healthy. 
Owner moving.' Call 482-3867 
evenings. 

Busy? Lazy? I patch, mend, embroider 

c lo th ing ( jeans especially). 

Reasonable. Lysa 7-5233 

Untraprolong is coming. 

I will paint any design on I 
Canvas for you. Finished needlepoint 
makesgreat presents—eyeglass cases, 
pillows, pictures—but unworked can­
vases are also great gifts for people 
who like to do needlepoint. 274-2927 

Do you have an interesting room? ASP 
reporter and photographer looking for 
imaginitive use of cubicle-like SUNYA 
rooms, for a fea ture . Call 
Features/Perspectives Editor, 7-8892 

4th SUNYA Annuol European Ski Tour 
St, Anton Austria Jem.9,79 — Jan. 19, 
79 $399 all Inclusive John Morgan 

' 457-4831 • 

Recorder lessons • beginning and ad­
vanced. Musicians and non-musicians. 
436-1074 

Experienced typist desires at home typ­
ing, letters, resumes, term papers, etc. 
Call 355-5690 

TYPING. Reports, Theses, etc. 346-
3277 after 6. Very Reasonable 

Students to teach Israeli dancing and 
singing to local youth group. Call trv 
457-7932 

HELP WANTED 

Part Time - customer Interviewing in 
major local dept. store In Colonie—No 
Selling—Guraranteed hourly wage 
plus generous incentive plan - days 
and hours flexible. For app't call Mr. 
Brown 271-6646 

Guitar Teacher wanted. Willing to 
traveltohomo in Delmar. Call 439-0807 

Typing, 75a a page. No theses 462-
0082 

Typing done in my home. 869-2474 

Homeworkers: Earn $25. per 100 stuf­
fing letters into already addressed, 
stamped envelopes supplied Free. Kit 
$ 1 . (refundable) Gemco, P.O.B. 
21244-M39, lndpls,Jnd.v4M21 j 

LOST & FOUND 
AS •. 

Reward. Male Irish Setter. 482-0634 

Lost: 1975 Whitetboro class ring 
Typing done in my home. 482-8432 Reward - Call 457-8771 

Instruction in flute • Reasonable rates. 
Coll 482-4368 

T'ai Chi Ch'uan - A Chinese form of 

movement meditation. 436-1074 

Bicycle repairs - Fred Vollmer, 7-8793 

M E N / — W O M E N ! 
/ob i on Ships! No experience re­
quired. Excellent pay. Worldwide 
fravel. Perfect summer job or career, 
send $3.00 for information. SEAFAX, 
Sept. M-9 P.O. Box 2049, Port Angeles, 
Washington 98362 

SCIENTOLOGY 
The Road To 
Total Freedom 

Come Visit Us At 

260 Lark Street 

Free Introductory lecture 

8:00 p.m. Tuesdays 

or Call: 462-6419 

Suzanne's Dance Studio 

•Beginners Encourged 

Swing Rumbu 

Fox Trot I'olka 

Cha Cha Waltz 

Muck and others 

Begin Oct. 7 call 456-6632 

LOW RATES 

P*JJMP*INe»*JJJsV< 

Sajfcfli 
^s Wed-Sun 

OnLino Street \ T / t V / \ 
(corner Madison/ ^ \ v y \ v 

Fr«« admiss ion, 

Sunday, Oct. 16, 

with this ad 

This 
Weekend: 

> 

MYRTLE 

sssfljjeflhof* 

If you ore a woman who Is tired of the 

passive role assigned to your sex, 

please write tome, l a m a male looking 

for the dominant woman who can fake 

control for her own pleasure. Please 

remember this would bo role playing to 

fuHHI our mutual needs; I a m not a 

gay, TV or sadist. I seek someone who 

shares my views and can conduct an In­

telligent discussion on the subject. I in­

vite any comments, -

Please write me at Box 761 dd , 1400 

Washington Ave., Albany. Discretion 

assured 

To Dane: 

Happy Birthday Old M a n 

* Happy l ^ o y S w e e t f e l At leottrm 
not In Prdncoi i ' 

••'love, 

Sua 

. Dear Renee, 
Come Sunday we may stop calling 

you Mom and starling you "Grand­

ma". Happy Birthdayl 

Love, 

Irving 

P h a l l o ^ 

Please com* home. All is forgiven, 

lustfully yours, 

Lewis 

Babe, Dear ARW, 

Everyday means loving you more. Ah Fuck Youl (Pretty witty, huh?) 

With love Forever, Jeffrey Fred 

Babushka 

Dear Cliff, 
y ver enn ngs. H birthday was happy. 
Hope you live to celebrate many . 

more "HAPPY BIRTHDAYS". v „ " )? ' 
_ . , _ Your Buddy 
Deb and Terry 

Htmtttm p. 19 

67 COLVIN AVE. 
right off SUNYA 

BUSLINE 

•Wl'9 
rfPPLi 

DircOT€QU€l 
9:30, 

dancing to 
3:DD 

OTE WW OMSE) S? KJ* ' 
dJJL'G, WWQ BEOSE0 SGi 

M 
Minima 

WiMVm L7GJG 
mm 

Colonial Quad 
Board seeks 

for coffee house and 
other events. 

Contact Rudy us soon 
as p***lhl4>r 7-8735. 
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, jngJprs & minors 

Geography Club guest speaker 
Professor J. Zimmerman (Political 
Science) will speak on 'Financing Public 
Transportation In NYS'. The talk will 
take place Thurs. Oct 10th at 8 IP.m., SS 
146. 

. . . 
There will be a general interest 

meeting of the Philosophy Cfub, 
Zoferifii.on Monday, Oct.7at8 p.m. 
In Humanities 354. 

Biology Cfub. announces the forma­
tion of a Biology Dept. Student Ad­
visory Committee. For further info., call 
Paul (489-2744). 

Information and applications for the 
New York State ngentt Scholarship 
Examination for Professional Study 
in Medicine, Dentistry, or Osteopathy 

are -available in University College. 
Application deadline is October 11, 
1974. 

^«>«JJ»«*«»»*«JHJ>sjjm»o» 

clubs & meetings 
V. 

All fmhman interested in organiz­
ing their class government and yearly 
activities are urged to attend a 
meeting on Monday, Oct. 7 at 8:13 
p.m. in CC 315. Questions? Call Linda 
017-7971. 

t * * 

The organizational meeting of the 
197475SUNYAWrestling C/uBwillbe 
at 4 PM on October 7. The meeting will 
be in the third floor lobby of the 
Physical Education Building next to the 
wrestling and weight rooms. If you con-
not attend, contact either Coach Gar­
cia or Coach Behe in the Phys. Ed. 
Building-Room 229. 

Reminder: Phoenix meets every 
Monday at 8 p.m. in the Humanities 
Lounge. 

There is now an OCF (Orthodox 
Christian fellowship) on campus. 
Anyone interested in belonging and 
attending meetings or simply talking 
about Orthodoxy • please call: Mary 7-
4300, or Dario 465-7681. 

The State Ostao) •" Singer* 

An interest meeting will bo held 
Sun. Oct. 13, at 10 PM in the lower 
LOUNGE OF Anthony Ha i r on Stat* 

For further into, caN lee at 7-4996. 

'• * * - *.' " 
There will be an interest meeting 

and discussion for those interested in 
Oriental rtsysticism a n d meditat ion. 
All those interested are urged to attend 
on Monday, October 6, 7:30 P-m. at 
Campus Center 973 . All 465-8425 for 
information. 

* * * 
Volunteers tar Mrddle Earth will 

meet Sunday night at 7:15 at 107 Ton. 
Eyck. Members of all components 
welcome. 

* • * 
There will be a Women's Gather ing 

Friday, Oct. 4 from 3:00-5:00 p.m. 
in the Women's Center, Cooper 100. 
Elizabeth Burns of the Counseling 
Center will be there to tolk. 

Mind games group farming. Con­
sciousness e x p a n s i o n , Sensory 
Awareness. Meets 8:00 Monday. Con­
tact Sam at 7-4330. 

* • * 
Ralph G. Caso, Republican can­

didate for Lieutenant-Governor will be 
speaking Wednesday, October 9th at 
12 noon in the CC Ballroom. Come 
listen!! 

Off Campus Student C o - o p -

All Present and Prospective off-campus 

students are urged to attend the 

organizational meeting Tuesday (Oct. 

8) at 8:30 P-». Robin 457- 6542. 

ŝfc<sssss«e»ss» 

' ' i*»»li,»e> * » » O*«fc0J»*» • ' 

Toy-Sachl diseo*e can be detected 
before birth. Come to Operation Gone 
Screen Sunday, October 6 at the 
Albany Jewish Community Cantor from 
10 a.m.-4 p.m. WOT shuttle buses to 
a nd f rom the circh) every half-hour. 

• * * 
October Is here again and soon 

Halloween as well. Be port of SUNYA's 
3rd annuoirrir* or Treat tar UNfCfr* 
Fund raising drive Fat mora Informa­
tion call Claire 7-4700. 

• i • 
Anyone intere«te.-l in playing in the 

JI .MJ. i l . !©off Tournament 
scheduled for next weekend, please 
contact Doug lewanda at 457-7977, or 
Nolan Altman at 437-7703, or come up 
and visit the A . M . I . A. office located 
on the 3rd floor of the Campus 
Center. Tonite at 7:30 P-m-

U.S.—China Veop.es' Friendship 
Assoc, will be celebrating the 25th an­
niversary of the Peoples' Republic of 
China, Join us ai the First Presbyterian 
Church on State and Willet Streets. For 
more info., call Tommy at 472-8761. 

All tufheran students and other in­
terested Christians are invited to par­
ticipate In a Contemporary Celebra­
tion of Holy Communion at 3:00 
p.m., Sunday, Oct. 6, In Chapel 
House. * « * 

Feeling the everyday hassios of 
living?—Need someone to talk to?— 
Information or referrals?—Call fAid-
die Barth Switchboard at 457-5300, 

glrobuctionts 
Jlmmta: 

MAHAVISHNII ORCHESTRA 
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h'litiirinu 

John McLaughlin ami Jraii-Lur l\m.y 

REPORTERS 

INTERVIEWERS 

INVESTIGATORS 
...and other 

sordid 
species. 

Come to an ASP meeting in the 
Fireside Lounge. Monday, Oct 7 

This may be your first step to 

®he Stem $ork Stonta 
(Well, would you believe the Troy Rfirnrn">) 
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.& Attention all Freshmen! -„,, 

*t 

Now's your chance to establish an organized 

class government. 

Want to find out more?... 

Monday, Oct. 7 at 8:15 pm CC. 315 
Meet your class guardians. 

Many important ideas will be 
discussed. $** 
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' rite Oaf Allkiim wlH be meeting 
Tuesday evenings at 9~p.m in the 
Patroon Lounge on the first floor of tho ' 
Campus Conter. -

:• * • 
An introductory lecture on 

. fckanfar , the Ancient Science ef 
' Total Aworeness, will bo hefd at tho 

Chapel House an Wednesday, October 
9, at 7:30 p m , ECKANKAft is not a 
yoga, religion, or philosophy, nor a 
metophyical or occult system, ft is mere­
ly a way to God-realization via Soul 
Travel. 

. . . 
A New Interest Group forming for 

the Sport of Archery. Anyone who is in­
terested is welcome!!! Please call Dale 
as soon as possible at 7-5231. . 

Interested in Tai Chi Chuan, the an­
cient Chinese ait of self defense? 
Class will be held at Rm. 147 Draper 
Hall Saturday mornings from 10:00 
to 11:00 a.m.. Oct.5thto Dec.21.Tui­
tion free (donation basis). For registra­
tion and information, call Mr. Szeto 
783-5727. 

* s « j * j « j e j o » g > i 

what to do 

Wine and Cheese Party FRIDAY 
Oct. 4 in the Women's Center—Cooper 
100, from 3-5 p.m. Student-faculty get--
together. Everyone invited. 

".J.OO,;*.,..., ,* '*' 
d rWWScSe'faohouse committee will 

.ihofdjtpii,; interest meeting on Wednes­
d a y , October 9 at 8 p.m. in Chapel 
House. Anyone who wishes to know 
more about Rafters and.br help out is 
welcome. 

* * * 
"Saylei International Open House 

will be held Sunday, October 
6th from 1:30p.m. to 2:30 p.rri! We're 
located on Alumni Quad, 179 Par­
tridge St. 

ciAssiftin 
DEAR WEAKtING 

I'M SO GLAD I HAVE YOU. 

LOVE. 

B.S. 

Gail, 
Name tags aren't so bad. 

Rich 

To those whocame to hear Hugh Carey 
last Saturday, many thanks. You 
helped when we needed it. 

Steve, Candi, and Lew 

To the Little fellow: 
Happy Birthday Larry. 

From 
Steve, Andy, AI, Brian, John, Dave, 

Leslie & JoAnne 

Dear Chicken Legs, 

When I'm on Ihe moon be there tool I 

love you. 

Tuck 

I 

Come down to the PIT PARTY tonite— 
Get juiced & loose on Sunrises & 

Beer. 9PM - Downtown - 50s 
sophomores, $1.00 oil others. 

Diane, 
Happy DirthduySweetlel 

Love, 

June 

Dear Puta: 
Happy One-Year Anniversaryl 

Love, 
Your Woman 
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a party in the German tradition 

•;»Sv 'S-^i-.i ^Js$Sffv'*jU 

location: Alumni Quad courtyard 

fl***-, 

tickets on sale in Campus Center 

ticket prices: 

$1. with Alumni Quad Card (advance) 
1.50 with Alumni Quad Card (at the door) 
1.50 with Tax Card (advance) 
2.00 with Tax Card (at the door) 

• 2.50 General Admission BJ&'MB * i s m 

Booters Readying tor Key SUNYAC Contest 

(4 

by Nathan Sabnt .,__ 
Tomorrow,- October 5~. at 11 

. a. m., the Albany State O real Danes 
soccer team will host Cortland State 
in a key State! University of New 
Vork Athletic Conference game. 
Both teams are undefeated in con-

i ference play, and the result should 
indicate just how good the Danes 
really are. Perhaps indicative of the 
importance of this game is the fact 
the WSUA has decided to carry the 
game live. 

"This is a key game for us." said 
Coach Bill Schieffelin. "I hoped we 
would°be 4-0 going in. and I only 
hope we are 5-0 coming put. You 
have to take them one at a time, and 
this is one I really want to take." 

Schieffelin sees Cortland as "a fast 
and aggressive team with good 
balance and depth, not unlike our 

• o w n . Generally, if Cortland carries 
twenty players, twenty will play." 

The Booters match up at least 
evenly with Cortland. Albany will 
field a healthy team, with no injuries 
to worryabout. Albany's defense has 
been rated among the best in the 
S t a t e by opposing coaches, 
anchored by goalie Henry Obwald, 
and fullbacks Bob Schlegel. Leroy 
Aldrich, Emerick Brownc-Marcke, 
and Arthur Bedford. "Superlative 
speed and excellent skills" was the 
way Buffalo State Coach Hartwick 
rated it. 

The halfbacks are also solid, with 

New Paltz Hosts Netters 
by Lynn A. O'Garrow 

Some of the finest tennis talent in the East will be displayed at the Eastern 
Collegiatcs at New Paltz, October 4 through 6. Albany will be sending their 
two excellent singles players, Louise Covitt and Terri Kcrman. Louise and 
Terri arc established veterans and should do well. 

The strong doubles teamof Pat I'odgorski and Dorri Uurre should beahle 
to intimidate their opponents and win the title. Bonnie Kawitzand freshman 
Claire CJoldman round out a very strong team. Albany will be up against a 
very tough field that includes Skidmore, St. Lawrence, University of Ver­
mont, Colgate, Queens, Lehman, Stony Brook and Onconta. 

1200 WESTERN AVE 
(Directly Across From 

SUNYA) 

All-New York State player Johnny 
Rolando on the left. Jerry Lee Hing 
in the middle, and either Wayne Gar-
roway or' Ricardo Rose on the right 
(Garroway sometimes sees action up 
front). Carlos Rovito and Denzil 
Ciirew give the Danes depth here. 
Most soccer people point to the half­
backs as the key to a good learn as 
they play both ways (offense and 
defense) and serve as a link between 
the offense and fullbacks. When the 
halves play well, the Danes play well. 

The forward line continues to be 
the only area of concern for 
Schieffelin. where individuals turn in 
brilliant performances for certain 
periods of time, and then seem to 
lose all sense of the game. While the 
Danes have allowed only two goals 
in lour games, they have scored only 

two in each of their Ian two gomes. 
The only player approaching con­
sistency up front baa been Chepe 
Ruano, with four goals and one 
assist. Frank Selca came alive for 
one half at Oswego, when he scored 
twice, but a leg infection forced him 
to sit out most of the Buffalo Stale 
game. Pascuali Petriccione has 
shown signs, of life, and Pauli 
SchieseL Matte Denora arid Edgar 
Martinez are all talented, but just 
have not scored in the playing time 
they have had. Interestingly enough, 
the player with the most potential up 
front may be Clinton Aid rich, yet his 
emotions occassionally get the better 
of him. as seen at Buffalo Slate. 
With his excellent speed and fine 
skills. Clinton could mature into as 
good a right wing as Albany has 
seen, but his head may have to 

mature, too. 

"The key to our team i i our depth 
and speed,"said Schieffelin. "I can 
shuffle players between positions, in 
and out of the game, and lose little in 
the way of talent or soccer sense. 
Sometimes it is almost a coin tots 
which decide* who will start. 

?To beat Cortland, we will need ] 
two things: a strong game from j 
everyone, and the type of fan tup- \ 
port we got during the Fredonia j 
rain-a-thon. Certainly, the Fredonia j 
crowd was the loudest in the twelve • 
years I have been here, and if we can • 
multiply those 100 tans by- 10 or : 
twenty, the psychic value of that sup- I 
port would put us ahead at least 1-0 
before the game starts. Once again I 
wunt to thank the 100 people who ' 
supported us against Fredonia." 

SUTTER'S 
MILL & MINING CO 

Restaurant and Bar 
FREE BARREL OF DEER AFTER 

SUNYA FOOTBALL GAME ON SAT 

Thurs. night - Happy Hour 7:30 to 
9:30 pm 
Mixed drinks and beer half price 

Sun. afternoon - Special 12:00 to 
8:00 pm 
Steerburgers $.75 

Socoar team preparing for aUrtwdsn/a hem* gam* wrwa a tough CerHand team. 

£J Bombshell Tries Again 

Can "Wholesale speed reading at 
the "Y" teach you to read 1,000 

words a minute? 
Yes, 1000 words every minute -a skill you can sue to quadruple your 

reading speed with no loss of comprehension! 

And you can achieve this skill - not for the $290. you'd expect to pay 
for a top-quality speed reading course - but for only $98. complete! 

That's all it costs - not one cent more - lor a full 6 week instruclional 
program (one class per week for VA hours). And best of all, you gel 
small, intimate classes....Individualized instruction and all classroom 

.materials, including manuals and reading books, at absolutely no ex-
Tfa expense. 

And all this is yours - not for the $290. you'd expect in pay - but for 
only $98. complete. Why? Because it's given al the Y.M.C.A.! 

So why not prove it all to yourself, without risking a penny! Call 
now and make your reservation lor a free demonstration lesson to be 
given al Ihe V.M.C.A. You may not improve fast enough to read 1,000 
words per minute...bul then again you may well go beyond that golden 
mark! 

FREE INTRODUCTORY LESSONS 
Calss now forming. For Appointment 
CALL ALBANY "Y" AT 449-7196 

274 Washington Ave. 

by Blonde Bombshell 
NEW YORK over ATLANTA 

by 5. After the way the Giants played 
last week, how can you not pick 
them. Atlanta must win if they still 
have hopes. 

C H I C A G O o v e r N E W 
ORLEANS by 4. The Bears arc 
tough with their new-found offense. 
New Orleans also has the weaker 
defense. 

DALLAS over MINNESOTA by 
3. Alter last week's game how can I 
pick Dallas. But Minnesota has had 

offense problems and when was the 
last lime Dallas has lost three in a 
row. 

L.A. over DETROIT by 10. The 
Rams were upset last week, and this 
week they go out for revenge. 

BUFFALOoverGREEN BAY by 
2. A real close one but Fcrgusen is 
better than Tagge, 

PHILADELPHIA over SAN 
DIEGO hy 9. The Eagles found their 
offense last week. The Chargersjust 
lost to Miami but I'm afraid that was 
their big effort lor a while. 

Introducing The Newly Opened 

PVT 
j / / Phone 439-9859 

BENNYS 
1360 New Scotland Ave. 
Slingerland, N. Y. 

HOT MEATBALL SANDWICHES 
SAUSAGE PEPPER ONION SANDWICHES 

PIZZA H CLAMS ....raw or i 

mm wir mm®-
noiB 

OPENED DAILY • mm. to i am. 
SUNDAYS g»PM.toSfa . 

S.F. over ST. LOUIS by 6.1 just 
can't believe the Cards are that good. 

' S.F. isn't what il used to be but they 
might surprise. 

C I N C I N N A T I ,* over 
WASHINGTON by 3. The 
Redskins were impressive bin the 
Monday night jinx will affect the old 
men. 

NEW E N G L A N D over 
BALTIMORE by (>. The Patriots 
cannot let up. Joe Thomas finds out 
the coach is only as good as his 
players. ', 

OAKLAND over CLEVELAND 
by 6. The Oakland defense is just loo 
tough lor I'hipps. 

DENVER over K.C. by 10. The 
winless Broncos have played better 
than that. They finally gei one in Ihe 
left column. 

PITTSBURGH over HOUSTON 
hv I.I. Joe Gilliam shows what he's 
made of, Ihe mad bomber gels im­
pressive stats for this one. 

MIAMI over NEW YORK by 7. 
How I wish il was ihe other way 
around. But Miami pulled oul last 
week'sand the race to the Super Bowl 
is on. 

Varsity Band 
The Albany State Varsity Band is 

now being formed. This completely 
student run band is looking for any 
students who play instruments. The 
Band hopes to play at the remaining 
football home games, and 
throughout the basketball season. 

eirfiWosefWhbiira'intercstcd should 
come to band practice on Tuesdays 
at 3:30 in PAC 78. There arc no 
auditions. 

" ! l 
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Munsey's Men Continue Winning Ways 
by George Mlitr 

The Albany State Harriers hosted 
their frtt triangular meet of the 
season Wednesday afternoon and 
found themselves going up against 
little competition as they trounced 
Siena 20-39 and RPI2040. The 

dual sweep pushed the vanity's 
record this fall to the 81 mark which 
is jusi about a good a record as will 
be found anywhere in the region.. 

Despite the cold, blustery 
weather, amazing times were turned 
in by the field, especially the Albany 

runners. - Placing first was Joe 
Rukanshagiza of Siena who was 
clocked in 25:44.1, which was the 
19th best time ever turned in over 
the Albany campus course. Next to 
finish up, were a string of Great 
Dane runners lead by Carlo 

Tht Cross-country team practicing for thatr most against WHIIame Collage tomorrow. 

Cherubino with a 26:17 and Vinnie 
Reda with a 26:24. 

For Cherrie it was surprisingly his 
i second best time ever here. Close 
behind came freshmen Steve Archer 
and Brian Davis each with a 26:58. 
Gary Furlong showed some excep­
tionally strong running'as he ran a 
27:21, which proved to be S3 seconds 
better than his fastest time to date.. 
Seventh place was grabbed by Fred 
Kitzrow with a 27:22 and Eric 
Jackson followed him in with his 
fastest time ever of 27:32. 

Munsey Happy 

Afterwards Coach Munsey felt, 
"They looked awfully, awfully good. 
They ran a very relaxed race w'ith no 
real pressure. 1 think they surprised 
themselves with rather fantastic 
times." 

The weather couldn't help but 
have a hampering effect on the 
runners as a strong wind, which has 
become atrademarkof the SUNYA 
campus, once again was up to its old 
tricks. According to Coach Munsey. 
"It was good running temperaturo-
wise; the problem was the wind. It 
was a real bitter wind." 

Regardless, il'sapparcnt the team, 
as a whole, is continuing to put out 
more in each meet then the 
proceeding one. This trend is what 
Munsey's been looking for. 

Jj As he says, "We've reached that 
1 higher plane of running; I do think 

we are about there. You couldn't ask 
for much better in oerformance; 

we're just continuing to run well." 
Another surprising fact that 

makes the win look even more im­
pressive is that Chris Burns and Her-
bie Hason, State's number three and 
four runnersdid not compete. Burns 
stayed out due to a leg injury and 
Hason was rested. 

Albany's freshman crop looks 
very strong this year, as they helped 
place the first seven men in the all 
time top 50 times for Albanyrunners 
here. 

"This is really nice to see." stated 
Coach Munsey. "They were running 
without having to run." 

Face Williams 

Tomorrow the harriers will havea 
little more to worry about, as they 
face a definitely stronger Williams 
team. 

"We're looking forward to a little 
more challenge," said Coach 
Munsey. "If we do our duty and 
don't horse around - we gave 
Syracuse a battlcand knocked Army 
out of there -1 don't think Williams 
will handle us, but you never know." 

Admittedly, the competition will 
be tougher but that should make the 
running proportionally belter. As 
Coach Munsey says, "This team is 
far ahead of any team we've over had 
at this time of year." 

Potential, development, execu­
tion. They all seem to be present and 
falling into place for this year's varsi­
ty. Where will it all lead? 

Ahonen Gets Nod Against RIT Tomorrow 
by Lea Zuckerman 

Dave Ahonen will get his chance 
to prove himself at quarterback 
tomorrow when they take on RIT in 
a 2 p.m. start. This will be his first 
starting assignment in a Great Dane 
uniform. 

Coach Bob Ford has always ex­
pressed a great deal of confidence in 
his young quarterback. "I think 
Dave has looked fine in two scrim­
mages and in practice. The Alfred 
situation was tough because of the 
weather, so 1 can't .fault his perfor­
mance." Ford was referring to 
Ahoncn's problem of fumbling and 
inability to move the ball. On a dry 
field Ford feels that Ahonen will be 
able lo do a good job. 

John Bcrtuzzi. the regular 
quarterback, suffered a dislocated 
left thumb in last week's 7-6 victory 
over Alfred. The preliminary 
medical report revealed that John 
would be inactive for three weeks. 
However, Bertuzzi has been working 
out all week and feels he can be ready 
tomorrow, Coach Ford does not 
want to rush the situation, so he will 
go with Ahonen, 

KIT and Albany have met four 
times in the past with the Great 
Danes holding a 3-1 advantage. The 
game last year at Rochester ended in 

a 19-0 Albany victory. Coach Ford 
calls this "an intense rivalry with 
each game a physical test for both 
squads." 

On the season, RIT is 0-2 with 
defeats at the hands of Hobart and 
St. Lawrence. ThisRIT team is prac­
tically the same one that faced the 
Danes last season, with the excep­
tion of a new head coach. 

Coach Ford feels that KIT has a 
very strong defensive line which will 
put pressure on his offensive 
linemen. Paul Isbell at middle guard 
is a standout for the KIT defense. 
Ford stated, "Rl'l is as big defensive­
ly as Alfred. We must use our speed 
to compensate for the weight we are 
giving away." Ford hopes that the 
Dane offense can move the ball lo 
the outside and control the KIT 
defensive line. 

On offense, the KIT line is very 
young which will aid the Great 
Danes. The inexperience of the RIT 
offense should make matters easier 
for the awesome Dane defense. This 
is a defensive squad that held 
Hofstra and Alfred to a mere thir­
teen points. 

The Danes will be without the ser­
vices of Jim llolloway, the fine 

.defensive lineman, who is out with a 
shoulder injury. Coach Ford must 

shuffle his line to fill the gap opened 
by Holloway's injury. 

RIT has two fine running backs in 
John Humphrey and Al Lent/.. 
Humphrey was called by Ford "the 
best tailback we've faced in four 
years." 

The Dane coaching staff it hoping 

for good weather tomorrow. The 
rain last week made field conditions 
dangerous for the players. Coach 
Ford remarked that, "Our kids arc 
not taking RIT lightly, the team 
morale was high at all our practices." 

Albany State is currently ranked 
number two in the Lambert Bowl, 

signifying the best regional foot­
ball team. Ithaca College is ranked 
number one and Coach Ford feels 
that if Albany can keep winning, 
then the pressure is on Ithaca to win 
as well. Albany Slate football is on 
the verge of gaining glory; it already 
gained respectability. 

Punt, Pass and Kick 
Tomorrow afternoon the football 

• department will hold a novel event, 
I as a punl, pan* and kick competition 
I will take place at naif lime of the 
| Danes-it IT football game. 

Selected celebrities from the area 
•were untied lo participate. Those 

who have accepted so far include 
.icolty McAndrews, who has the 
morning show on WPTK, Bill 
Heller, who wrilea sports for tht 
Times-Union, Kenneth Arduino, 
associate sports editor of the ASP 
and Poug l.ewandi, sports director 
of WSUA. Oano quarterback John Btrtuut fei obvloua pain otter dMoeatlng thumb In last Saturday's gams. 
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Alton Smith Controversy Continues Unabated 

Alton Smith will appsal hit telony conviction sometime In December. 

by Richard Nordwind 
Almost one year after his arrest, 

the controversy and legal manuever-
ing over the Alton Smith case con­
tinues unabated. The Alton Smith 
story epitomizes the tensions 
between the black community and 
the Albany Police, as well asdistrust 
between the University and the 
Police. 

On Nov. I 1973, Alton Smith was 
charged with 7 counts of felonies, 
following a violent altercation with 
two police officers, and the acciden­
tal shooting of a bystander. The in­
dictments were for 1st and 2nd 
degree assault and reckless en-
dangerment. 

Smith, a black Albany State un­
dergraduate art major, had wounded 
another Stale student, Michael 
Greggo, during the incident. Greggo 
was not seriously wounded in the 
shooting. 

Only two facts about the Nov. I 
incident are agreed upon by Smith 
and the Police. One is that it took 
place on Delaware Ave., near the 
Delaware Movie Theatre, a little 
before 10 I*. M, Secondly, both sides 
concur that Smith was near his car 

SA Lists Invalidated Elections; 
Some Council And Senate Totals In 

by Nancy Albauijli 
file results of several Student 

Association elections are now of­
ficial; the rest of the elections were 
invalidated by SA President Put 
Currun. 

From Indian Quad, Maureen 
DcMalo won a seat on Central 
Council. Roberta llarwitl won the 
State Quad Council scat, and (he 
two Colonial seats went to Arthur 
l.evine and Linda Shore. 

file results of the Council for the 
Class of'76 will be released pending 
the rerun of the commuter election. 
I'he votes from the five quads were 
not invalidated. 

All the commuter elections (for 2 
Council seats, a University Senate 
seat, and the '76 Council) were in­
validated because, according to 
Curran, the names slipped on the 
machine so that when a person press­
ed a lever, he had no way of knowing 
whose name he was programming 
into the machine. 

I'he elections for 2 Central Coun­
cil seats and one University Senate 
seat on Dutch Quad were in­
validated, said Curran, because the 
machine was not working properly 
and (here was no space provided for 
write-in voles. 

The Alumni Quad returns for 2 
Central Council scuts were in­
validated because one of the can­
didates was a pollsitler, said Curran. 
Ira Hirnbauni, SA Vice President, 
declined to give Ihe candidate's 
name, saying, "lie's still running, 
and it might not he fair." 
' Currun said that the elect ions will 

all he conducted by paper ballot this 
time. Ihey will not reopen 
nominations. 

Said Central Council Chairperson 
David Coyne, "Pat tried to in­
validate as lew of Ihe elections us 
possible, There was a lot of lime and 
money spent already, and he wanted 
lo save as much as he could." 

I.inda Weinslock, President of the 
Class of '75, is election com­
missioner. ('intuit stressed thai the 
confusion during the elections was 

1)01 entirely her fault. "We .needed 
somebody, and she said she'd help 
out." Hirnbauni added, "We all 
should have educated her more." 

I.inda Weinslock in response to 
recent charges of "incompetence" 
siiid, "I can't see any justification of 
it for me. I was under the impression 
that I would be helped." She further 
qualified her statements by saying, 
"One person having all that respon­
sibility is ridiculous - lhal is, unless 
that is the only thing they're involved 
with. I'm President of the Class of'75 
and Freshman class guardian as 
well." 

Hirnbauni looks ahead lo next 
week's elections with a little more 
hope. "We're loo inexperienced at 
this business to know perfectly what 
we're doing. I expect that there will 
probably be a couple of minor Haws. 
However, we've learned from ex­
perience, and Idoubl that we'll make 
the major mistakes we made last 
week." 

Lasl Wednesday night, Council 
repealed an election law that had 
been passed by lasl year's Council. 
Hirnbauni alleges dial before the law 
was scratched from Ihe hooks, it was 
violated several times. According lo 
the law. candidates lor elected 
SA positions must attend a meeting 
lo brief litem for their respon­
sibilities if elected. This meeting is 
supposed to he held one week before 
the election. Hut Ihe meeting for 
these recent elections was held two 
days before the election was to be 
held. Not all of the candidates were 
notified of their obligation to come. 

As well, the law staled lhal the S A 
President, Vice-President, Central 
Council Chairperson, and Vice-
Chairperson were lo attend. Veep 
Ira Hirnbauni was Ihe only one from 
SA who went. 

Coyne said, "I don't think anyone 
would deny thai the hill was 
violated. It's just that no charges 
have been brought up as yd." 

is^&&ssfflm^#ffifms&f&8M&si0s& 

SA Election Results 
•: Indian Quad 
•: Maureen De Maio 82 
\ Neill Cohen 47 
ji Write-ins 
•i Robert Raucti I 
jj J. Lutfi I 
; David I'osner I 
:• State Quad 
I Karen Floren 65 
| Koberla llartwill 77 

Colonial Quad 
} Paul Hobart 48 
: Arthur Levins 67 
j Neil .1. O'Connor 53 
i I.inda Shore 70 
i Mark S. Jaffee 50 
: Andy Mair 49 

Wriif-iiw 
Jell Cordova 36 
Arthur Fruholf I 
Jim Maiignim I 

Alan Moses I 
Richard (iiosa I 
Christopher Brown I 
Doug Klein I 
Jesse Scigel I 
Kuss Hall I 
Neal Shupak I 
Dave lluiise I 
(ilea Heer I 
Don Weicker 1 
Rich Weicker I 
Harry Goodman .1 
Keilh (iiecnburg I 
Rudy (iamberini 
Peter Alflcrbucli 
Howard Jacobs 
Rob Dcanc 
Thou Bernstein 2 
Void I 
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when the trouble began. From this 
point the two stories are radically 
different. 

"Alton was just checking out his 
car, when two men called down the 
street to him, 'Hey nigger! Hey 
coon!," says Smith's lawyer Mike 
Feit. Only later, Feit states, was 
Smith to discover that the two men 
were policemen. The two cops, later 
identified as Officer Manion and 
Dcctcctivc Tobin never presented 
Smith with identification, claims 
Feit. 

According to Smith, the two men 
grabbed him, and began beating him 
for no reason. Feit recounts, "Alton 
was down on the ground yelling for 
the police to help." 

A gun from the holster of one of 
the policemen fell lo the ground dur­
ing the fight, and Smith was able to 
grab it. 

"All Alton wanted to do was to 
fire the gun in the air for attention. 
He thought he was a dead man other 
wise," believes Feit. Instead of firing 
in the air the gun went off on street 
level, wounding Michael Greggo 
who had been sitting in a car one 
block away. Greggo had not known 
about the altercation. 

Police units in the area helped to 
subdue Smith, and placed him under 
arrest. Feit claims that Smith had 
severe head injuries from his struggle 
with the police, "which weren't 
properly treated until days later." 

Smith was charged with several 
counts of 1st and 2nd Degree 
Assualt. Bail, set at $20,000. was 
raised with the help of the N AACP, 
and the Union Settlement'. 

Smith took two lie detector tests; 
one in mid-November and the other 
in May. Each confirmed his 
testimony. 

Ihe District Attorney's office re­
jects Smith's assertation that he was 
the victim of blatant police brutality.« 

Smith "suspicious" 

"The two policemen were on a 
prostitution stake-out when Ihey 
saw a black male, later identified as 
Alton Smith, acting suspiciously.", 
says Steve Coffey, prosecuting at­
torney in the Smith case. 

The policemen, Coffey argues, im­
mediately identified themselves to 
Smith, so as to ask some routine 
questions. Alton Smith, Coffey 
states, threw the first punches at the 
policemen, and "fought like a mad 
bull" before he was arrested. 

Nor did the District Attorney's of­
fice believe Smith's version of the 
shooting incident. "The policemen 
thought that Smith was pointing the 
gun right up in at them, not up in the 
air," says Coffey. And Coffey further 
claims that it took a number of 
policemen to subdue Smith after his 
arrest. "This was not the actions of a 
man who hud just been severely 
beaten." 

I'he trial did not begin until July, 
1974, It lusted five days, was well 
covered by the local media, and well 
attended by members of the black, 
and University community. In his 
three years at SUNYA Smith hud 
built up an excellent reputation for 
his art work, and academic 
achievements, and many in the Un­
iversity came to support Smith, and 
offer character witness in his 
defense. 

The trial centered around three 
main arguements: Did the police 
offer identification to Smith?, did 
witnesses on Delaware Ave. actually 
see Smith being beaten? was the 
testimony of either Smith, or Officer 
Manich, and Detective Topin incon­
sistent with previous testimony given 
to the grand jury? 

The jury, confused by the exact 
meaning of the seven indictments, 
repeatedly asked presiding Judge 
John Clyne for instructions. After 
long deliberation the jury cleared 
Smith of all 1st Degree assault 
charges, but found him guilty of two 
counts of 2nd degree assault. In 
other words, the jury did not believe 
that Smith had attacked thcofficers, 
but they did find Smith guilty of 
resisting the policemen's perfor­
mance of duly. 

Defense scores Clyne 

After Ihe trial, one of Ihe jurors. 
Louis A. I essier said the jurors in­
correctly thought Ihey could find 
Smith guiliy of resisting arrest even 
though that charge was not part of 
the indictment, Another juror. 
William Strancy. regretted he had 
mil "held out" for an innocenl ver­
dict on all counts, according to feit. 

Defense attorneys were furious at 
Judge Clyne for what they felt were 
"insulficenl instructions to the jury." 
It was lack of knowledge, Feit 
believes, that led to Smith's two 
count conviction. Smith was 
sentenced to a five year probation 
period by the judge. 

So the process for appeal began. 
Such a process is un expensive 

one, and Smith with the aid of the 
NAACP, American Civil Liberties 
Union, teachers at SUNYA. and 
community leaders, have begun a 
fund raising drive lo raise legal fees. 
I'he Alton Smith legal defense fund 
hopes to raise $2,000 through private 
donations, and fund-raising events, 
on-campus and off. I'he appeal will 
be lodged with the Apellate Division 
of N.Y. suite courts. 

"Alton Smith is u remarkable 
young man," says Paul Smith, a 
chaplain at the University, and a 
firm Alton Smith supporter. "He 
battled his way up from a poverty 
background, and he's displayed a 
fantastic talent for ail." Like many 
others, Paul Smith does not believe 
Alton Smith was capable of com-
miting the crimes he was convicted 
of. 

D.A. backs his case 

"Believe me," says Ralph Smith, 
D.A. of Albany, "we look a good, 
long look at this case before we 
brought it to trial. Alton Smith did 
have a fine background, and he ob­
viously was a person of talent." 
Nevertheless, the D.A. felt the case 
against Smith was strong enough to 
bring lo court, and strong enough to 
win against any appeal. 

"All these people who testify in 
Alton Smith's behalf, how the hell 
do they know what happened that 
night?" asks Ralph Smith. 

One person who does know U 
Alton Smith himself, and he is reluc­
tant lo talk for fear of endangering 
his chances for appeal, 

"The facts speak for themselves," 
is all that Alton Smith will say about 
the night of Nov, I, 


