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Danes Prove Too Deep For Union, 8 5 - 7 0 
by Ppul Schwartz 

"The bench" is a term not 
popular with many basketball 
players, but as the Dane's season 
wears on, that specific group is 
becoming more and more impor­
tant. On Saturday, Albany's 
starters were oulscorcd by Union's 
first five, 61-51, but as has been the 
case the entire season, the Dane's 
reserve corps more than made up 
the difference. The five-man unit 
hit 70 percent of their shots, 
outscored Union's bench 34-9, and 
provided the impetus for Albany's 
85-70 victory at University Gym. 

Super-sub Pete Stnnish again ig­
nited the Dane offense, finishing 
with a team-high 16 points (II in 
ihc second half) on six-l'or-scvcn 
from die field and four of six free 
throws, helping Albany shool 5H 
percent for the contest, and im­
prove their record to 16-4. 

"Tlicy were just too deep," said 
Union basketball coach Mill 
Staiilon. "We dug a hole/ for 
ourselves early - our defense was 
incredibly poor in the first half. But 
in die first 15 minutes of (he second 
half I think we outplayed them. We 
gol their lead down with 8-10 
minutes to go, and that's where we 
should have made a run. But we gol 
lircd, and losi our composure -- wc 
look some shots loo early. Albany's-

depth is very good, and wc just 
don't have the depth. I think that 
was really critical." 

Nine Albany players scored six or 
more points in a balanced attack, 
while the Dutchmen (8-8) relied 
chiefly 'on ilieir high-scoring 
backcourt duo of Joe Cardany and 
Joe Clinton. Firing from long 
range, Clinton hit for 22 points and 
Cardany 15, but both were harrass-
cd into p. or shooting performances 
(Cardany 5-18, Clinton 7-16). 

Three jumpers by Wiiision Royal 
gol the Danes off lo a quick start, 
and after the'Senior guard assisted 
on Kelvin Jones' three-point play, 
Albany held a 17-10 lead- Boih were 
playing in llicir final home game, 
and Royal came through with a 15 
point, five assist effort, while Jones 
totaled nine points and a. Dane 
season-high 12 rebounds. 

"Ill the Capital District Tournn-
menl I was embarrassed by I hern 
(Union)," Jones said. "Their big 
men played better than 1 did, and I 
fouled out about five minutes into 
the second half. I wanted lo gel 

Reserve guard Hob Collier (44) fights for u loose hall during Ihc Danes 
day at University Gym. Albany's record now stands al 16-4 with three 

Union back." 
Despite being oturebounded !£)-7 

in the first half, ' ihc Dutchmen 
managed lo slay right with the 
Danes, and Clinton's jump shot 
with three minutes remaining in the-
half cut the Albany spread lo 34-31. 
But Union could get just one more 
basket, another Clinton jumper, 
while llie Danes reeled off 13 points 

lo lake a 47-33 lead al llie half: Rob 
Chine scored from inside, Royal 
connected on two jump shots, for­
ward Sieve Cow, starting his first 
game of the season, hit on a 
breakaway, followed by two free 
throws by Chine and one by Low, 
and Stanish's lay-in with three 
seconds left. 

"J'licy killed us off the boards in 

' 85-70 win over Union on Saliir-
gnmes left. (Photo: Steve Essen) 

ihc first half," said Scanlon. 
"Albany was executing tin offense, 
and we weren't stopping them. 
They dictated the tempo." 

The Danes had the big lead, bin 
ihey also had foul problems. Royal, 
Clime, and Bob Collier all picked 
up three fouls, and forced Albany 
coach Dick Sauers to junk his 
favorite defense - the man-to-man 

- for the cnlfre second half. 
"I had lo go into a zone (first a 

2-1-2, laier a 1-3-1),"explained 
Sauers. "I had three guys with three 
fouls, and they were all guards. I 
love to press,'but we couldn't. Then 
I switel I our zone to a 1-3-1, but 
t ooked worse than Ihc 2-1-2. 
Bu. I (ill didn't want logo back to 
the mon-lo-man." 

"I wasn surprised when Ihey 
came out in t he zone,"said 
Scanlon. "It was a pretty good 
move — they had a 14 point lead." 

Collier's steal and driving layup 
gave the Danes their largest lead, 
52-35, bill the Dutchmen then 
began to connect on shots from 
outsldt! Ihc Albany /one. Jumpers 
by John Moiuanile, Clinton, and 
John Kruin forced the Danes into a 
time oul with 11:38 left, their lead 
cul to 56-47. Union crepl as close as 
six points, bin seven slraighl 
Albany points put Ihc game away. 
Ray Ccsare hit a side jump shot, 
Stnnish scored on a lip in, Joe Jcd-
nak put in a jumper, and Royal's 
free Ihrow boosted ihc Danes ad­
vantage lo 76-62 with 1:53 remain­
ing. 

"We were really up for this 
game,"said Jones. "This was the 
first lime in three years that wc lost 
two games in a row, and those two 
losses gol us down. We had lo get 
somebody, and Union was thai 
somebody." 

"This was an important win," 
stated Sauers. "We needed Ibis 
game very much. Menially, 1 think 
we're back to where we were before 
Onconla. We may have sonic hard 
practices this week." 

The preparation is for the Danes' 
lasl three games of Ihc regular 
season — all on the road. Tomorrow 
night Albany faces Division II 
Southern Connccticul (12-9), and 
then face a showdown*with the two 
SUNYAC learns thai surround 
them. On February 16th, the Danes 
scpiare off witli Potsdam, 20-2, and 
undefeated in the conference. On 
February 20lh it will be Albany-
Platlsburgh, in what could very 
possibly be the deciding contest for 
the SUNYAC playoffs, probably lo 
be held in Buffalo. The Danes have 
two conference losses and P i t t ­
sburgh has three (one being a 70-56 
defeat by Albany). So in all 
likelihood, even with their fine 
record, Ihc Danes' fate will slill be 
undecided until their final game of 
the season. 

Grapplers Split In Finale 
l»\ Mike Williamson 

The Albany Stale wrestling team 
completed ' l s dual meei season lasl 
week, losing lo Western New 
England University and defeating 
capital district opponent RPI. 

The defcal by Western- New 
England was another in a long line 
of forfeit-marred efforts for llie 
Albany Grapplers, as they forfeited 
al 126 and heavyweight and lost Ihc 
match by 12 team points. Fine in­
dividual performances were lurried 
in by several wrestlers. Mark Dailey 
was victorious al 142, and Sieve 
Cronin won his match al 167 with a 
two point n: -vc in the lasl few 
seconds. Paul Mornbach and Vic 
Herman both won by a pin in Ilieir 
matches lo narrow the margin to 

six, inn ihc Forfeit at heavyweight 
kept the match oul of reach. 

The team concluded its season 
with a convincing 32-18 win over 
RPI. Albany Slate wrestling coach 
Joe DcMco was very pleased witli 
this effort againsi what he called "a 
much improved RPI learn." The 
match was highlighted by four 
Albany pin victories as Rob 
Spagnoli ai 134) and Cronin at 167, 
Uornhach at 177, ami Herman a! 

do very well in Hie SUNYAC's and 
is counting on qualifying several 
wrestlers fur the NCAA .National 
Championships. 

Of the season, which ended with 
ihc Danes showing a 9-10 record, 
DcMco said, "ll was it season filled 
willi opportunities that slipped by." 
Albany wreslled a lough schedule 
this year, and their efforts were 

190 all pinned Ilieir opponents, In consistently hampered by Forfeits 
addition, Dailey at 142 and Dave and injuries. Bui the quality of 
Siraubai 158 both out-pointed their competition faced by Albany on a 
opponents io round out Ihc Albany weekly basis this season will be of 

scoring. 

The victories by Hornbach gave 
him an undefeated dual meet record 
of 18-0-1. Such credentials should 
make him a lop seed in the upcom­
ing SUNYAC championships in 
Buffalo, DcMco expects the team lo 

great benefit lo llie wrestlers as they 
prepare for the post-season tour­
naments. 

With some luck, and a lot of hard 
work, Albany could do very well in 
these tournaments, perhaps having 
several wrestlers earn All-Amcrican 
honors. 

Ihc Albany Slate wrestling team closed out their dual meet season by losing 
lo Western New England and beating RPI. (Photo: Tony Tassarnlti) 

SUNY Campuses May Close 
Wharton Threatens Cutbacks 

by Aran Smith 
Darkened dormitories. Empty 

classrooms. Campus closed. 
SUNY Chancellor Clifion Whar­

ton told stale legislators Monday 
night that this may soon be (he 

SUNV Chancellor Wharton 
Faculty, Campuses, Cutbacks 

(Photo) UI'S) 
scene at one or more SUNY cam­
puses as a result of Governor Hugh 
Carey's 1980-81 Executive Budget 
recommendations. Addressing a 
joint session of Ihc Senate Finance 
and Assembly Ways and Means 
Committee, Wharton warned that 
legislative approval of Carey's pro­
posed $34.2 million cm in SUNY 
funding levels will result ir. 
"far-reaching consequences" lo 
New York Siaic's system of higher 
education. 

Wharton claims that these conse­
quences may range from the closing 
of campuses lo the elimination of 
academic programs and as many as 
2200 faculty and staff throughout 
SUNY. He also noted lliat cam-: 
puses may be forced lo limit 
enrollments. 

If proposed budget reductions 
are distributed among SUNY cam­
puses on a pro rata basis, SUNYA 
may lace the loss of 130 positions, 
according lo SUNYA Vice Presi­
dent for Finance and Business John 
l lar i igan. Approximately 20 
SUNYA faculty members would be 
included in this figure, he said. 

However, both Flariigau and 
SUNYA Community Relations 

Director Phillip Johnson agree ihal 
such a distribution scheme would 
by no means be certain of establish­
ment, should Carey's proposal take 
effect. 

"I think it is fairly clear thai the 
burden is going lo be on the back of 
SUNY lo come up with a plan lo 
address Ihc needs of the eighties in 
terms of the University," said 
Johnson. 

Wharton explained to legislators 
Ihal Carey's plan for funding 
SUNY docs nol lake into account 
the effects of budget .reductions 
levelled on the system each year 
since 1975. 

"Now the culs arc even worse," 
observed SASU Organizing Direc­
tor Bruce Cronin. "Before iliose 
cuts, SUNY was at its bare bones. 
Now willi lliis new cm, it's going lo 
change SUNY's mission entirely.'1 

Wharion also criticized the ex­
ecutive proposal for requiring ihal 
Ihc fiscal cutbacks be completed 
"in a time frame Ihal makes ilicm 
impossible for us ui implement 
without serious and far-reaching 
dislocations." 

flic immediacy, of ihc proposal 
would leave SUNY without suffi­
cient time lo phase oul positions or 
lake advantage of the effects of ;u-
Irllion. The sole option available 
would be what Wharton refers lo as 
the "permanent layoff" of faculty 
and staff. 

"it 's a fail accompli. You've just 
gol no money and yoU'vejust got io 
hack," said Johnson. "It's the dif­
ference between butchery and 
surgery. Do you wain to go in there 
with a meat cleaver or a scalpel? 
This is certainly the meal cleaver." 

The major components of the 
proposed $34.2 million budget 
reduction arc a $12.3 million base 
reduction and a $14 million cm, 
labelled a "rc-examlnntlon incen­
tive." The ambiguity of this phrase 
has led many to question the validi­
ty of the $14 million reduction, 

"It was literally pul on in ihc lasl 
days of the Assembly session," said 

SUNYA President Vincent 
O'LcaryC "You can sec it in the way 
it is written. It is not a well-designed 
cul. It was done crudely." 

"What they do is tell you that 
you've got lo act, not encourage 
you to re-examine," said Johnson. 
"If you have 14 million less dollars, 
you can't spend a lot of it in careful 
re-evaluation. You've gol lo cut 
right away." 

Whether proposed cutbacks 
would affect SUNY campuses as 
severely as Wharion suggests re­
mains a mailer for debate. O'Lcary 
believes thai Wharton's campus 
shutdown warnings are probably 
lillle more llian threats. He backs 
up Ibis assertion by citing potential 
problems witli investors holding 
shares of capital construction bonds 
for the various campuses. 

Johnson, on the other hand, 
views Wbarlon's claims as very real 
possibilities, "inevitably, the 
answer conies down lo eliminating a 
campus or Iwn campuses," he said. 

In Johnson's opinion, SUC-Ncw 
Pah/ and SUC-Fredonia may be llie 
first lo go. A shutdown of SUC-

Fredonia might be justified on the 
basis of the number of larger SUNY 
campuses crowded into its region of. 
the state, he said. He cited the ex­
istence of a University Center, four 
Colleges of Arts and Science, and 
numerous community colleges, all 
west of Rochester. The entire area 
has a population approximately 
equal lo that of Long Island, he 
said. 

Cronin, however, sees SUC-
Brockport as a possible first target 
for shutdown. 

"I 'd think New Paltz because 
New Paltz. is considered a weak, 
campus," he said. "But you have lo 
look al Brockporl, because they 
had a 700 enrollment dropl In the 
area where Brockporl is, you also 
have (SUC) Genesee, (SUNY 
Agricultural and Technical College 
al) Alfred, ihc two Buffalo Colleges, 
and Fredonia lo llie south. If one of 
llie considerations were regional. 
Mien the fuel ihal I here arc other 
campuses in llie area would be im-
purlunl." 

According to Johnson, the rela-
liouship of a campus to the com­
munity in which il is located will 
also conic into play if SUNY inusi 
choose a campus to close. 

"'Flic campus is the principal 
reason that these towns exist," he 
said. "There's a real economic im­
pact", a personal impact. It's no 
longer an educational question. It's 
a political and economic question.'.1 

Johnson nolcd that the loss of a 

i 

western New York campus would 
cause a great loss of jobs in an area 
already struck by the exodus of the 
steel industry. "Besides, it's nol a 
heavy industry," he said. "It's not 
a polluter." 

Why has it become necessary lo 
suggest that any campus close, 
when SUNY budgets have already 
been cut five years in a row? For at 
least part of the answer, many turn 
to the new Stony Brook Hospital, 
cons t ruc ted , equipped, and 
operated by means of $26.7 million 
in SUNY funds. In an open discus­
sion with residents of Dutch Quad's 

Pres. Vincent O'l.eary 
Campus closing unlikely. 

(Photo: UPS) 

Schuyler Hall lasl night, O'Lcary 
mentioned the "coincidence" Ihal 
1300 positions had been eliminated 
from SUNY schools at approx­
imately the same lime that Slony 
Brook Hospital was supplied willi a 

continued on page five 

Stipend Freeze Relaxed 

As Time Check-In Begins 
by Whitney Gould 

Al'icr being'accused-of nol fulfill­
ing minimum lime requirements, 
high-ranking SA officers have been 
ordered to record weekly office 
hours in accordance with a new 

Ms. Newmark Goes To Washington 
by Beth Sever 

"Washington makes SA look 
organized." After spending a day 
with President Jimmy Carter and 
Capitol Hill officials, SA Presi-. 
dent Lisa Newmark came lo lliis 
semi-convincing conclusion. 

Newmark was one of 300 college 
student government presidents 
from across the nation, who were 
invited to the White House on 
February 15. They met with lop 
government officials lo discuss ma­
jor current issues. 

However, from Newinark's 
political point of view, Ihc gather-
iug was a ''deliberate attempt io 
push us toward all pro-Carter 
things." 

"1 think ihc meeting was slapped 
together two weeks ago," Newmark 
said. When students asked when ihc 
gathering was planned, conflicting 

responses were offered by officials. 
One said Ihc meeting was planned 
in October, another said in 
November, while slill another said 
Ihc meeting was planned in 
December. 

Newmark added Ihal Carter, who 
spoke for approximately IS 
minutes, "d idn ' t talk about 
any thing of substance. Mislead, he 
appealed lo our patriotism for the 
draft." 

Carter's officials, added ihc SA 
President, were "very good at skir­
ling the issues. You could ask ihcm 
the color of ihc dbg; and they'd tell 
you about Ihc doghouse;" 

But, the siudcm politicians did 
have the opportunity I" meet and 
observe several high-ranking of­
ficials. 

National Security Advisor 
Zbgniew Brczinski addressed the 
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students on ihe necessity of draft 
registration, "A volunteer army 
works only if people volunteer. If 
no one volunteers, we need registra­
tion. 

"Registration is merely a matter 
of preparedness; it is an indication 
of committment," he added. 

Brczinski stated that the U.S. 
must become more receptive to 
Third World Nation, citing the im­
portance of making "long range 
plans to keep Western Asia and the 
Middle past secure againsi Soviet 
aggression." 

He added that die U.S. must per­
sist in the SALT talks, claiming it is 
a major contribution lo world 
peace. 

U.S, Director of Selective Ser-
viees, another speaker, avoided 
answering Newinark's questions 
about women's involvement in 
draft registration or the ages of pro­
posed draft registrants. 

Students also met with Chief 
Domestic Affairs Advisor Stuart 
Hisenstat, and top advisors from 
energy, budget, and Middle Eastern 
affairs committees. 

Eisenstat said there is no way to 
do away with nuclear energy at this 
lime. However, according to 
Newmark, Eisensiat believes that 
industry and Ihe Nuclear 
Regulatory Commission (NRC) 

continued on pane five 

check-in policy implemented today. 
The new Executive Uraneh 

Check-In Policy is the result of an 
Investigation by die SA Internal Af­
fairs Commit tec, which was promp­
ted by complaints.ilial officers were 
nol putting in required lime. The 
policy is designed lo verify the 
number of hours pul in by SA 
President, Vice President, Con­
troller and Central Council Chair. 

In a resultant action, the recent 
freeze placed on SA stipends has 
been lifted by Controller Craig 
Wcinstock. 

The freeze was originally called 
for by Wcinstock allowing the In­
ternal Affairs Committee could in 

vesligaie whether SA officers were 
working Ihe required 30 hours per 
week on SA related business. 

Stipend policy dictates dial top 
ranking SA officers must be pulling 
in Mils time in order to receive their 
monetary compensation of $522.50 
for ihc school year. 

The investigation, according to 
SA Internal Affairs Committee 
Chair Jim Mitchell, "was a tough 
issue to deal with. We were in a 
light spot. Everyone expected us to 
nail someone and we couldn't prove 
anything." 

Hut rather than turn the in­
vestigation into a "personality 
issue," Mitchell said SA should 
"concentrate on the future." 

Generally, SA officers affected 
by ihe policy fell it was a good idea. 
President Lisa Newmark said ihc 
bill was beneficial and added that 

continued on page five 

SA Controller Craig Wcinstock lifts stipend freeze. 
New check-in policy has been established, 

(Photo: UPS) 



Soviet Troops On Alert, 
Kabul, Afghanistan -AP- Soviet and Afghan troops were 
placed on full alert Thursday in readiness for possible new 
anti-Communist demonstrations and violence as worship­
pers emerge from Friday prayer in Kabul's mosques. 

Spokesmen for the Islamic guerrilla movement told 
reporters attacks were planned for Friday despite a reign of 
terror in rebel strongholds by the militia of the ruling Khaki 
People's Party. 

y Reliable diplomatic sources said dozens of alleged rebels 
or rebel sympathizers have been executed since fighting last 
week. Rebel sympathizers claimed the militia had executed 
"many hundreds." 

Some Western diplomats expressed skepticism about the 
guerrillas' ability to mount another citywide offensive so 
soon after suffering at least 300 dead and an estimated 

.1,000 injured in the last week's street battles, which the 
government blamed on "imperialist agents and saboteurs" 
in the pay of Pakistan, China and the United Slates. 

The Pakistani news agency PPI said rebels in 
Afghanistan shot down two Soviet helicopters Sunday in 
Ghazni and Kandhar provinces and killed 41 troops, in­
cluding three Russian officers, in a night attack Friday in 
luar province. The news agency said demonstrations 
against the Soviets had occurred in northern central and 
southern Afghanistan. It also reported that Afghan troops 
arc deserting in large numbers because the Soviets have 
forced the Afghanistan people to fight against the rebels 
while the Russians remain in the background. 

None of the, information reported by the Pakistani news 
agency could be confirmed from other sources. 

Iran Commission Tours Prisons 

A U.N. commission investigating charges against the 
deposed shah toured a notorious prison on Thursday and 
met with a representative of the ruling Revolutionary 
Council. 

Efforts to arrange a commission meeting with the 
American hostages were unsuccessful, at least for the lime 
being. The militant captors said they had not decided 
whether to permit it. 

It was feared the approximately 50 Americans, who have 
been.captive in the U.S. Embassy in Tehran for 117 days, 
might not be freed for 10 more weeks. A leading official 
has said it might take that long for (he as-ycl-unformed 
Parliament to make a decision. 

On its fifth full day in Iran the U.N. panel visited Ihc 
ousted shah's main residence, then loured Evin prison 
where thousands allegedly were tortured by SAVAK, the 
shah's secret police, before the monarch was forced from 
the throne before last year's Islamic revolution. 

Four commission members met with Hassan Habibi, of­
ficial spokesman for the Revolutionary Council. The fifth 
member — co-chairman Andres Aguilar of Venezuela — 
was in Caracas on a previously arranged visit and was to re­
join the commission in Tehran soon, U.N. spokesman 
Samir Sambar said. 

A report from the commission, released at Ihc United 
Nations, said the members went through a crowd of 1,200 
alleged victims and examined individual cases of obvious 
physical mutilation. 

"Co-chairman Mohamcd Bedjaoui spoke lo Ihc victims, 
assuring them of the commission's compassion for their 
suffering. He stressed that this deeply moving experience 
would remain imprinted in ihc memory of the members of 
the commission," it said. 

It had been hoped the panel's investigation would lead lo 
an early release of the hostages, but Iran's government and 
the militants insist there can be no link between the two 
events. 

The commission has been pushing Iranian authorities lo 
set up a meeting with the hostages, and Foreign Minister 
Sadegh Chotbzadeh has said he is trying lo arrange one. 
But ail have been unable so far to win (he approval of 
militants who have held the embassy since Nov. 4. 

Reagan Comes Up Short 

Syracuse, N.Y.-AP-Former Californian Gov. Ronald 
Reagan came up eight signatures short Thursday in his bid 
to get back on the balot in the state's primary, a stale 
supreme court justice ruled. 

Justice Holm Balio ruled thai Reagan could not be on Ihc 
Republican ballot, saying he was shy of the 1,250 required 
signatures needed to gel on leh ballot in the 32nd Congres­
sional District. 

The district includes eastern Suracuse, eastern Onondaga 
County, all of Cortland, Madison and Chenango counties 
and parts of Delaware and Otsego counties. 

James C, Tormey, one of the would-be Reagan delegates 
and an attorney representing the Reagan campaign, said 
Balio gave "a very fair hearing and was very generous." 

The stale Board of Elections had challenged 380 of the 

1,401 signatures the Reagan campaign presented. Balio 
restored 221 of the disputed names. 

Tormey said Reagan forces "would probably" appeal 
Thursday's decision. He said many other Reagan ballot 
petitions were being challenged throughout the state, par­
ticularly in New York City. 

Thursday's decision left Reagan witli slates on the ballot 
in at least 21 of the slate's 39 districts. 

NRC Sees No Shut Down 

Washington-AP-John F. Ahearne, the chairman of the 
Nuclear Regulatory Commission, said Thursday he doesn't 
anticipate thai this week's nuclear power plant accident in 
Florida will require a shut down of other reactors by the 
same designer. 

However, Ahearne told a Senate subcommittee he won't 
make a final decision until after he receives a full report on 
the Florida incident, which he said he expects ncxl Tuesday. 

Ahearne testified shortly before Ihc NRC was lo hear 
arguments for lifting its self-imposed moratorium on the 
licensing of new nuclear plants. No new licenses have been 
issued since the Three Mile Island accident in Pennsylvania 
nearly a year ago. 

Ahearne said the malfunction thai caused the reactor at 
the Crystal River nuclear plant lo shut down and flood the 
reactor containment with 43,000 gallons of radioactive 
water bore little relation to Ihe near-meltdown at the Three 
Mile Island plant. 

But a leading nuclear skeptic, Rep. James Weaver, 
D-Ore., look lo Ihc House floor lo lambasl Ihe NRC for ils 
handling of the Florida crisis. 

Activist Workshops 

PIRGEES are coming! What arc they? They arc 
members of NYPIRG and will be galvanling all over 
SUNYA this weekend for NYPIRG's 1980 Spring Con­
ference. Students and slaff members from all over Ihe stale 
will participate in more than 40 workshops dealing with 
topics such as Student Rights, Anti-Nuclear Organizing, 
Women's Rights, and the future of higher education in 
N.Y. 

The tentative confeencc schedule will include: 
Friday 5-11:30 p.m. — Arrival and Registration 
Saturday 9:30-9:50 a.m. — Introduction 

-Saturday, beginning at 10 a.m., there will be a scries of 
workshops in the lecture centers. 

Sunday will include general discussions on legislative in­
volvement in NYPIRG. 

A id for Married Students 

"Married students will be freed from financial 
discrimination because of the recent passage of amend­
ments to slate education laws," said Sharon. Ward, SASU 
President. 

The new version of education regulations states that in­
come criteria for financial aid awards to married students 
be based solcy on the earnings of the student and his or her 
spouse. 

Previously, financial aid awards were based on the com­
bined incomes of the student, his or her spouse and the sui-
denl's parents whether or not the student was listed as a 
dependent. 

"This policy was unfair and sevcrly reduced needed 
financial assistance," Ward continued. 

Under Ihc new provisions, any married student 
regardless of age who lias not resided with his or her 
parents for more than six consecutive weeks in a year or 

listed as n dependent on stale income taxes, will be declared 
emancipated for financial aid purposes. The student must 
have been married on or before December 31 of ihe 
previous academic year and not have received more than 
$750 In support from their parents. 

Sponsored by both Assemblyman Andrew Virgilio and 
Senator Kenneth LaValle, Ihe new provisions passed Willi 
little opposition and will become effective on July I, 1980. 

"Most married couples do not rely on their parents as a 
source of income," said legislative sources, "they should be 
considered under the emancipation standards established 
under Ihc education laws," 
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Attention Anti-Drafters 

A studenl-run coalition for peace was created last Saiur. 
day at SASU's first Anli-Drafl Conference. The New York 
Slate Coalition for Peace was organized during ||IC 

SUNYA-based conference with representatives In 
various slate and private cllcgcs and universities. 

According to SASU Campus Organizer Bruce Cronin, 
the Coalition arrived at several decisions and advocates llic 
following: 

Opposing ihe reinstatement of draft registration and 
conscription. 

Opposing military aggression and methods of war. 
Promoting nuclear disarmament. 
Cohdemning superpower intervention in internal af­

fairs of Ihc nation. 
Promoting a conservation policy and renewable 

resources (solar) so as lo create a self-sufficient nation In 
terms of energy, reducing dependency on foreign affairs. 

The Coalition is sponsoring several other anti-draft ef­
forts. On March 13, there will be a statewide Anli-Drafl 
Action Day. On March 22, an Anli-Drafl March 
Washington will be held. And, on April 13-14, an aiiikhafi 
leach-in will be held. 

The second Annual Capital District Radioihon for ihe 
Blind is scheduled for Saturday, March 8, 1980, from 8:00 
a.m to 8:00 p.m. on 1460 WOKO AM radio. This twelve-
+iour Radioihon will benefil the Northeastern Association 
of the Blind at Albany, Inc. and the over 1,200 blind ami 
visually handicapped people they serve annually. The pur­
pose of this year's Radioihon is lo generate increased public 
awareness of, and financial support for, quality services for 
the blind of Upstate New York. 

Blind consumers, their families, community leaders, and 
NABA Staff and Board Members will join WOKO D.J.'s 
in providing a comprehensive look into Ihe Assoclatioi 
diverse service programs. The broadcast will be live fro 
NABA Hcadquarlcrs at 301 Washington Avenue, Alban 
Advanced donations are welcome. 

Budget Teach-in 

The Albany Student Union and the UUP are sponsoring 
an all day "Budget Teach-In" Tuesday, In response lu 
Governor Hugh Carey's proposed budget cuts SUNY-whle. 

Beginning at 10 a.m in the Fireside Lounge, students will 
be educated on Ihe effects of the budget cuts in stale univer­
sities. 

Speakers will include faculty, slaff, and students who 
will offer advice on how to "save SUNY." 

New Graduate Fellowships 

The Husted Fellowship of $500 is awarded annuall) It: 
graduate student who holds a bachelor's degree from i 
University at Albany and has been in residence al i 
University for at leasl two years as an undergraduate. I'l 
award is made from the Husted Fund, which wasestabli' 
ed in recognition of Dr. Albert N. Husted's fiftieth yeat i 
Ihe faculty. The fellowship may be used for graduate si in 
at Ihis or any other accredited university. 

Tile Husted fellowship will be awarded on Alumni !>• 
(May 17, 1980). Application forms are available fro 
Alumni Affairs Office, Alumni House, Stale University i 
New York at Albany, Albany, New York, 12222; and nni 
ie returned lo Ihe Alumni Office before April I. 

For fuiher information, please contact Marsha J. M 
Cnrlhy at 7-4631. 

Educational Outreach 
NYPIRG is forming a new committee to aci as an educa­

tional outreach program for the Albany and campus com­
munities. For those individuals interested in public rela­
tions, health care, or law, NYPIRG's speaker's Bureau will 
serve as an outlet to pursue these interests. The group will 
educate lite public on issues such as (he generic drug law 
through public speaking and the media. 

The Agnes E. Funerer Memorial Fellowship of $500 is 
awarded annually to a graduate student who holds n 
bachelor's degree, from the Universiiy in Albany and lias 
been in residence at Ihe University for at leasl two years as 
an undergraduate. The award is made from the Agnes E. 
Funerer Fund, which was established in recognition ol Miss 
Fuiieier's contribution 10 Ihe development of theatre al Ihe 
State University of New York al Albany. The fellowship 
may be used for graduate study in theatre or theatre related 
fields at ihe Universiiy al Albany, at any other accredited 
University, or in a recognized theatre program. 

The Agues E. Funerer Memorial Fellowship will be 
awarded on Alumni Day, (May 17, 1980). Application 
forms are available from Alumni Affairs Office, Alunini 
House, Suite Universiiy of New York al Albany, Albany. 
New York, 12222, and must be returned to the Alumni Of­
fice before April I. 

For further information, please conlact either Robert J, 
Donnelly of the Theatre Department, dr Marsha i. Mc' nr-
thy. 
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Jonsson Victorious In 
SA Court Decision 

Election Results Upheld 

Albany Student Press 

is 
Page Three 

SA Supreme Court voted Tues­
day night lo uphold ihe contested 
results of the February 6,7 and 8 
Central Council elections held on 
Alumni Quad. 
• Dcspile efforis by unsuccessful 
candidate Steven Silverbcrg lo In­
validate the election. Laura Jonsson 
was officially declared victorious 
wilh 52 percent of the total of 
Alumni Quad voles. Silverbcrg 
received 33 voles. 

Sllvcrberg's appeal lo Ihe 
Supreme Court stemmed from a 
closed hearing of llic SA Election 
Commission held Monday. The 
group held unanimously to sustain 
the election results, Silverbcrg was 
not present at the meeting. 

Silverbcrg argued Tuesday nighi 
thai his absence was caused by il­
lness uiul thai the Commission's 
decision was not arrived al fairly, 

The court case was prompted by 
Silverbcrg's allegations thai 
Jonsson ran a "smear campaign" 
in ihc replacement elections. He at­
tempted to pursue litigation, charg­
ing Jonsson wilh slander and 

"morally disgusting" behavior, 
claiming she badmouthed him dur­
ing her campaign." 

The issue was brought before the 
Commission ufter hoih parties were 
informed of the hearing in a memo 
issued by Commissioner Ron 
Joseph on February 14. 

Silverbcrg plans to present proper 
medical evidence 10 verify his 
testimony concerning the reason for 
his absence. He was apparently ad­
mitted to a hospital due to a 
stomach virus. 

He added I lull he never received, 
ill writing, a notice of Monday's 
healing. 

However, according to Joseph, 
an official reminder was scni lo 
both candidates. Joseph added he 
also spoke lo Silverbeig on the 
telephone and said, "If you choose 
lo he absent, the court will carry on 
nonetheless, Silverbeig allegedly 
confirmed ihc date wilh Joseph, in 
addition lo requesting a written 
reminder "only for his files," 

Silverbeig said lie could not recall 
Ihis conversion. 

SllNVA's ice skating rink will remain temporarily unusable due In priihlcins. 
Physical Planl Director Dennis Slcwns is optimistic lltut lite rink will open'. 

(Photo: UPS) 

Joseph said he called Silverbcrg 
aficr ihe Commission hearing, 
reminding him thai a notice was 
issued. Silverbcrg then explained 
about his illness and claimed he at­
tempted to reach Joseph Sunday 
nighl. "This means he obviously i 
knew tiboul the case in order lo call 
nic," said Joseph. 

In addition, Silverbeig upparcttl-
ly failed lo issue a formal appeal 
witli the Election Commission, Ac-

cmitllttieci oil /nine thirteen 

Ice Rink Remains Closed; 
Problems Delay Opening 

New Program Coaches Assistants 
by Allele Gralla 

In an effort lo improve ihc quali­
ty of SUNYcVs teaching assistants 
(TA) a TA (raining committee has 
recently been formed, 

Assistant Vice President for 
Academic Affairs and Dean of 
Undergraduate Studies Helen 
pes fosses and Acting Dean of 
Graduate Studies Richard Hall 
created the committee lo improve 
tfhc TA program. 
, The committee will attempt to 
demonstrate teaching methods, 
library use, testing, grading, and 
teaching ethics. 

At ils first meeting early 
February, the committee divided 
itself into three subcommittees. The 
first subcommittee will assess the 
needs of graduate students. Il will 
try to discover the type of formal 
the graduate students themselves 
feel will be most effective. 

Surveying academic depart men ts 

and evaluating e.sisiing programs is 
the lask of the second subcommit­
tee. The purpose of ibis respon­
sibility, according lo Hall is to "try 
lo find good patterns mid supple­
ment or emulate them I'm ih • resi of 
the University." Hall emphasized 
that ihe new program would com­
plement not replace those that 
already exist. The third subcommit­
tee Is concerned With designing the 
leaching program itself. 

The 15-menibet committee made 
up of SUNYA professors, graduate 
and undergraduate students is 
chaired by SUNYA professor lid-
ward Kelly. 

This com ml l ice "is not jusi going 
lo be on paper,*' according lo 
Desfosses. "The administration is 
ready lo put some teeth into il," she 
said. In a memo to commit tee 
members Desfosses and Hall stated, 
"We have recommended to Ihe 
President and the Vice President for 

Academic Affairs, as well us the 
Council o\' Deans, that a sound 
leaching assistant program be 
prerequisite for a department to 

, receive assistanlship funds. They 
have supported our recommenda­
tion. 

i«> Sylvia Saunders 
While SUNYA's recently coin-

pleied ice skating rink is presently 
unusable due lo construction and 
weather difficulties, 1'hysical Plain 
director Dennis Stevens said lie 
hopes 10 open il again this season. 

"We'll check lo see if it looks like 
we can bring die surface back," he 
said. "If il looks like we can, we'll 
start clearing it off this weekend.*' 

He added that be would also have 
to be sure that there was enough 
studenl demand. He said thai for 
tlie iwo weeks ihe rink was open 
Students seemed "pleased." He 
estimated thai 20-30 students used 
it. He said he has received a number 
of calls from students asking if ihe 
rink would be cleared. 

Alumni Quad Mice Caughi 
By Poison And Traps 

Extermination Successful 

Helen Desfosses lias Initiated a Teaching Assistant Train hi". Committee. 
The program will attempt to prow the finality of SUNYA TA '.v. 

l>> Patricia lira n ley 
lu response lo numerous com­
plaints from Alumni Quad residents 
concerning mice, the Waterbury-
Alden cafeteria received special ex-
termination treatment over vaca­
tion according to Director of 
Residences .John Welly. 

"The Moore Pest Control Firm 
which services the Universiiy was 
informed that we had a mouse pro­
blem and mousetraps and poison 
were set throughout the cafeteria," 
Wehy said. 

He added, "Prior to vacation 
students who were having problems 
with mice were supplied wilh naps 
and poison." 

Waterbui y Residence Director 
Martha pilch said, "there have 
been no reported mouse problems 
since vacation but it is too soon lo 
say ihe problem no longer exists." 

She added, "I have checked with 
the first floor southwest wing which 
lias been highly troubled with mice 
In the past and there are no com­
plaints so far." 

Residence Assistant for this wing 
Diane Plackis said, "The week 
before vacation 1 caught four mice 
in five days. Hut since we've been 
back I've had no problems." 

""There's only been one reported 
problem with mice since we've been 
back," Welty said. 

Two mice have been caught on 
the second floor of Alden I lall since 
vacation, according to Van Schoor. 

Both Pilch and Van Schoor said 
they have ample supplies of 
mousetraps and poison if needed. 

Stevens said the rink, located 
beside ihe gym, was slarled in late 
fall al the request of SA and Presi­
dent OT.cary so il could be Used 
for wilder carnival events. "It was 
not a result of die brainpower of the 
Plant Department," he said. 

He explained (hat there really 
wasn't sufficient lime to build the 
rink because they were unublcto sod, 
seed and level off the area in time 
for the carnival. "By the lime we 
slarled it, we couldn't resod it," 

"If 1 had it lo do over, I would 
have slarled il before," lie said. 

In addition to lack of construc­
tion time, Stevens said un­
cooperative weather delayed com­
pletion of ihe rink. "All this rain 
and 50 degree weather," he said, 
"is ihe strangest weather I've 
seen." i . •.. q 

" I f s hard |o keep anythiugopen. 
Our problems are similar lo other 
municipal places such as Colonic, 
Bethel.:' 

Stevens said that if il is possible 
lo open ihe rink and if he can 
recruit more volunteers, skaiing will 
resume. 

Stevens said thai even with con­
st met ion and weather problems, ihe 
rink did not cost anywhere near ihe 
$6000 esiimaie quoted by an SA 
spokesman in a past ASP issue. 
"Thai's a lot of nonsense," he said. 

He said Ihe only "oui-of-pockei 
cash" was $450 used for a bulldozer 
contractor, "The majority of ihe 
workers were volunteer. Only two 
students were paid over a 2 and a 
half-week period," he said. 

continued on page twelve 

Old Juice Never Dies; 
h May Just TasieBad 

liy Murk I'lscheltl 
On Tuesday nigltl, February 2d, SUNYA sophomore Alan Frutkin 

.purchased an orange drink from a Campus Center vending machine. 
The expiration date on ihe carton was January 20. 

Frill kill bought three more canons and found Ihe same date on all 
ol' iliem. He confronted Assistant Director of Cash Sales and UAS 
Vending Supervisor Paul Arnold wilh the problem. 

According to Arnold, he and l-'nukin went back lo the machine, 
opened i' op and checked the oilier canons. All were daied March 
27, as were cartons in oilier machines later checked. l-'rutkin con­
firmed this story. 

Arnold said thai perishables, milk producis specifically, have a 
shell' life of 12 days and cartons in machines are checked daily by 

staff. 
"However," be said, "orange drink and non-perishables are good 

indefinitely. They do not spoil and are therefore not checked." 
Normally, said Arnold, these carious are not even daied. Albany's 

Crowley Dairy, which supplies the orange drink, began issuing pull-
dales or expiration dales in November, 1979, as a result of consumer 
requests for Ihc spoilage dale. 

"The problem here," said Arnold, "is that, regardless of whether 
L . continued on pane five 
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HOW TO GET A JOB 
Saturday, March 22nd 10 am-5:30 pm 

Hotel Americana in Albany 
660 Shaker Road (near the airport) 

Who Should Attend: 
College students, college graduates, career changers, returning 
women. 
What You Will Learn: 
Interview skills, resume writing, cover letters, Information about 
where jobs, and an overview over the best job hunting stategles. 
Handouts and samples. Question and answer session. 
Workshop Leaders: 
Dr. Marcia Fox, lecturer and author of Put Your Degree to 
Wor/((W.W. Norton). Excerpts and features have appeared in 
Mademoiselle, Self, and The New York Times. 
Dean Fred Slegal, President of Career Consultants,Inc. and former 
recruiter for one of the world's largest'professional organizations. 
Cost; 
Register Now(dlscount): $25.00 
Registration at the door: $30.00 

Please mall your certified check or money order payable to Fred 
Slegal Career Consultants, Box 681 Wall St. Station, New York, NY 
10005.Must be postmarked by March 15th. 

Name 

Address 

City Slate Zip 

Please toward Confirmation^ 
Please toward Directions 

^college student 
^.college graduate 
_career changer 
^returning woman 
_currenlly employed job seeker 
unemployed 
_other(pleese speclty) 

LIMITED TIME INTRODUCTORY O F F ^ l 

100 SELF 
MAILING 

PERSONAL 
MONOGRAMMED 

STATIONERY SETS 

ONLY 

$2.50 PLUS $1.00 
POSTAGE & 
HANDLING 

End all your gilt giving problems this year. At this price, you can give 
one to everyone on your gift list. 

You gel 100 beautiful personalized sets on fine paper with a monogram 
printed on bright gold background. 

Self mailing, the modern way to correspond. No messy envelopes to 
lick or misplace. 

You must be 100% delighted or your money will be refunded. 

Orders shipped promptly. 

ORDER TODAY TO RECEIVE THIS INTRODUCTORY OFFER 

SELF MAILING COMPANY BOX a, CARBONDALE, PA ww 
Q Enclose $2.50 PLUS $1.00 postage & handling for each set. 

D SAVE MORE. Order 5 sets and get 1 FREE 

• SAVE EVEN MORE. Order 10 sets and get 3 FREE 

Enclose $1.00 for each set ordered (excluding FREE sets). 
No C.O.D. 

Initials to be printed* 
(Monogram)" Name 

Address 

City 

State . Z i p 

'Use a plain sheet of paper for additional sets ordered and attach it to this coupon. 

Winner by 
a mile! 
When It comes to fast, 
free delivery, Pizza 
Dispatch doesn't horse 
around. Our famous 30 
minute delivery program 
has made us the number 
one pizza company In the 
world for store-to-door 
service. Give us a call. 
We'll be first down your 
home stretch... you can 
bet on III 

Fast. Friendly. Free 
Delivery. 

One 
Dollar 
Off! 
$1.00 off any large pizza. 
One coupon per pizza. 
Fast, Free Delivery. 
Expires March 6, 1980 

438-4475 

L 
IL 
C m F E f l ; 91 Russell Road 
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Down To EartHFood 
May Come To The Rat 

by Judlc Eisenncrg . ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ 
Tired of (hose mid-afternoon 

meals consisting of cheeseburgers 
and french fries? Worrying about 
the nutritious value of Rathskellar 
food? If so, naiural food may be 

"The answer. 
Plans arc currently underway to 

open a health food snack-bar in the 
section of the Rat where subs are 
usually sold. Yogurt shakes, felafel, 
whole wheal pizza, fruit salads, and 
carob brownies arc among the 
natural snacks which may be sold. 

A NYPlRG-bascd committee is 
researching the operation of snack 
bars ai oilier universities and issuing 
surveys on campus to determine 
student reaction to the health food 
sevice. Survey results have been 
positive. Committee members will 
be circulating pclUions on dinner 
lines within the next few days to 
confirm student Interest. 

Onee lite survey is complete, the 
comnilltce will submit il lo UAS for 
approval. If the idea is accepted, 
ihe coininllicc hopes to work with 
UAS, which lias an exclusive con-
iraci over all immediately consum­
mate food on campus, according 
lo NYI'IRG Project Coordinator 
Paul Maggiotlo. 
j2UhaJ>uKisliavenolvcibamar-

rived at. However, funds will be us­
ed mainly for purchasing the food. 
The Rat will supply kitchen 
facilities. 

Conimiilcc member Carolyn 
Brook feels il is Important for 
students to have more of a choice in 
what they eai. A natural food snack 
bar would enable people to buy 
foods which are not overly process­
ed or filled wllh preservalivcs. 

Brook explained dial Buffalo 
Stale has been operating a sue-' 
cessl'ul naiural food snack bar, with 
enthusiastic support from ihe 
University's food service. 

Pending UAS approval, 
SUNYA's snack bar should open 

SA Stipends 
continued from front pane 
SA officers should be responsible 
for fulfilling iheir hourly re­
quirements, 

Central Council Chair Mike levy 
said he had "no objection" because 
there were "no problems saying 
what time was pin in." 

Controller Craig Wciiisiuek men­
tioned ihe importance of SA of­
ficers meeting siipend policy and 
staled, "It's good thai we should be 
accountable lo siudenls." 

some time In March. "UAS has 
already shown some interest in it," 
said Brook. "All that's left to do is 
to present evidence of student in­
terest in a health food stand. UAS 
won't gel involved if they feel peo­
ple won't support it." 

Wharton Denounces Budget Cuts 

Newmark 
Meets 

Carter 
continued from front pane 
have been deficient in providing 
safely, training, equipment, and ac­
cident control. 

Eiscustat also outlined ihe goals 
of the Carter administration, such 
as restoring confidence in lite 
Presidency, balancing the budget, 
and cleaning ihe cmiiomucui while 
keeping euvlroutiienitil regulatory 
eosis down. 

Ulscnstni also defended Curler's 
deregulation of oil price controls 
before the passage of the windfall 
profits hill. New mark said. 
However, lie added thai ihe luxes 
from those windfall profits will he 
nllpctucd lo help lower income peo­
ple pay energy cosis, and lo support 
mass transit, solar energy, energy 
conservation and ilie muuufnciiir-
ing of synthetic fuel. 

continued front front puge 
staff of 1300. 

"What they're doing, in effect; is 
staffing the place with professors," 
said O'Leary of the leaching 
hospital, which also serves as a ma­
jor heallh care facility for the. 
residents of Long Island. "I 'm glad 
we don't have a medical school 
here, If ihe hospital tells me at 
10:00 .II night tlitii there's no one on 
duly in inieusivccare, and (SUNYA 
Assistant Vice President for 
Academic Affairs) Helen 
tllcsl'osses) says she needs someone 
in CUfi (Comer for Undergraduate 
Iducaiion), lei me tell you, CUE 
illsl l o s l . " 

According lo Croniu, SASU 
plans in follow up Wharton's 
presentation lo ihe legislature with 
further appeals to state senators 
and members o\ the Assembly. 

"After we talk lo them enough, 
we Ihiuk ihe funds will be 
rosloivd," he said. "We're not 
looking ai lite legislature as an 
enemy. I hey didu'l propose ihe 

" I dou'i think ihe Coventor is 
OIII in screw suite education," said 
Johnson. "Ilui I lull may be the ef­
fect of ihe budget." 

" I don't believe dial Carey is an 
ndvocidc of higher education 

U) record town m 

"WE'VE COT CLASS" 
ENTIRE STOCK OF 

CLASSICAL LP'S & CASSETTES 

*S49 ON SALE $593 
1 ser/e s THE CBS MASTERWORKS TITLES PICTURED IN 

THIS AD WERE ALL GRAMMY AWARD NOMINEES 
IN SEVERAL CATEGO.RIES, AS SEEN ON 
THE GRAMMY AWARDS, FEBRUARY27. 

countered Crontn.- "He's an ad­
vocate of private education. I think 
Carey has been going back on a 
commitment to higher education 
that the state has made." 

According to Cronin, Carey has 
claimed that SUNY budget cuts are 
a part of a program designed to 
"cut down on big government." 
This argument cannot stand, he 
said, as.slate spending was increas­
ed by $600 million in the last year. 

"Even if Carey didn't cut one 
cent, we'd be cut by 13 percent 
because of'ihc inflation rate," said 
Croniu. "There is money going to 

• slate agencies, but it's 1101 going to . 
us. Carey looks ai us like the Cable 
TV Division or the Department of 
Motor Vehicles, li's not something 
new he's doing. We're an educa­
tional institution, bin he's calling its 
a pari of big government." 

SASU is currently working 
toward obtaining a voice for 
siudenls in determining where 
budget cuts arc made. "What Carey 
is doing is establishing a Proposi­
tion 13 social services reduction 
wiihoui a referendum," said 
Croniu, 

According lo Cronin, SASU has 
for die first lime joined forces wilh 
Uniied University Professions 
(UUP) in ils fight agtliusl budget 
cutbacks. 

"What's going 10 he erueiii] 
now," said O'l ci'try, "is how much 
political strength students can inurr 

shtd." 
"We are I'ointi lo lake actions," 

he said, "Sonic of ihem may lie 
drastic. By drastic I mean iliul' 
iheie'll be more lhail jvisl letter-
wiilittii. We'll have in lake a teal 
haul stand." 

Dining ihe five years of construe-' 
tiun of Sumy Urook Hospital, less 
than hall' iis cost \"A* spent lor pro­
gram develop me ni on il.ie siies of 
SUNV's iiewcsi campuses: SUC-
Pmvhase, SUC-Old Wesihmy. l-'tn-
pire Stale College, ami SUNY Col­
lege ol' Optometry ami Technology. 
According 10 Wharton's six-year 
iv\ lev ol' I luiversity operations 
funding, lesser amounts of SUNY 
In nils have been speni on new 
building openings ($9.6 million), 
1 lie Mi iu-1 minion CM meal Campus 
($1,2 million), mid equipment 
replacement ($8.8 million). 

Wlmrton made an important 
poim of litis Inst iiem, in Ins address 
10 ihe Senate and Assembly com­
mittees, 

"Much of our equipment was ob­
tained simultaneously with the ma­
jor buildup of SUNY in.ihe 1960s, 
and 1 bus much ol ii is entering ob­
solescence ai ihe same time," he 
said. 

Wharton projects a SUNY-wide 
need for S103 million to cover 
equipment replacement in 1980-81. 
However, he is planning for the 
availability of a funding base of on­
ly $17 million. 

SALEGOOD 
THRU SAT., 
MARCH 1 

record town 

Bad Juice 
continued from page three 
or nut the product is a perishable, if 
il has an expired pull-date on it, it 
shouldn't be sold. The product is 
still safe, bul Ihe taste and Ihe 
physical appearance of Ihe food 
might be hail, since ihe produei is 
old. Here is where we are wrong. „^ 

"Alan caught us with our pants 
down," he added. 

An Albany Heallh Department 
official agreed. 

Albany-Stuyvesant Plaza 
Colonie-110 Wolf Rd. (near McDonald's) 
Delmar-Delaware Plaza 

Latham-Latham Circle Mall 
Schenactady-Mohawk Mall 

It's 
Sadie Hawkins 

Day 

http://U~antL.bu.XL


We'rei Changing Your 
VIEWPOINT 

LONG LIVE ROCK 
PARTY 

SATimdAy MARchl 

9:30 STATE ULOUNQE 

50c with Rock CROUP 
7 5 * All OTHERS 

UNivERsiTy I P RtouJRtd SpoNsoREdby T X O - T K E 

You will be asked to 
VOTEonMon.&Tues. 

March 10 &11: 

L Referendum: 
Shall the Student Activity Fee be 
increased by $2.50 per semester per 
student beginning with the Fall 1980 
semester? 

yes-— no<— 
Note: This referendum shall be non-binding. 

II. Central Council 
Replacement Seats: 

Dutch* 1 Off Campus* 3 

Nomination forms will be available 

in the S.A. Office 

Now'5 pm Thurs. March 6 

r 
IVIEWPOINT, SUN YA *s yearly Informationalhanri 
lk. book is holdlna an interest meetinn 

for anyone Interested in writino 
laylna out, drawing, shooting picture 
selling ads, or just making friendly 
suggestions (unfriendly suggest ons 
will not be accepted) fordesiqninn 
abrandnewvlewpointl 

The TIME: MoNfjUy . MARcb 7.1980. 7:00 D.M 
ThE PIACE: SA offices, ROOM 1 CAMPUS CENTER 
TkE PERSON: jAyGissEN, 489-0898 if you NAVE ANV 

OUESTIONSAboUT V I E W P O I N T OR OrbERWisE 
TbE LENQTh: 76 MINUTES 

VIEWPOINT! ISN'T IT TJME SUINYA'S WAS chANCfH? 

( D a t 2nd annual <^>£.mi- \JoxmaL 

<Sat.,cMaxc(i8. Qji.m. , U^utcfi f i n i n g cHal"l 

CJJ5C member $6.50 

ta.K card $7-5° 

oilier $8.50 

- fuLl-Koifler diiuur 

- dance, band 

- cain bat 

-noil d oeuviei 

Limited leati !! CatftBu cMondai,, c I laxen 3rd. 

<£andu 7-7786 £t[en 7-8363 

AluiMNi QuAd BOARCI 
presents 

LEAP YEAR PARTY 
SQUARE DANCE wiTrl 

CAUER 

ROCKw/D.J. TO Follow 

FRI. FEB. 29, 9p.m.- 2A.M 

BEER, CidER,DoNtTs, M uNchiES 

iwBRU 
$ 1 .50AT TIIF. dooR 

Prize for 

best dressed 

'hick' 
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by Douglas Kohn 
Governor Carey's proposal. to 

make cutbacks in the SUNY system 
has,brought to light heated debate 
regarding higher education in New 
York State. A controversial paper 
prepared by Joseph A. Kershaw, 

I New re/wjiie 
under trie auspices of the Sloan 
Commission, a panel of distinguish­
ed educators and citizens studying 
ihe relationship between higher 
education and government has rais­
ed serious questions concerning the 
SUNY system. 

Kershaw- slates in his 42-pagc 
paper,Jhat "SUNY's lour universi­
ty centers exemplify a major pro­
blem. It seems clear the state is not 
going to be able to create four first 
rate universities. It also seems clear 
that if it continues to try, all four of 
them will gradually slide into 
mediocrity." 

Kershaw focuses on the competi­
tion between private and public in­
stitutions for stale funding, a com­
petition that is apparently being 
won by the private sector. "The 
private sector and its champions in 
the legislature have succeeded in 
providing handsomely from the 
stale treasury," Kershaw states in 
his paper. 

According to a New York Times 
article published on February 5, one 
result of Ihe state's commitment 
towards widespread funding of 
private institutions could be the 

Commission Downgrades SUNYA 
closing down of some public institu­
tions. New York Slate may have to 
forfeit its goal to establish four 
outstanding university centers as a 
r&uli of litis problem. The article 
continues, "The stale has not raised 
all four centers to an equal level of 
excellence, and the lime may be at 
hand to consider whether the objec­
tive is feasible in light of the dire 
predictions for the next twenty 
years." 

Kerslitrw recommends that the 
slate concentrate its resources on 
the "centers closest lo achieving 
distinction, Stony Brook and Buf­
falo, and weigh closing, or at least 
downgrading ihe other two, Albany 
and Binghamlon.'.' 

These recommendations have 
drawn slicing reaction from of­
ficials al both Albany and 
Hiughamiou. 

SUNYA President Vincent 
O'Lcary expressed his Indignation 
over the report, criticizing it for 
failing lo undertake an in-depth 
analysis of the SUNY system and 
called Ihe data used by Kershaw 
"outmoded." 

O'Lcary pointed out that Ker­
shaw submitted a similar report to 
the Wesse! Commission in llJ77. 
The report's recommendations, 
however, were not incorporated in-
lo Ihe commission's final report. 
President O'l.eary believes that the 

facts presented in Kershaw's 
monograph make even less sense 
now. 

According lo O'Lcary, Albany 
and Binghamlon are Ihe two most 
popular campuses in the SUNY 
system, with the highest enrollmcnl. 
Buffalo and Stony Brook were in 
fact having trouble meeting enroll­
ment goals, claims O'Lcary. 

O'Lcary pointed out llial in the 
1970s il became clear I hat it would 
be impossible for any university to 
be equally strong in all areas. Ihus 
resulting in a large number of 
universities, including Albany, to 
develop certain strengths. 

"Albany has taken advantage of 
ihe unique environment in ihe stale 
capital," said O'Lcary. He believes 
thai the university has particularly 
strengthened its College of Social 
and Behavioral Sciences and has 
built extremely solid programs in 

Ihe areas of Criminal Justice, 
Education, Social Welfare, and the 
Graduate School of Public Affairs. 
As a result, Albany has a unique 
profile among SUNY schools, 
O'Lcary believes, 

"Each university center in New 
York carries out specific missions 
that arc particularly related lo the 
regions ihul they find themselves. 
Lor example, Albany finds itself in 
a region with a medical school, a 
law school, and a fine engineering 
school in •RPI. Together with 
Albany ihesc schools form a capital 
Uisirici higher education communi­
ty that can.meet an enormous varie­
ty of needs," said O'Lcary. 

O'Lcary also believes Kershaw's 
emphasis on culling back al the 
university center level is misplaced.. 
He pointed lo ihe fact thai ihe ex­
pected decl ine in college 
enrollments will show up most 
heavily at the undergraduate level. 

To rectify this problem, New 
York Stale needs "quality universi­
ty centers, as represented by Albany 
and Binghamlon, as well as Stony 
Brook and Buffalo," lo maintain a 
stable enrollment level, said 
O'Lcary. 

"Research and researchers are 
one of the keys lo Ihe future 
economic development ^\ New 
York State. Rather than culling 
back al the places where this 

research is being done, support for 
the centers should be increased," he 
added. 

O'Lcary does not believe the 
report will be accepted and explain­
ed he will take further action by 
presenting it to SUNY Chancellor 
Clifton Wharton and the Sloan 
Commission. 

SUNY Binghamlon University 
Relations Director Roberta Schecr 
questioned Ihe report's validity, 
citing the fact that it was based on 
research done two to three years 
ago. Schecr points out thai Kershaw 
cites tuition estimates from two 
years ago. 

His report, added Schecr, does 
not lake into account the efforts 
made by ihe university to concen­
trate its resources and become more 
selective in program offerings. 

SUNY Vice Chancellor of 
University Affairs and Develop­
ment Robefl I'errin sialcd, "The 
rcpori should be taken in context as 
a research paper done by one in­
dividual." When asked about the 
reported difference in distinction 
among the university centers, Per-
rin replied, "We al SUNY feel we 
have four firs] rale universities." 
Perrln does not see any competition 
between private and public institu­
tions for slate funding, citing the 
stales "long history" of supporting 
both. 

The British are coming to 
WCDB-91FM 

Monday, March 3 The Jam will be in Albany. 
Listen to 91FM for your chance to win tickets, albums and a 

gift certificate from the Record Co-op!! 

uou fcai/e ft ( -w want it I 
AND WE'LL COME TO YOU 

Ankle Bracelet names no longer apply? 

> Finally realize your School Ring is ugly? 

• Need quick Cash for this week's fix? 

cWo^a fiop^umi III 

qfrqht new call JUifpc. at 455-6802 
w w i» w w » w ' m ̂ - •> w ^ w »m w w^ m " ^ ^ ^ m»^ w m v » "w m 'irm-'tm ^*> • 

COUNTRY Pit RISTAURANT 

INTRODUCING COUPON SPECIALS 
— COUPON• 

BBQ 

Slate University of New York 
in cooperation with 

The Ik'pl. of Education and 
Culture, W.Z.O 

announces its 1980 
F O U R T E E N T H S U M M E R 

ACADEMIC 
PROGRAM IN 

ISRAEL 

Earn up lo 9 Undergraduate 
credits 

For informaiion write or call 
Office of International Educa­
iioii 

Stale University College 
Oneonia, New York 13820 
(607)431-3369 

S E N I O R S : 
C l a s s 

M e e t i n g 

Moi i . n i g h t 
M a r c h 3 
9 : 0 0 
CC 3 6 1 

- C O U P O N — — - * 

CINE1-2-3*45-6 
RT S I 1-BT • NOHTMWAV MALL • COLONIE 

BBQ 
RACK 

OF RIBS 
Baby Pork Sparerlbs cook­
ed with Grandma's Spiced 
BBQ Sauce. Includes 
choice ol Soup or Salad, 
French Fries, Roll and But­
ter. 

TWO 
FOR $699 

Value to $9.90 
Expires 3-15-80 

CHICKEN 
& RIBS 

Quarter Cnlcken and a 
petite rack of Pork 
Sparerlbs, cooked careful­
ly with Grandma's own 
BBQ Sauce. Included Is 
choice of Soup or Salad, 
French Fries, Roll and But­
ter. 

TWO 
FOR $699 

Value to $9.90 
Expires 3-15-80 

1273 Central Ave.,(NEXT TO VALLE'S) 459-4585 

• : . . - . • • . . • ' • • - • ' • - ' - ' ' • • • • 
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Middle Earth 
is forming a group: 

COPING WITH LOSS. 

Group will begin Tuesday, 
March 4 at 7:00 PM. 

Group size is limited. 
Call Middle Earth at 457- 7800 

for more information. 

The MousElî Ap 
^ Come to the Cabaret my friend! 

This weekend the Mousetrap 
welcomes S u g a r & Sp ice 

featuring Staci Block & Rena Lehrer. 
They'll be performing show tunes. 

February 29 & March 1. 
CAMPUS CENTER PATROON ROOM 

FRIDAY AND SATURDAY 
» P.M. TO 1A.M. 

A 
-UMURSm MJXIIIARVMRMCES. / 

Don't 
get pregnant. 

Use Cotitra-Fbam. 
I w o n ! risk damaging my body 

with the Pill or Ihe IUD. I ve 
.discovered Contra-Foam. 

WITH CONTHA-FOAMS 
PATENTED SINGLE STEP 

ATTACHED APPLICATOR THERE'S' 
• NO WAITING 

• NO FUMBLING 
• NO MESS 

ITS THAT SIMPLE TO 
PREVENT PREGNANCY. 

CONTRA-FOAM CONTAINS 
APPROXIMATELY 36 

APPLICATIONS BUT ITS 
SMALL ENOUGH TO FIT INTO 

YOUR POCKET OR PURSE. 

i CONTRA-FOAM IS AVAILABLE ' 
WITHOUT PRESCRIPTION AT 

LOCAL STORES. 

OFF 

i Coupon Expire* June 3o"7wo AU 

TJ« -^T •«**•<* <wf r*** ^ 
«* ?I60 NW tVo e . i . 1 
1UO* 

h r i w tfMiir I*, • , . |„ cfc*cfc. It b* c 

The WASP 
Is Coming 

The Annual 

PURIM PARTY 
Saturday night, March 1 st 

Beer, Hamantash, munchies, live band, dancinq 

• Megillah reading: 7.30pm LC 20 ^ ^ 
C o s j * CELEBRATION!: 9pm, Dutch U-Lounoe 
JSCcard-75 ' 
tax card-$1 by JSC and Kosher Pizza 
others-$1.25 Info, Gayle 7-7743 

QiSCDB) SPORTS 
g| £FD PRESENTS 
NCAA EASTERN REQIONAI BAskETbAll 

pUy offs 

Live FROM POTSCIAIVI, N.Y. 
FiRsrRouNd: AlbANy STATE (20-5) 

vs. 
ST. LAWRENCE (22-J) 

JoiN BRUCE SIIEINHAUS & Phi l Pivwick, FiiidAy 
FEbRUARy 29AT6:45pM&SA T l ) RdAy N . Q I I T , AS diey 

bRiNQ y ou All ThE pUy 'by - pUy 
SArDNdtd 

* * ^ * * * s 

HLLiiWi e 
* 

THESE ARE THE ARMIES 
^ OF THE NIGHT. 
T h e y ™ 100.000 strong. They outnumber the cops 

five to one. They could run New York Ciry 
lonighl they're all QUI to gel ihe Warriors 

WL 

VP°* 
IMISAUMI • 

'--'ana me nil 
• • • • • . • • . 

f* 

Friday and Saturday 

February 29 March 1 

7:30 and 9:30 
I'W-iiiro Center 18 

l .OOw/inx l.50w/(»"i 
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Cause:Drugs 
A New York congress member is 

suggesting that those excited Ira­
nian mobs who have been 
demonstrating outside the U.S Em­
bassy in Tehran just may be stoned 
on hashish. 

This allegation is coining I'roin 
Representative Lester Wolff, the 
chair of the House Select Commit­
tee on Narcotics. 

Wolff contends that — in his 
words — "Iran has a large traffic in 

' hashish. Quite obviously," he says, 
"the fcrvcr of the demonstrations 
outside the embassy indicates 
stimulation of sonic sort." 

It was pointed out to the congress 
member that the smoking of hash, 
rather than stimulating users, is 
more apt to mellow them out — 
making them more passive. 

His reply: "It mellows people out 
lo the point that they can be led 
very easily." 

6th 'Cents' 
A leant of psychics has reportedly 

out-classed a group of professional 
investors in trying lo pick out suc­
cessful stocks on the New York Ex­
change. 

The ESP News reports that two 
investors from Merrill, Lynch, 
Pierce, Tenner and Smith and one 
from EF Ilution and Company 
competed with three psychics in try­
ing lo purchase the most profitable 
stocks. 

Each of the participants in the 
contest "bnuglH"$l(XXl worth of 
common stocks using imaginary 
money, and six months later the 
slock selections were analyzed. The 
psychics' slocks gained a total of 

ZODIAC i 
$62.75 while the investors realized a 
loss of $9.95. 

Admitted one of the three 
analysts, Chris Morion: "We didn't 
do well at all. The psychics beat us 
fair and square." 

Next President? 
At least on presidential candidate 

who's not gelling a lot of media at­
tention is Garrett Trapnell — other­
wise known lo officials at the 
Marion Illinois U.S Penitentiary as 
number 72021-158. 

Trapnell is a bona fide candidate 
for the president of the United 
Stales. He's also serving a life 
sentence for air piracy, and the 
Marion inmate says the first thing 
he'll do if elected is pardon himself. 

Trapnell admits that as a con 
vicled felon, he can't vole in the 
next election, nor is he allowed to 
hold public office, lint lite constitu­
tion guarantees any native born 
citizen over the age of .15 ihe right 
lo be a candidate for the While 
House, and that includes Trapnell. 

Hence number 72021-158 has 
registered with the Federal Election 
Commission and has even formed 

.his own political party, the Na­
tionalists christian Democratic War­
ty, which he says is a bit to the right 
of the Democrats and lo the left of 
ihe Republicans. 

The parly members, he admits, 
arc mosl'y Federal convicts and one 
of Ihe main planks on his campaign 
plal foi in is, of course, prison 
reform. 

In fact, Trapnell says that the se-

Out there In the Atlantic Ocean on a sunshine beach 
there's going to be an outbreak of revelry this vacation 
break. And after the sun goes d o w n . . . wed, you know the 
effect that moonlight has on a celebration. We can only 
hope it won't be a full moon. 

Because from Jan. 13 through April 21 we're opening 
Nassau and Paradise Island to a wave of American col­
lege students. We have reason to believe that wave may 
reach tidal proportions. Probably because of the price: 
$269 Including air fare and 7 nights hotel. 
So there It is, young America. We guarantee you the best 
of dancing on the beach, water sports and a roaring party. 
Beyond that, you're Invited to Improvise. And since your 
talent for good timing is legendary, we've made prepara­
tions for you. We're going to be ready. 
With open arms. _ , _ . _ . _ — — .— — — — i 

501 Madison Avenue ij 
New York. N Y 10022 

—r. , , , , ,,, 12121355-4705 j| 
' I K I I l V » > tol l free(800) 223 0694 J' 

I INIEB^OLIIKJIATE HOLIDAYS INC. i 
FILING 

I 

$299.00 
Jan.05-Jan. 12" 

: Jan.12-Jan. 19" 
Jan. 19Jan.26 

; ;Jan. 26-Feb.02 
! , Mar. 01 -Mar. 08 

Mar.07-Mar. 14 

•Special departure 
$40 00 Supplement 

$339.00 
Mar. 14-Mar. 21 
Mar. 15-Mar. 22 " 
Mar. 21-Mar. 2B 
Mar. 22-Mar. 29" 
Mar. 28-Apr. 04 
Mar 29-Apr. 05 " 
Apr 04-Apr. 11 
Apr. 05-Apr 12" 

I 11 Alrlghtl Sounds goodl I've checked the week I j 
| want to party and enclosed my $50 deposit. 

I i ] Sounds good but I'd like to hear more. Send me 
• your brochure. 

J Name 
• Address 
I City s , a , o Z l p 

I Telephone. _ _ _ _ " _ _ . _ _ _ _ _ — — - . ' 

NASSAU&PARADISE ISLAND. 
BAHAMAS COLLEGE WEEK. 

cond thing he'd do as president, 
after pardoning himself, is "to br­
ing every government official into a 
federal lockup for at least 24 
hours" so they can see prison con­
ditions on a first person basis. 

Trapnell has filed a suit in U.S. 
Disiict Court, Incidentally, claiming 
lliat Marion officials are breaking 
title 18 of Ihe U.S code which for­
bids Federal officers from using 
Ihier positions to interfere with 
nominations or elections, He claims 
that the conditions of his incarcera­
tion prevent him from getting the 
word of his candidacy oul to the 
public. 

Tit Tourney 
A protest from the National 

Organization for Women has 
resulted in the cancellation of a pro­
posed Walla Walla, Washington, 
women's golf tournament known as 
"TIT." 

Ms, Magazine reports thai 
"ITT" is an acronym lor the winds 
"The Invitational Tournament." 

, Ihe magazine says that female con­
testants in Ihe tournament were to 
compete on Ihe basis of their bra 
sizes. 

According lo Mir., the divisions 
in ihe tournament, depending on 
bra size, included "gtiin drop," 
"langelo," "watermelon" and 
"golden delicious." 

The sponsors of the proposed 
tournament culled it off after the 
Blue Mountain Chapter of the 
Naiinal Organization I'm Women 
objected. The organizer of the 

Walla Walla event, Ron Coleman, 
is quoted by Ms. as saying that he 
held two previous "TIT" tour­
naments without receiving any com­
plaints. 

'Who'Trauma 
Roger Dallrey, the lead singer for 

The Who, says that the band has 
had real trouble playing ever since 
11 people died in a stampede for 
scats at its concert early in 
December in Cincinnati. 

According to Dallrey, "I've been 
forgetting words to songs every 
night. Your mind gets carried away 
now and then. It shook the baud 
pretty heavy." 

Dallrey and the oilier members of 
Ihe Who say that despite Ihe 
tragedy, they are anxious to return 
to Cincinnati some day to do 
another show. He said, "I think 
that would be Ihe best way to show 
what we feel toward Ihe people of 
Cincinnati." 

Comfort Counts 
lie very careful Ihe ncxi time you 

buy a pair of shoes because the way 
lhey ' . could determine the fate of 
your marriage, 

A society of fool specialists in 
England is suggesting Ihal one in 
every four divorces can be blamed 
on ill-filling shoes. 

According to Ihe British Council 
' of chiropodists, damage' to the sen­

sitive nerve endings of ttie feel 
makes people bad-tempered and In­
creases marital strife. 

Another finding of. the council is 
that in Britain alone, almost 4 
million people have one foot larger 
than the other. In such cases, the 
council recommends, shoes should 
be purchased singly rather than in 
pairs. 

Animal Accident 
Animal righls orgnai/alions are 

up in arms in France over reports 
that drugged live animals and 
human cadavers are being used in 
automobile crash studies near 
Paris. 

The magazine Paris-Mulch 
touched off the scandal by 
publishing gruesome, full-page 
photographs of durgged baboons 
and waxy-looking corpses hitting 
walls al 50 miles per hour. 

Tile head of France's national 
hlghvVay safely organization, Andre 
Chapon, is defending the use of 
animals in the disfiguring accidents. 
Chapon says "We use traiiquilizcd 
pigs and baboons to sludy Ihe 
organisms' reactions to ihe shock of 
an accident . . .doctors need a live 
animal lusiiidy such effects as com­
ma, wounds anil fractures." 

Pill'ls-Mali'h says Ihe 31 baboons 
and 2(1 pies were sllbjucled lo high­
speed crashes in recent tests. 

Pickled 

CUM yon say "P'ler Piper picked 
;i peck id' pickled peppers" when 
you've had one ion many? 

Well, doctors in Wesi Germany 
ure recommending thai drivers 
repeal such tongue iwislers In prove 
ihey are capable of driving if 
they've been drinking. 

SUNYA in Retrospect 
first of a werien 

and ' 

Bomb Scare 
'70 

Two calls, one to a Library secretary 
one to Security, caused ihe evacua­

tion of the Library at about 8:35 last 
night, By 9:15, students were again admit­
ted to the building. 

The first scare occurred when Security 
was lold tlial an explosive was set to go off 
in the Lecture Center Complex at 1:15 
pni. 

Notification came to Security from the 
Albany Times-Union which said it had 
received the bomb threat by telephone at 
approximately' 12:20 pm.Immediately 
upon receiving the threat Security began 
evacuating the Lecture Center Complex 
and searching for the explosive. 

The evacuation of the Lecture Center 
resulted in the crowding of hundreds of 
students in the main podium area. 

Birth of 
5 Quad 

'44 
State's "Big Ten" proved to _. 

such a tremendous success Inst year 
that Student Association voted to 
continue a project similar to It each 
year during the duration qf the war. 
Lost year's "'Big Ten" netted a profit 
of approximately $1800., enough 
to purchase a war bond that was 
used to buy a field ambulance. The 
"Big Ten" wart a series of presenta­
tions given by the various classes, 
organizations, and the faculty. 

This year the "Big Eight" wUl 
make It appearance as the backbone 
of Btate's social life and war effort. 
Elizabeth McOrath, '40, has been 
annotated chairman of the commit­
tee for the "Big Eight." Other mem­
bers on the committee are Mary Lou 
Haines, '40, Judy Dubc, '47, and 
Susan O'Oonnell, '48. 



columns 

A Draft May Be Blowing 
A Dangerously 

by N. Jaye Shore 
Primitive Perspective 

I dreami lhal Ihcy bombed Manhattan. 
After the frantic phone call I lay down and 
went lo sleep. At that point, the reasoning of 
one small person would have done no good 
or would have had no effect at all. 

When I woke up I discovered that Manhat­
tan was still intact for the moment so I ate 
breakfast and tried lo collect my thoughts. 
There were more upsetting things in the. 
news, but, like a person that has received loo 
much abuse, I considered it numbly and clos­
ed the paper. I iried to figure out what I 
should do, should I do anything. I needed to 
face my responsibility, but what was my 

rcspnnsibilily?whn was I anyway? How could 
1 effectively do anything? Everything was so 
large and confused. Everyone who thinks has 
been awestruck at the information lhal we 
have been allowed lo have, bui most of us 
are aware that there is much we do not know. 
Who am I in this deadened atmosphere? I 
feel like a brain cell in a medically sedated 
mind. 

In the face of history, in the bigness of the 
world, the bigness of a crowd at a drafl rally, 
1 feel small—loo small lo be effective—as 
small as a cell. Yes, you and I arc, relatively, 
as small as a brain cell . America is a country 
thai it is difficult to know since we live within 
it. Bui wc all know what Russia looks like. 
The information has been stored within each 
and everyone of us. It is easy lo sec a coun­
try, like a person, through a narrow scope. 
Don'i forget for a moment that there is 
anything less complex, less human, or lesslikc 
you and I within Russia's surfaces than there 
is within ours. 

"Bomb the shit out of Iran. They got it 
coining lo litem, and besides, we need the 
o i l , " Who are wc lo say thai? Let's punch 
America in the mouth because we don't like 
its altitude. Iran stole America's, rollcrsktilcs 
so America is justified in breaking Iran's 
fingers. Russia tripped America's sistei so 
America has I lie absolute right lo beat 
Russia's kid brother bloody. WV are dealing 
with a dangerously primitive perspective. 
And of course, we're right. America is 
justified, as well as the English, the Chinese, 
the Russians, the Isrnelics, the Germans, the 
Armenians, the Italians, and the Ira­
nians—everyone can find justification for 
their actions. 

Within each of us information has been 
stored. When wc arc called upon to add what 
we have learned to the whole, there is no 

reason not lo give it—or is Ihcre? Consider, i l 
educated fellows or our country, constitute 
the " b r a i n " of the. country, it is from the 
brain that is produced, along with the infor­
mation, the conscience, the ethical and moral 
beliefs, lite pride and character, and the 
reasoning abilities: all o f the aspects that wc, 
as humans, value. We are a big, healthy 
country, one which i thought was intelligent. 
I consider i l , and I think that others should 
also, an insult to enlist the Intelligence of our 
person into physical conflict. Are wc goals, 
bulls? What is our person like? Whul is our. 
character? 

Is America a seventeen-year-old kid who 
hasn't learned how to reason or control his 
sexual impulses? Is America a pampered 
preppy who flashes his vocabulary around 
like his clothes, but has no understanding of 
the human condition, save his won, who 
doesn't really know what the meanings of 
the words he uses arc, and has no experience 
in the world? Perhaps America needs a slap 
in the face; il doesn't mean, though, that wc 
need to fight back. 

I think that we should look broadly and 
simply at outs and other's characters. There 
are a lot of bruins in our country and a lot of 
cells in a brain. From these cells information 
is stored and called upon to be used. Aside 
from being an organic file cabinet, we arc 
also pari o f ihc conscience,!lie character, and 
the holders of values. So America wants lo 
enlist the help of millions of young 
Americans to solve the problems that wc are 
racing. I say, hy all means, LET'S HELP 
AMERICA. American needs more help than 
it thinks. Wc need to make il conscious that 
there are nunc effective ways of dealing with 
such problems and we can, if the whole bruin 
decides to, pull back the list lhal is ready lo 
punch, expend sonic energy lo calm down the 
angry body, and bring about the patience it 
will lake to reason our way out of this con­
flict and put in some esira hours to ensure 
that il won't happen again. 

Instead of being one of the brain cells lhal 
dies when America goes out and lies on a 
good one, or one that lias selfishly decided in 
bury himself in dead information, ignoring 
the cuircls and energy waves that arc rattling 
everyone around him, I must become pan of 
the ever-growing conscience thai hopefully 
will effect the decision-making pan of out 
country from flexing its muscles and pun-
clung Russia's iittlc brother,in lite lace. 

An Idealistic Strategy 
To the Editor: 

This letter is in response lo President 
Carter's motion lo revive registration and the 
draf l , both of which arc inconsistent for 
world peace. 

The argucmciil for potential military ac­
tion in the Persian Gulf revolves around our 
vilal interests there. The following is an alter­
native solution lo our present crisis. 

I propose that registration and a drafl be 
enacted, but for a different purpose than 
military duty. Those selected must serve a 
predetermined lime (2 or 3 years) within the 
United Stales working on ways so lhal we can 
become energy independent. ' propose wc 
ulilize the present technology of wind and 
solar power at home and use the money, 
manpower and education for increasing our 
research into new technologies of renewable 
energy sources. Those conglomerates tradi­
tionally based on producing war machinery 
should convey their capacities to the produc­
tion o f renewable energy resources. Gruman, 
Lockheed and the rest could relatively easily 
shift their production from fighters, tanks, 
and jeeps lo solar panels and wind power. In 
this way, with our present technology we 
could install sources of energy in those places 
lhal are appropriate (rural areas specifically) 
and thus, reduce our imported oi l . Using the 
vast amounts of money and research tradi­
tionally reserved for wartime technology ad­
vances the capabilities of renewable energy 
technology so we could gradually utilize 
technology in areas where it is now noi feasi­
ble. 

Ultimately the Middle East and all its oil 
would not represent that vilal interest and in 
I he long run wc would convert lo energy 
sources lhal are clean and healthy. This 
would also eliminate waste of thousands, i f 
not millions of lives. Blood for oi l , not mine! 
Any feedback? 

Sluan Lipson 

Tatt letale! 

Anonymous teller sent to the parents of Eric 
Kuli, auilwr of the-Aspects ankle "Beating 
The Drafl, 1980". 

Mr. and Mrs. Koli , 

I hope you arc proud of your son Eric. I f 
you have not already, please read Ihc article 
that your son wrote for the University 
Newspaper which appeared Friday, 2-8-80. 

If you agree with his feelings, then it is ob­
vious how he became the pit i ful excuse for an 
American ciliy.cn that he is. Bui I prefer to 

give you the benefit o f Ihc doubt, Perhaps 
Eric is totally at fault for his vegetable like at­
t i tude. I suggest in that case lhal you tn. 
courage your apathetic son to crawl back 
under whatever rock he came out from 
under. It is people like your son lltat have 
helped America become the laughed at, weak 
nation il is now; and our University to bt 
regarded as a clearing house lor apathetic 
morons, a category which thankfully all of us 
do not fit into. 
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Casualty 

To the Kdi lor: 
I l is a strange thing, to talk about 'war', 

and whether or not an individual would fight 
in one if called upon by their country. In such 
conversations, wc have certain expressions 
and idiomatic phrases which make the 
whole topic much easier lo deal with. We 
speak of 'going overseas', 'going to war', 
'fighting, for our country', 'going Into com­
bat ' , or 'standing up against the enemy'. 
These are very useful phrases which conve­
nient ly wrap up details which we all wish 10 
overlook, in a way so that we can sit down to 
a hearty dinner wiihoitt throwing up aftet 
hearing about the days "casualties" on lilt 
evening news. What is a casually? 

A half ounce piece of lead. It's cold, mid 
It's hard. And il navels ver) lasi. It travels 
very, very fast. You ncvci saw ii coming. 

I l rips through your flesh, causing an Cfr 
crucialing surge id" pain. It continues through 
your body, tearing through yom heart, yoill 
veins, and your nerves. It ' 
backwards Into the slime 
countless army boots, where ! 
lually lie rol l ing. The agon 
unbearable, an intensive pai 
could even imagine. You look i 
and you sec your blood ,_yjnnjii 
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Yuu fall 
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blood. 
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Dutch Quad 
Night at the Fights 

Interest meeting 

Tuesday March 4 

9:00pm TenEyckBasement 

Questions? Call Kenny 7-7894 

TWO DOWN - AND A LOT 
MORE TO GO! 

BAby , WE'RE sriU BORN TO RUN! 

CEUbRATSNq OUR 
SECONd ANNJVERSARy 

ONTkEAJR 

fldcBg} 
ai m 

MARch is O U R M O N T H ! 

SAFUNCIECI 

SA Legal Attorney Jack Lester will be available to 
answer any questions you may have: 

The following nights on the following quads: 

3/4 Alumni Quad Brubacher Hall Main Lounge 7:30 
3/6 Colonial Quad Penthouse 7:30 
3/11 Indian Quad Penthouse 7:30 
3/12 Dutch Quad Penthouse 7:30 
3/13 State Quad Penthouse 7:3* 

If you are moving off*campus\ 
please bring your lease. 

Aspects' 

Contents*** 
S t u d e n t 
Notebook: Out on 
the no r t hwa rd 
thruway, going home. 
Toward the receeding 
line of ch i ldhood 
memories. Adolescent 
summers basking on 
hot concrete. Fading 
images of d im 
recollection. Hitchik-
ingin the trail of VWs. 
Follow the running 
narrative on page 4a. 

S t u d e n t 
N o t e b o o k : 
Swooooooosh went 
the skis down the 
mountain white in a 
slush of snow. 
Ahhhhhh went the 
crowd as they stood in 
awed a d m i r a t i o n . 
Ooooooooh Babe said 
the skier as he launch­
ed into the.sky. Olym­
pic orientation on the 
Observer. Page 4a. 

S t u d e n t 
Notebook: It's the 
ninth inning of a late 
a f l e r n o o n . The 
schoolyard is squeal­
ing with kiddies. Con-
chila Is up. You can 
feel the tension. They 
don ' t cal l her 
" C l e a n - u p " fer 
nothin'. Meanwhile, 
the smart one. Shirley, 
wears red, and her 
knees don't Jouch. 
Find out the score on 
page 4a. 

F e a t u r e : Even 
honorary librarians 
begat. Let's face it, 
there's more going on 
between guys and 
dolls than tap dancing. 
The fact is you better 
be aware of the dif­
ferent birth control 
methods. Remember, 
accidents can happen. 
Find out how you can 
belay begatting on 
page 5a. 

For those 
who don't know 
enough about 

Contraception. 

For those 
. who do. 
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Aspects 
Feb. 2 9 , 1980 

Centerfold: In the 
beginning, there was 
Heaven, there was 
Hell, and there was 
the W o r d . Some 
listened, others didn't, 
but in one way or 
another, everyone's 
message Is the same: I 
am what I am. 

Sound and Vision: 
Out of the Pink and In­
to the black. The Wall 
was performed Hue at 
Nassau Coliseum for 
five nights and the J 

theatrical show has 
been heralded as the 
rock event of all time. 
But is this the end of 
Pink ' Floyd? Rave 
reviews ,the concept 
and the show on page 
8a. 

Sound and Vision: 
Costello's back in ac­
tion and Aspect's got 
him. Elvis packs twen­
ty tough tinged songs 
on one frantic LP and 
its delerious force Is 
sharp and biting. Join 
Cliff Sloan as he 
journeys through the 
tauntilated torment of 
E.C.'s world. What 
else can be said but 
Gel Happy on page 
9a. 

Fiction: You gotta 
meet this gir l 
Meredith. She's a real 
trooper. True, she has 
more than a fair share 
of agidou, especially 
this particular day. 
And she's not too cool 
about life's adversities, 
but, you know. Watch 
her, but not too close 
— she bites. On page 
10a. 

The Editor's Aspect 

Long Live 
Rock 

The lamb lies down ready for slaughter. Sheep, 
harmlessly passing away. Hands outstretched, a sea 
of waving hands, the constant rush of roaring 
throng. Mindlessly squealing and grunting, piggies 
under the steel of a Strat at 120 decibles — and beg­
ging for more. They want all the jam, and will 
stampede over eleven of their kind in Cincinnati to 
get it; or pay a hundred bucks to wail in the aisles for 
two hours. Get drunk, get stoned, get blown away at 
a rock show . . . 

Stage stuck and comfortably numb the boys in the 
band see sunshine amid the dark vacuum of the 
arena. But the fans only see the surrogate band, the 
imposter hiding behind cold eyes and sonic distort 
tion: hiding behind a wall of illusion. The fans don't 
know the pain of standing naked in front of twenty 
thousand screaming maniacs laughing because they 
like the sound twenty thousand bloody laughing 
maniacs make in the arena. They want loudness and 
dazzle and lights, lights, put on the lights, start the 
show, turn up the volume, release the balloons, put 
up the wall. They don't want to hear about being 
stabbed in the back by the dogs, or robbed of 
freedom of thought by vengeful teachers, and 
freedom of love by desperate mothers. They don't 
want to hear the eclipse of insanity. They don't want 
to be there at the machine. Maybe they too just want 
to feel comfortably numb. 

They would die for you, Led Zep, Stones, Who, 
Floyd. Die or kill, They'd do anything for a nod to 
the crowd or even a biting smile. (And standing ova­
tions for fifteen minutes while you pick a vein in the 
men's room, or later back in the hotel). But they'll 
never get behind the wall and see . . . You'll wait for 
the worms until they tear down the wall. 

And the wall will be rubble and again you'll stand 
naked in front of twenty bloody thousand bloody 
laughing worms. They still don't understand. But, 
you surrender, so what? , 

Spiritual Graffiti 
" H e y Y o u ! W i th you r ear against the wall wai t ing for so­
meone to call ou t w o u l d y o u touch m e H e y Y o u ! W o u l d 
you help me carry the stone O p e n you r heart , I'm c o m i n g 
h o m e . 

But it was only fantasy 

The wal l was too high as you can see 

No matter how he tried he could not break free 
A n d the wo rms ate into his b r a i n . . . " 

Old Pink 
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The Student Notebook 

Asp ectt 

They called me "clean-up,'' not because of 
my immaculate room. No, for that they called 
me "seldom," because I seldom cleaned It. 
"Clean-up" because I always batted fourth, or 
punched fourth In public school. Team cap­
tain, pitcher, catcher, and outfielder when 
need be, or when Denise Davis was up. She 
was a strapping black girl, the No-I-Would-
Not -L lke-To-Meet -You-Even- In -A-L lgh l -
Alley type, who- couldn't run fast, 'but boy 
could she hit. She didn't like me. I thought It 
Was because I was In the smart class. It was 
because I was friends with Shirley Beans. 
Shirley Beans always had clean fingernails and 
quarted, crust-trimmed tuna sandwiches. 

Shirley wasn't bad, I just didn't like seeing 
her walking to temple on Saturday In while 
patent leather shoes. Her legs formed an 
isosceles triangle when she pledged; they 
never met. 1 heard she had webbed feel, bul I 
couldn't ask her. We" weren't thai good 
friends. I would check It out Saturday, at her 
slumber party. 

In fact, I didn't want to be her good friend, 
cause she was third basewoman, up 8th, and 
It looked bad for the athleterati to be seen wllh 
her. 

We had a sub one day, Mrs. Hacked. I sign­
ed my Delaney card W. Amadeus'Mozarl and 
called her sergeant. She threatened will) 
detention, bul I was still Captain and detention 
was something that Archie got for passing out 
slices of pepperoni pizza In class.' 

• Titlllatlon and black bubbling schoolyard tar. 
Classes 4-2 and 4-3 were going to choose up 
their own sides at last. Inter-class punchball. 
Denise Davis and Conchlta Rodriguez cup 
lains, she called "even" and "once. Iwlei 
threece shoot': we both pul oul twos. "Three 

Friday Observer 

One From Column A 

PunchandJudy 
Conchita Rodriguez and Shirley Beans 

The Olympic torch has been doused and 
the spotlight no longer shines on Lake Placid. 
Once again it is a quiet mountain village. For 
two weeks, though, it was center stage for the 
world, land of masterful foreign sledders and 
skiers, Eric the Great and a Cinderella hockey 
team which proved that one should never 
underestimate American college kids. The ex­
citement was hitting its peak last Saturday . . . 

When the bus approached the sight of the 
90 meter ski jump at Intervale, the massive 
jump platform came Into view. Mouths drop­
ped at the sight .oO the blinking lights for 
airplanes atop the platform. The sun battled 
with the clouds, occasionally providing some 
warmth for the crowd of over 25,000. To 
describe the crowd is to describe every loud 
color In the universe. Yellow down jackets. 
Bright blue pants. Purple vests. Orange hats. 
A peacock would be jealous. 

The action. Athletes sliding down that 
monster and leaping Into the air, skis together, 
backs and heads held in perfect form. They 
stretched. Oh, how they stretched. They stret­
ched to prolong their majestic flights, refusing 
to land until more precious meters of ground 
passed under their skis. When Newton's Law 
finally prevailed, some had flown more than 
the length of a football field. 

Crazy. That was the first reaction to the 
jumpers. And the second and the third, A 
general consensus was that anyone who made 
that jump without a parachute deserved a 
medal. The crowd emitted roars of encourage­
ment for each American and Canadian 
athlete, but they would never be contenders In 
the competition for medals. The Finns buried 
the pack, capturing the gold and the bron2. 
North Americans simply weren't in the same 
league as their Nordic counterparts. 

The air was festive, though, as the Infor­
mality of the public address announcer and 
the antics of the "ski cheerleaders" kept 
everyone entertained. Just when the style and 
grace of the athletes had lulled the crowd into 
taking the jumps for granted, a violent spill 
brought the reality of danger to full front. The 
athlete was carried out, having suffered a 
broken collar bone. 

After the event the crowd poured out of the 
sight and the time came for Lake Placid's own 
special event — Olympic bus-walling. Though 
the vehicles were plentiful, it took nearly two 
hours to pile the masses Into them. 

"Olympic t-shirts!" Two t-shirls were in hot 
demand from the cold crowd: one with Ice for­
ming on the Olympic rings which proclaimed: 
"I Survived the 1980 Winter Olympic*", and 
another which had a single Olympif ring 
separated from the other four and read: "Lei 

takes It," I tried, but she glared and picked 
Beth-Gayl Slegel,(don't forget the hyphen). 
She was my classmate, my fucking classmate, 
I thought now, since I didn't use fuck as an ad­
jective In the fourth grade, this was war and 
twos were wild . . . 

After the third and fourth picks, It really 
doesn't matter, it becomes a moral thing. 
Never pick the ones who "ooh, ooh" and raise 
their hands like plastic head-banded Shari 
Schneider. Never pick the ones who ate 
mayonnaise on cold fried chicken, like Meryl 
Kessler. But ketchup on salami was allowed 
because Suzy Spieler was Ihe best short-stop 
around. Pick your friends? Well, that depend­
ed on who was having a social on Friday, or a 
slumber party. 

My turn. Well, f could pick Donna Divinsky 
to fill in the outfield. But she always gave you 
the reject presents she got for her birthday, I 
knew cause when I gave her a photo album I 
pul a red dot on the back and sure enough it 
turned up at Randl Klepner's on January 7th. 
So pooh on her slumber party, and when I 
didn't pick her she wailed "slaughter sides, .'m 
not playing." Eleanor Rlgby. Without Donna, 
we'd have fourteen on each team. And the 
ball-flowers, we called them. The ones who 
slapped, or rolled grounder's right into my 
hands, the first outs clinging to the fence, 
pretending to want to jump rope. Susiin 
Abner and Sheila Silverberg, Rachel Weiss 

and Sal Montanalgro. To be one of the 
chosen. Being made to feel wanted, one of 
the gang and what about Napml? 

What to do-about Shirley Beans? Standing, 
there In "stylish" "the denim-look" Keds, 
forlorn, cleaning her fingernails with her teeth 
and picking lint from her pretty floral skirt. 

My turn. Susan Abner is better, but Shirley 
Beans needs support from a jock like me. Do I 
want to win that badly? Yes. She always runs 
around screaming "Fair, Fair ball," and waits 
for Donna D. to get it, 

I don't like being vulnerable. Feeling like 
Reb Tevye on a bridge deciding his daughters' 
fates . . . . 

Webbed feet. A slumber party with a "Make 
Your Own Sundae" attraction. Real hot 
fudge, no Bosco bullshit. But I doVt like those 
crunchy things that Mrs. Beans tries to pass off 
as sprinkles. 

There is no other hand. I didn't pick her. 

I wear the Scarlet Letter; I am Cain. I am a 
fourth-grader and it Is happening again. We 
are choosing up sides and I will get picked last 
and there is nobody I can joke about it with. 

My name is Shirley Beans and Ihe denim 
sneakers are the mark of my caste. I wish this 
were over. Punchball isn't my worst sport: 1 
can look one way and hit the Other. And Its 
impossible to be that bad on third base. As 
long as 1 remember: "The play is to home." I 

Olympic Overki l l 
The Russians Play With Themselves." 

The bus. As the warmth of the bus soothed 
the frozen hands and faces, several hours of 
standing in snow made the feel harder lo lKaw 
out. What little ill humor the cold had brought 
on was melted as the bus driver pulled the 
chariot away from the sight. He flicked on a 
tape and over the, speakers came the Beach 
Boys wailing "Surfin' USA". The thoughts of 
surfboards and summer brought smiles to the 
many faces on the bus. 

Lake Placid Village, Beautiful, quaint town. 
Thousands of excited people walking up and 
down the main street. Saturday was sand­
wiched between two days of celebration over 
the Amazing Team America. Signs in shop 
windows congratulated the hockey players on 
their dramatic victory over the Soviet machine 
and wished them luck in the gold medal game 
against Finland. The talk of the crowds 
centered around hockey, the evenings figure 
skating competition and Eric Heiden's fifth trip 
to the gold mine. 

Ribbons Of Euphoria 

Hawkers, hawkers, hawkers. They sold 
everything — the official Olympic everything, 
that is. One man put the body of an airplane 
on a Cadillac and made his own souvenir 
shop on wheels. Another claimed to have in 
his possession pieces of the 1932 Olympic ski 
jump, which he offered to trade for Olympic 
pins. They hawked programs, pins, hats, 
scarfs, shirts, pennants, American flags, 
posters, paintings, bumperstickers, and more. 
One tipsy fellow, beer can cradled In his hand, 
leaned against a garbage pail and held up a 
tattered, four-fingered glove. 

"Chance in a lifetime!" he screamed. "Get it 
here — this is the Official Olympic Glove! Get 
il while 1 got It! One dollar for the Official 
Olympic Glove!" 

Scalpers, scalpers, scalpers. Super Bowls 
and heavyweight championships couldn'l 
command such prices. Two guys walked 
casually down the road, the scalper speaking 
in a Southern drawl. 

"You got any tickels?" 

' promise I will remember "the play Is to home" 
Pick me. 

It is not easy to stand here and be haled. 
I tried talking to Conchlta aboul it once 

because they were giving coolie shots and i 
wanted her lo give me one. Bul then I realiz­
ed: they Innoculated against my approach. I'n 
the faggot, the red ant. "Is Ihere a cure?" I 
wanted to know. Selsun Blue? Antibiotics? I 
know Its not just a matter of PF l:lyeis and a 
yellow raincoat and the right lunchbox. It's 
more •• It's me. 

I am Typhoid Mary and I wanl lo infect 
them. The play is lo home. I mumble and pick 
up the Spalding which has rolled to the lence. 
There is no one near enough lo hand II to. I 
will have to throw. 

Conchlta Is looking at me and I feci her eyes 
as 1 throw a sloppy, weak underhand. She 
may pick me anyway, because I invited her to 
my parly. That is going to be a disaster, but It 
was my mother's present to me. She knows 
kids do things like that, so she wanted me lo do 
It too. Launching me a debulanle Willi scabby 
knees and the popular appeal ol poison ivy, 

Cliques. I don'l know why we even bother 
to go through the motions. Conchila picks 
Susan Abner and Suzy Spieler. All three ol 
them have navy knee socks. Denise is Afro-
American and picks Beth-Gayl, and Elizabeth 
Van Oss. They have the longest legs In the 
class and cover the field like ostriches across 
Ihe savannah. My socks arc yellow and my 
knees don'l touch. I know il. 

1 guess I don't mind being picked last, 
because H's less responsibllily. They kno' 
already they're sluck with me, they don'l have 
to find oul. 

Pick me. Please. 

Thomas Martello 

"Ah got tickets fer the hockey game. If y'all 
wanl 'em, they're gonna cost you," 

"How much?" 
"There's quite a demand. Well, how about 

. . . um two hunert dollars each?" 
"I gotla think about it." 
One man complained that hold rooms 

would cost him $300 for one night foi him and 
his friends. One night in Lake Placid fi » almost 
the cost of room rates for a whole semester. 
Crazy. __ 

Traders, traders, traders. Button and pin 
trading was a major pasttime of spectators, 
The haggling was fierce and trades involving 
folks with pins adorning their entire down 
jackets drew large crowds. 

"1 got a Russian airline button!" 
"How about that ABC emblem?" 
Perhaps the most sought-after Item was the 

Olympic NBC peacock, suddenly an en­
dangered species after the events 
Afghanistan. This bird could feather up to 

continued on pwje 10a 

SueGerbe 

Going Home 
Houses camouflagued against the hills on a 

tapestry of another's life still unlcad • comes 
undone against the barren Irees lhat line 
themselves up in front of the night lor radical 
in(tro)spection. Giant lumps ol earth carefully 
placed on either side of the highway. What 
technique! The plastic cars that weave back 
and forth on the black ribbon wllh Ihe line(s) 
down the middle - they're the ones that really 
understand. They know, they know what it's 
like to be left alone with just their thoughts: 
close friends . . . distinct each . . . going 
home. 

Summers were always Ihe best in Emily 
Cove, Massachusetts, Ihe little town 1 grew up 
in. Eighty miles from the Cape, but we almost 
never went. Not until much later, anyhow. 
Weekends, years, were spent in or out of 
town, but with concrete under one's feet, not 
sand. And not Just because it gets In between 
your toes, and gels In your socks, your shoes 
and, inevitably, your bed. No, but because In 
Emily Cove you simply spcnl your lime either 
in or out of doors, and either In or out of town. 

Jackie and I used lo hitchhike a lot. Upstate 
and out-of-state, basically, although Ihe pro­
per current could carry us, say west. Just in 
general, nol meaning California or Arizona or 
even points really west (like Hawaii, Japan or 
even ihe East). No, maybe New York or even 
Woodslock(l), 

1 remember one particular event-even more 
clearly when I try to focus • a rock'n'roll 
(obsolete yet? no?) concert at approximately 
Wntkins Glen. N.Y. A racetrack but this 
weekend a rock'n'roll bazaar, festival, an 
open-air drug market, whatever. A girl named 
Jackie, a boy named Jackie, another named 
--, and more, much more. 
Out of breath . . , the sound of a mind In 

overdrive, racing, over-fatigued, not enough 
oxygene or something to the brain, 
hacheahoe try and catch its breath, so to 
speak, as If it could,. 

The sun sets Into its little nest Just beyond 
where you can see and I can, sec thai the traf­
fic's really spacing out. (Metaphor used osten­
sibly to describe the traffic really Is meant to 
modify inhabitants of one particular light blue 
VW heading northward on the thruway (not 
thru on the nnrlhway; that was weeks ago). 
Well, wish-you-wcre-here-at-Anahelm '77 Is 
playing lowly (db - even better!) In the 
background, and you get the picture: 

Flashback lo light blue veedub heading (you 
know where). Narrator squints In the dimming 
light, trying to make out the director. But the 
director's, made off with the leading lady and 
the script. Looks like a mystery Is unraveling, 
(Note: tliis would be a good place to Insert a 
mystery. Use your discretion)* 

The running narrative is spoiled walking 
along the side of the highway, panting very 
severely and sweating. Our TV cameras pull 
up and Ellen leans out the window, shouting 
"Hey - why aren't you running? You're sup­
posed tah be running!" The car has slowed 
down to the narrative's pace.and traffic is gel-
ting very backed up behind the Volkswagen. 
The sounds of hundreds of angry NYC-lo-
Westchester-communters' horns are heard on 
the lape. In fact, the sounds of the horn 
so loud that we can't even hear Ellen. Or ihe 
"running" narrative. By George! He's fallen 
over. And he's rolling clown the hill. Wall-a-
minute, I believe he's getting up. Uh huh, uh 
huh, he's fallen back down. Ladles and 
gentlemen It's all over! He has )usl rolled Inlo 
Ihe river. Sorry folks, but we won'l be showing 
Ihe rest of the clip as we promised. Bul, 
Ing up nexl Is Alex al the library where a pro­
test sit-in is being staged I " fight whal c 
leader has called "oppressive over di 
return policy" Alex? 

Obviously, something has gone wrong 
There's no Alex. In feci, there's no picture 
nothing Is coming oul o l Ihe TV People sl( 
glued to their sels walling (or something l( 
happen. Slowly, ihe picture returns and Ini 
sound Is restored. Bul It's not TV.r> News II 
not even the news. It's, It's . , . (To I" 
Mimed) 

Aspects Feature 

Do's And DorTtT 
P « 8 e 5 « 

Birth Control: 
THEIN9IDG 9TORV 

(^t\ Ir.th control is our responsibllily to the 
*~*next generation. The slatistics on un­

wanted pregnancies are staggering, and 
what's really distressing is most of them are 
unnecessary. Birth control methods are 
available to almost anyone wanting them. 

National agencies like Planned Parenthood 
or local clinics like Whitney M. Youngin Arbor 
Hill see over 10,000 women annually. 

Sue Gerber 
Granted, there are still side effects or in­

conveniences from most methods, but the 
alternative is even less appealing. Of 100 sex­
ually active women using no form of birth con­
trol, 80-90 will become pregnant before the 
year is oul. 

"It's not an easy decision," says Linda 
Stern, teen education coordinator at the 
Albany Planned Parenthood. She stressed the 
fact that the type of birth control a woman 

chooses is a personal decision based on her 
lifestyle and what she feels comfortable with. 
Some women may prefer the convenience of 
one method, or the lower risks of another. 

Abstinence Is still the most effective method" 
she emphasized. 

Nancy Raab, nurse praclltloner in charge of 
family planning at Whitney M. Young Health 
Center talked about how demographics affect 
women's decisions aboul birth control. "Most 
of our patients are adolescents — from the In­
ner city — and tend to prefer more convenient 
methods." A large majority of patients there 
use the pill or IUD, and Ms. Raab reports a 
very low incidence of related problems. 

Here's a very current discussion of several 
types of birth control methods, complete with 
descriptions, advantages and disadvantages of 
each based on-books, talks with counselors 
and Ihe latest in information put out by the 
NYS Department of Health, 

Still number one both locally and nation­
wide as a temporary (reversible) means of 
birth control is the Pill. There are basically two 
kinds of oral contraceptives: the standard birth 
control pill and the newer "mini-pil l ." Both are 
taken by mouth everyday and contain either 
one or both of the female hormones produced 
naturally in the ovaries: estrogen and pro­
gesterone. 

The "mini-pill Is 97-99 percent effective in 
preventing pregnancy and the other Is usually 
considered 99-99.7 percent effective. That is 
one of the major advantages of being on the 
pill, The other is the psychological benefit; the 
separation of the birth control method from 
the actual sex act allows more spontaneity, 
which many women say, improves relations. 

However, many women on the Pill report 
the opposite effect: a decrease In sex drive due 
to liormonal changes. When on the pill, a 
woman Is In a state of artificial pregnancy. 

MUSSEL 
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There is water retention in the tissues (often 
resulting in weight gain. Some lose weight, but 
many complain it's harder to lose weight when 
on the pill.) There's sometimes accompanying 
nausea, headaches, menstrual problems, sore 
breasts, darkened skin, emotional depression, 
etc. Some of the more serious, though less fre­
quent side effects include an increased risk of 
blood clots in the leg, lung or brain, strokes or 
heart attacks. 

For most women under 35, the risks are 
minimal, unless there's a family history of cer­
tain disorders (for example, breast pr uterine 
cancer.) This !•> why it's vital the prospective 
pill-user consult with a doctor she can trust. 

In older women, especially those over 35, 
overweight women or moderate to heavy 
smokers, Ihe risks are greatly Increased. For 
those smoking 15-35 cigarettes a day, the risks 
are 4.6 to 21 limes higher. Also, the risk of 
heart attacks is ten times higher for smokers. 
Risk of other circulatory diseases, like strokes, 
is three to five limes higher for smokers. And 
the overall mortality rate is thirteen times 
higher than for non-smokers. 

But still over 50 percent of women who 
regularly use birth control opt for the pill. 
There are several different strengths and doc­
tors are careful to prescribe the kind with the 
lowest dosage lhat still will be effective. Most 
women experience few, if any, side effects. 
Prices range from $2-5 a month, depending 
on whether the pills are obtained from a clinic 
or a drugstore. Often, special discounts or 
sliding scale fees are available to students. 

The second most popular (temporary) 
method of contraception is the use of foams 
and condoms. Unlike the pill or IUD, this 
method requires no physical examination or 
doctor's prescription. Foam and condoms are 
relatively inexpensive, available at drug stores 
and, when used together, arc almost 100 per­
cent effective in preventing pregnancy. And, 
unlike all other methods, condoms prevent 
the spread of V.D. . 

How they work' is obvious enough: the 
woman applies the foam or cream immediate­
ly before having sex and the man does the 
same with the condom. (One pamphlet sug­
gested that the partners help each other apply 
the devices to make it part of foreplay.) 

The advantages of this widely-used method 
are the availability and Ihe decreased health • 
risks to the woman. 

Some of the disadvantages relate to the tim­
ing elemenl — having to interrupt the foreplay 
lo apply the contraceptives. Also, with con­
doms the partners occasionally complain of 
decreased enjoyment, although some argue 
that's merely psychological. Then, there's the 
complaint of general messlness and the taste. 

Used Independently these methods aren't 
qulle as effeclive. Condoms are usually rated 
al 90-97 percent although there is the.chance 
of its slipping off or bursting. Foams used 

alone are about 90-97 percent effective. 
Another common type of birth control, at 

least in some demographic areas Is the in­
trauterine device, or IUD. This Is a plastic 
device, often shaped like a double S with a 
fine thread hanging off the bottom. It's im­
planted In the woman's uterus by a doctor, 
and removed the same way. Periodically, 
usually monthly. Ihe woman" checks for pro­
per placement by making sure the thread Is in 
place. Usually nothing else is required, 
although some doctors suggest using foam or 
condoms during ovulation. 

Many women like Ihe IUD because it's sim­
ple, malntalnence-free and, like the pill, 
removes the contraception from the sex'act, 
allowing greater spontaneity and confidence In 
having sex without fear of pregnancy, {The 
IUD is generally rated as 97-99 percent effec­
tive. 

The strange thing about the IUD — and the 
reason many women don't trust it as an effec­
tive birth control device (despite statistics) is 
that no one is quite sure how it works or why 
It's effeclive. One popular theory holds that 
the IUD somehow weakens the uterus, 
rendering it unable to support a pregnancy. 
Another belief is that it creates a change in the 
lining of the uterus, thereby preventing a fer­
tilized egg from attaching itself to the lining, 
and thus prevent it from starting a pregnancy. 

There are a few different kinds of lUD's. 
Some have added hormones or copper added 
and some believe those additions have further 
effectiveness against pregnancy. 

There arc several serious risks to consider 
before deciding upon using the IUD. There are 
many programs or clinics that refuse to fit an 
IUD for any woman who has nol consulted 
her family, due to the high risk of infection. 
Since the hanging thread>acts as a wick allow­
ing bacteria to freely ascend inlo the uterus 
and ovaries, il greatly increases the chance,of 
infection, which could lead to sterility. 

Among the other possible reactions, here is 
a partial list: anemia, backache, blood poison­
ing, bowel destruction, expulsion, embedi-
ment, perforation of the uterus or cervix, etc. 
In the rare event of pregnancy, there is the 
chance thai the IUD may become dislodged 
and implanted in the baby. Sometimes 
deformed babies are a result of this. But 
despite all the horror stories, these are only 
possible risks and they vary from woman to 
woman. This is why a complete physical and 
discussion with a knowledgable doctor Is so 
Important. 

Until recently, the diaphragm has tradi­
tionally been one of the least used artiflcal 
means of contraception. Demographics have 
a lot to do with interpreting statistics, yet it ap­
pears diaphragm use is on the rise, especially 
among college women. The diaphragm is a 
plastic "dome" with a tough outer rim. It's In-

serted by the woman up to six hours (some 
recommend two hours) before Intercourse, 
and then removed not less than six hours 
later. It's applied with spermicidal cream or jel­
ly and, when used faithfully. Is 97 percent ef­
fective. There are no physical side effects, ex­
cept the possibility of an allergic reaction to the 
spermicide. The effectiveness and absence of 
harmful side effects are what makes the 
diaphragm appealing, but there are disadvan­
tages as well. They involve the timing element 
(although, unlike foam and condoms, there Is 
significantly more leeway) the taste and smell 
and general messiness, Also, sometimes the 
man feels it inside but rarely during inter' 
course. There's also the chance of getting a 
holq in the plastic so it's necessary to check the 
diaphragm before and after each insertion. 

Natural family planning — sometimes called 
rhythm — is becoming increasingly popular. 
It's Ihe only method approved of by the 
Catholic Church, (although many religious 
Catholics practice olher forms of birth con 
trol). Basically there are three methods of 
determining when a woman is ovulating and 
during these few days a month (less than a 
week) sex is either avoided or olher means 
employed. These three methods are observing 
changes in the mucus produced by the cervix 
(it becomes stretchy, slippery and more abun­
dant during ovulation); the temperature 
method (taking your daily basal body 
temperature); the third involves a combination 
of ihe other two. This requires patience and 
faithful chart keeping and when followed can 
be up to 97 percent effective. Not all women 
can use this method, however. A discussion 
with a physician is necessary beforehand and 
several months of preparations must be allow­
ed. 

The advantages are obvious — no moral or 
religious objections can be raised, no artificial 
or harmful chemicals or hormones are altering 
the body. The disadvantages are that It's time 
consuming, not for everyone, and not always 
effective. 

Among married couples the most common 
type of birth control — at leasflocally — is per- j 
manent sterilization. For either the man or the j 
woman It's a simple operation (sometimes 
very expensive, especially for the woman, 
depending on where it's done, etc.) that 
doesn't affect your sex life except that there's 
virtually no fear of pregnancy. This Is a drastic 
step and usually the doctor will counsel pro­
spective patients first. The operation is almost 
always irreversible and therefore doctors are 
hesitant to perform It on young, unmarried 
people. 

There are other methods of birth control: 
withdrawal, the "day-after" pill, abortion, 
prayer. They are so ineffective, ad hoc, or 
radical that they won't be dealt with here. 

For further Information on any of the above 
topics, call Planned Parenthood or the 
Whitney Young Health Clinic, or other doc­
tors or clinics. m 



The boy remembered the way the bitter cold 
| of his mid-Atlantic city would tougheifhls skin • 

to a consistency similar to that ol his street­
wise friend's . character and the learned 
discipline of his fifth-grade teacher who taught 
him Improper Infractions and whose stern and 
round eyes scared the daylights out of his 
afternoon, only to send him back out In the • 
cold, his scarlet cheeks growing white edges 
like the down In his jacket or the snow, with 
the wind from the lake that hummed through 
his door at night In C minor harmonizing with 
the overture of the symphony of his life, en-

dlng with an erotic coda that culminated into a i 
shattering climax, but that was years away and J 
until then he faced a daily barrage of elemen­
tary questions that he neither liked nor j 
understood and grappled with the logic of sub- , 
jecls and predicates and do you do that at 
home? and sal In his seat pretending not .to 
know the answer, which would surely isolate 
him from the basketball players he couldn't 
compete with (who didn't let him play, 
anyway) and the girls who were growing taller 
than him as well as breasts and huddled into 
groups, most definitely to laugh at him, and 
him only because nobody else had /lis pro­
blems, or /lis fears which he was forced to 
assuage with a ?.\ inch screen thai offered him 

Bob O'Brian 
food when he was hungry, clothing when he 
felt naked, and companionship when he was 
lonely, and the price of this refuge he couldn't 
begin to conceive of as he believed that Ford 
had a better idea and really wondered if he 
would actually look belter in a sweater washed 
in Woolite that a sexy mannequin wore on a 
crowded city street, or sometimes discarded to 
parade around in a storefront picture window 
with no clothes on, but that didn't change her 
placid and benign Princess Grace smile one 
bit, neither did Ihe fact lhal she didn't have 
pubic hair that he didn't know at the lime 
would scratch against him uncomfortably the I 
first time because everyone knew the first time 
was to be savored and he could never llgure 
that one out, for his palms had turned wet and 
frigid cold the first time and his heart pumped 
ferociously in his throat from which he manag­
ed to cough up unintelligible sentences thai 
she didn't care to hear anyway, and legs so 
weak that they couldn't support him (or her), 
so it was with great awe and question and a 
source of cynical laughter to him, actually, thai 
all the fuss was made about it, lhal poems 
rhymed in memory of it, that songs were sung 
praising it, that books were sold recording the 
details of it, and even his father had to go 
through with It, as well as almost everybody he 
could think of, even Bogart who assuredly 
had a cigarette after it and even his Aunt Jean 
who also smoked cigarettes, almost with a 
vengeance and pulled the smoke up through 
her nose and let it out to soothe, her raspy, 
lough voice with a sloe gin fizz that was her 
lavoritc, the standard of his aunt whose hair 
was frosly while and whose physique was si ill 
lean and whose skirl would stick to her knees 
in the wintertime from the sialic which she 
would smooth oul with Ihe air of distinction 
lhal everyone said she had, on ihe order of a 

Joan Crawford, say, or Rosalind Russell, a 
"gutsy dame" who could tell the Men In her 
life lo shove it occassionally, and said things 
like "who in the hell do you think you are?" to 
show her Indignation, yes, even Aunt Jean 
went through it bul women like Aunt Jean l | 
frightened him and put the fear of the Tube in I I 
him which as he grew older assumed a dif­
ferent meaning and lold him that no one Jl 
would love him unless ho did it this way, and 
he would wreak from body odor and bad 
breath and be laughed, scorned, and ridiculed 
al and would be, basically, a piece of shit 
unless he did it the right way, all of which, as 
he later found oul, were manifestations of 
older standards that preordained the sequence 
of right things like the rlyht books lo read, the 
right music to listen to, the right restaurants, 
the right food. Ihe right people, and Ihe right 
thing to do, always a source of great conflict 
for him as it must be I guess hmmm maybe for • 
anyone who thinks or contemplates which 
maybe hmmm I guess isn't really lhal many, 
bul "many" is a subjective amount considering 
the number who are called as opposed to the ' 
number that are chosen, and for what grand 

purpose or design was he being called lor maul 
he have been so bold to ask — because hlsl 
name wasn't "Legion" and he was not m a n u ] 
at all, but-One Solitary Life just like Jesus waj | 
or Mao or even Buddah, Confucius. Muham-I 

I 'mad, St. Augustine or Princess Lee and Kerl 
sister Jackie, neither of whom he could im-l 
aglne farting and leaving Ihe room lo avoid tin J 
subsequent embarrassment of the utikindestl 
cut of all; or doing anything mundane and 0r-| 
dlnary, the things that warranted rep 
from parental figures, the things t\Ky didl 
anyway like leaving dirly peyole-smelllngl 
socks near Ihe bed or driving drunk Into ihe c l - | 

i ty at night where the niggers lived and waited! 
, with radios In their ears, drugs lo sell, hip jive] 

talk and Innate funk lhal he envied ,u 
laslzed about while he should've been uo :\ 
his trigonometry — binomials. Irinominals,] 
parabolas, and abstracts lhal helped build i l i e | 
great pyramids, lowers, dams, bridges, antj 
Ihe god-awful co-ops that an eighth tjrads 
malhead could have conceived on ,i bad day 
not unlike today — the "today" he so devoutly I 

' believed In and was lold with uncompro 
assurance w o u l d be fol lowed 
"tomorrow", and was preceded IT. an u\ 
more distant "yesterday" that w.i- o hrouded I 
by a mortalistic need to preserve whai 
never was, the same need thai drni u hi 
parents lo frame him and his sislet -1 vi r< 
in 8 and one-half X 11 fields of light at 
him to scratch, in chalk, one more ol 
eulogy lo his conscious living sell one 
word, on a graffltied, red-bricked wall ne,: 
school for which he was apprehended, h< 
cuffed, and dragged oi l in an eerie looking I 

I automobile with a screen in hark thai must lie [ 
used for wild animals or something, and then 
he was photographed front and side, linyer-

See*** 

I printed, and allowed to keep on his regular a t - | 
I tire of blue-jeans and a flannel shirt and in he F 
{went, Into the holding center cell for a night] 
(because justice began In the morning, and all I 

he could do until Ihen was try to sleep or s i l l 
j and scan his entire life up until that point and J 

reflect, which Is precisely what he was doing. ( 

In the morning, the boy was awakened b y l 
the jangle and clatter of keys opening locksl 
and metal bar-doors sliding to and fro, T w o l 
men stood' before him In silence, seeming t o l 
demand that he gel up from his col Im- l 
mediately, which is exaclly what he did. H e l 
had no Idea what lime of day it was, nor wherel 
they were taking him. The Iwo men were o f l 
equal height and both wore grayish, almost! 
khaki shirts and pants. Neither of them said a l 
word, but motioned that they wished him t o ! 
follow. The only sound lhal could be heard as! 
they walked was black leather shoes on the ! 
floor echoing through the oblong hallway that l 
neither emitted nor received light, save for o n e | 
flickering orange-yellow Incandescent bulb. 

After being led Into the courtroom, the boy 
Isat and looked al his surroundings. The design j 
|was traditional with Ihe usual Latin Inscriptions | 
|where Ihe 'U's look like 'V's and Ihe American 
(flag stood beside impressive pillars of ..white, 
I above anxious and downtrodden faces — 
I mostly black. An old man, most likely a drunk, 

stood before the Judge In a dark, i/gly-green I 
I raincoat. Again, no one spoke directly to the I 
I boy, but Instead, motioned lo him lo stand 
\before Ihe judge's bench. 

"What are Ihe charges agalr 
lashed the magistrate and before 
J answer, a voice emerged 

"D-d-d-dlsorderlyc c c condu 
The buy looked behind him 

I with an open briefcase on the di 
him a public defender win, had 
assigned to his mse because a |c 

I advocacy group hail taken inte 
beside himself HI'' allntne 
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"How old are you, son?" asked the judge In | 
j 'a friendly, paternal voice. 

"Seventeen, sir." 
"Seventeen, sir," repeated his honor with a j 

I sigh and as he read the deta Is of the boy's ar-
I rest, a faint smile thawed some of the icy-cold | 
j austerity of his due-processed face. 

"So, a John Doe, eh? Well, John Doe, 
I you've been accused of disorderly conduct — 

writing an obscenity on public property. How j 
do you plead?" 

Once more, the voice rang unevenly from ] 
the background. 

"Not-not-not gul-gul-guilly, your honor." | 
The boy was dumbstruck. His attorney con­
tinued without flaw, 

"This is more than merely a case of a boy I 
writing a dirly word on a brick wall. This strikes I 
at the heart of our basic rights. This is a matter | 
of free exp-exp-expresslon. We have no inten­
tion of entering a plea'of gui-gui-guilty. your | 
honor." 

"Your honor — wait — " the boy began, 
I ' but liis only objection was interrupted, again, 

by his attorney. 

When someone's right of self-expression is] 
Im * I m*lrn* impugned, no matter how petty or J 
oblique it may be, we're there to help." And j 

, with that display of eloquence and a half-
smile, the young, stuttering civil attorney pick­
ed up his brief case and left the courtroom, I 
leaving behind murmurs and the pounding of j 
ihe judge's gavel. 

\il tight, then, a plea of nol guilty has been I 
entered. John Doe, you are hereby ordered lo 
stand trial in Court Number 173 of Dutchess 

| County on May l b . Frankly, I was ready to 
I suspend the small fine you tvould've received 
t had you pleaded guilty, bul seeing <is though 
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I denl awarded the boy a certificate of merit lor 
his ".enacious sland on human rights for not 
only Americans, bul foi citizens of the world.' 
The spate of people, famous or nol. who dally || 

j confronted and praised Ihe buy, didn't se 
In mind In Ihe leasl lhal he oflered no explana- I 
lion for his actions and said nothing In j 

I response in their long winded platitudes. 

Not all reactions In Ihe buy's ongoing saga I 
I were favorable. There were splinter groups 
j among the more extreme elements of 1 

America's populace who believed lhal the boy I 
epitomized Ihe disintegration of the country's 

I moral fiber. Some of these groups perpetrated j 
I press leaks lo discredit him, one of which 
| claimed lhal Ihe boy hadn't wrlllen an obscenl-
I ty after all, bul was actually carving his Initials I 
I Inlo the brick al Ihe time of his arrest. Another I 
j group sent young high schoolers across the | 
I country with Instructions lo curse a blue-streak | 
j In fronl of senior citizens thus Illuminating ll 
(bad Influence Ihe boy had on Ihe nnlio 
I young and Ihe serious consequences of on i 
Iqul l la l foi him. while still another leak claimed | 

I thai th Illre ii i< l l i f i i l was a hoax. 
And as the Innuendo against him i 

[cumulated, Ihe buy became more and more i 
[desponileni, where finally I" ' said nothing al 
ja i l lo anybody, Months passed. Not a word, 
j The trial dale was approaching and ihe buy 

was taken back to prison as his defense was 
prepared. 

"N-n-n-now I don't want you lo s-s-s-spoll 
anything," his attorney advised. "J-j-just re­
main quiet and we'll l-l-take care of 
everything," 

From the meeting, ,the boy was led back lo 
his cell. Everything became unusually quiet 
and he' found himself suddenly face to face 
with a surly-looking Inmate who was pacing 
nervously with his hands in his pockets. 

"We don't like what you done," he said, 
and his eyes looked up and down at the boy. 

"Now, sometimes I say those words when 
I'm good and mad, but no one I know would 
write something so filthy and disgusting on a 
wall where little schoolchildren could see It." 
He pulled out a large kitchen knife that Im­
mediately sent the boy's heart beating at an In­
credible pace, draininq the blood from his 
legs. A guard slepped Into the foreground 
near the hostile Inmate andthe boy fell reliev­
ed, only to be consumed once again with fear 
as he realized lhal the guard had no Intention 
whatever ol helping him He slood with his 
arms folded. 

"We don't like you here," he sneered. "You 
should be burned (or what you did. Everyone 
else thinks-su. loo, even those fancy people 
with their money and their cars think so, but 
they're too chlckenshlt to admit it and now 
they're loo buied to care what happens lo 
you." 

The boy turned lo run bul was caught from 
behind with something that fell hot on Ills 
throat, ll fell like an Indian burn or a string be­
ing rubbed vigorously back and forth. He tried 
to scream bul only a gargling sound came oul . 
He struggled lo breathe, but couldn't and now 
everything fell silent. Mute faces looked al him 
like they were confused and Ihe boy fell lo the 
floor, breathless, while a preiiy shade ol red 
smeared his gray work shirt. 

The echo of footsteps ringing, unaccom­
panied violated the offensive silence and a pair 
o l black gatot Bhoes slood adjacent In the 
unpleasanl sight. 

"D il d did everything turn out all right?" 

"Yeah. It's over." 
hi "Thl 
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Sound and Vision 

Aspects 

QM Ike a spacecraft firing retrorockets In 
""^defense of gravitational pull , Pink Floyd 

touched down In New York this weekend. For 
better than thirteen years the Floyd have been 
sizzling airwaves with more than Just music. 
From the opening confusion of "Astronomy 
Domlne," to the resonant repercussions of 
"Outside The Wall" the band has maintained a 
reserved Insanity, which has served as a black-
hole center of some of the most progressive 
work done In the art spheres of Rock'n'Roll. 

Pink Live 

Up Against The Wall 
' ' . , ' , , , ,. „ A „ , „ „ ! , ( „ i „ storv. imposed by evil characters, but in truth it stage behind the We 

Rave 
The eighties see a new Pink Floyd. No more 

long voyages to saturn on the crest of Gllmour 
Guitar Work. Gone are the sessions of syn-
thesised music that made you ask yourself 
what universe are the sounds coming from?" 

As the trend has been of late, the Floyd have 
ouchcd down on earthly fooling, assuming 

the stance of Rock and Roll scientist, here to 
present research, and more Importantly, to 
conduct It. Something has happened to 
Floyd, and if we are willing lo see It, Ihey are 
willing to say 1^ but as always there is the Pink 
Floyd thematic paradox. 

The Ingredients of the music have changed 
very little in the past few years. The majority of 
the music is in cut time, the abundance of elec­
trical effects such as echo, loop, and delay arc 
still prevalent. Their stage presence Is still 
massive, profound, and cryptic. The music re­
mains reserved, mysterious, and symphonic 
and the story comes across loud and obscure. 

The themes of Pink Floyd albums have 
always been simple and hidden, at least since 
the concept album period beginning with Dark 
Side oj the Moon. Since that time Roger 
Waters has taken over most of the lyric 
writing, and as a result the work has become 
autobiographical and biographical (remember 
Syd?), with significant message content for the 
common man. But make no mistake, the 
albums have always been their story, any bolls 
of description 01 advice, the listener heats with 
empathy, he does by his own accord. 

D.S.O.T.M. was, on a broad scale, the ar­
chetypal, modern condition, On the personal 
level it is the story of Syd Barrett as echoed by 
the conscience of Roger Waters. Wish You 
Were Here Is the dllema of the modern con 
dltion. It Is Waters' apology-confession to Bar 
rett, with a touch of Idolization thrown in. In 
An/mu/s Walers points a finger at those-to 
blame lor the destruction of human society. It 
Is in these last two albums that the subject ol 
the themes switch from Barrett lo Watei», as is 
Waters realized that the sime (ate which befell 
Barrett was impending lor himself. 

This brings us to The Wall, Pink Floyd's first 
double-concept album. Take note that The 
Wall is not a double-album that Is a concept 
album, but is rather two concept albums. It Is 
the first time that Waters works on a highly 
personal level, addressing himself (and Bar-
reft) directly, If not by name. And in litis sense 
It Is frightening, because we see Ihe real 
Waters, the tragedy, the sadness, the insanity. 
The Wall is Just barely rock. It Is more art-rock, 
and still more, It Is rock-theatre. As performed 
It Is unl"'T anything I've seen except Tommy, 

In wlthdrawl from love, work, and even life. In 
an objective sense it Is all carlctertured and 
cllche'd, but considering that the Individual In 
question here Is a rock star, and taking note of 
(the unsung but still Included In the written 
lyrics) "What Shall We Do Now?" the cliche 
strikes with poignancy. The end of side two 
finds Waters quietly withdrawing Into himself. 
As a totality, Record One Is the story of the 
rock star from birth to self-admittance that the 
things one set out to do, having been ac­

complished, provide no happiness and much 
pain, forcinc the Individual to reject his station 
In society, as well as society itself. 

While Record One Is a slory that covers a 
large span of time, Record Two Is an accounl 
of the rock star from behind the wall, so that at 
tills point the plot slows down and the 
message picks up. In a sense Record One is 
the setting, Record Two Is Ihe slory. 

On Ihe (irsl side of Record Two (side 3) 
Waters gives an account ol his personal, pro­
fessional, and psychological situation, lull nol 
before asking If anyone understands, if 
anyone can see what he is saying abbul 
himself and everyone else, I le gels no answer. 
In "Hey You" he depicts Ihe situation between 
Pink Floyd and the audience. In "Nobody 
Home" he depicts the rock star's personal 
alienation. In "Comfortably Numb" he siunn 
ingly confronts himself and in eacli case comes 
away with nothing. These dilemmas now left 
unsolved culminate in a quiet frenzy of self-
rejection'in "The Show. Must Go On. " At this 
3olnt the story gels nasty. "In The Flesh" finds 
/Vaters mocking his audience for their ig­
norance, and In "Walling For The Worms" he 
admits his sickness, welcomes it, and nearly 
succumbs. But in "Stop" we see Ihe old 
humanitarian artist try once more lo say thai 
he always meant well, thai he always tried lo 
do something (or us, nol himself, that this 
Sickness he has developed is the sacrifice he 
has pa id for our bene f i t . 
In "The Trial" Waters is surrounded by his old 
and new oppressors and confronted with a re­
sounding sentence of gui/ly. His punishment 
mance Itself, some words need still to be 
spent on The Wall as a record. While many 

story, Imposed by evil characters, but in truth It 
Is self-imposed. Exposure . . . his punishment 
Is the creation, of his own volition, The Wall, 
the work where he sentences Pink Floyd to be 
exposed before its peers. Finally, In "Outside 
The Wall," there Is the feeling that something 

stage behind the wall and are asking 
themselves and us If anybodys out there. Then 
from behind the wall they play "Hey Y o u " and 
'he alienation between rock Idol, and jdollzers 
jecomes as real and as large as the grand ca-
lyon. "Nobody Home" sung by Waters In a 

an*' Is In many respects more advanced. For 
this t suffers In recorded form because Ihe 
essential element Is gone, and without 
performers any play becomes merely a text. In 
one single swoop of genius, Waters has 
creaicd Ihe ultimate comment on rock 
pedagogy, sacrificing even himself. The Idea Is 
so large II cannot be faithfully delivered In con­
cert form or recorded lorm, it flourishes only 
as theatre. 

Before venturing Into a review of the prefor-
real (twisted) society, to vlctlmlzer, undergoing 
powerful mutations along the way, climaxing 

may be able to empathize with the album's 
broad and superficial treatment of Ihe In­
dividual's cries within society and Ihe ensuing 
monumental effort to protect one's self Irom It 
resulting In self-destruction, the album Is far 
more focused than thai. Record One, which 
might be aptly titled "Bricks In Ihe Wall" Is a 
record about the cold insensitive world that 
masquerades as a normal society, and one in­
dividuals (Waters-Barrett) progression from 
victim, or what you and I might call a normal, 
sensitive person exposed (o the absurdities of 
— to be exposed ~~ Is, for Ihe purpose of the 

heavy has been lifted, as if amid the destruc­
tion the creation of something tiny and 
wonderful has come, perhaps freedom. 

Turning to the concert Itself, any description 
musl contain the term different. It was dif­
ferent from all previous Pink Floyd shows, and 
different from any other rock concert. Tradi­
tionally Pink Floyd have nol done much on 
stage beside letting the music and visuals 
speak for themselves. They don't mess around 
much, hardly ever project their personalities, 
only Infrequently speak to Ihe audience, and 
generally play a long show. All of lhat was 
changed this lime. The show was The Wall 
and nothing more. To some extent the visuals 
were less Intense than usual, as If this time 
Ihey wanted you- (the audience) to get 
something more out of the show than Just a 
great drug experience, they wanted you lo 
Ihink. Walers even introduced, one of the 
songs and after ihe show the whole band 
came on stage lo say Ihanks. The whole show 
took around Iwo hours, within which Ihe band' 
relocated on stage several limes. Waters mov­
ed around stage quite a bit. and even Gilmour 
could be seen bopping back and lorth occa­
sionally. 

In terms of comparison to other rock 
groups' concerts, well, they've never come 
close to Floyd's total audience. And while no 
group ca.i approach their total concert effect, 
t l i f Floyd liave moved somewhat away from 
the sheer (on e of earlier concerts into rock-as-
Iheafre, sacrificing some of Ihe concerl effeel 
In an atlump! to comment on the effect of 
earlier shows. The only thing remotely similar 
to this is Townshend's Tommy, which for all of 
Its p'rofoundity falls short of coherence unless 
taken melaphorlcaly. While Tommy is musical 
commenl in theatrical form, The Wall is rock-
as-thealre as a vehicle -to address rock as 
culture. Like Tommy, walking away from The 
Wall, even after it Is spectacularly performed, 
one must have a sad, hollow feeling II he Is lo 
suppose himself lo have understood it. The 
Wall, as an album or as a show Is a movement 
In rock h i s t o r y . 

The concert Itself was a spectacle. Before 
the band took to the stage, It was obvious that 
77ie Wall was todays lesson. As Floyd concert-
goers have been accustomed to for over eight 
years, suspended above the stage was the 
now familiar round movie screen. In addition, 
built on the wings of the stage were the begin­
nings of a massive wall that would meet at 
center stage. As the concert progressed these 
walls were continually expanded until during 
"Goodbye Cruel World" when the last brick 
was put up, completely separating Ihe au­
dience from the hand. During the first hall of 
the concert we were treated to one dive-
bombing WWII airplane, inflatable figures of 
the schoolteacher from "The Happiest Days of 
our Lives,", Ihe wife Irom "Young Lust," a 
telephone conversation, and the mother. Like 
the airplane and round screen used during the 
Darkslde lour, In the second half of the con­
cerl we saw another prop from an old concerl, 
the Inflatable pig, Roger's "Plggle," from 
Animals, which just goes lo show lhat these 
guys don't throw anything away. The first half 
of the show (Record One of the alburn) 
graphlcly displayed Ihe construction of Ihe 
wall around old Pink. When Ihe last bricks are 
put In place as "Goodbye Cruel World" fades, 
we are left with an awful sense ol separation 
.ind emptiness while Ihe house lights go up. 

I'll.' opening of the second hail is probably 
ihe -,111:11!' urn'.i brilliant theatrical effect In rock 
history, As "Is There Anybody Out There" 
begins we realize lhat Pink Floyd has taken ihe 

motel room constructed within the wall drives 
the alienation Into isolation. In "Comfortably 
Numb" Waters stands outside the wall facing 
and singing toward his own shadow. Gllmour 
sings the alternate voice In this song from on 
top of the wall, and In a marvellous lighting eft 
feet he Is strongly backllt so thai his silhouette 

and shadow confront the audience. The 
shadow imagry works so well that one cannot 
help but realize that Waters and Gilmour and 
playing Ihe same personna, who is In reality 
not one person but a synthesis of Waters and 
Barrett. At this point In the show it becomes 
clear that Waters has given up his fetish lor 
writing about Barrett's life, and now writes 
about his own life, as it is In the process of 
becoming similar to Barrett's life. After con­
senting, almost helplessly, to come out and 
continue the show ("The Show Must Go On") 
our herdes take on the crazed stance of Neo- . 
Nazi Rock emperors, not unlike Syd Barrett's 
own tendencies. Of course Barrett never 
realized his Intentions, but Waters unwittingly 
lived on those Intentions by becoming a rock-
god lo Floyd fans. In "Waiting For The 
WormS" Waters comes out and adresses the 
problem of luttering insanity, but not before 
searching versions of "In ihe Flesh" and "Run 
Like Flell" treat us to eight men on stage (two 
of every instrument) so that we can visually 
doubt which are the real Pink Floyd and which 
are "the surrogate band." Throughout the se­
cond half of Ihe show we are treated to movies 
on the wall a la Gerald Scarfe, which 
culminate in "The Trial," a delightful and 
dazzling bll of theatre. Finally the wall Is blown 
apart on stage. Ihe band retakes the stage, 
trouloadqr-slyle and sung "Outside The Wall" 
to non-electric music. The closing Is optimistic 
in that freedom seems possible even If It is a 
sad freedom, but pessimistic in that It almost 
seems a formal closing statement from Pink 
Floyd. While they may have gained their 
freedom thru the wall (the recording and per­
forming contracts are now fulfilled) we may 
have losl them as performers. 

Two closing notes, both sad: First, 
throughout the concert It was obvious that 
most of the audience, while enthusiastic, did 
not understand the message presented to 
them. Evidence of this was apparent In Ihe 
timing of applause (it seems Just when the au­
dience ought to be Insulted, It respond with 
cheers). This has been an ongoing problem for 
Pink Floyd, who have professed themselves to 
be both artists and exploiters, and it took 
courage to create The Wall In an effort to ex­
press this. Unfortunately most of their fans Just 
want "space-music" and would prefer to forget 
the often redeeming messages. 

Secondly, the message in The Wall Is so 
clear lo those who will attempt to see it, and 
the Ignorance of the general audience member 
so apparent, that It would seem as though we 
may have heard or seen the last of these boys 
as a performing group. a 
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Fear and Loathing 

Elvis Gets Happy 

( j j l h e r e were days when a skeptical 
"^ American public snickered at a homely 

' data processor who borrowed the name of our 
rock-n-roll god and proclaimed himself king: 
days when vengeful, love-lorn outcasts 
somehow didn't fit into Ihe scheme of rock-n-
roll stardom; days when Initials E.C. stood for 
a certain six siring vlrtuouso who played lead 
guitar with Derek and the Domlnos and 
Cream. But a pigeon-toed processor named 
Coslello has changed all that, patented the In­
itials E .C , and released a string of LPs too 
dynamic , powerful, and influenclal to be ig­
nored by anyone. 

Cliff Sloan 
Beginning with a 50s twang and venemous 

lyrics, the Initial sound of My Aim Is True was 
made crlsper and more streamlined. Record 
by record the lyrics blossomed with cynical wit, 
cutting their way through a well balanced 
garden of power-chord rock, calypso based 
beats, and softer ballads of loved-starved 
frustration. One could call Costello the seed 
and producer Nick Lowe the sun. They com­
plimented each oilier almost flawlessly and by 
E.C's third effort, Armed Forces (1978), the 
product was first class, all purpose rock, 
polished and accessible. 

Welcome Ihen, Get Happy, E.C. patent 
number four in a line of progressive, ear-
gripping rock music. This LP Is Intriguing and 
so adventurous lhat you'll feel like crawling In­
side the cover and exploring the vinyl. Each 
listen will reveal a new catchy tune or another 
scrap of biting lyricism. Get Happy is nol a first 
listen album, It's a one hundred and first listen 

•album. And although 1 sit about to inject my 
views and opinions on E.C.'s newest release, 
somehow, someway, I don't think I'll feel the 
same tomorrow, the next day, or the day after 
that. I'm simply not done exploring yet and I 
don't know (as I sit In the midst of my Qlfth 
listen) when I will be. Part of the reason for this 
Is that Get Happy has twenty tracks (len per 
side), and upon first listen I felt barraged as a 
blur of new, streamlined Costello sped by me, 
too quickly to grasp. I haven't yet captured the 
full Impact of Get Happy. I haven't completed 
my excavation. And so my reader, on this 
venture 1 can guide you only as far as 5lve. 
listens will allow me to. Consider me then 
another explorer, merely 5lve steps ahead of 
yourself. Do not hold me to my opinions or 
rehash this article In a few weeks only lo refute 
what 1 am about lo say. This LP is to be 
studied over and over again, interpreted and 
reinterpreted, learned and relearned, as is any 
piece of art. One thing this writer will promise, 
however, Is that Gel Happy will not bore you. 
It will remain on your turntable for days, If not 
weeks al a lime, drawing you with confident 
certainty as a magnet draws steel. So sit back 
and glance over my Journal, take a tour of 
listen number 5lve of Costello number four — 
draw from it, learn from It (If you canl, but 
don't bet on it. I still have 96 listens left to go. 

Entry No. 1, E.C. 4, Listen No. 5lue — "I 
Can't Stand Up For Falling Down" — Captain 
Costello Immediately bellows Ihe painful con­
fessions of love-lorn frustration. "I'm a man 
whose been hurt a little too much, I've tasted 
the bitterness of my own tears", sadness . . .", 
and so the story always seems to go with 
Costellonlan characters. It's a sturdy, If safe 
and conservative opener, that keeps The At­
tractions (who've only gone so lar as to Iden­
tify themselves as Steve, Bruce, and Pete on 
any American released album) right up front 
with Elvis throughout the number. The first 
revelation offered here Is that allhough twenty 
cuts Is a multitude of songs for any one LP, the 
music doesn't suffer, This tune (Ills its space 

nonchalantly, not sounding rushed or con­
densed. This should come as little surprise, 
however, since Costello's s.p.a. (songs per 
album) rale has never dipped below a dozen. 
Coupled with Nick Lowe's personal guarantee 
(or phonic quality, my first fear of Get Happy 
Is dissolved. Yes, It seems possible to get 
twenly worthwhile songs on a single LP. 

Entry No. 2. E.C. 4, Listen No. 5/ue — 
"Black and White World" — Captain Costello 
has stepped out In front of Steve, Bruce, and 
Pete, seemingly more in command. The 
democratic air of Entry No. 1 Is gone allhough 
the band works more effectively this way. The 
Attractions still follow their leader attentively, 
increasing his effectiveness, accentuating the 
still complaining Captain whose tone has 
grown more direct and stern, "There'll never 
be days like that again, when I was a boy and 
then a man." Flls bickering tone sounds as 
good as ever and I waul to hear more, but my 
desire Is In vain. The Captain has already, 
perhaps loo soon, turned his attention 
towards Entry No. 3, Nonetheless, I am hap­
py, impressed, and also eager to move on to 
Entry No. 3. 

Entry No. 3, E.C. 4, Listen No. 5/ue — 
"5ive Gears In Reverse" — "If you don't know 
by now, nobody'll tell you. If you don't know 
by now, she'll probably kill you," proclaims 
E.C. His cutting edge Is as sharp as ever, and 1 
have lo listen closely lo grasp the Captain's ex­
act words, allhough his attitude Is clear. He Is 
cynical, short-sighted, and vengeful, Ihe way 
I've always liked him. The band strikes hard, 
choppy chords, lending adequate support to 
Elvis' switchblade lyricism. Still only E.C. Is Ir­
replaceable. There Is little, If any, potent musi­
cianship on Get Happy, but nevertheless 
something clicks, and clicks well. I feel lul l , 
satisfied, and quenched as the Captain leads 
me on. 

Entry No. 4, E.C. 4, Listen No. 5lue — "B 
Movie" — Undoubtedly, this entry is the apex 
of my exploration with E.C. thus far. A 
brilliant piece of work by producer Nick Lowe 
and a calypso bass line leaves the Captain's 
whining, more subtle voice in the foreground 
The beat makes me want to dance; not jerk up 
and'down, but simply do a little skant or reg­
gae shuffle. E.C.'s voice glides gracefully over 
timely rhythmic changes, allhough his words 
still preach blunt reality. "Everyone's on the 
make, It's not your heart I wanna take," 
Costello boasts, his voice flowing with a 
melodic quality reminiscent of "Party Girl." It 
is sweelcynicism, prime E .C , the Captain in 
his finest form. This Is becoming one of Ihe 
most pleasurable expeditions my ears have 
ever taken. 

Entry No. 5, E.C. 4, Listen No. 5/ue — 
"Motel Matches" — E.C. takes this leg of the 
journey solo. "Motel Matches," In the tradition 
of "Alison", is Ihe Captain at the helm, 
another apex, another side of Costello, He 
grows more subdued and everything about 
him seems romantic, barring of course, the 
twisted metaphors. "Falling for you without a 
second look, falling oul of your open pocket-
book, giving you away like Motel Matches," 
E.C. mutters. So far, my piece de resistance 
thanks lo more slick production by Nick Lowe. 
The Caplaln Is growing In diversity, wit, and 
craftsmanship through every leg of my 
Journey. 

Entry No. 6, E.C. 4, Listen No. blue — 
"Human Touch" — A circus lype organ bc-
bops The Attractions back Into the 
spotlight with this upbeat number. It Is a lighter 
tune than Its Iwo predecessors, whose closest 
melodic relative is "Oliver's Army" (a product 
of Armed Forces). I interpret II as comic relief 
lo the usually Intense air of Costello. The Cap-
lain, however, had his usual sentiments, "I 
don't wanna know about much, I Jusl need 
that human touch." 

Entry No. 7, E.C. 4, Listen No. 5lue - r 
"Beaten to Ihe Punch" — Just "Pump It Up!" 

Entry No. 8, E.C. 4, Listen No. blue -
"Temptation" — "He drinks In self-defense, 
give me temptation," the twisted Captain 
sings. He Is Cupid's enemy, a preacher of 
anger and vengence. "Templatlon" is another 
scrap of the biting lyricism of which 1 previous­
ly spoke. The Allraclions revert lo a suppor­
tive role as Elvis reduces Ihe volume, but nol 
Ihe venom. It Is venom lhat churns in the 

stomach of the depraved, the bereft of love,, glad. I'd hate for him to soften up and change 
and the cynical. Yet I-listen and somehow his views. They're what keep him unique 
really enjoy It. It Is meshed together with a cat- " J ' L ' ~ " - - » - • - ""-'• 

chy, driving formula. In fact, if I didn't listen 
closely to E.C.'s words, I'd think him a roman­
tic. He asks not for my acceptance or sym­
pathy, but spits on my values and romantic 
Ideals. Still, I enjoy and respect. Twisted or 
not, he Is dynamic and refreshing, a pleasure 
to spend an hour with. 

Entry No. 9, E.C. 4, Listen No. 5lue — "1 
Stand Accused" — E.C. reaches for the 
volume switch again. The Attractions Jump to 
Ihe signal and blast oul "1 Stand Accused." It Is 
superb, the best power chord rocker I've heard 
the Captain produce thus far. I am at a loss to 
understand Elvis' reversal of feelings as he 
barks, "Girl, I love you so much I think I'm go­
ing insane." Rarely have I seen his wound this 
wide open, not covered by cynical vengence. 
Still his versatility behoove's me to continue, 
keeping my ears close to the speaker. 

Entry No. 10, E.C. 4. Listen No. 5/ue — 
"Riot Act" — The Captain is up front on this 
song, returning to his good old vicious self, 
"When the weather gels so tropical, and the 
talk gets so topical, Rlol Act." I like him like 
this, somewhat subdued with a whining, 
twisting voice reminiscent of "Little Triggers." I 
sit now al the half way point ol this musical 
journey. In the midst of lyrical switchblades 
and musical tightness. The Captain calls me 
on like a siren and I feel compelled lo obey, to 
flip over Ihe vinyl and Inject another powerful 

dose of Get Happy. 
Entry No. 11, E.C. 4. Listen No. blue -

"Love For Tender" — The lyrical wit of E.C. 
still proves to be the driving force, the power 
which gives energy and elfectiveness to Get 
Happy. As anyone familiar with Costello 
might expect, the "tender" here is legal 
tender. The lady, however, rejects E.C.'s of­
fer, "You won't take my love for tender . . . 1 
could be a big spender," he growls. The cut Is 
short, mean, straightforward, and to the point. 
E.C. moves on toward "Opportunity." 

Entry No. 12, E.C. 4, Listen No. Slue — 
"Opporlunily" — "I 'm looking for a little girl, 
big money for families having more than one," 
the Caplaln announces, telling us how he was 
born during the "second big baby boom." 
Again we see another cynical Incision of the 
lyrical blade, "I'd like to be a hero but I can't 
stand the stench . . . I'd like to be his funeral 
director." It seems he is now In Ihe trenches of 
Viet Nam, bitter yet holding his ground at 
stage center, preventing band democracy. 

Entry No. 13, E.C. 4, Listen No. Slue -
"The Imposler" — This is E.C.'s tale of bar 
room deception, "I don't know why you can't 
see, he's not the man you think he'll be, He's 
only the imposler." A powerful carnival organ 
returns me to the days of This Years Model. 
The Attractions move into slage. center with 
Coslello and Ihe result Is short, belligerent, 

keep him angry, keep him Captain. This 
tune Is quieter with a more effective and 
serious tone. 

Entry No. 15, E.C. 4, Listen No. 5/ue — 
"King Horse" — The Captain moves on , full 
steam ahead. "King Horse" has mixed 
melodies — boisterous, subdued, then 
boisterous again. There Is Elvis, a bass line, 
then a quick role of the drums announces the 
Introduction of a snakey organ that completes 
Ihe transition of a back and for*i duel between 
a bawling Costello and the accentuating At­
tractions. I am merely content, not over­
whelmed. 

Entry No. 16, E.C. 4, Listen No. 5/ue — 
"Possession" — Here Is a refreshing yet too 
short rendition of a mld-slxties rock beat 
seasoned with the unfailing lyrical switchblade 
ol the Captain. "If there's anything that you 
want, If there's anything lhat you need . . .", 
E.C. asserts, knowing full well lhat all these 
gifts and support can only lead to 
"Possession." 1 felt elated. The song had given 
me new vigor, more cause to carry on, but 
Elvis cut me off too soon. Still the earmarks of 
an E.C. classic haunt ihe song. I am feeling 
too comfortable with the Captain, as if I know 
what to expect. 1 don't like him this way. I 
want to be surprised and taken back, so I must 
travel on. 

Entry No. 17, E.C. 4, Listen No. blue — 
"Man Called Uncle" — A . light-hearted 
keyboard sound commands this rather easy 
moving tune. Only the Captain's voice holds 
venom while the band seems happy and dain­
ty. E.C. restores new faith, warding of! 

power beats thai keep the 
(E.C hit the volume switch again). Still, n 
doesn't capture the grace and vigor of "1 Stand 
Accused." It Is solid E .C , safe and secure (see 

'entry one) that Is enjoyable, but not a 
highlight. I hope that the Captain doesn't plan 
on gliding home through Ihe next seven cuts. 
Yet I have confidence, Elvis has earned It. 

Entry No. 14, E.C. 4, Listen No. blue — 
"Secondary Modern" — "Is It out ol the ques­
tion between you and me?" asks the agonized 
Caplaln, still unable lo gel his girl. Yel I'm 

disinterest, leaving absolutely no room for 
boredom. Needless to say at this point, the 
Captain had some words of romance. "When 
1 say I love you, 1 must be delirious . . ." 

Entry No. IS, E.C. 4, Listen No. 5iue -
"downt ime is Over" — "downt ime is over, 
it's lime lo take over, while others just talk," 
E.C. barks In an "Angels Wanna Wear My 
Red Shoes" tone. A circus organ appropriate­
ly fills In the background but by track 18 I've 
heard similar numbers. I want new adventure! 

Entry No. 19, E.C. 4, Listen No. Slue — 
"New Amsterdam" — This Is precisely the 
new adventure I was looking for — fresh, 
razor sharp E.C. with the Captain at the helm. 
"I step on Ihe brake lo get out of her clutches," 
he explains. The lyrical play on words is both 
amusing and intriguing and I find myself giving 
100 percent of my attention to the Captain's 
words. The Attractions stand politely In the 
background, as they're supposed lo. "New 
Amsterdam" Is the quiel high point of side 2, 
marked again by an authoritative tone of voice 
and a clever use of the language. 

Entry No. 20, E.C. 4, Listen No. Slue — 
"High Fidelity" — The Captain has proven 
himsell a slrong finisher, "High Fidelity" Is the 
best rocker on side 2 and coupled with "New 
Amsterdam," the finale of Gel Happy is Class 
A Costello at his spiteful best. 

On (he whole, I am more impressed with 
side 1. Perhaps though, I am simply tiring. 
The album Is indeed a Long Player and one 
thing is for certain; when you're done with Gel 
Happy, you won't reach for another Elvis 
album. There Is enough on this record to 
satisfy anyone's hunger for Costellonlan 
music. There are noticeable traces of the Cap­
tain's past three efforts (My Aim Is True, This 
Years Model, and Armed Forces) woven 
through E.C. 4. Yet Is unlike any of Its 
predecessors. It Is powerful, dynamic, and dif­
ferent, exactly what Costello has always 
brought to his audience. So as 1 close my jour­
nal on Listen No. 5lve, I ask you again not to 
consider my word absolute. It is an educated 
opinion but nonetheless, it Is an opinion, sub-

song Jumping Ject to change every day of my life. Get Happy 
offers a taste of every kind of Costello at a level 
ol Achievement which has grown with every 
record he's made. There's little doubt that 
numbers like "B Movie," "I Stand Accused," 
and "Motel Matches" will prove to be vintage 
Elvis. So heed my journal — see what you can 
grasp, what you can learn, and what you can 
draw from It. In the long run. however, It'll on­
ly cost you about $5lve dollars lo Gel Happy, 
perhaps the best investment you'll make this 



P*ge 10a Fiction 

Meredith 
"I can't believe it. I Just can't believe it," she 

boomed. "That God damn fucking car broke 
down again." 

There's no mistaking that deep, gravelly 
voice bellowing In the foyer, Meredith Is 
home. 

Meredith Llppman. I vividly remember 
those two years we-lived together. Like the 
weekly monopoly games we played with our 
tip money to divvy up the week's bills. And do 
you know those times Just when you think 
nothing more can go wrong and it does? Well, 
Meredith and 1 used to laugh. And we laughed 
a lot. But it took us a long time to get this way 
together. When she first moved into the Chat-
terton Parkway apartment things weren't so 
peaceful. 

"Can you believe it?" she asks. She directs 
the question to me, but really she Is speaking 
to no one In particular. 

Around Meredith, a painter, things were 
nevef stale. She has a dominating personality, 
and a delightfully deep, rich, resonant voice. 
But her moods tended to sel the atmospheric 
pressure of the apartment. Whether II would 
be volatile anger, hysteria, or hilarity could 
never be forecast. 

"What does thai car want from me? I Jusl 
put $167.00 In It last week." 

Meredith throws her keys with a crash on 
the coffee table, I put down "Sanity, Madness 
and the Family" and wait. Her large lealher 
shoulder bag drops thud on the floor and 
Meredith plops into the white velvet stuffed 
chair facing me on the couch. 

"What does lhat car think I'm made o(?" 
"What happened?" 1 asked feebly., It was 

often dangerous lo Interrupt one of Merediih's 
rampages. 

She grabbed my cigarettes. "Can 1?" 
"Sure," I said. I was out of matches. She 

stomped into the kitchen and returned puffing 
on her cigarette. 

"I came out of Appleby's at 1:00 this morn­
ing, and the fucking car wouldn't start. You 
know what It was like out tonight." 

No. 
"Pouring sheets and cold as hell. Roger and 

Rosalie had already left so I couldn't even go 
In to call." Roger and Rosalie owned Ap­
pleby's Restaurant where Meredith wailressed. 
"I had to walk a fucking mile in the God damn 
rain to a gas station." 

"Which one?" I asked. 
"Who cares. After an hour, a whole fucking 

hour, the guy finally decided he could come 
and look at the fucking car." Usually Meredith 
affectionately called her 1975 brown Honda 
CVCC "Baby". It was cute, she thought, with 

12 inch wheels. "So we got In his tow truck 
and went to look at It. I already told him it 
wouldn't start, but he tried it anyway. You 
know what he said? 'It won't start'. The God 
damn prick. I told him lhat. What did he think 
I was, stupid?" 

Personally, I felt sorry for the guy. Not only 
did Meredith reach critical mass without much 
provocation, but she was midstream in a les­
bian I-hate-men-slage. Whenever the lesbian 
emerged from her bisexuallty all men were 
pricks. 

"He poked around In the car for another 
hour and Just grunted, 'alternator wires. Wet. 
Can't dry 'em In the rain.' So he hitched the 
car up and towed it Into the station. At 'east II 
wasn't anylhlng more serious." A slight 
reprieve from Ihe hysteria. Even a smile, wry 
as II was. "He dried out Ihe wires and II started 
up Instantly. I was ecstatic. But then the bill. 
Do you know what It was? Do you know how 
much he charged me?" 

I shook my head no. 

"$30.00. Thirty God-damn-dollars. Jusl to 
dry my fucking wires. I gave him hell. Let me 
tell you." 

I'm sure you did, I thought. 
"Those lousy $30.00 were my tips from 

tonight, Plglel. I was out of cigarettes. And I 
couldn't even buy any because he look every 
God damn cenl I had," She eyed my 
Winslons. 

"Go ahead," I said. She lit another. "Have 
as many J$ vou like. I've got a carton In Ihe 
bedroom." I III one-too. 

"Thanks," she said. She took a long drag. "I 
can'l believe It. It's highway robbery. Thai's 
what II is. All mechanics are fucking pricks. 
What the hell did those pricks stick me w|th 
$167.00 for? They gave me a new alternator 
that I didn't even need. I'll sue those baslards. 
I can't afford this. Piglet. 1 can't afford lo shell 
out money every two minutes on thai God 
damn fucking car. I should sell I I . " 

I know she never will. Meredith's car Is her 
freedom. Her escapemobile. She loves to 
drive and feels trapped without It. 

"Maybe you should," I said. 
"I can't. I need the fucking wreck lo get to 

work." 

"Meredith, we can both use my tar. You 
drive George when you go to work. Later, I'll 
take a bus to classes and then drive George 
home so I can get to work on time. When 
you're finished take the bus home and walk to 
Turco's and pick up the car. Drive it up to Ap­
pleby's. I can walk home from Turco's or gel a 
ride from Sandy." 

"Maybe." She drew hard on the cigaretle. 

Margaret A. Brewster 
"No , " she said through exhaling smoke. "That 
won't work. Besides, where am I going lo find 
the time to look?" Meredith had been working 
seventy-five hours a week for (he last Iwo 
months. Days up on Purchase campus In an 
office, a Job she despised, and waltresslng 
nights: a Job she also despised. But It paid Ihe 
rent. 

"I know It won't be easy, but we can do It. 
I'll help you look," I said. 

"No. It won't work with our schedules. I 
wouldn't be able to see Maureen because you 
need the car lo gel to work." Maureen was 
Meredith's therapist. 

Sorrr-rrrry, I thought. I must have made a 
face. 

"Thanks anyway," she said quickly. "It's 
sweet Piglet, but it won't work. What am 1 say­
ing, see Maureen. I can't afford to see her 
now. I can't even buy those paints I wanted." 
Even though Meredilh had no space to paint 
her six foot by eight foot canvases In our two 
bedroom apartment, she always bought 
paints. 

Puffing on a fresh cigaretle. Meredith left 
the room. I heard a door slam. I picked up my 

Rising 
S t r e n g t h 

I n A Fear Of 
F l ight 

R i s i n g S t r e n g t h i n a F l i g h t o f F e a r 

I 
I h a v e r e a d t h e w o m e n ' s p o e t r y 
A n d l i s t e n e d 
T o t h e i r s o n g , 

I h a v e r e n o u n c e d s u c h p r i v a t e 

t h i n g s . 
N o w a s h f o r m o r e . 

I h a v e h e a r d t h e m a s t e r 
S a y i n g , 
W h e n It I s l o n g o n 
S h o w i n g f e a r . 

T h a t I h a v e o n l y 
B e g u n t o b e a f r a i d — 
T o t a s t e r e a l f e a r — 

Olympics 
continued jrom page 4a 

$75. ' 
Sights, sounds, smells. Mirror Lake, where 

the nightly award ceremonies were held. In full 
splendor . . , The speed skating oval in front 
of lake Placid High, home of the Olympic 
media corp and the only high school building 
In the country with a liquor license . . , The 
new ice center, its modernistic poles jutting out 

against the mountainous backdrop . . . The 
people and their unyielding energy . . . The 
Olympic theme song produced from a horn' 
player fh front of a church — They haweked 
religion like t-shirts . . . Foreign languages 
floating through the air and mixing with the 
other sounds of this winter carnival . . . Olym­
pic groupies, squealing when any athletes 
came through . , . .Many, many American 
flags. Pride in patriotism — a strange feeling 
for folks in this country . . . People waving at 
the ABC street camera and being Interviewed 

by Canadian television correspondents . . . 
The aroma of pepper steak cooked on open 
barbecues titillating the salivary glands . . . 
Courtesy, friendliness and lots of smiles. 

Another wait for a bus and then came the 
homeward Journey to Albany. Fatigue had set 
In, but a good, satisfying kind of fallgue. The 
day was over, but the memory of Lake Placid 
1980 will linger for a very long time. 

Were there any regrets? Jusl one: blowing 
that golden opportunity lo buy the Olficial 
Olympic Glove . . . • 

. A s p e c t * 

book and began reading. 
" A U G H H , " she.screamed. " O H , FUCK." 

Her voice was strained In an octave not her 
own, and a bit desperate. 1 got to the door of-
Ihe living room as she tromped out with her 
coleus and aralla plants held at arms length. "I 
can't stand It, APHIDS. My plants have 
aphlds." She went straight to the kitchen. 
"Where are the God damn garbage bags?" 

I couldn't believe she was going to throw out 
her favorite plants, but this time I was going to 
keep my mouth shut. 

"Where are they?" 
"Under the sink," I said as I arrived in Ihe 

kitchen. 
"I'sllll can'l find them." 
I reached under the sink and pulled them 

from behind the,Dove, Comet, S.O.S pads 
and empty grocery bags. "Here."11 handed her 
one. 

"I can't believe it. I Just hope none of my 
other plants have them. I can't afford to 
replace them all ." The coleus and aralla were 
in the garbage bag now. Meredith sat down at 
the kitchen table. "I Just can't stand it. I just 
can't stand It." Tears started barreling down 
her cheeks, 

I was waiting. The tears had to come. 
"Why?" she cried as I held her. 
. The tears only dribbling now, we went to 
her bedroom and checked her other plants. 
They all escaped the aphlds. She hunted 
through Ihe plants pinching olf dead leaves. 
She pruned off scraggly stalds and set them In 
her clipping jar. Picking up the mister she went 
to the bathroom. 1 heard the w".,er turn on 
then off. Back in her room Me fondled the 
leaves, dusting them and, dousing them with 
mist. 

"Oh, my babies," she cooed. "Mommy's 
here lo lake care of you." 

I began to chuckle as I always did when she 
talked to her planls. This lime Meredilh laugh­
ed too. 

"Thanks," she said without looking up. 
How was your night?" 

"Quiet," I replied. • 

I a m a l o n e a n d 
( I ) w a n d e r i n a c l a s s , 
A c o l d , ' r a w , r e m i n d f u l 
W a v e 
O f H e r s e l f . 

I I 
T h e l a n g u a g e t h a t Is w r i t t e n 
I s r u n d r y f r o m a p e n . 
B y f e a r , l i m i t s o f a n h o u r . 
A c l o c k t i c k i n g . 

What do I say. 
In dry song 
U s i n g c o a r s e w o r d s 

B o r n o f a p a r c h m e n t f e a r 
C r u m b l i n g a s i t g o e s o n . 

R i s i n g s t r e n g t h 
I n f l i g h t o f f e a r , 

I r e a d m y w o m e n ' s p o e t r y — 
H e a r m y s o n g . 

Valerie Major 

MARCH 1 
FIRST EVER 

PARTY 

Admission: Free with proof of referral 
5o° Without 

$ 1 . 0 0 for Judicial Board Personnel 

9:30- 1:00 PM Waterbury Hall Basement 

THE CAMPUS MINISTRY 
GOSPEL ENSEMBLE 
The Gospel choir on campus 
will hold weekly rehearsals on 
Wednesday nights from 7-10 
PM. in Brubacher Hall on Alumni 
For more information contact: 
Ms. Terri Gaillard at 465-7133 
or Mr. Kirley Crawford at 
457-5219. 
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Ufa Friday! 
Aspects Diversions 

Concert Corner 

page 11a 

Movie T imetable 
IFG 
'I'lieMoUb, liral Roar d 
The Producu 
Tower East 
Norma Rae 
Mash 
Albany Stale Cinema 
Warriors 
Fox Colonic 
All Thai Jazz 
Falso 
Mohawk Mall 
Kramer vs. Kramer 
Going In Style 
Chapter Two 
The Kids Ate Alright 
What Do You Say To A Naked Lady 
Madison 
Slartlng Over 
Cine 1 2 3 4 S 6 
Hero At Large 
Cruising 
Chapter Two 
The Fog 
Kramer vs. Kramer 
American Gigolo 
Rocky Horror Picture Show 

7:30,10:00 
7:30.10:00 

7:311.10:00 
7:30.10:00 

7:30.9:30 

7:00,9:15 
7:30,9:30 

7:00.9:00 
7 15.9 15 
7:00.9.30 

II 15 
11:15 

6:35,8:46.10:45 
7:25,9:40,11:45 
7:00.9:35.12:00 
7:00,9:00,41:00 

7:10,9:20 
6:30,8:55,11:15 

12:110 

The Leslie Puzz le 
by Howard P. Alvir, Ph.D. 
FIVE GREAT RECORDINGS OP CLASSICAL MUSIC 

Five excellent sound versions ol live classical masters ollei 
live liouis oi quality entertainment. 

From the following clues, can von determine the com 
poser, the title, the per/umters, ami i/ie record rontpmiy /or 
oocli? 
1. Alphabetically, either ABC or ZYX order. Ihe records are: 
by composer's las! name. 1st. FESTINO: 2nd. ihe one per­
formed hv the Amsterdam Concerlgebouw: 3rd. lire one 
recorded hv Angel: 4lll, I'lANO CONCERTO NO. 1; 5th. 
Ihe on.' recorded by I MUSICI. 
2. Two are recorded by Philips but are mil performed by 
ellhet Scholars Vocal Ensemble or hv Garrlck Ohlsson 
(piano), a Mill recording Is PIANO SONATA NO. 3 record­
ed by Sonar, which did not record ihe piece by Bizet. 
3. The composition "I Brahms Is entitled rTeiihei CONCERTI 
GROSSI nor SYMPHONY IN C MAJOR, ii is performed 
neither hv Daniel Epstein (pianol nor !<. Scholars Vocal 
Ensemble 
4. The composition oi Branchleri is nol performed by Epstein 
who is not recorded by Philips, 
5 'lire composition of Corelll is nol SYMPHONY IN C MA­
JOR which IH recorded by Philips 
t>. Chopin did nol compose PIANO CONCERTO NO. 1 
(used in tills puzzle) which Is not recorded by Musical 
Heritage Society. 

J .B . Scott's 
Feb. 29 
Mar. 2 
Mar. 6 
Mar. 8 
Mar'. 8 
Mar. 14,15 
Mar. 19 
Mar. 19 
Mar. 26 
Mar. 27 
Mar. 27 

Plasmatics 
Good Rats 

Brides 
Lene Lovitch 

Bruce Woolley 
Units 

Downchlld Blues Band 
Charlie Smith's Blues Band 

805 
Squeeze 

Wazmo Mariz 

Billboard's Top Ten 

Singles Albums 

1. "Crazy Little Tiling Called Love" 
by Queen 
2. "Yes, I'm Ruady" by Tori Di? 
Sarlo with K.C. 
3. "Longer" by Dan Foyelbcrg 
4. "Desire" by Andy Glbb 
5. "On The Radio" by Donna Sum­
mer 

6. "Another Brick In The Wall" by 

Pink Floyd 
7. "Do That To Me One More Time'1 

by Captain and Tennllle 
8. "Working My Way Back t o Yon 
— Forgive Me Girl" by Spinners 
9. "H im" by Rupert Holmes 

10. "The Second Time Around" by 

Shalamar 

1. "The Wal l" by Pink Floyd 
2. "Damn The Torpedoes" by Tom 
Petty and the Heartbreakers 
3. "Phoenix" by Dan Fogelberg 
4. "Permanent Waves" by Rush 
5. "Off The Wall" by Michael 
Jackson 
6. "On The Radio - Greatest Hits, 
Volumes One and Two" by Donna 
Summer 
7. "The Long Run" by Lagles 
S. "The Whispers" by The Whispers 
9. "Kenny" by Kenny Rogers 
10. "Fun and Games" by Chuck 
Mangione 

ACROSS 

1 "Touring" museum 
exhibit (2 wds.) 

8 U-235 or U-238 
15 "Sweet" g i r l of 

song 
16 Dispositions 
17 Giving bad news all 

at ,once (3 wds.) 
19 Painter of "The 

Twittering Machine" 
20 FDR's mother 
21 December 31 word 
22 Archipelago unit 

(abbr.) 
23 Unvarying 
26 Geometry assign­

ment 
27 Radio frequency 
32 Poetess Moore 
35 Water nymphs 
36 Israeli or Irani, 

e.g. 

47 "Call day" 
50 Turkish nobles 
54 Actor Auberjonols 
55 Privy to (2 wds.) 
56 Martin and Lewis 

movie (3 wds.) 
60 One of the empires 
61 King of France, 

877-879 
62 Wet behind 
63 Wild blue, and 

other places 

DOWN 

1 Gore Vidal book 
2 "Matinee" stars 
3 Stairway pillar 
4 Elation 
5 Rifle range: Fr. 
6 Prefix for verse or 

cycle 
7 Tennis racket 

specification 
8 Lead-in, for short 
9 Very dry 
10 Suffix: native of 

18 Faux pas 
23 See B-Across 
24 Part of NC0 
25 Dolphin follower 
26 Fats Waller's 

instrument 
28 All smiles 
29 Be patient 
30 Woodman's tool 
31 Belgian r iver 
32 Detective Helm 
33 "...against 

of troubles" 
34 Knell or t o l l 
39 Engagement for Luke 

Skywalker {2 wds.) 
40 Kind of acid 
41 With total ex­

posure 
42 Prefix: mouth 
46 Gas lamps 
47 Operative (2 wds.) 
48 " With Love" 
49 Those who oppose 
50 "There'll be 

time..." 
51 Alaric subject 

o 
(A 

4 
o 

37 Colorful corn 
38 Fred Perry's sport 
40 Consecration iW JU,. .A. ,,»„,,« ~. ... ._ 

participant 11 Quantities of butter 52 Der (Adenauer) 
43 Put the ball on the 12 " Plata," 53 Kind of gin' 

runner (2 wds.) montana's motto 55 Footnote note 
44 Corday's victim 13 Lowly laborer 57 Sumac of song 
45 Seventh Avenue 14 Girl in Salinger 58 Pennsylvania 6-5 

dunmy story 59 Go whistle-stopping 

ICQ) 
91 Si) 

Be listening lo 9 1 ' l :M for the 
NCAA Regional Basketball Playoffs. 
Albany State vs. St. Lawrence this 
Friday, February 29 at 6:45 p.m. 
Live from Potsdam. Stay luned! 
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Trivia Time 
by Vincent Aiello 

This week TRIVIA TIME lakes a 
look at literature. Not jusl anyone's 
literature but the classic llleralure of 
William Shakespeare. So here is 
your chance to tesl your knowledge 
on Shakespeare and as for you Bill, 1 
hope you are still writing wherever 
you are. Good Luck! 

1. "The course of true love never did 
run smooth" is In which o l 
Shakespeare's works? 
2. In which play Is It written. "Some 
are born great, some achieve 
greatness, and some have greatness 
thrust upon Ihem"? 
3. "Now would I give a thousand 
furlongs ol sea for air acre for barren 
ground" is from which ol Iris 
writings? 
4. Shakespeare dedicated sonnets to ' 
"Mr. (initials)", What are ihe initials? 
5. What Is the next line of this 
Shakespeare poem, "O mistress 
mine, where are you roaming?"? 
6. Identify the Shakespeare work 
from which the following Is taken: 
"When shall we three meet again — 
In thunder, lightning, or In rain"? 

7. In "King Lear", the king decided 
to retire from the throne and divide 
his kingdom in whal way?' 
8. From which work comes Ihe line 
"Neilher a borrower nor a lender 
be"? 
9. "Our remedies oil in ourselves do 
lie — Which we ascribe to heaven" is 
from what play? 
10. In two of his plays, William 
Shakespeare brings the scene to the 
Republic of Venice. One Is "The 
Merchant of Venice", what is the 
oilier one? 
Answers to last week: 
1. Godfather, On The Waterfront 

2., The Men 
3. Terry Malloy 
4. One-eyed Jacks 
5. Mutiny On The Bounty 
6. Mark Antony 
7. Ella Kazan 
8. 12 
9. Kim hunter 
10. Edle Doyle 
Wrile your answers down and bring 
ihem lo CC 334 by 5 p.m. Monday 
All winners will receive a (ree per 
sonal In the ASP. 

IFyOUVE BEEN 
FOLLOWING OUR 
5TORX4IFN0irM 
ASHAMED) YOU 
KNOW THAT THE. 
tAFETERIACREATURE] 
15 RUNNING WILD 
ATSUN/A.NO 
CONVENTIONAL 
MEANS CAN STOP 
I T ! WHAT CAN 
DOC HOPE TO DO? 

THIS SHOULD! 
PUT 70U OfJ 
•ICE".... 

DOt ACTIVATES HIS "ACE 
- IN-THE-HOLE"; ABSOLUTE 
ZERO FREEZING PELLETS, 
SHOT FROM HIS MEAD SLIT. 

IF A6S01UTE ZERO} 
D0ESNT STOP IT 
THERE'S N0THIU6 LtfTj 
TOTuV... 

# T D T R y ?
0 C 

CALL WUR FRIEND5 
THEV WON'T WANT 
TO MISS. . . , 

at meter xrs A mre 



' •Yvrnrowtv twtwwn» * »•>»»««* ••* < m r 

STATE QUAD TOWER 
PRESENTS 
A LEAP YEAR 

tonight 

unci 
ZfUtZ 

Sta te quad 
IT-Lounge 
I I . I .1 I !_ 

c 
• 

Admission 

J J J J 
$1.00 wi th Tower dorm card 
$1 .50 w i thout 

U ve music 
| by 

Kevin McKrei l 
formerly of 
t h e G r i n c h 

beer . soda .munchies 
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TOW£8£fl5T CINEMA 

<t?Jt(l« ftfM'llNMHIWIOt 

Tonight LC 7 7:30 & 10:30 

Sa/. March 1 

M * A * S * H 
7:30 & 10:00 LC7 

$.75 volTEC 
$1.25w/out 
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J! A Par ty To End All!! 
on Sadie Hawkiit's Day 
Friday Feb 29 at 9:30 in Dutch U-Lounge 

Featuring: 

Live Band 9:30-11:00 

Square Dance 11:00 -12:00 

Live Band 12:00-??? 

• • H a p p y Hour 9 :30-11 :00 

Unlimited MixedDrinks 
ir Vodka - * Amarellb - ir Gin 

irKaluah - -k Whiskey - if Beer 
I 

(After 11:00 Unlimited Beer) 

E«* 
\ > * e ft 

* > X^ 

Admission: $2 per couple (guy escorted by girl) 

$1.50 Stag 

comment editorial 

the Wind mst cuss MM 
your precious American blood seeping into 
the foreign mud, your final home. The agony 
is even greater now. Your hands arc grasping 
wildly at the air, clutching, graping. But they 
find nothing. All of a sudden, in the ever 
dimming light, you see somebody standing 
over you.. At first, a slight tinge of hope is 
mixed into your horrible burning 
nightmare"...but then you see he wears the 
colors of the other team. He thought you 
were trying to reach for your wea'pon, 10 spill 
his blood, as the game is played. He docs not 
know. He docs not even dream of your tor­
turous pain. Your weapon is the farthest 
thing from your mind. All you can think of is 
not dying. 

He looks down at you. As he looks into 
your face he feels sorrow. He would like to 
help you. But he can't risk it, So he thinks of 
a solution, and sends another half ounce 
piece into your brain, causing a flow of your 
fine American blood stronger than a mighty 
river's current. 

You payed an expensive price to call that 
blood American, and you hardly even goi lo 
use it. 

Jeffrey Ncuburger 

Protest Within System 
To the Editor: 

The short-sightedness and hypocrisy of to­
day's college students show quite clearly 
when examining the draft issue: First, 
students seem to believe that Ihe draft is 
something that began during the Viel-Nam 
war and.second, although young Americans 
are the first lo protest and complain, they are 
the least likely of all Americans to exercise 
their right to vote. 

Most of Ihe rhetoric being brought forth in 
opposition to the draft rests on the premise 
that a draft means war and war means 

another Viet-Nam. One only has to look as 
far as our class room walls to evidence sup­
port of this view: posters and signs blanket 
them with slogans such as "Slop the drafi -
No more Viei-Nams". 

Contrary to popular belief, the anti-draft 
movement did not emerge In this country In 
the '50's—unless you are speaking of the 
1860's. Anti-draft rallies, protests, and riots 
rocked major northern cities in response to 
conscription initialed during the Civil War. 
Both World Wars were precceded by tremen­
dous ami-drafi movements also. Directly 
prior to World War II pacifist feelings ran 
particularly high: In the late 1930's, after 
Hitler had turned Germany into a war 
machine, a national poll showed 39 percent of 
fall undergraduates said they would not par­
ticipate in any war and an additional 33 per­
cent would only fight if the United States was 
actually invaded. These examples are meant 
to show that anti-draft feelings have always 
been strong in this country no matter how 
great a Ihreat is facing our nation. 

Most protestors against the draft (and 
other government policies for that matter) 
are, by and large, hypocrites. Plain and sim­
ple. Non-voiing Americans who are eligible 
lo vole may have Ihe legal right to criticize 
our government but 1 believe they lack the 
moral right lo do so. 

The youth of our nation find plenty of 
time lo prolcsl and complain but Ihe majori­
ty of them can't find the time to try to imple­
ment change in a constructive manner—by 
voting. They are simply feedback 
mechanisms doing nothing lo alter or add to 
the initial input of government. It is time for 
college age Americans to begin working 
within the system—using iheir votes to make 
their voices heard. Thai is what democracy is 
all about. 

Charles T. Giacopelli 

Find the Answer 
The threat'of war is back and it is lime for 

each man (and woman?) to begin lo evaluate 
his position. 

1 can remember as a child seeing my 
parents eyes water as they heard the news of 
the death of a family friend. If memory 
serves, he was picked-off by a sniper near 
Ihe BMZ. As a child of twelve the words 
"war", "DMZ", or "Viet Cong" were all 
oblivious terms of Ihe grown up world. But 1 
can remember the article in Newsday idling 
how lie enlisted out of a total sense of duly. 
His father quoted hint as saying "It 's 
something I gotta do . " And I can still, to this 
day, sec those words as they appeared under 
his picture next to a spoils column. 1 can 
remember Tony's mother crying when she 
saw my brother marching in Ihe honor guard 
of a local parade sonic years ago, since Tony 
was good friends with my brother. And I 
once found a letter from Vietnam in my 
brother's drawer, doing those naughty things 
that all little brothers do. 

These are my images of the Vietnam era, 
coupled Willi Ihe niglilly news of tlealh and 
totals, seeing ihe peace sign painted 
everywhere and the four fool letters on Ihe 
Hewlett High wall: U.S. OUT OF 
SOUTHEAST ASIA. 

Those times arc gone now. The letters on 
live wnll have been covered over somehow, 
but you can siill make them out from Easl 
Rockuway Rd. If you know what to look for. 
They couldn't really erase them, I'guess. 

It's starting over now, or so it seems. Peace 
signs arc reborn and graffiti is no longer Ihe 
ail of guys named ACT; or SLY, It's ihe an 
of political commenlalors, Something else is 
back, something I didn't notice the first lime 
around — ihe news columns of anti-war pro­
tests mixed with pro-American viewpoints, I 
don't jusl read comics and look at Ihe pic­
tures like when I was twelve. 

As a child I guess I was a bil of a war 
hawk, cheering happily til Grimsby's news 
thai we jusl look ihis or ihai hill. Thai guy 
Tony was son of a hero for me, he was brave 
and proud and good. His death was noble in 
my childish eyes and 1 regretted thai some 
cheap sniper, loo scared lo face him, had to 
pick him off from some distant tree. A 
damned shame. 

So now I'm some son of intellectual col­
lege guy and I should know enough lo choose 
whether or noi lo go to Afghanistan with no 
indecision, 1 read Time every week and Ihe 
ASP on Tuesdays and Fridays. I know ihe 
issues. Not clearly. Nobody knows them 
clearly, but I got a good idea of what they 
arc. 1 know now what 1 would do. 

But my blood boils al lltosc who instantly 
speak of Canada and my skin curls in the face 
oi those who waul to nuke Iran now. The 
lack of thought and painstakingly weighing 
ihe issues is amazing in a community of such 
intelligent people. Don'i search for your 
answer, search for ihe answer. Go lo Canada 
or Afghanistan but march into both nations 
proudly. Proud that you have not served 
anything but yourself. If you run from the 
draft into Canada because you fear death 
you are truly a coward. If you inarch into 
Afghanistan because you want lo destroy ihe 
commie bastard you arc an ass. Should war 
break out we can measure manliness in those 
who fight because they believe the cause is 
jusl or those who flee, leaving all behind, for 
whal they believe is jusl. Those in the middle 
ate the cowards and Ihe asses. 

1 am not a religious man, but 1 am a free 
num. And I truly believe the words of the late 
Archbishop Sheen who said, "Freedom is 
not the right to do what you want, it is the 
right lo do what you ought," 

Please do whal you iruly believe you 
ought (o. 

\ 

iDcar Grandpa, 
1 write to you now. Because I'm scared. 
I'm scared grandpa. Because I realized that I can never be a soldier. Like you 

were. And be proud. Like you were. 'Cause I haven'l the guts. Like you had. To 
snuff oul life. 

And it frightens me grandpa. 'Cause you believed. And most believed. That it was 
all for our glorious homeland. And her vital inlercsts. This war. The big one. 

And how proud you must have felt! And tightly so. How your heart must have 
tingled, and sang. And swollen. And strained. For America. The beautiful. And oh 
she is beautiful. Your purpose. If only I could feel this too, grandpa. Things would 
be so much simpler. 

People shout traitor. They shout coward. 1 hear Ihem. And the same in silent . 
whispers. When I'm alone. Can't get rid of them. They soil my brain. And seed my f 
cells. No one can escape them. We can only kid ourselves. j | 

But whal of thai more powerful force? A voice? That calls me away from all lhal .{ 
It soothes me. And It's warm. And it tells me. It does grandpa. Over and over and , ? 
over. And again. That love must triumph. And that it will. That war is the most I 
visible symptom. Of the disorder mankind had inflicted on herself. Since the begin- y 

I ning of lime. It says that Ihou shalt not kill. At no lime. In no context. For no pur- I 
I pose. For no body. Over and over and over. And again. And it also tells me. That 
} there are always other ways. Reasonable. Jusl. Logical ones. We lose this notion. 
\ And we have lost ihe uliimaic war. 
{ Bui you've told me that war is nol murder. Grandpa? Thai it's just war. And it's 

different. This jolts me more. As if we're justifying. Pulling killing in a different 
contexi. An OK one. Like we're trying to blind our eyes. As we snuff oul lives. 

But it's gelling clearer lo me. Throughout history. It reads in black and white, 
grandpa. And red. 

1 would do anything. Everything. To serve America. And proudly. 1 love her. 1 
am thankful. Anything. And everything. Bui kill. This is too much. Too cruel. To 
ask of anyone. 

Because 1 was raised. By you. Your son. Your culture. To care about my brothers 
Nol to run away from injustice. But to recognize it. And fight It, And destroy it. ) 

{ 

\ 
And now 1 am castigated. Because 1 think. And I care. And my conscience is gelling 
demeaned. As if it is an ill one. Perhaps 1 look my teachings too seriously. Perhaps 
I've been lied to. 

Perhaps when the time comes. We should make bullets out of solid oil. Then no 
one would be shot. I've this uncanny sense though. Past profit-seeking. Beyond 
obstinacy. It questions deeply rooted sociocullural forces. Al work. Societies fester 
ing. And nurturing. A climate of violence. It has become engrained in Ihe world's 
vcryday fabric. From cradle to grave 

They may arrest me. And grandpa this frightens me too. thoreau was jailed. So 
as socrales. and galilco. And now they are dead. And martyrs. You can'i smash 

idea. By pulling it behind bars. And you shouldn't describe my protest. As my social 
fun. 

Perhaps my trouble is thai I have thought loo much. Fell too much. Dreamed. 
And believed. Optimistic. About people. But is this my trouble? Or is this my vir 
lue? 

I'm scared grandpa. Scared of my thoughts. And of yours. And America's. And 
the world's. I'm sorry if I hurt you. And Grandma. But please. I BESEECH YOU. 
For Ihe sake of mankind. Think that you may be mistaken 

'x 

I 

Rib 

In the last 50 years, normal men have killed more than 100 million of I heir fellow normal men. 

Could a greater miracle lake place than for us lo look through each others eyes for an insiani? 
Ilioietitt 
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Classified 
dobs 

Jobs In Alaska: Summer-year round. 
$800-2000 monthlyl Parks, fisheries, 
teaching, and morel 1980 employer 
l istings, Information. $3. Alasco, 
Box 2480, Goleta, CA 93018. 
Summer Jobs • Residence camp In 
upstate NY - general and specialty 
counselors needed. Interested, call 
Jesse at 455-6725. 

$356 weekly guaranteed. Work 2 
hours dally at home. Start im­
mediately. Free. PO Box 754-A, 
Pearl River, NY 10965. 
Counse lors : Ad i rondack Boys' 
Camp; 7 and one half weeks, 
$500-600; campcraft, sailing, swim­
ming (WSI), trip leader, rlflery, ar­
chery, sports, driver; 39 Mill Valley 
Road, Plttsford, NY 14534 

Help Wanted: Skilled and disciplin­
ed bass is t and drummer for 
Telethon '80 Pit Band. For Info: 
Mark - 462-9675. 

Wanted 
Wanted: Caricaturist for Telethon 
'80's Children's Hour on March 22. 
Call Mike, 7-3084 or Joy, 433-7588. 

Anthropology ma|or conducting a 
study on Vietnam combat veterans 
serving from Jan. 1968 to March 
1970. Imperative that I talk wi l t 
these vefs. Please call 869-8317 
Friday-Sunday. 

Services 
-Taping: Disser tat ions, theses, 
shorter papers accepted, excellent 
work guaranteed, call 463-1691 
days, evenings before 9 pm. 

Rush typing jobs done by legal 
secretary. 6 yrs. experience, minor 
editing and spelling corrections, 
neatness and accuracy count. Call 
Theresa at 439-7809. 
Haircuts $4. Shampoo and blowdry 
extra. Al's Hairstyles, Ramada Inn, 
Western Ave., Albany. 482-8573. 
Mon., Wed., Fri., 12-5; Tues., Thur. 
till 7. 
Passport-Application Photos $5 for 
two; $.50 each thereafter. Mon. 
12:30-2:30, University Photo Service, 
CC 305, 7-8867, ask for Bob, 
Roanne, or Suna. 
Typing Service -IBM Selectrlc - Bar-
bara Hale, 445-1575, days; 273-7218, 
nights, weekends. ^ ^ 

Friendly Flxit, electric appliance 
repair (toasters, hairdryers, etc.) 
Free picKup and delivery. Ron Isaac, 
434-6241. 

Income Tax preparation, Federal, 
State, and City, $S, 7-8718. 
Typing - Fast, accurate, free pick-up 
and delivery, $.80 per page, 
869-6542. 
Typing: Fast, accurate, reliable. I'm 
a deadline-oriented typist with a 
3-yr. old typing service and a B.A. in 
English. I offer neat professional 
work (minor editing, spelling correc­
t ions, proofreading Included) at $.7"i 
per page. Call Leo at 489-6164. 

Income Taxes prepared • call 
482-5702 after 4 and weekends. 

Need tutor for Eco 100 a and b, 300, 
301, etc.? Call T.E. at 436-4509 
daytimes. 

F o r Sa le 

For Sale: Kenwood LS-405B speaker 
system, excellent condition, 100 
watt max., 1 year old, list price $350 
a pair, selling for $225. Mark, 7-7904. 
JVC JL-A20 semlauto turntable, 
Technics SA-200,25 w., .04 per cent 
THD, make offer. Mark, 7-5184. 

Pioneer 4141 cassette deck. Ex­
cellent condition, Dolby, must sell. 
Call Chris at 7-7904. ,__ 
Macintosh MA-5100 amp-preamp, 
Macintosh MR-73 stereo tuner In 
wood cabinets, excellent condition, 
best offer, call 459-5602, daytime, 

'ask for Dr. Matin. ^ _ ^ 
CB power mike. Astatic D-104, ex­
cellent condition, only $35, Steve, 
7-8913. 

Housing 
Looking for guys to move off cam­
pus with next year. Call Marty at 
7-8715. 
One or two housemates wanted: 
Fall 1980, beautiful, busline apart­
ment , fu rn ished, $78 wi thout 
util it ies. Call Audrey a t449-1648. 

Apartment for rent on busline, 1 
bedroom - $250; 3-4 bedrooms • 
$380, for June 1. Furnished, heal, 
utilities not included, no sublets, 
439-6295. 

One female to complete a 4 
b e d r o o m ap t . on b u s l i n e . 
Reasonable rent, good location, 
quiet neighborhood. Call Kathy or 

Hardtop for 1970 
355-8944 after 5 pm. 

J e b b i e : 436-9487. 

Rides 
Riders • wanted to Kaplan Center In 
Delmar for GRE Prep, course. Mon­
day n i g h t s , s t a r t i n g 3-3-80. 
371-2593. 

Lost/Found 
Found: An envelope lor Maureen; 
before vacation. Call Barb at 7-5170 
and Identify contents. 

Personals 

Thlsy'ta the official 19B0 Winter 
Olympics Birthday personal. Hope 
yours Is one of the best ever. 
; Love, Barbara 

Thanks to all my friends lor making 
my 19th birthday one to remember 
of what I can remember of It). 

Thanks to my neighbors for buying 
me bottomless shots, my strong 
friends for carrying me back, Karen 
for your room, and Linda for being 
the greatest best friend and for be­
ing there. 

Love, Lisa 
To Melville 305, 
We just loved your sweet cream. 
Hoped you l iked our scent-
sensational gift In return. 

3 In 304 
P.S. Thanks, Steve Gerber 
CS, , 

Meet me at the Garrison. 
Love, Ray, Jay, Jimmy, George, 

John, Dwaln, and.... 

JuJu, 
Happy 20th birthday. 

Love, MerMer 

State Quad Tower presents: A Leap 
Year Celebration; tonlghtl Next one 
Is in four years. 

Atti ia; 
You're over the hill. Happy 20th bir­
thday. 

A woman's place Is in the House 
and the Senate. Elect Liz Holtzman 
to the U.S. Senate, Come to an In­
terest meeting tomorrow (Sat.) at 2 
pm. in the Humanities Lounge, 3rd 
floor. ' 
To Anthony 104: , 
Mike, Dean, Phil, and Bor|e, thanks 
for a really amazing 19th birthday 
I'll never forget. Also to you Pattl, 
my sincere appreciation for making 
It extra special. 

Dan 
This Is to the love of my life - The 
Golden Cafeteria Girl with the "Big 
Blues". Oh, how I missed that 
twinkle, that sparkle, your, wiggle! I 
love you, wil l you marry me? 
P.S. To give you a hint, the " I Is a 
"we" and our " I ' s " are upon you 
dur ing your Thurs. night Rat 
Sociable. , ._• . 
P.P.S. Who's your blonde friend? 
How d id you two foxes get 
together? Is she married? 
Anderson '80. Campaign this Satur­
day In Vermont. Free transporta­
t ion. Call BUI at 7-5227 or Rob at 
7-3091. . 

Gall, 
Happy birthday to the best "sister 
and friend In Haoppauge and 
Albany. , 

Love, Rachel 
Guess Who r-uomlS., 

MGB. Call 

Electric Amplifier: Acoustic 135 
(like new) 125 watts RMS, Reverb, 
Wheels. $300. Fred, 7-5063. 
Car Stereo Cassette - Pioneer 
KP-8005, AM-FM, ln-dash, super-
tuner, locking FF and rewind, auto 
elect, $100, call Rich at 7-5235. 
75 Plym. gr. Fury; new TMS'N and 
batt.; $800; 7-8604. 
Now Audio l iMI 40 wait speakers, 
woofer, tweeter; port newest In on-
campus speakers. Solid wood 
cabinet with extraordinary sound. 
$175 (negotiable). Contact Mark at 
7-7735. _ ' 

Brand now technics by Panasonic 
receiver SA-500, special value, $325 
(negotiable), 55 watts per channel, 
loaded, contact Mark Immediately, 
77735. 

1975 AMC Hornet, run8 wall, very 
dependable ;oomy hatchback! 
$1400, BU8, M872!" 

' ' " ' u"tlasa,$3007273-8966, 

Marty (who drove me to Ithaca), 
I know I've thanked you, but I really 
appreciated it; here 'he personal 
anywayl Thanks again; everyone 
should be like you. 

Arden 

Where is the missing help from F.C. 
on Central Ave.? The owner must be 
a S.O.B. 

George, 
Although I have not been actively 
pursuing it, my interest in you has 
not waned. I still love you and want 
you my little amore. 

Klt tyj<0 
Ooh la la Sassooni tNo Jap Party!! 
Irving Hall, Sat. 9 pm, beer, soda, 
munchles. 

Admission 
Calvin Klein • $6 
Sassoon • $4.50 

Jordache - $3 
Levi's and Lee's • $1 

Stephanie, 
As some people say: It's been real, 
i t 's been nice, and yes, It's been real 
nico. Happy birthday! 

Love, Wayne 

F.C. Cleaner sucks. 
fhanks Bear foTall the happiness. I 
love you very much. 

Always and forever, Boo 
Bethi ~~~ 
The times go lightly when I'm with 
you too. 

The Sophisticated Sophmore 
Weirdo, . 
Coffee, the Today Show and Her­
man. What more could a woman 
want? 
Love, "Sexy" _ 

f o my Entrepreneur, 
Whether you're driving a Fwuck, 
popping pills, batterylng or copying, 

-fust remember that I'm behind you 
100 percent. So here's to good luck, 
good times, success, a promising 
future and our one year anniversary. 

Love, Your faithful whlpper 

f o l h e boy~wlth the fattest feel In 
the world (9EEE), 
How come you're older than me but 
I'm the one turning gray? Have the 
greatest birthday ever - this won't 
be the last ! 
Love alwayB, the fattest girl In Ihe 

,. world 
C^nTeTrTbTag toTJelancey on Friday 
nlte. Sadie Hawkins Day!! 

To our secret admirer, 
We lust wanted to thank you for the 
roses. You made this Valentine's 
Day special. 

Love, Joan and Jan 
f o o u r best friend In Hamilton with 
that defected thigh, 

Happy Blrthdayl 
We love you, Sayles 

MatT, 
I'd put you in a personal but people 
might think we were going out. 

Annette, 
Here's one lor you alone - you 
deserve so much mora. At least It 
says something special; I love you. 

Andrew 

Nanci, 
Let's be traditional this year. I love 
you, wi l l you be my Valentine? 

Lustful 

To all you "Anti-Draft Advocates", 
Soviet aggression must not be met 
with appeasement, as was the case 
with NAZI Germany in 1938. If 
you're not w i l l i ng to defend 
democracy, then you don't deserve 
Its treedoms. State Box 1715. 

Leap Year Party, State Quad 
U-Lounge, tonight at 9:30. Live 
music by Kevin (Grlnch) McKrell. 

Land J aro coming out of the closet 
to announce they're lesbians. Sorry 
guys. 
No Jap Party??!! Sat. nlte, March 1, 
9 pm., Irving Hall, beef, soda, mun­
chles, $1 admission, show off your 
labels. 

No Jap Party??! I Sat. nlte, March 1, 
9 pm., Irving Hall, beer, soda, mun­
chles, $1 admission, show off your 
labels. 

What a hyneell 

My litt le sweetie pie, 
Imagine me and you. I do. I think 
about you day and night. It's only 
right to think about the girl you love, 
and hold her tight. So happy 
together. If I should call you up, In­
vest a dime, and you say you belong 
to me, and ease my mind, Imagine 
how the world would be. So very 
fine. So happy together. I can see 
me loving nobody But you for all my 
life. When you're wllh me, baby, the 
skies wil l be blue for all my life. Me 
and you, and you and me, no matter 
how they toss the dice, It has to be. 
The only one for me is you, and you 
lor me. We're happy together. 

Love, Your Big Strong Man 

Carole, 
Wishing a happy birthday to our 
lavorite little sophomore In the 
world. Have a great day, but 
remember- - - -you re a lways a 
freshman to us. 

Ellen, Ruth, and Linda 

SCP 
Our friendship will last a lifetime • II 
we remain open and honest. 

Love, SAT 

DeaTRena, 
You have so many talents! Singing, 
playing piano, meeting Navy guys 
on buses and finding sleezy roller 
rinks. We'll do great tonight at the 
Mousetrap. "Sugar and Spice" 
forever.-Thanks for your hospitality 
In Delaware. 

Love, Stacl 
W i l l i 

Nice tan. 
Welcome back party tonight, Dutch 
Quad, Ten Eyck, Suite 308, free 
beer, pizza, a l l Invited. 

f e n Eyck Rock 'n ' Roll. Watch for It. 

Leap Year Party, State Quad 
U-Lounge, tonight at 9:30, live 
music by Kevin McKrell (formerly of 
the Grlnch). . 

Helena, 
In four days I'll be back s r 1 we II 
celebrate. If I were half as iod a 
friend as you are, I'd be iucky. 
You're very special and I love you. 
Happy 20th. 

David 

Dear Sheila, 
Have a happy birthday and start the 
March birthdays off right. It's a 
great month (or great people. 

Love, Lorin 

Dear Meryl, 
Happy birthday! Hope you have a 
fantast ic 5th birthday to last 
another 4 years. 

Love your old play-pal, Lorln 

Bermuda - Bermuda - Bermuda 
Spring Vacation • 8 days and 7 
nights; $249-275. Contact Bryan at 
434-0793. Includes air fare, ac­
comodations, and more. 

Smudge, 
Well, we're trying again. Thank you 
for getting it In. Is it any fresher? 

Love, Rags 

Get your act together. Applications 
for Telethon '80 auditions are In CC 
130. 

Cood Wet T-ShIrt Contest 
Delancey hall Friday night. 

To the resident crazies o( Hudson 
(hopefully!), here's the Valentine, 
only a little late. Good luck In 
house-hunting. In keeping with 
tradition I'm Inviting mysell over lor 
dinner soon. 

RL 

To my roommate with the sexy 
voice: . 
Hope your 20th birthday Is as sweet 
and special .Is you are. 

Love always, Andy 

Get your act together. Applications 
for Telethon '80 Auditions are In CC 
130. 
Tonight It's on Dutch. A party to end 
all featuring: Happy Hour (vodka, 
amaretto, gin, kaluah, whiskey, 
beer) and live band from 9:30 to 11. 
After 11 more music and beer and a 
square dance. Tonight, 9:30, Dutch 
U-Lounge, $2 per couple (guy 
escorted by girl), $1.50 stag. 
4 plus 2 goes to Rollerama on Fri­
day, March 7th..The cost Is $3 for 
admission and skates plus a 
nominal bus fare. Tickets wil l be on 
sale In Ihe Campus Center next 

week. 
It's Cabaret night this weekend at 
the Mousetrap. Stop Inl 
Woman seeks mature, responsible 
person to share large apt. in Albany. 
Good location. Ask lor Paula. Call 
489-4579, Mon. thru Thrus., 6 to 10 
pm. 
To Rich, Donna, Sally, Jackie, 
"Kennedy", Ray (Chekov makes up 
for the misspelled name), Jack (DQ 
lives), Rob, and especially Rhonda, 
Thank you for making my birthday 
so wonderfull 

Robin 

Sugar and Spice will be performing 
show tunes at the Mousetrap this 
weekend. 
Get your act together. Applications 
lor Telethon '80 Auditions are In CC 
130; • 

To the boring bunch In 1801, 
The moon in Albany Is lovely this 
time of year. We love you from the 
tips 'of our wings to the curl of our 
talis. 

The Space Pigs 
t ightest JeamTContest l ! No Jap 
Partyl Sat. nlte, 9 pm., Irivng hall, 
beer, munchles, soda. 

Dear Deb, 
Happy 19th, chum. One more day 
until Gershow Day. Remember: 
"Don't move, I will eat..." and " I 
luuuuvv B.P.' 

Dear Ellen, Yes, I missed you over 
vacation!! Glad you're finally back. 

Love.Steven 
P.S. When are we going back to 
P.K.'s?!! 
Tonight It's on Dutchl A party to 
end all featuring: Happy hour 
(vodka, amaret to, g in, kaluah, 
whiskey, beer) and live band from 
9:30 to 11. After 11 more music and 
beer and a square dance. Tonight, 
9:30, Dutch U-Lounge, $2 per couple 
(guy escorted by girl), $1.50 stag. 
Welcome baciTpariylonlghl! Dutch 
Quad, Ten Eyck, Suite 308, free 
beer, pizza, alt invited. 
To Sarah, Bob, Laurie, Stacy, Laura,, 
and Bruce, 
I |ust wanted to say thank you lor all 
the help you guys gave me these 
past months. T don t know what I 
•would have done without you. I love 
you all. 

Tricla 

Tan Eyck Rock V Roll. Watch for it. 
State Quad Tower presents A Leap 
Year Party t o n l g h l at 9;30, 
U-Lounge. Jump on over and |oin 
the lun. 

John Kerr, 
I love you. 

(Not from who you think) 

Frelre, 
It's hard lo find the words to thank 
you for the flowers without getting 
too phllisophlcal, but hey....we ap­
preciate your Ihougthfulness and 
we wish we could give you 
something In return. A "bushel of 
apples maybe? 

Thanks again, love, Jan and Joan 

To a Potter, 
Just wanted to wish you a happy 
"19th" birthday! 

Love, A Werewolf 
P.S. Wait and see, I'll be able to 
make at least the top 45! 

feiethon^alTsTaiT; 
Get psyched! Only 3 weeks to go! 

Terl Herkimer, 
You make my day brighter whenever 
I catch a glimpse of you on campus, 
yet I don't see enough of you. 

A secret admirer M 

Auntie \C, 
You've caught up!! Happy 19th bir­
thday l l 

Love ya', Bath Tub 

' Happy March! 
Love, Laurie 

Eric Helden "and the Hockey Team 
wil l be at Delancey this Friday nite. 
Wil l You? 

Dear Stacl and Rena, . 
Break legs! You'll be great because 
your Sugar and Spice. 

Love, Naomi 

Tomorrow Is still February at 825 
Myrtle's "February 30th" party. 

Dear Jeanette and Jules, 
You made my vacation truly fan­
tastic. Its nice lo have friends like 
you guys. 

Love, Robb 

Ice Rink 
Remains Closed 

continual /mm pane 'three 

SA officials, however, believe 
Sieveus figure of $450 is loo low. 
They argue thai Ihe salaries of ihe 
workmen would increase ibis 

iioum significantly. 
Sicvens denied litis by saying I hot 

crews ordinarily used for snow 
c l e a n - u p were e m p l o y e d . 
"Besides," lie said, " A i any one 
time ihere we,re no m o n than six 
grounds people wo rk i ng . " 

In addii ion, Stevens said he had 
planned for ihe $450 eosi lo lie off­
set by a $7(W.27 SA delil dttling 
back lo I'allfesi. According lo 
Stevens ihe oulsinuding bil l was 
sent November 12. 1979 lo cover 
costs or lighting, w i l ing and nddi-
lional services provided by llie plain 
department. " S A never paid i t , " he 
said. 

Ceniral Council Chair Mike Levy 
said SA refuses to pay because " i l 
was our understanding thai llie 
Universiiy would be able lo absorb 
exorbitant cosis. We don't think 
ihe $710 is unreasonable.'.' 

'Besides," l evy added, " tha i 
money is irrelevnnl lo ihe issue of 
the skaiing r i nk . " 

Stevens said thai although there 
have been problems, this "hasn't 
dampened" his idea of having llie 
skaiing rink next year. 

He said ihe rink area wil l he sod­
ded, seeded and graded ihis spring 
so ihe same problenls wil l nol be 
repealed next year. 

' 
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Chess Club meets every Monday nigln 6-11 p.m. in CC .175. All in­
terested in chess welcome. Speed chess, clutrtburnarhctns. 
International Folkdanclng 2nd floor gym, P.E. Bldg. Every Mon­
day Evening, 6-8 Beginners.; 8-10 Advance. Free. All welcome. 
.Dances Tauglu. 
Speakers Forum Meetings arc every Monday nigln in Campus 
Cenlcr 37.1 ni 8:30. New Members Welcome. 
Astronomy Club General Interest Meeting. We will go to ihe 
telescope after. I'liy. Room 12" Monday, Marcli 3rd ai 8:00 p.m. 
Seniors — Class (if HO Meeting, Mon. Marcli 3 al 9:01) in CC 361. 
Senior week plans will be discussed. 

Campaign '80 J 

[Preview]] 
Telethon '80 T-shirt Buy your T-shirl now! On sale in tile CC Lob­
by. 
Telethon '80 Sign up tor Slate Quad CTiampagnc-eockiail 
breakfast in bed. San. March 2. Sign up on dinner line tonight. 

c Sectnal 

Friends or l.iz llolt/man Meeting. A Woman's Place is in the 
House and ihe Senate. Elect l.i/ Hollzninn to ihe U.S. Senate. 
Come lo an interest meeting Saturday Marcli I, at 2:00 p.m. 
Humanities lounge. 
SUNY Albuni Students for George Hush There will be an 
organizational meeting lot students interested in winking on die 
Bush presidential campaign, Assemblyman John Zagntuc, central 
N.Y. campaign chairman will speak. Walch for signs. Tuesdav. 
Marcli 4, 1980, at 8:00 p.m. 

Telethon 
Clilldrcns Hour Chaperone meeting Marcli 4, 1980 9:00 in LC 19. 
All Wclcomcl 
Wanted: Caricaturist for Telethon '80's Children's Hour on 
March 22nd. If inlercsled, please call Mike al 457-3084 or Joy at 
438-7588. 
Flea Market March 5tli: Conic and buy al Telethon '80's Flea 
Market in the Ballroom and the Gallery surrounding It, II in­
terested in selling, coniaci Rhonda 482-0538. 
Operations Meeting Wed, March 5th at 9:00 p.m. in LC 23. Work 
llie nigln of Telethon. 
Applications for auditions for Telethon '80 are available in CC 
130. Do an aci for Telethon! , 
Telethon '80 Fugle Mountain Discount rentals and lift tickets for 
Eagle Mountains. 30 percent will be donated lo Telethon '80. Ask 
for details at Telethon tabic in die Campus Center. 
Telethon '80 Gel your hair cul al Glemby's in Sears in Colonic 
Mall. Mention Telethon and $2 will be donated lo Tclclhon '80. 

JSC-llillel & Kosher Pino. The annual Pilrinl Party. Beer, 
hamantash, munchles, live band, dancing, etc, Megillalt reading: , 
7:30 p.m., LC 20, Celebrations: 9 p.m. Dutch U-Lounge. (Prize 
I'm best costume) Saturday, March 1. 
Sbahhos House Mcgilla Reading. Sal. Nigln, March I, 7:00 p.m.. 
Sun, March 2, 11:00 a.m. 67 Fuller Rd. Off SUNY 
Shulilms House Feslive Purim Parly on Sunday Marcli 2 al 5:30. 
67 Fuller Rd. Off SUNY. 
Sliuhlios House Celebration & be festive meal. Fri. Feb. 30 al 6:00 
• Sal, March I al 10:30. 67 Fuller Rd. (off SUNY) 

JJSC-Hillcl Some Enchanted Evening Our 2nd annual semi-formal, 
with limited tickets left, and only a lew days left to buy them. Live 
dance band, hors d'ocuvrcs, full Kosher dinner, cash bar, and 
morel It's in the Dutch Dining Hall, Saturday night, Marcli 8, at 
9:00 p.m. You must buy a ticket by this Monday night. 
JSC-llillel Weekly Torah Study Group Each Thursday afternoon, 
from 12 to I, in Campus Center 357. 

Campus Ministry Gospel Ensemble, >bc gospel choir on campus, 
holds weekly rehearsals on Wednesday nights 7-10 p.m. in 
Brubnchcr Hall on Alumni Quad. For more information contact: 
Mrs. Tcrri Gaillinrd al 465-7133 or Mr. Kirley Crawford at 
457-5219. 
JSC-llillel Sllahhal Services Traditional, (Chapel House), Friday 
pights at 4:30 and Saturday mornings at 9:30. Kiddush & lun­
cheon. Liberal (Chavurah) services, Friday lllghls at 7:30 in HU 
354. Oueg following. 
Campus Crusade for Christ Prime Time. A lime of fellowship, 
fun, and singing. Come join us! CC 375, Thursday nighl. 7:30 -
8:30. 

Miscellany D 
Preview Notice 

• Each club, group, and 
organization must submit to 
the ASP (Preview Mailbox) the 
name of one representative. 
This name will be the only one 
recognized at the bottom of 
each Preview form. 
• All Previews are to be sub­

mitted to the SA Contact Of-
fice only. Thanks! 

4 plus 2 Koltursku1iii[> Nif.lit al Kollcrnmii Join 4 plus 2 on Friday, 
March 7ih nt Rollerama in Schneciady. Cost is $4 which includes 
round-irip bus, admission and skaic rental. Tickets on sale on In­
dian Quad dinner line March 3-7. 
School of Uhlan ami Information Science Colloquium Scries 
Robert .1. Freeman, Executive Director, Committee on Public Ac­
cess lo Records, New Yoi k Department of Slate, will give a talk on 
"Access jo Information in New York Stale," on Wednesday, 
February 13, 1980, at 1:00 p.m. in Draper Hall, Room 146. The 
public is Invited io attend. 
Oi'iiiv of Internallmial Pro^rums An orientation meeting for all 
students Interested in the Wurzburg summer intensive German 
language program, Augnsi I'JHO, wilt be held on Thursday, March 
n. 1980 ai 7:30 p.m. in Humanities 290, 
SUNY A SimU-nl Arl Council I si annual T-shirt competition. 
"Design your own T-shirt and subnhi it io us!" Requirements: I) 
Musi contain a logo with or without design and 2) Size: 8 X 10 or 
smaller - limit 3 colors. Mini; Keep ii simple. I'ri/es Awarded. 
Deadline: March 17. 

P AC The Dream IMu> by Sirindberg: Directed hy Jarker Uuiian. A 
prototype of expressionism and (hcatrc of the absurd. An epoch-
making vision of mankinds trials and follies. March 12-15 & 19-22 
al 8:00 p.m. and Mar. 16 at 2:30 p.m. Main Theatre. 
Nicaragua SnIUIurily Committee & People & Food Sundino Lives! 
Two short films about Nicaragua and speakers from Maryknoll 
Magazine who recently returned front Nicaragua. Lecture Center 
(room lo be announced) Friday, March 7, 1980, at 7:30 p.m. 

Jonsson Wins Supreme Court Favor 
continual ft lint /nine three 
cording in Commission spokesper­
son Jeff Stem, Ihe election Con-
stiiulion stales an appeal must be 
made within 24 hours of an elce-
l imi. Joseph extended the time 
limit. 

The Supreme Court accepted the 
ease after the Commission waived 
the riglu in ignore Ihe appeal and 
form a decision without Silvcrberg. 

During Tuesday nigln's pro­
ceedings, S i l verberg charged 
Jonsson with accusing him of steal­
ing class funds during liis class of 
'XI presidency in 1SJ7H. Current 
class of 'HI President Gary Schat-
sky conilrmed daring the hearing 
and trial, thai thel'l allegations 
against Silvcrberg were made during 
his tenure as elass president. 
Silvcrberg resigned in reaction lo 
what he called "group pressures." 

Silvcrberg claims ll ial Jonsson, in 
her d o o r - i o - d o o r c a m p a i g n , 
repealed these allegations lo pro­
spective voicrs. " T w o campaigners 
of mine found people, while going 
dooi ' lo-door, who told ihem that 
'Laura Jonsson said to mc thai be 
(Silverberg) stole money from Ihe 
class' and llial my presidency ended 
because of stealing class funds." 

l ie added thai Schatsky had a 
"past record" against h im. 

Joseph said .lonsson's statements 
were not false and thai while there 
were Ibefl allegations, they were 
never substantiated. " Y o u don't 
have slander Ihere," said Joseph. 

Joseph then reminded ihe Cotui 
that Silverberg was brought before 
the body In Apr i l , 1SJ78, and was 
found guilly of slandering elass of 
'SI write-in presidential candidate 
Saul Aronsou. 

"1 don'l believe I said more titan 
llial they were allegations." said 
Jonsson. " 1 only answered ques­
tions. I wasn't volunteering this in­
formation to people. 1 never said lie 
stole money. ' ' 

Jonsson staled earlier l l ia l 
S i lverberg, i l l his c a m p a i g n ^ 
presented her as an unqualified can­
didate, claiming here weaknesses 
were thai whe was a woman and a 
I'rcshpcrson. 

"She did nol run a clean cam­
paign," said Silvcrberg. " I ' m nol 
President Kennedy and she 
shouldn't bring somclhing up like 
CTiappaquiddick. 

'Ihere was some question after 
the trial regarding the brief period 
of lime in which the decision was 
readied. 

The Com i decided Silverberg Itad 
ample lime to prepare bis case and 
failed io substantiate his appeal. 

Make Love, No). War- About 300 people 
attended SUNYA's first anti-draft rally held 
on Valentine's Day on the podium. 

lo: Boh Leonard 

g>tuumt 

5Lrje Unite The Student 
Association 
Newspaper 

is resuming publication with your input. An in­
terest meeting will be held Tuesday nite in the 
Off-Campus lounge (Outside the SA Office) at 
8 p.m. 
Positions available include Editors, Produc­
tion technicians, proofreaders and writers. 
SUNYA needs an alternative newspaper and 
you can help. 

BUY 2GET 1 FREE! 
COLD C U T S - C H E E S E - T U N A - T U R K E Y 

GV\fowyumTast)^ 

Available at MIKF'S I f i W 
a l l I n r a t i n n c I f l l B L U'^^ t j"• tlJJ* 

an locations S U B M A R | N £ 

_0PENJ DAYSA WEEK_ 

BUY 2GET~1 FREE!" 
ROAST B E E f - H A M - P A S T R A M I 

c\r\fovv^umTasty^ 
Available at ' 
all locations 

OPEN 7 DAYS A WfEK 
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J. V, Finds Success Despite Adversity 
continued front-page nineteen 
lems for the coach. 

Most of all, Kopp taught and 
utilized the Albany State system to 
its fullest. . 

Kopp tried to downplay his role 
in the team's success, citing the old 
adage that "coaches don't win 
games, they only lose them." 

"At the beginning of the season, 
I wasn't sure how wc were going to 
do. Most people had no hope for 
us," reflected Kopp. "But the at­
titude of the remaining eight was 
cxccllcm. Small problems will hap­
pen on any team. My guys Worked 
as hard as any other team," he con­
tinued. . 

Kopp tried hard to push the 
credit onio his players. "The eight 
thai stuck out the year are a real 
good bunch of guys. Everybody 
jvisi worked real hard together. 1 
never had reason to gel mad at 
anybody for lack of efforl." 

Indeed, those lhai stayed were 
hard workers, hustlers, and 
dcdieaied. Such dclerminalioii 
oflcn resulted in foul' Irpublc for 
Albany, bin as lite record shows, ii 
won bnllgamcs. 

Albany did have those players 
thai slood OIII I hough, in Ihe per­
sons of Gaines and Gallo, The 
J.V.'s iwo jop varsity prospects 
averaget! 17.4 and 15.4 points per 
game, respectively. "We looked lo 
him in lough situations," said Kopp 
of Gaines, who had ilie leant high 
game (3D points againsi Union), 
and did the bulk of I he ball handl­
ing. When asked lo compare the 
Iwo with regards .lo value lo Ihe 
learn, Kopp replied, "You could 
loss il up." 

How could a college basketball 
lean) win wiihoui depth? 

How could a college basketball 
team win wilhoul height? 

How could a college basketball 
lean;', with all ihe problems, adver­
sity, and a new coach even dream 
about a winning percentage of .800 
over a 20-ganie schedule? 

However iliey did il, lltey won. 
Most of i heir games were referred 
lo by players as "leant efforts." 
The same can he said for Ihe whole 
season. 

"We won a couple thai we pro­
bably should have lost," said Kopp 
in retrospect. "Overall, we had a 
pretty good year." Lei's hear il lor 
understatement. 

Men'?. Track 
continued fivin pttge eighteen 

As was I lie case in the dual meet 
with Union, Albany's main 
weakness seemed lo lie in I lie fjeld 
events. The Danes never finished 
above fourth place in any of ihe 
field events. 

With ihe completion of lasi 
week's action, Albany's won-loss 
record for dual meets now siands al 
3-4. Tomorrow, the track team 
moves on lo Union to partake in the 
Capital District Mccl. For this 
meet, Munscy plans to swiich his 
runners into different events giving 
them a well deserved rest in 
preparation for the Union Invita­
tional on March 8lh and the 22 
team New York Stale Champion­
ship Meet, the following Saturday, 
March 15. 

Rugby Club 
Wanis Players 

Anyone interested in becoming a 
member of the Albany Slate Rugby 
club should call Mike al 457-1865. 
No experience is necessary. The 
rugby club is currently preparing 
foi a LOUgh s p t j p g s c h e d u l e . 

League I 
1. Nice & Easy 
2. Spectrum Crew 

League II 
1. Barbara 
2. Eggs 
3. Rim Jobs 
4. Big Shois 

League III 
1. Gargoyles 
2. Cool Dudes 
3. Running Rebels 
4. Long Branch 
5. Tiny Bui Tough 
6. TBD 
7. Jerry's Kids 
8. Balzac 
'J, Wharf Rais 
10. Chin Droihers 

League IV 
1. Acadian 
2. Go For 11 
3. On lop 
4. Snakes 

W1RA 
1. Asubetts 
2. Tuborg Gold 
3. Classics 

FLOOR HOCKEY 

League I 
1. Downiown Blades 
2. Slickhandlers 
3. Fever • 
4. Hanson Gang 
5. Los Gringos 
6. Cheap Shois 

League II 
1. Uncle John's Band 
2. Pierce Silencers 
3. Cosmic Debris 
4. (lie) Bgglandcrs 

Benny Hill 
(>. Sudden Death 

League I 
1. Wildebeasis 
2. Palace Guard 
3. Gammon I 

League II 
1. Gobagool 
2. Muffdivcrs 
3. Chin Bros. 
4. SA's 

COLD 
1. Gammon II 
2. Once Again 
3. Derelicts M ^ 
4. On Our Way Out 

5. Pace Sel lers 

6. Go For 11 

WlllA 
i. Tower Girls 
2. Joint 
3. Motley's Crew 
4. Now Seriously Folks 

Albany guard Mike Gaines (Ihe Jayvces' leading scorer) lakes a jumper in 
an earlier contest. (IMioln: Sue Taylor) 

League I 
1. Fggs 
2. Chin's Bar-n-Grlll 
3. Jeopardy 

DOWNIOWN BASKETBALL 

League II 
1. Werewolves 
2. Bo's Bounders 
3. Downiown Slugs 
4. (lie) Dunkin' Dojiuts 

69'ers 

Women's 
Tuborg Gold 
I Icrbie's Girls 

StfV^ 

She was married at 13. 
She had four kids 

by the time she was 20. 
She's been hungry and poor. 

She's been loved and cheated on. 
She became a singer and a star 

because it was the only way 
she knew to survive. 

CcnffrutucA'j 

SISSY SPACER TOMMY LEE JONES 
"COAL MINER'S DAUGHTER" 

also starring BEVERLY DANOELO LEVON HELM Screenplay by TOM RICKMAN 
Based on the Autobiography by LORETTA LYNN with GEORGE VECSEY 
Executive Producer BOB LARSON Produced by BERNARD SCHWARTZ 

Directed by MICHAEL APTED A BERNARD SCHWARTZ Production A UNIVERSAL PICTURE U 
I>(; rainttw. cuiouici suoasini •< 

fMvt:ti.sAi.t'iivs-ii'iiiusiNi'.Ai.i.niiiirisnr.sKitvi:ii 

Opening March 7 at a theatre near you 
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Women Swimmers 19th In Meet 
FinishWilh4-7Record On Season 

Ihe Albany Stale women's swimming team finished up llieir season hist 
week lo give them a 4-7 record. (I'holo: UPS) 

by Maureen George 
The Albany Stale women's swim 

learn complcied their season during 
vacation when they participated in 
the stale championship meet on 
February 21, 22, 23 al Harlwick 
College. 

Ten swimmers from Albany went 
lo the meet; Ann Hoch, Carol Lim, 
Donna Slarace, Donna Silize, 
Carolyn Shwidock, Joan 
Mieklcham and alternates Joan 
Nugent, Lisa Soincck, Belli Lar­
son, and Judy Koltai. The learn 
placed ll)th oui of twenty four 
teams, which is a belter showing 
than lasi year's team (which placed 
15th oul of 16 learns). 

Despite l lie poor showing, 
Albany broke llirec school records. 
The 41)0 yard medley relay leam of 
Larson, Lim, Slarace and Silize 
came through with a lime of 4:55.8 

minutes, which is one second better 
than the prcvioiis record. The 800 
yard freestyle Albany relay record 
was bettered by six sccqnds with a 
lime of 9:44.6 minutes. That team 
consisted of Hoch, Slarace, Sitize, 
Schwidock and Nugent. The 400 
yard freestyle leam of Hoch; 
Slarace, Silize and Schwidock 
broke Ihe previous school record 
for their event with a lime of 4:17 
which is six seconds quicker lhan 
the old mark. 

The stale competition was 
dominated by Ocncsco and ihe 
Rochester Institute of Technology. 

"Both these teams were over­
powering," said Albany women's 
swimming coach Sarah Bingham: 
"They were well disciplined and 
swam superbly." 

The Mosi Valuable Athlete of the 
meet was Seudelci from Harlwick. 

She qualified for Five events In the 
National Championships, which 
will be held at Allegheny. 

Albany finished their season with 
a 4-7 record'. Bingham reflected on 
ihe season saying, "We have a 
young team. We have a good foot­
hold and a good base. Next year I 
hope to pull in some freshmen." 
She added, "The girls were happy 
with their performance and I was 
pleased with (he season." 

Faculty Handles 
Students, 61-44 

A leam of SUNYA's faculty 
taught a student team a lough 
lesson lasi night. The faculty easily 
defeated ihe students, 61-44, in a 
game played for Telethon 80. 

-Olympics"In Boston? D e P a u l Falh To j V o t r e D a m e Jinx 
" I ' » » > » • , ...III ™™U» o . . , , . . m n m k n l u l l s Ul l ivCrs i ly BOSTON (AP) Boston will make a 

strong bid to become Ihe site of 
"alternative Olympics" this sum­
mer, and it shouldn't cost city lax-
payers a cent, Mayor Kevin H. 
While said Thursday. 

"We arc prepared to fight, if the 
opportunity avails itself, to hold the 
Olympics in Boston," White said al 
a news conference. 

He announced Ihe formation ol'a 
nine-member committee lo in­
vestigate ihe possibility and said 

one member, Tufts University 
President Dr. Jean Mayer, hascon-
lacicd Ihe While House and legal 
counsel. 

While said Mayer will go lo Ihe 
While House Friday lo discuss the 
possibility. 

The Summer Olympics ate 
scheduled to lie held in Moscow, 
iiut President Carter lias said lite 
United States will not participate 
because of Russia's military nclion 
•ii Afghanistan. 

N l 1**136*25.00 if 

lUe neat MMtetlwk... U>e kttfiu y,«u need *25 

^atfcwtcdwwUiclClfO)t£cft 455-6007 

i lN > 
EDUCATIONAL 
PROGRAMS IN 

ISRAEL 
II You're Looking lor a Pjogiarn in Israel 

tor a Child, High School or College Students, 
a Teacher or Yourself. 

LOOK NO FURTHER 
Programs last six months lo a year, a semester. 

and/or a summer. All include transportation, 
room, board, touring and field trips. 

1 I I High School Year Program U School Teachers Seminars 
- *.-..-__ j^j w,n)er Seminars 

U Bat-Bar Mllzvah 
Pilgrimage 

[ J Adull Programs 
i i '••"•-• - i j ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ ^ _ IJ Summei Youth Seminars 
For further inlormation. check the appropriate box 
(boxer,) mail, or call today. SA 

I I High School Year Program 
I | Hayim Greenborg College 

Program 
|J University Credit 

Seminars 
I | Israel Ulpan 

I 

U -

Addreil 

Stall • 
HP-

DEPARTMENT OF 
EDUCATION & CULTURE 
L W O R L D ' Z I O N I S T O R G A N I Z A T I O N 
V Department ot Education & Culture 
^ ^ 515 Park Avenue. N.YC. 10022 

^ (212) 752-0600 ext 377/376 

SOUTH BEND, Iml. (AP) — Top-
ranked college basketball teams 
which venture Into Noire Dame's 
Athletic and Convocation Center 
indeed are invading treacherous 
ground. 

live limes in ihe 12-year history 
of ihe ACC - as ihe school's "sixth 
man" student body affectionately 
calls it - the Irish have stopped the 
nation's No. I leam in iis tracks. 

On .Ian. 23, 1971, it was UCLA. 
Three years later, il was UCLA 

< again and the Bruins1 88-game win-
i nlng streak. In ll)77, it was 
i unbeaten San Francisco, and a year 
J later defending the national chain-
1 pion Marquette. 

Wednesday night was DePaul's 
i lain. It look two over-lime scs-
| sions, but ihe Irish got the job done 
' again with a pulsating 76-74 victory 
i which snapped ihe Blue Demons' 
, 26-game winning streak. 
[ "That's what freaks me out 
• about litis place." said Notre Dame 

Conch Digger Phelps, 
"Don'l play Noire Dame when 

you're No. I and unbeaten. 
"Bui this doesn't compare with 

1974. Beating UCLA, snapping ihe 
winning streak and everything that 
goes with il rank with ihe greatest 

moments in spoils. I ihink any 
coach would have wanted to be part 
of ii," Phelps added. 

Orlando Woolcridgc canned two 
free throws with I1) seconds left in 
the second overtime lo give ihe 
Irish. 21-5, ihe victory. The winning 
shots capped a steady uphill climb 
which began ut'ler DePaul, 25-1, 
scored the first eiglu points of ihe 
second half to lake a commanding 
lead. 

Bui Notre Dame roared back and 
wiped out a nine-point deficit by 
scoring 11 straight points to sel up a 
see-saw battle which saw ihe game 
tied at 64 after regulation, and 70 
after the first overtime. Iloih learns 
wasied opportunities io win the 
game in regulation. Two free 
throws by Tracy Jackson lied ihe 
game at 64 with 1:08 lefl, DePaul 
wcnl into a delay game and held the 
ball until Teddy tiruhbs ihrcw ii 
away with LI seconds lefl. 

Noire Dame look possession bill 
turned it over when Bill Hnn/lik was 
whistled for traveling five seconds 
later. DcPaul's Clyde Uradshaw 
missed a 20 fooler al ihe buzzer, 
and ihe game went into overtime. 

Rich Branding tied ilie game al 70 
with a jumper from the comer wiih 

Hottest New Drink of the Year 

Comfort 

Super smooth! Fire enthusiasm any 
time with this wonderful warm-up I 

Recipe: 1 |iggor 0 Vi oz.) 
Southern Comfort 

Small stick cinnamon 
Slice lomon paol 
Hoi ciclor 
Put cinnamon, lemon 
peel and Southern 
Cnmlort in mug. Fill 
with cider and stir. 
(Put spoon in mug 
to pour hoi cider.) 

Southern 
Comfort 
Nothing's so delicious ns Comfort' on-thc-rocksf 
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seven seconds left In the first ovcr-
llnic. He got ihe chance after James 
Milehem, playing with a broken 
hand, missed ihe entire backboard 
on ihe from end of a onc-and-end 
free throw situation with 36 seconds 
lo go and DePaul leading 70-68. 

While Coach Ray Meyer obvious­
ly was disappointed with the loss, 
lie seemed a bit relieved. 

"I've been asked 10 times in the 
last iwo weeks about being No. 1. 1 
didn't ask lo be No. 1. It was voted, 
and so what," he said. "Pll send 
congratulations if there is another 
team voted No. I after this game. 
He can have ihe 'monkey'. I don't 
want it." 

Kelly Tripncka led Noire Dame 
with 28 points and WollcrldgC add­
ed 16. Mark Aguirre, voled the 
game's mosi valuable player, scored 
28 lor DePaul, and leammale Terry 
Cummings added 16, 

Si. John's Deals 

Providence, 48-44 

PROVIDENCE, R. I . (AP) 
Freshman David Russell scored 17 
points as eiglilh-raiiked St. John's 
endured a colU-sltOQtlng game and 
hung on for a 48-44 vielory over 
Providence Thursday In llie opener 
of ihe Big Easi basketball touma-
nient. 

Both learns had trouble finding 
Ihe basket and avoiding lurnovers. 
Providence trailed 27-20 at halftimc 
but closed to within 43-42 on a 
jumper by Ricky Tucker with 2:38 
lefl in the game. But a costly tur­
nover thwaricd the comeback at­
tempt. 

With 2:08 left lo -go, Rudy 
Williams rebounded a St. John's 
miss and Providence played for one 
shot. Williams' pass went off the 
arm of John Nolan and Reggie 
Carter stole Ihe ball and went in for 
a stuff with 1:06 logo. 

A free llirow by Wayne McKoy 
put the Redmen ahead 46-42, but 
two free throws by Jerry Scolt clos­
ed the gap to two points. 

The Friars got ihe ball back after 
Curtis Redding walked and wilh six 
seconds left Williams drove for the 
apparent lying basket was called for 
an offensive foul. 

Frank Gilroy finished the scoring 
for St, John's with two free throws 
with five seconds remaining, 



German Club Members 

REMEMBER TONIGHT 
Mardi Gras-Fasching Party 

BE THERE! 

Jugger Naut Concert 
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HYPIRG's 1*8© Spring 

CONFERENCE 
SUN Y a t Albany 

March I - * 
Join New York State's 
Largest Gathering of 
Student Activists! 

OVER FORTY WORKSHOPS SCHEDULED: 

POLITICAL REFORM, STUDENT POWER, 
ANTI-NUCLEAR ORGANIZING, TOXIC 
CHEMICALS , CO-OPs, CONSUMER 
PROTECTION, WOMEN'S RIGHTS, 
SOCIAL JUSTICE, LOBBYING, HIGHER 
EDUCATION, STANDARDIZED TESTING 

and much more!! 

NEW YORK 
PUBLIC 
INTEREST 
RESEARCH 
GROUP 

For More Information Contact: 
N YPIRG Office CC 382 

457-4623 
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Joe Gorman 
Robert Weaver 

and 
Mike Joyce 

FEATURING: Moody Blues, Classical Rock, 
The Beatles and oriainal music. 
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Men's Swim Team Set For SUNYAC Championships 
by Jeff Schadoff 

The regular season is over and Ihe 
Albaiv Stale men's swim leam is 
"shooting for the stars", ' so lo 
speak, as Ihcy prepare for Ihe up­
coming SUNYAC championships 
this Thursday. 

The Danes finished ihe season 
with a dual-meet record of 10 wins 
and 4 losses, second best season 
ever to their 1977-78 campaign at 
13-2. Wi l l i a winning percentage in 
dual meet competition of .714, 
Albany swimming coach Ron While 
was "o /c ra l l , very pleased." 

Now lhal the regular season has 
been completed the SUNYAC 
championships arc now of the 
essence. The Danes are sending 
three relays to Potsdam with three 
swimmers solely participating in in­
dividual events. 

The one relay that gets preference 
is Albany's medley relay consisting 
of Steve Bonawitz, Joe Shore, 
Frank Heler, and Kevin Ahern. 
"Our medley has had top seed time 
all season. We're just polishing il 
off for the Nat ionals," said While. 
The two remaining teams have 
Ahem, Hetcr, Dave Zybala, and 
Tom Roberts swimming the 400 and 
800 yard freestyle relays. " O u r 
relays are good relays," added 
White. Ahern felt " the 400 should 
finish in the top three with the 800 
hopefully getting a good effort 
also." 

Rounding out the Dane squad of 
nine to Potsdam are swimmers 
Kerry Donovan and Jiin Colgan 
and diver Bill Derkasch. Many of 
the swimmers competing in the 
relay events arc also competing in­
dividually as well. "Last year we 
went lo Ihe SUNYAC's with nine 
guys and did the best wc ever did 
(4th oul of 12). We have more 
potential now, as I think back til 
preseason In September when I had 
some doubts," said While. 

An important part of a team's 
preparation for the big SUNYAC 
meet is lo be able lo " j a p c r " as suc­
cessfully as possible — lo go from 
basic bulk training to lhal of preci­

sion discipline in order lo perfect 
every aspect or ihe event. "We had 
three weeks lo prepare but this pasi 
week has been one beautiful taper 
week. There's no doubt about h — 
they'll be ready. This team is the 
besl tapered and most rested leam 
I've ever seen in Ihe s'x years I'm 
coaching here," mentioned While. 

(Jelling down lo ihe competition 
on. paper, Cortland should will il 
all. The battle is for the ncxi lltree 
spots wilh Potsdam gelling the edge 
on second due to their slight depth 
advantage and Gcneseo and Albany 
battling for Ihe next two spols. Bill 
If "we put all the pieces together wc 
can hope for a big one at the end. Il 
would really blow our minds for a 
second with third meriting an ex-
cclleni showing and fourth place — 
pnr-for-ihe-coiirse," said While. 

In Ihe diving Derkasch represents 
the Danes and While feels lhal 
"He 's ready for Ihe upcoming 
SUNYAC championship competi­
t ion. He has an opportunity to 
place ai least sixth on both boards 
(one and three meter)." 

Commenting on Ihe concluded 
regular season, While said, " W e 
had, wi lh our schedule, a real 
pressure season which made us slay 
on top of our game at all limes. 
We've had tough teams all through 
our schedule which gave for many 
close mecls — most of them down 
lo ihe last relay. We've also had a 
couple of heartbrcakers along with 
a few surprise wins — unexpected 
back in preseason. The guys arc 
very dedicated. I enjoy coaching a 
winner and this learn has definitely 
been a winner." 

The Danes finished out their 
regular season two weeks ago al 
Binghamlon as they participated in 
the "University Center" meet with 
Buffalo, Slony Brooki and host 
Binghamlon rounding out ihe field. 
The Danes went in as favorites Inn 
losi lo Buffalo by three points, 
59-56, with Binghamlon and Slony 
Brook righl behind til 51 and 49, 
respectively. 

The Danes had a chance lo wil l 

The Albany Stale men's swimming team finished their dual-meet schedule with a record of 10-4, their 
second best season ever. The squad now looks In the SUNYAC's. (Pimm: UPS) 

the meel as ihey came back from a 
15 point deficit to go up by one go­
ing Into the final relay. Never­
theless, they were edged out lo cap­
ture a disappointing second. 

Winners on the day were Shore in 
the backstroke with Hcler second. 
Ahern took the 200 yard fiecstyle 
and Derkasch look both the one 
and ihrcc meter diving events. 
"Derkasch looked outstanding. 
Definitely his best showing ever," 
said While, adding, " A l l three 
teams were pointing al us. Wc were 
Ihe team to beat. Buffalo really had 
I heir all in Ibis meet." 

"We've always been a respected 
team by opposing S U N Y A C 
coaches anil since there's nothing to 
lose al the SUNYAC's — Ihcre's 
noi that pressure thai Cori land 
mighl have as number one — so it's 
just a mailer of going oul and 
swimming," said While. 

Women's Track Team Gets 
Third In Four Way Meet 

by Kalhy Perrilli 
Three weeks ago in a four-way 

meel al Cortland, ihe Albany Stale 
women's indoor iraek team came in 
third place behind Coriland and 
Alfred, and ahead of Binghamlon. 

The only I'irsi place went to Sue 
Stem in Ihe 600 yard run with a 
lime of 1:31.7, establishing ;i school 
record. She look fourth place in Ihe 
long jump and placed third in ihe 
S80 relay. " W e didn' l even know 
there was one until we goi there," 
remarked Albany women's Hack 
coach Barb Palm. 

Barbara Hil l came in fourth in 
the fi(X) yard dash and "d idn ' t score 
in ihe 220 but established a school 
record because we've never run in ii 

Ron, 
Go Take a Powder 

R.L.,E.B.,andR.E.G. 

Danes vs. Si. Lawrence Tonight 
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wbli Ihe Hears. 70-68). 
"Their quickness will be our big-

gcsi problem," explained Sailers. 
" W e like lo press learns and force 
them lo nun over Ihe ball, but I 
don'i ihink wc will be able lo press 
Si. Lawrence. Ihey are very quick 
— quicker than wc are. They might 
have the bcsl personnel of any leam 

:•: in ihe tournament." 
:j: Sauers waiched as Si. Lawrence 
: overpowered Pi t tsburgh Monday 
i night, 87-62 — without Iwo of their 
i key players. Saint guard Jim 
I llerkman was out with a possible 
i broken ankle, and is doubtful to 
; face ihe Danes. The oilier injury 
• could be disastrous for St. ' 
• Laurence, (ieorge Hughes, a 6-2 

| Three Grapplers 

\ To National Meel 
Paul Hornbach, Mike Dailey, 

and Vic Herman all qualified for 
Ihe NCAA Nalional Champion­
ships ihis weekend In Connecticut 
by virtue of their placements in the 
SUNYAC's last weekend in Buf­
falo. 

Dailey took fourth in the 142 
pound class, while Herman look the 
samespol in his 190 pound division. 
H o r n b a c h , A l b a n y ' s p remie r 
wrestler all season, was injured in 
the finals, but still look second. He 
is questionable for the meet. 

All-Amcrici l l i forward, did not play 
against Pi t tsburgh due lo an ankle 
injury, and his slants is unknown 
for Ihe playoffs. Hughes is the 
Saints leading scorer (21.6) and re-
bounder (11.6), 

" I would say lhal llerkman is 
very questionable and Hughes just 
threw of f his crutches on Monday, 
so he's questionable," said Paul 
I-vans, St. Lawrence's head coach. 
" I f those two are out il would 
greatly hurl us. As wc showed 
against Plallsburgh, we can replace 
Hughes' scoring, bill he's also our 
leading reboundcr, and lo slay with 
Albany wc iniisi be able to board 
wilh them. Hut wc have a good 
bench, and I ihink wc match up 
wilh Albany as well as we match up 
with any team in Ihe tournament." 

"They were a darn good team; 
even without their injured players," 
Sauers said. "They didn' l have 
their best player or their best 
shooting guard, but Ihey slill ex­
ecuted like a smooth, well-oiled 
machine, I was very impressed." 

Last year, it was a one-point loss 
in Kentucky that eliminated Ihe 
Danes from advancing in the 
playoffs. This weekend, the com­
petition is at least as lough — the 
F.ast Regional figures lo be one of 
Ihe strongest in the nation. Albany 
is in with the lop 32 Division I I I 
leanis in the'counlry, and for the 
Danes lo further their surprising 
season depends, indeed, upon their 
ability lo "gel il going." 

before," said Palm. 
Another record was established 

by Chris Gardner, who look second 
place in ihe iwo mile run with a time 
of 11:49.06. Sue Railed came in 
fourth in the 60 yard hurdles and 
Liz Kirk look third in ihe shot put. 

The following week at Vermont 
Ihe team placed fourth, behind 
U V M , Cortland, and U Mass. 

Chris Gardner ran Ihe 3000 
meters in 10.-19.5, "21 seconds bel­
ter than Ihe qualifying lime for Ihe 
Lastern Regional championships," 
Palm said. This placed her fourth in 
the competition. 

In ihe 8(X) meter tun. Stern plac­
ed third wilh a lime of 2:22.6, 
establishing a new school record. 
She also look sixlli place in the stan­
dard long jump. Kirk placed fourth 
in tiie shot put. 

This weekend al Harvard is Ihe 
Eastern Regional competition for 
women's indoor track and field in 
which Gardner will he running in 
the Iwo mile competition. 

Coming up in May tire the 
NYSAIAW's, "and already we've 
had some people qualify based on 
what ihey did indoors," Palm 
remarked. Stern will compete in the 
long jump and half mile, Gardner 
will run ihe 2-mile, and Kirk will 
compete in the shot put. 

The squad is currently practicing 
for ihe spring outdoor season, any 
interested performers should con­
tact coach Palm. 

ASP Top 

DDePaul 
2) Kentucky 
3) Syracuse 
4) Louisville 
5) Maryland 
6) North Carolina State 
7) Notre Dame 
8)l..S.U. 
9) St. Johns 

(lie) Missouri 

28 
26 
21 
20 
17 
15 
14 
9 
7 
7 

College basketball rankings compil­
ed by B(ff Fischer, Rich Seligson, 
and Paul Schwartz. Points awarded 
im a 10-9-8-7-6-5-4-3*2-1 basis. 
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Women Cagers Place Third In Tourney 

Noney llallimin drives pust defender in earlier gni 
Capital District Tournament. (I'lmlo; 

ie. She won M V I 
Sue Taylor) 

by Lori Cohen 
Albany women's varsity basket­

ball came of age this past week. 
While most students were home 
relaxing, the women were playing in 
the Capital District Tournament. 
Albany finished a very respectable 
third, losing in Ihc lasi two seconds 
to Ihc College of St. Rose, 54-56, 
and then, in ihe consolation round, 

-., they bcai Skidmore, 62-60. 

Albany women's basketball 
coach Amy Kidder said on the 
season up lo ihe tournament: 
"Going into the lournamcui we had 
losl all our games since January 29. 
Mentally we were nol playing good 
ball, ihe season was lagging. We 
had been playing well ill practice, 
bul we hail been practicing well for 
the whole month of January. We 
wcni into ihe loiiritnnicn! nol 
knowing wliai lo expect of 
ourselves." 

Albany's first opponent was Si. 
Rose, whom I hey hail been playing 
close all season. " I h e leam was 
totally psyched. We played mature 
basketball and niiiliiluinctl ii 
throughout ihe game. We used lo 
lose our cool if we gol ahead, bin 
ihis lime we were patient and played 
well," Kidder reflected. St. Rose 
played an excellent mau-io man 

Track Team Dropped By Union 

defense, even switching players on 
picks. In the last two seconds, St. 
Rose scored, alter Ihe lead had 
changed hands all game. The loss 
sent Ihc young Dane squad into the 
consolation round. 

They played Skidmore in the con­
solation round, for third place in 
ihc tournament. "It looked like we 
were totally out of gas, beat from 
the nighl Deforc ," Kidder 
said."Everything changed in the se­
cond half. We seemed more alive. 
Willi three minutes left in ihc half, 
we hit a few in a row anil il gol us 
going, il also gol Skidmore ner­
vous. We ended up winning by iwo. 
All along I had Ihc thoughl ill the 
back of my mind dial we might pull 
it out ill ihe fourth quarter, because 
we had done II before against Skid­
more. Il fell good lo he on ihe win­
ning side of a close score like that." 

The win place ihcm third in the 
tournament-, behind Si. Rose (first) 
and Union (second), Il was a good 
ending lo Ihe season for the young 
players, and Ihe rookie coach, 

Nancy llalloran, all year a play-
maker and dependable hall handler, 
won Mosl Valuable Player honors 
for ihc tournament, "Il was a shock 
lo all of us, including Nancy, con­
sidering we had only finished third 
in ihc tournament. Yel she had 
played good, consistent ball," said 
Kidder, llalloran averaged 13 
points during the tournament, while 

getting many steals and handing out 
numerous assists, and she was also 
named to the All-tournament team, 
along wilh icammale Theresa 
Clark. 

Clark played excellent ball Ihc 
whole lournamcui, averaging 17 re­
bound a game and 15 points a 
game. "Nancy lias played such • 
good ball our lasl four or five 
games. She kept us in those games. 
She has improved so much 
ihroughqui the season. Theresa also 
played a fanuisiic tournament, ris­
ing up lo tiie occasion." Kidder 
said. 

Liia'nuc LaLondc had tin ex­
cellent season, as did Kim Warner. 
Kidder commented, "Those girls 
gave us 110 percent every single 
game we played. Wc counted on 
them for liu points a game, and we 
could nol win without il. They con­
tinued IO play ihc same consistent 
hall in (he tournament, l.uanne had 
Iwo off days, and Kim was sick, hut 
I hey slill gave all ihey had. They 
were Ihe backbone of ihe team all 
season. 

The women ended Ihe season on 
a very high nine. Willi ihe youth of 
the leam and Ihc vitality anil en­
thusiasm of ihe coach, Ihc leam has 
a very briglil flume. Hopefully ihe 
high from ihe end of Ihis season will 
lasi until nexl season, when 
everybody will have a year's ex­
perience under Ihcir bell. 

by Mure Haspel 
Lasi week was hardly one of rest 

for the Albany Stale Men's Indoor 
Track leam. The squad kepi on the 
run, facing Union College in a dual 
meet on the I4ih and competing in 
the seventh annual Kl'l invitational 
on I he 23rd. 
j Despite losing 67-60, the Danes 
performed admirably al Union, 
hauling a "scrappy" Union lentil 
on Valentines Day in what Albans 
indoor track coach Hob Miiuscy 
called a thriller of a meet. Union, as 
Munsey pointed out, is a good all 
around leam: sirong in both runn­
ing and field events, Although 
Albany dominated the running 
competition, Munsey admitted ihai 
the leam was weak iu the field 
events. This deficiency accounted 
for the seven-point difference in Ihc 
very close score. In fact, a first and 
second in ihe high jump event, 
which took place near the end of 
the meet, secured the victory for 
Union. Attributing this weakness u 
a lack of field facilities (there arc 
none on campus), Munsey explain 
ed, "It's hard lo have vaullers when 
there's no place to vault." 

Never theless , Albany did 
dominate the running events with 
notable performances lurned in by 
senior Bill Malhis and sophmorcs 
Bruce Shapiro and Scott James, 
Mathis, Albany's only double win­
ner of the meet, took a first in the 
800 meter race with a time of 
2:00.6. He also won the 1500 nicler 
run wilh an excellent time of 4:02.8 
In that race, Shapiro came in se­
cond with a close 4:03.5. Shapiro 
wcni on to win one of his own by 
taking ihe 1000 meter event, posting 
a 2:33.5. James ran a good race in 
Ihe 3000 meter run, edging out 
Union's Ed Arnhcitcr by 2.5 
seconds with a lime of 8:49. I. 

Albany also swepi both the one 
and iwo mile relays, but that was to 
no avt-.il as Albany was 
mathematically eliminated from a 
possible victory earlier in ihe meet, 

On February 23, nine days after 
ihe loss to Union, Albany traveled 
lo RPI lo participate in ihe seventh 
annual running of the Marty 
McDonagh Invitational Track 

Meel. Despilc a phenomenal show­
ing in Ihe distance medley relay and 
a leam score of 45.5, which was 
good enough for a fifth place oul of 
13, Munsey was nol extremely hap­
py witli his team's final results. 

"I was a Mule disappointed in the 
final leam lolal," Munsey said. 
"We could have finished a 'Utile 
higher up in the final slaiidings if ii 
hadn't been for a couple of bail 
breaks." 

One bad break which Munsey 
cited was Tony l-'crrelii's accidental 
disqualification in ihc 4(X) meter 
run. Ferrelli was disqualified for 
niisiakingly stepping on the lane 
line. Unfui innately, this mistake 
did cost Albany six points which 
niighl have pul ihe Danes ahead of 
RPI in ihc final slaiidings. The host 
team, RPI, finished fourth with a 
team total of 51.5 points, behind 
number one Colgate will) 117 
points, second place Cortland, 96 
points, and ihird place Siena, 66 

points. 
The highlight of ihe meel was 

Albany's record breaking lime of 
10:30.6 iu the distance medley 
relay. The team of Jim Roili, 1'cr-
rclli, Malhis, and Shapiro nol only 
sel a new RPI Invitational record, 
bul also a new field house mark as 
well. The disiancc medley is a relay 
composed of four pans, starling 
willi 880 and followed by Ihe 440, 
three-quarters mile, and one mile 
respectively. Ii was Mathis, a star of 
llie Union meel, who broke Ihc race 
open with a 3:08.0 iu ihe ihrcc-
quartcrs mile leg. 

Again, for ihe second consecutive 
meel, Mathis won the 800 meier 
event wilh a record breaking 1:58.0, 
besting his previous winning lime 
by 2.6 seconds. Malhis also entered 
ihe 1500 meter run. bul he did nol 
fair as well, taking only fourth 
place. 

continued mi I'titie fourteen 

LSAT/GKE/GMAT 
Don't let 4 years of college 

go by the boards. 
You worked hard in college; but, io has everyone elas who' i 
taking thetetests. What you nocJ it an edgo. Our test 
preparation courses ccn bo that edge, 

J'hn Sexton Test Preparation courses offer you distinct ad­
vantages in preparing for these all important tests: 

• Beit, most recant materials 
eSubstarUive curricula 

( not Just timings ) 
• Team instruction by a 

superior faculty 
• Practice exsma 

Compare John Sexton Course 
for information call 

•Counseling 
• " L i v e " instruction 

( not just tapes ) 
• Substantial it'tdy materials 
• Extra • help sessions 
• L S A T / G R E / G M A T Classes 

Mow Forming 

advantages .with others, then 

TEST PREPARATION CENTERS . I 

869-7346 | 

Additional Week 
of 

SENIOR PORTRAITS 

s ign -up NOW at Info. Desk 
Portra i ts taken Narck 1-7 

S4.00 s i t t ing fee e e i ° 5 

$5.00 Re-sitting fee 

February ?9, 1980 
Albany Student Press , Page Nineteen 

Injured Spikers Raise Record With Five Wins 
Several Key Starters Hurt 

by Larry Kahn 
The Albany Sta te men ' s 

volleyball team upped ihcir record 
lo 7-| in an action-packed week, 
with wins over New Paltz, RPI, 
Livingston, Nyack and Syracuse, 
and their first defeat, to Springfield 
College. Unfortunately, the vic­
tories were marred by injuries to 
key starters. 

"We're in better shape now than 
wc were a couple of weeks ago, but 
we're not healthy," said Albany 
volleyball eoack Ted Earl, "But 
others are getting experience now 
because of the injuries and they're 
responding well. Hopefully we'll 
have everybody healthy for our big 
games in the middle of March." 

On Saturday Albany travelled lo 
Syracuse and beat them in an emo­
tional match, 13-15, 15-9, 15-13, 
15-8. "Syracuse just came off a big 
win," said Earl, "They pummelled 
R1T and they were reeling pretty 
good about themselves—wc just 
look the fire out of ihcm. II was an 
emotional win for us." 

Syracuse didn't roll over and play 
dead, though, and aided by some 
key Albany errors they kept Ihe 
match close. Syracuse was leading 
8-5 in the fourth game when Albany 
mil the snark ihey needed from the 

bench in the form of Don Klinsky's 
blocking and Rich Soeder's passing. 
Socder made five straight perfect 
passes to get the team oul of trouble 
and they reeled off ten straight 
point lo wrap up the match. 
"It was not one of our more stellar 
performances," noted Earl. "We 
made errors I would attribute lo nol 
having practice Ihc three days 
before Ihc match, though I have to 
give credit to the entire leam—we 
switched offenses in the middle of 
the match, from the 5-1 we've been 
using all season to a 6-2, and the 
team was able to switch with a 
minimum of difficulty," 

Just the day before, on Friday, 
Ihe team had suffered their first set­
back of Ihe season againsl Spr­
ingfield College, 3-15, 4-15, 15-11, 
11-15. Injuries were a key factor in 
Albany's poor play with three 
starters hampered by various 
ailments. Hob Allcrs was losl due lo 
illness, Howie Nusinov was suffer­
ing from back spasms, and Fred 
Askham cut his fool in practice 
earlier in the week, diminishing his 
effectiveness. Albany's only win 
came ill ihe ihird game againsl Spr­
ingfield's second siring. They look 
ihe lead in Ihc final game at 11-10, 
bill couldn't pull il out. 

The Albany men's volleyball leam, coached by Ted Karl, won five matches 
In Ihe last week and losl one. (Photo: Mark Nadlcr) 

"We fell we could have beaten 
Ihcm, but wc were emotionally 
down because we had lo draslicaly 
change our lineup. We had lo move 
Tom Leahy into Ihc middle," Earl 
explained, "And he did a credible 
job, bul he just doesn't have Ihe ex­
perience of Nusinov iu Ihe middle." 

The weekend before, Albany hit 
lite road and came up wilh four 
straight victories. On Friday Ihc 
spikers "played superbly" as Ihey 
"devasiaied" New I'allz on Ihcir 
home court, 15-1, 15-4, 15-1. 
"They're on Ihe bottom of a 
rebuilding cycle," said Earl, "But 
they're oul there Irving and you 

have lo give them credit." Albany 
followed up the victory with 
another over RIM in a iwo oul of 
three maich, 15-7, 15-7. 

Earl noled (hat "RPI was really 
psyched lo lake us, bill wc just 
outplayed Ihcm. They were playing 
without two starters which pro­
bably made some difference, bul we 
were awesome at Ihe net. Gary 
Becker, Howie Nusinov, and Fred 
Askham were all very successful in 
blocking ihcir hitters." 

Then on Saturday, the leam 
travelled to Nyack lo lake on Liv­
ingston College and Nyack. Albany 

bested Livingston in the first match 
three straight, 15-4, 15-6, 15-7, and 
then went on to beat Nyack two out 
of three, 15-11, 9-15, 15-1. "The 
real story," according to Earl, 
"was that we played ail but the last 
game without Nusinov, our best 
blocker. He came down with back 
spasms and we were unable to move 
as a team.Howie's emotional 
leadership is so important tot he 
team that he only touched the ball 
five times inthe 15-1 game—his 
presence ws enough to spark the 
other five guys. We' moved out 
ahead to 7-1 and it was all downhill 
the rest of the way. Becker, 
Askham, and Lockley had a field 
day blocking." 

Albany was also scheduled to 
play late yesterday afternoon 
againsl a very strong West Point 
squad. Yet another starter will be 
losl as Askham nearly broke his 
arm in practice and il is doubtful 
that he'll play at all. Looking 
ahead, with three starters sidelined, 
Earl somehow looks at the bright 
side, "After West Point we play 
Vassar and New Paltz—neither is a 
highly eompclilivc team and it will 
give us some lime to get healthy., 
Hopefully by Ihc middle of March 
everybody wili be ready when we 
play within our division again." 

How Could A Team With So Little Do So Much? 
by Bub Bellaflore 

They lost their starling center to 
an automobile accident before Ihc 
season began. Two players quit in 
the first two weeks of competition. 
Now, they could only suit up nine 
men for a game — nine men, thai 
is, if no one was hurl. They had no 
depth. How could a college basket­
ball team win without depth? 

Sports 
Analysis 

Albany Business College (ABC) 
team and Division 1 Siena. 

Afler starting conditioning 
workouts in Ociober, the Danes 
opened ihcir schedule againsl JCA 
in late November, and beat them 
81-75. Albany also won their next 
Iwo games (all at home), bul the 
Dane offense still looked shaky and 
unorganized. Then came what was 
probably Ihc turning point in the 
season — a 90-85 come-from-

The Danes then losl lo Army on sure if Ihis slrcak Is a record, bul from a 55-39 hall'lime deficit to a 
ihe road, but relumed after the i Kopp said lllfll nol even Ihc grcal 98-90 Dane final advantage. Kopp 
holiday break witli a win over 
Hamilton and a blow-out of Ihc 
College of St. Rose (106-73), before 
losing lo Union (again, on Ihe 
road). Even lliough there were two 
losses in that period, the Danes 
were gaining confidence, and with 
the St. Rose win, ihe knowledge 
thai if Ihey had lo, they could pul 
an opponcnl away. 

f 

18-2 Dane squad of 1977-78 had wasn't quite sure why Hardy, a 
such a sneak. player with varsity potential in both 

Then, on February 21, Mohawk basketball and football, decided lo 
Valley Community College halted quit, bin only found out through 
ihc Albany machine Willi a 78-69 another player whom Hardy had 
defeal of Ihc Danes. "We didn't lold. 
play very well," Kopp said. "If Albany then beat Siena 88-74 on 
we'd have played ihe way we were February 23, before losing lo 
capable of, we'd have won." HVCC on Wednesday 
Evidently the loss of Dave Hardy, 

Those players thai did remain 
were not blessed with great height. 
No deplh is bad enough. How 
could a college basketball team, 
even a J.V. leam, win withoul 
height? 

And ihey only had three bona 
fide outside shooters. 

Now, how is a leant witli no 
depth, no height, and just adequate 
shooting ability supposed to win 
basketball games? 

Well, teach thai team a successful 
system of smarl offense and stingy 
defense, give Ihcm an intelligent 
rookie head coach (who had gotten 
Ihe job only one week before the 
season opener), lei ihcm supply Ihe 
hard work, hustle, and heart, and 
you've got Ihc 1979-80 edition of 
the Albany Stale men's J.V. basket-
hall learn. 

Despite losing to Hudson Valley 
Community College Wednesday 
night, 69-68, in Ihc season finale, 
Ihe Danes boasted an impressive 
16-4 record, were victorious in all 11 
home games, had a nine-game win­
ning slrcak, and look 15 of their 
firsl 17 contest before dropping two 
of their last three. 

Led by guard Mike Gaines and 
forward Mike Galto, Albany 
defeated squads such as ihe Junior 
College of Albany (who, incidental­
ly! was selected for the NCAA 
Junior College postseason tourna­
ment), an extremely talented 

Albany head J.V. coach Steve Kn 
campaign, emphasizes a 

behind thrilling overtime vieiory 
over ABC. Albany was down 47-33 
at ihe half in thai game, and won it 
wilh some clinch shooting, especial­
ly by Gaines (14 points in ihe lasi 15 
minutes of play), and great defense 
thai held ABC's hot shooters in 
check. This win set ihe wheels in 
motion, "The ABC game gave us 
Ihe feeling thai we could come back 
when were behind," said Albany 
J.V. coach Sieve Kopp. 

Wliai was Ihe secret lo Albany's 
success? There musl have been 
something that blended a crew of 
freshmen and a disciplined offense 
into an efficient basketball squad. 
Midsl all Ihc adversity, Ihc quil­
lings, lite injuries (which often forc­
ed I lie statistician into service), and 
I lie cvcr-prescul foul I rouble, there 
was one stabilizing force. 

"Sieve Kopp did a great job of 
coaching Ihcm. He kepi them 
together. He gol Ihc most out of the 
players he had." Those were ihe 
words of Albany men's varsity 
baskcihall coach Dick Saucrs, in 
reference lo (he J.V. coach. When 
il really came down lo il, Kopp was 
Ihc difference. The first-year coach 
had lo deal right off ihe bal with the 
death of sophomore center Jack 
Carmody. 

Cnrmody, a front-line player who 
was hurl as a freshman, was to be a 
team leader by virtue of his ex­
perience and a capable performer, 
was killed in a tragic auto accident 
during prc-season. Besides the loss 
of a key player, Kopp had to keep 

W IIN morale high and he 
From January 22 until February tremendous offensive rehounder very successful. 

20, the Danes were untouchable, who gave Albany much-needed c Kopp had to compensate for the 
Beginning willi lite demolition of a muscle underneath and was a key \ \K^ 0f height with strategic game 
rusiy Onconta squad (107-74), performer for the Danes all season plans lo shut down the big men that 
Albany look nine games in a row, as sixth man, hurt tremendously. ,|,c schedule presented (6-8 Tony 
including all incredible 43 point an- Hardy was the third Albany player Franks of CSR and 6-8 Tom Truax 
nihllatlon of Skidmore (98-55). The lo quil, as he left Ihe leam afler his[0f RPI, among others), whatever he 
high point of thai streak was pro- best performance of the season (a planned usually worked. He also 
hahly Ihe revenge match againsl 22-point game against JCA on never knew who he'd have for any 
Union, which Albany won by 18 February 13). He had 13 in the se- particular game (due lo injuries, 
points. Since no consistent J.V. cond half of lhat contest, and e l c j a n ( j c a u S ed more prob-
basket ball records are kepi, il is un- engineered the Albany comeback continued on page fourteen t 

pp, who gnltletl Ihe Danes In an impressive 16-4 record in his first 
point during a tlmc-ntll In an earlier game against JCA. 
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Danes Face St. L a w r e n c e ^ ^ 
Split In Buffalo Enou^To Send 2^Jmal^To~E^^ional 

by Paul Schwartz 
There was an unlikely series of 

events at the SUNYAC tournament! 
in Buffalo last weekend, resulting in 
some anxious moments for the 
Albany Slate basketball team. But 
Sunday evening, the Danes received 
the news they had been wailing for 
— Albany, for the second year in a 
row, was in the NCAA playoffs. 

The Danes will face St. Lawrence 
tonight in the first round of the 
Division III East Regional in 
Potsdam, while the SUNYAC 
Champion Potsdam Bears (24-3). 
will host Stony Brook (18-8) in the 
second game. 

"Any one of the four teams can 
win it," said Albany coach Dick 
Sauers. "It 's really up for grabs. 
Potsdam, has a tremendous advan­
tage by playing on their home 
court, but they have already lost 
three home games this season. 
Whoever can gel it going will win it, 
and I feel the winner of the East will 
go a long way. Wc have as good a 
chance as anybody." 

That chance was almost blown in 
Buffalo's cozy Clark Hall last week, 
where the lop four squads from the 
conference's cast and wesi divisions 
met to determine the SUNYAC title 
and the automatic bid to the 
playoffs. After Potsdam got by 
Buffalo State, 54-56, on Friday, the 
Danes and Buffalo squared off in 
what turned out to be a slow-
motion marathon. It took regula-1 

lion play and four overtimes to 
separate the two teams, and in the 
end, almost three hours after it 
began, the Bulls came away with a 
65-57 victory. The next night, in 
their final impression on the NCAA 
selection committee, Albany needed 
a convincing decision over the 11-15 
Buffalo Stale Bengals. The Danes 
came through with a 98-61 trounc­
ing of the Bengals, and then watch­
ed as Potsdam's Ed Jachim hit two 
free throws with 24 seconds left to 
seal the Bear's 50-45 triumph over 
Burralo. 

The committees then look over. 
Potsdam was in. So was St. 
Lawrence, winners of the Indepen­
dent College Athletic Conference 
(ICAC). Next came the two at-largc 
bids, and based on their 11-0 record 
ugaiust Division 111 teams in New 
York State, Stony Brook was 
selected. There was one spot to be 
filled, and the two possibilities were 
Albany (20-5) and Buffalo (17-10). 

"Wc felt there were several teams 
in the east of NCAA calibre," said 
Dave Oeorr, chairman of the Divi­
sion 111 Eastern Regional selection 
committee over ihc phone on Mon­
day. "There was ferocious competi­
tion between Albany and Buffalo 
— it went four overtimes on Ihc 
court and in our committee. Wc 
had good discussion, and Ihc voting 
was very close. Albany's strong 
points were Ihcir record, their (wo 
solid performances at Buffalo 

[pele Stanlfli drives** Buffalo State's Derrick Mljshcll applies defensive 
I pressure. Albany defeated the Bengals, 98-61. (Photo: Mike Farrell) 

against a darn good Buffalo1 team 
(the Danes defeated Buffalo 66-58 
earlier in the season), and the 
strength of the east division of the 
SUNYAC compared to Ihc west 
division. When wc gave the national 
committee our recommendations, 
we gave I hem the four teams I hat 
were eventually picked, and wc also 
asked them to consider the Buffalo 
situation — wc wanted them to at 
least know that there were other 
teams in the cast with good records". 
Then the national committee voted 
unanimously for Albany," 

"Albany got in because of the 
strength of their schedule," said 
Tom Murphy, basketball coach and 
athletic director al Hamilton, and a 
member of the East Regional selec­
tion committee. "And Ihc last game 
at Buffalo went four overtimes, so 
it's obvious thai it was u pretty 
equal game. If Buffalo had beaten 
them by 10 or 15 points, they would 
have been in. But based on the 
closeness of the game, and their 1-1 
record against each other, and look­
ing at their schedules and com­
parative scores, Albany gels it. Buf­
falo has beaten nobody with a win­
ning record — They've only beaten 
losers." 

So the loss to the Bulls did not 
leave the Danes eliminated, but it 
certainly left them frustrated. Buf­
falo used ihc small court to their ad­
vantage, laying back in a zone 
defense, with 6-6 center Nate Bottic 
applying enough Intimidation to sli­
de the Dane inside game — three . 
Albany postmen managed just three 
field goals among them. But guards 
Winston Royal and Rob Chine pro­
vided the Danes with early 12-6 and 
19-12 leads, and they seemed on ihc 
verge of forcing the Bulls out of 
their zone. However,Albany shot 41 
percent during the game, allowing 
Buffalo lo slick with their defense, 
despite repeated slow-downs by the 
Danes. At the half, it was Albany 
holding a 21-20 lead; after regula­
tion play, it was 36-36; then lied al 
38 after one overtime, 41 after the 
second, 45 after three extra periods, 
before Buffalo exploded for 20 

. points in the fourth overtime. 
"I assumed they would play a 

zone," said Sauers aflcr the game. 
"They played us man-to-man the 
first lime. But wc didn't shoot very, 
well, and their zone made 
everything jammed up in the mid­
dle, and they were bigger than wc 
were, so wc couldn't pass Ihc ball 
over them." 

"Wc gol into a quick lead, so wc 
were content lo hold the ball out," 
said Royal, Ihc Dane captain. 
"They play on that small court, and 
they have good height. They jusi 
didn't switch lo a man-lo-man." 

"The zone is our best defense," 
Buffalo coach'Bill Hughes said. 
"You saw what they did Ihc few 
times we went man-to-mau — they 
killed us. I thought they did a good 
job against our zone, but we have a 
good zone, and it's tough to beat." 

Despite their difficulties, Albany 
still had four golden opportunities 
to win the game — four shots that 
could have clinched a Dane victory 
— but each chance came up empty. 
With 1 ;49 left in regulation, Albany 
took control, the score lied at 36, 
The Danes held for the last shot, 
and with time running down, center 

Albany forward Steve Low goes Inside between Tom Parsons (30) and Nalc 
•Ionic (40) during the Dane's loss lo Buffalo. (Photo: Mike Farrell) 

thinking of Ihc glory afterwards. 
But I put I hat out of my mind, and 1 
thought about the game. With all 
the overtimes, it was almost like 
sorts>f a high school game. That's 
what I thought of." 

Willi Buffalo behind them, Ihc 
Danes needed to concentrate on 
Buffalo Stale Saturday night, but in 
the first half, that concentration 
seemed to waiver. Albany shot just 
40 percent, was oulrebounded 
21-14, and after Terry Burch's jam, 
t|ie Bengals closed an early Dane 
lead to 30-26 al halflimc. The 
Danes were not exactly taking Buf­
falo by slorm. 

Albany owned the next half. 
Scoring a Dane-record 68 points, 

Albany gol ihcir running game in 
full swing, and behind career highs 
by reserves Bob Collier (18 points) 
and Steve Low (16 points), the 
Danes turned the contest into a 37 
point rout, enough of a spread to 
even impress the NCAA committee. 

The victory gave Albany their se­
cond consecutive 20-win season (the 
Danes closed out their schedule 
with victories over Potsdam and 
Pittsburgh), bin Albany's bid for 
number 21 will no doubt be 
tougher. The St. Lawrence Sainls 
went 12-0 in the ICAC, 22-3 for Ihc 
season, and currently sport a 15 
game winning streak. Their lust loss 
was a 75-74 setback lo Polsdam, a 
leant they have faced three times 
(Ihc Saints won their last malchup 

votiiinutd on /Mine seventeen^ 

Kelvin Jones found himself forced 
lo lake a long side juniper 
("Definitely out of my range —it 
was not a good shot for me," Jones 
said later). The shot came close, but 
bounded away. Overlime. 

With 40 seconds remaining in the 
first overtime the Danes had the 
ball, and wailed for the final shot 
with the score tied al 38. Royal tried 
a long jumper, which missed at ihc 
buzzer. The second overtime was a 
41-41 deadlock when Albany stole 
the ball and rushed up court, Steve 
Low glanced up at the clock, 
Ihoughl he saw one second remain­
ing, and threw a half-court shot-at" 
the basket, which hit off the rim. 
Actually, there :wcrc nine seconds 
left when Low's shol was launched. 
In ihe third overtime Ray Ccsare's 
jump shot was blocked by John 
Pilzpatrick, sending the contest to 
its fourth and final overtime. 

Aflcr 55 lense minutes , 
something finally had to give, and 
in the final extra session, the Bulls 
broke things open. Bouie and his 14 
rebounds had fouled out one over­
time before, and his replacement, 
6-5 freshman Kenny Jones, stole the 
show. His offensive rebound basket 
gave Buffalo a 47-45 lead, and 
Jones went on lo score 11 points in 
the fourth overtime — his only 
points of Ihe entire game — as the 
Bulls look control. 

"At first, 1 was real nervous,", 
Kenny Jones said. "I missed two 
free throws al firsl— I was kind of 
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Colonial Cuts Elevator Use 

Tries io Eliminate Vandalism 
by Michele Israel 

While residents complain of in-
convenience and inadequate notice. 
Colonial Quad will keep two of the 
three tower elevators temporarily 
inoperable until vandalism is reduc­
ed. 

Heading io continuous elcvator-
vandulism in Livingston Tower, 
Colonial Quad Hoard, rower 
Council, ;uid Tower Director Dave 
Render insiiiuicd an anli-vandalism 
policy lust Wednesday which will 
shut down iwo elevators on Thurs­
day, Friday, and Saturday nights 
from II pm. lo 7 am. According to 
Colonial Quad Central Council 
Senatoi Mark Borkowskl, ihc 
elevators will remain closed until 
the "culprit is caught." 

However, while students favor 
(he protection policy, many arc 
arguing that ii was instiiuedwithout 
proper notice this past Thursday. 
According io Borkowskl, residents 
were informed i^\' the procedure late 
last Thursday only two. hours 
before service was terminated. In 
addition, Borkowski claims Rendci 
only contacted three section of the 
tower. 

According to Colonial Quad 
Central Council represent alive 
Mark Lafayette, approximately 50 
lower residents attended Sunday's 
Quad Hoard meeting lo complain oT 
the inconvenience. "For what a few 

people do, you're punishing 450 
people that live in the tower," 
Lafayette said. 

Lafayette said that he had no 
previous knowledge of lite policy. 
"I came back from vacation and 

,read the policy on the wall," he 
said. 

Quad Relations Vice-President 
Becky Tuttle said Ihc policy shall re­
main as is until more information, 
regarding Ihe occurrence of- van­
dalism surfaces. 

Tuttle added thai residents were 
properly informed of ihe policy, ex­
plaining that Render did cut Unci 
RAN and several tower sections, 
Posters were placed on all even 
floors and in the main lobby early 
Thursday morning, explained Tut­
tle. 

Render was unavailable lot com­
ment. 

Tutileexplained that maintaining 
towel elevators has been a long pro­
cess. Lust year and early last 
semester, repairs in the elevators 
were made continually by die quail 
custodial staff and ihe Plain 
Department. 

Colonial Quad's Committee of 
Vandalism and Safety cited a 
definite need Id improve Ihc condi­
tions of the elevators. "Ai least 
every oilier weekend another light 
was out or a panel ceiling was miss­
ing/1 said Tultie. 

Suspended officers Vila and Buchanan 
Student witnesses called to testify, (photo: John Hodges) 

According io Tower Council 
member Andria Ciagliano, a light 
plate was destroyed in an even 
elevator as soon as vacation ended. 
"Something is going to be done. 
The bullshit has lo stop," added 
Ciagliano. 

Over this past vacation, explain­
ed tuttle, Plant Department Direc­
tor Dennis Stevens promised to 
repair ihc elevators. New plexiglass 
ceilings were installed and light 
panels were replaced and rewired. 

Borkowskl, however, said that 
the elevators were "shabbily 
repaired." Tul tic added that while 
Stevens did repair the elevators, a 
"flimsy job was done." Tuttle ap­
parently requested ceiling panels 
which could be securely attached io 
the crossbars, rather than the plex­
iglass. In addition, the light panels 
were held down by only two screws. 

According lo Stevens, ihe 
elevators were repaired a number of 
limes last year. "You can maintain 
them jusi so long," He added thai 
shutting down clcvutoi service is an 
"unfortunate" way to resolve ihe 
vandalism problem. "I would like 
ihc elevators to operate all the 
lime," he added. 

Stevens said there is.no safety-
factor invoked with running only 
one elevator, citing the shutdown of 
elevators in case of fire. 

I mile pointed out thai no deals 

Student Victim in 
Pine Hills Burglary 

by Laura Fin rent! no 
Albany's Pine Hill "Student Ghetto" was the scene of yet another 

incident in this year's wave of downtown incidents yesterday. Ac­
cording to Albany Police Lieutenant Detective John Damino, a man 

entered a first floor apartment near Alumni Quad through a window 
at approximately 3 am Monday. 

He then entered ihc room of a female SUNYA student, placed his 
hands around her neck and said, "I'll only be here a few minutes." 
The woman reportedly screamed and the intruder fled through the 
kitchen door. 

Albany Police Sergeant Daniel Nicholson described Ihe intruder as 
5" 10" in height and wearing a dark ski hat and a dark waist-length 
leather jacket. His age and race have not been determined. 

According to Damino, ihe incident is not related to the work of 
the "Pine Hills Toucher," whom he claims is actually a composite 
name of two or three people. 

Damino pointed oui thai two intruders involved in rapes have been 
apprehended downtown. While previous incidents attributed to the 
"Toucher" were sexually related, yesterday's break-in was not, ac­
cording lo police. 

Damino believes that another two individuals involved in 
downtown crimes are still at large. 

Albany police are following up the Pine Hills crimes by issuing 
questionnaires (o victims and deploying random police patrols, said 
Damino. 

were officially made regarding the 
policy. She explained the elevators 
remained open because ihcclcvalor 
key was inaccessible. 

"I'm sony people were inconve­
nienced in the lower, lint ii did 
heighten awareness. I do agree there 
were some problems but the 
response was immature," lidded 
Tuttle. "li l iy students docs not 
represent the tuujoi i t \ ." 

Tutile explained thai partial ter­
mination of elevator xcr\ Ice \\i 
hopefully discourage weekend van­
dalism. 

While Borkowskl supports the 
new policy, he cites Inadequacies in-
the way the idea was introduced. 
Aside from lack of propel publici­
ty; those elevators remaining 
unusable were lo have their doors 
closed. Borkowskl said ihex were, 
left open and according to Tutile, 
this resulted in elevuior damage. 

Borkowski is seeking a com­
promise io the current policy, pen­
ding access lo ihe elevator key. I le 
is advocating that the elevators run 

from 7 am. to H pin. during the 
week, and iheit having two turned 
off at 8 pin. Borkowski, Tultie, and 
Lafayette have met with Dean of 
Student Affairs Neil Brown to 
discuss ihe situation and will meet 
again today to arrive at a decision. 
Brown was unavailable for com-

Colonial's Livingston Tnwcr. 
Cite of elevator vandalism. 

(Photo: UPS) 

Students Subpoenaed in Hearings 
by Patricia Braulcy 

SUNYA students Jay Anielman 
and Tony Lcnkiewkv were sub­
poenaed io testify at preliminary 
police depart men ifd hearings for 
suspended Albany City Police of­
ficers Richard Vila and Michael 
Buchanan. 

Albany Police Li. William Mur­
ray, also subpoenaed, said "These 
(hearings) determine whether ihc 
officers will be permanently 
dismissed from ihc department." 

Vita and Buchanan were 
suspended from lite -department for 
violating police department rules 
and regulations dating back lo in­
cidents on March 21 and 28 in 
SUNYAN Walerbury Hall. On Oc­
tober 24, Vila and Buchanan were 
acquitted of six criminal charges in­
cluding extortion, robbery, and 
burgjary of several SUNYA 
students. 

Anielman and l.enkiewic/, both 
witnesses in ihe case, were issued 

supocnas last Wednesday by 
Albany Police Serjeant William 
Dolan, according lo I.eukiewic/. 

He said, "Wc were scheduled lo 
testily at ihe Public Safely Building 
in from of arbitrator Professor 
Donald P. Goodman on Friday. 

Anielman, however, said he wus 
told on Thursday morning that the 
hearing was "indefinite!) postpon­
ed." He said no reason was given 
for the postponement. 

I.enkiewkv said, "I was uul 
notified of Ihe postponement by 

any official. Bui when Jay lold me 
he did not have lo aiieuil the heal­
ing on the scheduled day, I assumed 
it was postponed." 

Lieutenant Murray said the hear­
ing was "not cancelled, but ad­
journed until a later dale." 

Murray explained, "When an 
Albany City Police Officei is 
suspended on disciplinary charges, 
his contract assures him a depart­
mental hearing." 

"The hearing can be done in two 
ways and Ihe officer determines 
which procedure will be used. They 
can choose lo have their case heard 
by ihc Public Safety Commission of 

ihe City of Albany or they can be 
heard by an arbitrator assigned by 
l|ieir union," said Murray. 

Murray said he docs not know 
when the departmental hearings will 
be rescheduled. 
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